STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

INITIAL EXPRESS TERMS
FOR
PROPOSED BUILDING STANDARDS
OF THE
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT (DSA-AC)

REGARDING PROPOSED CHANGES TO
THE CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, PART 10

2016 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
TRIENNIAL CODE CYCLE

LEGEND FOR EXPRESS TERMS
1. Existing California amendments or code language being modified are in italics when they appear in
the model code text: All such language appears in italics, modified language is underlined.
2. New California amendments: All such language appears underlined and in italics.
3. Repealed text: All such language appears in strikeout.

INITIAL EXPRESS TERMS

DSA-AC proposes to amend specific portions of the 2015 International Existing Building
Code and adopt into the 2016 California Existing Building Code, as indicated.

CHAPTER 1
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION |
CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION

ITEM 1.00
CHAPTER 1, DIVISION | - MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE
Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire California Chapter

Adopt entire California Chapter as amended
(amended Sections listed below)

Adopt only those Sections that are listed below

Chapter / Section

>

=Y
©
=

=

©

=

o
IX|1X

ITEM 1.01
(begin underline) SECTION 1.9
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT

DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms May 29, 2015
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 1of6 2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc
DGS-DSA-Access Compliance




STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

1.9.1 Division of the State Architect — Access Compliance.

Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in California Code of
Regulations, Title 24, Part 2 (California Building Code), Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 requlated by the Division
of the State Architect—Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2 , Chapter 11A or 11B, as
applicable under authority cited by CA Government Code Section 4450 and in reference cited by CA
Government Code Sections 4450 through 4461, 12955.1(c), and CA Health and Safety Code Sections
18949.1, 19952 through 19959.

1.9.1.1 Adopting agency identification. Division of the State Architect-Access Compliance
amendments in this code appear preceded with the acronym [DSA-AC]. (end underline)

CHAPTER 4
PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE METHOD

ITEM 4.00
CHAPTER 4 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE

Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)
Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section
410 (1 paragraph below title only)

[><

ITEM 4.01
SECTION 410
ACCESSIBILITY FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in Title
24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 requlated by the Division of the State Architect-
Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or Chapter 11B,

as applicable. (end underline)

410.1 Scope. ...
CHAPTER 6
REPAIRS
ITEM 6.00
CHAPTER 6 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE

Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended

Sections listed below)

Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section

DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms May 29, 2015
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 20f6 2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc

DGS-DSA-Access Compliance



STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

‘ 605 (1 paragraph below title only) | |

<

ITEM 6.01
SECTION 605
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

605.1 General. ...

CHAPTER 7
ALTERATIONS - LEVEL 1

ITEM 7.00
CHAPTER 7 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE
Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)
Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section
705 (1% paragraph below title only)

<

ITEM 7.01
SECTION 705
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

705.1 General. ...

CHAPTER 8
ALTERATIONS - LEVEL 2
ITEM 8.00
CHAPTER 8 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE

Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended

Sections listed below)
DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms May 29, 2015
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 30f6 2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc

DGS-DSA-Access Compliance



STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X
Chapter / Section
806 (1% paragraph below title only)

<

ITEM 8.01
SECTION 806
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

806.1 General. ...

CHAPTER 9
ALTERATIONS - LEVEL 3

ITEM 9.00
CHAPTER 9 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE

Adopting Agency DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)
Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section
906 (1% paragraph below title only)

[><

ITEM 9.01
SECTION 906
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

906.1 General. ...

CHAPTER 10
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
ITEM 10.00
CHAPTER 10 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE
Adopting Agency DSA-AC
DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms May 29, 2015
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 4 0f 6 2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc

DGS-DSA-Access Compliance



STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)
Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section
1006 (1% paragraph below title only)

<

ITEM 10.01
SECTION 1006
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 requlated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

1006.1 General. ...

CHAPTER 11
ADDITIONS

ITEM 11.00
CHAPTER 11 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE
Adopting Agency DSA-AC
Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)
Adopt only those Sections that are listed below X

Chapter / Section
1105 (1% paragraph below title only)

[><

ITEM 11.01
SECTION 1105
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or
Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

1105.1 Minimum requirements. ...

CHAPTER 15
CONSTRUCTION SAFEGUARDS
ITEM 15.00
DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms May 29, 2015
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 50f6 2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc

DGS-DSA-Access Compliance



STATE OF CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

CHAPTER 15 — MATRIX ADOPTION TABLE

Adopting Agency

DSA-AC

Adopt entire Chapter

Adopt entire Chapter as amended (amended
Sections listed below)

Adopt only those Sections that are listed below

Chapter / Section

1508 (1% paragraph below title only)

<

ITEM 15.01
SECTION 1508
ACCESSIBILITY

(begin underline) [DSA-AC] Buildings or facilities where accessibility is required for applications listed in

Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 1, Section 1.9.1 regulated by the Division of the State

Architect-Access Compliance shall comply with Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code, Chapter 11A or

Chapter 11B, as applicable. (end underline)

1508.1 Construction sites. ...

Notation
Authority: Government Code Section 4450.

References: Government Code Sections 4450 through 4461, and 12955.1(c) and Health and Safety

Code Sections 18949.1, 19952 through 19959.

DGS BSC TP-121 (Rev. 7/2014) Initial Express Terms
Rulemaking file #03-16 - Part #10 — 2016 Tri Code Cycle 6 of 6
DGS-DSA-Access Compliance

May 29, 2015
2016 Part 10 - Initial-Express-Terms.doc



