
 
BSC 03/12 Page 1 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX                                                              TITLE (CODE) 
AGENCY: CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION [BSC 03/12]                                  CCR, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (Structural) 
 
LEGEND: 
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s 
(CAC)s: 

ACCESS = Accessibility 
BFO = Building, Fire & Other 
HF = Health Facilities 
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy 
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces 
GB = Green Building 

 
Actions: 

A = Accepted 
AA = Approve as amended 
AS = Approve as submitted 
D = Disapprove 
FS =Further Study 
W/D = Withdrawn by agency 

 
Amendments, if indicated by agency: 

S = Statutory 
N = New 

Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only): 
GREEN = uncontested items 
YELLOW = challenged items 
SALMON = W/D, no action required 

 
 
SD/LF CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
 
 
CHAPTER 1, DIVISION I, CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION 
Adopt only those sections that are listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-1 1.1.3.2 E      
BSC 3/12-2 1.1.11 E      

 
 
CHAPTER 1, DIVISION II, CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION 
BSC Does not adopt Chapter 1, Div. II 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-3 Note E    Non-regulatory  
 
 
 
 
 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 2 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTER 2, DEFINITIONS 
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-4 RETROFIT E    Relocated from Chapter 34 (Non-
regulatory) 

 

 
 
CHAPTER 3, USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-5 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 4, SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS ON USE AND OCCUPANCY 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-6 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 5, GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-7 Entire Chapter       



 
BSC 03/12 Page 3 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTER 6, TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-8 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 7, FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-9 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 8, INTERIOR FINISHES 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-10 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 9, FIRE PROTECTION 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-11 Entire Chapter       
 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 4 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTER 10, MEANS OF EGRESS 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-12 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 12, INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT 
Adopt entire chapter as amended 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-13 1203.2 E    Repeal existing amendment  
BSC 3/12-14 Entire Chapter as 

Amended 
    See Part 2 of express terms for existing 

amendments being moved forward 
without modification 

 

 
 
CHAPTER 14, EXTERIOR WALLS 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-15 Entire Chapter       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 5 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTER 15, ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-16 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 16, STRUCTURAL DESIGN 
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-17 1613.5 N      
BSC 3/12-18 1613.5.1 – 

BALLASTED 
PHOTOVOLTAIC 
SYSTEM 

N    New definition for ASCE-7  

BSC 3/12-19 1613.5.2, Exception E    Modify ASCE 7 §13.4  
BSC 3/12-20 1613.6.9 E    Incorporated in 2012 model code 

reference standard ASCE-7-10 
 

BSC 3/12-21 1613.6.10 E    Incorporated in 2012 model code 
reference standard ASCE-7-10 

 

 
 
CHAPTERS 17,  STRUCTURAL TESTS AND SPECIAL INSPECTIONS  
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-22 Entire Chapter     See Part 2 of express terms for existing 
amendments being moved forward 
without modification 

 

 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 6 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

 
CHAPTERS 18, SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS  
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-23 1803.5.12 (2) E    Incorporated in 2012 model code   
 
 
CHAPTERS 19, CONCRETE 
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-24 1908.1.2 (h) E    Covered by ACI 318-11 Section 21.10.2  
BSC 3/12-25 1908.1.3 (21.4.5) E    Incorporated in 2012 model code  
BSC 3/12-26 1908.1.9.ACI318 

(D3.3.1 & D3.3.7) 
E    Covered by 2012 IBC Section 1905.1.9 

Exception 2 
 

 
 
CHAPTERS 20, ALUMINUM 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-27 Entire Chapter       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 7 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTERS 21, MASONRY 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-28 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTERS 22, STEEL 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-29 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTERS 23, WOOD 
Adopt Entire Chapter as amended 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-30 2305.1.4 E    Covered by 2012 IBC Section 1905.1.9 
Exception 2 

 

 
 
CHAPTERS 24, GLASS AND GLAZING 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-31 Entire Chapter       



 
BSC 03/12 Page 8 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

 
CHAPTERS 25, GYPSUM BOARD AND PLASTER 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-32 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTERS 26, PLASTIC 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-33 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-34 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 31, SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION 
Adopt Entire Chapter as amended 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-35 Entire Chapter     Carry forward existing amendment  



 
BSC 03/12 Page 9 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

 
CHAPTER 32, ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-36 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 33, SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION 
Adopt Entire Chapter without amendments 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-37 Entire Chapter       
 
 
CHAPTER 34, EXISTING STRUCTURES 
Adopt only those amendments listed below (See part 2 of BSC Express Terms for existing amendments being carried forward) 
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-38 3402.1 (Retrofit) E    Relocated to Chapter 2  
BSC 3/12-39 3417.5 N      
BSC 3/12-40 3418 (BSE-C 

Response…) 
E      

BSC 3/12-41 3418 (BSE-R 
Response…) 

E      

 
 
 
 
 
 



 
BSC 03/12 Page 10 of 10 06/ 25/2012 
Commission Action Matrix  
Amend 2012 International Building Code 
 

CHAPTER 35, REFERENCED STANDARDS 
Adopt entire chapter without amendments  
 

Item Number Code Section 
Type of 
amend- 

ment 
(S, E, N) 

CAC: 
(AS, AA, 
D, FS) 

Agency 
Response 

to CAC 
(A, D, W/D) 

45-Day Comments 
(AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations 

CBSC 
Action 
(AS, 

AA, D, 
FS) 

BSC 3/12-42 Entire Chapter E      
 
 


