STATE OF CALIFORNIA - STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

March 1, 2012

Massoud Abolhoda, S.E., Building Official
Planning and Development

County of Santa Barbara

123 E. Anapamu Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

Dear Mr. Abolhoda;

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on February 16, 2012 of the County of Santa
Barbara submittal pertaining to Ordinance No. 4822 with findings and is acceptable for
filing. Your filing attests to your understanding that according to Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building Standards Code
shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the findings and the
modifications or changes have been filed with the California Building Standards
Commission (the Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

- ke
/nrique M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

cc:  Chron
Local Filings



County of Santa Barbara

Planning and Development

Glenn S. Russell, Ph.D., Director
Dianne Black, Director of Development Services
Jeffrey S. Hunt, Director Long Range Planning

February 13, 2012

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento CA 95833

RE: 2010 California Building Code
To Whom It May Concern:

On January 17, 2012 the Santa Barbara County Board Supervisors voted unanimously to re-adopt the 2010
California Building Codes to include local geological, topographical and climatic conditions, necessitating the
proposed amendments. The 2010 California Building Codes with amendments and other published model
codes as listed below to collectively comprise Building Regulations of the Santa Barbara County Code. The
adoption is codified by Ordinance 4822 and is located in Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code.

2010 California Building Code, Volume 1 and 2
2010 California Residential Code

2010 California Electrical Code

2010 California Plumbing Code

2010 California Mechanical Code

2010 California Energy Code

2010 California Green Building Standards Code
2010 California Building Administrative Code
2010 California Historical Building Code

1997 Uniform Housing Code

1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings

Pursuant to the 2010 California Building Code Section 1.1.8, the Santa Barbara County Building Division
hereby submits the attached ordinance containing amendments, additions and deletions to the 2010 California
Building Standard Codes, as well as the findings therefore. Please forward any comments or questions to the
address below.

Sincerely,

-

"""""""" - B Sy YT
Massoud Abolhoda, S.E.

Building Official

805-568-3120

mabothoda@co santa-barbara.ca,us

cc: Kevin Ready
........................................................................................... ‘....................n........................................,...u.........................

123 E. Anapamu Street, Santa Barbara, CA 93101 + Phone: (805) 568-2000 - FAX: (805) 568-2030
624 West Foster Road, Santa Maria, CA 93455 + Phone: (805) 934-6250 - FAX: (805) 934-6258
www.sbcountyplanning.org



SANTA BARBARA COUNTY
BUILDING CODE

Ordinance No. 4822

Effective 01/17/2012



Planning and Development Department
Dr. Glenn Russell, Director

Division of Building and Safety
Massoud Abolhoda - Building Official

Santa Barbara office:

123 East Anapamu Street
Santa Barbara CA 93101-2058
Phone: (805) 568-3030
Facsimile: (805) 568-3103

Santa Maria Valley office:
624 West Foster Road
Santa Maria CA 93455-5137
Phone: (805) 934-6230
Facsimile: (805) 934-6258

Internet web page: www.sbcountyplanning.orq

Adopting with Modifications:

2010 California Building Code, Volumes 1 and 2
2010 California Electrical Code

2010 California Plumbing Code

2010 California Mechanical Code

2010 California Energy Code

2010 California Building Administrative Code
2010 California Historical Building Code

2010 California Existing Building Code 2010
1997 Uniform Housing Code

1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
2010 California Residential Code

2010 California Green Building Standards Code



Section 10-2.11
Section 10-2.12
Section 10-2.13
Section 10-2.14
Section 10-2.15
Section 10-2.16
Section 10-2.17

Section 10-3.3 1

TABLE OF CONTENTS

ARTICLE I——ADMINISTRATIVE ......ccocovtititieieiee vttt sttt n et et e s s e e e et e s et esareseresseeees - 5
Section 10-1.1 TEHE ettt s et et ettt reeen 5
Section 10-1.2 Purpose ...... 9
Section 10-1.3  AUIROFIEY..........cccooiiiiiicrcieccct ettt 0
SECHION J0-1.4  SCOPE ...ttt sttt ettt ee e w6
Section 10-1.5  APPHCGBILILY ..ottt et s et et eseren e et e e e e et et 6
SECHON J0-1.6  IHIERE ...ttt s bbbt b e ettt st n et et 6,7

ARTICLE II—ORGANIZATION AND ENFORCEMENT ..ottt ee e ee et aaetn e s e es s 7
Section 10-2.1 Creation of Division of BUilding and Sfety..............cccoceiiiiiriiiiiiieisieeeeeieisee st eeeeneeness
Section 10-2.2 Powers and Duties of the Building Official.....

Section 10-2.3  Appointing AUtROTILY .........ooocoveeiiss e

Section 10-2.4 Custodian of Records ...........c.ccoucvovivvviveninn,

Section 10-2.5 Right of Entry ...ccooovvvvvceieiiciiicinioncnns

Section 10-2.6 Permits, Inspections and Fees.................

Section 10-2.7  Application for Permil...............c.c.ccccocovvivirivriroceerceinrnne

Section 10-2.7.1  Submittal DOCUMENLS................c.coooeeeeereericeieieeeeeseee e

Section 10-2.7.2  Construction Documents ................c................

SeCtion 10-2.7.3  PerMil PFOCESSING ..........cccccccovivimmniieiiiiseies ettt es s s st sttt en e e enenestee et esee e ss e e seeeeseseeenen
Section 10-2.7.4  Expiration of PLAR REVIEW .............couveiiiieiereeses oottt ev e oe e e es et es s es s
Section 10-2.7.5  Temporary StrucCtures.....cecvvereoneererenennn..

Section 10-2.7.6  Temporary POWer.........c.ccccoeeriverernivosineieriinn

Section 10-2.7.7  INSPECTIONS.......ccovoveirniiiviininercsisiesis e

Section 10-2.7.8  Service ULIlIties .........covoemeveeeeeeeccroieeer i

Section 10-2.7.9  Certficate of OCCUPANCY ......covveeeeeeeeieeienivin.

Section 10-2.8 VIOIALIONS ..ottt

Section 10-2.9 Stop Work Orders.......cocoueceveciinioioieeneeeees s

Section 10-2.10  ADGIEMENT OFAFS ...c.ovovveiiiiieirisiereeeeeeevee e

Abatement Procedures for Dangerous Buildings and Excavations
Costs of Abatement or Compliance; Tax Lien
Notice of NONCOMPIIANCE........c..cocooooviieiiiiricisiriesccinreies s

PUDLIC NUISANCE ...ttt v e as sttt ettt et st e e e eeeee e

Injunction...........ccccccvviivivinannnn.
Civil Remedies and Penalties

Section 10-2.18  SeVerability.........cccccooviieiviovciieiieeeeiceiec oo e
Section 10-2.19  Liability .....c..coocoiviieoiieeice oo,
Section 10-2.20  Limitations and Conflicts...........,
Section 10-2.21  Cooperation of Other Officials..........cc.ceovouvin..
Section 10-2.22  APPeals......c.ccocoivivveiineriiieeieiieieeeeee e
Section 10-2.23  Appeals Boards.........
Section 10-2.24  Appeals HEaring Fee............c.ccvuouieiviiiioeoeeeseeeeeeeeeseeis oo eeeeor e asea s
ARTICLE HI, PART I—PRIMARY BUILDING CODE .......cccovueiioiioeeessieirieeee e e teeeeeeeeeeev v er e eeeenerenee et 24
SeCtION 10-3.1 1 AOPHON ..ottt ettt ettt et et ee et r v sttt ettt e e eee e e s s 24
Section 10-3.1 2 AMENAMENLS ............cooiviiiiieriierioseiir ettt ettt s et er ettt ee oo s ets e reen 24-26
Section 10-3. 1 3 Exempt Accessory AGrictltural BUIIAINGS .............cccccoeviviisiviveeeisiceineeeceeoeeeeeee e es e 26
ARTICLE III, PART 2—PRIMARY RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE ........cccooooieecoirees oot ees oo 27
Section 10-3.2 1  Adoption ..o OO SO TR U PSR UP TR 27
SeCtion 10-3.2 2 AMEIAIMENLS .....c..cooiveeiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee e e e e e 27,28
ARTICLE HI, PART 3—PRIMARY GREEN CODE.......ccccocoiiiiiiieieeeeee oot ettt et e ev e ren oo 28

AOPIION oottt ettt er e 28



TABLE OF CONTENTS (cont.)
ARTICLE IV—PRIMARY ELECTRICAL CODE.

Section 10-4.1 AOPIION ...ttt bbbt b bbb bbbttt enere et enen b s
Section 10-4.2 AMENAMENES ....c.oivvovveeeiiricreeieeeeesesie e es s
Section 10-4.3 Connection to Electrical Installations
ARTICLE V—PRIMARY PLUMBING CODE..........ccoeiiiiie ittt see et r et et e e ts e s e e e e arevanee s 29
Section 10-5.1 AODHON ..ottt ettt s et e s s b st s e bt ee ettt ae e s et 29
Section 10-5.2 ATEIAIMERLS «...c.oivivioiesiric ettt ettt sttt et et et et es e st s e st st st s es s reateereseeameanerees et eeneeneeen 29,30
ARTICLE VI-—~PRIMARY MECHANICAL CODE.........cc..c..oooiiii oot ettt e et et e e et et e ntv e e s areaeareenn 30
Section 10-6 1 AOPIIOTL ..ottt bbb b et a e b eSSk r ettt se st eae s s tena o 30
Section 10-6 2 AIHEIAIMEIES .ooovivv ettt sttt et et ettt teeae et st et o2 st e eene e et et eeseteeeeeatentene e eeta et et eeeeertenneean 30
ARTICLE VII—PRIMARY HOUSING CODE..........ccoccoouiiiaieeieeieees oottt et es s et ar s e everae e eeeese e e e eeenenanen 31
Section 10-7 1 AODHON ... ivoiiietet ettt ettt e s e e es s sttt ea et ettt ettt s s ereennan s 31
Section 10-7 2 AEIUAIMEALS «.....ccoiiiiise ettt ettt st es et er sttt s st st e s e s e st erta s ts et sa s st ete st asas et ererteates 31
ARTICLE VIII—PRIMARY DANGERQUS BUILDINGS CODE.......cc.coovoooiiieieeiee oo eeeeee e aee e 31
Section 10-8 1 AGOPHION ..ottt et es ettt ettt ettt et ettt ettt 31
ARTICLE IX——RELOCATED BUILDINGS .........ccooiiiiooie oo et et r et e e e e et esae e e ervases e 31
Section 10-9 1 Permits REGUIFEA. ...........ccc.iiiiviiiieiiee ettt et e b sttt et ea ettt ese et s ess bt sten e 31,32
Section 10-92  AppliCQtions...........cccoooeveceiiinniceiesireens

Section 10-9 3 Investigation Fee
Section 10-94  Authorization to Proceed and Posting of Notices

Section 10-95  Reasons for Denial of Relocation Permit ...............ccoeeeevevieoneeraeeeean.s :
Section 10-9 6 PerfOrmance SECUTILY ...ttt et aas sttt ses bbb en b s et seas 32,33
Section 10-97 Protest Against Issuance of a ReloCAtion Permil..............cocvvvivoeivivivivnennniiieioosioisisss s sssosssessssssesssssssen - 33
ARTICLE X—GEOLOGIC HAZARDS .......ccccooirttiitieeieeceeisae ettt av st av e s ettt s e ts st eas st etese et s s etesestesestaeteas st esses b easetenean 33
Section 10-10 1 GENEFAL PYOVISIONS. ........ccouviiiueiiiittiei ettt ettt sttt bttt b ns st s b s 33
Section 10-10 2 TSI VESEA BIUJTS .ottt ettt eb et st s s st s n et eae s s v 33,34
Section 10-10 3 NAPLES BIUITS (..ot ettt e a st es vt s et ettt ettt s e e et een s 34
Section 10-10 4 Designated Soil CORIAMINALION AFEAS .......oo.cceiveiecieiiiiiiieieeie ettt eee ettt e 34
ARTICLE XI—SPECIAL PROBLEMS AREAS ..o oottt ere sttt ettt as ettt ea sttt 35
Section 10-11 1 GEREFAL ..ot bbb R b h sttt s e 35
Section 10-11 2 DEfIITHONS ... e e e et es st 35
Section 10-11 3 Powers and Duties of the Special Problems COMIMIIEE. ............oovivvriveirinericaisesnoninsesesreses s es e 35
Section 10-11 4 FOOS ..ot et b st e ettt ettt er et 36
ARTICLE XII— PRIMARY BUILDING STANDARDS ADMINISTRATIVE CODE .........ccoocoovivvciieieiiieeseeceeeris e, 36
Section 10-12 1 AOPIIOT ...ttt eSS bR r s bR s et b eba et n et 36
ARTICLE XIII—PRIMARY EXISTING BUILDING CODE ........c.cccccoouviiiiiiiieiiiieieiie ettt er s aran st ars s araesone 36
Section 10-13 1 AOPHON ...ttt et e b et e b ea bt s sttt 36
APPENDIX A TO CHAPTER 10.....ccccooiiiiioiiiinii ettt ettt ettt 1 st b et b sttt sen s eter s assstas st anseranserees 37
MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES........ccocovitiiitiiiisiritetet ettt stes vttt es st st et ansete e s teetetessates e s s s s etstsetsaas i 37,38



NOTICE OF EXEMPTION
TO: Santa Barbara County Clerk of the Board of Supervisors
FROM: Massoud Abolhoda, Building Official, Planning & Development

The project or activity identified below is determined to be exempt from further environmental review
requirements of the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) of 1970, as defined in the State and
County Guidelines for the implementation of CEQA.

APN: Countywide Case No.:110RD-00000-00033
Location: Countywide
Project Title: Building Ordinance Amendments

Project Description: Amendments to County Code Chapter 10 (Building Code) adopting specific local
geological, topographical and climatic findings to justify local adoption of the California Code of
Regulations commonly known as California Model Codes regulating building permitting and
construction requirements

Name of Public Agency Approving Project: County of Santa Barbara
Name of Person or Agency Carrying Out Project: County of Santa Barbara

Exempt Status: (Check one)
Ministerial
Statutory Exemption
X  Categorical Exemption
Emergency Project

Declared Emergency

Cite specific CEQA and/or CEQA Guideline Section: 15061(b)(3) (no possibility of a significant
Impact on the Environment)

Reasons to support exemption findings:

The ordinance amendments add specific local geological, topographical and climatic findings to
justify the local adoption of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations Part(s) 1 through 12
which regulate all public and private building construction in the State of California which became
effective statewide January 1, 2012, by operation of law. The inclusion of local findings does not
alter the local amendments that were previously found to have no significant environmental impact



Lead Agency Contact Person: Massoud Abodhoda, Building Official
Phone #: (805) 568-3120

Department/Division Representative: Date:

Acceptance Date:

distribution:  Hearing Support Staff

Project file
Date Filed by County Clerk:



BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
COUNTY OF SANTA BARBARA, CALIFORNIA

ORDINANCE NO. 4822

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF SANTA
BARBARA AMENDING AND ADOPTING CHAPTER 10 OF THE COUNTY CODE AS THE
BUILDING CODE OF THE COUNTY OF SANTA BARBARA

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Barbara finds and declares that there exist in
the certain areas of Santa Barbara County conditions and situations that require modification of
California codes for buildings and related construction, and further, that these conditions and
situations require specific legislative action to provide for the safety and health of the populace of
the County. The following Building Code of the County of Santa Barbara is adopted under authority
of Section 7 of Article XI of the State of California.

The Board of Supervisors hereby finds that following geological, topographical and climatic
conditions exist in the County of Santa Barbara necessitating enacting local amendments specifically
identified herein.

a) That Santa Barbara County is prone to extreme weather conditions, from hot, dry winds from the
east (Santa Ana and sundowner winds), to strong westerly (coastal) winds, which greatly enhance
the ability for fire to spread as reflected in devastating recent fires. In addition, the topographical
layout and features of the county make the area subject to isolation should a flood or earthquake
occur, which would prevent or severely limit and delay the north and south entities from giving or
receiving mutual aid and emergency assistance;

b) The present firefighting resources of this county are constrained in their efforts to control fires in
large unsprinklered buildings within the urban limit line and all buildings outside of the urban limit
line as designated in the county comprehensive plan;

¢) Geologic and topographic conditions in the county result in extended response times for firefighting
resources, which may contribute to greater life and property loss in large unsprinklered buildings
within the urban limit line and in all structures outside of the urban limit line; and

d) Climatic conditions and flammable vegetation contribute to the extreme high fire hazard severity in
the county, resulting in numerous wildland fires which draw existing fire department resources from
their structure protection areas for extended periods of time. This in turn extends response times,
which may contribute to greater life and property loss in large unsprinklered buildings within the
urban limit line and in all structures outside of the urban limit line.

e) That Santa Barbara County Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone and High Hazard Areas are more
accurately reflected on the “Santa Barbara County Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones Map in
Local Responsibility Area,” on file in the office of the State Fire Marshal and a map entitled “High
Fire Hazard Area Map” on file in the County of Santa Barbara Building & Safety Division of the
Planning & Development Department. That High Fire Hazard Area Map is to be considered a



g)

Wildland-Urban Interface Area. These maps are found to be more consistent with the recent Santa
Barbara Fires than those issued by the State Fire Marshal.

Historically, the area generally bounded as follows was subject to extreme wind and previously
designated as a Special Wind Region: on the east by a north-south line running through El Capitan
Point, on the north by the ridge of the Coast Range, on the west by the coast from the southerly
boundary of Vandenberg Air Force Base south to Point Conception, and on the south by the coast
line from Point Conception to El Capitan Point. The basic wind speed in this region for the purpose
of establishing wind loads must be considered to be 95 miles per hour (3 second gust).

Seismic shaking within the Santa Ynez Region of Santa Barbara County would most likely be
generated by movement along Los Alamos, Casmalia or Baseline faults. An event with a 10 percent
probability of occurrence in 50 years is estimated to generate a 6.63 maximum magnitude
earthquake with a peak ground acceleration of 0.41 g. The Orcutt region of Santa Barbara County
would be most likely affected by seismic activity along the Casmalia fault. An event with a 10
percent probability of occurrence in 50 years is estimated to generate a 7.81 maximum magnitude
earthquake with a peak ground acceleration of 0.30g. The area outside of, but in close proximity to,
the city of Santa Barbara would most likely be affected by movement along the Mission Ridge, Red
Mountain or Mesa-Rincon Creek faults. An event with a 10 percent probability of occurrence on 50
years is estimated to generate a 7.22 maximum magnitude earthquake with a peak ground
acceleration of 0.53g. As such, certain conventional framing detailing permitted in the California
Residential Code are deemed inappropriate for strong earthquake shaking that sites in Santa Barbara
County could experience and are not acceptable without further engineering analysis.

Further, the Board identifies the following sections in this ordinance non-administrative and local amendments
were deemed necessary based on the local geological, topographical and climatic identified above:

Article III, Part 1, Section 10-3.1.2.B,C,D, E, Fand H
Article I, Part 2, section 10-3.2.2.Bto L.

The International Model Codes adopted, as amended herein, include:

1.

Primary Building Code: California Building Code, Volumes 1 and 2, 2010 Edition, promulgated by
the California Building Standards Commission

Primary Electrical Code: California Electrical Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by the California
Building Standards Commission.

Primary Plumbing Code: California Plumbing Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by the California
Building Standards Commission.

Primary Mechanical Code: California Mechanical Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by the
California Building Standards Commission.

Primary Energy Code: California Energy Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by the California
Building Standards Commission.

Primary Building Standards Administrative Code: California Building Administrative Code,
Chapter 4, Articles 1 and 3, and Chapter 7, Article 21, 2010 edition, promulgated by the California
Building Standards Commission.

Primary Historical Building Code: California Historical Building Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated
by the California Building Standards Commission.



8. Primary Existing Building Code: California Existing Building Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by
the California Building Standards Commission.

9. Primary Housing Code: Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, published by the International
Conference of Building Officials (ICBO).

10. Primary Dangerous Building Code: Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997
Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials (ICBO).

L1. Primary Residential Code: California Residential Code, 2010 Edition, promulgated by the California
Building Standards Commission.

12. Primary Green Building Standards Code: California Green Building Standards Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission.

Therefore, together with local modifications to such codes and certain other provisions regulating
buildings and structures and the construction thereof, the Board of Supervisors of Santa Barbara
County amends and adopts Chapter 10 of the County Code of Santa Barbara County and ordains as
follows:

SECTION 1

Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

CHAPTER 10— BUILDING REGULATIONS

ARTICLE I—ADMINISTRATIVE

Section 10-1.1 Title

This Chapter shall be known as the County of Santa Barbara Building Code, and may be
cited as such, and is referred to herein as “this Code.” This chapter shall adopt certain State
and model codes by reference, together with amendments thereto, as published herein.
These referenced codes and amendments shall have the same force and effect as if fully set
forth herein.

Section 10-1.2 Purpose

The Board of Supervisors expressly finds that the purpose of this Code is to provide minimum
standards to safeguard life, limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling
the design, construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location, relocation and
maintenance of all buildings, structures and certain equipment specifically regulated herein,
within the County of Santa Barbara.

The purpose of this Code is not to create or otherwise establish or designate any particular class
or group of persons who will or should be especially protected or benefited by the terms of this
Code.



Section 10-1.3 Authority

This Code is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by Section 7 of Article XI of the State
constitution to a County to make and enforce such local, police, sanitary and other regulations as
are not in conflict with the general laws of the State. It is further adopted pursuant to the
applicable provisions of the State Housing Laws (Health and Safety Code Section 17910 et seq.,
and particularly Sections 17922 and 17958 thereof) and applicable rules and regulations
promulgated pursuant thereto as Title 24 and 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

Section 10-1.4 Scope

The provisions of this Code shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and
demolition of every building or structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such
buildings or structures and certain equipment specifically regulated herein.

Section 10-1.5 Applicability
A. This Code shall apply within all of the unincorporated territory of Santa Barbara County.
Exception:

Public projects located in a public way and not subject to County land use regulations; public
utility towers and poles; mechanical equipment not specifically regulated in this Code;
hydraulic flood control structures; and buildings and structures owned and constructed by a
Federal, State, or other agency whose authority preempts that of County government.

B. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair,
move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain any building or
structure in the County, or cause the same to be done, contrary to, or in violation of, any of the
provisions in this Code, and Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, the Uniform Housing
Code, the California Building Code, the California Plumbing Code, the California Mechanical
Code, the California Electrical Code and any other codes as adopted by this Code and the State
Housing Law.

Section 10-1.6 Intent

A. ltis the intent of this Article to provide administrative control over all of the applicable sections
of the adopted State and model codes even if these sections are not specifically identified in each
of the adopted codes.

B. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific
requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any specific case, different sections of this code
specify different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, the most restrictive
shall govern.

C. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state or federal
law.

D. References to chapter or section numbers, or to provisions not specifically identified by number,
shall be construed to refer to such chapter, section or provision of this code.



E. Whenever in this Code, except as stated in Article 1 Section 10-1.1, or in any of the codes
adopted by reference hereby, another code or publication of standards or of rules or regulations is
referred to, any language to the contrary notwithstanding, such reference shall not incorporate by
reference such other codes, standards, or rules or regulations as part of this Code or of any of the
codes adopted by reference hereby unless set out in full herein, but they shall be considered and
may be used by the Building Official as guides to assist in determining whether or not there has
been compliance with the provisions of this Code. The Building Official shall not be bound by
the provisions of any such other codes, standards, interpretations, or rules or regulations not
expressly adopted by reference in this Code in determining such compliance.

F. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, the
California Building Code or the California Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building
Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

ARTICLE II—ORGANIZATION AND ENFORCEMENT

Section 10-2.1 Creation of Division of Building and Safety

There is hereby contained within the County governmental structure the “Division of Building and
Safety” of Planning and Development, herein referred to as the “Building Division” which shall be
under the administrative jurisdiction of the Building Official as designated by the appointing authority.

Section 10-2.2 Powers and Duties of the Building Official

The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this Code and of
the codes adopted by reference herein. For such purpose, the Building Official shall have the power of
a law enforcement officer. The Building Official is hereby authorized to consult experts qualified in
fields related to the subject matter of this Code and codes adopted by reference herein as necessary to
assist him/her in carrying out his/her duties. The decisions of the Building Official in enforcing,
interpreting, or in exercising the authority delegated by the provisions of this Code and of the codes
adopted hereby shall be deemed final, subject to appeal as provided in Section 10-2.22 of this Code.

Section 10-2.3 Appointing Authority

The Director of Planning and Development of the County of Santa Barbara shall appoint the Building
Official and shall authorize the Building Official to appoint such number of officers, inspectors,
assistants and other employees for the Building Division as shall be authorized by the Board of
Supervisors from time to time. The Building Official may deputize such employees as may be
necessary to carry out the functions of the Building Division.

Section 10-2.4 Custodian of Records

The Building Official shall cause a permanent record to be kept of all permits and all other pertinent
transactions of the Building Division under this Code and the codes adopted hereby.



Section 10-2.5 Right of Entry

During the course of exercising the duties delegated to the Building Official in Section 10-2.2 of this
Code, and when, in the opinion of the Building Official, there exists a reason to believe that a violation
of this Code or due cause exists to inspect a property, the Building Official is hereby authorized to
enter such property or premises at any reasonable times and to inspect and perform any duty imposed
on him/her by the provisions of Section 10-2.2 of this Code or by other applicable law.

If such property or premises be occupied, the Building Official shall first present proper credentials to
the occupant and request entry, explaining his/her reasons therefore. If such entry is refused or cannot
be obtained because the owner or person having charge or control of the property cannot be located
after due diligence, the Building Official shall have recourse to every remedy provided by law to enter
and inspect the property. Notwithstanding the foregoing, if the Building Official has reasonable cause
to believe that there exists an unsafe, substandard, or dangerous condition within the building or
premises as to require immediate inspection to safeguard the public health or safety, he/she shall have
the right to immediately enter and inspect such property and may use any reasonable means required to
secure such entry and make such inspection, whether such property be occupied or unoccupied and
whether or not permission has been obtained. If the Building Official observes a violation of this Code
during the normal performance of his/her duties, he/she shall have the full right afforded by law to
enter the property to enforce the provisions of this Code.

Section 10-2.6 Permits, Inspections and Fees

A. Permits. The Building Official shall receive applications, review construction documents and
issue permits for the erection, and alteration, demolition and moving of buildings and structures,
inspect the premises for which such permits have been issued and enforce compliance with the
provisions of this code.

Exception:
a. Building: A building permit shall not be required for the following:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, patio covers,
playhouses, playground or athletic equipment and similar uses provided the floor area
does not exceed 120 square feet and does not exceed 12 feet in height.

2. Wood fences not over 8 feet high and fences of other materials not over 6 feet high,

measured from the lowest adjacent grade to the top of the fence on the side which yields

the greatest height, unless supporting a surcharge or structural element.

Oil derricks.

Movable cases, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches high.

Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet in height measured from the bottom of the

footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II or

1I-A liquids.

6. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the tank capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

7. Platforms, walks and wood decks not more than 30 inches above grade at any point and
not over any basement or story below, nor supporting any structure above.

8. Painting, papering, and similar finish work.

9. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

10. Window awnings supported completely by an exterior wall of Group R, Division 3, or
Group U, Division 1 Occupancies when projecting not more than 54 inches nor
encroaching into required yards.

oW

8



11.

12.
13.

14.

15.

Electrical: An electrical permit will not be required for the following:

L.

9.

Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R, Division 3 Occupancy that are
less than 24 inches deep, and the pool walls are entirely above the adjacent grade and the
capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,927L).

Readily removable plastic covered hoop structures without in ground footings or
foundations that are not more than 12" in height.

Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including
service systems.

Agricultural buildings not exceeding 3,000 square feet in floor area constructed and used
to house farm implements, equipment, hay, grain, poultry, livestock or horticultural
products. Such buildings shall not be a place of human habitation nor a place of
employment, nor shall such buildings be used by the public, be used to store hazardous
materials in violation of the Fire Code, nor contain plumbing, mechanical, electrical,
structural or architectural features that may reclassify the occupancy or the character of
the occupancy of said building as determined by the Building Official. See Section 10-3.3
of this Code.

Roofing repairs less than 100 square feet within a twelve month period.

Portable motors or other portable appliances energized by means of a cord or cable
having an attachment plug end to be connected to an approved receptacle when that cord
or cable is permitted by this Code.

Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers or approved fixed appliances of
same type and rating and in the same location.

Temporary decorative lighting energized by cord or cable having an attachment plug end
to be connected to an approved receptacle.

Reinstallations of attachment plug receptacles but not the outlets therefore.

Replacement of an over current device of the same capacity and in the same location.
Repair or replacement of electrodes or transformers of the same size and capacity for
approved signs or gas tube systems.

Removal of abandoned electrical wiring.

Electrical wiring, devices, appliance or equipment operating at less than 25 volts and not
capable of supplying more than 50 watts of energy.

Low-energy power, control and signal circuits of Class II and III as defined in this Code.

¢. Plumbing: A plumbing permit will not be required for the following:

L.

The stopping of leaks in drains, soil, waste or vent piping, provided that should any
concealed trap, drainpipe, soil, waste or vent pipe become defective and it becomes
necessary to remove and replace all or part thereof with new material, the same shall be
considered as new work, and a permit shall be obtained and inspections made, as
provided in this Code.

The clearing of stoppages, including the removal and reinstallation of water closets, or
the repair of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures, provided such repairs do not involve or
require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes, or fixtures; nor for the removal
and reinstallation of water closets, or the installation of new water closets.

d. Mechanical: A Mechanical Permit shall not be required for the following:

L.

A portable heating appliance, portable ventilating equipment, a portable cooling unit, or a
portable evaporative cooler.



2. A closed system of steam, hot or chilled water piping within heating or cooling
equipment, regulated by this Code.

3. Replacement of any component part or assembly of an appliance that does not alter its
original approval and complies with other applicable requirements of this Code.

4. Refrigerating equipment that is part of the equipment for which a permit has been issued
pursuant to the requirements of this Code.

5. A unit refrigerating system.

e. Repairs: A permit shall not be required for the following:

Ordinary repairs to structures, replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable
electrical equipment to approved permanently installed receptacles. Such repairs shall not
include the cutting away of any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of
any structural beam or load-bearing support, or the removal or change of any required means
of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the egress requirements nor shall
ordinary repairs include addition to, alteration of, replacement or relocation of any standpipe,
water supply, sewer, drainage, drain leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric
wiring or mechanical or other work affecting public health or general safety.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization
for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction

B. Permits Required: No person, firm, or corporation shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair,
move, improve, remove, convert or demolish any building or structure regulated by this Code, or
cause the same to be done, without first obtaining the necessary permits for each separate building
or structure from the Building Official.

1. Validity of permit. The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed to be a
permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this code or of any
other ordinance of the jurisdiction. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or
cancel the provisions of this code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be
valid. The issuance of a permit based on construction documents and other data shall not
prevent the Building Official from requiring the correction of errors in the construction
documents and other data. The Building Official is also authorized to prevent occupancy
or use of a structure where in violation of this code or of any other ordinances of this
jurisdiction.

2. Suspension or revocation. The Building Official is authorized to suspend or revoke a
permit issued under the provisions of this code wherever the permit is issued in error or
on the basis of incorrect, inaccurate or incomplete information, or in violation of any
ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this code.

3. Placement of permit. The building permit or copy shall be kept on the site of the work
until the completion of the project.

4. Permits transferable. Permits required by this Code may be transferred from the
original permitee to second parties when legal requirements have been satisfied, when
approved by the Building Official, and when applicable fees have been paid.

C. Expiration of Permits: Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this
Code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by such permit is
not commenced within one year from the date of issuance of such permit. If the work authorized
by such permit is started and then the work is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days or
longer, the work shall not be recommenced until a new permit is obtained by paying all applicable

10



fees currently in effect, provided that no revisions have been made to the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided that the suspension or abandonment of the work has not
exceeded one year. If the suspension or abandonment of the work has exceeded one year, a full
review of the project and a new permit shall be required.

. Permit Fees: Permit Fees shall be established through an ordinance adopted by the Board of
Supervisors as may be necessary from time to time.

. Emergency Permits: Emergency permits may be issued by the Building Official for any area of
work regulated by this Code when it is determined that the work is of an emergency nature and
failure to perform the work may be detrimental to the health, safety, or welfare of the occupants,
public, or the environment. Applications for emergency permits shall be filed no later than the next
business day from the date of commencement of emergency work. An emergency permit may also
require a land use permit.

Maintenance Permits: The Building Official may authorize the issuance of a maintenance permit
on an annual basis to any qualified person, firm, or corporation regularly engaged in the repair,
replacement of parts, or maintenance of existing electrical, plumbing, or mechanical systems
regulated by this Code. Maintenance permits shall not be construed to permit the installation of
new systems not previously authorized by a permit issued by the Building Official. Such
maintenance permit shall be valid only for work which is performed on a single work site.

The Building Official may also authorize the issuance of an annual contractor’s maintenance and
repair permit which shall entitle the permit holder to the same rights, privileges, and restrictions set
forth above, except that the issuance of such permit shall not restrict the permit holder to work
performed at a single work site.

The holder of a maintenance permit or contractor’s maintenance and repair permit shall report all
work performed under the permit to the Building Official on a monthly basis. All said work shall
be inspected by the Building Official not later than 10 days following the end of each calendar
month.

An annual issuance fee as specified in the current adopted fee schedule shall be collected by the
Building Official at the time of issuance of a maintenance permit. The Building Official shall bill
the permitee on a monthly basis for all inspection work performed under the maintenance permit at
an hourly rate as designated by resolution of the Board of Supervisors.

. Alternative Materials, Design and Methods of Construction and Equipment The provisions of
this code are not intended to prevent the installation of any material or to prohibit any design or
method of construction not specifically prescribed by this code, provided that any such
alternative has been approved. An alternative material, design or method of construction shall be
approved where the Building Official finds that the proposed design is satisfactory and complies
with the intent of the provisions of this code, and that the material, method or work offered is, for
the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this code in quality, strength,
effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety. A fee as stated in the current fee schedule shall
be submitted with the application for an Alternative Materials or Method of Construction request.

1. Research reports. Supporting data, where necessary to assist in the approval of materials
or assemblies not specifically provided for in this code, shall consist of valid research
reports from approved sources.

2. Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with the provisions of this
code, or evidence that a material or method does not conform to the requirements of this
code, or in order to substantiate claims for alternative materials or methods, the Building

11



Official shall have the authority to require tests as evidence of compliance to be made at
no expense to the jurisdiction. Test methods shall be as specified in this code or by other
recognized test standards. In the absence of recognized and accepted test methods, the
Building Official shall approve the testing procedures. Tests shall be performed by an
approved agency. Reports of such tests shall be retained by the Building Official for the
period required for retention of public records.

H. Modifications. Wherever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions
of this code, the Building Official shall have the authority to grant modifications for individual
cases, upon application of the owner or owner's representative, provided the Building Official
shall first find that special individual reason makes the strict letter of this code impractical and
the modification is in compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and that such
modification does not lessen health, accessibility, life and fire safety, or structural requirements.
The details of action granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the files of the
department of building safety.

Section 10-2.7 Application for Permit

To obtain a permit the applicant shall first file an application therefore in writing on a form furnished
by Planning and Development Department, Building and Safety Division for that purpose. Every
such application shall give such information as may be required by the Building Official, County
Agencies, or State Law.

Section 10-2.7.1 Submittal Documents

Plans, specifications, engineering calculations, diagrams, soil investigation reports, special
inspection and structural observation programs and other data shall constitute the submittal
documents and shall be submitted in one or more sets with each application for a permit. When such
plans are not prepared by an architect or engineer, the Building Official may require the applicant
submitting such plans or other data to demonstrate that state law does not require that the plans be
prepared by a licensed architect or engineer. The Building Official may require plans, computations
and specifications to be prepared and designed by an engineer or architect licensed by the state to
practice as such even if not required by state law. Computations, diagrams, schedules, soil reports,
geological or geotechnical reports, and other data sufficient to show the correctness and adequacy of
the plans shall be submitted when required by the Building Official.

Exception:

The Building Official may waive the submission of plans, calculations, construction inspection
requirements and other data if it is found that the nature of the work applied for is such that
reviewing of plans is not necessary to obtain compliance with this Code.

Section 10-2.7.2 Construction documents
Construction documents shall be in accordance with the following:

A. Information on Construction Documents. Construction documents shall be dimensioned and
drawn upon suitable material. Electronic media documents are permitted to be submitted when
approved by the Building Official.

12



Construction documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature and extent of
the work proposed and show in detail that it will conform to the provisions of this code and
relevant laws, ordinances, rules and regulations, as determined by the Building Official.

. Fire Protection System Shop Drawings. Shop drawings for the fire protection system(s) shall
be submitted to indicate conformance to this code and the construction documents and shall be
approved prior to the start of system installation. Shop drawings shall contain all information as
required by the referenced installation standards in Chapter 9 of the California Building Code.

. Means of Egress. The construction documents shall show in sufficient detail the location,
construction, size and character of all portions of the means of egress in compliance with the
provisions of this code. In other than occupancies in Groups R-2, R-3, and I-1, the construction
documents shall designate the number of occupants to be accommodated on every floor, and in
all rooms and spaces.

. Exterior Wall Envelope. Construction documents for all buildings shall describe the exterior
wall envelope in sufficient detail to determine compliance with this code. The construction
documents shall provide details of the exterior wall envelope as required, including flashing,
intersections with dissimilar materials, corners, end details, control joints, intersections at roof,
eaves or parapets, means of drainage, water-resistive membrane and details around openings.

The construction documents shall include manufacturer's installation instructions that provide
supporting documentation that the proposed penetration and opening details described in the
construction documents maintain the weather resistance of the exterior wall envelope. The
supporting documentation shall fully describe the exterior wall system which was tested, where
applicable, as well as the test procedure used.

. Site Plan. The Construction Documents submitted in accordance with Section 10-2.7.2 of this

Code shall be accompanied by a Site Plan, drawn to scale, showing the size and location of all
proposed construction, all existing structures on the site, including the Point of Connection to the
Public or Private Sewer System, Public or Private Water Supply and all other serving utilities,
distances between proposed and existing structures, from proposed structures to property lines
and the established street grades and proposed finished grades. Site Plans shall also include the
location of all recorded easements along with the easement descriptions. When applicable, Site
Plans shall also indicate flood hazard areas, design flood elevations, floodways, and design flood
elevations, including finish floor elevations of the lowest habitable floor.

When required by the Building Official, a survey of the lot shall be performed to assure that a
structure is located in accordance with the requirements of this Code, and/or is situated with
respect to Mean Sea Level such that it complies with regulations governing construction in
flood-prone areas.

Examination of Documents. When documents are required precedent to the issuance of a
permit and those documents have been confirmed, by review, to comply with the requirements of
this Code, the Building Official shall endorse, or cause to be endorsed, in writing or stamp on
both sets of plans and specifications "APPROVED." Such approved plans and specifications
shall not be changed, modified, or altered without authorization from the Building Official, and
all work regulated by this Code shall be done in accordance with the approved plans.

The Building Official may issue a permit for the construction of part of a building or structure
before the entire plans and specifications for the whole building or structure have been submitted
or approved provided adequate information and detailed statements have been found complying

13



with all pertinent requirements of this Code. The holder of such permit shall proceed at his/her
own risk without assurance that the permit for the entire building or structure will be granted.

. Approval of Construction Documents. When the Building Official issues a permit, the
construction documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, as "APPROVED” One set of
construction documents so reviewed shall be retained by the Building Official, one set shall be
returned to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of work and shall be open to inspection by the
Building Official or a duly authorized representative. A third set shall be forwarded to the Santa
Barbara County Tax Assessor’s office.

. Previous Approvals. This code shall not require changes in the approved construction
documents, construction or designated occupancy of a structure for which a lawful permit has
been heretofore issued or otherwise lawfully authorized, and the construction of which has been
pursued in good faith and has not been abandoned.

Phased Approval. The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of
foundations or any other part of a building or structure before the construction documents for the
whole building or structure have been submitted, provided that adequate information and
detailed statements have been filed complying with pertinent requirements of this code. The
holder of such permit for the foundation or other parts of a building or structure shall proceed at
the holder's own risk with the building operation and without assurance that a permit for the
entire structure will be granted.

Design Professional in Responsible Charge. When it is required that documents be prepared
by a registered design professional, the Building Official shall be authorized to require the owner
to engage and designate on the building permit application a registered design professional who
shall act as the registered design professional in responsible charge. If the circumstances require,
the owner shall designate a substitute registered design professional in responsible charge who
shall perform the duties required of the original registered design professional in responsible
charge. The Building Official shall be notified in writing by the owner if the registered design
professional in responsible charge is changed or is unable to continue to perform the duties. The
registered design professional in responsible charge shall be responsible for reviewing and
coordinating submittal documents prepared by others, including phased and deferred submittal
items, for compatibility with the design of the building.

. Deferred Submittals. For the purposes of this section, deferred submittals are defined as those
portions of the design that are not submitted at the time of the application and that are to be
submitted to the Building Official within a specified period. Deferral of any submittal items shall
have the prior approval of the Building Official. The registered design professional in
responsible charge shall list the deferred submittals on the construction documents for review by
the Building Official. Documents for deferred submittal items shall be submitted to the registered
design professional in responsible charge who shall review them and forward them to the
Building Official with a notation indicating that the deferred submittal documents have been
reviewed and been found to be in general conformance to the design of the building. The
deferred submittal items shall not be installed until the deferred submittal documents have been
approved by the Building Official.

. Amended Construction Documents. Work shall be installed in accordance with the approved
construction documents, and any changes made during construction that are not in compliance
with the approved construction documents shall be resubmitted for approval as an amended set
of construction documents.

14



M. Retention of Construction Documents. One set of approved construction documents shall be
retained by the Building Official as required by state or local laws.

Section 10-2.7.3 Permit Processing

The Building Official shall examine or cause to be examined applications for permits and
amendments thereto within a reasonable time after filing. If the application or the construction
documents do not conform to the requirements of pertinent laws, the Building Official shall reject
such application and provide a written checklist to the applicant, stating the reasons therefore. If the
Building Official is satisfied that the proposed work conforms to the requirements of this code and
laws and ordinances applicable thereto, the Building Official shall issue a permit therefore as soon as
practicable.

A. Building Permit Issuance: The Building Official may require approval by other governmental
agencies prior to issuance of a building permit, including water and sewer districts.

B. Designated Special Problems Areas: Building or grading permits for buildings and structures
proposed for construction in a designated Special Problems Area shall not be issued until the plans
and specifications have been reviewed and approved by the Special Problems Committee pursuant
to Article XI of this Code.

C. Rezoning: If buildings or structures for which a permit is applied under this Code are to be
located on property subject to an resolution pending before the Board of Supervisors initiating a
rezoning, a permit shall not be issued while the proceedings are pending on such rezoning unless
the proposed buildings or structures would conform to both the existing zoning of such property
and the said rezoning initiated by the Board of Supervisors unless a Preliminary Development Plan
was approved by the Board of Supervisors before the adoption of said resolution.

Section 10-2.7.4 Expiration of Plan Review

Applications for which no permit is issued within 365 days following the date of application shall
expire by limitation, and plans and other data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the
applicant or destroyed by the Building Official. Upon written request by the applicant, a plan review
application may be extended by the Building Official for an additional 180 day period, provided that
no code changes have occurred within 365 days of the initial plan review application.

Unless specifically authorized by the Building Official, and documented as to cause, no application
shall be extended more than once.

Section 10-2.7.5 Temporary Structures

The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary structures and temporary uses.
Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, but shall not be permitted for more than 180 days.
The Building Official is authorized to grant extensions for demonstrated cause.

Temporary structures and uses shall conform to the structural strength, fire safety, means of egress,
accessibility, light, ventilation and sanitary requirements of this code as necessary to ensure public
health, safety and general welfare.

The Building Official is authorized to terminate such permit for a temporary structure or use and to
order the temporary structure or use to be discontinued.

15



Section 10-2.7.6 Temporary Power

The approval of temporary power is intended for the purpose of facilitating construction activities
and/or temporary occupancy not to exceed 365 days.

The Building Official may authorize temporary connection or disconnection of power as part of an
electric installation of approved projects before such installation has been fully completed and the
final certificate of completion has been issued. The part covered by the temporary certificate shall
comply with the requirements specified for temporary lighting, heat or power in the California
Electrical Code.

The Building Official is authorized to terminate such permit for temporary power and to order the
temporary power supply to be discontinued.

Section 10-2.7.7 Inspections

A.

Inspections. The Building Official shall make all of the required inspections, or the Building
Official shall have the authority to accept reports of inspection by approved agencies or
individuals. Reports of such inspections shall be in writing and be certified by a responsible
officer of such approved agency or by the responsible individual. The Building Official is
authorized to engage such expert opinion as deemed necessary to report upon unusual technical
issues that arise, subject to the approval of the appointing authority.

General All construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by
the Building Official to ensure compliance with the requirements of this Code and all such
construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes until approved
by the Building Official.

Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation of the
provisions of this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction
shall not be valid.

It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain accessible and exposed
for inspection purposes. Neither the Building Official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for
expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to allow inspection.

Setback and Height Certification At the discretion of the Building Official, a survey by a
licensed land surveyor shall be performed to verify that the building or structure is located in
accordance with the approved plans and does not exceed the approved building height as shown
on the approved plans.

Preliminary Inspection. Before issuing a permit, the Building Official is authorized to examine
or cause to be examined buildings, structures and sites for which an application has been filed.

Required Inspections. Where required by Section 10-2.7.7(A) and upon notification by the
permit holder, the Building Official shall make inspections as set forth below:

1. Footing and foundation inspection. Footing and foundation inspections shall be made
after excavations for footings are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place.
For concrete foundations, any required forms shall be in place prior to inspection.
Materials for the foundation shall be on the job, except where concrete is ready mixed in
accordance with ASTM C 94, the concrete need not be on the job.

16



2. Concrete slab and under-floor inspection. Concrete slab and under-floor inspections
shall be made after in-slab or under-floor reinforcing steel and building service
equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary equipment items are in place,
but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including the subfloor.

3. Lowest floor elevation. In flood hazard areas, upon placement of the lowest floor,
including the basement, and prior to further vertical construction, the elevation
certification required in Section 1612.5 of the California Building Code shall be
submitted to the Building Official.

4. Frame inspection. Framing inspections shall be made after the roof deck or sheathing, all
framing, fire blocking and bracing are in place and pipes, chimneys and vents to be
concealed are complete and the rough electrical, plumbing, heating wires, pipes and ducts
are approved.

5. Lath and gypsum board inspection. Lath and gypsum board inspections shall be made
after lathing and gypsum board, interior and exterior, is in place, but before any
plastering is applied or gypsum board joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

6. Fire- and smoke-resistant penetrations. Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-
resistance-rated assemblies, smoke barriers and smoke partitions shall not be concealed
from view until inspected and approved.

7. Energy efficiency inspections. Inspections shall be made to determine compliance with
the currently adopted California Energy Code and shall include, but not be limited to,
inspections for: envelope insulation R- and U-values, fenestration U-value, duct system
R-value, and HVAC and water-heating equipment efficiency.

8. Other inspections. In addition to the inspections specified above, the Building Official is
authorized to make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this code and other laws that are enforced by the
Division of Building and Safety.

9. Special inspections. For special inspections, see Section 1704 of the California Building
Code.

10. Final inspection. There shall be a final inspection and approval on all buildings when
completed and ready for occupancy. An approval for occupancy and the issuance of a
clearance by the Building Official for the connection of utilities to any building or
structure shall be contingent upon compliance with provisions of this Code and any other
applicable laws and ordinances.

F. Inspection Agencies. The Building Official is authorized to accept reports of approved
inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to qualifications and
reliability.

G. Inspection Requests. It shall be the responsibility of the owner or person doing work authorized
by a permit to notify the Building Official by telephone, orally, or in writing when said work is
ready for inspection. Such notification shall be given at least one working day before such
inspection is desired.

The Building Official shall have authority to remove, or to require the removal of, any
obstruction which prevents the required inspection of any portion of a building, structure, wiring,
plumbing, ductwork, electrical, or mechanical equipment, as necessary to verify compliance with
this Code and the approved drawings.

17



H. Approvals Required. Work shall not be done on any part of a building or structure beyond the
point indicated in each successive inspection without first obtaining the written approval of the
Building Official. Such written approval shall be given only after an inspection has been made
of each successive step in the construction as indicated by each of the inspections required in
section 10-2.7.7 of this Code and by other applicable laws and ordinances.

Section 10-2.7.8 Service Utilities

A. Connection of service utilities. No person shall make connections from a utility, source of energy,
fuel or power to any permanent or temporary building or system that is regulated by this code for
which a permit is required, until approved by the Building Official.

B. Authority to Disconnect Utilities. The Building Official or his authorized representative shall
have the authority to disconnect any utility service or energy supplied to a building, structure or
building service therein regulated by this Code, or the referenced technical codes, in case of
emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property.

The Building Official shall, whenever possible, notify the serving utility, the owner and the
occupants of the building or structure of the decision to disconnect prior to taking such action,
and shall notify such serving utility, owner and occupants of the building or structure, in writing,
of such disconnection immediately thereafter.

C. Connection after Order of Disconnection. No person shall make connections from any energy,
power or fuel supply, nor supply energy or fuel to any building service equipment which has
been disconnected or ordered to be disconnected by the Building Official or the use of which has
been ordered discontinued by the Building Official until the Building Official authorizes the
reconnection and use of such equipment.

Section 10-2.7.9 Certificate of Occupancy

A. Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no change in the
existing occupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be made, until
the Building Official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefore as provided herein. Issuance
of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions
of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction.

Exception:

Certificates of occupancy are not required for work exempt from permits under Section 10-
2.6.1

B. Certificate Issued. After the Building Official inspects the building or structure and finds no
violations of the provisions of this Code, including type of occupancy and use of the building, or
other laws or regulations enforced by the code enforcement agency, the Building Official shall
issue a Certificate of Occupancy which shall contain the following:

1. The number of the building permit.

2. The address of the building.

3. The name and mailing address of the owner.

4. The name and mailing address of the tenant.

5. A description of that portion of the building, including floor area (in square feet) for
which the certificate is issued.

18



6. A statement that the described portion of the building has been inspected for compliance
with this Code for the group and division of occupancy and the use for which the
designated occupancy is classified.

7. 'The name of the Building Official.

8. The date that the Certificate of Occupancy was issued.

The Certificate of Occupancy shall run concurrently with the tenancy of the building.
Subsequent tenants shall be required to obtain a Certificate of Occupancy in their name.

C. Temporary or Partial Certificate. Upon written request by the owner and if the Building
Official finds that no substantial hazard will result from occupancy of any building or portion
thereof before the entire building is completed, a Temporary or Partial Certificate of Occupancy
may be issued for a portion or portions of the building. Such Temporary or Partial Certificate must
include compliance with this Code for all required access and exiting systems, toilet facilities and
fire protection equipment and systems.

Upon completion of the entire structure all Temporary or Partial Certificates shall be surrendered
to the Building Official in exchange for a final Certificate of Occupancy.

D. Revocation. The Building Official is authorized to, in writing, suspend or revoke a certificate of
occupancy, a temporary certificate of occupancy or completion issued under the provisions of
this code wherever the certificate is issued in error, or on the basis of incorrect information
supplied, or where it is determined that the building or structure or portion thereof is in violation
of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this code.

Section 10-2.8 Violations

A. It shall be unlawful, for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair,
move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain any building or
structure in the County of Santa Barbara, or cause the same to be done, contrary to, or in violation
of, any of the provisions of this Code and Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, the
Uniform Housing Code, the California Building Code, any of the other codes adopted by this
Code, the State Housing Law, any order of the Building Official, or of the conditions of any permit
issued hereunder. Whenever work for which a building permit is required by this code and has
commenced without first obtaining said permit, an additional penalty fee equal to all applicable
permit fees up to $2,000.00 shall be assessed. The payment of such fees shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by
law.

B. The issuance of a permit or the approval of plans and specifications shall not be construed to
authorize any violation of the provisions of this Code or Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County
Code, The California Codes, the State Housing Law, or permit conditions applied by other County
agencies. No permit presuming to give authority to violate the provisions of this Code or Chapter
14 of the Santa Barbara County Code or the State Housing Law, shall be valid, except insofar as
the work or use which it authorized is lawful.

C. The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans and specifications shall not prevent the
Building Official from thereafter requiring the correction of errors in said plans and specifications
or from suspending construction operations when in violation of this Code or Chapter 14 of the
Santa Barbara County Code the California Codes or the State Housing Law or Ordinance, or from
revoking any certificate of occupancy when issued in error.

19



Section 10-2.9 Stop Work Orders

Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this Code, or any of the codes adopted
by reference herein, or any specific conditions placed on the permit, the Building Official may order
the work stopped by written notice served on any person or persons performing such work, or causing
such work to be done. Any such person or persons shall forthwith stop such work until authorized by
the Building Official to proceed.

Section 10-2.10 Abatement Orders

When any structure or site is being used or constructed in violation of this Code or Chapter 14 of the
Santa Barbara County Code, or any of the codes adopted by reference herein, the Building Official
may order such use or construction discontinued and the structure or portions thereof vacated by a
written notice served on any person or persons causing such use. Such person or persons shall
discontinue the use within the specified time as indicated on the notice. After receipt of such notice,
such person or persons shall abate the violations or cause the building or structure to be demolished or
removed.

Section 10-2.11 Abatement Procedures for Dangerous Buildings and Excavations

A. The Building Official shall inspect or cause to be inspected a building, structure or excavation
where reasonable suspicion exists that said building, structure or excavation may be substandard,
unsafe, or used in violation of this Code, the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings, the Uniform Housing Code, or any of the codes adopted by reference herewith.

B. If, after inspecting the building, structure, or excavation, the Building Official determines that said
building, structure, or excavation is unsafe, substandard, or used in violation of this Code or any of
the codes adopted by reference herein, the Building Official shall give a written Notice and Order
to the owner, tenant, or user of the building or property pursuant to the provisions of the Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings or the Uniform Housing Code. If the Building
Official finds that certain electrical, plumbing, mechanical, excavation or structural systems pose
an immediate hazard to life and property, the Building Official may order such systems
disconnected, removed, or abated immediately.

C. If a Notice and Order must be served upon the owner, tenant, or user of the building or structure,
the Building Official shall assess the owner, tenant, or user of the building or structure all
applicable fees required to cover expenses by the County in the processing of the Notice and Order
to abate. Such processing fee shall be calculated at a rate as designated by resolution of the Board
of Supervisors.

D. Buildings damaged by fire or by natural disasters where the extent of damage to the building
exceeds 75 percent of the valuation of the building prior to the disaster shall comply with the
requirements of this Code.

Section 10-2.12 Costs of Abatement or Compliance; Tax Lien

A. Any person, whether as principal, agent, employee, or otherwise, who maintains any premises in
violation of any provision of this Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, any of the
adopted California Codes, or the State Housing Law shall be liable for and obligated to pay to the
County all costs incurred by the County in obtaining abatement or compliance which is attributable
to or associated with the enforcement or abatement action, whether such action is administrative,

20



injunctive, or legal, and for all damages suffered by the County, its agents, officers, and employees
as a result of such violation or efforts to abate the violation.

B. If the owner of the property involved in such abatement or compliance action fails to pay for the
costs of such abatement or compliance action upon demand by the County, the Board of
Supervisors by resolution may order the cost of the abatement to be specially assessed against the
parcel. Such assessment shall be collected at the same time and in the same manner as ordinary
County taxes are collected and shall be subject to the same penalties and the same procedure and
sale in case of the delinquency as are provided for ordinary County taxes.

Section 10-2.13 Notice of Noncompliance

Whenever the Building Official determines that work has been done without the required permits, or
has not been completed in accordance with the requirements of this Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa
Barbara County Code, the State Housing Laws, or any other code adopted herein, the Building Official
may cause a Notice of Noncompliance to be recorded with the County Recorder and shall notify the
owner of the property of such action. The Notice of Noncompliance shall describe the property, shall
set forth the non-complying conditions, and shall state that the owner of such property has been duly
notified. The Building Official shall record a notice of release of the Notice of Noncompliance with the
County Recorder when it has been determined by the Building Official that the non-complying
conditions have been corrected.

Section 10-2.14 Public Nuisance

Buildings or structures, or portions thereof, regulated by this Code which are unsafe, or not provided
with adequate egress, or which constitute a fire hazard, or which are determined substandard under the
provisions of the Uniform Housing Code, the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings, or the State Housing Law, or which are otherwise dangerous to human life, or which
constitute a hazard to health, safety or public welfare by reason of inadequate maintenance,
dilapidation, damage, obsolescence, or abandonment as specified in this Code, or any other effective
ordinance, shall be declared unsafe buildings and shall be declared public nuisances and shall be
ordered abated by repair, rehabilitation, removal, or demolition pursuant to the provisions of this Code.
Public nuisances, as determined by the provisions of this section, shall require abatement under the
provisions of Section 10-2.11 of this Code.

Section 10-2.15 Actions, Violations and Penalties

A. Any person, firm or corporation, whether as principal, agent, employee, or otherwise who violates
any of the provisions of this Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, or any other
code adopted by reference herein is guilty of a crime. The offense may be filed either as an
infraction or a misdemeanor at the discretion of the District Attorney.

B. If filed as an infraction and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a fine not to
exceed $100.00 for a first violation, a fine not to exceed $200.00 for a second violation of the same
code provision within a period of one year, and a fine not to exceed $500.00 for each additional
violation of the same code provision within one year.

C. If filed as a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a fine of
not less than $500.00 nor more than $25,000, or imprisonment in the County jail for a period not to
exceed 90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment, except that where such prior convictions,

21



as either infractions or misdemeanors, are alleged in the accusatory pleading, and either admitted
by the defendant in open court, or found to be true by a jury trying the case, or by the court in a
case where guilt is established by a plea of guilty or nolo contender, or by trial by the court sitting
without a jury, the punishment shall be a fine of not less than $1,000 nor more than $25,000, or
imprisonment in the County jail for a period not to exceed 180 days, or by both such fine and
imprisonment.

D. A person shall be guilty of a separate and distinct offense for each and every day, or portion
thereof, during which any violation of this Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, or
any of the codes adopted by reference herein is committed, continued, or permitted.

Section 10-2.16 Injunction

A. When the Building Official determines that a person is engaged in, or is about to engage in any act
or acts which constitute a violation of the provisions of this Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara
County Code, the State Housing Law, any code hereby adopted, or any regulation, permit,
covenant, standard, requirement, or other order issued, promulgated, or executed there under, the
County District Attorney or County Counsel may make application to the Superior Court for an
order enjoining such acts or practices, or for an order directing compliance, and, upon a showing
that such person has engaged in or is about to engage in any such acts or practices, a temporary
injunction, restraining order or other order may be granted.

B. In a civil action brought pursuant to this Code in which a temporary restraining order, temporary
injunction, or permanent injunction is sought, it shall not be necessary to allege or prove at any
stage of the proceeding that irreparable damage will occur should the temporary restraining order,
preliminary injunction, or permanent injunction not be issued, or that the legal remedies are
inadequate.

Section 10-2.17 Civil Remedies and Penalties

A. General: Any person, whether acting as a principal, agent, employee, or otherwise who willfully
maintains a substandard, hazardous, or other nonconforming structure or use in violation of this
Code, Chapter 14 of the Santa Barbara County Code, the State Housing Law, any code hereby
adopted, or of any rule, regulation, order, or permit issued there under shall be liable for a civil
penalty not to exceed $25,000 for each day the violation continues to exist.

B. Penalty Assessment Procedure: In determining the amount of civil penalty to assess, the court
shall consider all relevant circumstances, including, but not limited to, the extent of the harm
caused by the conduct constituting the violation; the nature and persistence of such conduct; the
length of time over which the conduct occurred; the net worth of the person(s) responsible, whether
corporate or individual; any corrective action taken by the persons responsible; and the cooperation
or lack thereof in the public efforts toward abatement.

C. Remedies Not Exclusive: The remedies or penalties provided by this Code are cumulative to each
other and to other remedies or penalties available under all other laws of this State and shall not be
construed to restrict any remedy provided by law.

D. Administrative Fine: Pursuant to Chapter 24A of the Santa Barbara County Code, an
administrative fine may be imposed for any violation of this Chapter. The amount of said
administrative fine and the procedures for the imposition of said fine shall be as specified in
Chapter 24A.

22



Section 10-2.18 Severability

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Code or the application thereof to any
person or circumstance is for any reason held to be unconstitutional or invalid, such decision shall not
affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Code or the application of such provisions to other
persons or circumstances. The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would have approved this
Code or any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase hereto, irrespective of the fact that any one
or more sections, subsection, sentences, clauses or phrases should be declared to be unconstitutional.

Section 10-2.19 Liability

A. It is the intent of the Board of Supervisors to establish minimum standards for the protection of the
health, safety, and welfare of the public. This Code shall not be construed to establish standards of
performance, strength, or durability other than those specified. This Code, nor any of the services
rendered in connection with its terms by County officers, inspectors, agents, or employees is
intended, nor shall be construed as the basis, for any expressed or implied warranties or guarantees
to any person relative to, or concerning any structure or part, portion or appurtenances thereto or
thereof constructed, erected, altered, enlarged, repaired, moved, replaced or removed pursuant to
this Code or any permits granted hereunder. No cause of action shall arise in favor of any person
against the County or any of its officers, inspectors, agents, or employees because any structure or
portion thereof erected, altered, enlarged, repaired, moved, replaced, or removed, or any
appurtenance, system, wiring, plumbing, mechanical equipment, devices, or appliances installed,
maintained, repaired, or replaced hereunder, do not meet the standards prescribed herein.

B. The Building Official, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his/her duties,
shall thereby not render him/herself personally liable for any damage that may occur to persons or
property as a result of any act or by reason of any act or omission in the discharge of his/her duties.
Any suit brought against the Building Official or employees of the Building Division because of
any act or omission performed by such in the enforcement of the provisions of such codes or other
pertinent laws or ordinances implemented through the enforcement of this Code, or enforced by the
code enforcement agency, shall be defended by the County until final termination of such
proceedings and any judgment resulting there from shall be assumed by the County.

Section 10-2.20 Limitations and Conflicts

The provisions of this Code shall not be construed to conflict with the provisions of the State Housing
Law, nor any other provisions of State or Federal laws. The requirements of this Code or the codes
adopted hereby which are more restrictive than applicable Federal or State laws shall be deemed
supplementary and additional thereto.

Section 10-2.21 Cooperation of Other Officials

The Building Official may request and shall receive so far as may be necessary in the discharge of
his/her duties the assistance and cooperation of other officials of the County.

Section 10-2.22 Appeals

Appeals from decisions, interpretations, or acts of the Building Official, or of the Special Problems
Committee pursuant to this Code, shall be filed in writing with the Board of Building Appeals or the
Board of Disabled Access Appeals as applicable. Such appeals shall be filed within 15 days of the act

23



by the Building Official or Special Problems Committee as applicable. Such Board of Building
Appeals or Board of Disabled Access Appeals is hereby expressly declared to be the Local Appeals
Board referred to in Sections 17920.5 and 17925 of the Health and Safety Code. Such Board of
Building Appeals or Board of Disabled Access Appeals is hereby authorized to hear appeals regarding
the building requirements of the County and shall have all of the power and authority conferred on a
Local Appeals Board under the said sections of the Health and Safety Code.

Section 10-2.23 Appeals Boards

A. Board of Building Appeals. General: In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this
code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals shall be
appointed by the governing body and shall hold office at its pleasure. The Board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business.

B. Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of
this code or the rules legally adopted hereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of
this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
Board shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

C. Qualifications. The Board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience and
training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employees of the
jurisdiction.

D. Board of Disabled Access Appeals: The Board of Disabled Access Appeals shall consist of three
members of the disabled community appointed by the Building Official to such terms of office as
determined by the Building Official. The Building Official or his/her representative shall be an ex-
officio member without voting rights. The Board of Disabled Access Appeals shall appoint a
chairperson and shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations governing the conduct of its business.

Section 10-2.24 Appeals Hearing Fee

Fees as specified in the current adopted fee schedule shall be paid to the Building Official at the time
of application for a hearing before the Board of Building Appeals or Board of Disabled Access
Appeals.

ARTICLE 11, PART 1—PRIMARY BUILDING CODE

Section 10-3.1.1 Adoption

That certain building code known and designated as the California Building Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130,
Sacramento, California 95833-2936, based on the 2009 edition of the International Building Code,
published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL.
60478-5771, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary Building Code of the County and made a
part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety
and welfare of the public.

Section 10-3.1.2 Amendments

A. Chapter 2 of the California Building Code (Definitions) is hereby amended by adding the
following definition:

24



Greenhouse is a commercial or agricultural structure designed to house, shelter or shade live
plants for commercial purposes.

. Section 702A of the California Building Code (Definitions) is hereby amended to read as follows:

Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone is an area shown as “Santa Barbara County
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones Map in Local Responsibility Area”, on file in the office of
the State Fire Marshal, herein designated and based on the recommendation of the CDF Director
pursuant to Government Code Sections 51177(c), 51178, and 5118 and where the County of Santa
Barbara is responsible for fire protection.

. Section 702A of the California Building Code (Definitions) is hereby amended by adding the
following definitions

High Fire Hazard Area is an area of the County of Santa Barbara designated by the Building
Official as having a high propensity for wild fire due to the existence of excessive wild brush fuel,
lack of adequate water for fire suppression, or lack of adequate access to firefighting equipment
and is shown on a map entitled “High Fire Hazard Area Map” on file in the County of Santa
Barbara Building and Safety Division of the Planning and Development Department. This area is
to be considered a Wildland-Urban Interface Area.

. Section 701A.3 of the California Building Code is hereby amended as follows:

New buildings, additions, alterations, and repairs located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or any
Wildland-Urban Interface Areas designated by the enforcing agency constructed after the
application date shall comply with the provisions of this chapter.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings of an accessory character classified as a Group U occupancy and not exceeding
120 square feet in floor area, when located at least 30 feet from an applicable building.

2. Buildings of an accessory character classified as Group U occupancy of any size located
at least 50 feet from an applicable building

3. Buildings classified as a Group U Agricultural Building, as defined in Section 202 of this
code (see also Appendix C — Group U Agricultural Buildings), when located at least 50
feet from an applicable building.

. Sections 1505.1.1, 1505.1.2, 1505.1.3 and 1505.1.4 of the California Building Code are hereby
amended to include the following: Use of Wood roofing materials is prohibited.

Exception:

Approved Class A or B fire-retardant-treated wood roofing materials are permitted to effect
repairs for roofs of similar existing wood roofing material where such repairs do not exceed
25 percent of the existing roof area within any given 12 month period.

. Section 1505.1.4 is hereby amended to include the following: Roofing for structures in a Wildland-
Urban Interface Fire Area shall be class A or B roofing assemblies.

. Section 1607.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to include the following:

1. Live loads posted. Where the live loads for which each floor or portion thereof of a
commercial or industrial building is or has been designed to exceed 50 psf (2.40 kN/m?),
such design live loads shall be conspicuously posted by the owner in that part of each
story in which they apply, using durable signs. It shall be unlawful to remove or deface
such notices.

25



2. Snow Load Posting. [OSHPD 3] Snow loads used in design shall be posted as for live
loads.

3. Issuance of certificate of occupancy. A certificate of occupancy required by Section
111 shall not be issued until the floor load signs, required by Section 106.1, have been
installed.

4. Restrictions on loading. It shall be unlawful to place, or cause or permit to be placed, on
any floor or roof of a building, structure or portion thereof, a load greater than is
permitted by this code.

H. The California Building Code is hereby amended by assigning a basic wind speed of 95 miles per
hour (3 second gust), to the region of the County generally bounded as follows: on the east by a
north-south line running through El Capitan Point, on the north by the ridge of the Coast Range, on
the west by the coast from the southerly boundary of Vandenberg Air Force Base south to Point
Conception, and on the south by the coast line from Point Conception to El Capitan Point.

I The following Appendix Chapters, or parts of Appendix Chapters, of the California Building Code
are hereby adopted:

Appendix Chapter C as amended in item K below

J. Section C102.1 (General) of Appendix Chapter C, Agricultural Buildings of the California
Building Code is hereby amended by adding the following paragraph:

Greenhouses shall not be used for retail sales, offices, packing sheds, workshops, storage of
processed products, processing of produce, or other similar purposes. The allowable area of a
greenhouse shall not be limited provided that a minimum 20 foot wide level and clear buffer strip
is maintained around the perimeter of the building, and the height of the building shall not exceed
one story or 20 feet above surrounding grade. The structural system of a greenhouse may be of any
material allowed by the California Building Code. A greenhouse building, not meeting the above
limitations, shall be assigned by the Building Official to the occupancy classification it most nearly
resembles.

Section 10-3.1.3 Exempt Agricultural Buildings

A. Agricultural buildings exempt from building permits pursuant to section 10-2.6.1, , item 14 of this
Code shall be located on agriculturally or residential ranchette zoned land and receive a land use
permit from the Planning and Development Department. A minimum 20-foot separation shall be
maintained between such buildings and other buildings and property lines.

B. Exemption from building permits shall not further exempt such agricultural buildings from
electrical, plumbing, or mechanical permits and their associated fees, or from the provisions of the
Primary Electrical Code, Primary Plumbing Code, or Primary Mechanical Code.

C. Plans and specifications for prefabricated agricultural buildings designed by a licensed engineer or
architect shall be acceptable for review and subject to approval by the Building Official.
Agricultural buildings not meeting the requirements of Section 2308, of the California Building
Code (Conventional Light Frame Construction) may be subject to Special Inspection under the
provisions of Section 1704 of the California Building Code.

26



ARTICLE III, PART 2—PRIMARY RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE

Section 10-3.2.1 Adoption

That certain building code known and designated as the California Residential Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130,
Sacramento, California 95833-2936, based on the 2009 edition of the International Residential Code,
published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL
60478-5771, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary Residential Code of the County and made a
part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety
and welfare of the public.

Section 10-3.2.2 Amendments

A.

B.

Section R303.8 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting: “When the
winter design temperature in Table R301.2(1) is below 60 degrees Fahrenheit (16 degrees Celsius)

Section 313.2 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows: One- and
two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall
be installed in one- and two-family dwellings and manufactured housing not in a mobile home
park.

Section R327.2 of the California Residential Code (Definitions) is hereby amended by adding the
following definition:

High Fire Hazard Area is an area of the County of Santa Barbara designated by the Building
Official as having a high propensity for wild fire due to the existence of excessive wild brush fuel,
lack of adequate water for fire suppression, or lack of adequate access to firefighting equipment
and is shown on a map entitled “High Fire Hazard Area Map” on file in the County of Santa
Barbara Building and Safety Division of the Planning and Development Department. This area is
to be considered a Wildland-Urban Interface Area.

Section 702A of the California Building Code (Definitions) is hereby amended to read as follows:

Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone is an area shown as “Santa Barbara County
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones Map in Local Responsibility Area”, on file in the office of
the State Fire Marshal, herein designated and based on the recommendation of the CDF Director
pursuant to Government Code Sections 51177(c), 51178, and 5118 and where the County of Santa
Barbara is responsible for fire protection.

Section R327.1.3 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended as follows:

New buildings, additions, alterations, and repairs located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or any
Wildland Urban Interface Areas designated by the enforcing agency constructed after the
application date shall comply with the provisions of this chapter.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings of an accessory character classified as a Group U occupancy and not exceeding
120 square feet in floor area, when located at least 30 feet from an applicable building.

2. Buildings of an accessory character classified as Group U occupancy of any size located
at least 50 feet from an applicable building

27



3. Buildings classified as a Group U Agricultural Building, as defined in Section 202 of this
code (see also Appendix C — Group U Agricultural Buildings), when located at least 50
feet from an applicable building.

F. Section R327.1.3.1 (first paragraph) of the California Residential Code is hereby amended as
follows:

New buildings, additions, alterations, and repairs for which an application for a building permit is
submitted on or after July 1, 2008 located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildland Urban
Interface Area shall comply with all sections of this chapter, including all of the following areas:

Figures R602.10.6.2 (1) and R602.10.6.2 (2) of the California Residential Code are hereby deleted.

H. Sections R902.1.1, R902.1.2, R902.1.3 and 902.1.4 of the California Residential Code are hereby
amended by adding the following sentence: Use of wood roofing materials is prohibited.

Q

Exception:

Approved fire-retardant-treated wood roofing materials are permitted to effect repairs for
roofs of similar existing wood roofing material where such repairs do not exceed 25 percent
of the existing roof area within any given 12 month period.

I The California Residential Code is hereby amended by assigning a basic wind speed of 95 miles
per hour (3 second gust), to the region of the County generally bounded as follows: on the east by
a north-south line running through El Capitan Point, on the north by the ridge of the Coast Range,
on the west by the coast from the southerly boundary of Vandenberg Air Force Base south to Point
Conception, and on the south by the coast line from Point Conception to El Capitan Point.

J. Chapter 17 of the California Building Code is hereby adopted in its entirety.
K. Chapter 32 of the California Building Code is hereby adopted in its entirety.
L. Chapter 33 of the California Building Code is hereby adopted in its entirety.
M. Appendix Chapters H, J and K are hereby adopted in their entirety.

ARTICLE III, PART 3—PRIMARY GREEN CODE

Section 10-3.3.1 Adoption

That certain building code known and designated as the California Green Building Standards Code,
2010 Edition, promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park
Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, California 95833-2936, published by the International Code Council,
4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5771, is hereby adopted and enacted as the
Primary Green Building Code of the County and made a part of this Code by reference, the purpose
and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety and welfare of the public.

28



ARTICLE IV—PRIMARY ELECTRICAL CODE

Section 10-4.1 Adoption

That certain electrical code known and designated as the California Electrical Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite
130, Sacramento, California 95833-2936 , based on the 2008 Edition of the National Electrical Code
published by the National Fire Protection Association, 1 Battery march Park, Quincy, Massachusetts
02269, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary Electrical Code of the County and made a part
of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety and
welfare of the public.

Section 10-4.2 Amendments

Pursuant to Article 89, sections 89.108.4.2 and 89.108.4.3 of the California Electrical Code (Fees and
Plan Review) electrical fees shall be by the current fee ordinance adopted by the Board of Supervisors
for the County of Santa Barbara.

Section 10-4.3 Connection to Electrical Installations

Except where work is done under a maintenance permit, it shall be unlawful for any person, firm or
corporation to make connections from a source of electrical energy, or to supply electrical power to
any electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus, or equipment which requires a permit for
installation, unless such person, firm or corporation shall have obtained prior authorization from the
Building Official and the utility service provider.

ARTICLE V—PRIMARY PLUMBING CODE

Section 10-5.1 Adoption

That certain plumbing code known and designated as the California Plumbing Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130,
Sacramento, California 95833-2936, based on the 2009 edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, 5001 East
Philadelphia Street, Ontario, California, 91761-2816, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary
Plumbing Code of the County and made a part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject
matter of which is to protect the health, safety and welfare of the public.

Section 10-5.2 Amendments

A. Pursuant to Section 103.4.2, 103.4.3, 103.4.5 of the California Plumbing Code (Permit Fees)
plumbing fees shall be by the current fee ordinance adopted by the Board of Supervisors for the
County of Santa Barbara.

B. Section 402 of the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a new subsection 402.7
as follows: Commercial Car Washes. Commercial car wash facilities shall have water recycling
systems approved by the Administrative Authority.

29



Section 412 of the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended to incorporate the Minimum
Plumbing Fixture table in Appendix A of Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code. These
standards in Appendix A are adopted into this title as though they are a part of the California
Plumbing Code, as adopted by the state.

Section 1209.5.2.3 and 1209.5.2.4 of the California Plumbing Code are herby deleted in their
entirety.

Appendix D (Sizing Storm-water Drainage Systems) of the California Plumbing Code is hereby
adopted in its entirety.

Appendix K (Private Sewage Disposal Systems) of the California Plumbing Code is hereby
adopted in its entirety until such time that it is replaced by the County of Santa Barbara individual
sewage disposal system installation standards as adopted by, and amended from time to time by,
the Board of Supervisors. It shall be the responsibility of the Director of Environmental Health to
enforce the provisions of this appendix as they pertain to private sewage disposal systems and
liquid waste.

ARTICLE VI—PRIMARY MECHANICAL CODE

Section 10-6.1 Adoption

That certain mechanical code known and designated as the California Mechanical Code, 2010 Edition,
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130,
Sacramento, California 95833-2936 , based on the 2009 Edition of the Uniform Mechanical Code,
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, 5001 East
Philadelphia Street, Ontario, California, 91761-2816 , is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary
Mechanical Code of the County and made a part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject
matter of which is to protect the health, safety and welfare of the public

Section 10-6.2 Amendments

A.

Pursuant to Sections 115.0, 115.1, 115.2, 115.3 of the California Mechanical Code, (fees and plan
review) mechanical fees shall be by the current fee ordinance adopted by the Board of Supervisors
for the County of Santa Barbara.

Section 507.1.7.2 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding the following:
Exception: Mobile food vending vehicles.

Section 515.3 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby amended by deleting the section in its
entirety.

30



ARTICLE VII—PRIMARY HOUSING CODE

Section 10-7.1 Adoption

That certain housing code known and designated as the Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition,
published by the International Conference of Building Officials, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier,
California 90601, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary Housing Code of the County and made
a part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety
and welfare of the public.

Section 10-7.2 Amendments
A. Section 203.1 of the Uniform Housing Code (Appeals Board) is hereby deleted in its entirety.

B. Section 302 of the Uniform Housing Code (Fees) is hereby amended by deleting the text in its
entirety and replacing with the following:

Whenever work is required to be done under the provisions of this Code, a building, plumbing,
electrical, or mechanical permit may be required by the Building Official prior to the
commencement of work. Appropriate fees shall be assessed by the Building Official pursuant to
permit fee resolutions as adopted by the Board of Supervisors from time to time. In the event that
abatement proceedings must be initiated against a property in order to gain compliance with the
provisions of this Code, all costs associated with the abatement shall be paid by the property owner
pursuant to the provisions of Section 10-2.12 of this Code.

C. Section 1001.2 of the Uniform Housing Code (Inadequate Sanitation) is hereby amended by
adding the following item:

16. Lack of an approved potable water supply.

ARTICLE VIII—PRIMARY DANGEROUS BUILDINGS CODE

Section 10-8.1 Adoption

That certain dangerous building code known and designated as the Uniform Code for the Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, by the International Conference of Building Officials, 5360
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, CA 90601, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary Dangerous
Building Code of the County and made a part of this Code by reference, the purpose and subject matter
of which is to protect the health, safety and welfare of the public.

ARTICLE IX—RELOCATED BUILDING

Section 10-9.1 Permits Required

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to move or cause to be moved any building or
structure into or within the County of Santa Barbara without first obtaining a relocation permit from
the Building Official. A relocation permit shall be valid for a period of 180 days from the date of
issuance. Upon written request, an additional 180-day extension to the permit may be granted by the
Building Official.

31



Exception:

A relocation permit shall not be required for temporary tool sheds, construction shacks, or similar
structures associated with a construction site where a valid permit issued by the County is in force,
or for manufactured buildings used in accordance with their listings.

Section 10-9.2 Applications

An application for relocation of a building or structure shall be filed with the Building Division. Prior
to the Building Official accepting the application, the applicant shall obtain a Land Use Clearance
from the Zoning Division of Planning and Development and submit it along with plans and
specifications for review by the Building Official.

Section 10-9.3 Investigation Fee

An investigation fee as specified in the current adopted fee schedule shall be paid to the Building
Official upon submittal of the application for a relocation permit. This fee shall not be refundable after
the investigation has been completed by the Building Division. If the building or structure proposed to
be relocated is situated outside the County of Santa Barbara, the applicant shall pay an hourly rate plus
mileage from portal to portal for Building Division staff to perform the necessary relocation
investigation.

Section 10-9.4 Authorization to Proceed and Posting of Notices

Upon receipt of application for a relocation permit and payment of the appropriate fees, the Building
Official shall inspect the building or structure to be moved and provide a written investigation report to
the applicant who shall contain notice of approval or disapproval of the relocation permit. The
investigation report shall also contain any conditions and requirements necessary to make the building
conform to the requirements adopted herein for new buildings.

If the permit is thereby denied, the report shall contain reasons for denial of said permit. If a relocation
permit has been issued and the building has not been relocated within said period, the Building Official
shall require a new relocation investigation report and payment of appropriate fees. Prior to the
issuance of a relocation permit, the Building Official shall post on the building to be relocated and at
the proposed new site a Moving Notice for 10 consecutive days. A relocation permit shall not be
issued prior to the expiration of 10 days from the date of posting of a Moving Notice.

Section 10-9.5 Reasons for Denial of Relocation Permit

Except as otherwise provided in this Code, the Building Official shall not issue a relocation permit for
a building or structure which is so constructed or in such condition as to pose a hazard to the life,
safety and welfare of the public if the building is moved, or if the building is not compatible or
consistent with the surrounding properties within a radius of 500 feet, or if infested with pests or
unsanitary, or if unfit to be used as a dwelling or for human habitation.

Section 10-9.6 Performance Security

A. The applicant shall sign a written agreement guaranteeing that all the work necessary to complete
the relocation and installation of the building or structure at its new site will be completed within
180 days from the date of issuance of the relocation permit. The applicant shall also post with the

32



Building Official performance security in the form of a negotiable instrument of credit approved by
County Counsel, bond, or cash deposit in an amount determined by the Building Official to be
sufficient to complete the required work indicated in the relocation investigation report plus a 15
percent contingency cost.

B. Upon satisfactory completion of the work, the Building Official shall return the performance
security deposited within 30 days from the date of completion.

C. In the event of a default in the performance of any of the terms of the agreement or the
conditions of approval. Building Official shall have the right to retain the security deposit and
use its proceeds to either complete the work or abate the substandard position of the building.

D. All work performed pursuant to a relocation permit shall be performed according to the provisions
of the Uniform Housing Code as adopted by section 10-7.1 of this Code.

Section 10-9.7 Protest against Issuance of a Relocation Permit

A protest against the issuance of a relocation permit must be filed in writing with the Building Official
no later than 10 days from the posting of the Moving Notice.

The Building Official shall cause the protest to be brought before the Board of Supervisors, or before a
review committee designated by the Board of Supervisors, no later than the first scheduled meeting
following the expiration of the 10 day posting period. The Board of Supervisors or review committee
shall at said meeting set a date for a public hearing to be held to hear the protest and render a
determination. A filing fee as specified in the current adopted fee schedule shall be collected by the
Building Official for all protest hearings.

ARTICLE X—GEOLOGIC HAZARDS

Section 10-10.1 General Provisions

A. Where the general condition of the soil or underlying rock of a building site is such that it may
present a potential for failure, or a hazard to the health, safety and welfare of the public, the
Building Official may require any additional information as necessary to ascertain the safety and
stability of the site and any building or structures constructed or to be constructed on said site.

B. When determined by the Building Official that the soil or underlying rock on a given site has the
potential for failure, slippage, subsidence, or other movement, the Building Official may require
that the plans for a proposed building or structure on said site be prepared by a licensed engineer
and approved by a licensed engineering geologist and the Building Official.

Section 10-10.2 Isla Vista Bluffs

A. It shall be unlawful for any building or structure in the Isla Vista bluffs area, as identified in the
Local Coastal Plan, to be constructed or located in violation of the provisions of Policy 3-4 of the
Local Coastal Plan and subsequent revisions of the policy.

33



Exceptions:

1. Structures or improvements specifically designed to protect existing buildings or structures
from damage caused by soil erosion or subsidence of the bluff and consistent with Policy 3-
4 of the Local Coastal Plan.

2. Structures or improvements specifically designed to protect the bluff against further
subsidence and erosion consistent with Policy 3-4 of the Local Coastal Plan.

B. Buildings constructed in the Isla Vista bluffs area shall have roof, ground surface, and subsurface
drainage designs approved by the Building Official.

C. Except for the required safety fencing, accessory structures shall not be placed or constructed
closer than 5 feet to the top of the bluff face and in compliance with the required set-back of the
section 1808.7 of 2010 California Building Code. For setbacks of buildings, see County zoning
ordinance.

D. It shall be unlawful for any improved property adjacent to the Isla Vista Bluffs to fail to have in
place, within five feet of the bluff face or at such other location as is approved by the Building
Official, a safety fence in conformity with the guardrail requirements of the current adopted
version of the California Building Code.

1. The Building Official may, by departmental regulations, supplement the Uniform
Building Code to meet the specific needs and conditions of the Isla Vista area and may
require alternative safety features as the Building Official deems necessary.

2. Owners of such properties shall make application for installation of such fencing within
60 days of the effective date of this ordinance and shall have the required fencing in place
with 180 days of the effective date of this ordinance,

3. Should soil or other conditions make it unsafe to place the safety fence within five feet of
the bluff face, the Building Official may authorize alternative placement

4. Should further recession of the bluff face so require, the owner shall move the safety
fence as may be necessary.

5. Any such fence shall be marked at least each fifty feet or once per lot, whichever is
greater, with a warning sign approved by the Building Official for this purpose.

6. Failure to erect and property maintain this safety fence shall be cause for the Building
Official to declare the property unfit for occupancy and file for criminal and civil
sanctions as deemed appropriate and provided for by the local and the States codes..

Section 10-10.3 Naples Bluffs

It shall be unlawful for any building or structure in the Naples bluffs area, as identified in the Local
Coastal Plan, to be constructed or located in violation of Policy 3-4 of the Local Coastal Plan. All such

buildings and structures shall have a roof, ground surface, and subsurface drainage designs approved
by the Building Official.

Section 10-10.4 Designated Soil Contamination Areas

New buildings constructed within soil contaminated areas, as determined by the Building Official and
the Director of Environmental Health shall meet the requirements of the County of Santa Barbara
Hazardous Material Recovery and Soil Remediation Program.

34



ARTICLE XI—SPECIAL PROBLEMS AREAS

Section 10-11.1 General

A. Plans and specifications for the proposed grading, construction, addition to, or change in use of
buildings and structures in a Special Problems Area as defined in this article shall be submitted to
the Special Problems Committee, herein referred to as such, or as “the Committee.”

B. The directors or managers of the Planning and Development Department, Environmental Health
division of the public health department, Fire Department, and Public Works Department shall
designate representatives to serve as members of the Committee.

Section 10-11.2 Definitions
For the purpose of this article, certain terms are defined as follows:

Special Problems Areas are areas of the County of Santa Barbara designated by resolution of the
Board of Supervisors as having existing or anticipated special and unique problems pertaining to
flooding, drainage, soils, geology, access, sewage disposal, water supply, location, or elevation
which impact the health, safety and welfare of the public. The following locations are designated
as Special Problems Areas:

South County: Hollister Avenue at Modoc Road, Mission Canyon, Naples, Shepard Mesa,
Summerland.

North County: Ballard, Janin Acres, Los Alamos, Los Olivos, Sweeney Road.

Special Problems Committee is a committee composed of representatives of the following
departments or divisions: Planning and Development, Environmental Health, Fire, and Public
Works.

Section 10-11.3 Powers and Duties of the Special Problems Committee

A. The Special Problems Committee shall review plans and specifications of buildings and structures
(including the components of wastewater disposal systems) proposed for construction in a Special
Problems Area. Individual members of the committee may recommend to the County decision-
makers any and all reasonable conditions of approval considered necessary to mitigate present or
anticipated problems within the scope of the Committee’s charge, or to prevent damage to public
or private property, risk of injury to persons, or creation of a public nuisance. Where an individual
member or members are unable to identify feasible mitigation of such problems, damage, or risk,
each may recommend denial of the permit that would authorize the construction of the proposed
buildings or structures.

B. Upon completion of the Committee’s review of the plans and specifications, the recommendations
of each individual committee member shall be documented in written form signed by the
chairperson of the Committee.

35



Section 10-11.4 Fees

A fee as specified in the current adopted fee schedule shall be paid to the Building Division at the time
of application for the processing of plans and specifications for buildings and structures proposed for
construction in a Special Problems Area. Such fee, or portion thereof, may be waived at the discretion
of the Building Official based on the extent of work performed by Building Division staff.

ARTICLE XII—PRIMARY BUILDING STANDARDS ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

Section 10-12.1 Adoption

Articles 1 (Essential Services Buildings) and 3 (Local Buildings) of Chapter 4 (Administrative
Regulations for the Office of the State Fire Marshal (SFM)) of the California Building Standards
Administrative Code, and Article 21 ( Plan Review, Building Inspection and Certification of
Surgical Clinics, Chronic Dialysis Clinics and Outpatient Services Clinics) of Chapter 7 (Safety
Standards for Health Facilities), California Building Standards Administrative Code, California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, 2007 Edition, promulgated by the California Building Standards
Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, California 95833-2936, is hereby
adopted and enacted as the Primary Building Standards Administrative Code of the County and
made part of this code by reference, the purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health,
safety and welfare of the public.

ARTICLE XIII—PRIMARY EXISTING BUILDING CODE

Section 10-13.1 Adoption

That certain building code known and designated as the California Existing Building Code, 2007
Edition, promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive,
Suite 130, Sacramento, California 95833-2936, is hereby adopted and enacted as the Primary
Unreinforced Masonry Building Code of the County and made part of this code by reference, the
purpose and subject matter of which is to protect the health, safety and welfare of the public.

36



APPENDIX A TO CHAPTER 10

MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES

SECTION 2905 — GENERAL number of fixtures are the minimum required as shown in Table
A-29-A and are assumed to be based on 50 percent male and 50

Each building shall be provided with sanitary facilities, including percent female. The occupant load factors shall be as shown in

provisions for accessibility in accordance with Chapter 11. Table A-29-A.

Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of building occu- EXCEPTION: Where circumstances dictate that a different ratio is

pancy with the minimum numbers as shown in Table A-29-A. The needed, the adjustment shall be approved by the building official.

TABLE A-29-A—MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES1.28

WATER CLOSETSS LAVATORIES®
{tixtures per person) {fixtures per person) BATHTUB OR SHOWER
TYPE OF BUILDING OR OCCUPANCY# MALE FEMALE MALE FEMALE {fixtures per person)
For the oceupancies listed below, use 30 square feet {2.78 m?) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.
Group A
Conference rooms, dining rooms, drinking | 1:1-25 1:1-25 one for each water closet up to four;
establishments, exhibit rooms, 2:26-75 2:26-75 then one for each two additional
gymnasiums, lounges, stages and similar 3:76-125 3:76-125 | water closets
uses including restaurants classified as 4:126-200 4:126-200
Group B Occupancies 5:201-300 5:201-300
6:301-400 6:301-400

Over 400, add one fixture for each
additional 200 males or 150 females.

For the assembly occupancies listed below, use the number of fixed seating or, where no fixed seating is provided, use 15 square feet (1.39 m2) per occupant
for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Assembly places—

Auditoriums, convention halls, dance 1:1-50 3:1-50 1:1-200 1:1-200

floors, lodge rooms, stadiums and casinos | 2:51-100 4:51-100 | 2:201-400 2:201-400
3:101-150 6:101-200 | 3:401-750 3:401-750
4:151-300 8:201-400 | Over 750, add one fixture for each

Over 300 males, add one fixture for | additional 500 persons.
each additional 200, and over 400
females add one for each 125.

For the assembly occupancies listed below, use the number of fixed seating or, where no fixed seating is provided, use 30 square feet (2,29 m?) per occupant
for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

‘Worship places
Principal assembly area one per 150 one per 75 | one per two water closets
Worship places
Educational and activity unit one per 125 one per 73 | one per two water closets
For the occupancies listed below, nse 200 square feet (18.58 m?) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures,
Group B
Offices or public buildings 1:1-15 1:1-15 one per two water closels
2:16-35 2:16-35
3:36-55 3:36-55
Over 55, add one for each 50
persons,
For the oceupancies listed below, use 50 square feet (4.65 m?) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.
Group E 1:1-13 1:1-15 one per 40 one per 40
Schools—for staff use 2:16-35 2:16-35
All schools 3:36-55 3:36-55
Over 55, add one fixture for each
additional 40 persons,
Schools—for student use 1:1-20 1:1-20 1:1-25 1:1-25
Day care 2:21-50 2:21-50 2:26-50 2:26-50
Over 50, add one fixture for each Over 50, add one fixture for each
additional 50 persons, additional 50 persons.
Elementary one per 30 one per 25 | one per 35 one per 35
Secondary one per 40 one per 30 | one per 40 one per 40

For the occupancies listed below, use 50 square feet (4.65 m2) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Education Facilities other than Group E
Others (colleges, universities, adult centers,
elc.) one per 40 one per 30 | one per 40 one per 40

(Continued)

37




TABLE A-29-A—MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES123—(Continued)

WATER CLOSETS® LAVATORIESS
{fixiures per person) {fixtures per person) BATHTUB OR SHOWER
TYPE OF BUILDING OR OGCUPANCY4 MALE FEMALE MALE FEMALE {fixtures per persen}

For the occupancies listed below, use 2,000 square feet (185.8 m?) per occupant for

the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Over 100, add one fixture for each
additional 300 persons.

Group F 1:1-10 1:1-10 one for each two water closets one shower for each 15

Workshop, foundries and similar 2:11-25 2:11-25 persons exposed to excessive

establishments, and Group H Oceupancies | 3:26-50 3:26-50 heat or to skin contamination
4:51-75 4:51-75 with irritating materials
5:76-160 5:76-100

For the occupancies listed below, use the des
number of plumbing fixtures.

ignated application and 200 square feet

18.58 m?) per occupant of the general use area for the minimum
P

Group I
Hospital waiting rooms

Hospital general use areas

one per room {usable by either sex)

1:1-15 1:1-15
2:16-35 3:16-35
3:36-55 4:36-55

Over 55, add one fixture for each
additional 40 persons.

one per room
one per each two water closets

Exercise room

one per exercise room

one per cell
one per exercise room

Hospitals
Patient room one per yoom one per room one per room
Ward room one per eight patients one per 10 patients one per 20 patients
Jails and reformatories

Cell one per cell

Other institutions (on each occupied floor)

one per 25 one per 25

one per 10 one per 10

one per eight

For the occupancies listed below, use 200 square feet (18.58 m?) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Group M
Retail or wholesale stores

1:1-50 1:1-50

2:51-100 2:51-100

3:101-400 3:101-200
4:201-300
5:301-400

Over 400, add one fixture for each
additional 500 males and one for
each 150 females.

one for each two water closels

For Group R Occupancies, dwelling units and hotel guest rooms, use the chart. For congregate residences, use 200 schare feet (18.58 m?) for Group R,

Division 1 Occupancies and 300 square feet (27.87 m?) for Group R, Division 3 Occupancies for the minimum plumbing fixtures.

Group R
Dwelling units
Hotel guest rooms

one per dwelling unit
one per guest room

one per dwelling unit
one per guest room

one per dwelling unit
one per guest room

Congregate residences

one per 10 one per 8
Add one fixture for each additional
25 males and one for each additional
20 females.

one per 12 one per 12
Over 12, add one fixture for each
additional 20 males aad one for each
additional 15 females

one per eight

For females, add one bathtub
per 30. Over 150, add one per
20,

For the occupancies listed below, use 5,000 square feet (464.5 m?) per occupant for

the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Over 100, add one for each 300
males and females.

Group § 1:1-10 1:1-10 one per 40 occupants of each sex one shower for each 15

Warehouses 2:11-25 2:11-25 persons exposed to excessive
3:26-50 3:26-50 heat or to skin contamination
4:51-75 4:51-75 with poisonous, infectious or
5:76-100 5:76-100 irritating materials

NOTE: Occupant loads over 30 shall have one drinking fountain for each 150 occupants.

IThe figures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum re
Drinking fountains shall not be installed in toilet rooms.

quired for the number of persons indicated or any fraction thereof.

*When the design occupant load is less than 10 persons, a facility usable by either sex may be approved by the building official.

4 Any category not mentioned specifically orabout which there are any questions shall be classified by the building official and included in the category which it most
nearly resembles, based on the expected use of the plumbing facilities.

SWhere urinals are provided, one water closet less than the number specified may be provided for each urinal installed, except the number of water closets in such
cases shall not be reduced to Jess than one half of the minimum specified.

STwenty-four inches (610 mm)of wash sink or 18 inches (457 mm) of a circular basin, when provided with water outlets for such space, shall be considered equiva-

lent fo one lavatory.

38




SECTION 2

This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force thirty (30) days from the date of its passage and
before the expiration of fifteen (15) days after its passage, it, or a summary of it, shall be published
once, with the names of the members of the Board of Supervisors voting for and against the same
in the Santa Barbara News press, a newspaper of general circulation published in the County of

Santa Barbara.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED, this 17th day of __ January , 2012 by the

following vote:

{

AYES: Superv1sor Carbajal, Superv1sor Wolf, Supervisor Farr, Supervisor Gray,

NOES: None
ABSTAIN: None
ABSENT: None

ATTEST:

CHANDRA L. WALLAR

N mARD
By:

Deputy

' APPROVED AS TO ACCOUNT ING:
ROBERT GEIS

AUDIT Z -CONTROLLER

Deputy

39

Superyisor Lavagninc

%//4/ -

DOREEN F
CHAIR, BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

APPROVED AS TO FORM

DENNIS MARSHALL
COUNTY COUN

By: /
Mn E. R?ady,ér., Senior




STATE OF CALIFORNIA ~ STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN IR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

April 7, 2011

Richard Todd, Division Chief/Fire Marshall
Santa Barbara County Fire Department
County of Santa Barbara

4410 Cathedral Oaks Road

Santa Barbara, CA 93110-1042

Dear Mr. Todd:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on March 16, 2011, of the County of Santa Barbara
submittal pertaining to Ordinance No. 4771 with findings and is acceptable for filing.
Your filing attests to your understanding that according to Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building Standards Code
shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the finding and the modification
or change have been filed with the California Building Standards Commission (the
Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

h m & ,
Enrique M. Rodriguez
Assaociate Construction Analyst

ceC: Chron
Local Filings



Fire Department Michael W. Dyer

Fire Chief
“Serving the community since 1926” County Fire Warden
HEADQUARTERS Christian [. Hahn

Deputy Fire Chief
4410 Cathedral Oaks Road
Santa Barbara, CA 93110-1042
(805) 681-5500 FAX: (805) 681-5563

March 16, 2011

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833

To Whom It May Concern:

On December 14, 2010 the Santa Barbara County Board of Supervisors voted 4 to 1 in favor to
adopt the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments. The adoption is codified by Ordinance
4771 and is located in Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara County Code.

Pursuant to the 2010 California Fire Code Section 1.1.8, the Santa Barbara County Fire
Department hereby submits the attached ordinance containing amendments, additions and
deletions to the 2010 California Fire Code, as well as, the express findings for each. Please
forward any comments or questions to the address below.

Thank you,

T

Richard Todd

Division Chief/Fire Marshal

Santa Barbara County Fire Department
(805) 681-5554
richard.todd@sbcfire.com

Serving the cities of Buellton and Goleta, and the Communities of Casmalia, Cuyama, Gaviota, Hope Ranch, Los Alamos,
Los Olivos, Mission Canyon, Mission Hills, Orcutt, Santa Maria, Sisquoc, Solvang, Vandenberg Village



County of Santa Barbara

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

Minute Order
December 14, 2010

Piesent: S - Supervisor Carbajal, Supervisor Wolf, Supervisar Farr, Supervisor Gray,

and Supervisor Centeno

FIRE file Relerence No 10-00990

28} Consader recommendanons regarding an Ordinance amending Chaprer 15 of the Santa Barbara County

Code 10 adop the 2010 Cahforma Fue Code, as follows

4} Consuder the adoprion {second reading) of an Ordinance amending Chaprer 15 of the Sama Barbara
County Code 1o adopt the 2010 Cabformia Fire Code, with amendmenis replacing the amended 7007
Califormia Fire Code as the enforcement Code 1 all areas within the Santa Barbars County Fue
Prosecnion Distinct and all othes unincorporated areas of 1the County, except the areas waithin the
Carpintenia/Summertand Fire Protection Distnct, Montecito T e Protecuion Do, Vandenberg An

Foce Base and Buresu of Indian Affaus Lands, unless otherwise speaified by this Ordinance, and

) Derenmine that the adoption of this Ordinance 15 categoncally exemprt from the Cahiforma
Environmental Quality Actin comphance with Section 1506 1(b)(3)

A motion was made by Supervisor Gray, seconded by Supervisor Carbajal, that this

matter be Acted on as follows:
a)y Adopted.

ORDINANCE NO. 4771

by Approved.

The motion carried by the following vote:

Ayes: 4. Supervisor Carbaysl, Supervisor Wolf, Supervisor Farr, and Supervisor
Gray
Noes: I - Supervisor Centeno

This is a true certified copy of the original document
on file or of record in my office. It bears the seal
and signature, imprinted in purple ink, of the
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.

M& \k&\ Q-'\ 4 _:-..v
Clerk of the Board, Santa Barbara County, {alifornia
Date /ZZ’l_Hld by Deputy: &?a%}} @Q'”x

County of Sants Barbsre Page 74



AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 15 OF THE SANTA
BARBARA COUNTY CODE, ADOPTING THE 2010 CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE AND A FIRE CODE FEE SCHEDULE

ORDINANCE NO. 47711

An ordinance of the County of Santa Barbara amending Chapter 15 of the
Santa Barbara County Code to adopt the 2010 edition of the California Fire
Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from
fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in
the County of Santa Barbara; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore.

The Board of Supervisors of the Counly of Santa Barbara, State ol Caldornia, ordains as follows

Section One

Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara Counly Code is amended in the tollowing manner

1 Article |, entitled” "Adopton of the 2007 California Fire Code” is deleted and
replaced with Article |, entitled "Adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code”

2 Article V, entitled "Fees”, incorporates a current fire code fee schedule with no
changes to the existing fee schedule, however Article V is amended lo update
references to the Califormia Fire Code
3 Article VI entitled "Violations-Legal Actions” is amended 1o update the reference
to the 2010 CFC in Sec. 15125 Citations — Enforcement procedures:
All other provisions of Chapter 15 shall remain in eHect

Section Two
Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara County Code is amended as follows

Article I,

Adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code

Sec. 15-1. Adoption of 2010 California Fire Code.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Barbara for the purpose of prescribing
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous materials or
explosion, adopts the 2010 edition of the Calitornia Fire Code {hereinafier California Fire Code or
"CFC") based on the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code, including Chaplters 1-49 and




Appendix Chaplers 4, A,B, C, D, E, F, G, Hand i as published by the international Code Council,
except such portions as are added, deleted. modified o1 amended by Sec. 15-3 of this chapter A
copy of the 2010 edition of the California Fire Code is on file with the Clerk of the Board of
Supervisors and is adopted and ncorporated by reterence

This Ordinance shall be controling in all areas within the Santa Barbara County Fire Protection
District and  all other unincorporated areas of the County, excepl the areas within the
Carpentenia/Summertand Fire Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection District, Vandenberg
Air Force Base, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Lands. unless otherwise specified by this Chapter

Sec. 15-2. Rules of Construction.

(a) Wherever the word “jurisdiction” 1s used in the CFC it shall mean all areas within the

Santa Barbara Counly Fre Protection District and all other unincorporated areas of the
County, except the areas within the Carpentena/Summerland Fie Protection Distiict,
Montecilo Fire Protection Distict, Vandenberg An Force Base, and Bureau of Indian
Affairs lands, unless otherwise specified by this Chapte:

(b) Whenever the words "chief” and/or “fire chief” of the tire department are used they shall be
held to mean the Sanla Barbara County Fire Chiel also known as the "Fire Warden, or his or her
designee.”

(¢) Whenever the words "building department” are used they shall be held lo mean the Building
and Safety Division of the Santa Barbara County Planning and Development Department

(d) Whenever the words "police department” and "police” are used they shall be held to include
the Santa Barbara County Shentf Department or the law enforcement agency that has legal
jurisdiction

(e) Whenever the words "California Building Code” and “building code” are used they shall be
held to include the building code as adopted under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County
Code.

() Whenever the words "California Electrical Code” are used 1l shall be held to inciude the
electrical code as adopted under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code.

() Whenever the words "California Residential Code” and "residential code” are used they shall
be heldto include the residential code as adopled under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County
Code.

(g) Whenever the words "Counly Land Use and Development Code” are used it shall be

held to include the County Land Use and Development Code adopted under Chapter 35 of

the Santa Barbara County Code

(h) Whenever the words "Fue Protection Certihicate” (FPC) are used it means the
application for review of any new building or structure that requires a building permit, any
residential building or structure that adds an accumulation of 1000 square feet or more,

any commercial bullding or struclure that adds an accumulation of 500 square feet or

more, any commercial bullding or stiucture thal adds any square footage exceeding 5000
square feel, or the review of any changes to a fire protection system

(1) Whenever the words “High Fire Hazard Seventy Zone Maps” are used it means the

maps adopted under Chapler 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code and on file with the
Office of the State Fie Marshal

() Whenever the words "Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps” are used it means

the maps adopted under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code and on file with

the Office of the State Fue Marshal

(k) Whenever the words "Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards”

are used it means those standards researched and developed by the Santa Barbara
County Fire Depaniment, on tile with the fire code oficial and avallable for review and
reference at www sbcfire com

Sec. 15-3. Amendments to the California Fire Code.



The Cahfornia Fire Code 1s amended as follows in order to properly safeguard the healih, safety,
and wellare of the people, property and environment of Santa Barbara County
DIVISION 1l

{a) CHAPTER 1 —~ SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION is hereby revised and amended as follows

SECTION 101 GENERAL
Section 101.1 Title 1s amended to read as follows
These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Santa Barbara County, hereinafter
referred 1o as "this code”

SECTION 102 APPLICABILITY
Section 102.1 Construction and design provisions is amended by adding the following

Exception: This section shall not apply 1o any agncultural buldings, specifically
exempted in Santa Barbara Counly Code Chapter 10, Building Regulations, which
reads as lfollows

Agnicultural bulldings not exceeding 3,000 square feet in floor area constructed and
used to house farm implements, equipmenl, hay, grain, pouliry, hvestock or horticuliural
products  Such buildings shall not be a place ol human habiaiion nor a place of
employment, nor shall such bulldings be wused by the public, be used to store
hazardous materials in violation of the Fire Code, nor contamn plumbing, mechanical,
electnical, structural or architectiural features thal may reclassify the occupancy or the
character of the occupancy of said-building as determined by the Building Official. See
Section 10-3.3 of the Santa Barbara County Code

And provided that, whenever there is any change in the use or occupancy of such building
so that it no longer meels the above-hsted specification for exemption of agrcultural
buildings, the building must comply with the requirements of this code prior to making such
change ol use or occupancy

SECTION 104 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES
Section 104.6 Official Records is amended to read as follows
The fire code official shall retain official records for not less than five years uniess otherwise
provided by other regulations.
Section 104.6 is further amended by deleting Sections 104.6.1 through 104.6.4.

SECTION 105 PERMITS
Section 105.1.1 is amended by deleling the phrase " W any ... " in the second sentence

SECTION 108 BOARD OF APPEALS is amended by deleting the entire section. Board of
Appeals s covered under Santa Barbara County Fire Code, Appendix A

SECTION 109 VIOLATIONS 1s amended as follows
Section 109.3 Violation Penalties is hereby amended by deleling the existing language
and inserting the following” Violation penallies are covered under Santa Barbara County
Code, Chapter 15, Article VI
Section 109.3.1 Abatement of violation shall remain unchanged

SECTION 111 STOP WORK ORDERS is amended as follows;
Section 111.4 Failure to Comply is amended to read as follows:
Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a sltop work order,
except such work as that person is directed by the Fue Chief te perform 1o remove a
viclation or unsafe condition, 1s guilty of an infraction as described in Santa Barbara County
Code, Chapter 15, Article VI

(]



{b) CHAPTER 2 -~ DEFINITIONS 15 amended as follows

SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS 15 amended by adding the following terms
FIRE HAZARD. Any thing or act that increases or could cause an increase of the hazard
or menace of fre to 3 greater degree than that customanly recognized as normal by
persons in the public service regularly engaged in preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire or any thing or act that could obstruct, delay, hinder or mlerfere with the operations of
the fire department or the egress of occupants in the event of fue. When a Fire Hazard has
been determined to exist by the Fue Chief, the Fire Hazard shall be considered 1o be a
nuisance
FIRE PROTECTION CERTIFICATE (FPC) Is the apphcation for review of any new building
or structure that requires a bullding permil, any residential buillding or structure that adds an
accumulation of 1000 square feet or more, any commercial building o structure that adds
an accumulation of 500 square feet or more, any commeraial building or structure that adds
any square footage exceeding 5000 square feet, or the review of any changes to a fie
protection system
PETROLEUM FACILITIES. Shall for the purpose of this code, be designated by the Fire
Chief and include, but not be hmited to, tanks, compressors, pumps, vessels and other
large equipment or structures pertinent to ol field operations sited at a single location

{c) CHAPTER 3 - GENERAL PRECAUTIONS AGAINST FIRE 15 amended as follows
SECTION 304 - COMBUSTIBLE WASTE MATERIAL

304.1.1 Waste material. 1s amended by inserting the phrase "When determined to be 3 fire

hazard,...” at the beginning of the fist sentence

304.1.2 Vegetation. i1s amended as follows
By inserting the phrase "When determined to be a fire hazard, " at the beginning of the
first sentence
By replacing the words *  the International Wildiand-Interface Code” with *  Section
4914 of this code”.

(d) CHAPTER 4 - EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS is amended by deleting all
sections except the following

SECTION 401 GENERAL

SECTION 402 DEFINITIONS

SECTION 403 PUBLIC ASSEMBLAGES AND EVENTS
SECTION 407 HAZARD COMMUNICATION

(e) CHAPTER 5 - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES s adopled in s entirety with the following
amendments

SECTION 501 GENERAL
501.1 Scope is amended by adding al the end of the sentence ™ and Santa Barbara
County Fire Department Development Standards”.

SECTION 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
503.1 Where required. 15 amended by adding at the end of the sentence " and Sania
Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards "
503.2 Specitications. s amended by adding at the end of the sentence *  and Santa
Barbara Counly Fire Department Developrnent Standards ™
503.2.1 Dimensions. s amended by replacing the phrase " of not less than 20 feet
(6096 mm), exclusive ol shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with
Section 5036, " with the phrase "  in accordance with Santa Barbara County Fue
Department Development Standards



503.6 Secunty gates. 1s amended by deleting the existing language and replacing it with,
"The inslallation of security gales acioss a fire apparatus access road shall be in
accordance with Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards.”

505.1 Address numbers. is amended by deleting the words, "Numbers shall be a
minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm) high with @ minimum stroke of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).” and
mserting the words, "Residential building numbers shall be a minimum of 3 inches (765
mm) high with a minimurm stroke of 0.5 inch (12.7) and Commercial building numbers shall
be a minimum of 6 inches (153 .0 mm) huigh with a minimum stroke of 1 inch (25.4 mm)”
505.1.2 Mixed-use Building is added to read as follows: A notification system shall be
mstalled in a manner and location approved by the Fire Chief, which indicates the presence
of residential dwelling units.

505.3 Road Naming, is added to read as follows, all public and private access roads shall
be named In accordance with the Santa Barbara County Fue Depaniment Development
Standards and the County Land Use and Development Code as adopted under Chapter 35
of the Santa Barbara County Code

SECTION 507 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
507.1 Required water supply. 1s amended by adding the following sentence 1o the end of
the paragraph, "Fire protechion water supply systems shall be installed -and maintaned in
accordance with Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards ”

{(f)y CHAPTER 6 BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS is amended as follows;

SECTION 610 is added to read as follows;
610 Photovoltaic Systems
610.1 General. The installation of photovollaic systems shall comply with this seclion
and the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code and the requirements of
the local authority baving jurisdiction

Exception: Section 610 (et seq) shall not apply lo photovoltaic systems installed on one
and two family dwellings.

610.2. Plans. Construction plans that include a roof layoul of the proposed photovoltaic
system panels and equipment shall be submitted to the fire code official for approval prior
to installation

610.3 Design. Photovoltaic systems shall be designed in accordance with the “SOLAR
PHOTOVOLTAIC INSTALLATION GUIDELINE" 1ssued by the California State Fire
Marshal Office Apnl 22, 2008 with amendment to Section 2 2 1 (page 10) as follows’

Section 2.2.1 on Pg 10 of the SFM "SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC INSTALLATION
GUIDELINE" is amended to read

2.2.1 Access

There shall be a minimum six-fool (6) wide clear perimeler around the
edges of the roof, as measured from the exterior bearing walls of the
building to the nearest photovoltaic panel. Examples #5 to #8 shall reflecl
this requirement

Exception: If either horizontal axis of the building is 250 feet or less,
there should be a minimum four feet (4') wide clear perimeter around the
edges of the roof, as measured from the exterior bearing walls of the
building to the nearest photovoltaic panel

(g} CHAPTER 8 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS is amended as follows:
SECTION 801 GENERAL is amended as follows’

[l



SECTION 901.4.1 Required fire protection systems is amended by adding at the end of
the sentence * . and Santa Barbara County Fire Depariment Development Standards”

SECTION 901.6 Inspection, testing and maintenance i1s amended by adding at the end of
the 1asl sentence * . after obtaining written penmission from the fire code official

SECTION 902 — DEFINITIONS i1s amended by adding the lollowing terms
[B] AWNING. An architectural projection that provides weather protection, identity or
decoration and is wholly supported by the building to which it is attached  An awning 1s
comprised ot a ightweight, ngid skeleton structure over which a coverning is attached
[B] COURT. An open, uncovered space, unobstructed to the sky, bounded on three or
more sides by exterior building walls or other enclosing devices

SECTION 903 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS 1s amended by revising section
903 1.903 2, and by adding a new section 9037
903.1 General. 15 amended by adding the tollowing phrase to the end of the sentence
and Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards
9032 Where Required. 15 amended by adding at the end of the sentence  "and Section
903 7"
903 7 Santa Barbara County Automatic Sprinkler Systems.
The provisions ol this section shall be applicable o all areas within the Santa Barbaia
County Fire Protection District and all other unincorporated areas ol the County, except the
areas within the Carpenteria/Summerland Fure Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection
Distnct, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Bureau of Indian Affawrs Lands, unless otherwise

restrictive provisions shall be controlling.
903.7.1 Locations Required. Concurrent with provisions in the California Fue Code,
Calfornia Building Code, California Residential Code, and in the Santa Barbara County
Code, automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed and maintained in the locations
specified as follows!
1.All new one and two-family dwellings and townhouses {R-3 Occupancies).
(2010 California Residential Code, Chapter 3, Section R-313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems / 2010 California Building Code Chapter 9, Section 903.2.8
Group R)
2 New buildings and structures with a final floor area of 5000 square feet or
more.
New buildings or new structures {including prefabricated or relocated structures) for
which application for building permits are officially filed or required to be filed with the
Santa Barbara County Planning and Development Department, Building and Salety
Division, which have a total floor area of five thousand square feet or more; and
3.New buildings and structures located outside the Urban Limit Line.
New buildings or new structures (including prefabricated of relocated structures) for
which application for building permits are officially hled or required to be fled with the
Santa Barbara County Planning and Development Department, Building and Safety
Division, that are construcled (regardless of square foolage) outside of the "Urban
Limit Line” (as defined in the land use element, definition section of the Santa
Barbara County General Plan), or within the Carpintenia-Summerland Fie Protection
District.
4_Modification to existing buildings and structures with a final floor area of 5,000
square feet or more.
Existing buildings or structures for which applications for maodification are officially
filed or required to be filed with the Santa Barbara County Planning and Development
Department, Building and Safety Division and which are modified to add any square
footage and, subsequent to the addition, the total square foctage of the bullding or
structure is 5,000 square feet or more; and
5 Modification to existing buildings and structures located outside the Urban
Limit Line.

6



Existing buildings or structures for which apphcations or modiication are oticially
filed or required to be filed with the Santa Barbara County Planning and Development
Department, Building and Safety Division that are located outside of the "Urban Limit
Line” (as dehned in the land use element, definition sechion ol the Sanla Barbara
County General Plan), or within the Carpentena Summerland Fire Protection District
and which are modilied to add five hundred squaie feet o1 more for non-residential
(notwithstanding Section 903.7 1#3) and add one thousand square feet or more for
residential - Existing nonresidential and residential structures shall install sprinklers
throughout the structure when fire sprinklers are required However, Section
903 7 143 shall apply if the final gross floor ares 1s 5,000 square feet or more

NOTE: Any additional square footage added atter January 1°' 2011 shatll be

accumulative towards the totals listed in Section 903.7.1 #5 above.

Exceptions:
1 Sechion 90371 shall not apply to any agncultural buddings, including greenhouses,
as defined in the Califormia Building Code, which would otherwise be included within
the requirements of this section, provided that
Whenever there is any change in the use or occupancy of such bullding so that it no
longer meets the above-listed definition of agncultural budding, the building must
have a sprinkler system installed prior 1o making such change of use or occupancy in
all areas of the buldding which would have been required to have spiinklers but for
the existence of the exception set out in this subsection.
2. Other detached Group U buildings, as defined by the California Building Code . may
be exempted from Section 903 7 1 on a case-by-case basis in writing by the Fiie Chief
and the Building Official (subject to the same occupancy change conditions as noted in
"Exception 17 above).
3. Buildings classified as Group S-2, as defined by the Calitornia Building Code, may
be exempted from Section 903 7 1 on a case-by-case basis in writing by the Fre Chiet
in accordance with Section 111.2.4 and/or Chapter 1 Seclion 104 9 of the 2010
California Fire Code (subject lo the same occupancy change conditions as noted in
"Exception 17 ghove).

803.7.2 Floor area computation. The lotal floor area of such bulldings or structures shall
be within the outside perimeter of the exterior walls of the building under consideration,
exclusive of vent shafts and courts, without deduction for corndors, stairways, closets, the
thickness of intenor walls, columns or other teatures  For all occupancies other than Group
R, Division 3 the floor area of a building, or portion thereof nol provided with surrounding
exterior walls shall be the usable area under the honzontal projection of the roof, floor
above or awning. The gross floor area shall nol include shafls with no openngs or interior
courts

903.7.3 Plan approval. No automatic sprinkler system required by this section shall be
installed without prior approval, by the fire chief, of the pians for the installation, testing and
maintenance of the system System plans, including system calculations shall be approved
prior o system installation

SECTION 905 STANDPIPE SYSTEMS is amended as follows,

905.3 Required installations 1s amended by adding the words *  and when required by
the fire code official” at the end of the first sentence

(h) CHAPTER 27 - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS — GENERAL PROVISIONS is hereby amended
by revising Section 2703.3.1.3 as follows:

2703.3.1.3 Control. When an unauthorized discharge caused by primary containment or system
tailure is discovered, the invelved primary containment or system shall be placed temporanily oui
of service and repaired or permanently removed from service

{}) CHAPTER 33 - EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS is hereby amended by revising Section
3301 .1 and adding Sections 3301.2 and 3301 3 as follows



SECTION 3301 GENERAL
3301.1 Explosives Requirerments. For explosives requirements, see Tille 19 California
Code of Regulations, Chapter 10
3301.2 Prohibition of Fireworks. The manufacturing, possession, storage, sale, use and
handling of any and all freworks 1s prohibited in all areas within the Santa Barbara County
Fue Protection District and all other unincorporaled areas of the County, except the areas
within the Carpentena/Summeiland Fire Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection
Distnct, Vandenberg An Foice Base, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Lands, unless otherwise
specified by this Chapter

EXCEPTION: A permitied Pubhc Display of Fireworks, as defined in Section 12524 of the
Health and Salely Code by a Slate Fire Marshal licensed Pyrotechmic operator Public
Displays of Fireworks shall comply with Title 19 California Code of Regulations, Chaples
6 -~ Fueworks.

3301.3 Seizure The fue code otfical 1s authonzed 1o seize, take, temove or cause o be
removed fireworks in violahon of 3301 2 and/or CCR Title 19.

3

(j) CHAPTER 49 — REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREAS is
hereby amended by including addihonal defintions to Section 4702 1 and adding Section 47 14

SECTION 4902.1is amended by adding the following definitions:
BOARD is the Santa Barbara County Board of Supervisors

BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES are those buildings and structures, described within this
Chapter, whether inhabited or not

COMBUSTIBLE MATERIALS are weeds, stubble, brush, rubbish, litter, dry grass, dry
leaves or other flammable matenals thal are readily ignitable and endanger the public
safety

DEFENSIBLE SPACE 15 the atea suniounding a stiuclure or buillding where basic wildfire
protection praclices are implemented, providing the key point of defense hom an
approaching wildfire or escaping shucture fire. The area is characlerized by the
establishment and maintenance of fuel modificalion measures.

FIRE HAZARD is any thing or act that increases or coeuld cause an increase of the hazard
or menace of fre to a greater degree than that customarily recognized as normal by
persons in the public service regularly engaged in preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire or any thing or act that could obstruct, delay, hinder or interfere with the operations of
the fire depariment or the egress of occupants in the event of fire. When a Fire Hazard has
been determined to exist by the Fire Chief, the Fire Hazard shall be considered 1o be a
nuisance

PARCEL is a portion ¢f land of any size, the area of which is determined by the assessor's
maps and records and may be identified by an assessor's parcel number whether or not
any buildings or struclures are present.

REDUCED FUEL ZONE s & fire break within 30 feet to 100 feet from each building or
siructure and is created by disrupting the vertical and/or horizonlal continuity of flammable
and combustible vegetation with the goal of reducing fire intensity, inhibiting fire in the
crowns of trees, reducing the rate of fire spread, and providing a safer environment for
firefighters to suppress wildfire



SECTION 4914 Santa Barbara County Fire Hazard Abatement is added to read as follows
4914.1 Applicability of article. The provisions of section 4914 shall be applicable to all
areas within the Santa Barbara County Fue Protection District and all other unincorporated
areas of the Counly, excepl the areas within the Carpenteria/Summerland Fire Protection
District, Monteoito Fire Protection District, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Bureau of
Indian Affairs Lands, unless otherwise specified by this Chapler, and those areas in
independent fire distncts having governing bodies other than the Santa Barbara County
Board ol Supervisors that choose to enforce this section 1t any part of this arnlicle is in
conflict with any other part, the more restrictive provisions shall be controlling.

4914.2 Prohibited disposal of combustible material. No person shall place, deposit o1
dump combustible material, which in the opinion of the code official constitutes a fire
hazard, on a parcel, whether or not he owns such parcel, or whether or not he so places,
deposits or dumps on such parcel with the consent of the owner thereof.

49143 Clearance of Brush, Vegetative Growth and Combustible Material from
Parcels. Al parcels declared a fire hazard shall be cleared entirely of combustible
matenal If the chief delermines this impractical, the provisions of Section 4914 4 may be
used

4914.4 Clearance of Brush or Vegetative Growth from around Structures.
4914.4.1 Any person owning, leasing, controlhng, operating or mamtaining any building
in, upon, or adjoining any-mountainous. area, forest-covered lands, brush-covered lands,
grass-covered lands, or any land that is covered with combustible material shall at alt
times:
(3) Maintain arcund and adjacent to the building or structure a firebreak made by
removing and clearing away, for a distance of not less than 30 feet on each side of the
building or structure or to the property line, whichever is nearer, all flammable
vegetation or other combustible growth
(b} Maintain around and adjacent 1o the building or structure a Reduced Fuel Zone
made by removing all brush, flammable vegetation, or combustible growth ihat is
located within 100 feet from the building or structure or 1o the property line. Grass and
other vegetation located more than 30 feet from the building or structure and less than
18 inches in height above the ground may be maintained where necessary o stabilize
the soil and prevent erosion
{c) Remove that portion of any tree that extends within 10 feet of the outlet of a
chimney or stovepipe
{d) Maintain any tree adjacent lo or overhanging a bullding tree of dead or dying wood
(e) Maintain the roof of a structure free of leaves, needles, or other dead vegeltative
growth. '
(fy Maintain compliance with Calforma Pubhc Resources Code Section 4291 and
California Government Code Seclion 51182

Exceplions:
1. Section 4814 .4 does not apply to agricultural crops, single specimens of
frees or other vegelation that is well-pruned and maintained so as 1o
effectively manage fuels and not form a means of rapidly transmitting fire
from other nearby vegetation lo a dwelling or structure.

2. In accordance with CEQA Guideline 15304(1), fuet management activities
shall not result in the taking of endangered, rare, or threatened plant or
animal species or significant erosion and sedimentation of surface waters.

4914.5 Fire hazard declared. The presence of combustible material on a parcel shall,
when in the opinion of the fire chief, constitute a fire hazard



4914.6 Prosecution. The fue chiel shall serve a wrntlten order upon the owner or
possessor of a parcel, when in his or her opimion, a firte hazard exists upon a parcel. The
order shall identlity the fire hazard and diec! such owner or possessor to remove or abate
the fre hazard within a specified period of ime, bul not less than ten days, after such ordes
is given. Every owner or possessor who falls or refuses to abate said fire hazard trom such
parcel within the ime specified after being served with such order is guilty of an infraction
as described - in Santa Barbara County Code, Chapter 15, Article VI Evidence that the
current assessment roll of the County shows real property assessed 10 a person shall
conshtute pnima facie evidence that such person is the owner of such property

4914.7 Order to abate fire hazard --Notice. The chief shall send, by certiied mail, a copy
ol the written order providing information specified in Sec 4914 6, and shall include an
assessor’s parcet number of the parcel set forth on the counly assessment roll, 1o the las!
assessee of the parcel at the address given on such roll. In addition, the order shall provide
the specific date, time and locahon of when the Board of Supervisors of the County of
Santa Barbara will meel to hear the report of the fire chief regarding the alleged fire hazard,
and mclude the lollowing.
"WARNING: The Fire Chief has determined that a fire hazard exsts on this parcel . If not
abated, the Fue Chief or his designee, shall enter and remove o1 abate the fire hazard by
cutting, burning or remaoving the flammable material THE COST OF SUCH REMOVAL
WILL BE COLLECTED BY ADDING 1T ONTO THE TAXES ASSESSED AGAINST THIS
Paicel ANY OWNER OR POSSESSOR INTENDING TO ABATE THIS FIRE HAZARD
AT HIS OWN EXPENSE SHOULD DO SO IMMEDIATELY "

The chief shall post each notice to abate including the legal description in some
conspicuous place in the office of the clerk ol the board ol supervisors. It shall be the
responsibility of the owner of record in the cuirent assessment roll to nolify any new owner
or possessor of the parcel of the notice that was received and lorward the notice to the new
owner or possessor of the parcel. It shall also be the responsibility of the current owner of
record to nohify the fire department of this change in ownership. .

49148 Order to abate fire hazard--Posting Location. The chief may, in addition lo
matling, have a written order posted in front of any parcel upon which a fire hazard exists,
or. it such parcel does not front upon any streel, highway o1 road, then either upon the
portion of such parcel nearest to a street, highway or road or upon such portion that is likely
to give aclual notice to the owner or lawful possessor.

4314.9 Order to abate fire hazard--Posting Time. The order provided for in Sec. 4914 .8
shall be posted at least ten days before the board meels to hear the report of the chief
regarding the alleged fire hazard

4914.10 Hearing. Al the time and place stated in the wrilten orders, the board shall meet
to hear the 1eport of the chief and any objections thereto. The chief or his designated
representative shall atltend, intorm the board as to the alleged fire hazard and supply the
legal description of the parcel upon which it exists, the name and address of the last known
assessee thereof and state whal he has done in order lo give notice of the hearing
according to the provisions of this article. The board may continue from time to time as il
sees fil

491411 Board of Supervisors’ direction to abate fire hazard. If after a hearing, the
board finds thal a fire hazard exists upon a parcel, it may direcl the chief to abate the
hazard. The board shall maintain a record of its proceedings at such hearing and retain
therewith the report of the chief, a legal description of such a lot or land and, where
available, the name and address of its last known assessee.




4914.12 Abatement procedure--Chief authorized to expend funds, contract, etc. If the
board directs the chief 1o abate a fire nazard, he shall proceed o abate such hazard uniess
it has been abaled, completely, before his agents arnve 10 begin such abatement The chiel
may expend appropnated funds for such abatement and may contriact with a3 person of
persons for the performance of the work of such abatement

4914.13 Account of expenses--Report to be filed with the board. The chief shall keep
an account of his expenses when abating a hre nazard pusuant to the diuection of the
board, and file a report with the board. The report shall include the assessor’s lax area and
paicel numbers according 1o the county assessment roll of the parcel upon which such fue
nazard existed and, when available, the name and address of the last known assessee.
The report shall include a reasonable administrative cost in an amount to be hixed by the
board from time 1o time_based on administiative costs of carrying out these regulations.

4914.14 Account of expenses--Filing with clerk--Confirmation hearing. The report of
expenses feferred 10 10 sechon 4914 13 shall be maintamed on fle  open o public
inspection, n the office of the clerk of the board tar at least ten days before a heanng of the
board to confirm such report. If any person shall, hefore the expiration of such ten days, lile
awritten request for notice of the hearing upon such conhirmation, the board shall mail such
notice to the address supplied in any such wrntten request At the hme fixed for such
hearing, the board shall meet to hear any objections to the report of expenses filed by the
chief as required by this section. At such hearnng the board may make any modifications in
the amount it deems just, alter which the repont shall be confirmed.

491415 Expenses constitute special assessment and lien. The amount of expenses
incurred by the chief for abating a fire hazard shall conshitute a special assessment and a
fien against the parcel from which such hazard was removed

4914.16 Expense report to be transmitted to auditor-controller. The board shall dehver
a copy of the expense report, as confirmed, to the auditor-controller ol the county on of
pefore August 1, following such confirmation

4914.17 Inclusion of assessment on property tax bill--Disposition of revenue. The
county auditor-conlroller shall enter the amount stated in the report as a special
assessment against the parcel described in the report. The tax collector of the county shall
include the amount of the assessment on the bill for laxes levied against the parcel. All
laws applicable to the levy, collection and entorcement of county taxes are applicable to
such special assessments All special assessments collected as provided in this arlicle
shall be accounted for as fire district revenue

(k) APPENDIX A - BOARD OF APPEALS is hereby amended by deleling all existing language
and nserting the following

SECTION A101 GENERAL
A101.1 Scope. To determine the suitability of alternate materials and types of construction
and to provide reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this code, there shall be and
hereby is created a board of appeals.

A101.2 Membership and Appointment. The board of appeals shall consist of five
members who are qualified by experience and training 1o pass judgment upon pertinent
matters. The members shall be appointed by the Board of Supervisors and shall hold office
al their pleasure Each member of the executive body has the right lo appoint a member
ihat resides in or out of their supervisor district



A101.3 Quorum. Three members shall conshlule a quorum for a heanng

A101.4 Clerk of the Board. The County Executive Office shall serve as the clerk of the
board of appeals

A101.5 Rules and Regulations. The Board of Supervisors shall adopt reasonable rules
and requlatons for conducting board of appeals hearings and investigations  The board of
appeals may adopl guidehnes for the conduct of their heanngs and investigations, as they
deem appropriate

A101.6 Decisions. The board of appeals shall render decisions and findings in wiiting to
the fue chiel, with a duplicate copy to the appellant. The decisions of 1he board of appeals
may be appealed de novo to the board of supervisors, at the ophtion of the appellant or fire
chiet. provided thal, a request 15 made in witing to the clerk of the board of SUPernvIsors
within 20 days after the decision of the board of appeals was served on the parties. If the
decision of the board of appeals is not appealed o the board of supervisors, it shall be linal
and only subject 1o review by winit of mandale 1o the superior court. If the decision of the
board of appeals 1s appealed to the board of supervisors, the decision of the board of
supervisors shall be final and only subject to review by writ of mandate to the superor
court

NOTE: If a majority of the board of supervisors determines thal its prior involvement
with an appellant, prevents it from serving as a reasonably, impartial, non-involved
decision maker—it-shall decline 1o hear the appeal. I the board ol SUpervisors
dechnes to hear an appeal, the decision of the board of appeals shall be deemed
final and only subject to review by wril of mandate 1o the superior court

A101.7 Terms of office. The term ot office of a member of the board of appeals shall
coincide with the term of office of the County Supervisor that appointed the member

A101.8 Stay of enforcement. The fiing of an appeal apphcation shall not stay an
enforcement order However, the fire chief may modily, i his or her sole discretion, an
enforcement order during the pendency of an appeal

A101.9 Subpoena powers. The subpoena powers of the Board of Supervisors set farth in
Article 9, Section 25170 el seq. of the Government Code are delegaled to the board of
appeals and shall apply lo all hearings and investigations under the board of appeals’
junsdiction '

A101.10 Fees. A fee of two hundred dollars shall be paid by the appellant to the clerk of
the board of appeals at the time of application for a hearnng before the board of appeals |t
the decision of the board of appeals is appealed to the board ot supervisors, an additional
fee of four hundred and forty-three dollars shall be paid by the appealing parly, to the clerk
of the board of supervisors, al the time of application for a hearing before the board of
SUPETVISOIS

A101.11  Junisdiction.  This appeal process shall apply to disputes  within  the
unincorporated area of the fire district, within incorporated areas of the fire district and
within incorporated areas outside of the fire district where the fire department provides
service by contract However, a city council of an impacted city, may adopl an alternative
procedure for reviewing decisions of the board of appeals

{1} APPENDIX C ~ FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION is hereby amended by
adding the words " and Sanla Barbara County Fire Depariment Development Standards” after
the word "appendix” in Section C101 1



{m) APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS 15 hereby amended by deleting all
existing language except SECTION D105 AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

Sec. 15-4. Findings with regard to geological, topographical and
climatic conditions.

The Board hereby finds that all amendments, including additions and deletions, to the CFC are
based upon the following geological, topographical and climatic conditions in the area protected
by the Santa Barbara Counly Fue Department Those condiions include:

{a) That the Santa Barbara County Fire Departrent service area 1s prone to extreme weather
conditions, from hot dry winds from the east (Santa Ana and Sundowner winds), to strong
westerly (coastal) winds, which greally enhance the ability for fire to spread In addition, the
topographical layout and features of the Counly Fie Department's service area makes the
area subject toisolation should a flood or earthquake occur, which would prevent or severely
fumit and delay the north and south entibes from giving or receiving mutual aid and
emergency assislance, ' : ‘ '

(b) The present firefighting resouices of this county are constrained in their efforts to control
fires in large unsprinklered buildings within the urban Iimit ine and all buildings outside of the
urban limit line as designated in the county comprehensive plan;

(c) Geologic and topographic conditions in the county result in extended response times for
firebghting resousces, which may contiibute to greater hte and property loss in large
unsprinklered buildings within the urban imit line and in all structures outside of the urban
it line; and

(d) Climatic conditions and flammable vegetation coninbute to the exireme high fire hazard
severity in the counly, resulting in numerous wildland fires, which draw existing fire
department resources fiom their structure protection areas for extended periods of time. This
in turn extends response imes, which may contribute to greater lite and property loss in large
unsprinklered builldings within the urban hmit line and in all structures outside of the urban
limit line.



Article i},

[Remains Unchanged]




Articlies Il

[Remains Unchanged]




Article IV.

[Remains Unchanged]

16



Article V.
Fees
Sec. 15-100. Apphlicability of article.

Ihe fees set forth in this article shall be applicable to the cortesponding inspection
services provided by the Santa Barbara County Fire Department

Sec. 15-101. Fee schedule.

The fees contained in this seclion are based on the average amount of stalt ime required
for inspection, processing andissuance of each permit type

(a) Operational Permits.

Permit Type Fee
105 6 1 Aerosol products $ 99
105 6 2 Amusement buildings
b 99
$ 149
$ 198
105 6 3Awviahion Facilities $ 149
105 6 4 Carnivals and fairs
50-100 occupants $ 99
101-300 occupants $ 149
over 300 occupants $ 297
105 65 Cellulose nitrate fitm $ 198
105 6 7 Combustible fibers b 99
105.6 8 Compressed gases $ 99
105.6 9 Covered mall b 149
105 6.10 Cryogenic fluids b 99
1056 11 Culling and welding b 99
105 612 Dry cleaning plants $ 99
1056 13Exhbits and trade shows $ 274
105.6 14 Explosives $ 206
1056 16 Flammable or combustible hquids
1. Pipeline 3 137
2 To store Class tiquids >5 in. >10 out $ 39
3. To store Class It or 1H-A hiquids >25 in. >60 out $ 99
4 Removal of Class 1 or It liquids from UST CUPA fees apply®
5 To install, construct, alter or operale $ 1,370
equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, wells refinenes. efc
6 To place temporarily out of service a3 tank
usT CUPA fees apply’

~



AST —less than 1320 gations
AST ~ equatto o greater than 1,320 galions
7 To change tank content type
8 To manufactuie process, blend or tefine
9. Dispensing into fuel tanks of motor vehicles
10 Dispensing from tank vehicles 1o motor vehicles
105 6 17 Floor finishing
1056 18 Fruit and crop npening
105 6 19F umigalion or thermal insecticidal fogging
105 6 20 Hazardous malenals {see Groups 1-4 below)
Group 1 (see below

{

Group 2 {see below

Group 3 (see below
(

[N )

Group 4 (see below
105.6 21 HPM Facilite
105 6 22 High-piled storage
105 6.23 Hot work operations
105.6 24 Industnal ovens
105 6 25 Lumber yards and woodworking plants
105 6 26 Liquid or gas fueled vehicles or equipment m
assembly bulldings
105.6.27 L PG gas
105 6 28 Magnesium
1056 29 Miscellaneous combustible storage
105.6.30 Open burning
Agricultural
Backyard
High fire hazard
105.6.31 Open flarmes and torches
105.6.32 Open flames and candles
105.6.33 Organic coatings
105 6.34 Places of assembly
50-100 occupants
101-300 occupants
over 300 occupants
105.6.36 Pyrotechnic special effects material
105.6 37 Pyroxyhin plastics
105 6. 38 Relrigeration equipment
105.6.39 Repair garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities
105.6.40 Rooftop heliports
105 6. 41 Spraying or dipping
105 6 42 Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts
105 6 43 Temporary membrane structures, tenis and canopies
105 6 44 Tire re-building plants
105.6.45 Wasle handling
105.6.46 Wood products
105 6 47 Additional permits (SFM required)
Production facilities

$
$

137
548

CUPA fees apply”
Aclual cost (sec

b
$
$
%
$

L= S S -

N A B P A O

3

A

RS S S Sl

&R N

{ual

99
99
99
99

198

99
198
248
297
198
198

99
274
149

]

99
198
99

50

50

56
99
99
99

99
149
198
274
198

99

99

99
149
137

e
149

Sec

15-102)

ctusal cost (sec 15-102)

15-102)



Pyrotechmc and special effects $ 274
Live audiences $ 137

‘Fees for these permils are covered by the Certified Unified Program Agency's
(CUPA) Underground Storage Tank (UST) Program.

“*Fees lor these permils are covered under the Land Use Permit fee schedule

Group No. 1. $99.00 lor any or all of the following:

1. Hazardous matenals n excess of the amounts listed v Chapter 1, Table

105.6 20 and less than those Iisted in Gioups 2.2,2.3,2.4 38 4

2 Cryogenic fhuds. including flammables, oxidizers or cowrosives {including

oxygen), in excess ol the amounts histed in Appendix Chapter 1, Table 1056 10
Exception: Group 1 does nol include fuel systems of vehicles or fuel used i
connechon with oil-burning equipment

Group No. 2. $198.00 for any or all of the tollowing:

1. Any quantity of explosives, water 1eactive, pyrophoric or hypergolic matenals,
highly toxic poisons;

2. 200 cubic teet or more but less than 2,000 cubic feet at standard temperature
and pressure for compressed gas,

3. 55 gallons or more but less than 550 gallons; or

4. 500 pounds or more but less than 5000 pounds.

Group No. 3. $248.00 for any or all of the following:

1. 2,000 cubic feet or more bul less than 10,000 cubic feet at slandard
temperalure and pressure for compressed gas;

2. 550 gallons or more but less than 2,700 gallons; or

35,000 pounds or more but less than 25,000 pounds.

Group No. 4. 35297.00 for any of all of the following:

110,000 cubic feel or more al standard temperature or pressure for compressed
Qas;

22,700 gallons or more; o1

3 25,000 pounds or more

(b) Construction Permits.

Permit Type Fee
105 7.1Automatic hre-extinguishing systems See below™’
105 7 2Baltery systems 3 274
105 7.3Compressed gases $ 411
105 7 sFire alarm and detection systems and related equipment See below**
105 7 6Fire pumps and related equipment See below**
105 7 1Flammable or combustible hquids
1.To repait or modify a pipeline $ 274
2 To install, construct or alter equipment, tanks plants, terminals. $ 1,370

wells refineries, etc.

3 Toinstall alter, remove. abandon of otherwise dispose of a tank




usT CUPA fees apply’

AST - less than 1,320 gallons $ 274
AST - equal to of greater than 1,320 gatlons $ 548

105 7 8 Hazardous matenals (see Groups 1-4 below)
Group 1 {see below) $ 137
Group 2 {see below) 5 274
Group 3 (see below) $ 343
Gioup 4 (see below) ¢ 411
105 7 9Indusinal ovens $ 274
1057 1oL P gas b 137
105 7 11 Private fire hydrants See below™
105 7 1y Spraying of dipping $ 274
105 7 12 Standpipe systems See below™’
105 7 14 Temporary membrane structures, tents and canopies b 137

‘Fees for these permits are covered by the Certified Uniied Program Agency's
(CUPA) Underground Storage Tank (UST) Program

**Fees for these permits are covered under the Land Use Perrnif fee schedule.

Group No. 1. $137 .00 for any or all of the following

1 Hazardous materials in excess ol the amounts histed i Chapter 1, Table

105.6.20 and less than those listed in Groups 2.2, 23,24, 3 &4,

2 Cryogenic fluids, including flammables, oxidizers or corrosives (including

oxygen), in excess of the amounts listed in Appendix Chapter 1, Table 105.6.10.
Exception: Group 1 does not include fuel syslems of vehicles or fuel used in
connection with oil-burning equipment '

Group No. 2. $274 00 for any or all of the following

1. Any quantity of explosives, water reactive, pyrophoric or hypergolic malerals,
highly toxic poisons,

2 200 cubic feet or more but less than 2 000 cubic feet at standard temperature
and pressure for compressed gas,

3. 55 galions or more but less than 550 galions; o1

4. 500 pounds or more bul less than 5,000 pounds

Group No. 3. $343 00 tor any or all of the following

1. 2,000 cubic feet or more but less than 10,000 cubic feet at standard
temperature and pressure for compressed gas;

2. 550 gallons or more but less than 2,700 gallons, or

3 5,000 pounds or more but less than 25,000 pounds

Group No. 4. $411.00 for any or all of the following

1. 10,000 cubic feet or more at standard temperature or pressure for compressed
gas,;

2 2,700 gations or more; or

3. 25,000 pounds or more

Sec. 15-102. Surcharges.

Surchaiges based on aclual costs will apply when, in the opinion of the Fire Chief,
circurmnstances develop that require extraordinary time for issues including but not limited
to special research, consultation, or numerous Inspections to ensure comphance

~o
)



Sec. 15-103. Petroleum facility response — Cost Recovery.

Petroleum Facily Operators shall pay a tee as specified below, lor any response 0 theu
petroleum facility (and/or associated piping and wells) by the Santa Barbara County Fie
Department that i1s caused by a violalion of Chapter 27 (Hazardous Malenal) o1 Chapter 34
(Flammable and Combustible Liquids) of Article 1 of Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara County
Code There shall be no fee for the initial response o a petroleum faciity 10 a calendar year
However, a lee of $712 shall be charged for each subsequent response to a petioleum tacihity in
a calendar year Additionally, if the lime needed by County Fire to mitigate the hazard caused by
any violalion exceeds two hours, the Petroleum Facility Operator shall pay a surcharge based on
County Fue's actual response costs

Exception: Oftshore related Petroleum facilities with Conditional Use Permits and regulated by

the County's Systems Safety and Reliability Review Committee (SSRRC) are exempt from Sec
15-103

5 L2



Article VI.

Violations--Leqal Actions

Sec. 15-121. Cniminal actions.

(a) Any person who violates any of the provisions of this chapter of the Sanla Barbara County
Code or fals lo comply with any order made under this chapler or who builds in violation of any
plans submutted andlor reviewed under this chapter, or who violated the provisions of any
certificate o1 permit 1ssued under this chapler, and/or who falls to comply with an order made
under the authonty of this chapler 1s. for each and every such violahon and noncomphance
respectively, severally gulty of a come  The offense may be hled edher as an mbaction or a
misdemeanor at the discretion of the distnct atiorney

{b) If filed as an nfraction and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a hne not
10 exceed one hundred dollars tor a hrst violation, a fine not to exceed two hundred dollars tor a
cecond violation of the same code provision within a penod of one year, and a fine nol lo exceed
five hundred dollars for each addiional violation of the same code provision within one yeat.

(c) If filed as a rmisdemeanor and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than five hundred dollars nor more than twenty-five thousand dollars, of imprisonment
in the county jail for a period not to exceed ninety days, or by bolh such fine and impnsonment,
except that where such prior convictions, as either infractions or misdemeanors, are alleged in
the accusatory pleading, and either admitted by the defendant in open court, or found to be true
by a jury trying the case, or by the courtin a case where guilt s established by a plea of guilty or
nolo contendere, or by trial by the court siting without a jury, the punishment shall be a fine of not
less than one thousand dollars nor more than twenty-five thousand dollars, or impnsonment in the
county jail for a period not to exceed one hundred eighty days. o by both such fine and

imprisonment

(d) Each and every day durning any portion of which any violation of this chapter or the rules,
requlations, orders, of permits issued there under, i1s committed, continued or permilted by such
person, fum, or corporation shall be deemed a separate and distinct offense (Ord. No. 3788, Ord
No 4494)

Sec. 15-122. Civil Actions.

{a) Injunctive Relief. Whenever any person, firm, or corporation has engaged in of 15
aboul to engage in any act or practice which conslitutes or will constitute a violation of any
provision of this chaptler or any rule, regulation, order, of permit issued thereunder, the
district altoiney, county counsel or district counsel may make apphcation lo the Superiot
Court for an order enjoining such act or practice, or for an order directing comphance, and
upon a showing by the fire department that such person, fum, or corporation has engaged
in or is about to engage in any such act or practice, a permanent or prehminary injunction,
temporary restraiming order, or other order may be granted

(b) Abatement. In lhe event thal any person, firm, or corporation shall talt to abate a
violation hereunder after notice of sarme and opportunity to correct or end the violation, the
district attorney, county counsel of district counsel may apply 1o the Superior Court of this
county for an order authorizing the fire department to undertake those actions necessary
to abate the violalion and requuing the violator to pay for the costs of such undertaking
(Ord. No 3788; Ord No 4494)



Sec. 15-123. Civil remedies and penaities.

(a) Civil Penalties. Any person, whether acting as prncipal, agent, employee  or
otherwise. who willfully violates any of the provisions of this chapter or any rule, regulation,
order or permit issued thereunder, shall be liable for s civil penalty not to exceed twenty-
five thousand dollars for each day thal the violalion continues 1o exist.

{b) Costs and Damages. Any person, whether as pnincipal, agent, employee or otherwise,
violates any of the provisions of this chapter or the rules, requlations, order or permits
issued thereunder. shall be liable to the County of Santa Barbara for the costs incurred
and the damages suffered by the counly s agents, and agencies as a direct and
proximale result of such violation(s).

{c) Procedure. In determining the amount of the civil penally to impose, the Count shall
consider all relevant circumstances, including, but not hmited to, the extent of the harm
caused by the conduct constituting a violation. the nature and persistence of such conduct,
the length of ime over which the conduct occurred, the danger to public health and safety,
the corrective achen, If any, laken by the detendant and the assets, habililies, and net
worth of the violator(s) {Ord No. 3788, Ord No. 4494)

Sec. 15-124. Cumulative remedies and penalties.

The remedies or penalties provided by this section are cumulative to each other and to the
remedies of penalties available under all other taws of this state. (Ord. No. 3788; Ord. No.
4494)

Sec. 15-125. Citations--Enforcement procedures.

Personnel assigned to the Bureau of Fire Prevention may be guided by the operating
procedures as oullined in the 2010 CFC, Chapter 1, Sec 109 Violations (Ord. No. 3788;
Ord. No 4494)




Articie VI

[Remains Unchanged]



Section Three

“This ordinance shall lake effect and be in force thirty days from the date of i1s passage. and
belore the expiration ol fiteen days after its passage it shall be pubhshed. with the names of Ihe
members of the Board of Supervisors voting tor and against the same, in the Sanla Barbara
News Press, the Lompoc Record and the Santa Mana Times, which are newspapers of general

circulation published i the County of Santa Barbara ™

PASSED APPROVE D AND ADOPTED this T4tBayof 2010, by the following vote
December
AYES Supervisors Carbajal, Woll, Farr, Gray

NOES Supervisor Centeno
ABSTAIN. None

ABSENT None o

}/// 1 ////W/
J%e Wolf V/

(\au Board of Supervisors
4

ATTEST: o

C i/\NDRA WALLAR

%BO/\RU

Deputy

(DO NOT PUBLISH APPROVAL]

MICHAEL W, DYER

FIRE CHIEF

SANTABARBARA @puww/mm
\

APPROVED AS TO FORM APPROVED AS TO ACCOUNTING FORM
DENNIS MARSHALL, ROBERT W. GEIS, CPA
COWN]Y COUNSEL AUDITOR-CONTROLLER
ot
By /’w///'f'




