STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

February 20, 2014

Luis Sainz

Building Official

City of National City
1243 National City Blvd.
National City, CA 91950

RE: Ordinance #2013-2382, 2386, 2387, 2388, 2389, 2390, 2391, 2392, 2393, 2394
Dear Mr. Sainz:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on January 16, 2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain ten ordinancs modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modifications are accepted for filing and are enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,
M 4

/é;ue M. Rodrig%

Associate Construction Analyst

cc:  Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



ot GALIFORNIA s

| TONAL CI
NAI’L 1907 ,_,-=5

4 INconronmE

CITY OF NATIONAL CITY - DEVELOPMENT SERVICES DEPARTMENT
1243 NATIONAL CITY BLVD., NATIONAL CITY, CA 91950

January 9, 2014

State of California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833-2936

RE: CITY OF NATIONAL CITY CODE ADOPTION AND CHANGES TO THE 2013
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS-TITLE 24

Dear Building Standards Commission,

This letter is to confirm that the City of National City has adopted the current edition of the 2013
California Building Codes, California Code of Regulations, Title 24. Enclosed you will find the
City ordinances outlining the adoptions and the changes made to the state codes. The
changes made are minimal.

If you have any questions regarding our code adoption please contact me directly at 619-336-
4214,

Sincerely,

Luis Sainz
Building Official




4 CALIFORNIA =

NA 'EIONALW

Ca‘ﬂoonm:mﬂ

CiTy OF NATIGNAL CITY - DEVELOPMENT SERVICES DEPARTMENT
1243 NATIONAL CITY BLVD., NATIONAL CITY, CA 91950

January 8, 2014

State of California Bullding Standards Commission
2625 Natomas Park Drive, Sulte 130
Sacramento, CA 85833-2936

RE: CITY OF NATIONAL CITY CODE ADOPTION AND CHANGES TO THE 2013
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS-TITLE 24

Dear Building Standards Commission,

This letter is to confim that the City of National City has adoptad the current edition of the 2013
California Building Codes, California Code of Regulations, Title 24. Enclosed you wiil find the
City ordinances outlining the adoptions and the changes made to the state codes. The
changes mada are minimai.

If you have any questions regarding our code adoption piease contact me directly at 6198-336-
4214,
Sincaraly,

Luis Sainz
Buliding Official



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 — 2392

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING VOLUMES 1 AND Il AND APPENDICES C, G, H, AND | OF THE 2013
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THAT CODE,
AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.08 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

Section 1. The City Council of the City of National City hereby adopis Volumes ! and
I, and Appendices C, G, H, and | of the 2013 California Building Code.

Section 2. The City Council of the City of National City hereby deletes, adds, or
modifies certain provisions of the 2013 California Bullding Code based on local climatic,
topographic, or geclogical conditions that justify deviating from that code.

Section 3. The City Cauncil of the City of National City amends Chapter 15.08 of the
National City Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 15.08
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Sections;
15.08.010  California Building Code — Adopted.
15.08.020  Chapter 2, Definitions — Amended.

15.08.025  Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section 104 “Duties and Powers of Building
Official®, Subsection 104.6 "Right of entry" — Amended.

15,08.030  Chapter 1, DIVISION I|, Section 105 ‘Permits®, Subsection 105.2 "Work
exempt from permit ~ Bullding” - Amended.

15.08.040  Chapter 1, DIVISION li, Section 105 “Permits”, Subsection 105.5
"Expiration” — Amended,

15.08.045  Chapter 1, DIVISION i, Section 105 “Permits”, Subsection 105.7
"Placement of permit’ — Amended. '

15.08.050  Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section 105 "Permits”. Subsection 105.8 "Permit
denial" - Added.

15.08.055  Chapter 1, DIVISION II, Section 109 “Fees®, Subsection 109.2 "Schedule
of permit fees" — Amended.

15.08.056 Plan review fees—Added.

15.08.060  Chapter 1, DIVISION Il, Section 109 “Fees", Subsection 109.4 "Work
commencing before permit issuance” — Amended.

15.08.065  Chapter 1, DIVISION II, Section 110" Inspections”, Subsection 110.3.8.1
"Reinspections” — Added.

16.08.070  Chapter 1, DIVISION [l, Section 111 “Certificate of Occupancy”,
Subsection 111.3 "Temporary occupancy” — Amended.




15.08.075  Chapter 1, DIVISION |I, Section 113 “Board of Appeals”, Subsection 113.1
"Genaral* - Amended.

16.08.080  Chapter 1, DIVISION Il, Section 114 "Violations”, Subsection 114,1
"Uniawful acts" — Amended.

15.08.085 Section 501 "General®, Subsection 501.2 "Address identification” -
Amended.

15.08.090  Table 1505.1 "Minimum roof covering classification for types of
construction™ — Amended.

15.08.082  Chapter 18, Divislon If, Section 1803 "Geotechnical Investigations®,
Subsection 1803.1.1.1.1 — Added.

15.08.083  Chapter 31, Division II, Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and
Safety Devices, Subsection 3109.4.4.8(4) "Construction requirements for
building a pool or spa” — Amended.

15.08.095 Section 3409 “Historic Buildings®, Subsection 3409.1.1. "Historic buildings"
- Added.

15.08.100  Appendix Chapters C, G, H and : — Adopted.

15.08.010 Californla Buiiding Code ~ Adgpted. The city council adopts, for the

purpose of prescribing regulations goveming the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, use, height, area, fire resistance
and maintenancs of all bulldings and/or structures, Volumes | and |l of the 2013 California
Building Code, including both Administration Divisions | and II, published in the Califomia
Building Standards Commission 2013 Edition, based on the Intemational Building Code 2011
Edition, California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2, Part 2.5 of Division 13 of the California
Health and Safety Code beginning with section 18901, and Appendices C, G, H, and I, save and
except such portions as are deleted, added, or modified. Copies of all the codas are filed in the
office of the building official and are adopted and incorperated as fully set out in this chapter,
and the provisions thereof shall be controlling within the city limits.

15.08.020 Chapter 2, Definitions — Amended. Section 202 of the 2013 California

Building Code Is amended by amending the following definition:

Building, Existing. An "existing bullding" is a building erectad prior fo the
adoption of the 2013 Califomia Building Code, or one for which a legal building
permit has been issued. If more than fifty-percent of a structural roof or more than
fifty-percent of all exterior walls are removed as partof a project, the building Is not
an-existing building.

15.08.025  Chapter 1, DIVISION |, Section 104 “Duties and Powers of Building
Official’, Subsection 104.6 "Right of snitry” ~ Amended. Section 104.8 of the 2013 California
Building Code Is amended fo read as follows:

104.6 Right of Enfry. When necessary to make an inspection to enforce
any of the provisions of this code, or when the Authority Having Jurisdiction has

Oedinance No. 2013 — 2392 2 Amanding NCMC Chapter 15,08
Adopied: December 3, 2013 2018 Buliding Code




reasonable cause to believe that there exists a condition that makes such building
or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the Authority Having Jurisdiction, or
designee, may request entry as specified in Chapter 1.12 of the National City
Municipal Code.

15.08.030 Chapter 1, DIVISION |, Secfion 105 “Permits”. Subsection 105.2 "Work
exempt from permit — Building" — Amended. Section 105.2 Buliding: Item 4 of the 2013

California Building Code is amended to read as follows:

Permits for retaining walls shall be as specified in the National City
Municipal Code, Chapter 15.70.

Section 105.2 Building of the 2013 California Bullding Code is amended by
adding the following items:

14,  Playground, gymnastic and similar eguipment and
structures used for recreation and athietic activities accessory to Group R Division
3 structures.

16.  Repairs to lawfully existing Group R Division 3 structures
and Group U occupancy structures accessory to Group R Divigion 3 structures
constructed pursuant to a building permit which involves only the replacement of
component parts or existing work completed with similar materials only for the
purpose of maintenance and do not affect any structural components or plumbing,
mechanical or electrical installations. Repairs exempt from permit requirements
shall not include any addition, change or modification in construction. exit facilities
or permanent fixtures or equipment. Specifically exempt from permit requirements
are:

1) Painting and decorating including refinishing of
exterior stucco finishes.

2) Installation of floor covering.

3) Cabinet work.

4) Outside paving on private property not within the
pubiic right-of-way.

5) Replacement of existing windows with no structural
medification of the existing window opening.

16.  Ground mounted satellite antennas not exceeding ten feet

in diameter and roof mounted satellite antennas not exceeding eight feat in

diameter,
17.  Painted wall signs and styrofoam or other foam mounted
wall signs.
5.08.040 Chapter 1, DIVIS Il ion 105 "Permits” ion 105

“Expiration” - Amended. Section 105.5 of the 2013 Callfornia Buliding Code is amended to
read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation and become

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2382 3 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.08
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Building Code




null and vold If the building or work authorized by such permit is not commenced
within six calendar months from the date of such permit, or if the building or work
authorized by such permit is stopped at any time after the work is commenced for
a period of six calendar months, or If the building or work authorized by such permit
exceeds three calendar years from the issuance date of the permit. Work shall be
presumed to have commenced if the permitiee has obtained a required inspection
approval of work authorized by the permit by the Authority Having Jurisdiction
within six calendar months of the date of permit Issuancs.

Work shall be presumed ta be stopped if the permittee has not oblained a
required inspection approval of work by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within
each six-month period upon the initial commencement of work authorized by such
permit.

Before such work can be recommenced, 2 new permit, or a renewal permit
as specified below, shall be first obtained.

1. Permits where work has not commenced. For permits for
which work has not commenced In the first six calendar months from the date of
issuance, a renewal permit may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have been made or will be made In the
original plans and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from
the original Issuance date;

C. The same edition of the California codes is in effect
as ussd in the initial plan check;

D. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a
new permit is paid; and

E. The renewal permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of initial permit issiiance.

Whare later editions of the California codes have been adopted than used
in the inltial plan check, such applications for renewal shall be considered as a new
plan check submittal. Accordingly, pians shall reflect the requirements of the
current codes in effect, a full new plan check is required, and a full new plan check
fee shall be paid. Upon completion of a new plan check, the permit may be
renewed upon payment of a permit fee equal to one-half the amount required for
a new permit.

2, Permits where work has commenced. For permits whers
work has commenced and was subsequently stopped as defined herein, a renewal
permit may be obtained provided that:

A. No changes have been made or will be made in the
original piane and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from
the original issuance date;

C. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a
new permit is paid, except that where construction has progressed and has been
approved to the point of requiring only a final inspection, a fee equal to one quarter
the amount required for a new permit shall be paid; and

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2382 4 Amanding NCMC Chapter 15.08
Adopted: Decamber 3, 2013 2013 Bullding Code




D. A renewa! permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of initial permit issuance.

3. Permits that have exceeded three years. For permits that
have exceeded three years beyond the issuance date, a renewed permit may be
obtained provided that:

_ A Construction in reliance upon the bullding permit has

commenced-and has been approved:;

B. No changes have been made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work: and

C. A fee equal to the full amount required for a new
permit is paid except that where the Authorlty Having Jurisdiction determines that
construction has progressed to the point that a lesser fee is warranted, such lesser
fee shall be pald.

The maximum life of a permit renewal in accordance with subsection
15.08.040.3 shall be one calendar year from the date of renewal. The permit may
be renewed for sach calendar year thereafter provided that all requirements of A,
B and C as staled in subsection 15,08.040.3 are met.

4. Extension of an unexpired permit. For an extension of an
unexpired permit, the permittee may apply for an extension of the time within which
work under that permit may be continued when, for good and satisfactory reasons
as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction in his or her sole discretion, the
permittee is unable to continue work within the time required by section 15.08.040.
The Authority Having Jurisdiction may extend the time for action by the permitiee
for a period not exceeding six calendar months beyond the expiration date In effect
at the time of the extension application, upon written request by the pemittee
showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented
action from being taken.

5. Permits issued where the permittee has been deployed to a
foreign couniry, may be held in abeyance until six months after the retum of the
permittee from his/her deployment if necessary, upon application for such relief by
the permittee.

15.08.04 ter 1, DIV N Il Section 105 “Permits”, Subsaction 105.7
-Placement of permit’ — Amended. Section 105.7 of the 2013 Callfonia Building Code Is
amended to read as foliows: :

Section 105.7 Placement of permit. The building permit or a copy, the
inspection record, and the approved plans shall all be kept on site until the
completion of the project. The inspection record is to be kept on the job unless
removed by the building official.

15.08.050 Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section 105 “Permits’, Subsection 105.8 "Permi
denial" — Added. Section 105.8 is added to the 2013 Callfornia Building Code to read as foliows:

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2392 5 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.08
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Building Code




Section 105.8 Permit depial. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may deny
the iszsuance of & building permit on any property where there exists an unsafe or a
substandard building as provided in Chapter 15.10 and 15.16 of the National City
Municipal Code, or where there axists unlawful construction, or where there exists
a viclation of the National Clity Municipal Code.

15.08.05 ter 1, BIVISION i, Section 108 “Fees" section 108.2 “Schedule
of parmit fees” — Amended. Section 109.2 of the 2013 Californla Bullding Code Is amended to
read as follows:

Section 108.2 Schedule of permi fees. Permit fees, including plan review
fees, shall be assessed in accordarce with the current City of National City Fee
Schedule.

15.08.056 ___ Plan review fees — Added. When plans are incomplete or changed so as
to require addltional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be chargad in accordance
with the current City of Natfonal City Fee Schedule.

15. 0 er 1, DIVISION n 109 “Fees”, Subsection 109.4 "Work
commenc:gg befere permit issuance” — Amended. Section 109.4 of the 2013 California Buiiding

Cede is amended to read as follows:

Section 109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who

commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or
plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an
administrative penalty equal to the inspection fee portion the permit fee that would
be required by this code if a permit were to be issued. The administrative penalty
is in addition to a permit fee.

When & plan review is required for issuance of such permit, the plan review
fee portion witi not be subject to said penalty. The payment of such administrative
penalty shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of
this code or from any penalty prescribed by law.

08.065 Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section 110 “inspections”, Subsection 110.3.8.1
“Re-inspections” — Added. Section 110.3.8.1 is added to the 2043 California Building Code to -
read as follows:

Section 110.3.8.1 Re-inspections. A re-inspection fee may be assessed

for sach inspection or re-inspecticn when any of the following occurs:

1. The portion of work for which the inspection was called is
not complete orthe corrections previously required and called for are not mads;

2. Calling for an inspection before the job is ready for such
inspaction or re-inspection;

3 The inspection record card or the approved plans are not
posted or otherwise available to the inspecior;

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2362 6 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.08
Adopted: Dscember 3, 2013 2018 Building Code




4, Failure to provide access on the date for which the
inspection is requested; or

5. Deviating from the approved pians when such deviation or
change required approval of the building official.

To obtaln a re-inspection, the pemmittee shall file an appilcation in writing
on a form provided for that purpose and pay the re-inspection fee in accordance
with the current City of National City Fee Schedule. In instances where a re-
inspection fee has been assessed, no further inspections shall be performed until
the fees have been paid.

15.08.070 Chapter 1, DIVISION i, Section 111 “Certificate of Occupancy”’,
Subsection 111.3 "Temporary ogcupancy” — Amended. Section 111.3 of the 2013 California

Building Code is amended to read as follows:

Section 111.3 Temporary Certificate of Occupancy. Where a project or a

major portion thereof is substantially complete and can be safely occupied, but
practical difficulties deiay completion of work, the building official may issue a
Temporary Certificate of Occupancy for the use of a portion or portions of the-
building or structure prior to the completion of the entire project.

Prior to issuance of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy, the premises
shall be inspected by all affected city departments who shall prepare a list of work
required to be completed and shall forward the list along with a recommendation
for approvel or disapproval of the issuance of a Temporary Certificate of
Occupancy to the building official.

Upon receipt of a recommendation for approval from all affected City
departments, the building official may prepare a Temporary Certificate of
Occupancy granting temporary occupancy that shall include the following:

1. Work yst to be completed;

2. Maximum time allotted for completion of said work:

3. Property owner's signature and the signature of the
contractor agresing to complete the work within the prescribed time or vacate the
premises upon order of the building official until such work is cempieted;

4. Evidence that a faithful performance bond has been posted
if required by any affected city department: and

5. A copy of the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy granting
temporary occupancy shall be provided o all affected city departments.

15.08.075  Chapter 1. DIVISION I, Section 113 "Board of Appeals”, Subsection

113.1 "General® — Amended, Section §13.4 of the 20153 Cslifornia Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

Section 113.1 Board of Appeals. The City Council, pursuant to National
City Municipal Code Chapter 15.04, shall have jurisdiction to review the items as
enumerated in Chapter 15.08 of the National City Municipal Code.

Ordinance No. 2018 - 2392 7 Amending NCMC Chapter 15,08
Adoptad: December 3, 2013 2013 Building Code




15.08.080 ° Chapter 1, DIVISION |I, Section 114 "Violations”, Subsection 114.1

*Uniawful acts" ~ Amended. Sestion 114.1 of the 2043 Callfornia Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

Section 114.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or
corporation fo erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove,
convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buliding or structure or
cauge or pemit the same to ba done in viotation of this code.

Violation of any provision of this code shall be punishable as a
misdemeanor and shall carry the penalties as prescribed in Chapter 1.20 of the
Nationai City Municipal Code.

15.08.085 Section 501 “General”. Subseglion 501.2 "Address identification" =

Amended. Ssction 501.2 of the 2013 Callfornia Building Code Is amended to reed as follows:

Section 501.2 Address numbers. Every principal builkding or structure
within the incorporated limits of the City of National City shall be identified by a
designeted street number as issued by the National Ciy Fire Department.

Approved numbers or addresses shall be piaced on all new and existing
buildings, adjacent to the principal entrance to the premises or at a peint that is
highly visible and legible from the street. If necessary, directional signs shali be
posted showing proper access to the given address from a point where the Fire
Department access roadway leaves the dedicated street, to the entrance of each
addressed building. All such numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabetical
letters and shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102mm) high with & minimum stroke
width of 0.5 Inches (12.7mm), and shall be placed on a contrasting background.

15.08.090 able 1508.1 "Minimum roof covering classification for tvpes of
construction® — Amended. Table 1505.1 of the 2013 Callfomnia Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

Due o climatic and geographical conditions within the City of National City.
Tabie 1505.1 is amended as follows:

Table 1505.1
Minimum Roof Covering Classification
For Types of Construction ‘
A B jwa Ts  Twa Tue v [va |vB |
B | B B B B B B B |
15.08.082 Cha 18, Division ion 1803 " | Investigations”

Subsection 1803.1.1.1.1 — Added. Chapter 18, Division II, Section 1803 Geotechnical
Investigations, Subsection 1803.1.1.1.1 is added to the 2013 California Building Code to read as
follows:

Ondinance No. 2013 — 2392 8 Amending NCMC Chapter 15,08
Adopted: Decamber 3, 2013 2013 Buliding Code




Subsection 1803.1.1.1.1. A geotechnical investigation shall be submitted
with each application for a building pemmit for a2 new building or addition 500
square feet and larger. The investigation and report shall comply with the
requirements of Section 1803.

16.08.093 Chapter 31, Division i, Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and
Safety Devices, Subsection 3108.4.4.8(4) "Construction requirements for building a pool or spa”

=Amended. Section 3109.4.4.8 (4) of the 2013 California Building Code is amended to read as
follows: '

Section 3100.4.4.8 (4) Construction requirements for building a pool or

spa. Whenever any building permit is issued and there is an existing swimming
pool, toddler pool or spa, the permit shall require that the suction outlet of the
existing swimming pool, toddler peol or spa be updated so as to be equipped with
an anti-entrapment cover meeting current standards of the American Society for
Testing and Materials (ASTM) or the American Society of Mechanical Engineers
(ASME).

15.08.095 Section 3409 "Historical Bulldings®, Subsection 3409.1.1 "Historic
buildings"-—Added. Section 3408.1.1 is added to the 2013 California Building Code to

read as follows:

Section 3409.1.1 Histaric Buiidings. The repair, aiteration, enlargement,
maintenance and moving of historic buildings which are designated as historic
pursuant to National City Municipal Code Chapter 18.139 shall comply with the
provisions of the State Historical Building Code (Part 8, Title 24, California Code
of Regulations} and shall be subject to the review of permit requirements of
National City Municipal Code Chapter 18.12.

15.08.100  Appendix Chapters C, G, H. and ! ~ Adopted. Appendix Chapters C, G, H

and i of the 2013 California Bullding Code are adopted.

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of December;

Michasl R. Dalla, Clty Clerk

Ordinance No. 2013 ~ 2392 9 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.08
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Building Code




Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Councilmembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rics, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None.
Absent: None,

Abstain:  None.

AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORRISON
Mayor of the City of National Cily, California

/

' Deputy

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Counil and that there was avaliable for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregeing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2392 of the Citv Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on December 3, 2013,

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

Deputy




ORDINANCE NO. 2013 - 2386

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, INCLUDING ANNEX H,
AND THE 2011 NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE, AND AMENDING CERTAIN
SECTIONS OF THOSE CODES, AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.24
OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

Section 1. The City Councl! of the City of Nationai City adopts the 2013 California
Electrical Code, Annex H of the 2013 California Electric Code, Califomia Code of Regulations,
Title 24, Part 3, including all Annexes, and the 2011 National Electrical Code.

Section 2, The Clity Council of the City of National City deletes, adds, or modifies
certain provisions of the 2013 California Electrical Code and Annex H of the 2013 California
Bullding Code.

Section 3. The City Council of the City of National City amends Chapter 15.24 of the
National City Municipal Code to read as foflows:

Sections:

15.24.005 2013 Califernia Electrical Code, Annex H of ths 2013 California Electrical
Code and the 2011 National Electrical Code — Adopted and amended.

15.24.010  Annex H, Administration and enforcement — Adopted and amended.

16.24.015  Annex H, Section 80.13 “Authority”, Subsection 80.13(7) "Right of entry" —
Amended.

15.24020  Annex H, Section 80.13 “Authority”, Subsection 80.13(17) “Electric
Fencas Prohibited” — Added.

15.24.025 Annex H, Section 80.15 "Electrical Board" ~ Amended.

15.24.030 Annex H, Section 80.18 "Permits and Approvals®, Subsection 80.19(D)
"Annual permits" — Deleted.

15.24.035 Annex H, Section 80. 18 "Permits and Approvals®, Subsection 80.19(E)
"Fees" —~ Amendead.

16.24.037  Annex H, “Work commencing before permit issuancs® — Added

15.24.040 Annex H, Section 80.19 *Permits and Approvals®, Subsection 80.19(F)
"inspection and approvals® — Amended.

15.24.045  Annex H, Section 80.19 “Permits and Approvais”, Subsection 80.19(H)
“Applications and extensions” — Amended. -

15.24.050 Annex H, Section 80.19 “Permits and Approvals”, Subsection 80.18()
“Permit denial® - Added.

15.24.055 Annex H, Section 80.23 "Notice of violations, penalties” - Amended.



16.24.060  Annex H, Section 80.25 *Connection to electrical supply”, Subsection
80.25(C) "Notification” — Deleted.

15.24.085  Annex H, Section 80.27 "Inspactor's qusiifications” — Deleted.
15.24.070  Annex H, Section 80.29 "Liabillty for damages” — Daleted,
15.24.080  Annex G, Supervisory Control and Data Acguisition (SCADA) — Deleted,

15.24.005 2013 California Elecfrical Code, Annex H of the 2013 Califernia Electrical

Code and the 2011 National Electrical Code — ed amended. The city council adopts
the 2013 Celifornia Electrical Code, Annex H of the 2013 California Electric Code, California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 3, including all Annexes, and the 2011 National Electrical
Code, for the purposs of prescribing in the City of National City, regulations governing the
inspection of installations, investigation of fires caused by electrical installations, the raview of
construction plans, drawings, and speoifications for electrical eystems, the design, alteration,
modification, construction, maintenance, and testing of slectrical systems and equipment, the
regulation and control of electrical installations at special events Including but not limited to
axhibilts trade shows, amusement parks, and other similar special occupancies, Iin or on any
building or structure, or outdoors on any premises or property. The City Council amends,
deletes, or adds certain sections of the 2013 Electrical Code, Annex H of the 2013 Electrical
Code, and the 2011 National Electrical Code, based on local climatic, opographic or geological
conditions that justify deviating from sald Codes. Copies of these codes are flled in the office of
the building official, and are adopted and incorporated as if fully set out in this chapter, and the
provisions thereof shall be controlling within the city limits.

15.24.01 Annex H, Administration and enforcement — Ado and amended.
ANNEX H to the 2013 California Electrical Code entitled "Administration and Enforcement”, is
adopted subject to the following additions, amendments and deletions contained in this chapter.

15.24.01 Anne Saction 80,13 “Authority”, Subsection 80.13(7) "Right of entrv" —
Amended. Section 80.13(7) of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical Code is amended to
read as follows:

80.13(7) Right of entry. When necessary to make inspections to enforce
any provision of this code, or when the Authority Having Jurisdiction has
reasonable cause to belisve that there exlsts in any bullding or upon any premiseg
a condition or code violation which makes such building or premises unsafe,
dangerous or hazardous, the Authority Having Jurisdiction , or designee, may
request entry as specified in Chapter 1.12 of the National City Municipal Cods.

15.24.020 _ Annex ction 80,13 "Authority”, Subsestion 80.13(17) “Electric
Fences Prohibited” — Added. Sectian 80.13 {17} is added o Annex H of the 2013 California
Electrical Code as follows:

80.13 (17). Eleclric Fences Prohibited. No electric fence shall be
constructed maintained or operated within the City of National City. Eleciric fences
as used herein, inciude all fences which in any way use electrical energy as an

Ordinence No. 2013 — 2386 2 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.24
Adapted: December 3, 2013 2013 Electrical Code



additional deterrent or have wires charged with eleciricity which are not covered
with adequate insulation to protect persons and animals coming In contact
therawith.

15.24.025 _Annex H, Section 80.15 "Elsctrical Board" — Amended. Section 80.15 of

Annex H of the 2013 Callfornia Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

80.15 Advisory and Appsasis Board. The City Council, pursuant to Chapter

15.04, shali have the jurisdiction to review the ltems as enumerated in Chapter
15.24 of the National City Municipal Code.

15.24.030 Ann Section 80.18 "Permits and A Is”, Subssction 80.19(D
"Annual permits” - Deleted. Section 80.19(D) of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical Code
is deleted.

15.24.035 __ Annex H, Section 80.19 *Pemits and rovaigs”. ction 80.19(E
Fees” -~ Amended. Section 80.19(E) of Annex H of the 2013 Californla Electrical Code is
amended to read as follows:

Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the current City of National City
Fee Schedule.

15.24.037 Annex H, "Work commenclng before permit issuance” — Added.
Work commencing before permit Issuance. Any person who commences

any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be Subject to an administrative
penalty equal to the inspection fee portion the permit fee that wouid be required by
this code if a permit were to be issued. The administrative penalty ie in addition fo
& permit fee.

When a plan review is required for issuance of such permit, the plan review fee
portion will not be subject to said penally. The payment of such administrative penalty
shall not exsmpt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code or
from any penalty prescribed by law.

24 040 % H, Section 80.19 "P
"inspection and approvais® — Amended. Section 80.1
Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

i Is”, Subsection 80.19(F
9(F) of Annex H of the 2013 California

(1) Al elecirical systems and equipment for which a permit is required
by this code shall be subject to inspection by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, and
the electrical system shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes
until approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

It shall be the duty of the permittee 1o cause the electrical system
to remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes. Neither the Authority
Having Jurisdiction, nor the City of National City shall be fiable for the expense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to permit

Ordinance No, 2013 - 2386 3 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.24
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Electrical Code



Inepection. When the instaliation of an electricei system and aquipment Is
complete, an additional and final inspection shall be made. Electrical systams and
equipment regulated by this code shall not be connected to the energy source until
authorized by the Authortty Having Jurisdiction.

Approval as a result of an ingpection shall not be construed to be
an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of
the City of National City. inspections presuming to give authority to viclate or
cancel provisions of this code or other ordinances of the City ¢f National City shalil
not be valid.

{2) inspection requests. It shali be of the duty of the permittee to notify
the Authority Having Jurisdiction that such work Is ready for inspection. The
Authority Having Jurisdiction may require that every request for Inspection be filed
at least one working day before such inspsction is desired. Such request may be
in writing or by telephone at the option of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

it shail ba the duty of the pammittee o provide access to and means
for inspection of such work.

(3)  Operation of Electrical Equipment. The requirements of section
15.24.040 shall not be construed to prohibit the operation of any electrical system
or equipment installed to replace existing equipment. The request for inspection of
such equipment must have been with the Authority Having Jurisdiction not more
than forty-eight houre after such replacement work is completed and before any
portion of such slectrical system is concealad by any permanent portion of the
building.

(4)  Re-inspections. A re-inspection fee may be assessed for each
inspection or re-inspection when any of the following occurs:

A The portion of the work for which the inspection was called
is not complete or the corrections previously required are not made:

B Calling for an inspection before the job is ready for such
inspection or re-inspection;

] The inspection record card or the approved plans are not
posted or otherwise available to the inspector;

D Fallure to provide eccess on the date for which the
inspection is requested; or

E Deviating from the approved plans when such deviation or
change required approval of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

To obtain a re-inspection, the permitiee shall file an application in
writing on a form provided for that purposs and pay the re-inspection fee in
accordance with the current City of National City Fee Schedule. In Instances
where re-inspection feee have been assessed, no further Inspsctions shall be
performed until the fees have been paid.

15.24.045 Annex H jon 80,19 * its and A 8°, Subsection 80.19(H
8 and "~ A . Sectlon 80.19{H) of Annex H of the 2013 California
Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

Ondinance No. 2013 ~ 2388 4 Amending NCMC Chapier 15.24
Adopled: December 3, 2013 2013 Electrical Code



Ordirance No. 2013 - 2386 5 Amending NCMC Chepter 15.24
Adopied: December 3, 2013

80.19(H) Application end Extensions. Every permit issued by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation and

become null and void if the bullding or work authorized by such permit is not
commenced within six calendar months from the date of such permit, or if the
building or work authorized by such permit is stopped at any time after the work is
commenced for a period of six calendar months, or if the buliding or work
authorized by such permit exceeds three calendar yaars from the issuance date
of the permit. Work shall bs presumed to have commenced if the pemmittee has
obtained a required Inspection approval of work authorized by the permit by the
Authority Having Jurisdiction within six calendar months of the date of permit
issuance.

Work shall be presumed to be stopped if the permiftes has not obtained a
required inspection approval of work by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within
each six month period upon the initial commencement of work authorized by such
pemit.

Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit, or a renewal permit
as specified below, shall be first obtained.

1. Permits where work has not commenced. For permits for which
work has not commenced in the first six calendar months from the date of issuance,
a renewal permit may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have been made or will be made in the original
plans and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from the
original issuance date;

C. The same edition of the Califomnia codes is in effect as used
in the initial plan check;

D. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a new permit
is paid; and

E. The renewal permit shall expire three calendar years from
the date of initial permit issuance.

Where later editions of the California codes have been adopted
than used in the initial plan check, such applications for renewal shall be
considered as a new pian check submitial, Accordingly, pians shall reflect the
requirements of the current codes in effect, a full new plan check is required, and
a full new plan check fee shall be paid. Upon completion of a new pian check, the
permit may be renewed upon payment of & permit fee equal to ons-half the amount
required for a new pemit.

2. Permits where work has commenced. Eor permits where work has
commenced and was subsequently stopped as defined herein, a renewal permit
may be obtained provided that: '

A No changes have been made or will be made in the original
plans and specifications for such work;

B. The explration has not exceeded three years from the
original issuance dale;

C. A fee squal to one-half the amount required for a new permit
is paid, excapt that where construction has progressed and has been approved to

2013 Elecirical Code



the point of requiring only a final inspection, a fee equal o one guarter the amount
required for a new permit shall be paid; and

D. A renewal permit shail expire three calendar years from the
date of inltial parmit lssuancs.

3. Permits that have excesded three years. For permits that have
exceeded three years beyond the issuance date, a renswed permit may be
obtained provided that:

A Construction in reliance upon the buiiding permit has
commenced and has been approved;

B. No changes have been made or will be made in the original
plans and specifications for such worl;

: C. A fee equal to the full amount required for a new permit is
paid except that where the Authority Having Jurisdiction determines that
construction has progressed to the point that a lesser fee is warranted, such lessor
fee shell be paid.

The maximum life of a permit renewal in accordance with
subsection 15.24.045.3 shall be one calendar year from the date of renewal. The
permit may be renewed for each calandar year thereafter provided that all
requirements of A, B, and C as stated in subsection 15.24.045.3 are met.

4, Extension of an unexpired permit. For an extension of an unexpired
permit, the permitiee may apply for an extension of the time within which work
under that permit may be continued when for good and satisfactory reasons as
determined by the Autherity Having Jurisdiction in his or her sole discretion, the
permittee is unable to continue work within the time required by section 15.24.045.
The Authority Having Jurisdiction may extend the time for action by the pemitiee
for a period not exceeding six calendar months beyond the expiration date in effect
at the time of the extension application, upon written request by the permitiee
showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented
action from being taken.

. Permits issued where the pemmittee has been deployed o a foreign
country, may be held in abeyance until six months after the return of the permittee
from his/her deployment if necessary, upon application for such relief by the
pemmittee.

15,24.0 nex H, Section 80,18 * ) rovalg” io
“Permit denlal" — Added. Section 80.16(l) is added to Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical
Code to read as follows;

80.18(i) Permit Denigl. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may deny the
issuance of & building permit on any property where there exists an unsafe or
substandard building as provided in Chapter 15.10 and 15.16 of the National City
Municipal Cods, or where there exists unlawful construction or a violation of the
National Clty Municipal Code.

15.24.055 Annex H, Section 80.23 "Notice of violations alties” — Amended.
Section 80.23 of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2386 6 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.24
Adoptsd: Dacember 3, 20413 2013 Electrical Code



80.23 Violations, Penalties. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or
corporation fo erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove,
convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or
cause or permit the same fo be done in violation of this code.

Violations of any provisions of this code may be punishable as a
misdemeancr and shell carry the penalties as prescribed in Chapter 1.20 of the
National City Municipal Code.

15.24.080 Annex H, Section 80.26 "Connection to electrical su Subsection

80.25(C)"Notification” — Degloted. Section 80. 25(C) of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical
Code is deleted.

4.065 Annex H, Section 80.27 "Ins g lifications® — Deleted. Section
80.27 of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical Code is deleted.

15.24.070 Annex H, Section 80.29 "Liability for damages"” — Deleted. Section 80.29
of Annex H of the 2013 California Electrical Code is deletsd.

Annex G ofthe 2013 Callfomia Electrical Code is deleted,
PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of Decem

on Morrison, Mayor

Crdinance No. 2013 - 2386 7 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.24
Adopted: Decambar 3, 2013 2013 Elecirical Code



Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National Clty, Callfornia, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes; Councilmembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None.
Ahsent; Nore.

Abstain; None.

AUTHENTICATED BY’ RON MORRISQ
Mayor of the City of National City, California

f.J 4
City CierK of the City of National City, California

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vots of not less than a
majority of the membars elected to the Council and that there was available for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinances.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2386 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on December 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National City, Cafifornia

By:

Deputy



ORDINANCE NO 2013 - 2387

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND THE APPENDICES
THERETO, ADOPTING THE NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION
ASSQCIATION STANDARDS, AND AMENDING
CHAPTER 16.28 OF THE NATIONAL GITY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Council of the City of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1. The City Councll of the City of National City hereby adopts the 2013
California Firs Code, Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of Regulations, the Appendices
thereto, and the National Fire Protection Assaciation Standards.

Section 2. The City Councll finds that the amendments being made In this Chapter
15.28 are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, or topographicat
conditions: namely, that the age of structures, separation and density create an Increased risk of
conflagration meriting more stringent standards. A copy of this ordinance shall be filed with the
Office of the State Fire Marshal and the State Building Standards Commission. This action is
taken pursuant to Health and Safety Code sections 17958.7 and 18941.5.

Section 3. The City Councll of the City of National City hereby amends and deletes
certain sections of the 2013 California Fire Code, based on local climatic, topographic or
geclogical conditions that justify deviating from that Code.

Section 4. The City Coungil of the City of National City hereby amends Title 15,
Chapter 15.28 to read as follows:

CHAPTER 15.28

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
Sections:

15.28.002 Findings and declarations.

15.28.010 2013 California Fire Code ~ Adopted and amended.
15.28.020 Establishment and duties of fire prevention bureay,
15.28.030 Definitions.

15.28.035 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited — Amended.

15.28.040  Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of Class | and |l fiquids
in outside aboveground tanks is prohibited — Amended,

15.28.050  Establishment of limits in which storage of liqusfied petroleum is
prohibited — Amended.



15.28.080  Establishment of Limits for Storage of Explosives and Blasting Agents is
to be Prohibited ~ Amended.

i5.28.070  Amendments made to the 2043 Califomnia Fire Cede.
15.28.080  Section 101.5 "Referenced Codes™ — Amended.
15.28.085  Section 307.4.1 "Bonfires" ~ Amended.

15.28.080  Section 307.4.2 "Recreationgl Fires" — Amended.
15.28.100  Section 1011.6.1 "Graphics” — Amended.

15.28.110 Section 5704.3.3.9 "Storage of Empty Wooden or Plastic Pallets" -
Supplemented.

15.28.120  Section 503.2.7 and Appendix Section D103.2 "Grade” — Amended.
15.28,130  Section 503.8 "Securily Gates” - Amended.
15.28.140  Appeals.

15.28.150  New materials, processes or occupancies, which may require permits.
15.28.160  Penalties,

Findings jong. The city council of the city of National Chty,
doaes specifically and exprassly find and declare that the nature and uniqueness of the local
climate, geographical and topographical conditions in the city of National City does reasonably
necessitate and demand specific changes in and variations from the 2013 California Fire Code,
which are noted in and made part of this chapter as authorized by Health and Safety Code
Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5. These conditions result from the age and concentration of
struciures and the increased risk of conflagration spread as a result.

ja Fire Code — nd a d. There is adopted by
the city counci! of the city of National City for the purpose of prescribing regulations goveming
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardouz materials OF expiosion and
establishing a fire prevention bureau the 2013 California Fire Code, and the appendicss thersto,
including both Administration Divisions | and il, published by the Intemational Cade Council and
the Caiifomia Building Standards Commission, and the National Fire Protection Association
Standards (current edition) published by the National Fire Protection Association, save and
except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, added, or amended. Within this chapter, those
codes may be collectively referred to as the California Fire Code. One copy of this adopted code
is on file In the office of the fire chief of the city of Nafional City. The code Is adopted and
incorporated as fully as if set out as length herein, and from the date on which thig chapter shall
take sffect, shail be controlling within the limits of the city of National Clty,

15.28.02 ablishment and duties revention A
- Al The Califernia Fire Code shall be enforced by the fire prevention bureau in the

fire department in the city of National City, which is established and shall be operated under the
supervision of the chief of the fire department.

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2387 2 Amending NCMG Chapler 15.28
Aopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Fire Code



B. The battalion chief/fire marshal In charge of the fire prevention bureau shall be
appointed by the chief of the fire department of the ity of National City.

C. The director of emergency services may detail members of the fire department
as inspectors as shall from time to time be necessary. The chief of the fire department shall
fecommesnd to the city manager of National City the employment of technical inspestors, who,

when such authorization is made, shall be selected through an examination to determine their
fitness for the same position.

A The word "jurisdiction" used in the 2013 Califomia Fire Code means the City of
Nationat City.

B. Whenever the words “chief of the bureau of fire prevention" are used in the
Callfornia Fire Code they shall be held to mean the fire marshal of the city of Nationat City.

C. Where reference to the Uniform Building Code, or Bullding Code, or any
Nationally Recognized Standard is made, it means the currently adopted edition.

D. Where the word "Administrator” is used in the California Fire Code, it shall be
held to mean the city council of the City of National City. Whenever the term "city” is used it
means the city of National City.

E. Where the term “corporation counsa!” is used in the Callfornia Fire Code, it shall
be held to mean the city attorney for the City of National City.

F. "Fire authority having jurisdiction (FAHJ)" means the designated entity providing
enforcement of fire regulations as they reiate to planning, construction and development. This
entity may also provide fire suppression and other emergency services,

G. Whenever the term “this code" is used it means the 2013 California Fire Code as
modified by the City of National City with the deletions, amendments, and additions contained in
this chapter.

H. Whenever the terms "chief", "fire chief", "chief of the fire department" are used
they mean the "director of the department of emergency services",

8.035 blishment of limi dist n gto f ic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited —_Amended. Section 5504.3 of the 2013 Caiifornia Fire Code

Is amended to read as follows:

The Establishment of Limits for Storage of Flammable Cryogenic Fluids.
The storage of flammable cryogenic fiuids is prohibited in all areas within the City
limits of National City, excepi within the following zones as established by the
National City Land Use Code: MM and IM: Medium Manufacturing; MH and IH;
Heavy Manufacturing; MT-Tidelands Manufacturing.

15.28,040 Establishment of limits of districts In which storage of Class | and |l liquids

in outside aboveground tarks is prohibited — Amended. ‘Sections 5704.2.9.6 and 5706.2.4.4 of
the 2013 California Fire Code are amended to read as foliows:

All areas within the city limits of the city of National City except for those
areas zoned commercial or manufacturing, as established, defined, and set under
the zoning regulations in Title 18 of the Nationat City Municipal Code.

Ordinance No. 2013 ~ 2387 3

Amending NCMC Chapter 15.28
Aopted: Dacember 3, 2013

2013 Flre Coda



9, Yoy stablis| S ynicH 8 age of lig BU_DRIGSY 8BS s
prohibited - Amended. Section 6104.2 of the 2013 California Fire Code is amended to read as
follows:

All greas within the city limits of the city of National City, except for those
areas 2cned commercial or manufactusing, ss established, defined, and set under
zoning regulations in Title 18 of the Nationa! City Municipal Code.

5.28. , shin i gg plosives and Blasting Agents is
to be Prohibited — Amended. Chapter 56 of the 2013 California Fire Code is amended to read
as follows:

The permanent storage of explosives and/or blasting agerts shall be strictly
prohibited within the city limits of the city of National Clty. Temporary storage may
be allowed, by permit, during setup for excavation, demonstration, or cther usa,
when in the opinion of the fire marshal, there are significant measures in place to
ensure public safety.

15.28.070 _ Amendments made to the 2013 Californla Fire Code. The geographical
density of the city of National City, the dry southem California climate, which is subject to annual
drought conditions, make the following amendments set out in Sections 15.28.080 through

15.28.130 necessary and mest the conditions described in Section 15.28.002, Findings and
declarations.

16.28.080 __Section 101,65 "Refersnced Codes” - Amended. Section 101.5 of the
2013 California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

101.5 The codes, standards and publications adopted and set forth in this
code, Including other codes, standards and publications referred to therein are, by
fitle and their most cument edition, hereby adopted as standard reference
documents of this code. When this code does not specifically cover any subject
related to building design and construction, recognized fire engineering practices
shall be employed. The National Fire Codes and the Fire Protection Handbook of
the National Fire Protection Association are permitted to be used as authoritative
guides in determining recognized fire-prevention engineering practices,

15.28.085 Section 307.4.1 *“Bonfires” — Amended. Section 307.4.1 of the 2013
California Fire Code is amendad te read as follows:

307.4.1 Bonfires, Bonfires are sirictly prohibited within the City Limits.

15.28.090 Section 307.4.2 “Recreational Fires" — Amended. Section 307.4.2 of the
California Fire Cods Is amended to read as follows:

307.4.2 Recreational Fires. Recreational Fires are strictly prohibited within
the City limits.

Crdinanca No, 2013 - 2387 4 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.28
Aopted: Dacember 3, 2013 2013 Fire Code



15.28,100 Section 1011.6.1 "Graphics" —Amenggq' . Section 1011.8.1 of the 2013
California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

1011.6.1. Graphics. Every exit sign and directional exit sign shall have
piainly legible letters not less than 6 inches {152 mm) high with the principal strokes
of the ietters not less than 0.75 inch (18.1 mm) wide. The word "EXIT" shall have
letters having a width not less than 2 inches {51 mm) wide, except the letter ",
and the minimum spacing between letters shall not be less than 0.375 inch {8.5
mm). Signs larger than the minimum established in this section shall have letter
widths, strokes and spacing in proportion to the height.

The word "EXIT" shalt be green in color and in high contrast with the
background and shall be clearty discernible when the means of exit sign
illumination is or is not energized. If a chevron directional indicator Is provided as
part of the exit sign, it shall be green in color, the construction shall be such that
the direction of the chevron directional indicator cannot be readily changed,

15.28.110 Section 5704.3,3.9 "Storage o! Wooden or Plastic Pallets” -

Supplemented. The following is added to Section 5704.3.3.0 as follows:

Storage of Empty Wooden or Plastic Pallets. The storage of empty wooden
or plastic pallets is prohibited, except as follows:

1. Outdoor Storage. Pallets may be stored outside of building
or in a detached building. Pallets shall not be stacked closer than 5 feet from any
bullding.

: 2. Indoor Storage. Pallets shall not be stored indoors unless
the premises are protected with an automatic fire sprirkler system in accordance
with NFPA Standard 13, section titled Protection of Idle Pallets, except whan both
of the following conditions are met:

a. Pallets are stored no higher than 6 feat.
b. ‘Each pallet pile of no more than 4 stacks shall be

separated from other pallet piles by at least 8 feet of clear space and 25 feat from
any commoxiity.

15.28.12 ction $03.2.7

503.2.7 and Appendix Section D103.2 Grade. The maximum pemitted
gradient for a fire apparatus access road shall not exceed 15%.

15.28.130 Section 5083.6 "Security Gates" — Amended. Section 503.6 of the 2013
California Fire Code is amended as follows:

Ali gates or other structures or devices which could obstruct fire access
roadways or ctherwise hinder emergency operations are prohibited unless they
meet standards approved by the Chief, and receive Specific Plan Approval,

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2387 5

ndi i ! ;
Sections 503.2.7 and Appendix Section D103.2 of the 2013 California Fire Code are amended
to read as follows:

Amending NCMC Chapter 16.28
Aopted: December 3, 2013

2013 Fire Code



All automatic gates across fire access roadways and driveways shall be
equipped with an approved key-operated switches ovemiding all command
funciions and opening the gate(s). Gates accessing more than four residences or
residentiel lots, or gates accessing hazardous institutional, educational or
assembly occupancy group structures, shall alsc be equipped with an approved
emergency traffic control-activating strobe light sensor(s), or other devices
approved by the Chief, which will activate the gats on the approach of emergency
apparatus with a battery back-up or manual mechanical disconnect in case of
power failure.

Ail automatic gates must meet fire department policies deemed necessary
by the Chief for rapid, reliable access.

15.28.140 Acpeals. Whenever the director of the department of emergency services
or hisfher duly authorized representative disapproves an appiication or refuses to grant a psrmit
applied for, or when it is ciaimed that the provisions of the code havs been misconstrued or
wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal the decision to the city council, as established by
and pursuant to Chapter 15.04.

15.28.150 New C occupancies, which may require permits.
The building and safety director, the chief of the fire department and the fire marshal shall act as
a committee to detenmine and specify, after giving effacted persons an opportunity to-be heard,
any new materials, processes or occupancies which shall require permits in addition to those
now enumerated in said code. The fire marshal shall post such list In a conspicuous place in
his/her office and distribute copies thereof to interested parties.

15.28.180 Penalties. Any person who shall violate any of the provisions of the 2013
California Fire Code adopted or any order made thereunder, or who shall bulld in viclation of
any detalled statement of specifications or plans submitted and approved is gullty of a
misdemeanor.

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of Dece T2013.

7 -

nnﬂir;ison, Mayor

APERAVED AS TO FORM:

Michael R. Dalla, Gty Clerk

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2387 6

Amending NCMC Chapter 15.28
Acpted: Decamber 3, 2013

2013 Fire Code



Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, Caiifornia, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Counciimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None.
Absent: None.

Abstain: None.

AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORRISON
Mayor of the Ciiy of National City, California

City Clerk of the City ational City, Californta

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013,

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance In full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Councii and that there was avaiiable for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

} FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2387 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on December 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National City, California,

By.

Deputy



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 - 2388

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 20103 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, AND AMENDING
CHAPTER 1575 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Counci of the City of National City does ordain as foilows:

Section 1. The City Councll of the City of National City heraby adopts the 2013
California Energy Code, California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 8, establishing regulations
for the instaliation, mainteénance and alteration of energy systems within the city.

CHAPTER 15.75
CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE
15.75.010 2013 Califomi Code — Adopted. The city council adopts and

incorporates herein, for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the conservation of energy,
the 2013 California Energy Code, California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 6. Except as
otherwise provided by this chapter, all construction of buildings where energy will be utilized
shall be in conformance with the 2013 California Energy Code ‘

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

n Morrison, Mayor




Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Counciimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None,
Absent: None,
Abstain: None.
AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORRISON

Mayor of the City of National City, California

3
City Clerk of the City of Aational City,

California

Deputy

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had slapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said crdinance was read in full pricr to its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Council and that there was available for the
consideration of each member of the Councit and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2388 of the City Council of the City of National Clty, passed
and adopted by the Councll of said City on December 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

By:

Deputy



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 - 2389

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE,
AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.78 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Councl! of the City of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1. The City Councii of the City of National City hereby adopts the 2013
California Green Building Standards Code, Califomla Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11,
establishing regulations to enharice building design and construction within the city.

Section 2. The Clty Council of the City of National City amends Section 15.78.010 of
the Nationai City Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 15.78
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

15.78.010 2013 California Green Bullding Standards Code — Adopted. The city

councli adopts and incorporates herein for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the
reduction of negative impacts or increasing positive environmentel impacts and encouraging
sustainable construction praotices, the 2013 California Green Bullding Standards Code,
California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11. All construction of buildings shall ba in
conformance with the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code, except as otherwise
provided by thie chapter.

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

n Morrison, Mayor
ATTEST:

Michael R. Dalla, City Cierk

'ROVED AS TO FORM:




Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Counclimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None,
Absent: None.

Abstain: None.

AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORRISON
Mayor of the City of National City, California

Clty Clerk of the City of National City, California

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passags or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Council and that there was available for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2388 of the City Councit of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on December 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

By:

Deputy



ORDINANCE NO. 2018 - 2300

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNGIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ABOPTING THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX
CHAPTERS A, B, C, AND D, AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THAT CODE,
AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.14 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Council of the Clty of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1.

The City Council of the City of National City adopts the 2013 California

Mechanical Code, including Appendix Chapters A, B, C, and D.

Section 2.

The City Councll of the City of National City deletes, adds, or modifies

certain provisions of the 2013 California Mechanical Code.

Section 3.

The City Councll of the City of Natlonal City amends Chapter 15.14 of the

National City Municipal Code to read as follows:

Sections:

15.14.005
16.14.015
15.14.020

15.14.025

15.14.030

15.14.035

15.14.040

156.14.045

15.14.050
16.14.065

CHAPTER 15.14
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE

2013 Califomia Mechanical Code — Adopted.
Chapter 1, Division Ii, Administration — Adopted and amended.

Chapter 1, Division Ii, Saction 108 “Powers and Duties of the Authority
Having Jurisdiction®, Subsection 1086.3 "Right of entry” — Amended.

Chapter 1, Division {I, Section 108 “Board of Appeals®, Subsection 108.1
"General" — Amended. '

Chapter 1, Division |I, Section 110 “Penalties”, Subsection 110.1
"General® - Amended.

Chapter 1, Division iI, Section 113 “Permit Issuance”, Subsection 113.4
"Expiration” — Amended.

Chapter 1, Division Il, Section 113 “Permit Issuance”, Subsection 113.6
"Permit denial” - Added.

Chapter 1, Division ll, Seciion 114 “Fees”, Subsection 114.1 "General" —
Amended.

Chapter 1, Division Il, Table 114.1 "Mechanical permit fees" — Deleted.

Chapter 1, Division II, Section 114 “Fees”, Subsection 114.2 "Permit fees”
- Amended.



15.14.060 Chapter 1, Division li, Section 114 *Fees®, Subsection 114.3 "Plan review
fees" — Amanded.

15.14.065 Chapter 1, Division I, Section 114 “Fees®, Subsection 1i4.5 “Investigation
fess — work without a permii” — Amended

15.14.070 Chapter 1, Division II, Section 115 *Inspections, Subsection 115.8
"Reinspections® — Amended.

16.14.076  Appendix Chapters A, B, Cand D — Adopted.
15.14.080  Chapter 1, Division ll, Section 516 “Recirculating Systems" - Delsted.

4.005 2013 California M nical Code — Adopted. The city council adopts and
incorporates hersin as the National City Mechanical Code, for the purpose of prescribing in the
City of National City, regulations goveming the erection, installation, alteration, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of any heating, ventilating, cooling,
refrigeration system, incineration or other miscellaneous heat producing appliance, in or on any
bullding or structure or outdoors on any premises or property, the 2013 California Mechanical
Code, including Appendix Chapters A, B, C, and D, California Code of Regulations Titie 24, Part
4, except such portions as are deleted, added, or amended by this chapter. Copies of all codes
are flled in the office of the building official and are adopted and incorporated as if fully set out
in this chapter, and the provisions thereof shall be controlling within the city limits.

.15.14.015 apter 1, Divigion 1I, “Adminigtration® — Adopted and amendad. Chapter
1, Division [1, "Administration” is adopted subject to the additions, amendments and deletions
provided in this Chapter.

15.14.020 hapter 1, Division il, Section 108 "Powers and D of the ri

Having Jurisdiction”. Subsection 106.3 "Right of entry” — Amended. Section 106.3 of the 2013

California Mechanical Code is amended ta read as foliows:

108.3 Right of entry. When necessary to make inspections to enforce any
provision of this code, or when the Authority Having Jurisdiction has reasonabie
causs to balleve that there exists in any bullding or upon any premises e condition
or code violation which makes such building or premises unsafe, dangerous or
hazardous, the Authority Having Jurisdiction , or designee, may request entry as
specified in Chapter 1.12 of the National City Municipal Code.

read as follows:

108.1 Board of Appeals. The City Council, pursuant to National City
Municipal Code Chapter 15.04, shall have the jurisdiction to review the items as
enumerated in Chapter 15.14 of the National City Municipal Code.

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2350 2 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.14
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Mechanical Code



15.14, fer 1, Division jon 110 "Pe " Subsectic
110.1"General” - Amended. Section 110.1 of the 2013 California Mechanical Coda is amended
0 read gs follows:

110.1 Violations. Violations of any provision of this code shall be
punishable as a misdemeanor and shall carry the penalties as prescribed in
Chapter 1.20 of the National City Municipal Code. -

“Permit [ssuance®, Subsecticn 113.4
“Expiration” — Amended. Section 113.4 of the 2013 California Mechanical Code is amended to
read as foliows;

113.4 Expiration. Every permit issued by the Authority Having Jurisdiction
under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation and become null and
vold If the bullding or work authorized by such permit is not commenced within six
calendar months from the date of such pemmit, or if the building or work authorized
by such permit is stopped at any time after work has commenced for a period of
six calendar months, or if the building or work authorized by such parmit exceeds
three calendar years from the issuance date of the permit. Work shall be presumed
to have commenced if the permittee has obtained a required inspecticn approval
of work authorized by the permilt by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within six
calendar months of the date of permitissuance.

Work shall be presumed to be stopped if the permittee has not obtained a
required inspection approval of work by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within
each six month period upon commencement of work authorized by such permit.

Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit or renewsl permit is
obtained, as spacified below, shall first be obtained.

1. Permits where work was not commenced, For permits for
which work has not commenced in the first six calendar months from the date of
issuance, a renawal permit may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have besn made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work:

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from
the original issuance date;

C. The same edition of the adopted codes is in effect
as used in the initlal plan check:

D. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a
new permit is paid, and

) E, The renewa! permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of the initlal permit Issuance. .

Where later editions of the Califomia codes have
besen adopted than used in the initial plan chack, such applications for renewal
shall be considerad as a new plan chack submittal. Accordingly, plans shall reflact
the requirements of the current codes in effect, a full new plan check is required
and a full new plan check fee shall be paid. Upon completion of the new plan check,

Ordinance No. 2013 = 2380 3 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.14
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Macharical Cade



the permit may be renewed upon payment of a permit fee equal to one-half the
amount required for a new permit.

2. Permit where work was commenced. For permits where
work was commenced and was subsequently stopped as defined herein, a renewal
permit may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have been made or will be made In the
original plans and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three vears from
the original issuance date:

C. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a
new permit is pald except that where construction has progressed to the point of
requiring only a final inspection, a fee equal to one-quarter of the amount required
for new permit shall be pald; and

D. A renewal permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of the initlal permit Issuance.

3. Permits that have exceeded three years. For permits that
have excesded three years beyond the Issuance date, a renewed permit may be
obtained, provided that:

A Construction in reliance upon the building permit has
been commenced and has been approved;

B. No changes have been made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work; and

C. A fee equal to the full amount required for a new
permit is paid, except that whera the Autharity Having Jurisdiction determines that
construction has progressed to the point that a lesser fee is warranted, such lesser
fee shall be paid.

The maximum life of a permit renewal in accordance
with sub-section 15.14.035.3 shall be one calendar year from the date of renewal.
The pemmit may be renewed each calendar year thereafter provided that all
requirements of A, B and C as stated in sub-section 15.14.035.3 are met.

4. Extension of an unexpired permit. For an extension of an
unexpired permit, the permittee may apply for an extension of time within which
waork under that permit may be continued when for good and satisfactory reasons,
as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction in his or her sole discretion, the
permittee is unable to continue work within the time required by section 15.14.035.
The Authority Having Jurisdiction may extend the time for action by the permittes
for a period not exceeding six calendar months beyond the expiration date in effect
at the time of the extension application, upon written request by the permittee
showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented
action being taken.

5. Permits Issued where the permittee has been deployed to 2
foreign country may be held in abeyance until six months after the return of the
permittee from his/her deployment if necessary, upon application for such relief by
the permittee.

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2380 4 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.14
Adopted: Decembar 3, 2013 2013 Mechanical Code



5,14, h lvision I, Section 113 "Permit lssuence® Sub 13.8
"Permit denial" — Added. -Section 113.6 of the 2013 Callfornia Mechanical Code is added to
read as follows:

113.6 'Permil dendal. The Authority having Jurisdiction may deny the
issuance of a bullding permit on any property where there exists an unsafe or a
substandard building as provided in Chapter 15.10 and 15.16 of the National City
Municipal Code, or where thare exisis unlawful construction, or where there exists
a violation of the National City Municipal Code.

5,14, h Secilon 114 "Fees” o 1 "Genaral" -
Amended. Section 114.1 of the 2013 California Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

114.1 General. Fess shall be assessed in accordance with the current
Clity of National City Fee Schedule.

Table 114.1 of the 2013 Callfomia Mechanical Code, entitted "Mechanlcal Permit Fees",
deleted.

15.14,086 _ Chapier 1, Division Il, Section 114 “Fees’, Subsection 114.2 *Permit fees"

=Amended. Section 114.2 of the 2013 Callfornia Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

114.2 Permit Fees. Permit fees shall be assessed in accordance with the
current City of National Clty Fee Schedule.

15.14.060 Chapter 1, Division Il, Secfion 114 “Fees”, Subsectioh 114.3 "Plan review

fees” — Amended. Section 114.3, of the 2013 California Mechanical Code is amended as
follows:

Section 114.3 Plan review fees. When plans are incomplete or changed
0 as to require additional plan raview, an additional plan review fee shall be
charged in accordance with the current City of National City Fee Schedule.

1, Division Ii 14"

-EJ&MEEL..LLMM_E&_MM
“investi — work with — Amended. Saction 114.5 of the 2013 California

Mechsnical Code is amended to read as follows:

Seotion 114.5 [nvestigation fess — work without & permif. Any person who
commences any work on a bullding, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or
plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject {o an
administrative penaity equal to the inspection fee poition the permit fes that would
be required by this code If a permit were to be issued. The administrative penalty
is in addition to a permit fee.

Ordinance No. 2613 - 2380 5 Amending NCMC Chapter 15,14
Adopted: Dacember 3, 2013 2913 Mechanical Code



When a plan review is required for issuance of such permit, the plan review
fee portion will not be subject to sald penalty. The payment of such administrative
penalty shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provigions of
this code or from any penalty prescribed by law.

15.14.070 Chapter 1, Division I, Section 115 “Inspections”, Subsection 115.6
"Reinspactions” — Amended. Subsection 115.6 of the 2013 California Mechanical Code is
amended to read as follows:

116.6 Re-inspections. To obtain a re-Inspection, the permitiee shall pay
the re-inspection fee in accordance with the current City -of Naticnal City Fee
Schedule. in instances where 2 re-Inspection fes has besn assessed, no further
inspections shall be performed until the fees have been pald.

15.14.075 Appendix Chapters A, B. € and D ~ Adopted. Appendix Chapiers A, B, C

and D of the 2013 Californla Mechanical Code are adopted.

15.14.080 Chapter 1, Division [I, Section 516 ‘Recirculating Systems” — Deleted.

Section 516 of the 2013 California Mechanical Code is daleted.

PASSED and ADOQPTED this 3rd day of Decembe

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2380 6 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.14
Adopted: Dscember 3, 2013 2013 Mechanical Code



Pessed and adopted by the Councll of the City of National City, Califomia, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Counciimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None.
Absent: None.

Abstain: None.

AUTHENTICATED BY; ROM MORRISOM
Mayor of the City of National City, Callfornia

4

City Clerk of the City of bﬁléﬂonal City, California

Dsputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, fo wit, on November 18, 2013 and on December 3, 2013,

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passage or
that the reading of sald ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majorlty of the members elected to the Council and that thers was available for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its

passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

I FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, frue and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2390 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on December 3, 2013.

Clty Clerk of the City of National City, Califomnia

By:

Denuty



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 ~ 2391

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AND TABLE 2802.1 OF
THE 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THOSE
CODES, AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.20 OF THE NATIONAL CiTY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Councll of the City of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1. The City Council of the City of National City adopts the 2013 Califomia
Plumbing Code and Table 29802.1 of the 2013 California Building Code,

Section 2, The City Council of the City of National City deletes, adds, or modifies

certain provisions of the 2013 California Plumbing Code and Table 2902.1 of the 2013 California
Building Cods.

~ Section3.  The City Council of the City of National City amends Chapter 15.20 of the
National City Municipal Code to reed as follows:

CHAPTER 15.20
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE

Sections:

15.20.005 2013 California Plumbing Code — Adopted.
16.20.016  Chapter 1, Divisions | and Il — Adopted and amended.

15.20.020 Chapter 1, Division i, Section 102 "Organization and Enforcement”,
Subsection 102.2.1 “Right of entry” - Amended.

18.20.024  Chapter 1, Division II, Section 102 * Organization and Enforcement”,
Subsection 102.3 " Board of Appeals™ - Amended.

15.20.025 Chapter 1, Division 11, Section 102 *Organization and Enforcement”,
Subsection 102.5 "Penalties” ~ Amended.

15.20.027 Chapter 1, Division II, Section 103 "Parmits and Inspections®, Subsection
103.4.3 “Iinvestigation fee — Work without a permit® — Amended.

15.20.030 Chapter 1, Division I, Section 103 "Permits and Inspections”, Subsection
103.3.3 "Expiration” — Amended.

15.20.035 Chapter 1, Division }I, Section 103 "Permits and inspections”, Subsection
103.3.6 "Pemit denial” - Added.

15.20.040  Chapter 1, Division Ii, Section 103 "Permits and Inspections”, Subsection
103.4 "Fees" — Amended.

15.20.042 Placement of permit — Added.



16.20.045  Chapter 1, Division I, Saction 103 “Parmits and Inspections®, Subsection
103.4.1 "Plan review fees” — Amended.

15.20.050 Chapier 1, Division [l, Section 103 "Permits and Inspections”, Subsection
103.5.9 "Reinspections” - Amended.

15.20.080  Chapter 1, Division I, Tabls 103.4 "Plumbing penmits fees" - Deleted.

15.20.085 Chapter 1, Division 11, Table 422.1 "Minimum plumbing fackities” —
Deleted.

16.20.070  Table 2802.1 "Minimum number of required plumbing fixtures of the 2013
California Building Code" — Adopted.

15.20.005 2013 California Plymbing Code —~ Adopted. The city councll adopts, and
incorporates herein as the city plumbing code, except as amended, deleted, or added by this
chapter, for the purpose of prescriblag in the City of National City, regulations goveming the
erecticn, installation, alteration, repair, refocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance
of any plumbing, gas, or drainage piping and systems or water heating or treating equipment in
or on any building or structure or outdoors on any premises or property, the 2013 California
Plumbing Code, including Administration Divislons | and I, California Code of Regulations Title
24, Part 5, and Table 2802.1 of the 2013 California Building Code. Copy of all codes are filed in
the office of the building official and are adopted and incorporated as f fully set forth in this
chapter, and the provisions shall be controlling within the city limits.

15.20.015 Chapter 1, Divigions | and Il — Adopted and Amended. Chapter 1,
Division |, "Administration” is adopted. Chapter 1, Division I, *Administration” is adopted,
subject to the additions, amendments, and deletions contained in this chapter,

5.20.020 hapts ecti rganization and Enforcement”
8 jon 102.2.1 ", ' = nded. Section 102.2.1 of the 2013 Callfornia

Plumbing Cods is amended to read as follows:

102.2.1 Right of Entry. When necessary to make an inspection to enforce
any of the provision of this code, or when the Authority Having Jurisdiction has
reasonable cause to belisve that there exists in any building or upcn any premises
a condition or code violation which make such building or premises unsafe,
dangerous or hazardous, the Authority Having Jurisdiction. ,or designes, may
request entry as specified in Chapter 1.12 of the National City Municipal Code.

15.20,024 _ Chagter 1. Division ii. Section 102" Organization and Enforcement”,
Subsection 102.3 " Board of Appesls" — Amended. Section 102.3 of the 2013 Califomnia
Plumbing Code is amended to read as follows:

102.3 Advisory and Appeals Board. The City Councill, pursuant to National
City Municipal Code Chapter 15.04, shall have jurisdiction to review the items as
enumerated in Chapter 15.20 of the National City Municipal Code.

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2391 2 #mending NCMGC Chapter 15.20
Adopied: December 3, 2013 2013 Plumbing Code



15.20.025 Ch 1 ision Il, Section 102 “ nization a me
Subsection 102.5 "Panalties” — Amended. Section 102.5 of the 2013 California Plumbing Code

Is amended to read as follows:

102.5 Pepalties. Violation of any provision of this code shall be punishable

as a misdemeanor and shall carry the penalties as prescribed in_Chapter 1.20 of
the National City Municipal Code.

027 Chapter 1, Divigion i "Permits an ctions”, Su ion

103 4.3 "investigation fee — work without a permit” - Amended. Section 103.4.3 of the 2013
Califomia Plumbing Code is amended to read as follows: :

103.4.3 Work without 8 permit. Any person who commences any work on
a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before
obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an administrative penalty equal
to the inspection fee portion the permit fee that wouid be required by this code if a
permit were to be issued. The administrative penalty is in addition to a parmit fee.
When a plan review is required for issuance of such permit, the plan review fee
portion will not be subject to said penalty. The payment of such administrative
penalty shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of
this code or from any penalty prescribed by law.

15.20.030 Chapter 1, Division |l, Section 103 “Permits and Inspections®, Subsection

103.3.3 "Expiration” — Amended. Section 103.3.3 of the 2013 Califomia Plumbing Code is
amended to read as follows:

103.3.3 Expirgtion. Every pemmit issued by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction under the provisions of this cods shall expire by limitation and become
nulf and void If the bullding or work authorized by such permit is not commenced
within six calendar manths from the date of such permit, or if the building or work
authorized by such perm is sfopped at any fime after the work is commenced for
& perlod of six calendar months, or if the buliding or work authorized by such permit
exceeds three calendar years from the issuance date of the permit. Work shall be
presumed to have commenced if the permittee has obtained a required inspection
approval of work authorized by the pemmit by the Authority Having Jurisdiction
within six calendar months of the date of psrmit issuance.

Work shall be presumed to be stopped if the permittae has not obtained a
required inspection approval of work by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within
each six-month period upon the initial commencement of work authorized by such
permit.

Bsfore such work can be recommenced, a new permit, or a renewal permit
as specified below, shall be first obtained.

1. Permits where work has not commenced. For permits for
which work has not commenced in the first six calendar months from the date of
Issuance, a renewal permit may be obtained provided that:

Ordinance Ne, 2013 - 2391 3 Amending NCMC Chagpter 15.20
Adopted: December 3, 2043 2013 Plumbing Code



A No changes have bsen made or will be made In the
original plans and specifications for such work;

B The expiraticn has not exceaded three vears from
the original issuance date;

C. The same edition of the California codes Is in effect
as used in the initial plan check:

D. A fee equal to cne-half the amount required for a
new psrmit is paid; and

E. The renewal permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of initial permlt issuance. :

Where later editions of the California codes have
been adopted than used in the Inltial plan check, such applications for renewal
shall be considered as a new plan check submittal, Accordingly, plans shall reflect
the requirements of the current codes in effect, a full new plan check is required,
and a full new plan check fee shall be pald. Upon completion of a new plan chack,
the permit may be rerewed upon payment of a permit fee equal to one-half the
amount required for a new parmit.

2. Permits where work has commenced. For permits where
work has commenced and was subsequently stopped as defined herein, 4 renewal
permit may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have been made or will be made in the
original plans and specifications for such work: -

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from
the original issuance dats:

C. A fee equal to one-half the amount required for a
new permit is paid, except that where construction has progressed and has been
approved to the point of requiring only a final inspection, a fee equal to one quarter
the amount required for a new permit shall be paid; and

D, A renewal permit shall expire three calendar years
from the date of initial permit issuance.

3. Permits that have exceeded three years. For permits that
have exceeded three years beyond the lssuance date, a renewed permit may be
obtained provided that:

A, Construction in reliance upon the buiiding permit has
commenced and has been approved:

8. No changes have bsen made or will be made In the
original plans and specifications for such work:

C. A fes equal to the full amount required for a new
permit is paid except that where the Authority Having Jurisdiction determines that
construction has progressed to the point that a lesser fee is warranted, such lesser
fee shall be paid.

The maximum life of a permit renewal in accordance
with subsection 15.20.030.3 shall be one calendar year from the dats of renewal.
The permit may be renewed for each calendar year thereafter provided that al|
requiremente of A, B, and C as stated in subsection 15.20.030.3 are met.

Ordinanca Mo, 2013 — 2391 4

Amending NCMC Chaplar 15.20
Adopted: December 3, 2013

2013 Plumbing Code



4, Extension of an unexpired permit. For an extension of an
unexpired permit, the permittee may apply for an extension of the time within which
work under that permii may be continued when for good and satisfactory reasons,
as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction in his or her sole discretion, the
permittee is unable to continue work within the time required by section 15.20.030.
The Authority Having Jurisdiction may extend the time for action by the permittee
for a period not exceeding six calendar months beyond the expiration date in effect
at the time of the extension application, upon written request by the permittee
showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented
action from being taken.

5a Permits issued where the permittee has been depioyedto a
foreign country, may bs held in abeyance until six months after the return of the
permitiee from his/her deployment if necessary, upon application for such relief by

the permittee,
15.20,03 hapter 1, Division |l. Sect *Permits and ions”, Su ol
103.3.5 “Permit denial” — Added. Section 103.3.5 is added to the 2013 California Plumbing

Code is to read as follows:

103.3.5 Permit deniaj. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may deny the
issuance of a plumbing permit on any property where there exists an unsafe or a
substandard building as provided in the Chapters 15.10 and 15.16 of the Nationai
City Municipal Code, or where there exists unlawful construction, or where there
exists a violation of the Nationa! City Municipal Code.

l‘l 1,"'1,'[: ,-;-‘:"ll

1 M( 3 I i . ‘
103.4 "Fees" —~ Amended. Section 103.4 of the 2013 California Plumbing Code is amended to
read as follows:

Section 1034 Faees. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the
current City of National City Fee Scheduie.

15.20.042 _ Placement of permit — Added. The buliding permit or & copy, the
inspection record, and the approved pians shali all be kept on site until the completion of the

project. The inspection record is to be kept on the job unless removed by the building official.

5 1. Divi . "
103.4.1 "Plan review fees” — Amended. Section 103.4.1 of the 2013 California Plumbing Code ie
amended to read as follows:

103.4.1 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data are required to be
submitted by 103.2.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans
and specifications for review. The plan review fees for plumbing work shall be
assessed in accordance with the cument City of National City Fee Schedule .
When plans are incomplete or changed so as to require an additional plan review

Ordinance No. 2013 = 2391 5

Amending NCMC Chapter 15.20
Adoplad; December 3, 2012

2013 Plumbing Cods



fee, the fee shall be asseesad In accordance with the current Cly of Natlonal City
Fee Schedule.

. Chapter 1, Divi

103.5.8 ‘Relnsections” ~ Amended. Section 103.5.9 of the 2013 Calforia Phumbing Code is

amendad to read as follows:

Section 103.5.9 Re-inspections. A re-inspection fes may be aseessad for
each inspection or re-inspection when any of the following occurs:

1. The portion of work for which the inepsction was called is
not complete or the comections previously required and calied for are not made;

2. Cafling for an inspection before the job is ready for such
inspection cr re-inspaction:

3 The inspection record card or the approved plans are not
posted or otherwise available to the inspector:

4, Faliure to provide access on the date for which the
inspection is requestad; or,

5. Deviating from the approved plans when such deviation or
change required approval of the building official.

To obtain a re-inspection, the permitiee shall file an application in writing
on a form provided for that purpose and pay the re-inspection fes in accordance
with the current City of National Clty Fee Schedule. In instances where a re-
inepection fea has been assessed, no further inspections shall be performed until
the fees have been paid.

16.20.0 03.

Table 103.4 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2013 Californ
Permit Fees”, is deleted.

ia Plumbing Code, entitied "Plumbing

52 ) Table 422.1 ing facilitie . Table 422.1 of
Chapter 4, of the 2013 California Plumbing Code, entitied "Minimum Plumbing Facilities", is
deleted.

: [able 28 i he ing fixtures of the 2013
ifornia Building Code"” = d. Table 2002.1 of the 2613 California Buiiding Code is
adopted. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of cccupancy and in the minimum
number shown In Tabie 2902.1. Types of occupancies not shown in Table 2602.4 shali be
considered individually by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. The number of occupants shall be
determined by this code. Occupancy classification shail be determined in accordance with
Chapter 3 of the 2013 California Buliding Code.

[SIGNATURE PAGE TO FOLLOW]

Ordinance No, 2015 - 231 6 Amending NCMC Chapisr 15.20
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Flumbing Code




PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of Decembe, 2013,

on Morrison, Mayor

ATTEST:

Michael R. Dalla, City Clerk

Ordinance No. 2013 ~ 2381 7 Amending NCMC Chaptar 15,20
Adopled: December 3, 2013 2013 Plumbing Code



Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on
December 3, 2013 by the foliowing vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Councilmembers Cano, Morrison, Netividad, Rios, Sotelo-Soiis.
‘Nays: None.,
Absent: None.

Abstain; ‘None.

AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORR
Mayor of the Clty of National City, Calfornia

City Clérk of the City of National City, Califomnia

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passags, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior o its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Councll and that there was available for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a wrilten or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing Is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2391 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on Decembaer 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National Gity, Calffornia

By:

Deputy



| ’_--_ n

ORDINANCE NO. 2013 - 2303

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, AMENDING
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THAT CODE, AND AMENDING CHAPTER 15.79

OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE

The City Council of the City of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1.

The City Coundil of the City of National City hereby adapts the 2013

California Residential Code, California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5.

Section 2.

‘The City Council of the City of National City hereby amends, adds, and

deietes certain sections of the 2013 Californla Residential Code.

Section 3.

The City Councii of the Clty of National City amends Chapter 15.79 of the

Natlonal City Municipal Code to read as follows:

Sections:

15.78.010
156.78.025

15.78.030

15.79.040

16.79.045

15.79.050

15.79.055

15.79.060

15.79.065

15.78.070

CHAPTER 15.79
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

2013 Califomia Residential Code adopted.

Chapter 1, DIVISION Il, Section R104 “Duties and Powers of the Building
Official”, Subsection R104.6 "Right of entry” — Amended.

Chapter 1, DIVISION II, Section R105 “Permits”, Subsection R105.2
"Work exempt from permit— Building” ~ Amendad.

Chapter 1, DIVISION 1I, Section R105 "Pemnits”, Subsection R105.5
"Expiration” — Amended.

Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R105 "Permits®, Subsection R105.7
"Placement of permit" ~ Amended.

Chapter 1, DIVISION [, Section R105 “Permits”, Subsection R105.8.1
"Permit denial” ~ Added.

Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R108 “Fees", Subsection R108.2
"Schedule of permit fees” — Amended.

Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R108 “Fees", Subsection R108.6 "Work
commencing before permit issuancs” — Amended.

Chapter 1, DIVISION Hi, Section R109 "Inspections®, Subsection 109.3.1
"Reinspactions” — Added.

Chapter 1, DIVISION Hl, Section R110 “Certificate of Occupancy”,
Subsection R110.4 "Temporary occupancy * — Amended.



15.78.075 Chapter 1, DIVISION iI, Section R112 *Board of Appeals”, Subsection
R112.1 "Generai® - Amended.

15.79.080 Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R113 *Viclations®, Subsection R113.1
"Unlawful acts™ - Amended.

15.79.082 Section 202 Definitions “Building Existing" —~ Amended.

15.79.085 Chapter 1, DIVISION 1l, Section R319 "Site Addresses”, Subsection
2319.1 "Address numbers® — Amended.

16.72.080  Chepter 1, DIVISION i, Section RB02 “Roof Classification”, Subsection
R802.1.3 "Roofing Coverings in all other areas " — Amended.

15.79.095 Plan review fees.

15,79.010 _ California Residential Code adopted. The city eouncil adapts, for the

purpose of prescribing regulations governing the erection, conetruction, enlargement, aiteration,
repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, acoupancy, use, height, ares, fire resistance
and maintenance of one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories
sbove grade, the 2013 Callfomia Residential Code, published by the Califarnia Bullding
Standards Commission based on the International Residential Code 2012 Edition, including
specified Appendices, including Administration Divisions | and II, Califomnia Code of Regulations
Title 24, and Part 2.5 of the California Heslth and Safety Code beginning with Section 18901,
and save and except such portions as are deletad, added, or modified based on the climatic,
topographic, or geologic conditions. Copies of the codes are filed in the office of the building
official, and are adopted and incorporated as fully set out in this chapter, and the provisions
thereof shall be controlling within the city limits.

15.79.025 Chapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R-104 “Duties and powers of the

“Building Official”, Subsection R104.6 "Right of entry” — Amended. Section R104.6 of the 2013

Celifornia Residential Code is amended to read as foliows:

R104.6 Right of Entry. When necessary to make an inspection to enforce
any of the provision of this code, or when the Authority Having Jurisdiction has
reasonable cause to belleve that there exists in any buiiding or upon any premises
a condition or code violation which make such bullding or premises unsafe,
dangerous or hazardous, the Authority Having Jurisdiction, or designee, may
request entry as specified in Chapter 1,12 of the National City Municipal Code.

1 hapter 1. DIVISION { i | ite” ctio

2Work exempt from permit - Bullding® — Amended. Chapter 1, DIVISION II, Section R105.2 of

the 2013 California Residential Code is amended by adding the following:

11.  Playground, gymnastic and similar squipment and structures used
for recreation and athletic activities accessory to Group R Division 3 structures.

12. Repairs fo lawfully existing Group R Division 3 structures and Group
U occupancy structures accessory to Group R Division 3 structures -constructed

Ordinance Ne, 2013 ~ 2393 2 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.79
Adopted; Decamber 3, 2013 2013 Residential Code



pursuant to a building permit which invoives only the replacement of component
perts or existing work complsted with similar materials only for the purpose of
maintenance and do not affect any structural components or piumbing, mechanical
or electrical installations. Repairs exempt from permit requirements shall not
include any addition, change or modification in construction, exit facllities or
permanent fixtures or equipment. Specifically exempt from permit requirements
are:
A) Painting and decorating Including refinishing of exterior
stucco finishes.
.B) Installation of floor covering.
C) Cabinet work.
D) Outside paving on private property not within the public
right-of-way. _
E) Replacement of existing windows with no structural
modification of the existing window opening.
13.  Ground mounted satellite antennas not exceeding ten faet .in
diameter and roof mounted satellite antennas not exceedirg eight feet in diameter.
14.  Painted wall signs and styrofoam or other foam mounted wall signs.

15.79.040 apter 1, DIVISION Il, Section R105 "Permits”, Subsection R105.
"Expiration” — Amended. Section R105.5 of the 2013 California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

Section R105.5 Expirafion. Every permit issued by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation and bacome
null and void i the building or work authorized by such pemmit is not commenced
within six calendar months from the date of such permit, or if the bullding or work
authorized by such permitis stopped at any time after the work is commencad for
a period of six calendar months, or if the building or work authorized by such permit
excaeds three calendar ysars from the issuance date of the permit. Work shall be
presumed fo have commenced if the permittee has obtained a required inspection
approval of work authorized by the permit by the Authority Having Jurisdiction
within six calandar monifis of the date of permit issuance.

Work shall be presumed to be stopped if the permittee has not obtained a
required Inspection approval of work by the Authority Having Jurisdiction within
each six-month period upon the initial commencement of work authorized by such
permit.

Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit, or a renewal permit
as spacified below, shall be first obtained.

1. Permits where work has not commenced. For permits for which
work has not commenced in the first six calendar months fram the date of issuance,
a renewal permit may be obtained provided that

A No changes have been made or will be made in the original
plans and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from the
original issuance date;

Ordinance No, 2013 - 2393 : 3 Amending NCMC Chapter 16.79
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Resldential Cade



C.  The same edition of the California codes Is in effect &s used
in the initial plan checlk;

D. A fee equal io one-half the amount requirad for a new permit
Is paid; and

E. The renewal permit shall expire three calendar years from
the date of initial parmit iIssuance.

Where later editions of the California codes have been adopted
than used In the inlial plan check, such applications for renewal shall be
considered as a new plan check submitial. Accordingly, plans shall refiect the
requirements of the current codes in effect, a full new plan check is required, and
a full new plen check fee shall be pald. Upon completion of a new plan check, the
permit may be renewed upon payment of a permili fee equal to che-half the amount
required for a new permit.

2, Permits where work has commenced. For permits whare work has
commenced and was subsequently stopped as defined herein, & renewal permit
may be obtained provided that:

A No changes have been made or will be made In the original
plans and specifications for such work;

B. The expiration has not exceeded three years from the
original issuance date; .

C. A fee equal to one-haif the amount required for a new permit
is paid, excapt that where construction has progressed and has been approved to
the paint of requiring only a final inspection, & fee equal to one quarter the amount
required for a new permit shall be paid;

D. A renewal permit shall expire three calendar years from the
date of initial parmit issuance.

: 3. Permits that have exceeded three years. For pemits that have
excesded thres years beyond the issuance date, a renewed parmit may be
obtained provided that:

A Construction in reliance upon the building permit has
commenced and has besn approved;

B. No changes have bean made or will be mads In the original
pians and specifications for such work:

C. A fee equal to the full amount required for a new permit is
paid except that where the Authority Having Jurisdiction determines that
conetruciion has progressed to the polnt that a lesser fee is warranted, such lesser
fee shall be paid. _

The maximum life of a permit renewal in accordance with
subsaction 15.70.040.3 shall be one calendar year from the date of renswal. The
permit may be renewed for each calendar year thereafter provided that all
requirements of A, B, and C as stated in subsection 15.70.040.3 are met.

4, Extenslon of an unexpired permit. For an extension of an unexpired
permit, the permittse may apply for an extansion of the time within which work
under that permit may be continued when far good and satisfactory reasons, as
determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, in his or her sole discretion, the
permiitee is unable to continue work within the time required by section 15.79.040,

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2393 4 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.79
Adapted: December 3, 2013 2013 Resicential Code



The Authorlty Having Jurisdiction may extend the time for action by the permittee
for a period not exceading six calendar months beyond the expiration date In effect
at the time of the extension application, upon written request by the permittee
showing that circumstances bayond the contral of the permittee have prevented
action from being taken.

5. Permits Issued where the permittee has been deployed to a foreign
country, may be held in abeyance until six months after the return of the permittee
from his/her deployment if necessary, upon application for such relisf by the
pemitiee.

15.79.045 hapter 1, DIVISION I, Section R105 “Permits”, Subsection R105.7

"Placement of permit” - Amended. Section R105.7 of the 2013 California Residential Code is
amended to read as fallows:

Saction R105.7 Placement of permit. The building permit or a copy, the
inspection record, and the approved plans shall all be kept on site until the
completion of the project. The inspection record is to be kept on the job unless
removed by the building official,

16.79.050 _ Chapter 1, DIVISION [, Section R105 “Permits” Subsecti 105.8.1

"Permit denial” — Added. Section R105.8.1 is added to the 2013 California Residential Code to
read as follows:

Section R105.8.1 Permif denial. The Authority Having Jurisdiction may
deny the Issuance of a building permit on any property where there exists an
unsafe or a substandard building as provided in the Chapters 15.10 and 15.16 of
the National City Municipal Code, or where there exists unlawful construction, or
where there exists a violation of the National City Municipal Code.

15.79.055 Chapter 1, DIVISION ll, Section R108 *Fees". Subsection R108.2 —

-Schedule of permit fees” — Amended. Section R108.2 of the 2013 California Residential Code

is amended to read as follows:

Section R108.2 Schedule of it fees. Permit fees, Including plan review
fees, shall be assessed in accordance with the cutrent City of National City Fee
Scheduie.

15.79.060 Chapter 1, DIVISION Ii,. on R108 “Fees”, Subsection R108.6
commencing before permit issuance” — Amended. Section R108.6 of the 2013 California

Residential Code is amended 1o read as follows:

Section R108.6 Work commencing before permit jssuance. Any perscn

who commences any work on a bullding, structure, slectrical, gas, mechanical or
plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an
administrative penalty equal to the inspection fee portion the permit fee that would
be required by this code if a permit were to be issued. The administrative penalty

Ordinance Mo, 2013 - 2393 5 Amending NCMC Chapler 15.79
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Residential Code



is in addition to & permit fee. When a plan review is required for issuance of such
permit, the plan review fee portion will not be subject to said penalty. The payment
of such administrative penalty shali not exempt any person from compliance with
all other provisions of this cada or from any penalty prescribed by law.

15.79.065___ Chapter 1. DIVISION i, Saction R109 “Inspections”, Subsection 109.3.1

"Re-inspections” — Added. Chapter 1, DIVISION II, Section R109.3.1 is added to the 2013
California Residential Code to read as follows:

Section R109.3.1 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for
each Inspection or re-inspection when any of the following occurs:

1. The portion of work for which the inspeciion was called is noct
complete or the comractions previously required and called for are not made:

2, Calling for an inspaction before the job is ready for such inspsction
or re-inspection;

B The inspection record card or the approved plans are not posted or
otherwise available to the inspector:

4, Failure to provide access on the dafe for which the inspection is
requested; or,

5, Deviating from the approved plans when such deviation or change
required approval of the buliding official.

To obtain a re-Inspection, the pemmittee shall file an application in writing
on a form provided for that purpose and pay the re-inspection fee in accordance
with the current City of National City Fee Schedule. in instances where a re-
inspection fee has been asssssed, no further Inspections shall be performed untl
the fees have been paid.

5.79. Cha 1. DIVISION I, Segtion R110 “Certificate of Occupa
Subsaction R110.4 "Temporary occupancy” — Amended. Section R110.4 of ths 2013 California

Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

Section R110.4. Temporary Certificate of Qcoupancy. Where a project or

a major portion thereof is substantially complefe and can be safely occupied, but
practical difficulties delay completion of work, the building official may lssue a
Temporary Certificate of Occupancy for the use of @ portion or portions of the
building or structure prior to the complation of the entire project.

Prior to issuance of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy, the premises
shall be inspected by all effected city departments who shall prepare a list of work
required to ba completad and shall forward the list along with. & recommendation
for approval or disapproval of the issuance of a Temporary Ceriificate of
Occupangy to the building official,

- Upon receipt of a recommendation for approval from all affected city
departments. the building officlal may prepare @ Temporary Certificate of
Occupancy granting temporary occupancy that shall inciude the following:

1. Work yet to be complsted;
2, Maximum time allotted for completion of said worl

Ordinance No. 2013 - 2353 6 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.79
Adopled: December 3, 2013 2013 Residential Code



3. Property owner's signature and the signature of the contractor
agreeing to complete the work within the prescribed time or vacate the premises
upon order of the building official until such work is completad;

: 4, Evidence that a faithful performance bond has been posted if
required by any affected city department; and

5. A copy of the Temporary Certificate of Occupancy granting
temporary occupancy shall be provided to all affected city departments.

16.79.075 hapter 1, DIVISION II, Saction R112 “Boa peals”, Subsectio
R112.1 "General" — Amended. Section R112.1 of the 2013 California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

Section R112.1 Board of Appeals. The City Council, pursuant to National
City Municipal Cods Chapter 15.04, shall have Jurisdiction to review the items as
enumerated In Chapter 15.79 of the National City Municipal Code.

15.79. Chapter 1, DIVISIO Section R113 "Violations", Subsection R113.1
"Uniawful acts" — Amended. Section R113.1 of the 2013 Callfornia Residential Code is

amended to read as follows:

Section R113.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be untawful for any person, firm or
corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove,
convert or demolish, equip, use occupy or maintain any building or structure or
cause or permit the same to be done in violation of this code.

Violation of any provision of this code shall be punishable as
misdemeanor and shall carry the penalties as prescribed in Chapter 1.20 of the
National City Municipal Code.

18. ection 202 Definitions "Building Existing™ — Amended. Section 202
Definitions "Building, Existing” of the 2013 Califomia Residential Code is amended to read:

Bullding, Existing. An “existing building” is a building erscted prior to the
adoption of the 2013 Callfornia Residential Code, or one for which a legai building
permit has been Issued, If more than fifty-percent of & structural roof or more than
fifty-percent of all exterior walls are removed as part of a project, the building Is not
an exisiing bullding.

15.79.085 hapter 1, DIVISION |1, ion R319 "Site Addresses”, Subsaction
R319.1 "Address numbers" —~ Amended, Section R319.1 of the 2013 California Residenitial
Cade is amended to read as follows:

Section R319.1 Address numbers. Every principal building or structure
within the incorporated limits of the City of National City shall be ilentified by a
designated street number as issued by the National City Fire Department.

Approved numbers or addresses shall be placed on all new and existing
buildings, adjacent to the principal enirance to the premises or at a point that Is

Ordinance Na. 2013 — 2383 7 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.79
Adopted: December 3, 2013 2013 Resldential Code



highly visible and legible from the strest. If necessary, directional signs shall be
posted showing proper access ‘o the given address from a point where the Fire
Department access roadway leaves ie dedicated street, to the entrance of each
addressed building. All such numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabetical
letters and shall be @ minimum of 4 inches (102mm) high with 2 minimum stroke
width of 0.5 inches (12.7mm), and shall be placed on & contrasting baciground.

15.72.080 Chapter 1, DIVISION Ii, Section R802 “Roof Classification”, Subsection
RE802.1.3 "Roofing Coverings in all other areas” — Amended. Section R802.1.3 of the 2013

California Residential Codas is amendad to read as follows:

Section R202.1.3 Roof Coverings in o other ereas. The entire roof
covering of every existing structure where more than fifty percent (50%) of the total

roof area is replaced within any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every
new struclure, and any roof covering applied in the alteration, repair or
replacament of the roof of the roof of every existing structure, shall be a fire-
retardant roof covering that is at ieast Class B.

15.79.085 Plan review fees. When plans are incomplete or changed so as to require
additional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be charged in accordance with the

current City of National City Fee Schedule.

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

{Fon Morrison, Mayor

ATTEST:

11e ot

Michael R. Daila, Cly Clerk

ROVED AS TO FORM:

wi\pe
at¥(a Silva

City Attorn

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2353 8 Amending NCMC Chapter 15.79
Adopted: Decembar 3, 2013 2013 Resldental Codo



Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vate, to-wit:

Ayes: Counciimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Salis.
Nays: None.
Absent: None,

Abstain; None.

AUTHENTICATED BY: N MORRISON
Mayor of the Gity of National City, California

City Clbrk of the Gity of/National Clty, Calforna

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed betwsen the day of its infroduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on November 19, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to lts final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Council and that there was available for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and: foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2383 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City oh December 3, 2013.

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

By:

Deputy



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 - 2394

AN ORDINANCE QF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY
AMENDING CHAPTER 15.04 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNICIPAL CODE
BY AMENDING SECTION 15.04.010 PERTAINING TO
THE CITY COUNCIL'S AUTHORITY UNDER TITLE 15

The City Council of the Clty of National City does ordain as follows:

Section 1.  Chapter 15.04 of the National City Municipa! Code i is amended by
amending Secticn 15.04.010 to read as follows;

15.04.010 City Councll's Authority Under Title 186.

A In matters pertaining to Title 15 of the Municipal Code, the clty council shall have
final authority in the following matters:

1. Alternate Materials and Method of Construction. The city council may
approve alternate materials and/or method of construction provided they find that the proposed
materials and/or method of construction, for the purpose intended, at least equivalent of that
prescribed in the code in suitabllity, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durabllity, safety and
sanitation,

2. Refusal to lssue Pemits. The refusal of the buliding official to issue any
permit required by the city may be appealed by the applicant to the city council.

3. Notice to Abate Public Nuisances. The action of the bullding official in
issuing a correction notice or a notice to abate a public nuisance may be appealed to the city
council,

4, interpretation of City Codes. The decision of the building official in
interpreting provisions of the bullding code, housing code, electrical code, plumbing code,
mechanical code, energy code, grean buildings standards code, uniform code for the
abatement of dangerous buikdings, uniform swimming pocl, spa and hot tub code, and
resldentlal code of the city may be appealed to the city council.

5. Disabled Access Regulations. All appeals regarding the interpretation or
application of the disabled access regulations conteined in Chapter 7 (commencing with Section
4450) of Divislon & of Title 1 of the Government Code pursuant to Health arid Safety Code
Section 19057.5 and the disabled access regulations contained in Titie 24 of the California
Code of Regulations shall be heard by the clty council.

8. Decision of the City Councll to be Final. in deciding the matters
enumerated in subsections 1 through 5 of this section, the decision of the city council shall be
final.

B. Definitions. The following definitions apply to Chapter 15:

For the purposes of Chapters 15.08, 15.10, 15.14, 15.16, 15.20, 15.22, 15.24, 15.34,
15.75, 15.78, and 15.79, “Authority Having Jurisdiction™ means the building official of the City of
National Clty.

-~ Signature Page to Follow ~-



e s 4ine) e R RSl e Sk mArms smem bAoA e o BV e

PASSED and ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

_-.--—""'-
on Morrison, Mayor

MicHae! R. Datla, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

lla Gdcifya Siiva
City Attorngy

Ordinance No. 2013 — 2394 2 Amending NCMC Chapler 15.04
Adopted: December 3, 2013 Clty Council's Authoirty under Title 15



Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, Califomia, on
December 3, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Counciimembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Sciis.
Nays: None.
Absent: ‘None.

Abstain: None,

AUTHENTICATED BY: RON MORRISON
Mayar of the City of National City, Califomnia

Rl )2l

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of iis final
passage, to wit, on November 18, 2013 and on December 3, 2013.

I FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior tc its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Council and that there was availabie for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a fuil, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2394 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Counct! of said City on December 3, 2013,

City Clerk of the City of National City, California

By:

Depuiy



ORDINANCE NO. 2013 — 2382

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CiTY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF NATIONAL CITY AMENDING
CHAPTER 1.08 OF THE NATIONAL CITY MUNIGIPAL CODE
PERTAINING TO OFFICIAL CITY SEALS, LOGOS,
INSIGNIAS, BADGES, AND NAMES

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Councl! of the City of National City as
follows:

Section 1. Title 1.08 of the National City Municipal Code is hereby amended
by amending the Table of Contents to read as follows:

Chapter 1.08
OFFICIAL CITY SEALS, LOGOS, INSIGNIAS, BADGES AND NAMES

Sections.:

1.08.0' 0 City Seal.

1.08.C20 Clty Insignia.

1.08.J30 City Logo.

1.0€.040 City Logo.

1.03.050 Official City Name Adopted.

1.0:8.060 Officlal Community Development Commission of the City of National City
Name Adopted.

1.08.065 Official Successor Agency to the Community Development Commission as
the National City Redevelopment Agency Name Adopted.

1.08.070 Police Department Badges.

1.08.080 Fire Department Badges.

1.08.090 Fire Department Logo.

1.08.100 Violations of Public Usage Without Permission.

Section 2. That Chapter 1.08 is amended by adding Section 1.08.065 to read
as follows:

1.08.065 Officlal Successor Agency to the Community Development

Commission as the National Citv Redevelopment Name Adopted. The official
name for the Successor Agency fo the Community Development Commission as the
National City Redevelopment Agency shall be the "Successor Agency to the Community
Development Commission as the National City Redevelopment Agency”, and hereby
constitutes and is adopted as the official name for the Successor Agency to the
Community Development Commission as the National City Redevelopment Agency. The
name “Successor Agency” shall also constitute a secondary official name for the
Successor Agency to the Community Development Commission as the National City
Redevelopment Agency.




Section 3, That Chapter 1.08 is amended by amending Sections 1.08.070 and
1.08.080 to read as follows:

0 Poli a . The following symbols with the
inscriptions thereupon conetitute and are adopted as the official badges of the Poiice
Department of the City.

1.08.080 Fire Depariment Badges. The following symbols with the

inscriptions thereupon constitute and are adopted as the official badges of the Fire
Department of the City.

PASSED and ADOPTED this 20th day of August, 2013.

Ron Morrison, Mayor

ael R, Dalla,{City Clerk

ROVED AS TO FORM:

e

Chautia GaMtua Silva
City Attorgley

Ordinance 20135 - 2382 2 Amandging NCMC 1.08
Logos, Insignies, Names, Badges




Passed and adopted by the Council of the City of National City, California, on August
20, 2013 by the following vote, to-wit:

Ayes: Councilmembers Cano, Morrison, Natividad, Rios, Sotelo-Solis.
Nays: None.
Absent; None.

Abstain: None.

AUTHENTICATED BY; RON MORRISON
Mayor of the City of Nationat City, Califomia

Al ardlas
City Cllrk of the City of National Gy,

Cslifornia

Deputy

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally adopted until seven
calendar days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final
passage, to wit, on August 6, 2013 and on August 20, 2013.

| FURTHER CERTIFY THAT said ordinance was read in full prior to its final passage or
that the reading of said ordinance in full was dispensed with by a vote of not less than a
majority of the members elected to the Council and that there was availabls for the
consideration of each member of the Council and the pubiic prior to the day of its
passage a written or printed copy of said ordinance.

| FURTHER CERTIFY that the above and foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of
ORDINANCE NO. 2013-2382 of the City Council of the City of National City, passed
and adopted by the Council of said City on August 20, 2013.

City Clerk of the Clty of National City, Callfomia

By:

Deputy




