STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

January 28, 2014

Andrew Stuffler, Chief Building Official
Community Develcpment Department
City of Ventura

501 Poii Street, Room 117

Ventura, CA 93001

RE: Ordinance #2013-014, 015, 016, 017, 018, 019
Dear Mr. Stuffier:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on January 2, 2014.

Cur review finds the submittal to contain six ordinances modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modifications are accepted for filing and are enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Heaith and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

nrique M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chren
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)






O’Brien, Laurie@DGS

From:

Sent:

To:

Ce:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear SBSC Staff,

Stuffler, Andrew <astuffler@ci.ventura.ca.us>

Thursday, January 02, 2014 5:42 PM

OrdinanceFilings@DGS

City Clerk; Deborah Hazen

2013 State Code Adopting Ordinances - San Buenaventura City
ATTACHMENT A.xls; ATTACHMENT B.xls; Building.pdf; Residential; Piumbing;
Mechanical; Fire; Electrical; item 07.pdf

Attached are the Ordinances, Administrative Report {(item 7), and Locai Findings (Attachments A & B)
for adoption and amendment to the 2013 State Building Standards Codes.

Andrew Stuffler
Chief Building Official

City of Ventura (aka: San Buenaventura)

astuffler@cityofventura.net

805)654-7868







CITY OF VENTURA

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORT

Date: December 3, 2013
Agenda Item No.: 7
Council Action Date: December 9, 2013

To: Honorable Mayor and City Council

From: Mark D. Watkins, City Manager
Cynthia M. Rodriguez, MMC, City Clerk

Subject: 2013 California Building Standard Codes

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that Council waive the second reading in full and adopt the ordinances
approving by reference the 2013 Editions of the California Building Code, Electrical Code,
Fire Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, Residential Code, and the 2012 Edition of the
International Property Maintenance Code, and amending certain provisions thereof
through express findings of local necessity.

Attached for your reference are the proposed ordinances introduced by the City Council on
November 18, 2013.

Cynthia M. Rodriguez, MMC _
City Clerk






ATTACHMENT A

L ocatl Condition Description of Condition

he City has: 1) areas with expansive soils and des that are subject 1o
mudflows and unstable conditions. Special foundation considerations and
soils analyses requirements must be in place to provide a reasonabie
degree of structural integrity for buildings constructed in these areas; 2)
several earthquake faults that, when active, will impose unique lateral loads
on structures in the City. Special lateral structural design criteria are

Geological needed to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake faults in
the City; 3) Earthquakes will block/damage roads and limit the Fire
Depariment's ability to access and fight fires. Buiit-in fire protection
systems will provide the initial fire fighting services until the Department can
arrive on site; 4) areas of corrosive water and areas of very hard potable
water. Special piping materials and provisions for on-site water treatment

must be made
The City has: 1) Existing hillside and flat land developments require special

drainage precautions Structures are subject to water damage without

Topographical special requirements addressing site drainage; 2) many older City streets
are very narrow and difficult for the Fire Department to stage equipment,
clear wildland and fight fires.

The City has: 1) periods of high temperatures accompanied by low humidity
and high winds each year. These conditions could create an environment in
which the fire department may have great difficulty in controliing fires
occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not having built in fire
protection; 2) periods of intense rainfall, which create the need for special
drainage precautions; 3) moist coastal air and some corrosive native soil.

Climatic

Administrative changes are those made to either sections of the State
Building Standards Codes that are not specifically adopted by a State
agency or that are needed to coordinate the State Codes with the City's
local Charter and Municipal Code. Administrative amendments shall not
resuit in waiving or reducing the State Building Standards Codes

regulations.

Administrative







"SAep Z/1 pue

dnewl ¢ 0} dn 1o} }s0] si Afornosje Buipjing Jeyy Jusae ul uoposioid apiaoid 1'¢°9°L06 0d0 €10¢
0) se 0s swa)sAs wieje all 10} Ajddns Jamod dn yoeq e salinbay
uonejejsul 12 ¥#'€06 _
oHewS pue ubisep wajsAs Japjuuds aiiy d1jewolne 10y Sjie}ap saquUosald| 9 1'L'S'€ €06 '2° €06 O8O €l0c
—— swigjsAs ispjulids-aly djewlojne L1°1°1°808 085 £10Z
T ypm sBuipjing ul pajjejsul aq o} Jjaw jey) sajiy Buijiao oyseld sjqiyold
|esIboj0a5) juejsisal jenbyles aq 0} swa)sAs buljlad papuadsns salinbay 11717808 249D €102
alnsodxa
Jnewi|n il pue|p|im wolj way) joejoid 0} UoHONIISUOD BAlISIsal-all [eloads L1'E€VLI0L 080 €10¢
aAey (sapis||ly) spuejpjim ypm soepajul jey) sbulpling salinbay
SARNSILILPY apo) asueudjulel AHadoid [euoneusdjuj SLL 085 €102
¥ o 210Z 3y} YIm sainjonuis ajesun JO JusladIojus auy) Sajeulpioon) _
. piepuejsqns si Jey} Apadold e buiseydind SpLL g9 €102
¥ o AiBuimounun wouy sisAng aAnoadsold pue siapuaj s}09j0id
aAljelsiulupy by R €Ll 080 €10¢
o . ayj oyl uoisinold plreog sjeaddy BuisnoH / 207 s,AlD 8y} spasuj|
SANEISILILIDY sjoalo.d J19jjewss 1o} Aouednad() JO d}eduIHd) 2 uondeoxg L'LLL | 589 €102
- T ay) se saAlas pied qol jwied Ay paubis-l0joadsul ayj ey sayue|d :
LOAjelSIuILpY . spunjas 99} juad buinss| 10} $s820.1d e saqlIosald 9'601 280 €102
LLAjensiuiLpy j1ouno) AjD Ag paaosdde aq 0) S99} 1asn salinbay 2’601 24D €102
SAENSIUILIPY uonendxa Jwiad yjim sebueyd apo) 550l 285 €102
¥ T spiepuelg Buipjing 9)e)g pue sauljpesap juswalede Sajeulpiood
LOAeNsIuIpY aouenss| Jjwiad alojaq pled aq 0} S99} salinbay 0l wWa)| €601 28D €10¢
SAljensiuILIpY SRS 6 walj €GOl 080 €10¢
¥ o JO JUBA® 8L} Ul $32Jn0sal Jo sjuednooo Bulpjing Ajiwej-jnw salnssy
LLAlensiuwpy aouenss] Jiwiad Yyym sjeroldde buiuue|ld |BO0| S8jeUIpJ00) g Wa)| £'601 24990 €102
«OANBSIUIWpPY s)iwuad paau spays usym sayue|) | Wa)| ¢'601 049 €102
«OAJELJSIUILDY SIaLWwo}snd Joj uopeoyjuapl Jejs Ajsjes pue Buipjing sajowoid G0l 040 €10¢
_SAIRISILILDY apo) buip|ing 8y} YjIm ssadoid uolen|eAs buipjing Jv 101 [yl g9 €102

Buipui v juswiyoeny

Jwelboid juswssassy A19jes, 18)sesip-1sod a)e)S sy} Sa)eulIpioo)
uonduasaqg

8 INJWHOVLLY

uoI329S apoo




Code Section

1505.1, 1505.1.2,
1501.1.3, Table

Description

Protects roofs from catching fire from wind blown embers by not

Attachment A Finding

2013 CBC 1505.1, 1505.1.5, |allowing class C roofing and limiting class B roofing. Climatic
1505.6
2013 CBC 1613.6 Requires additional shear wall connections to the foundation in Geological
earthquake-prone areas
2013 CBC 1613.7 Requires additional shear wall connections to the foundation _.= Geological
earthquake-prone areas
2013 CBC 1613.8 Requires additional shear wall connections to the foundation in Geological
earthquake-prone areas
2013 CBC 1613.9 _».mn.::mm additional engineering analysis and strengthening for Topographical
hillside structures
2013 CBC 1705.3 & Table >__o€m m..z,.m__ low risk concrete work to be performed without a Geological
1705.3 special inspector :
2013 CBC 1801.3 Oo.o&_:mﬁmm State storm water permit requirements with State Administrative*
Building Code
2013 CBC 1803.1 >__0<<m.m3m__ low risk projects to be performed without special soils Geological
analysis
2013 CBC 1803.6 Specifies the soils reporting requirements for better understanding Geological
Allows the City to seek additional analysis of soils and site .
2013 CBC _Amow.w.m conditions rather than prohibit development outright Geological
2013 CBC 1804.1 Mwmwa_:mﬁmm the City Grading Ordinance with the State Building Administrative®
2013 CBC 1804.5 Oooa_:m.ﬁm.m the City Floodplain Management Ordinance with the Administrative*
State Building Code
2013 CBC 1807.1.4 Prohibits wood boards to serve as the foundation for a building in Geological
an area prone to earthquakes
2013 CBC 1807.1.6 Requires an engineer's analysis and design of new foundations in Geological
areas prone to earthquakes .
2013 CBC 1809.3 & Figure _u_.mmnm_cmm a process for "stepping vc__a_:o foundations down a Geological
1809.1 slope in areas prone to earthquakes
2013 CBC 1809.4, 1809.7 & _uqmmo:vmm .Em_ minimum depth of footings based on the soil Geological
Table 1809.7 expansion index




apo) buipjing 8y} Yiim sassaoold

OAJEASIUILPY pue suofjeinbal ,eAlelsIUIWPY S0 [ENUSPISAY 8y} S8)eUIpIoa) 00id QO €l0e
—_— soijje ul bulim Jndino jaued Jejos oljje}swu (4) 9°069 BPMY | 939 €102
e -uou ojui bupno woy [puuosied aia1as pue sieyyby ail sjos)oid :
[eoiBojoss POIIEISUL 8J8 SISjow [Eouoad Sidminu| - . oy | 035 e10z
: alaym wisAs |eoujosle Buipjing ay) Jo josuuoosip ajbuls e saiinbay :
|eoibojoan) Jaid Jo 300p B uo wa)sAs [eoL08fe BY) JojuOW 0} WSlsAS e salinbay ¥ ¥ G E€OE BPMY | 930 €102
«OAjelsiulwpy 8poJ buipjing sy} yum sassedo.d sjeadde sojeuipioo)| €880} 68 SOy 033 €10¢
+SAjensiuILIPpY apoJ buipjing ay) y)im sesseooid sjeadde sajeulpioos 801 JND €102
wajsAs )
eoiBojoeg ondas e ybnouy) pasodsip Buiaq woly sjsem jeusnpul suqiyold 9'6 [H] 9dO €102
pajenjeas .
|E91BojcaE) 3q ued ubisep wejsAs ondas jey) os podai sjios e sannbay LLIHI Odd eloe
OAJELSIILIDY [eaoldde pue mainal Jajepp LBLOL 9dD €102
¥ o BINJUAA Ym s)iuiiad Jojdedlsiul aseall pue |io ‘Je} sejeulpioo)
aAlensiuILpY SANIqI|01d1S00 S1 Jamas A4 YA 2dD €10¢
L T al|gnd 8y} 0} uoldBULo2 JI BululwIB)ep 10} SISk aL) SaquIsald
sbuljiamp .
eobojoas 10} papiroid aq 0} UOOBUUOD WB}SAS JBUBYOS JBjeM e salinbay €llo OdJ €102
LOAlels|iuiwpy apo) buipjing ay} yum sassaoold sjeadde sejeuipioo)) €201 2dD €102
SAljensIuIWpY $9$5300.d pue SUOREINGaI L'y0¥e 080 €10¢
L L uoneoolal Buipjing Buiquosaid Aq asn-a1 Buipjing sejowold
[e01B0j08S) SECIESHOICSHEN IS £'90€Z 080 £10Z
' ul sBulpjing Joj eue)Io ubisep ||em Jesys WNLWIUIW S8qLosald
6 sayenbyles o} suo.d eaie ue uj buipjing o
|ea1bojoss € 10} Uojjepunoj ayj se 2A1as 0} Spieoq ||[EM qUO POOM SHJIYOIH LIV voee 980 €10C
6 seale suoid-ayenbyles . .
|€a1b0]099 ul sBuipjing Jo sjlem Jeays uj pash aq 0} SMaIos IO S|leu salinbay L '6'v0eC Qg3 £loe
[eoiBojoas sayenbyyes o) euold eale ue Z1°6081 €D €107
' uj Buip|ing e 10} UOI)EPUNO} BY) SB SAISS 0] SISGLUI} POOM sjqiyold
|eoibojoan) S 8'6081 042 €1L0¢

Buipuig v juswyseny

-a)enbypes uj paoejd suonepunoy uj steq Buioiouies saninbay
uonduasag

uol329S apon




Code Section

Description
Promotes building re-use by prescribing building relocation

Attachment A Finding

Code

2013 CRC R301.1 . Administrative™
regulations and processes

2013 CRC R301.1.4 MMMMQ_:m”mw residential building design on siopes with the Building Geological

2013 CRC R322.0 OOoa_:mz.wm E.m City Floodplain Management Ordinance with the Administrative*
State Residential Code
Requires buildings that interface with wildiands (hillsides) have

2013 CRC R327.1.3.1 special fire-resistive construction to protect them from wildland fire Climatic
exposure

2013 CRC R401.1 MMmqma_smﬁmm the City Grading Ordinance with the State Residential Administrative®

2013 CRC R401.3 000._d_=m.ﬁmm State storm water permit requirements with State Administrative®
Residential Code

2013 CRC R401.5 Mwm..ma_:mﬁmm the City Grading Ordinance with the State Residential Administrative*

2013 CRC R403.1 Requires reinforced concrete to serve as the footing for a building in Geological
an area prone to earthquakes

2013 CRC Table R403.1 WM___M”M the table that allows masonry to serve as a footing for a Geological

2013 CRC 403.1.1 _uqmmo_._vmm .Em minimum depth of footings based on the soil Geological
expansion index

2013 CRC R403.1.3 Requires reinforced concrete to serve as the footing for a building in Geological
an area prone to earthquakes

2013 CRC R403.1.3.2 Requires reinforced concrete to serve as the footing for a building in Geological
an area prone to earthquakes

2013 CRC R403.1.5 & Figure vqmwom_cmm a process for "stepping" building foundations aoé: a Geological

R403.1.5 slope in areas prone to earthquakes

2013 CRC 404.2 Prohibits wood boards to serve as the foundation for a building in Geological
an area prone to earthquakes

2013 CRC R506.1 _uamn_._amm a minimum *oozsm.amw_m: for expansive soils so that an Geological
engineered design is not required.

2013 CRC R506.2.1 Coordinates the City Grading Ordinance with the State Residential Geological




Buipulq v juswyoeny

uonduasag

uofi23s apon

— "buyoos g ssejo Buniwi) pue Buyool 9 SSejo BuIMmoje 2’2064 ® €1°206Y YD €102
U Jou Aq siaquie umolq puim woly auy Buiyoyed woly syooi sjoslold| ‘2 1L Z06YN ‘1'206Y
R ER) Juejsisal ayenbypes aq 0) swis)sAs buiisd papuadsns saiinbay 2'508y JYD €102
12n0 paysnd buisq wolj way) deay| 0} Jopio Ul siaquisll i
leajBojoes) Buiwe.y joos pue Buyjieo 1abi1e| usamiaq sxoolq Bulwely sainbay 8'208Y 94O eloe
seale auoid-ayenbypes q 2j0U)00}
eoibojoas ul sBuipjing Jo sjjem Jeays uj pasn aq 0} SMaIIs 10 sjleu saiinbay (2)e'z'c094 a|ge L JHO €102
S91I0)S 7 0] seale o
[ea1Boj0e0) auoid-axenbypes ul Buioelq |jem aajduosaid Jo asn ay) sy ()e’01 209y aiqeL 40 €10¢
abeyealq ge[s Juaaaid 0) Jyauaq wnWixew .
[edjBojoes) saAIb J| a1aym pajleisul aq o} Juswadiojulal gejs |je sasnbay ¥'2’905d QI €loe
sge|s 8)21oU092 asn JoLdjUI .
eo1bojoas Japun pues jo JaAe| aseq pue suelquusL aInjsiow e saguosald €2°908 QO €102




N

v

a1




ORDINANCE NO. 2013- 014

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFCRNIA BUILDING CODE
AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF
THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: FINDINGS. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geologlca! or

topographical conditions exist as follows:

A,

Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied by low
humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could create an
environment in which the fire department may have great difficulty in controlling
fires occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not having built-In fire
protection. The City also experiences periods of intense rainfall, which create the
need for special drainage precautions.

Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and includes
hillsides that are subject fo mudflows and unstable conditions. Special foundation
considerations and soils analyses requirements must be in place to provide a
reasonable degree of structural integrity for buildings constructed in these areas.
Several earthquake faults run through the City that, when active, will impose

- unique lateral loads on structures in the City. Special lateral structural design

criteria are needed to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake
faults in the City.

Topographical. The City has hillside and fiat land developments that require
special drainage precautions. Structures would be subject to water damage
without special requirements addressing site drainage.

After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local
climatic, geological, and topographical . conditions make modifications and
changes to the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code reasonably
necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of life, health, and

property.

A13-00258 1



SECTION 2: Chapter 12.115 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code
(“SBMC") is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 12.115 Building Standards
Section 12.115.010. Adoption of California Building Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to California Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive,
Part 2 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California Building
Code, 2013 Edition (“CBC"), including all standard printed Chapters and Sections
(whether adopted by the State matrix or not), is adopted by reference subject to the
amendments, additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter. This Chapter is also
intended to supersede Chapter 12.115 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura
Municipal Code in its entirety. The CBC will apply to all occupancies identified by this
code. One true copy of the CBC is on file in the office of the City Clerk and Building
Official and is available for public inspection as required by law.

Section 12.115.020. Amendments.

A. The city council finds that certain local climatic, geological, and/or topographical
conditions exist as follows:

1. Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied
by low humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could create
an environment in which the fire department may have great difficulty in
controlling fires occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not
having built-in fire protection. The city also experiences periods of intense
rainfall, which create the need for special drainage precautions.

2. Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and
includes hillsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions.
Special foundation considerations and soils analyses requirements must
be in place to provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity for
buildings constructed in these areas. Several earthquake faults run
through the City that, when active, will impose unique lateral loads on
structures in the City. Special lateral structural design criteria are needed
to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake faults in the
City.

3. Topographical. The City has hiliside and flat land developments that
require special drainage precautions. Structures would be subject to water
damage without special requirements addressing site drainage.

B. After due consideration, the city council finds and determines that these local

climatic, geological, and topographical conditions make modifications and
changes to the CBC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective

A13-00258 2



protection of life, health, and property. The CBC is therefore modified, amended,
added to, and changed as set forth below:

1.

A13-00258

Section 101.4.7 is added to read as foliows:

101.4.7 Post Damage Assessment. This section established standard
placards to be used to indicate the condition of a structure for continued
occupancy. The section further authorizes the Building Official and his/her
authorized representatives to post the appropriate placard at each entry
point to a buliding or structure upon completion of a safety assessment.

101.4.7.1 Application of Provisions. The provisions of this chapter are
applicable to all buildings and structures of all occupancies regulated by
the City of Ventura. The Clty Council may extend the provisions as
necessary.

101.4.7.2 Definition. Safety assessment is a visual, non-destructive
examination of a building cr structure for purpose of determining the
condition for continued use or cccupancy.

101.4.7.3 Placards. The following are verbal descriptions of the official
placards to be used to designate the = conditon for continued
occupancy of buildings or structures. '

INSPECTED (Green) - Lawful Occupancy Permitted is to be posted on
any building or structure wherein no apparent structural hazard has been
found. This placard is not intended to mean that there is no damage to the
building or structure.

RESTRICTED USE (Yellow) - is to be posted on each building or structure
that has been damaged wherein the damage has resulted in some form of
restriction to the continued occupancy. The individual who posts this
placard will note in general terms the type of damage encountered and will
clearly and concisely note the restrictions on continued occupancy.

UNSAFE (Red) - Do Not Enter or Occupy is to be posted on each building
or structure that has been damaged such that continued occupancy poses
a threat to life safety. Buildings or structures posted with this placard shall
not be entered under any circumstance except as authorized in writing by
the Buliding Official, or histher authorized representative.  Safety
assessment teams shall be authorized to enter these buildings at any
time. This placard is not to be used or considered as a demolition order.

The placard must note in general terms the type of damage encountered,
the Municipal Code section violated and the following text: The City of
Ventura, 501 Poli St, Room 117, Ventura, CA 93001 (805)654-7869.



A13-00258

Once it has been attached to a building or structure, a placard is not to be
removed, altered or covered until done so by an authorized representative
of the Building Official. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or
corporation to alter, remove, cover or deface a placard unless
authorized pursuant to this section.

Section 104.5 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

104.5 Identification. The building officials shall wear official, City issued,
photo identification at all times when serving the public..

Section 105.2 ltem 1 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

A single, one-story, detached accessory structure used as a tool or light
storage shed, playhouse, and similar uses, provided the projected roof
area is not greater than 120 square feet, such structures are not taller than
8'6" in maximum height, is located on a residentially zoned lot, has no
regulated plumbing or mechanical equipment and the structure does not
obstruct or divert the flow-of rain water from one property to another.

Section 105.3 ltem 8 is added to read as follows:

8. Have obtained Planning Division approval to apply for a building
permit.

Section 105.3 ltem 9 is added to read as follows:

9. To ensure that adeguate resources are available to correct errors in
workmanship that effect adjacent units, buildings with more than 2
dwelling units and all non-residential buildings must have the permit
issued to a State licensed contractor.

Section 105.3 ltem 10 is added to read as follows:

10. Have paid all applicable application, plan check and/or permit fees as
set forth in the City's most current User Fee resolution.

Section 105.5 is amended to add the following sentence:

' Permit expiration shall not be extended more than 3 years beyond the

issuance date or beyond a City ordered abatement deadline, whichever is
less. For the purposes of this Section, abandonment shall mean the time
between any of the inspections listed on the back of the permit card.



10.

1.

A13-00258

Section 109.2 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Section 109.2 Schedule of Pemit Fees. Fees shall be established,
become effective and be applied to applications, plan checks and permits
as approved by City Council Resolution or Ordinance.

Section 109.6 is replaced In its entirety to read as follows:

Section 109.6 Refunds. Fee refunds may be granted only when the total
hours spent providing application, plan check and inspection services for
the permit related work are less than the permit fee paid divided by the
current hourly rate in the City User Fees Resolution.

Secticn 111.1 Exception #2 is added to read as follows:

Exception 2. A signed City permit job card will serve as the Certificate of
Occupancy for residential and residential accessory buildings of 2 units or
less.

Section 113 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Section 113 Local / Housing Appeals Board. A Local / Housing Appeals
Board (also identified as "Board” or "Board of Appeals") is established to
hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by
the Building Official or Fire Marshal relative to the application and
interpretation of the building requirements of the city. The Board will
consist of seven members who will be appointed by the City Council. In
addition, the Building Official, or his or her designee, will be an ex-officio
member and will act as secretary to the Board. Five of the voting members
will constitute a quorum; the ex-officio member will have no vote. Each of
the voting members will be qualified by experience and training to
consider matters pertaining to construction regulations and each will be an
actual resident of the City during his/her incumbency. Whenever possible,
the Board will be composed of members representing the following
specialties: General Contractor, Licensed Professional Engineer, Licensed
Architect, Handicapped Accessibility Advocate, Planning/Zoning
Professional, Licensed Real Estate Professional. If a Board member
ceases at any time to be an actual resident of the City, the office held by
that member will be deemed vacant. Of the members of the Board first
appointed, three will be appointed for initial terms of four years. Their
successors will be appointed for terms of four years. Each member will
serve until his or her successor is appointed. The Board will adopt
reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its business and will
render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a copy to



A13-00258

the Building Official. The Board may recommend to the City Council such
new legislation as it may deem appropriate. The Local / Housing Appeals
Board will serve as the appellate board or body whenever any of the
codes adopted by reference provide for the same. The Local / Housing
Appeals Board will also act as the Appeals Board for the Earthquake
Hazard Reduction Ordinance. Appeals to the Board will be processed in
accordance with administrative policies and on application forms provided
by the Building Official. A fee established by City Council resolution will
accompany an application for a hearing before the Board. Copies of any
rules and regulations adopted by the Board will be delivered to the
Building Official, who will make them freely accessible to the public. The
Board will have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative
provisions of this Code nor will the Board be empowered to waive
requirements of this Code or the technical codes.

113.1. Appeal to City Council.

A Local / Housing Appeals Board action. An application for appeal to
the City Council may be filed by the applicant or an aggrieved
person, as defined in Chapter 24.110, affected by a decision of the
Local/Housing Appeals Board, provided that the appeal is filed in
writing within thirty days after the Board publishes a final decision.
Notwithstanding the definition of an aggrieved person in Chapter
24.110, any member of the City Council may also be considered an
aggrieved person affected by such a determination for purposes of
this section. In addition, the City Council may on its own motion,
within thirty days after the final decision, or at its next regular
meeting for which Brown Act agenda requirements can be satisfied,
whichever is later, elect to review and consider any action of the
Local/Housing Appeals Board.

B. Application for appeal. An application for appeal required by this
section shall be filed by the appellant with the city clerk and shall
clearly state the grounds of appeal and the action which appellant
requests the City Council to take. If the challenged decision
consists of one or more actions based on particular findings or
conditions that the appellant believes were erroneously or
improperly included or omitted, the appeal shall specify which
findings or conditions were erroneous or improper or which findings
or conditions should additionally be imposed. Notwithstanding any
provision of this section to the contrary, no application for appeal
need be filed by the City Council, or any member or representative
thereof, when the city council elects, by majority vote on its own
motion, to review and consider an action pursuant to subsection A.
of this section.



A13-00258

113.2 Action by City Council.

A

B.

Hearing date. The city manager or city clerk shall fix the time for

hearing the appeal.

Notice. The city clerk shall notice the hearing before the City

Councll as required by chapter 24.580

Record on appeal. All materials on file with the director shall be part

of the city council hearing record. In addition, any party may offer

supplemental evidence during the appeal hearing.

De novo review. The city council is not limited to consideration of

the material in the record on appeal. The city council may review

any matter or evidence relating to the action on the application
regardless of the specific issue appealed.

Actions. The City Council may:

1. Continue action on the appeal for a pericd of time deemed
appropriate by the City Council;

2. Sustain the Local / Housing Appeals Board action upon
finding that all applicable findings have been correctly made
and all provisions of local ordinance, or other provisions of
law, are complied with;

3. Sustain the Local / Housing Appeals Board action but
require whatever additional conditions or guarantees as it
may deem necessary or desirable to further the purposes of
local ordinance or comply with other provisions of law:

4, Overrule the Local / Housing Appeals Board, action without
prejudice upon a finding that all applicable findings have not
been correctly made or all provisions of local ordinance are
not complied with but that, in either case, the application has
merit and may possibly be modified to comply with local
ordinance or other provisions of law:

5. Overrule the Local / Housing Appeals Board action upon
finding that all required findings have not been correctly
made or all provisions of local ordinance, or other provisions
of law, are not complied with; or

6. Take such other action as may be necessary or desirable to
further the purposes of local ordinance or other provisions of
law.

Vote required. A simple majority of the City Council members voting

shail be required to sustain, overrule, or modify a decision by the

Local / Housing Appeals Board which is appealed, or to grant an

appealed appiication where the Local / Housing Appeals Board has

failed to act within the time allowed pursuant to local ordinance.



12.

13.

14.

A13-00258

G. Effective date. A decision of the City Council sustaining, overruling
or modifying any decision, determination or requirement of the
Local / Housing Appeals Board shall be final and conclusive upon
the rendering of the decision unless otherwise provided by the city
council in rules of procedure or elsewhere.

H. Effect of denial without prejudice. A decision that has been denied
without prejudice on appeal may be refiled at any time but must be
accompanied by the prescribed filing fee.

113.3 Hearing transcript not required.

No provision of this Code shall be construed to require the keeping of a
verbatim hearing transcript except as may be required by state law.

Section 114.5 is added to read as follows:

114.5 Notice of Non-Compliance. =~ Whenever the Building Official
determines that work has been done without the required permit, or has
not been completed in accordance with the requirements of this Code, the
Building Official may record a Notice of Noncompliance with the office of
the County Recorder and shall notify the owner of the property of such
action. The Notice of Noncompliance shall describe the property, shall set
forth the noncomplying conditions, and shall state that the property owner
has been so notified.

The Building Official shall submit a Notice of Compliance to the County
Recorder when it is determined that noncomplying conditions have been
corrected or removed. A fee as set forth in the City User Fees Resolution
will be charged to the property owner for submittal of a Notice of
Compliance.

Section 116 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

116 Unsafe Structures and Equipment. Unsafe structures and equipment
are regulated by the 2012 International Property Maintenance Code as
adopted by the City of Ventura.

Section 701A.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 701.A.3.1 Application date and when required. New buildings for
which an application for a bullding permit is submitted on or after July 1,
2008 located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildiand Interface Fire
Area shall comply with all sections of this chapter, including all of the
following areas:



15.

16.

17.

18.

A13-00258

1. All unincorporated lands designated by the State Board of Forestry
and Fire Protection as State Responsibility Area (SRA) including:

1.1.  Moderate Fire Hazard Severity Zones
1.2.  High Fire Hazard Severity Zones
1.3. Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones

2. Land designated as High or Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zone
the Office of State Fire Marshal pursuant to California Pubiic
Resource Code 4201 — 4204.

Section 808.1.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 808.1.1.1 Suspended acoustical ceilings. Suspended acoustical
ceilings shall be designed in accordance with ASCE-7-10 Section 13.5.6.

Section 808.1.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

Sec. 808.1.1.1.1 Thermo-Tile Molded Polystyrene Ceiling Tiles and
Ceiling Panels. Thermo-Tile Molded Polystyrene Ceiling Tiles and Ceiling
Panels shall not be installed in buildings and/or rooms where an automatic
fire sprinkler system is instailed.

Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 803.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in
new buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described
in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and locally adopted Appendix M of
the State Fire Code.

Section 903.3.5.1.1 is amended to read as foliows:

Section 903.3.5.1.1. Limited area sprinkler systems. Limited area
sprinkler systems serving fewer than 20 sprinklers on any single
connection are permitted to be connected to the domestic service where a
wet automatic standpipe is not available. Limited area sprinkler systems
connected to domestic water supplies shall comply with each of the
following requirements:

1. Valves shall not be Installed between the domestic water riser
control valve and the sprinklers.

Exception: An approved indicating control valve supervised in the open
position in accordance with Section 903.4.



19.

20.

21,

22,

23.

A13-00258

2. The domestic service shall be capable of supplying the
simultaneous domestic demand and the sprinkier demand required
to be hydraulically calculated by NFPA 13R or NFPA 13D.

Section 903.4.2.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 903.4.2.1 Means of notification. Buildings with fire sprinkier
monitoring systems shall be provided with an approved audio/visual
notification device in each suite or occupancy.

Section 907.6.2.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 907.6.2.1 Secondary power supply capacity. The secondary
power supply capacity shall be of an approved type and shall provide a
minimum of 60 hours of power under non alarm conditions and shall be

capable of operating all alarm notification appliances for 5 minutes after 60
hours.

/
Exception: Fire alarm and sprinkler monitoring systems meeting the
requirements of a central station fire alarm system per NFPA 72.

Section 1505.1 is amended by removing the reference to Class C roof
assembilies to read as follows:

Section 1505.1. General. Roof assemblies shall be divided into the
classes defined below. Class A and B roof assemblies and roof coverings
required to be listed by this section shall be tested in accordance with
ASTM E 108 or UL 790. Wood roof coverings shall be tested in
accordance with ASTM D 28988. The minimum roof coverings installed on
structures shall comply with Table 1505.1.

Section 1505.1.2 is amended by deleting the Exception for moderate fire
hazard severity zones.

Section 1505.1.3 is amended by changing the reference from Class C to
Class B to read as follows:

Section 1505.1.3 Roof coverings within all other areas. The entire roof
coverings of every existing structure where more than 50 percent of the
total roof area is replaced within any one-year period, the entire roof
covering of every new structure, and any roof covering applied in the
alteration, repair or replacement of the roof of existing structures, shall be
a fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class B.

10



24,

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

A13-00258

Section 1505.1.5 is added to read as follows:

1505.1 Additions to Existing Buiidings. in any 12 month period, additions
of less than 26% of the existing roof area may be of Class B materials that
match the existing rcof. Additions in high fire hazard areas must meet the
current high fire hazard area roofing requirements in addition to this
section.

Table 1505.1 is amended to replace all references to Class C with Class
B.

Section 1505.6 is amended to read as follows:

Section 1505.6 Wood Shingles and Shakes. No wooden shakes or
shingles, treated or untreated, shall be used for roof covering unless
specifically allowed in Sections 1505.1.3 or 1505.1.5 of this cods.

Section 1613.6 is added as follows:

Section 1613.6. Local modification to standard ASCE 7-10. Standard
ASCE 7-10, section 12.12.3, Equation 12.12-1 is amended to read as
follows:

O = Cadmax (Eq. 12.12-1)
Section 1613.7 is added as follows:

Section 1613.7. Local modification to standard ASCE 7-10. Standard
ASCE 7-10, section 12.2.3.1, Exception 3.

Detached one-and two-family dwellings up to two stories in height of light
frame construction.

Section 1613.8 is added as follows:

Section 1613.8. Local modification to standard 7-10. Standard ASCE 7-
10, section 12.11.2.2.3.

Wood Diaphragms. In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties shall be in
additon to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be
accomplished by use of toe nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor shall
wood ledgers or framing be used in cross-grain bending or cross-grain
tension. The diaphragm sheathing shall not be considered effective as
providing ties or struts required by this section.

For wood diaphragms supporting concrete or masonry walls, wood
diaphragms shall comply with the following:

11



30.

A13-00258

1. . The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet. Added
chords of diaphragms may be used to form sub-diaphragms to
transmit the anchorage forces to the main continuous crossties.

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the
sub-diaphragm shall not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm
shear.

Section 1613.9 is added to read as foliows:
1613.9 Seismic Design Provisions for Hillside Buildings.

1613.9.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish minimum
regulations for the design and construction of new buildings and additions
to existing buildings when constructing such buildings on or into slopes
steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). These
regulations establish minimum standards for seismic force resistance to
reduce the risk of injury or loss of life in the event of earthquakes.

1613.9.2 Scope. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of
the lateral-force-resisting system for hillside buildings at and below the
base level diaphragm. The design of the lateral-force-resisting system
above the base level diaphragm shall be in accordance with the provisions
for seismic and wind design as required elsewhere in this Division.

EXCEPTION: Non-habitable accessory buildings and decks not

supporting or supported from the main building are exempt from these
regulations.

1613.9.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section certain terms are
defined as follows:

BASE LEVEL DIAPHRAGM is the floor at, or closest to, the top of the
highest level of the foundation.

DIAPHRAGM ANCHORS are assemblies that connect a diaphragm to the
adjacent foundation at the uphill diaphragm edge.

DOWNHILL DIRECTION is the descending direction of the slope
approximately perpendicular to the slope contours.

FOUNDATION is concrete or masonry which supports a building,
including footings, stem walls, retaining walls, and grade beams.

12



A13-00258

FOUNDATION EXTENDING IN THE DOWNHILL DIRECTION is a
foundation running downhill and approximately perpendicular to the uphill
foundation.

HILLSIDE BUILDING is any building or portion thereof constructed on or
into a slope steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%).
if only a portion of the building is supported on or into the slops, these
regulations apply to the entire building.

PRIMARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing
a direct connection as described in Sections 1613.8.5 and 1613.8.7.3
between the diaphragm and the uphill foundation.

SECONDARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and
providing a redundant diaphragm to foundation connection, as described
in Sections 1613.8.6 and 1613.8.7.4.

UPHILL DIAPHRAGM EDGE is the edge of the diaphragm adjacent and
closest to the highest ground level at the perimeter of the diaphragm.

UPHILL FOUNDATION is the foundation parallel and closest to the uphill
diaphragm edge.

1613.9.4 Analysis and Design.

1613.9.4.1 General. Every hiilside building within the scope of this section
shall

be analyzed, designed, and constructed in accordance with the provisions
of this division. When the code-prescribed wind design produces greater
effects, the wind design shall govern, but detalling requirements and
limitations. prescribed in this and referenced sections shall be followed.

1613.9.4.2 Base Level Diaphragm-Downhill Direction. The following
provisions shail apply to the seismic analysis and design of the
connections for the base level diaphragm in the downhill direction.

1613.9.4.2.1 Base for Lateral Force Design Defined. For seismic forces
acting in the downhill direction, the base of the building shall be the floor at
or closest to the top of the highest level of the foundation.

1613.9.4.2.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic
design, the response modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 4.5 for
bearing wall and building frame systems. The total base shear shall
include the forces fributary fo the base level diaphragm including forces
from the base level diaphragm.

13



A13-00258

1613.9.5 Base Shear Resistance-Primary Anchors.

1613.9.5.1 General. The base shear in the downhill direction shall be
resisted through primary anchors from diaphragm struts provided in the
base level diaphragm to the foundation.

1613.9.5.2 Location of Primary Anchors. A primary anchor and diaphragm
strut shall be provided in line with each foundation extending in the
downhill direction. Primary anchors and diaphragm struts shall also be
provided where interior vertical lateral-force-resisting elements occur
above and in contact with the base level diaphragm. The spacing of
primary anchors and diaphragm struts or collectors shall in no case
exceed 30 feet (9,144 mm). -

1613.9.5.3 Design of Primary Anchors and Diaphragm Struts. Primary
anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance with the
requirements of Section 1613.8.8.

1613.9.5.4 Limitations. The following lateral-force-resisting elements shall
not be designed to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm in
the downhill direction:

1. Wood structural panel wall sheathing,

2. Cement plaster and lath,

3. Gypsum wallboard, and

4, Tension only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section
2205.2.2 may. be used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and
diaphragm struts to the foundation provided lateral forces do not induce
flexural stresses in any member of the frame or in the diaphragm struts.
Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal
members when the frame is not rectangular.

1613.9.6. Base Shear Resistance-Secondary Anchors.

1613.9.6.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required by Section
1613.9.5, the base shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted through
secondary anchors in the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts
in the base level diaphragm.

EXCEPTION: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations
extending in the downhill direction spaced at not more than 30 feet (9,144

14



A13-00258

mm) on center extend up to and are direcily connected to the base level
diaphragm for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth.

1613.9.6.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity and Spacing. Secondary anchors
at the base level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal
to the base shear, including forces tributary to the base level diaphragm,
but not less than 600 pounds per lineal foot (8.76 kN/m). The secondary
anchors shall be uniformly distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and
shall be spaced a maximum of four feet (1,219 mm) on center.

1613.9.6.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be
desighed in accordance with Secticn 1613.8.8.

1613.9.7 Diaphragms Below the Base Level-Downhill Direction. The
following provisions shall apply to the lateral analysis and design of the
connections for all diaphragms below the base level diaphragm in the
downhill direction.

1613.9.7.1 Diaphragm Defined. Every floor level below the base level
diaphragm shall be designed as a diaphragm.

1613.9.7.2 Design Force. Each diaphragm below the base level
diaphragm shall be designed for all tributary loads at that level using a
minimum seismic force factor not less than the base shear coefficient.

1613.9.7.3 Design Force Resistance-Primary Anchors. The design force
described In Section 1613.8.7.2 shall be resisted through primary anchors
from diaphragm struts provided in each diaphragm to the foundation.
Primary anchors shall be provided and designed in accordance with the
requirements and limitations of Section 1613.8.5.

1613.9.7.4 Design Force Resistance-Secondary Anchors.

1613.9.7.4.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required in
Section 1613.8.7.3, the design force in the downhill direction shall be
resisted through secondary anchors in the uphill foundation connected to
diaphragm struts in each diaphragm below the base level.

EXCEPTION: Secondary. anchors are not required where foundations
extending in the downhill direction, spaced at not more than 30 feet (9,144
mm) on center, extend up to and are directly connected to each
diaphragm below the base level for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth.

1613.9.7.4.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity. Secondary anchors at each

diaphragm below the base level diaphragm shail be designed for a
minimum force equal to the design force but not less than 300 pounds per

15



A13-00258

lineal foot (4.38 kN/m). The secondary anchors shall be uniformly
distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and shall be spaced a
maximum of four feet (1,219 mm) on center.

1613.9.7.4.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be
designed in accordance with Section 1613.8.8.

1613.9.8 Primary and Secondary Anchorage and Diaphragm Strut Design.
Primary and secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in
accordance with the following provisions:

1.

Fasteners. All bolted fasteners used to develop connections to
wood members shall be provided with square plate washers at all
bolt heads and nuts. Washers shall be minimum 3/16 inch (4.8 mm)
thick and two inch (51 mm) square for 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) diameter
bolts, and 1/4-inch (6.4 mm) thick and 2-1/2-inch (64 mm) square
for 5/8-inch (16.9 mm) diameter or larger bolts. Nuts shall be
wrench tightened prior to covering.

Fastening. The diaphragm to foundation anchorage shall not be
accomplished by the use of toenailing, nails subject to withdrawal,
or wood in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension.

Size of Wood Members. Wood diaphragm struts collectors, and
other wood members connected to primary anchors shall not be
less than three-inch (76 mm) nominal width. The effects of
eccentricity on wood members shall be evaluated as required per
ltem 9.

Design. Primary and secondary anchorage, including diaphragm
struts, splices, and collectors shall be designed for 125% of the
tributary force.

Allowable Stress Increase. The one-third allowable stress increase
permitted under Section 1605.3.2 shall not be taken when the
working (allowable) stress design method is used.

Seismic Load Factor. The seismic load factor shall be 1.7 for steel
and concrete anchorage when the strength design method is used.

Primary Anchors. The load path for primary anchors and diaphragm
struts shall be fully developed into the diaphragm and into the
foundation. The foundation must be shown to be adequate to resist
the concentrated ioads from the primary anchors.

16



A13-00258

8. Secondary Anchors. The load path for secondary anchors and
diaphragm struts shall be fully developed in the diaphragm but
need not be developed beyond the connection to the foundation.

9. Symmetry. All lateral force foundation anchorage and diaphragm
strut connections shall be symmetrical. Eccentric connections may
be permitted when demonstrated by calculation or tests that all
components of force have been provided for in the structural
analysis or tests.

10. Wood Ledgers. Wood ledgers shall not be used to resist cross-
grain bending or cross-grain tension.

1613.9.9 Lateral-Force-Resisting Elements Normal to the Downhill
Direction. ;

1613.9.9.1 General. In the direction normal to the downhill direction,
lateral-force-resisting elements shall be designed in accordance with the
requirements of this section.

1613.9.9.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design,
the response modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 4.5 for bearing
wall and building frame systems.

1613.9.9.3 Vertical Distribution of Seismic Forces. For seismic forces
acting normal to the downhill direction the distribution of seismic forces
over the height of the bullding using Section 12.8.3 of ASCE 7 shall be
determined using the height measured from the top of the lowest ievel of
the building foundation.

1613.9.9.4 Drift Limitations. The story drift below the base level diaphragm
shall not exceed 0.005 times the story height. The total drift from the base
level diaphragm to the top of the foundation shall not exceed 3/4 inch (19
mm). Where the story height or the height from the base level diaphragm
to the top of the foundation varies because of a stepped footing or story
offset, the height shall be measured from the average height of the top of
the foundation. The story drift shall not be reduced by the effect of.
horizontal diaphragm stiffness.

Where code-prescribed wind forces govern the design of the lateral force
resisting system normal to the downhill direction, the drift limitation shall
be 0.0025 for the story drift and the tofal drift from the base level
diaphragm to the top of the foundation may exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm)
when approved by the Department. In no case, however, shall the drift
fimitations for seismic forces be exceeded.

17



A13-00258

1613.9.9.5 Distribution of Lateral Forces.

1613.9.9.5.1 General. The design lateral force shall be distributed to
lateral-force-resisting elements of varying heights in accordance with the
stiffness of each individual element.

1613.9.9.5.2 Wood Structural Panel Sheathed Walls. The stiffness of a
stepped wood structural panel shear wall may be determined by dividing
the wall into adjacent rectangular elements, subject to the same top of wall
deflection. Deflections of shear walls may be estimated by Section
2305.3.2. Sheathing and fastening requirements for the stiffest section
shall be used for the entire wall. Each section of wall shall be anchored for
shear and uplift at each step. The minimum horizontal length of a step
shall be eight feet (2,438 mm) and the maximum vertical height of a step
shall be two feet, eight inches (813 mm).

1613.9.9.5.3 Reinforced Concrete or Masonry Shear Walls. Reinforced
concrete or masonry shear walis shall have forces distributed in proportion
to the rigidity of each section of the wall.

1613.9.9.6 Limitations. The following lateral force-resisting-elements shall
not be designed to resist lateral forces below the base level diaphragm in
the direction normal to the downhill direction:

1. Cement plaster and lath,
2. Gypsum wallboard, and
3. Tension-only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Chapter
22 of this Code may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the
direction normal to the downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not
induce flexural stresses in any member of the frame. Deflections of frames
shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal members when the
frame is not rectangular.

1613.9.10 Specific Design Provisions.

1613.9.10.1 Footings and Grade Beams. All footings and grade beams
shall comply with the following:

1. Grade beams shall extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) below the
lowest adjacent grade and provide a minimum 24-inch (610 mm)
distance horizontally from the bottom outside face of the grade
beam to the face of the descending slope.

18



A13-00258

2. Continuous footings shall be reinforced with at least two No. 4
reinforcing bars at the top and two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the
bottom.

3. All main footing and grade beam reinforcement steel shall be bent
intc the intersecting footing and fuily developed around each corner
and intersection.

4, All concrete stem walls shall extend from the foundation and
reinforced as required for concrete or masonry walls.

1613.9.10.2 Protection Against Decay and Termites. All wood to earth
separation shall comply with the following:

1. Where a footing or grade beam extends across a descending
slope, the stem wall, grade beam, or footing shall extend up to a
minimum 18 inches (457 mm) above the highest adjacent grade.

EXCEPTION: At paved garage and doorway entrances to the building, the
stem wall need only extend to the finished concrete slab, provided the
wood framing is protected with a-moisture proof barrier.

‘2. Wood ledgers supporting a vertical load of more than 100 pounds

per lineal foot (1.46 kN/m) and located within 48 inches (1,219 mm)
of adjacent grade are prohibited. Galvanized steel ledgers and
anchor bolts, with or without wood nailers, or treated or decay
resistant sill plates supported on a concrete or masonry seat, may
be used.

1613.9.10.3 Sill Plates. All sill plates and anchorage shall comply with the
following:

1. All wood framed walls, including nonbearing walls, when resting on
a footing, foundation, or grade beam stem wall, shall be supported
on wood sl plates bearing on a level surface.

2. Power-driven fasteners shall not be used to anchor sill plates
except at interior nonbearing walls not designed as shear walls.

1613.8.10.4 Column Base Plate Anchorage. The base of isolated wood
posts (not framed into a stud wall) supporting a vertical load of 4,000
pounds (17.8 kN) or more and the base plate for a steel column shall
comply with the following:

19



31.

i
n
m
i
i
i
m
i
i

A13-00258

When the post or column is supported on a pedestal extending
above the top of a footing or grade beam, the pedestal shall be
designed and reinforced as required for concrete or masonry
columns. The pedestal shall be reinforced with a minimum of four
No. 4 bars extending to the bottom of the footing or grade beam.
The top of exterior pedestals shall be sloped for positive drainage.

The base plate anchor bolts or the embedded portion of the post
base, and the vertical reinforcing bars for the pedestal, shall be
confined with two No. 4 or three No. 3 ties within the top five inches
(127 mm) of the concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate
anchor bolts shall be embedded a minimum of 20 bolt diameters
into the concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts
and post bases shall be galvanized and each anchor bolt shall have
at least two galvanized nuts above the base plate.

1613.9.10.5 Steel Beam to Column Supports. All steel beam to column
supports shall be positively braced in each direction. Steel beams shall
have stiffener plates installed on each side of the beam web at the
column. The stiffener plates shall be welded to each beam flange and the
beam web. Each brace connection or structural member shall consist of at
least two 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter machine bolts.

Section 1705.3 is amended to read as follows:

1705.3 Concrete construction. The special inspections and verifications
for concrete construction shall be as required by this section and Table
1705.3.

Exception: Special Inspection shall not be required for:

1.

2.

Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks on grade.

The Building Official may waive the requirement for the
employment of a special inspector if he/she finds the construction

or work is of a minor nature and/or is such that no unusual hazard
exists.

20



32. Table 1705.3 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE 1705.3
REQUIRED VERIFICATION AND INSPECTION OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

: | REFERENCE ||BC
VERIFICATION AND INSPECTION | CONTINOUSIPERIODIC|gr s ARD(a) |REFERENGE

3. Inspeétion of anchors cast in concrete where
llowable loads have been increased or where X ACI 318:D.9.2 1908.5
trength design is ussd.

4. Inspection of anchors post- installed in hardened
concrete members. (b) _
1. Adhesive anchors installed in horizontally or|
upwardly inclined orientations to resist X ACI 318:D.8.2.4
sustained tension loads.

2. Mechanical anchors and adhesive anchors X AC| 318: D.9.2
not defined in 4.a.

b. Speclfic requirements for speclal inspection shall be Included in the research report for the anchor Issued by an approved source
in accordance with ACI 355.2 D.9.2 in ACI 318, or other guallfication procedures. Where specific requirements are not provided,
special inspection requirements shall be specified by the registered design professional and shall be approved by the building
officlal prior to the commencement of the work

33. Section 1803.1 is amended to read as follows:

1801.3 State Stormwater Discharge Permit Coordination. All site drainage
components and system shall also comply with any State issued
stormwater discharge permit requirements. Where State stormwater
discharge permits conflict with this code, the City Engineer and Chief
Building Official will determine the most appropriate regulations from both
documents that assure clean water discharges into State waterways and
promotes the safety and general welfare of the community.

34. Section 1803.1 is amended to read as follows:
1803.1. General. The classification of the soil at each building site shall be
determined when required by the building official. An investigation, or
investigations, shall be conducted for each site by an engineer
appropriately licensed in California and reports shall be submitted in
accordance with CBC Section 1803.6.
Exceptions: The following may be exempt from this requirement:

1. Sites having natural formations known by the building official to be
free of adverse characteristics.

A13-00258 21



35.

A13-00258

2. Sites for minor buildings and additions less than one thousand
(1,000) square feet in area when the building official determines
that no special site conditions exist.

Section 1803.6 is replaced with the following:
1803.6. REPORTS. When the building official requires that a written report

of the soils investigation be submitted, that written report of the soils
investigation shall include, without limitation, the following information:

1. A plot plan showing the location of all test borings and/or
excavations and location of cut to-fill "daylight line."

2. Descriptions and classifications of materials encountered.

Sl Elevation of the water table if encountered.

4, Expected total and differential settlement.

5l Location of property or site, including address or lot number and
fract.
6. Description of site, including existing use of ground, topographical

irregularities, such as barrancas, existing structures, and elevations
or ground slopes.

7. Description of proposed structure.

8. Boring logs showing subsurface material to a depth of at least ten
(10) feet.

9. Expansive indexes, including location and depth of samples.

10. Any information that may indicate geological or earthquake
problems, or the potential for hydro consolidation.

11. Recommendations for foundation type and design criteria, including
bearing capacity, provisions to minimize the effects of expansive
soils and hydro consolidation, and the effects of adjacent loads.

12.  Retaining wall design studies and recommendations (if applicable).

13.  Special studies and recommendations concerning the expansion

potential, erosion potential, erosion control, and irrigation
requirements, and maintenance requirements on slopes steeper

22



36.

A13-00258

than two horizontal to one vertical whenever requested by the
building official.

14. Pile and stilt design studies and recommendations (if applicable).

15. Swimming pool design studies and recommendations (if
applicable).

16.  Special site investigations (if applicable).
Section 1803.3.2 is added to read as follows:

1803.3.2. SPECIAL SITE INVESTIGATION. Whenever, in the Building
Official's opinion, test borings or excavations required by the provisions of
CBC Section 1803.3 cannot determine the adequacy of a building's overall
stability, the Building Official may require a special geologic, hydrologic,
seismic, liquefaction, or other investigation. Geologic investigations, such
as hillside stability and potential fault activity, shall be conducted by a
California Certified Engineering Geologist.

The engineering geologist's work must be based upon a detailed, accurate
topographic base map. The map shall be of suitable scale and shall cover
the project area as well as any adjacent area which may be affected. The
map shall include the existing and proposed contours, location of streets,
pads, slopes, structures, and pertinent elevations.

1803.3.2.1. HILLSIDE STABILITY.

A. Any report required by the Building Official o determine a building's
stability, will be based upon an investigation conducted to reveal
any subsurface conditions that may lead to landslides, slump, or
settiement. It shall include descriptions of topography relief,
drainage, sarth materials and structure, a detailed geological map,
geologic cross sections and recommendations for site
development, including consideration for site drainage.

B. Any such report will also describe the effects of the development on
the site and adjacent properties and specific conclusions
concerning the feasibility and anticipated future stability of the
overall development. Specific recommendations for the correction
of ail known and/or anticipated geologic hazards on the site must
be included.

1803.3.2.2. FAULT ACTIVITY. A report required by the Building Official
will include information and recommendations concerning:

23



37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

A13-00258

A. Surface rupture along faults, including age, type of surface
displacement and amount of reasonable anticipated future
displacements of any faults within, or immediately adjacent to, the
site; definition of any areas of high risk; and recommended building
restrictions or use limitations within any designated high risk area.

B. Secondary ground effects, including estimated magnitude and
distance of all relevant earthquakes, lurching and shallow ground
rupture, liquefaction of sediments and soils, settlement of soils, and
potential for earthquake induced landslides.

A new Section 1804.1 is added to this Chapter and all other 1804 Section
numbers are renumbered accordingly. The new Section 1804.1 is added
to read as follows:

1804.1 City Grading Ordinance. All grading in the City must comply with
the current City Grading Ordinance. Where the City Grading Ordinance
and this code conflict with respect to grading regulations, the City Grading
Ordinance will take precedence. Building and foundation permits shall not

be issued prior to the City Engineer's final approval of the associated

grading work supporting or otherwise effected by the building or
foundation.

Section 1804.5 is amended to begin with the following sentence:

1804.5 Grading and fill in flood hazard areas. Grading and filling in flood
hazard areas must comply with the City Floodplain Management
Ordinance. Where the City Floodplain Management Ordinance and this
code conflict relative to grading and filing, the City Floodplain
Management Ordinance takes precedence.

Section 1807.1.4 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Permanent wood foundation systems shall not be used for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1807.1.6 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Prescriptive design of foundation walls shall not be used for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1809.3 is amended by adding the following sentence and figure:
Fbr structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, the

stepping requirement shall also apply to the top surface of grade beams,
supporting wall. Footings shall be reinforced with four (4) one-half (1/2”)

24



42.

43,

A13-00258

inch diameter deformed reinforcing bars. Two bars shail be placed at the
top and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure 1809.1

a N RECOMMEND: a > b
- b < 20"
____________ e —
- b
S ~— ! - MiN. 244 REBAR (TOP & BOTTOM)
e = i N p— .
L "\“‘s -
=T R N i | GRADE
|—l ] ~ ™~ '
"' | EI EIEITE IE R { ~
T e~ T
':_mlzl_llﬁmm!:ﬁmml I IﬁM:'
STEPPED FOUNDATIONS ' —II—ITI—= 11—

Figure 1808.1

Section 1809.4 is amended to read as follows:

1809.4 Depth Of Footings. The minimum depth of footings below the
undisturbed ground surface shall be 12 inches (305 mm), but not less than
the depth as prescribed by Table 1809.7. Where applicable, the
requirements of Section 1809.5 shalt also be satisfied. The minimum width
of footings shall be 12 inches (305 mm).

Section 1809.7 is amended to read as follows:

1809.7. Slab Floor Construction At Or Below Grade. Slab floors on grade
for all structures, including carports, shall be of Portland cement concrete
and comply with the minimum requirements of CBC Table No. 1809.7.
The following requirements for slab floor construction shall be adhered to,
except where engineered modifications are approved by the building
official and continuous inspection during construction is provided.

1. Loose fill shall be pasted and compacted according to the Building
Official’s instructions.

2. Except for buildings, or portions thereof, used only for agricultural,
storage, industrial, or similar uses, an approved vapor barrier of not
jess than six (6) mil thickness shall be installed under all slabs.
Such vapor barrier shall cover all earth or fill material within the
exterior boundaries of the building. At all footings or barriers, such
vapor barrier shall be turned up or down at (east three (3) inches. In

25



44,

no case shall the vapor barrier penetrate within three (3) inches
horizontally of any fastener used to transfer shear or uplift, such as
anchor bolts, tiedown bolts and shot pins. Joints shall be lapped a
minimum of twelve (12) inches or be fastened together with a
suitable compound with three (3) inches of minimum lap.

CBC Table 1809.7 is amended to read as follows:

Table 1808.7—Foundations for stud bearing walls—minimum requirements® %1412

Fveighted Foundaton for slab and ralsed floor systsme=® Conorels alaks
lexpansion No, of Stem Fooling Footing All parimster | Interior foolings | Relnk 312 Pre-molstanelng Reatrictions on
index storias thickness" widih’ thickness footings® forslaband | for continuous 4°with £, over 51 of solls under plots under
raised fiaors® | foundatiens > JReinforcement * Total footings, plars raised floors
Dopth boiow natural surface thickness and alabs®®
of ground and finish grade of sand
inches
0 1 6 12 ] 12 12 184 #4 @ 48 ofe.. Molataning of ground Plare allowed for|
ery low 2 [ 15 7 18 18 'opand wach way 2 prior fo placing concrets single floor
non oxpansive 3 10 18 8 24 24 I:mm or is recommended loads only
1-60 1 [ 12 8 15 12 I:-ﬂ #3 @ 36" ol 3% over oplimum molsture required Piers allowed for
ow 2 ] 15 7 18 18 opand each way 4 % & depth of 16" below lowest adjacent single floar
F a 10 18 8 24 24 batiom yrada. Testing required. loads only
Is1-00 1 ) 2 8 21 12 1444 top @24 00 3% over optimum molsture required
Mﬂll’lm 2 8 15 8 2 18 and hottam each way 4 10 B depth of 18 balow lowast adjacent Plers not
3 10 18 B 24 24 bars @ 24" 0.0, ench way grade. Testing required. allowed
12" Into foating, 36° inta slab '
91-130 1 B 12 8 27 12 3% over aptimum moisture required
fHigh 2 [] 15 [ 27 1@ - Iy to a depth of 18" below lowost adjacent Plars not
3 10 18 8 27 24 bars @ 24" 0.c. each way grade. Testing required. allowsd
12" ima fosting, 36° Into alab **
IAbova 130 Special design by a licensed Architect or Engineer required
jvery high
A13-00258 26




A13-00258

TABLE 1809.7 FOOTNOTES

1.

Premoistening is required where specified in Table 1805.4.2 in
order to achieve maximum and uniform expansion of the soil before
constructicn and thus limit structural distress caused by uneven
expansions and shrinkage. Other systems which do not include
pre-moistening may be approved by the Bullding Official when sLch
altematives are shown to previde equivalent safeguards against the
adverse effects of expansive soil.

Underfloor access crawl holes must be provided with curbs
extending not less than six.(6) inches above adjacent grade to
prevent surface water from entering the foundation area.

Reinforcement for continuous foundations shall be placed not less
than 3" above the bottom of the footing and noft less than 3" below
the top of the stem.

Slab reinforcement shall be placed at slab mid-depth and continue
to within two inches of the exterior face of the exterior footing walls.

Moisture content shall be maintained until foundations and piers are
poured and a vapor barrier is installed. Tests shall be taken within
24 hours of each slab pour.

Crawl| spaces under raised floors need not be pre-moistened
except under interior footings. Interior footings which are not
enclosed by a continuous perimeter foundation system or
equivalent concrete or masonry moisture barier shall be
designated and constructed as specified for perimeter footings in
Table 1809.7.

A grade beam not less than 12" x 12" in cross-sectional area,
reinforced as specified for continuous foundations in Table
1805.4.2. shall be provided at garage door openings.

Foundation stem walls which exceed a height of 3 times the stem
thickness above the lowest adjacent grade shall be reinforced in
accordance with CBC Chapters 18 & 19 or as required by
engineering design, whichever is more restrictive.

Footing widths may be reduced upon submittal of calculations by a
registered civil or structural engineer or licensed. architect, but shall
be a minimum of 12 inches for one and two-story structures and 15
inches for three-story structures.

27



45.

46.

47.

48.

49,

A13-00258

10. Bent reinforcing bars between exterior footing and slab shall be
omitted when the floor is designed as an independent, “floating”
slab.

11.  Fireplace footings shall be reinforced with a horizontal grid located
3" above the bottom of the footing and consisting of not less than
No. 4 bars at 12" on center each way. Vertical chimney reinforcing
bars shall be hooked under the grid.

Section 1809.8 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Plain concrete footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or F.

Section 1809.12 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or F.

Section 2304.9.1 is amended by adding the foliowing:
Staple fasteners in Table 2304.9.1 shall not be used 1o resist or transfer

seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or
F.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when
the allowable shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and
approved by the Building Official.

A new footnote q is added to Table 2304.9.1, as follows:

g. Staples shall not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 2304.11.7 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Wood shall not be used in retaining or crib walls for structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 2306.3 is amended to read as follows:

2306.3 Wood structural panel shear walls. Wood structural panel
shearwalls shall be designed and constructed in accordance with AF&PA
SDPWS. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F,

applications of Tables 4.3A and 4.3B of AF&PA SDPWS shall include the
following:

28



50.

A13-00258

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less
than 3/8 inch thick and studs shall not be spaced at more than 16
inches on center.

2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood
structural panels resisting seismic forces in structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F is 400 pounds per linear foot

(pH).

Exception: Other nominal unit shear capacities may be pemitted if such
values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building
official.

3. Where shear values using allow stress design (ASD) exceed 350
pif or load and resistance factor design (LRFD) exceed 500 plf, all
framing members receiving edge nailing from abutting panels shall
not be less than a single 3-inch nominal member, or two 2-inch
nominal members fastened together in accordance with Section
2306.1 to transfer the design shear value between framing
members. Wood structural panel joint and sill plate nailing shall be
staggered at all pane! edges. See Section 4.3.6.1 and 4.3.6.4.3 of
AF&PA SDPWS for sill plate size and anchorage requirements.

4. Nails shall be placed not less than1/2 inch in from the panel edges
and not less than 3/8 inch from the edge of the connecting
members for shear greater than 350 plf using ASD or 500 plf using
LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less than 3/8 inch from panel
edges and not less than 1/4 inch from the edge of the connecting
members for shears of 350 pounds per foot or less using ASD or
500 pif or less using LRFD.

5. Table 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Section 3404.7 is added to read as follows:

3404.7 Relocation of Existing Buildings. No person, firm or corporation
shall move or relocate any building or structure into the City, or from one
lot to another lot within the City, or from one portion of a ot to another
location on the same lot without first obtaining a building permit; provided,
however, nothing contained in this chapter shall be construed to apply to a
factory-built building approved as such under the jurisdiction of the State.
To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application therefore in
writing on a form fumnished for that purpose. Any building relocation shall
be subject to the following provisions:

29



A13-00258

Exception: Minor structures which do not require a building permit per
Section 105 of this code.

3407.7.1 The following information shall be filed for review and subject to
the approval of the Building Offi C|a| prior to the issuance of the bwldlng
relocation permit:

3407.7.1.1 The location and address of the current site and new site
shown on a plot plan. This shall include the showing of adjacent lots on all

sides of the property and an indication of all structures and improvements
on such lot;

3407.7.1.2 A letter of structural -integrity from a State licensed structural
engineer stating the age of the structure, it's structural capacity for lifting
and relocating, and the specific location of supports to safely transport the
building.

3407.7.1.3 Plans and specifications for the proposed improvements at the
new location, including utilities, emergency vehicle access, drainage, etc.;

3407.7.1.4 A valid transportation permit issued by the City Engineer for
the specific structure proposed for relocation,;

3407.7.1.5 A termite inspection report prepared by a legally qualified
person; !

3407.7.1.6 The plan and details for abandonment of sewage disposal
systems and/or sewer laterals as set forth in the California Plumbing
Code;

3407.7.1.7 A current photograph showing the front of each building to be
relocated;

3407.7.1.8 Such additional information as shall be deemed reasonably
necessary by the Building Official to carry out the intent and purpose of
this Chapter.

3407.7.2 Inspection.

3407.7.2.1 Before any application for a permit is accepted, an
investigation of the condition of the building to be moved and inspection of
the proposed new location must be completed by the City Building Official.
Fees for this investigation and inspection shall be based on the City
Council approved hourly rate for Building & Safety multiplied by the
estimated total travel, inspection and the post-inspection documentation
time needed.

30



3407.7.2.2 If the building or stiucture is located outside the City fimits,
a mileage charge equivalent to the current mileage rate paid by the City
may be charged for each mile traveled outside the City limits in the course
of the investigation.

3407.7.3 Before the Building Official may grant a building relocation
permit, there shall be evidence of full compliance with all pertinent
ordinances, rules, regulations and other laws of the City and State.

3407.7.4 The Building Official shall find prior o granting a building
relocation permit: '

3407.7.4.1 That there Is evidence of full compliance with the City Zoning
Ordinance;

3407.7.4.2 That all new or repair work in the moved building shall
comply or be altered to comply with current State Title 24
requirements as adopted by the City; and

3407.7.4.3 Before a building permit may be granted, there shall be
required of the applicant the posting of a bond in such an amount as is
determined by the Building Official to cover costs of any provisions stated
in this chapter but not less than $100,000. The bond shall aiso cover the
costs involved in cleaning up the vacated site and restoring it to a safe and
healthy condition. The bonding time is a minimum of ninety (90) days and
be extended for good cause by the Building Official if final inspection of
the moved building is not obtained within the ninety (90) days.

SECTION 3: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION. The City
Council determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code §§ 21000, et seq.,
"CEQA"}) and the regulations promulgated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations §§ 15000, et seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists only of
minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related regulations
and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of deleting or
substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefor. This
ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the
environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the
environment,

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, the
effective date of this Ordinance. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and

A13-00258 31



effect for sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date
of this Ordinance.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY. If any part of this Ordinance is deemed invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, the city council intends that such decision will not affect the

validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance and, to this end, the provisions of this
Ordinance are severable.

SECTION 6: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If this entire Ordinance is
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such action will
render this Ordinance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previously in effect prior
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all purposes.

SECTION 7: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 31% day
following its final passage and adoption or January 1, 2014, whichever is later.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _9 _day of _December , 2013.

AT

Cheryl Heitmann
Mayor

APPROVEP A FORM:

By:
Avriel Pierre Calonne
City Attorney

A13-00258 32



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

|, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the
City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES: None.

ABSENT: None.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

DeputyCity Clerk




o




ORDINANCE NO. 2013- 015

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE GITY OF
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CCODE
AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIOCNS THEREOF
THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: FINDINGS. The City Council finds and determines that local climatic,
topographic, and geographical conditions exist as follows; :

A. Climatic and Geological. The City has moist coastal air and some corrosive
native soil.

B. After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these Iocal
climatic and geological conditions make modifications and changes to the 2013
Edition of the Califomia Electrical Code reasonably necessary to provide
sufficient and effective protection of life, health and property.

SECTION 2: AMENDMENTS. Chapter 12.125 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura
Municipal Code ("SBMC") is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 12.125 Electrical Standards
Section 12.125.010. Adoption of the California Electrical Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive, Part 3 of
Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California Electrical Code,
2013 Edition (*CEC"), including Annex C, is adopted by reference, subject to the
amendments, additions and deletions set forth in this chapter. One true copy of the CEC
is on file and in the office of the Building Official and the City Clerk and is avallable for
public inspection as required by law.

Section 12.125.020. Amendments.

A The City Council finds and determines that local climatic and geographical

conditions exist as follows: The City has moist coastal air and some cerrosive
native soil.

B. After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local
climatic and geological conditions make modifications and changes to the CEC
reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of life, health

and property. The CEC is therefore modified, amended, added to, and changed
as sef forth below:

A13-00258



1. Article 89.108.8.3 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

89.108.8.3 Appeals. Appeals of the decision of the Building Official
enforcing this code shall be filed and acted upon in accordance with
Section 113 of the California Building Code as adopted by the City of San

Buenaventura in Section 12.115.020 of the San Buenaventura Municipal
Code.

2. Article 303.5.4.4.3 is added to read as follows:

303.5.4.4.3 Marina Ground Fault Monitoring. Where a marina distribution
transformer is located on a dock or pier, the secondary wiring system shall
be equipped with a ground fault monitoring system with the intent of
alerting marina management personnel to hazardous low level ground
fault conditions in the surrounding water. The ground fault monitoring
system shall include a ground fault warning light located on the
transformer and within a readily visible area to the marina management
personnel.

3. Article 230.71 is added to read as follows:

230.71 Single Service Disconnecting Means Required. Multi-meter
installations where the applied service voltage is 480 or 277/480 shall
have a single disconnecting means for all meters and distribution
equipment downstream.

4. Article 690.6 (F) is added to read as follows:

690.6 (F) Wiring methods covered in Article 334 of this code shall not be
used for DC or AC output circuits running from photovoltaic panels to the
electrical service panel.

SECTION 3: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT. The City Council
determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code §§ 21000, ef seq.,
"CEQA") and the regulations promulgated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations §§ 15000, et seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists only of
minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related regulations
and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of deleting or
substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefor. This
ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the
environment CEQA Guidelines 15308 and that does not have the potential to cause
significant effects on the environment.

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or

A13-00258



preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, this
Ordinance's effective date. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and effect for

sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of this
Ordinance.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY. If any part of this Ordinance is deemed invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, the Clty Council intends that such decision will not affect the
validity of the remaining portions cf this Ordinance and, to this end, the provisions of this
Ordinance are severable.

SECTION 6: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If this entire Ordinance is
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such action will
render this Ordinance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previousiy in effect prior
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all purposes.

SECTION 7: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 31% day
following its final passage and adoption or January 1, 2014, whichever is later.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _9 day of _December , 2013.

CLR IS

Cheryl Meitmann
Mayor

ATTEST:

Copth M A ogues

Cywthia M. Rodriguez, MMC d

City Clerk

APPROVED FORM:

Ariel Pierre Calonne
City Attorney

A13-00258



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

|, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the

City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES: None.

ABSENT:; None.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

Deputy Clty Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 2013- 016

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND
AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF
THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as follows:

Section 1: FINDINGS. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geological, or

topographical conditions exist as follows:

A.

Climatic. The City experiences periods of extremely high temperatures
accompanied by low humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could
create an environment in which the Fire Department may be unable to control
fires occurring in vegetation as well as structures not having built in fire
protection.

Geological. The City is located in a seismically -active area. A significant
earthquake could render the Fire Depariment incapable of providing adequate
fire protection. In that instance, built-in fire protection would be relied upon for
controlling most structural fires.

Topographical. The City has developed areas of steep hillsides. These hillsides
create Fire Department access problems which can prevent the timely
extinguishment of fires in structures not having built-in fire protection.
Additionally, many structures in the hillside area are subject to exposure from
fires occurring in native vegetation remaining on undeveloped land parcels.

The City Council, following due consideration, finds and determines that, due to
these local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions, -amendments,
additions, and deletions to the California Fire Code, 2013 Edition, are reasonably
necessary to provide sufficient and effective levels of fire safety for the protection

of life, health and property. Specifically, the following amendments are made

through San Buenaventura Municipal Code section 14.010.020 which:

1. Allows the Fire Chief to apply fire appliance requirements to residential
occupancies in order to address the periods of low humidity and high
winds, potential seismic activity, or areas of restricted access present in
the City.

2. Provides a means of ensuring that fire protection systems are installed
and maintained in a manner that will provide adequate protection during
periods of low humidity and high winds, potential seismic activity, or in
areas of restricted access present in the City.

A13-00258 1



3. Requires the installation of fire sprinkiers in most new buildings/structures,
those structures/buildings to which specifi ied additions are made, and
structures/buildings in which occupancy use changes are made that
increase the fire and life safety hazard of the structures/buildings in order
to provide adequate fire protection during periods of low humidity and high
winds, potential seismic activity, or in areas of restricted access present in
the City.

4, Controls the storage of hazardous materials, including but not limited to
flammable liquids in order to reduce the danger from fire during periods of
low humidity and high winds, potential seismic activity, or in areas of
restricted access present in the City.

5. Limits the use of fireworks and pyrotechnic devices to state-licensed
technicians to reduce the danger from fire during periods of low humidity
and high winds, or in areas of restricted access present in the City.

6. Limits the growth of hazardous vegetation and maintains defensible space
around buildings and structures in order to reduce the danger from fire
during periods of low humidity and high winds, or in areas of restricted
access present in the City.

Section 2: Chapter 14.010 of Division 14 of the City of San Buenaventura Municipal
Code (“SBMC”) is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 14.010 Fire Regulations
Section 14.010.010. Adoption of California Fire Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive, Part 9 of Title
24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California Fire Code, 2013
Edition (“CFC"), is adopted by reference subject to the amendments, additions and
deletions set forth in Section 14.010.020 of this chapter. Adoption of the CFC includes
CFC Appendix Chapters 4, B, BB, C, CC, D, F, H, and K. The CFC will apply to all
occupancies within the City’s jurisdiction. One (1) true copy of the CFC is on file in the
office of the fire marshal and is available for public inspection as required by law.

Section 14.010.020. Amendments.

A. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geological, or topographical
-conditions exist as follows:

1. Climatic - The City experiences periods of extremely high temperatures

accompanied by low humidity and high winds each year. These
conditions could create an environment in which the Fire Department may

A13-00258 2



be unable to control fires occurring in vegetation as well as structures not
having built in fire protection.

Geological - The Clty Is located in a seismically active area. A significant
earthquake could render the Fire Department incapable of providing
adequate fire protection. in that instance, buliit-in fire protection would be
relied upon for controiling most structural fires.

Topographical - The City has developed areas of steep hillsides. These
hillsides create Fire Department access preblems which can prevent the
timely extinguishment of fires in structures not having buiit-in fire
protection. Additionally, many structures in the hillside area are subject to
exposure from fires occurring in native vegetation remaining on
undeveloped iand parcels.

After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local

climatic, geological, or topographical conditions make additions, modifications
and changes to the CFC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective
levels of fire safety for the protection of life, health and property. The CFC is
therefore modified, amended, added to, and changed as set forth below:

B.
1.
2.
3.
A13-60258

Section 101 is amended to read as foliows:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of
the City of San Buenaventura,. hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 103.2 is deleted.
Section 104.12 is added to read as follows:

Section 104.12.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish
authority to obtain reimbursement from responsible individuals for the
expenses of any emergency response and/or enfoercement action by the
Ventura City Fire Department to protect the public from fire or hazardous
substances and situations.

Section 104.12.2 Reimbursement. In accordance with the Health and
Safety Code section 13000 et seq., an individual who acts negligently or in
violation of the law and thereby requires the jurisdiction to provide an

emergency response to a danger posed by a fire or hazardous substance

shall be liable for reimbursement fo the agency for the costs incurred.

In accordance with Government Code Sections 53150 through 53158, any
individual who is under the influence cf an alcoholic beverage or any drug
or the combined influence of an alccholic beverage or any drug, and
whose negligent operation of a motor vshicle, boat or vessel, or civil



10.

1.

12.

A13-00258

aircraft caused by that influence, proximately causes any incident and
thereby requires the agency to provide an emergency response shall
reimburse the agency for the cost incurred.

Section 105.6.12 is deleted:

Section 105.6.17 is deleted.
Section 105.6.19 is deleted.
Section 105.6.34 is deleted.
Section 105.6.39 is deleted.
Section 105.6.45 is deleted.
Section 105.6.48 is added to read as follows:

Section105.6.48 Christmas Tree Lots. An operational permit is required
for the operation of a site, lot, and/or facility where harvested trees are for
sale to the public.

Section 108.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 108.1 Appeals to determine the suitability of alternate materials
and types of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of
the provisions of this code will be heard and determined in the following
manner:

1. The appeal will be first directed in writing to the fire code official.
The fire code official will render an appeal decision and finding in
writing to the appellant.

2. In the event an appellant is not satisfied with an appeal decision
and finding rendered by the fire code official, a further appeal may
be made in writing to the Local Appeals Board (Board) within thirty
(30) days of the decision and finding. This Board, established in
Section 113 of the California Building Code as adopted by the City,
will also act as the Board of Appeals with respect to the CFC.

Section 109.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or
who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of

the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,



13.

14.

A13-00258

or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
guilty of violation of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code. Fines and/or
imprisonment shall be in accordance with the San Buenaventura
Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 111.4 is amended to read as foilows:

Section 111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine in accerdance with the San
Buenaventura Municipal Code.

Section 114 is added to read as follows:

Section 114 Fire Watch

Section 114.1 When required. Fire watch shall be provided as follows:

1. When required by other sections of this code.
2. When the fire code official deems a condition essential for
public safety.

3. When the fire code official determines that conditions may
result in a rekindle from a fire previously extinguished.

Section 114.1.1 Financial responsibility. The property owner, the tenant or
occupant in control of the premises shalil be responsible for all costs of
providing a fire watch.

Section 114.2 Qualifications. Personnel assigned to fire watch duties shall
possess the following minimum qualifications:

Shall be at least 18 years of age.

Shalil be capable of executing the duties and responsibilities
as specified in 114.4.

Shall be capable of operating a mobile telephone device
and/or portable radio.

Shalil be capable of inspecting all portions of assigned watch
area.

W M=

Section 114.3 Number and hours. The fire code official shall specify the
minimum number of fire watch personnel required and the hours during
which they must be present based on the conditions and size of the
facility.



15.

16.

A13-00258

Section 114.4 Duties & Responsibilities. Duties and responsibilities of
persons assigned fire watch duties include, but are not limited to the

following:

1.
2.

Know the address of the facility being watched.

Be equipped with a mobile telephone device that can be
used to contact 9-1-1 or a portable radio that can be used to
communicate with a constantly attended
security/communications center.

Continuously make rounds and monitor all assigned areas.
Immediately report any sign of smoke, fire or other
emergency to 9-1-1 or to the security/communications
center.

Shall activate the building fire alarm system when the
building is equipped with such a system or notify those
present to evacuate the building or area.

Shall assist with the evacuation of people present in the
area.

Keep a fire watch log that, as a minimum, includes the
following information:

a. Identifies the building or area by name and address
that is under watch.
b. The date and time each round or tour is completed,

plus comments on what was observed. Each entry
shall contain the name and signature of the person
conducting the watch.

() Fire watch logs shall be immediately accessible for
review by the fire code official. A copy of the fire
watch log shall be retained by the owner or agent of
the facility being protected. _

Continue the fire watch until termination has been accepted

by the fire code official.

Fire watch personnel shall not be assigned additional duties

during their fire watch tour.

Section 202 is amended to add the following definition:

"Addition to a building or structure” is an extension or increase in floor
area or height of a building or structure. '

Section 202 is amended to add the following definition:

"Person" is a natural person, his heirs, executors, administrators or
assigns, and also includes a firm, partnership whether general or limited,
corporation, unincorporated association, union or organization,
cooperative and trust, its or their successors or assigns, or the agent of



17.

18.

19.

A13-00258

any of the aforesaid. It shall inciude the plural as well as the singular
number, the male and female gender, and all governmental entities
subject in whole or in part to this Code and the codes adopted by
reference herein.

Section 202 is amended to add the following definition:

"Undetermined Use" a building/structure will be considered of
undetermined use if the specific occupancy type is not determined at the
time of permit application for the installation of a fire protection system.

Section 304.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 304.1.2 Vegetation. Weeds, grass, vines or other growth that is
capable of being ignited and endangering property, shall be cut down and
removed by the owner or occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance
requirements in urban-wildland interface areas, hazardous watershed fire
areas, hazardous fire areas and parcels declared a public nuisance shall
be in accordance with Chapter 49 and Appendix L.

Section 311.6 is added to read as follows:
Section 311.6 Property or Materials Damaged by Fire.

Section 311.6.1 Safeguarding Damaged Property. The owner, or other
person having under their control any property or materials damaged by
fire will secure the property either by boarding up all openings, fencing,
barricading or other appropriate measures as directed by the chief.

Section 311.6.2 Removal of Debris. All debris and/or damaged materials
will be removed from the property in the manner and within the time frame
established by the chief.

Section 311.6.3 Authority to secure property damaged by fire or other
disaster. The Fire Code Official shall be empowered to initiate necessary
actions to secure property damaged by fire or other disaster and/or
remove and dispose of debris, and other damaged materials when, after
giving notice to the owner of record of the property, the owner fails to
secure the property and/or remove debris as ordered by the Fire Code
Official.

Section 311.6.3.1 Cost Recovery. The Fire Code Official is authorized to
initiate any and all actions necessary to recover the costs of securing
property damaged by fire or other disaster and/or removing and disposing
of debris, and other damaged materials when, after giving notice to the
owner of record of the property, the owner fails to secure the property



20.

21.

A13-00258

and/or remove debris and the City provides the service either through the
use of City resources or a contractor.

Section 319 is added to read as follows:
Section 319 Combustible Materials Subject to Spontaneous Ignition

Section 319.1 General. Combustible materials subject to spontaneous
ignition shall be kept in accordance with Section 319.

Section 319.2 Prevention of Ignition. Materials shall be stored, handled,
treated and monitored as necessary and in such a manner as to prevent
ignition.

Section 319.3 Provisions for Extinguishment. The owner or person
responsible for materials regulated by Sec 319 shall provide the
necessary means to extinguish a fire should ignition occur. Piles shall be
arranged in a manner to not exceed the capability of available resources
to extinguish a fire in a single pile. Access for firefighting apparatus shall
be approved by the fire code official.

Section 401.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 401.3 Emergency responder notification. Notification of
emergency responders shall be in accordance with Sections
401.3.1 through 401.3.5._

Section 401.3.1 Fire events. In the event an unwanted fire occurs on a

property, the owner or occupant shall immediately report such condition to
the fire department.

Section 401.3.2 Alarm activations. Upon activation of a fire alarm signal,
employees or staff shall immediately notify the fire department.

Section 401.3.3 Delayed notification. A person shall not, by verbal or
written directive, require any delay in the reporting of a fire to the fire
department.

Section401.3.4 Group E fire alamm initiation. Every person and public
officer managing, controlling, or in charge of any public, private, or
parochial school shall cause the fire alarm signal to be sounded upon the
discovery of fire.

Section 401.3.5 Hazardous Materials Events. In the event an unplanned
or unwanted release of hazardous materials occurs on a property, the



22,

23.

A13-00258

owner or occupant shall immediately report such condition to the fire
department per Section 503.3.1.

Section 503.6 is amended to read as follows:

Section 503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a
fire apparatus access road shall be approved by the fire chief. Where
security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation
shall be maintained operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where
provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates intended for
automatic coperation shall be desighed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F 2200 and be provided with a fire
department approved key switch.

Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 505.1 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall
have approved address numbers, building numbers or approved building
identification placed in a position that is plainly legible and visible from the
street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with
their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or
alphabetical letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm)
high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Where access is
by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from

the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to
identify the structure. All new building address numbering, building unit
numbering, and street designation shall be approved by the Fire Code
Official.

Secticn 505.1.1 Directories. When required by the fire code official,
complexes with multiple buildings may be required to provide directories,
premise maps and directional signs. The scale, design and location of
directories shall be approved by the fire code official and may be required
to be illuminated.

Section 505.1.2 Rear Door Address Numbers. All commercial and
industrial buildings with access via an alley or other similar roadways shall
have the address number, unit or suite number provided on or adjacent to
the rear door of the building or tenant space. These numbers shall
contrast with their background. Address and suite numbers shall be
Arabic numerals or aiphabet letters, shall be a minimum of six (6) inches
{152 mm) high with a minimum strcke width of 0.75 inch (19 mm).
Numbers and/or letters of larger size may be required based on the size
and design of the building or group of buildings.



24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

A13-00258

Section 603.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 603.4 Portable unvented heaters. Portable unvented fuel- fired
heating equipment shall be prohibited in occupancies in Groups A, E, |, R-
1, R-2, R-2.1, R-3, R-3.1 and R-4. All other occupancies shall obtain a
permit from the fire code official.

Exception: Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall be allowed
in accordance with Section 603.4.2.

Section 603.6.6 is added to read as follows:

Section 603.6.6 Spark Arrester. Chimneys used with fireplaces or heating
appliances in which solid or liquid fuel is used will be maintained with a
spark arrester as approved by the fire code official.

Section 901.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 901.4.2 Nonrequired fire protection systems. Any fire protection

system or portion thereof not required by this code or the California
Building Code shall be allowed to be furnished for partial or complete

protection provided such installed system meets the requirements of this

code and the California Building Code.

Exception: Partial automatic fire sprinkler systems shall not be installed in
commercial buildings.

Exception: When designed to protect specific hazard and approved by the
fire code official.

Section 901.7 is amended to read as follows:

Section 901.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire protection
system is out of service, the Fire Code Official shall be notified
immediately and, where required by the Fire Code Official, the building
shall either be evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be provided for
all occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire protection
system has been returned to service. Where utilized, fire watches shall
comply with the provisions of Chapter 1, Sections 114.1, 114.1.1, 114.2,
114.3, and 114.4 of this code.

Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 803.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in
new buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described
in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Appendix M.

10



29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

A13-00258

Section 903.3.5.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 903.3.5.1.1 Limited area sprinkler systems. Limited area sprinkler
systems serving fewer than 20 sprinkiers on any single connection are
permitted to be connected to the domestic service where a wet automatic
standpipe is not available. Limited area sprinkler systems connected to
domestic water stipplies shall comply with each of the following
requirements:

1. Valves shall not be installed between the domestic water riser
control vaive and the sprinklers. -

Exception: An approved indicating controi valve supervised in the
open position in accordance with Section 903.4.

2. The domestic service shall be capable of supplying the
simultaneous domestic demand and the sprinkier demand required
fo be hydraulically calculated by NFPA 13R or NFPA 13D.

Section 903.4.2.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 903.4.2.1 Interior Notification. Buildings with fire sprinkier
monitoring systems shall be provided with an approved audio/visual
notification device in each suite or occupancy.

Section 903.6 is amended to read as follows:

Section 803.6 Where required in existing buildings and structures. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and
structures where required in Chapter 11 and Appendix M.

Section 805.12 is added to read as follows:

Section 905.12 Fire hose requirements. The Fire Code Official may, upon
written request of the property owner, waive the requirement for fire hose

in conjunction with required standpipe systems.

Section 907.6.2.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 807.6.2.1 Secondary power supply capacity. The secondary
power supply capacity shail be of an approved type and shall provide a
minimum of 60 hours of power under non alarm conditions and shall be

capable of operating all alarm notification appliances for 5 minutes after 60
hours.

11



34.

35.

36.

37.

A13-00258

Exception: Fire alarm and sprinkler monitoring systems meeting the
requirements of a central station fire alarm system per NFPA 72.

Section 907.10 is added to read as follows:

Section 907.10 False alarms. The Fire Code Official is authorized to seek
cost recovery for a fire department response to an alarm system activation
which is determined to be a false alarm caused by system malfunction,
system misuse or other non-emergency causes.

Section 907.10.1 False alarm frequency. The cost recovery fee may be
charged for all responses after the second false alarm in a calendar year.

Section 907.10.2 False alarm fee. The amount of the cost recovery fee
will be in accordance with the San Buenaventura Municipal Code.
Additional fees may be charged for extraordinary circumstances.

Section 3304.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 3304.5 Fire watch. When required by the Fire Code Official for
building demolition that is hazardeus in nature, qualified personnel shall
be provided as an on-site fire watch. The Fire Watch shall meet the
requirements set forth in Chapter 1, Sections 114.1, 114.1.1, 114.2, 114.3,
and 114.4.

Section 3311.3 is added to read as follows:

Section 3311.3 Temporary Exit Signage. All buildings under construction
or undergoing demolition shall be provided with temporary exit signage
when any one or more of the following conditions are present:

1. - The building is two or more stories in height

2. The building is 10,000 square feet or larger

3 When in the opinion of the Fire Code Official, exit sighage is
necessary due to the design of the building or other unusual
circumstances are present

The location and design of the exit signs shall be determined by the Fire
Code Official.

Section 4811.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 4811.2 Permits. A permit shall be obtained, unless waived by the
fire code official for any of the activities that follow:

12



a. Use of pyrotechnic special effects, see Section 3308.1.1 and
California Code of Regulaticns, Title 19, Division 1, Chapter 6

b. Open flames

c. Flammable or combustible liquids, gases and dust

d. Hot work

e. Presence of motor vehicles within a building

f Tents and canopies, see Chapter 24

g. Portable generators

h. Any additicnal permits as required by the AHJ

38. Section 4805.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 4905.3 Establishment of limits. Wildland-Urban Interface Fire
Area's required construction methods shall be required for all new
structures built for human occupancy in the High, and Very High Fire
Hazard Severity Zones within the City of Ventura per maps established by
the Office of State Fire Marshal pursuant to California Public Resource
Code 4201 — 4204.

39. Section 4806.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 4906.2 Application. Buildings and structures located in the

following areas shall maintain the required hazardous vegetation and fuel
management:

1. All unincorporated lands designated by the State Board of Forestry
and Fire Protection as State Responsibility Area (SRA) including:

1.1. Moderate Fire Hazard Severity Zones
1.2. High Fire Hazard Severity Zones
1.3. Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones

2, Land designated as High or Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zone
the Office of State Fire Marshal pursuant to California Public
Resource Code 4201 — 4204.

40. Section 4907.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 4907.1 General. Defensible space will be maintdined around all
buildings and structures in State Responsibility Area (SRA) as required in
Public Resources Code 4290 and "SRA Fire Safe Regulations" California
Ccde of Regulations, Title 14, Division 1.5, Chapter 7, Subchapter 2,
Section 1270.

Buildings and structures within the High and Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity Zones of a Local Responsibllity Areas (LRA) shall maintain

A13-60258 13



41.

A13-00258

defensible space as outlined in Government Code 51175- 51189 and
Appendix L.

Section 4907.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 4907.2 When required: The Fire Department may require an
applicant for all new residential custom homes, production tract homes,
multi-family residential and commercial buildings within High and Very-
High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to submit a Fire Resistant Landscape
Plan as part of the approval process.

Section 4907.2.1 Landscape Submittals: Fire Resistant Landscape Plans
shall be submitted and approved by the Fire Department prior to the
framing inspection. Landscape plan submittals shall include, at a
minimum, a readable scale, the delineation of 100-foot fuel modification
zone, the existing vegetation, and all irrigated areas, a plant legend with
both botanical and common names and identify all plant material symbols.

Section 4907.2.2 Landscaping Requirements: plant materials used shall
be approved by the Fire Department for plant palette. Landscape plans
shall be in accordance with the following criteria.

1 All non-fire resistive trees, including conifers, palms, pepper trees,
and eucalyptus, species, shall be planted and maintained so that
the tree’s drip line at maturity is a minimum 30 feet from any
combustible structure. All fire resistive tree species shall be planted
and maintained at a minimum of 10 feet from the tree’s drip line to
any combustible structure.

2. For streetscape plantings, all non-fire resistive trees shall be
planted so that the center of the tree trunk is 10 feet from edge of
curb. Fire resistive trees can be planted 10 feet from edge of curb
to center of tree trunk. Care should be given to the tree’s form
selected so that the tree canopy will not encroach into the roadway,
nor produce a closed canopy effect.

3. Limit planting of large unbroken masses especially trees and large
shrubs. Groups should be two to three trees maximum, with mature
foliage of any group separated horizontally by at least 10 feet, if
planted on less than 20 percent slope, and 20 feet, if planted on
greater than 20 percent slope.

4, If shrubs are located undemeath a tree's drip line, the lowest

branch should be at least three times as high as the understory
shrubs or 10 feet, whichever is greater.

14



42.

43,

44.

45.

46.

A13-00258

5. Existing trees can be pruned 10 feet away from roof, eave, or
exterior siding, depending on the tree’s physical or flammable
characteristics and the building censtruction features.

6. All free branches and palm fronds shall be removed within 10 feet
of a fireplace chimney or outdoor barbecue.

Section 5608.1.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 5608.1.2 Storage. A permit is required to store fireworks in any
quantity and will only te issued for storage associated with a display or for
the use of pyrotechnic special effects material by state-licensed
pyrotechnicians as described in section 5608.1.1.

Section 5608.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 5608.2 Prohibition. The manufacturing, possession, storage, sale,
use and handling of fireworks is prohibited.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Storage of fireworks in accordance with Section 5608.1.2.
2. Use and handling of fireworks for display in accordance with
Section 5608.1.

Section 5608.3 is added to read as follows:

Section 5608.3 Firing. All fireworks displays shail be electrically fired.
Section §704.2.9.6.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 5704.2.9.6.1: Storage of class | or H liquids in above-ground tanks
300 gailons or larger outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by
the fire code official.

APPENDIX L is added to read as follows:

APPENDIX L — FIRE HAZARD ABATEMENT

L101.1 Scope. This appendix provides provisions intended to identify
hazard areas and mitigate the risk to life and structures from intrusion of
fire from wildland fire exposures and fire exposures from adjacent
structures and to mitigate fires from spreading to wildland fuels that may

threaten to destroy life, overwhelm fire suppression capabilities, or resuit
in large property loss.

15



A13-00258

L101.2 Purpose. The purpose of this appendix is to establish minimum
requirements in wildland-urban interface areas that will increase the ability
of buildings to resist the intrusion of flame or burning embers being
projected by a vegetation fire including; the identification of hazardous fire
areas that require applicable defensible space provisions included in this
code and enforced by the fire code official and applicable state and local
fire-resistive building standards that are required by the local building
official.

L102 Definitions.

L102.1 Definitions. For the purpose of this appendix certain terms are
defined as follows:

“Combustible Material” includes seasonal and recurrent weeds, stubble,
brush, dry leaves, tumbleweeds, rubbish, litter or flammable materials of
any kind.

“Defensible Space” is an area either natural or man-made, where material
capable of allowing a fire to spread unchecked has been treated, cleared
or modified to slow the rate and intensity of an advancing wildfire and to
create an area for fire suppression operations to occur.

“Hazardous Fire Area” is land which is covered with grass, grain, brush, or
forest, whether publicly or privately owned, which is so situated or is of
such inaccessible location that a fire originating upon such land would
present an abnormally difficult job of suppression or would potentially
result in great and unusual damage through fire or resulting erosion. Such
areas are designated by the fire code official. The fire code official is
authorized to utilize as reference, the definition of Hazardous Watershed
Fire Area, Local Agency Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps designated
pursuant to California Government Code, Sections 51175 through 51189
and the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code.

“Hazardous Watershed Fire Area” is a location within 500 feet of a forest
or brush-, grass-, or grain-covered land, exclusive of small individual lots
or parcels of land located outside of a forest or brush-, grass-, or grain-
covered area. '

“Parcel” is a portion of land of any size, the area of which is determined by
the assessor's maps and records and may be identified by an assessor's
parcel number whether or not any buildings are present.

“Public Nuisance" is a declaration by the fire code official that the
presence of combustible material on a parcel creates a fire hazard.

16



“Wildland-Urban Interface Area” is that geographical area where
structures and other human development meet or intermingle with
wildiand or vegetative fuels.

L103 Uniawful Disposal. Every person who places, deposits or dumps
combustibie material on a parcel whether or not he owns such parcel, or
whether or not he so places, deposits or dumps on such parcel with the
consent of the owner thereof, is subject to civil penalties as set forth in
Chapter 1.050 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code and to criminal
penalties as set forth in the Caiifornia Health and Safety Code Section
13871.

L104 Clearance of Brush, Vegetative Growth and Combustible Material
from Parcels. All parcels declared a public nuisance shall be cleared
entirely of combustible material. If the fire code official determines this
impractical due to hazards posed by the resuiting clearance, the
provisions of Section L105 may be used.

L105 Clearance of Brush and Vegetative Growth Away from Structures.
Any person owning, leasing, controlling, operating or maintaining any
building in, upon, or adjoining any hazardous fire area, and any person
owning, leasing or controlling any land adjacent to such building, shall at
all times maintain around and adjacent to such building an effective
firebreak made by removing and clearing away, all combustible material
for a distance of not less than 100 feet from all portions of the building.

EXCEPTION: Single specimens or stands of protected species of trees,
omamental shrubbery or similar plants used as ground covers, provided
they do not form a means of rapidly transmitting a fire from the native
growth to any building.

L106 Prosecution. The fire code official shall serve a written order upon
the owner or possessor of a parcel, when in the opinion of the fire code
official, a public nuisance exists thereon. The order shall direct such owner
or possessor to remove or abate the public nuisance per the procedures
and timeframes outlined in Chapter 8.010 of the San Buenaventura
Municipal Code.

47. APPENDIX M is added to read as foilows:
APPENDIX M - FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

M101 General. An automatic fire extinguishing system shall be installed in
all occupancies and locations as set forth in Appendix M and Chapter 9.

M102 Definitions.

A13-00258 17



A13-00258

“Building/Structure, Existing” — buildings or structures permitted,
constructed and final authorization for occupancy received prior to
November 6, 1991 by the authority having jurisdiction.

"Building/Structure, New” — buildings or structures permitted, constructed
and final authorization for occupancy received on or after November 6,
1991 by the authority having jurisdiction.

“Floor Area” — as defined by the California Building Code

“Multiple Use Occupancies” — buildings or structures that contain more
than one occupancy group listed in Section 202 as determined by the fire
code official.

M103 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be
provided in new and existing buildings/structures in the locations as
described in this section.

M103.1 New Buildings/Structures. In all new buildings or structures, to be
occupied by Groups A, B, E, F, H, |, L M, R, S, U, or mixed use occupancy
classifications when over 500 sq. Ft. in fioor area. For all new townhouses
and one- and two- family dwellings an automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be installed per the California Residential Code.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Detached U occupancy carports used for motor vehicle storage
intended for no other use or storage that are open on sixty percent
(60%) of exterior walls. Such carports are limited to three thousand
(3,000) square feet or less in floor area and will be constructed
entirely of noncombustible materials. Treated lumber is not
allowed.

2. Detached residential U occupancy carports or garages limited to
one thousand (1,000) square feet or less in floor area and located a
minimum of 10 feet from adjacent structures.

3. Noncombustible detached car wash structures, provided the car
wash is separated from other structures with an assumed property
line.

4. Public schools shall comply with Section 903.2.2 of this code.

M103.2 Existing Buildings/Structures.

18



A13-00258

M103.2.1 In all existing residential buildings or structures when cumulative
additions are made which result in a total floor area 100% or greater than
the November 6, 1891 area of the building or structure.

M103.2.2 In all other existing buildings/structures, when cumulative
additions are made which resuits in a total building/structure floor area
equal to or greater than five thousand (5000) square feet and the additions
exceed the greater of:

a) Ten percent (10%) of the original floor area, or
b) Two thousand five hundred (2500) square feet.

EXCEPTION: Occupancy types required to have an automatic fire
sprinkler system installed by the California Building Code when the square
footage is less than 5,000 square feet will comply with the requirements of
the California Building Code.

M103.2.3 In all existing buildings/structures, having a total floor area equal
to or greater than five thousand (5,000) square feet when a change in
occupancy classification or use occurs that results in a more hazardous
use, based on life and fire risk than the existing occupancy classification
or use.

EXCEPTION: Occupancy types required to have an automatic fire
sprinkler system installed by the California Building Code when the square
footage is less than 5,000 square feet will comply with the requirements of
the California Building Code.

M103.2.4 In all existing buildings/structures where renovations occur
requiring a building permit and the total area of the ceiling covering
removed and/or previously exposed underside of roofffloor decking
exceeds 75% or greater of the total floor area of the building/structure.

EXCEPTION: Occupancy types required to have an automatic fire
sprinkler system installed by the California Building Code will comply with
the requirements of the California Building Code.

M104 Installation Requirements

M104.1 Modifications

M104.1 For the purposes of this Appendix, fire walls shall not be
considered as creating separate buildings.

19



M104.1.2 Where allowed, sprinkler systems installed in accordance with
NFPA 13D'in Group R-3 occupancies shall provide sprinkler protection for
aftached Group U occupancies.

M104.1.2 When NFPA 13R sprinkler systems are provided in Group R
occupancies, exceptions to, or reductions in, code requirements are not
allowed based on the installation of either a NFPA 13R or NFPA 13
sprinkler system. This shall also include requirements in the California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2 and Part 9.

M104.1.3 Buildings/structures containing multiple use occupancies which
include one or more Group R accupancies shall be protected throughout
with fire sprinklers that meet NFPA 13 standards.

Section 3: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION. The City
Council - determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code §§ 21000, et seq.,
"CEQA") and the regulations promulgated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations §§ 15000, et seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists only of
minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related regulations
and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of deleting or
substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefore. This
ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the
environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the
environment.

Section 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, this
Ordinance's effective date. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and effect for
sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of this
Ordinance.

Section 5: SEVERABILITY. If any part of this Ordinance or its application is deemed
invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, the City Council intends that such invalidity
will not affect the effectiveness of the remaining provisions or applications and, to this
end, the provisions of this Ordinance are severable.

Section 6: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If this the entire Ordinance or
its application is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, any repeal of the
SBMC or other city ordinance by this Ordinance will be rendered void and cause such
SBMC provision or other city ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all
purposes.

A13-00258 20



Section 7: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 315 day following
its final passage and adoption or January 1, 2014, whichever is later.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _9 _ day of December _, 2013.

Cheryl Hgﬁmann

Mayor
ATTEST:

Nthe Mot

Cinthia M. Redriguez, MMC
City Clerk

APPROYED F

iz

Ariel Pierre Calonne
City Attorney

A13-00258 21



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

I, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the

City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
: Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES.: None.

ABSENT: None.

I.N WITNESS WHEREOF, | havé set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

Aotens STl

Deputy ‘City Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 2013-_017

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL
CODE AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIGNS
THEREOF THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL
NECESSITY

The Council of the City cf San Buenaventura does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: Chapter 12.130 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Ordinance Code
("SBMC") is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 12.130 Mechanical Standards
Section 12.130.010. . Adoption of the California Mechanical Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive, Part 4 of
Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the Califonla Mechanical
‘Code, 2013 Edition ("CMC"), including Appendices D and F thereof, and standards
contained therein, is adopted by reference, subject to changes set forth in this chapter.
One frue copy of said Code, is on file in the office of the City Clerk and Building Official
-and is available for public inspection as required by law.

Section 12.130.020. Amendments.

After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that due to the need to
establish administrative procedures to enforce the CMC, that changes to the California
Mecharical Code, 2013 Edition, are needed and therefore, the CMC is modified,
amended, added fo, and changed as set forth below:

Section 108 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

108. Appeals. Appeals of the decision of the Building Official enforcing this code
shall be filed and acted upon in accordance with Section 113 of the California
Building Code as adopted by the City of San Buenaventura in Section
12.115.020 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code.

Note: For administrative purposes, wherever the term “Authority Having
Jurisdiction” is used in the CMC, it shall be understood to meaning “Building
Official” or his/her cfficial designee.

SECTION 2: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT. The City Council
determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code Section 21000, et seq.,

A13-00258 1



"CEQA") and the regulations promulgated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations Sections 15000, ef seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists
only of minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related
regulations and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of
deleting or substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefor.
This ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the

environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the
environment.

SECTION 3: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, this
Ordinance's effective date. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and effect for

sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of this
Ordinance.

SECTION 4: SEVERABILITY. If any part of this Ordinance is deemed invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, the city council intends that such decision will not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance and, to this end, the provisions of this
Ordinance are severable.

SECTION 5: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If this entire Ordinance is
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such action will
render this Ordinance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previously in effect prior
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all purposes.

i
i
i
"
i
n
i
]
i
H

A13-00258 2



SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 31%

day
following its final passage and adoption or January 1, 2014, whichever is latest.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 9 day of December , 2013.
__ A <
Cheryl Heitfhann It
Mayor
ATTEST:

ynthia M. Rodriguez, MMC
ity Clerk

APPROVED A$ TOJFORM:

Ariel Pierre Calonne TSN~
City Attorney

A13-00258 3



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

I, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the.

City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES: None.

ABSENT: None.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

o

Deputy Gity Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 2013- 018

AN ORDINANCE CF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE 2013 EDITION OF THE
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AND AMENDING
CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF THROUGH
EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: FINDINGS. After due consideraticn, the City Council finds and determines
that local climatic, topographic, and geographical conditions exist as follows: -

A Climatic and Geological. The City has a limited supply of local water some of
which is corrosive in nature which requires modification of plumbing fixtures to
conserve water and protect the public health and welfare.

B. After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local
climatic and geological conditions make modifications and changes to the 2013
Edition of the Califomia Plumbing Code reasonably necessary to provide
sufficient and effective protection of life, health and property.

SECTION 2: Chapter 12.120 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code
(“SBMC") is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 12120 Plumbing Standards
Section 12.120.010. Adoption of California Plumbing Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to California Government Code sections 50022.1 o 50022.8, inclusive,
Part 5§ of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California
Plumbing Code, 2013 Edition (“CPC"), including Appendices A, B, C, D, G, H, I, and K
thereof, is adopted by reference subject to the amendments, additions and deletions set
forth in this chapter. The CPC will apply to all cccupancies identified by this code. One
true copy of the CPC is on file in the office of the City Clerk and Building Official and is
available for pubiic inspection as required by law

Section 12.120.020. Amendments.

A..  After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that local climatic,
topographic, and geographical conditions exist as follows: Climatic and
Geological. The Clty has a limited supply of local water some of which is
corrosive in nature which requires modification of plumbing fixtures to conserve
water and protect the public health and welfare.

A13-00258



These local climatic and geological conditions make modifications and changes

to the CPC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of
life, health and property. Therefore, the CPC is modified, amended, added to,
and changed as set forth below:

1.

A13-00258

Section 102.3 is replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

102.3 Appeals. Appeals of the decision of the Building Official enforcing
this code shall be filed and acted upon in accordance with Section 113 of
the California Building Code as adopted by the City of San Buenaventura
in Section 12.115.020 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code.

Section 611.3 is arﬁended by adding the foliowing sentence to the
beginning of the paragraph:.

Each new single-family and multi-family building shall have its water
distribution system designed such that a water softener loop is provided at
a location within 6 feet of building drainage system access for water
softener discharge.

Section 713.4 is amended by adding the foliowing sentence to the end of
the paragraph:

When the property owner can demonstrate to the Building Official that
connection to the public sewer costs more than 150% of the cost of the
private sewage disposal system approved by the State Water Resources
Board, the Building Official shall grant replacement of the private sewage
disposal system. '

Section 1014.1 is amended by adding the following sentences to the end
of the paragraph:

All grease interceptor systems shall be subject to review, approval and
inspection by the City public sewer authority — currently Ventura Water.
While these reviews, approvals and inspections shall be in addition to the
plumbing system review of the City- Building and Safety Division, the
Building and Safety Division will facilitate coordination of the review,
approval and inspection processes.

Section H 1.1 is amended to add the following:

The soils report required in this section shall be performed under the
supervision of a California registered Environmental Health Specialist,
Civil Engineer, Geologist, or Engineering geologist. The soil report must
specifically document the soil absorption rate for purposes of disposal
system sizing. Where this Chapter conflicts with the City Municipal Code



requirement mandating connection to the public sewer, the connection to
public sewer shall be required.

6. Section H 9.6 is deleted and replaced with the following:

H 9.6 Waste Discharge. The discharge of industrial waste into a soil
absorption system shall be prohibited uniess sufficient analysis has been
submitted to, reviewed, and approved by the Local Appeals Board.

SECTION 3: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT. The City Council

determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code §§ 21000, ef seq.,
"CEQA") and the regulations promuigated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations §§ 15000, ef seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists only of
minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related regulations
and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of deleting or
substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefor. This
ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the
environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the
environment.

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or
preciude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, this
Ordinance's effective date. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and effect for

sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of this
Ordinance.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY. If any part of this Ordinance is deemed invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, the city councll intends that such decision will not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance and, to this end, the provisions of this
Ordinance are severable.

SECTION 6: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If this entire Ordinance is
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such action will
render this Ordinance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previously in effect prior
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all purposes.

11l

1

1/l

m

A13-00258



SECTION 7: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 31% day
following its final passage and adoption or on January 1, 2014, whichever is later,

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _9 day of December  2013.

Cheryl H;itmann

Mayor

ATTEST:

ot MK b

Cyhthia M. Rodriguez, MMC
City Clerk

APPROV %%

Ariel Pierre Calonne
City Attorney

A13-00258



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

I, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the
City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES: None.

ABSENT: None.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

)

Deputy City Clerk







ORDINANCE NO. 2013-_019

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CiTY OF
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
2013 EDITION CF THE CAUFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS
THEREOF THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL
NECESSITY

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura dees ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: FINDINGS. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions exist as follows:

A.

Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied by low
humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could create an
environment in which the fire department may have great difficulty in contrclling
fires occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not having built-in fire
protection. The City aiso experiences periods of intense rainfall, which create the
need for special drainage precautions.

Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and includes
hillsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions. Special foundation
considerations and soils analyses requirements must be in place to provide a
reasonable degree of structural integrity for buildings constructed in these areas.
Several earthquake faults run through the Clty that, when active, will impose
unique lateral loads on structures in the City. Special lateral structural design
criteria are needed to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake
faults in the City.

Topographical. The City has hillside and flat land developments that require
special drainage precautions. Structures would be subject to water damage
without special requirements addressing site drainage.

After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions make modifications and
changes to the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code reasonably
necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of life, health, and
property.

A13-00258 1



SECTION 2: Chapter 12.110 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code
("SBMC") is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 12.110 Residential Building Standards
Section 12.110.010. Adoption of California Residential Code, 2013 Edition.

Pursuant to California Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive,
Part 2.5 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California
Residential Code, 2013 Edition (“CRC"), including all standard printed Chapters and
Sections (whether adopted by the State matrix or not), is adopted by reference subject
to the amendments, additions, and deletions set forth in. this chapter. The CRC will
apply to residential occupancies identified by this code. One true copy of the CRC is on
file in the office of the Clty Clerk and Building Official and is available for public
inspection as required by law.

Section 12.110.020. Amendments.

A. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geological, and/or topographical
conditions exist as foliows:

1. Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied
by low humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could create
an environment in which the fire department may have great difficulty in
controlling fires occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not
having built-in fire protection. The city also experiences periods of intense
rainfall, which create the need for special drainage precautions.

2. Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and
includes hillsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions.
Special foundation considerations and soils analyses requirements must
be in place to provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity for
buildings constructed in these areas. Several earthquake faults run
through the City that, when active, will impose unique lateral loads on
structures in the City. Special lateral structural design criteria are needed
to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake faults in the

City.

3. Topographical. The City has hillside and flat land developments that
require special drainage precautions, as well as a system of roadways and
highways that generate traffic noise. Structures would be subject to water
damage without special requirements addressing site drainage.

B. After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these local

climatic, geological, and topographical conditons make modifications and
changes to the CRC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective

A13-00258 2



protection of life, health, and property. The CRC is therefore modified, amended,
added to, and changed as set forth below:

1. Chapter 1, Division Il is replaced in its entirety with the following:

Division |l Administration.

R100. Administration. Refer to Chapter 1, Division Il, of the 2013
Caiifornia Building Code, as adopted by the City of Ventura, for all
administrative requirements and regulations.

2. Section R301.1 is amended by adding the following to the end of the
section:;

Relocation of Existing Buildings. Relocated residential buildings shall
comply with the relocation requirements found in the 2013 California
Building Code, Section 3407.

3. Section R301.1.4 is added to Chapter 3 to read as follows:

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on into
slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent
slope). The design and construction of new buildings and additions to
existing buildings when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one
unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with
Section 1613.9 of the Building Code.

4, Section R322.0 is added to read as follows:

R322.0 Grading and fill in flood hazard areas. Grading and filling in flood
hazard areas must comply with the City Floodplain Management
Ordinance. Where the City Floodplain Management Ordinance and this
code conflict relative to grading and filling, the City Floodplain
Management Ordinance takes pracedence.

B Section R327.1.3.1 is amended to read as follows:
Section R327.1.3.1. Application date and where required. New buildings
for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after July
1, 2008 located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildland Interface
Fire Area shall comply with all sections of this chapter, including all of the
following areas:

1. All unincorporated lands designated by the State Board of Forestry
and Fire Protection as State Responsibility Area (SRA) including:

1.1. Moderate Fire Hazard Severity Zones

A13-00258 3 .



10.

A13-00258

1.2. High Fire Hazard Severity Zones
1.3. Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zones

2. Land designated as High or Very-High Fire Hazard Severity Zone
the Office of State Fire Marshal pursuant to California Public
Resource Code 4201 — 4204.

Section R401.1 is amended to add the following paragraph at the
beginning of the section:

All grading in the City must comply with the current City Grading
Ordinance. Where the City Grading Ordinance and this code conflict with
respect to grading regulations, the City Grading Ordinance will take
precedence. Building and foundation permits shall not be issued prior to
the City Engineer’s final approval of the associated grading work
supporting, or otherwise affected by, the building or foundation.

The last sentence of Section R401.1 is amended to read as follows:

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category DO, D1, D2 or E shall not
be permitted.

Section R401.3 is amended to add the following paragraph at the
beginning of the section:

All site drainage components and systems shall also comply with any
State issued stormwater discharge permit requirements. Where State
stormwater discharge permits conflict with this code, the City Engineer
and Chief Building Official will determine the most appropriate regulations
from both documents that assure clean water discharges into State
waterways and promotes the safety and general welfare of the community.

Section R401.5 is added to read as follows:

R401.5 Grading. Also refer to the City of Ventura Municipal Code Grading
Ordinance for requirements goveming excavation, grading and earthwork
construction including fills and embankments.

The first sentence of Section R403.1 is amended to read as follows:

All exterior walls and load bearing interior walls shall be supported on
continuous concrete footings, or other approved structural systems which
shall be of sufficient design to accommodate all loads according to Section
R301 and to transmit the resulting loads to the soil within the limitations as
determined from the character of the soil.



11.

12.

13.
14.

15.

Table R403.1 is deleted.

Section 403.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 403.1.1 Minimum Size. Ali foundation and/or siab designs shall be
predicated upon a soil analysis. Said design shall not be less than those
minimum requirements set forth in Title Table 1809.7(1) for each soil
expansion range.

The exception in Section R403.1.3 is deleted.

The exception in Section R403.1.3.2 is deleted.

Sec. R403.1.5 is amended by adding the following:

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories DO, D1, D2 or E,
stepped footings shall be reinforced with four one-half (1/2") inch diameter

deformed reinforcing bars. Two (2) bars shall be placed at the top and
bottom of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5.

RECOMMEND: a>b
bs2-0"

Y

16.

A13-00258

y ! b
—
e U Sy A

==

S
=l <

T /I—MIN. 244 REBAR (TOP & BOTTOM)

.
.,

e,
| T TTT ™rT T pom { [
SETTEEE T PEETy ty 1  e,
S -

]
Hogpt bl | el | el [ - . -~ |
=== T
ey T v e gl . oy
». e ] l_ T . \\—---

~

HIEETEEIETELS
===
STEPPED FOUNDATIONS ™" T =TTF—ITI—T1

Figure R403.1.5
Section 404.2 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Wood foundation walls shali not be used for structures located in Seismic
Design Category D0, D1, D2, and E.



17.

18.

19.

20.

A13-00258

Section R506.1 is amended by adding the following:

In lieu of a more detailed design per Sec. 1808.6 of the 2013 California
Building Code the following minimum requirements for concrete slab on
ground shall apply:

Slab floors shall be reinforced as set forth in Table1809.7. All slabs
founded on solls found to be in an expansive index of over fifty (50) shall
be doweled into foundation walls with not less than No. 3 reinforcing steel
bars bent twelve (12") inches into the wall and thirty-six (36") inches
minimum into the slab at twenty-four (24") inches o.c. maximum. Interior
walls with continuous foundations shall have similar floor ties.

Section R506.2.1 is amended to add the following to the end of the
section:

Also refer to the City of Ventura Municipal Code Grading Ordinance for
requirements governing excavation, grading and earthwork construction
including fills and embankments.

Loose fill shall be compacted in an approved manner and fo the
satisfaction of the Building Official or shall be removed and replaced with
coarse sand or gravel.

Section 506.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 506.2.3 Vapor retarder. An approved moisture membrane with a
minimum thickness of six (6) mils shall be installed in an approved manner
under all interior concrete slab areas except residential garage slab areas.
A layer of sand with a minimum depth of one (1"} inch shall be placed over
said membrane and shall be moist just prior to the placing of concrete. In
cases where the foundation system proposed is a post tension slab and
footing, a two (2") inch layer of sand shall be required

Section R506.2.4 is amended to add the following sentence to the end of
the section:

Al reinforcing in slab floor shall be positioned above the center of the slab.



21. Table R602.10.1.3(3) is amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.1.3(3)*
b.c

BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN
CATEGORY (AS A FUNCTION OF BRACED WALL LINE LENGTH)

SOIL CLASS D*
WALL HEIGHT =16 FT
10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (feet) OF
15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEADLOAD |  BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED ALONG
BRACED W - EACHBRACED WALL LINE
' Method LIB,
Seismic Design DWB, SFB,
Category Braced Wall |PBS,and  [Methods® GB {Method Continuous
(SDC) Story Location |Line Length . |HPS and PCP WSP® Sheathi_nge
_ _ 10 . NP . 8.0 25 2.1
A 20 NP 6.0 . 5.0 43
VAN E 30 NP ~ 240 7.5 6.4
[ | 40 NP 32.0 10.0_ 8.5
. 50 NP 40.0 12.5 - 10.6
SDCD: ﬁ 10 NP NP 55 47
20 NP NP 11.0 9.4
ﬁ £ 30 NP NP 76.5 4.0
40 NP NP 22.0 18.7
50 NP NP 27.5 235

a. Wall bracing lengths are based on a soii site class "D." Interpolation of bracing length between the
Sd., values associated with the seismic design categories shall be permitted when a site-specific Sds
value is determined In accordance with Section 16.

b. Foundation cripple wall panels shall be braced In accordance with Sectien R602.10.9

&. Methods of bracing shall be as descrlbed in Sections R802.1 0.2, R602.1 0.4 and R602.1 0.5 d. Methods GB and PCP braced
wall panel h/w ratio shall not exceed 1:1.

d. Wood Structural Panel shall have a minimum thickness in SDC D, of 15/32", and shall not be attached
using staples.

22. Table R603.2.3(2) footnote b is amended to read as follows:

Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16 inch on diameter
except as noted. Use of staples in roof, fioor, subfloor, and braced wall
panels shall be prohibited for structures located in Seismic Design
Category DO, D1, D2, and E.

23.  The first sentence of Section R802.8 is amended to read as follows:
Roof framing members and ceiling joists having a depth-to-thickness ratio

exceeding 2 to 1, based on nominal dimensions, shall be provided with
lateral support at points of bearing to prevent rotation.

A13-00258 7



24. Section R805.2 is added to read as follows:

R805.2 Suspended ceilings. Suspended acoustical ceilings shall be
designed in accordance with ASCE-7-10 Section 13.5.6.

25. Section R902.1 is amended to read as follows:

R902.1 Roof Covering Materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as
set forth in Sections R904 and R905. A minimum Class B roofing shall be
installed. Roofing shall be listed and tested in accordance with UL 790 or
ASTM E 108.

The “Exceptions” of this section remain as contained in the State Code.
26. Section R902.1.2 is re-titled to “Roof Coverings in Other Areas.”
27. Section R902.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

R902.1.3 Additions to Existing Buildings. In any 12 month period,
additions of less than 26% of the existing roof area may be of Class B
materials that match the existing roof. Additions in high fire hazard areas
must meet the current high fire hazard area roofing requirements in
addition to this section.

28. Section R902.2 is amended to read as follows:

R902.2 Wood Shingles and Shakes. No wooden shakes or shingies,
treated or untreated, shall be used for roof covering unless specifically
allowed in Sections R902.1.1, R902.1.2, or R902.1.3 of this code.

SECTION 3: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT. The City Council
determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the California
Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources Code §§ 21000, et seq.,
"CEQA") and the regulations promulgated thereunder (14 California Code of
Regulations §§ 15000, et seq., the "State CEQA Guidelines") because it consists only of
minor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related regulations
and specification of procedures related thereto and will not have the effect of deleting or
substantially changing any regulatory standards or findings required therefor. This
ordinance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the
environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the
environment.

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city
ordinance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeiture, or liability incurred before, or
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, the
effective date of this Ordinance. Any such repealed part will remain in full force and

A13-00258 8



effect for sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date
of this Ordinance.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY. if any part of this Ordinance is deemed invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, the City Council intends that such decision wili not affect the

validity of the remaining portions cf this Ordinance and, to this end, the provisions of this
Ordinance are severable.

SECTION 6: VALIDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. if this entire Ordinance is
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such action will
render this Ordinance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previously in effect prior
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in full force and effect for all purposes.

mn _
SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance will take effect on the 31% day
following its final passage and adoption or January 1, 2014 whichever is later.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _8 ~day of December _ , 2013.

A (/¢%\~

Cheryl Heifgfiann
Mayor

ATTEST:

(ogien M g,

Cinthia M. Rodriguez, MMC'
City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Ariel Pierre Calonne
City Attorney

A13-00258 9



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF VENTURA ) ss
CITY OF SAN BUENAVENTURA )

|, ROXANNE FIORILLO, Deputy City Clerk of the City of San Buenaventura,
California, certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed and adopted by the

City Council of the City of San Buenaventura at a regular meeting on December
9, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Morehouse, Weir, Tracy, Andrews,
Monahan, Deputy Mayor Nasarenko, and Mayor Heitmann.
NOES: None.

ABSENT: None.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and affixed the seal of the City of
San Buenaventura on December 10, 2013.

Deputy City Clerk




