COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX

AGENCY: DIVISION of the STATE ARCHITECT — STRUCTURAL SAFETY [DSASS 05/09]

TITLE (CODE)
CCR, TITLE 24, PART 11 (2010 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING CODE)

LEGEND:

Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s

(CAC)s:

ACCESS = Accessihility
BFO = Building, Fire & Other
HF = Health Facilities

PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces

GB = Green Building

GB CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE

Actions:

A = Accepted

AA = Approve as amended
AS = Approve as submitted
D = Disapprove

FS =Further Study

WI/D = Withdrawn by agency

Amendments, if indicated by agency:

S = Statutory
N = New
E = Existing

Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):

GREEN = uncontested items
YELLOW = challenged items

SALMON = W/D, no action required

(NOTE: Chapter titles shown shaded are adopted in common by the agencies and may be considered for action together by the committee)

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION
Adopt amendments listed below

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- ERES Response 45-Day Comments . GEHON
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-1 101 E AS, FS “Further study” by the committee means
recommendation to modify for 45-day.
Coordinate with BSC
DSASS 5/09-2 102 E AS Coordinate with BSC
DSASS 5/09-3 105 E AS
CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt amendments listed below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
. amend- S Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-4 202 N AS CAC: Coordinate all definitions with BSC
AUTOMATIC
DSASS 05/09 1of16

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

January 12 & 13, 2010




CONBIHONED
FLOOR-AREA

DSASS 5/09-5

202
BUILDING
ENVELOPE
CONBIHONED
SPACE;
DIRECTLY

AS

DSASS 5/09-6

202
CALIFORNIA
BUILDING
CODE
CONBIHONED
SPACE;
INPIREGTLY

AS

DSASS 5/09-7

202
CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL
CODE
BISPOSAL

AS

DSASS 5/09-8

202
CALIFORNIA
ENERGY
CODE
BRA/ERSION

AS

DSASS 5/09-9

202
CALIFORNIA
MECHANI-
CAL CODE
EXFHTFRAHON

AS

DSASS 5/09-10

202
CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING
CODE
HAZARBOUS
WASTE

AS

DSASS 5/09-11

202 CONDI-
TIONED
SPACEINERT
SOHDBSOR
INERT
WASTE

AS

DSASS 5/09-12

202 COOLING

AS

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

20f 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




EQUIPMENT
PROCESS
SPACE

DSASS 5/09-13

202 ENERGY
COMMISSION
REGYCLEOR
REGYCGHING

AS

DSASS 5/09-14

202
ENFORCING
AGENCY RE-
USE

AS

DSASS 5/09-15

202 GREEN
BUILDING
SOLIB
WASTE

AS

DSASS 5/09-16A

202
INFILTRA-
TION

DSASS 5/09-16B

202 KITCHEN

DSASS 5/09-16C

202 LOW-RISE
RESIDENTIAL
BUILDING

DSASS 5/09-16D

202
OUTDOOR
AIR

DSASS 5/09-16E

202
RESIDENTIAL
BUILDING

DSASS 5/09-16F

202
RESILIENT
FLOORING

DSASS 5/09-16G

202 VAPOR
BARRIER

CHAPTER 3 GREEN BUILDING
Adopt amendments listed below

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

30f 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




CBSC

Typeof | cpc, | Agency Action
[tem Number Code Section amgg?- (ADS,FéA, Rf;%%é € 452:5;&%”8?1:8”;5 Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) . FS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-16 | 301.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-17 | 303 2.1 N FS D CAC: Tiers — coordinate with other agencies
DSASS 5/09-18 | 303.1 N
DSASS 5/09-19 | 303.1.1 N
DSASS 5/09-19A | 304.1 FS D DSA has removed tiers from its proposal
DSASS 5/09-19B | 304.1.1 FS D DSA has removed tiers from its proposal
CHAPTER 5 NON RESIDENTIAL MANDATORY MEASURES
DIVISION 5.1 PLANNING AND DESIGN
Adopt amendments listed below
Type of CAC: Agency AC;SoCn
ltem Number Code Section IS (AS, AA, S DS Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-20 | 5.101 N AS
DSASS 5/09-21 | 5.102 CUTOFF N AS
LUMINAIRES
DSASS 5/09-21A | 5.102 LOW-
EMITTING &
FUEL
EFFICIENT
VEHICLES
DSASS 5/09-21B | 5.102
NEIGHBOR-
HOOD
ELECTRIC
VEHICLES
DSASS 5/09-21C| 5.102 PZEV
DSASS 5/09-21D | 5.102 TENANT
OCCUPANTS
DSASS 5/09-21E | 5.102
VANPOOL
VEHICLE
DSASS 5/09-21F | 5.102 ZEV

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

4 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




DSASS 5/09-22 | 5-106-4 N William Orr, CHPS Moved to Appendix as voluntary
Recommends: AA
DSASS 5/09-23 | 5-1064-% N FS CAC: Coordinate with BSC, typ.
DSASS 5/09-24 | 510642 N FS
DSASS 5/09-25 | 510643 N FS
DSASS 5/09-26 | Fable5:-10643 N FS
DSASS 5/09-27 | 518651 N AS Moved to Appendix as voluntary
DSASS 5/09-28 | Fable5:-106.5-1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-29 | 5.106.9 8 N AS Shown as 5.106.10 in DSA checklist
DSASS 5/09-30 | 5.106.42 10 N AS BSC deleted due to redundancy in CBC
DSASS 5/09-31 | 510613 N AS
DIVISION 5.2 ENERGY EFFICIENCY
Adopt amendments listed below
e gf CAC: ROy AC\thlso?l
. amend- ’ Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,F,;A, t0 CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-32 | 5.201.1 N AA CAC: Coordinate with BSC and HCD
DSASS 5/09-33 | 5-204-4 N AA Coordinate with BSC; sectioné& subsections
were adopted by BSC in Division 5.4
DSASS 5/09-34 | 5:204-4-1 N FS
DSASS 5/09-35 | 5:204-4:2 N FS
DSASS 5/09-36 | 5:204-43 N FS
DSASS 5/09-37 | 5:2064-45 N FS
DSASS 5/09-38 | 5:204-4-5:1 N FS
DSASS 5/09-39 | 5:2064-4-5:2 N FS
DSASS 5/09-40 | 5:2064-4-6 N FS
DIVISION 5.3 WATER EFFICIENCY AND CNSERVATION
Adopt amendments listed below
Type of ) Agency CB.SC
amend- GAE) Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,Fé,)A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-40A | 5.302.1
GRAYWATER
DSASS 05/09 5o0f 16 January 12 & 13, 2010

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code



DSASS 5/09-40B

5.302.1
MODEL
WATER
EFFICIENT
LANDSCAPE
ORDINANCE

DSASS 5/09-41

5.302.1
POTABLE
WATER

AS

DSASS 5/09-42

5.302.1
RECYCLED
WATER

AS

DSASS 5/09-43

5.302.1
SUBMETER

AS

DSASS 5/09-43A

5.302.1
WATER
BUDGET

DSASS 5/09-46

5.303.2

AS

DSASS 5/09-47

Table 5.303.1

AS

DSASS 5/09-48

Table 5.303.2

AS

DSASS 5/09-49

5.303.4

AS

DSASS 5/09-50

5.303.6, Items
1-5only

22222

AS

DIVISION 5.4 MATERIAL CONSERVATION AND RESOURCE EFFICIENCY
Adopt amendments listed below

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- e Response 45-Day Comments . Action
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,FgA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) . FS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-51 | 5.401.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-51A | 5.402.1
ADJUST
DSASS 5/09-51B | 5.402.1 -
BALANCE
DSASS 5/09-51C | 5.402.1 TEST
DSASS 5/09-51D | 5.407.1
DSASS 5/09-52 | 5.407.2.1 N AA Coordinate with BSC
DSASS 5/09-53 | 5.407.2.2 N AA Coordinate with BSC

DSASS 05/09
Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

6 of 16 January 12 & 13, 2010



DSASS 5/09-54 | 5.408.1 N
DSASS 5/09-55 | 5.408.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-56 | 5.408.2.1 N AA
DSASS 5/09-57 | 5.408.2.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-59 | 5.410.1 AS
DIVISION 5.5 ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY
Adopt amendments listed below
Type of CAC: Agency XB.SC
: ction
[tem Number Code Section el (AS, AA, Response DSl Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-60 | 5.501.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-61 | 5.502.1 N AS
COMPOSITE
WOOD
PRODUCTS
DSASS 5/09-61A | 5.502.1 MERV
DSASS 5/09-61B | 5.502.1
MAXIMUM
INCREMEN-
TAL
REACTIVITY
DSASS 5/09-61C | 5.502.1
PRODUCT-
WEIGHTED
MIR
DSASS 5/09-61D | 5.502.1
REACTIVE
ORGANIC
COMPOUND
DSASS 5/09-62 | 5.502.1 VOC N AS
DSASS 5/09-64 | 5:504:2 N FS A CAC: Coordinate with BSC. DSA moved it to
the Appendix.
DSASS 5/09-65 | 5.504.3 N AS
DSASS 5/09-69 | 5.504.4.3.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-70 | 5.504.4.3.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-71A | 5.504.4.4.1
DSASS 5/09-72 | 5.504.4.4.2 N AS

DSASS 05/09
Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

7 of 16 January 12 & 13, 2010



DSASS 5/09-72B | Table 5.504.4.5
DSASS 5/09-73 | 5.504.5.3 N AS
DSASS 5/09-74 | 5.504.6.1 N AS CAC: To be coordinated with other agencies.
DSA moved this to “Outdoor Air Quality”
DSASS 5/09-76 | 5.505.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-77 | 5.506.1 N FS
DSASS 5/09-78 | 5.507.5 N AS DSA moved to Appendix, revised per CHPS
DSASS 5/09-79 | 556451 N FS A
DSASS 5/09-79A| 5.508.1
DSASS 5/09-79B | 5.508.1.1
CHAPTER 6 REFERENCED ORGANIZATIONS AND STANDARDS
Adopt amendments listed below
T2 gf CAC: OBy PC\CBtISO(I?l
. amend- ’ Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,F,;A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-80 | 601.1 N AS CAC: To be coordinated with other agencies
CHAPTER 7 INSTALLER AND THIRD PARTY QUALIFICATIONS
Adopt amendments listed below
CBSC
e ] CAC: MBI Action
[tem Number Code Section B (AS, AA, NEETEIIED LY COE T Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-81 | 701 N -
DSASS 5/09-82 | 702.1 N -
DSASS 5/09-83 | 703.1 N -

CHAPTER 8 COMPLIANCE FORMS AND WORKSHEETS
Adopt amendments listed below

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

8 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




CBSC
Type ol | cac: | Agency 45.Day Comment Action
. amend- esponse -Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,Fé,)A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-84 | Worksheet N AS CAC: To be coordinated with other agencies
(WS-1)
DSASS 5/09-85 | Worksheet N AS
(WS-2)
DSASS 5/09-86 | Construction N AS
Waste
Management
(CWM) Plan
DSASS 5/09-87 | Construction N AS
Waste
Management
(CWM)
Worksheet
DSASS 5/09-88 | Construction N AS
Waste
Management
(CWM)
Acknowledgme
nt
APPENDIX A5 NONRESIDENTIAL VOLUNTARY MEASURES
DIVISION A5.1 SITE PLANNING AND DESIGN
Adopt amendments listed below
[tem Number Code Section angg- (ADS,FéA, Rf:%%é € 45(:6?;)’&?”&”;8“)5 Annotations ,&SD
SEN | 2F) | (A D wp) FS)
DSASS 5/09-88A | A5.101.1
DSASS 5/09-88B | A5.102.1
ALBEDO
DSASS 5/09-88C | A5.102.1
BIORETEN-
TION
DSASS 5/09-88D | A5.102.1

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

9 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




BROWNFIELD
SITE

DSASS 5/09-88E

A5.102.1
DEVELOP-
MENT
FOOTPRINT

DSASS 5/09-88F

A5.102.1
GREENFIELD
S

DSASS 5/09-88G

A5.102.1
GREYFIELD
SITE

DSASS 5/09-88H

A5.102.1
FLOOR AREA
RATIO

DSASS 5/09-88l

A5.102.1
INFILL SITE

DSASS 5/09-88J

A5.102.1 LOW
IMPACT
DEVELOP-
MENT

DSASS 5/09-88K

A5.102.1
LOW-
EMITTING &
FUEL
EFFICIENT
VEHICLES

DSASS 5/09-88L

A5.102.1
NEIGHBOR-
HOOD
ELECTRIC
VEHICLES

DSASS 5/09-88M

A5.102.1 PZEV

DSASS 5/09-88N

A5.102.1
VANPOOL
VEHICLE

DSASS 5/09-880

A5.102.1 ZEV

DSASS 5/09-88P

A5.106.4

DSASS 5/09-88Q

A5.106.4.1

DSASS 5/09-88R

A5.106.4.2

DSASS 5/09-88S

A5.106.4.3

DSASS 5/09-88T

Table

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

10 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




A5.106.4.3

DSASS 5/09-88U

A5.106.5.1

DSASS 5/09-88V

Table
A5.106.5.1.1

DSASS 5/09-88W

A5.106.5.1.3

DSASS 5/09-88X

A5.106.5.1.4

DSASS 5/09-88Y

A5.106.5.3

DSASS 5/09-88Z

A5.106.5.3.1

DSASS 5/09-88AA

Table
A5.106.5.3.1

DSASS 5/09-88BB

A5.106.6

DSASS 5/09-88CC

A5.106.6.1

DSASS 5/09-89

A5.106.7.%,
Hem-2-only

FS

CAC: Coordinate with BSC

DSASS 5/09-89A

A5.106.9

DSASS 5/09-90

Ab.106.11;
Hems1—5

FS

Language, solar

DSASS 5/09-90A

A5.106.11.1

DSASS 5/09-90B

A5.106.11.2

DSASS 5/09-90C

Table
A5.106.11.2.1

DIVISION A5.2 ENERGY EFFICIENCY

Adopt amendments listed below

[tem Number

Code Section

Type of
amend-
ment
(S,E,N)

CAC:
(AS, AA,
D, FS)

Agency
Response
to CAC
(A, D, WID)

45-Day Comments
(AS, AA, D, FS)

CBSC
Action
Annotations (AS,
AA, D,
FS)

DSASS 5/09-91

A5.201.1

To be coordinated with other agencies

DSASS 5/09-92

A5.202.1
ENERGY
STAR

DSASS 5/09-92A

A5.202.1
DEMAND
RESPONSE
AUTOMA-
TION
INTERNET
SOFTWARE

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

11 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




CLIENT
DSASS 5/09-92B | A5.202.1
GEOTHER-
MAL
DSASS 5/09-93 A5.202.1 N FS
GRID
NEUTRAL
DSASS 5/09-93A | A5.202.1
OVERCUR-
RENT
PROTECTIO
N DEVICE
RATING
DSASS 5/09-93B | A5.202.1
PROCESS
DSASS 5/09-93C | A5.202.1
TIME
DEPENDENT
VALUATION
(TDV)
ENERGY
DSASS 5/09-93D | A5.203.1
DSASS 5/09-94 Ab.203.1.1 N FS Coordinate with BSC
DSASS 5/09-95 A5.203.1.2 N FS
DSASS 5/09-96 | A5:20313 N - No language proposed for this Section #.
DSASS 5/09-97 A5.204.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-98 A5.204.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-99 Ab:204.5:1 N FS Coordinate with BSC, which moved §
DSASS 5/09-100 | A5204-5:2; N FS Coordinate with BSC, which moved §
Hem-Lonly
DSASS 5/09-101 | A5.211.1 N FS Coordinate §A5.211 with BSC, no CAC action
DSASS 5/09-102 | A5.211.1.1 N
DSASS 5/09-103 | A5.211.21.1 N AA CAC: Move the definition to a definition §
DSASS 5/09-103A | A5.211.21.2
DSASS 5/09-104 | A5.211.2.1 N
DSASS 5/09-105 | A5.211.2.2 N
DSASS 5/09-106 | A5.211.2.3 N
DSASS 5/09-107 | A5.211.3 N
DSASS 5/09-108 | A5.211.4 N
DSASS 5/09-109 | A5.211.4.1 N
DSASS 05/09 12 of 16 January 12 & 13, 2010

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code



| DSASS 5/09-110 | A5.212.1

DIVISION A5.3 WATER EFFICIENCY AND CONSERVATION
Adopt amendments listed below

1-4

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments geny
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, b y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
DSASS 5/09-111A | A5.301.1
DSASS 5/09-111B | A5.302.1
HYDROZONE
DSASS 5/09-111C | A5.302.1
MODEL
WATER
EFFICIENT
LANDSCAPE
ORDINANCE
DSASS 5/09-111D | A5.302.1
PLANTS
DSASS 5/09-111E | A5.302.1
POTABLE
WATER
DSASS 5/09-111F | A5.302.1
RECYCLED
WATER
DSASS 5/09-111G| A5.302.1
SUBMETER
DSASS 5/09-111H| A5.303.2.1
DSASS 5/09-1111 | Table
A5.303.2.1
DSASS 5/09-111J | Table
A5.303.2.2
DSASS 5/09-112 | A5.303.3, Items N AS CAC: Coordinate with BSC

DSASS 5/09-112A

A5.304.1

DIVISION A5.4 MATERIAL CONSERVATION AND RESOURCE EFFICIENCY
Adopt amendments listed below

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

13 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




CBSC

T f Agen .
. ar>1/1pe?18- S RegSoﬁge 45-Day Comments . AEE
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
SEN | D (A, D, WID) FS)
DSASS 5/09-113A | A5.401.1
DSASS 5/09-113B | A5.402.1
BUILDING
COMMIS-
SIONING
DSASS 5/09-113C | A5.402.1
EMBODIED
ENERGY
DSASS 5/09-114 | A5.402.1 LIFE N AS CAC: Coordinate chapter with BSC
CYCLE
ASSESSMENT
DSASS 5/09-115 | A5.402.1 OVE N AS
DSASS 5/09-115A | A5.402.1
POST-
CONSUMER
CONTENT
DSASS 5/09-115B | A5.402.1 PRE-
CONSUMER
CONTENT
DSASS 5/09-116 | A5.402.1 N AS
RECYCLED
CONTENT
DSASS 5/09-117 | A5.402.1 N AS
RECYCLED
CONTENT
VALUE (RCV)
DSASS 5/09-118 | A5.404.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-118A | A5.404.1.1
DSASS 5/09-118B | A5.404.1.2
DSASS 5/09-120 | A5.405.4 N AS
DSASS 5/09-120A | A5.405.4.2
DSASS 5/09-121 | A5.406.1.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-122 | A5.406.1.3 N AS
DSASS 5/09-123 | A5.409.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-123A | A5.410.2
DSASS 5/09-123B | A5.410.2.1

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

14 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




DSASS 5/09-123C

A5.410.2.2

DSASS 5/09-123D

A5.410.2.3

DSASS 5/09-123E

A5.410.2.4

DSASS 5/09-123F

A5.410.2.5

DSASS 5/09-123G

A5410.25.1

DSASS 5/09-123H

A5.410.2.5.2

DSASS 5/09-123|

A5.410.2.6

DSASS 5/09-123]

A5.410.3

DSASS 5/09-123K

A5.410.3.2

DSASS 5/09-123L

A5.410.3.3

DSASS 5/09-123M

A5410.3.3.1

DSASS 5/09-123N

A5.410.3.4

DSASS 5/09-1230

A5.410.3.5

DIVISION A5.5 ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY
Adopt amendments listed below

[tem Number

Code Section

Type of
amend-
ment
(S, E, N)

Agency
Response
to CAC
(A, D, WID)

45-Day Comments
(AS, AA, D, FS)

Annotations

CBSC
Action
(AS,
AA, D,
FS)

DSASS 5/09-123P

A5501.1

DSASS 5/09-123Q

A5.502.1
INTERIOR,
BUILDING

DSASS 5/09-123R

A5.502.1
MERV

DSASS 5/09-124

A5.502.1
MULTI-
OCCUPANT
SPACES

New definitions regarding formaldehyde to be
coordinated with other agencies.

DSASS 5/09-124A

A5.502.1 NO
ADDED

FORMALDE-

HYDE (NAF)
RESIN

DSASS 5/09-125

A5.502.1
SINGLE
OCCUPANT
SPACES

AS

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

15 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




DSASS 5/09-125A | A5.502.1
ULTRA-LOW
EMITTING
FORMALDE-
HYDE (ULEF)
RESINS
DSASS 5/09-126 | Not used N AS
DSASS 5/09-127 | A5.504.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-128 | A5.504.1.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-129 | A5.504.1.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-129A | A5.504.2
DSASS 5/09-130 | A5.504.4.5.1 N AA
DSASS 5/09-131 | A5.504.467 N AA CAC: Update CHPS materials list, typical
DSASS 5/09-133 | A5.504.5.1 N AS Coordinate §§ with BSC
DSASS 5/09-134 | A5.504.5.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-134A | A5.504.5.3.1
DSASS 5/09-135 | A5.507.1.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-136 | A5.507.1.1.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-137 | A5.507.1.1.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-138 | A5.507.1.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-139 | A5.507.32 N AS
DSASS 5/09-140 | A5.507.43 N AS
DSASS 5/09-141 | A5.507.43.1 N AS
DSASS 5/09-142 | A5.507.43.2 N AS
DSASS 5/09-143 | A5.507.5 N AA DSA adoption differs from CBSC
DSASS 5/09-144 | A55045 N This § appears duplicated in the checklist

DSASS 05/09

Commission Action Matrix — Green
Amend 2010 Green Building Code

16 of 16

January 12 & 13, 2010




