COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX - YELLOW

AGENCY: THE DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT [DSA-AC 01/12]

TITLE (CODE)

CCR, TITLE 24, PT 2, CH 11B (2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE)

LEGEND:

Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s

(CAC)s:
ACCESS = Accessibility
BFO = Building, Fire & Other
HF = Health Facilities
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces
GB = Green Building

ACCESS CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE (DSA-AC)

Actions:
A = Accepted
AA = Approve as amended
AS = Approve as submitted
D = Disapprove
FS =Further Study
WI/D = Withdrawn by agency

Amendments, if indicated by agency:
E=Existing
S = Statutory
N = New
Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):
GREEN = uncontested items
YELLOW = challenged items
SALMON = W/D, no action required

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOL. 1, CHAPTER 11B — ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS PUBLIC ACCOMMODATIONS, COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS AND

PUBLICLY FUNDED HOUSING

CHAPTER 1-DIVISION | & Il, CALIFORNIA SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

CBSC
220 CAC: BT Action
Item Number Code Section | 2mend- (AS, AA, NEETEIIED D COEs Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
DSA-AC 01/12-7 1.9.1.3 E AS A Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommended Approve as Amended | See DSA's FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12-8 A
CHAPTER 2-DEFINITIONS
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
Ty?e
0 CBSC
ame GGy R':g egﬁ)s/e 45-Day Comments Ao
[tem Number Code Section nd- | (AS, AA, o F(): AC (AS yA A, D, FS) Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) e AA D,
(S, E. (A, D, W/D) FS)
N)
TOPIC 2.1 DEFINITIONS
Section 202
DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW Page 1 of 10 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B




DSA-AC 01/12-38 Assembly area E/N Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12-110 | Mezzanine N Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12-122 | Path of travel E/N Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Communities
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-144 | Public housing N Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommended Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-170 | Site-development E Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-182 | Structural frame E/N Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12-185 | Technically infeasible EIN Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
(2" paragraph only) Recommends Approve as Amended | See DSA’s FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12- Guy-Wires Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
306.1 Item added Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW Page 2 of 10 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B



CHAPTER 11B-DIVISION | - APPLICATION AND ADMINISTRATION
Adopt Chapter with Amendedments as listed below

Recommends Disapprove

See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

CBSC
Type of ) Agency .
d- s Response 45-Day Comments &EH0N
[tem Number Code Section | 2MeN (AS, AA, y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 11B.2
DSA-AC 01/12-281 | 11B-106.5 E/N AS A Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
DSA-AC 01/12-287 | 11B-202.3 E FS A Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Approve as Amend See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-202.4 Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this
289.1 Item added Recommended Approve as Amended | comment. See DSA's FSOR for explanation.
for 45Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-203.2 E AS Martin Cooper City of Foster City DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
289.1 Construction Sites Recommended Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
Item added for 45
Day
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-203.10-11B- E AS A Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
292.1 Item added 203.14 Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-298 | 11B-206.2.5 E AA A Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Disapprove See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-300 | 11B-206.2.8 E FS A Richard Traversi CDCR DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-301 | 11B-206.3 E AS A Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.

DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 3 of 10

January 8, 2013




Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR

Recommends Disapprove

Access Compliance Consultants
Recommend Approve as Amended

DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-208.3.1 Brian Moffitt DSA commented on this item. See DSA’'s FSOR for
320.1 Schools Insurance Authority explanation
[tem added for 45 Recommend Approve as Amended
Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12-332 | 11B-213.2 AS Richard Traversi CDCR DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01-12- 11B-213.2.1 AS Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & Agency modified this item per public comment and
332.1 Inspection Services for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
[tem added for 45 Recommend Approve as Amended comments received during 15 Day
Day comment Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-343 | 11B-216.2 AS Roger Fish SF University DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Recommended Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-363 | 11B-219.2 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Recommends Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-224.3 AS Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
398.1 Inspection Services See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
[tem added for 45 Recommend Approve as Amended
Day comment Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-226.3 AS Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
404.1 ltem added Recommends Disapprove See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-233.3.1.2 FS Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
417.1 ltem Added Recommended Approve as Amended | See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for 45Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-247.1.2.4 Gail Farber County of LA DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
441.2 Recommend Disapprove See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Item added for 45 Sree Kumar, County of LA
Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-247.1.2.5 Brian Moffitt DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
441.3 Schools Insurance Authority See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation.
[tem added for 45 Recommend Approve as Amended
Day comment Eric McSwain

DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 4 of 10

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-465 | 11B-404.2.9 FS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommends Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

DSA-AC 01/12-474 | 11B-405.7.2.1 AS Gail Farber & Sree Kumar County of | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.

LA See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

Recommend Disapprove

DSA-AC 01/12-475 | 11B-405.7.3.1 AS Gail Farber & Sree Kumar County of | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.

LA See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

Recommend Disapprove

DSA-AC 01/12-476 | 11B-405.7.4 FS Gail Farber & Sree Kumar County of | DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.

LA See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.2.2 AS Murali Pasumarthis
485.2 County of San Diego
Item added for 45 Recommend Further Study
Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12-477 | Figure 11B- AS
406.2.2
DSA-AC 01/12-478 | 11B-406.3 thru AS
11B-406.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12 11B-406.3.2 AS Murali Pasumarthis DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
487.1 County of San Diego See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
[tem added for 45 Recommend Further Study
Day comment Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine
Recommend Approve as Amended

DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.5.3 AS Christophe Schneiter P.E., DSA modified this item due to public comment and
489.1 Landings City of Santa Cruz; for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
[tem added for 45 Recommend Disapprove comments received during 15 Day.
Day comment Michael Penrose, Sacramento

County, Dept. of Transportation;
Recommend Disapprove
Matt Carpenter, SACOG;
Recommend Disapprove
Jose Luis Caceres, SACOG;
Recommend Disapprove
Murali Pasumarthis
County of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Further Study
Alexandra Warner
City of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Norm Hughes, City of Freemont
Recommends Approve as Amended
Terry Abbott CDorT
Recommend Disapprove
Edric Doringo Cit of SD

DSA is not proposing other modifications for this
item. See DSA's FSOR for explanation

DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 5 of 10

January 8, 2013




Recommended Further Study
DSA-AC 01/12 11B-406.5.10 AS Murali Pasumarthis DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
493.1 County of San Diego See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Item add for 45 Day Recommend Further Study
comment Alexandra Warner
City of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Edric Doringo Cit of SD
Recommended Further Study
DSA-AC 01/12-494 | Figure 406.6 AS Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine
11B-406.5.10 Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-495 | 11B-406.5.11 thru AS Alexandra Warner DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
11B-406.6 City of San Diego See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Recommend Further Study
DSA-AC 01/12-506 | 11B-407.2.3.1 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-508 | 11B-407.2.3.2 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-520 | 11B-407.4.7.1.1 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-524 | 11B-407.4.9 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-525 | 11B-407.4.10 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-409.2 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
532.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for 45 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-409.4.6 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
534.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for 45 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-409.4.7 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
534.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for 45 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12-537 | 11B-410.8 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-541 | 11B-502.3.3 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-542 | Figure 11B- AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
502.3.3 Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW Page 6 of 10 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B



DSA-AC 01/12-548 | 11B-502.6.3 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing modifications for this item.
Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-561 | 11B-503.3.3 AS Brian Moffitt DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Schools Insurance Authority See DSA's FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-564 | 11B-504.3 AS 15-Day comment: DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Janis Kent Stepping Thru posted 15Day language; no comments received
Accessibility during 15 Day
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-502.6 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
572.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
for Comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-502.10 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
572.2 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
for Comment
DSA-AC 01/12-577 | 11B-603.5 AS Brian Moffitt DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Schools Insurance Authority See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-604.2 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
577.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA's FSOR for explanation
for 45 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-604.3.2 AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
578.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
for comment
DSA-AC 01/12-579 | Figure 11B- AS Mark Wood, CASp DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
604.3.1 Recommend Approve as Amended See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-598 | Table 11B-604.9 AS Brian Moffitt DSA commented on this item. See DSA’s FSOR for
Schools Insurance Authority explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-606 | 11B-608.2.1 AS Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Inspection Services See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-612 | 11B-608.3.1 AS Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Inspection Services See DSA's FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-618 | 11B-608.5.1 AS Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Inspection Services See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
Jay Hyde, SCABO
DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW Page 7 of 10 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B



Recommend Approve as Amended

Recommend Approve as Amended
Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp
Recommended Approve as Amended

15Day Comment:
Eugene Lozano, CCB

DSA-AC 01/12-628 | 11B-609.3 AS Michael Mankin DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
Recommends Approve as Amended | item. See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-703.5.1 Eugene Lozano, CCB
643.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended
for 45Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12-662 | 11B-705.1 AS Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
Recommend Further Study item. See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-664 | #05-3:% 11B- AS Pat Merriman, Masons Supply
705.1.1.1 Company
Dome Size Recommend Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-665 | 70512 11B- FSIST Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
705.1.1.2 Recommended Disapprove posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day
Eugene Lozano, CCB
Recommend Approve as Amended DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
item. See DSA's FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-668 | #05:14:3 11B- FS/IST 15Day Comment: DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
705.1.1.3 Sharon Toji Access Communications | posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommend Approve as Amend during 15 Day
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Disapprove DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
Eugene Lozano, CCB item. See DSA's FSOR for explanation
Recommend Approve as Amended
Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp
Recommended Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-669 | 11B-705.1.1.4 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB
Recommend Approve as Amended
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Further Study
DSA-AC 01/12-670 | 11B-705.1.2 AS Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
Recommended Approve as Amended | item. See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12-671 | 11B-705.1.2.1 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA

posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day

DSA is not proposing further modifications for this
item. See DSA'’s FSOR for explanation

DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 8 of 10

January 8, 2013




Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-672 | 11B-705.1.2.2 AS Brian Moffitt DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Schools Insurance Authority posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommend Approve as Amended during 15 Day
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Disapprove DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
Eric McSwain See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
Access Compliance Consultants
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-705.1.2.3 - Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
673.1 Item added 11B-705.1.2.7 Recommended Disapprove
for 45 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12-679 | 11B-705.3 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB
Recommend Approve as Amended
Mark Wood, CASp
Recommends Approve as Amended | DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
See DSA’s FSOR for explanation
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-707.3 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA is not proposing further changes on this item.
681.1 Item added Recommend Approve as Amended | See DSA’'s FSOR for explanation
for 45 Day Mark Wood CASp
comment Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-689 | 11B-707.9.1.2 AS Eugene Lozano, CCB
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01-12- 11B-804 Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
696.1 Item added Recommended Approve as Amended | explanation.
for Comment
DSA-AC 01/12-707 | 11B-805.4.1 AA Eric McSwain DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
Access Compliance Consultants explanation.
Recommend Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-712 | 11B-805.7 AA Eric McSwain DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
Access Compliance Consultants explanation.
Recommend Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-806 AA Michael Mankin DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
712.1 ltem Added Recommends Approve as Amended | explanation.
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-809.4 Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
715.1 Item added Recommended Approve as Amended | explanation.
for comment
DSA-AC 01/12-725 | 11B-902.3 AS Michael Mankin DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
Recommends Approve as Amended | explanation.
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW Page 9 of 10 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B



Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended

DSA-AC 01/12-726

11B-902.4

AS

Michael Mankin
Recommends Approve as Amended
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended

Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended

DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
explanation.

DSA-AC 01/12-727

11B-902.4.1

AS

Michael Mankin
Recommends Approve as Amended
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended

Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended

DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
explanation.

DSA-AC 01/12-728

11B-902.4.2

AS

Michael Mankin
Recommends Approve as Amended
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended

Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended

DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
explanation.

DSA-AC 01-12-
731.1 Item added
for 45Day comment

11B-1003.2.2

Michael Mankin
Recommends Disapprove
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended

DSA commented on this item. See FSOR for full
explanation.

DSA-AC 01/12 - YELLOW
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 10 of 10

January 8, 2013




