COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX

AGENCY: DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT [HCD 03/12]

TITLE (CODE)
CCR. TITLE 24, PART 2.5 (2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE)

LEGEND:

Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s

(CAC)s:

ACCESS = Accessibility
BFO = Building, Fire & Other
HF = Health Facilities

PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces

GB = Green Building

BFO CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE

(HCD)

Actions:
A = Accepted
AA = Approve as amended
AS = Approve as submitted
D = Disapprove
FS =Further Study
W/D = Withdrawn by agency

ITEM 1 - CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND APPLICATION DIVISION | CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below

Amendments, if indicated by agency:

S = Statutory
N = New
Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):

GREEN = uncontested items
YELLOW = challenged items

SALMON = W/D, no action required

CBSC
U722 @) CAC: BT Action
Item Number Code Section AmEE- (AS, AA, MESTpEIES SR (ORI Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S.EN) ! (A, D, WID) FS)
HCD 03/12-1-1 111 E AS A Editorial
HCD 03/12-1-2 113 E AS A Amend Section
ITEM 2 - CHAPTER 1 DIVISION 1 SECTION 1.8.1
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
CBSC
Typeof | cpc. Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section IS (AS, AA, REsppEines R (AT Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) !
HCD 03/12-2-1 18.1 E AS A Amend Section
ITEM 3 - CHAPTER 1 DIVISION 1 SECTION 1.8.3.4
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
CBSC
VP2 @ CAC: Agency Action
Item Number Code Section AmEE- (AS, AA, MESTpEIES SR (ORI Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) :
HCD 03/12-3-1 1834 E AS A Amend Section
1844
HCD 03/12 - Final - GREEN Page 1 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix

Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




ITEM 4 - CHAPTER 1 SECTIONS R106.1, R106.1.1, R106.1.3 AND R106.2
Adopt these Sections without amendments.

CBSC
Typeof | oo | Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section IEE (AS, AA, REspls ey (EIIT I Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) !
HCD 03/12-4-1 R106.1 N AS A
HCD 03/12-4-2 R106.1.1 N AS A
HCD 03/12-4-3 R106.1.3 N AS A
HCD 03/12-4-4 R106.2 N AS A
ITEM5 - CHAPTER 1 SECTIONS R109.1
Adopt this Section with amendments listed below
CBSC
T2E e CAC: RIS Action
ltem Number Code Section AmEE- (AS, AA, MESTpEIES SR (ORI Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ’ (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 03/12-5-1 R109.1 N AS A Amend Section
ITEM 6 - CHAPTER 1 SECTIONS R109.1.3
Adopt this Section without amendments.
CBSC
Typeof | e, G Action
ltem Number Code Section dilleilt (AS, AA, REsponoe SoDaylComments Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) !
HCD 03/12-6-1 R109.1.3 N AS A
ITEM 7 - SECTION R109.1.4.1
Adopt this Section with amendments listed below
CBSC
T2 CAC: RIS Action
ltem Number Code Section - (AS, AA, RESIEDES RS ACSIICIE Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, W/D) Fé) :
HCD 03/12-7-1 R109.-141 E/N AS A Renumber and Amend Section
R109.14.2
HCD 03/12 - Final - GREEN Page 2 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix

Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




ITEM 8 - SECTION R109.1.6.2
Adopt Sections with amendments listed below

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- G- Response 45-Day Comments . A
[tem Number Code Section ment (AE)S,FAA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
SEN | 2FS) | (A D wib) FS)
HCD 03/12-8-1 R109.1.6 N AS A
HCD 03/12-8-2 R109.1.6.1 N AS A
HCD 03/12-8-3 R109.1.6.2 N AS A New Section
ITEM 9 — PART Il, CHAPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below
CBSC
ey CAC: (e Action
ltem Number Code Section CIEE, (AS, AA, RES OIS R R CRIICIE Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
HCD 03/12-9-1 R202 E AS A Amend Definition
ALTERATION
HCD 03/12-9-2 R202 N AS A Amend Definition Exceptions
APPROVED
HCD 03/12-9-3 COMMERICAL E AS A Remove Definition
BUILDING
HCD 03/12-9-4 CURTAIN-WALL E AS A Remove Definition
HCD 03/12-9-5 DEMAND E AS A Remove Definition
REGIRCULATIO
N-WATER
SYSTEM
HCD 03/12-9-6 EFFICIENCYTD N AS A Add Definition
WELLING UNIT
HCD 03/12-9-7 GRAY-WATER E AS A Remove Definition
HCD 03/12-9-8 GUARD OR N AS A Add Definition
GUARDRAIL
HCD 03/12-9-9 INSULATING E AS A Amend Definition
SHEATHING
HCD 03/12-9-10 LODGING E AS A Amend Definition
HOUSE
HCD 03/12-9-11 REPAIR E AS A Amend Definition
HCD 03/12-9-12 RISER E AS A Amend Definition
HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 3 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




HCD 03/12-9-13 SKYLIGHT E AS A Remove Definition
HCD 03/12-9-14 | SLEEPING UNIT E AS A Remove Definition
HCD 03/12-9-15 SUNROOM E AS A Amend Definition
HCD 03/12-9-16 | THIRD-PARTY E AS A Remove Definition
CERTIFICATION
AGENCY
HCD 03/12-9-17 THIRD-PARTY E AS A Remove Definition
CERFETIFIED
HCD 03/12-9-18 | THIRD-PARTY AS A Remove Definition
TESTED
HCD 03/12-9-19 VENTILATION E AS A Amend Definition
HCD 03/12-9-20 | WHOLEHOSUE E AS A Remove Definition
MECHANICAL
VENTLATION
SYSTEM

ITEM 10 — PART Ill, CHAPTER 3 - BUILDING PLANNING, EXCEPT R313
Adopt Chapter, Except R313, with amendments listed below

Type of CAC: Agency KB.SC
: ction
ltem Number Code Section IS (AS, AA, REsppeines R (AT Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
HCD 03/12-10-1 R300 N AS A New Section
HCD 03/12-10-2 R300.1 N AS A New Section
HCD 03/12-10-3 R300.2 N AS A New Section
HCD 03/12-10-4 | TABLE R302.1(1) E AS A Amend Table
HCD 03/12-10-5 | FABLER302:1(2) E AS A Remove Table
HCD 03/12-10-6 R302.5.1 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-10-7 R302.5.2 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-10-8 R303.1 E AS A Amend Exceptions
HCD 03/12-10-9 R303.3 E AS A Amend Exception
HCD 03/12-10-10 R303.3.1 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-10-11 R303.4 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-10-12 R303.5.2.1 N N/A WD HCD was withdrawn by the agency — No CAC
action was taken for this item.
HCD 03/12-10-13 R304.5 N AS A Add Section
HCD 03/12-10-14 R310.1 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-10-15 R313 E AS A HCD does not adopt section
HCD 03/12-10-16 R321.3 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 4 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




HCD 03/12-10-17 R324.1 N AS A Add Section

HCD 03/12-10-18 R324.1.1 N N/A W/D HCD was withdrawn by the agency — No CAC
action was taken for this item.

HCD 03/12-10-19 R330.1 N AS A Add Section

ITEM 11 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 4 — CONSTRUCTION WASTE REDUCTION DISPOSAL AND RECYCLING
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- G Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, WID) Fé) '
HCD 03/12-11-1 R401.4.1.1 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-11-2 R401.4.1.1.1 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-11-3 R401.4.1.1.2 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-11-4 R401.4.1.1.3 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-11-5 R401.4.1.1.4 N AS A Add Section
HCD 03/12-11-6 R401.4.1.1.5 N AS A Add Section
ITEM 12 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 5 - FLOORS
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- Gt Response 45-Day Comments . geich
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ‘ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
HCD 03/12-12-1 R506.2.3.1 N AS A Add Section
ITEM 13 - PART lll, CHAPTER 6 ~-WALL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below
CBSC
Type of . Agency >
. amend- G Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, WID) Fé) '
HCD 03/12-13-1 R602.3.4.1 N AS A Add Section
HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 5 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




ITEM 14 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 7 - WALL COVERINGS

Adopt Chapter without amendments

Type of T CBSC
EIERE | S Regpon)s/e 45-Day Comments Ao
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
(S.E. D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA. D,
N) (A, D, WID) FS)
HCD 03/12-14-1 | ENTIRE CHAPTER E AS A
ITEM 15 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 8 — ROOF-CEILING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below
Type of Agency CBSC
e Gt Response 45-Day Comments Al
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
(S, E. D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA. D,
N) (A, D, WID) FS)
HCD 03/12-15-1 R802.10.2 E AS A Amend Section
HCD 03/12-15-2 R806.2 E AS A Amend Section
ITEM 16 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 9 - ROOF ASSEMBLIES
Adopt Chapter without amendments
Type of Agenc CBSC
EE: G Responge 45-Day Comments AElE
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
(S,E. D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA, D,
N) (A, D, WID) FS)
HCD 03/12-16-1 | ENTIRE CHAPTER E AS A
ITEM 17 - PART Ill, CHAPTER 10 - CHIMNEYS AND FIREPLACES
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below
Type of T CBSC
e || G Regpon)s/e 45-Day Comments geton
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
(S.E. D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA. D,
N) (A, D, WID) FS)
HCD 03/12-17-1 R1004.1.1 E N/A W/D HCD was withdrawn by the agency — No CAC
action was taken for this item.
HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 6 of 9 November 1, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code




| HCD 03/12-17-2 | R1004-4 | E | AS | A |

| Remove Section

ITEM 18 - PART IV, CHAPTER 11 - ENERGY CONSERVATION
HCD proposes not to adopt Chapter 11

ITEM 19 - PART V MECHANICAL, CHAPTERS 12 - 23 - ENERGY CONSERVATION
HCD proposes not to adopt Chapters 12-23

ITEM 20 - PART VI FUEL GAS, CHAPTER 24
HCD proposes not to adopt Chapter 24

ITEM 21 - PART VII PLUMBING, CHAPTER 25
HCD proposes not to adopt Chapter 25

ITEM 22 - PART VIIl ELECTRICAL, CHAPTERS 34-43
HCD proposes not to adopt Chapters 34-43

ITEM 23 — PART IX, CHAPTER 44 — REFERENCE STANDARDS
Adopt Chapter with amendments listed below

Type of Agency CBSC
amend- L Response 45-Day Comments Action
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS)
(S, E, D, FS) (A, D, WD) AA, D,
N) $ FS)
HCD 03/12-23-1 ICC - IBC--12 E AS A Remove some references
HCD 03/12-23-2 ICC - IPC--12 E AS A Remove some references
HCD 03/12-23-3 ICC - IPSDC--12 E AS A Remove some references
HCD 03/12-23-4 | NFPA-720-09 12 E AS A Amend reference
HCD 03/12-23-5 UL - 2034-08 E AS A Amend reference
HCD 03/12-23-6 UL - 2075-04 E AS A Amend reference

ITEM 24 — APPENDIX A — SIZING AND CAPACITIES OF GAS PIPING
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix A

HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix

Adopt 2012 International Residential Code

Page 7 of 9

November 1, 2012




ITEM 25 — APPENDIX B - SIZING OF VENTING SYSTEMS SERVING APPLIANCES EQUIPPED WITH DRAFT HOODS, CATEGORY | APPLIANCES, AND APPLIANCES

LISTED FOR USE WITH TYPE B VENTS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix B

ITEM 26 — APPENDIX C — EXIT TERMINALS OF MECHANICAL DRAFT AND DIRECT-VENT SYSTEMS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix C

ITEM 27 — APPENDIX D - RECOMMENDED PROCEDURE FOR SAFETY INSPECTION OF AN EXISTING APPLIANCE INSTALLATION

HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix D

ITEM 28 — APPENDIX E - MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix E

ITEM 29 — APPENDIX F — RADON CONTROL METHODS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix F

ITEM 30 - APPENDIX G - SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix G

ITEM 31 - APPENDIX H — PATIO COVERS
Adopt Appendix H without amendments.

Type of Agenc CBSC
cmeme- | GA: Reg onge 45-Day Comments ety
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS)
(S, E, D, FS) (A, D, WD) AA, D,
N) ' FS)
HCD 03/12-31-1 | ENTIRE APPENDIX E AS A

ITEM 32 - APPENDIX | - PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix |

ITEM 33 — APPENDIX J - EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix J

ITEM 34 — APPENDIX K — SOUND TRANSMISSION
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix K

ITEM 35 - APPENDIX L - PERMIT FEES
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix L

HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 8 of 9
Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code

November 1, 2012




ITEM 36 — APPENDIX M — HOME DAYCARE - R-3 OCCUPANCY
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix M

ITEM 37 — APPENDIX N — VENTING METHODS
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix N

ITEM 38 — APPENDIX O - AUTOMATIC VEHICULAR GATES
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix O

ITEM 39 — APPENDIX P - SIZING OF WATER PIPING SYSTEM
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix P

ITEM 40 — APPENDIX Q - ICC INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ELECTRICAL PROVISIONS/NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE CROSS REFERENCE
HCD proposes not to adopt Appendix Q

HCD 03/12 — Final - GREEN Page 9 of 9 November 1, 2012
Commission Action Matrix
Adopt 2012 International Residential Code



