COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX
AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HEALTH PLANNING DEPARTMENT [OSHPD 04/12]

TITLE (CODE)
CCR. TITLE 24, PART 2 (2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE)

LEGEND:

Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s

(CAC)s:

ACCESS = Accessibility
BFO = Building, Fire & Other
HF = Health Facilities

PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces

GB = Green Building

HF CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE (OSHPD)

CHAPTER 1

SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

DIVISION |

CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION

Actions:

A = Accepted

AA = Approve as amended
AS = Approve as submitted
D = Disapprove

FS =Further Study

WI/D = Withdrawn by agency

Amendments, if indicated by agency:
S = Statutory
N = New
E = Existing

Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):

GREEN = uncontested items
YELLOW = challenged items
SALMON = W/D, no action required

Carry forward existing California Chapter 1, Division | of the 2010 California Building Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1, 2, 3 & 4 with the following modifications:

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- GGy Response 45-Day Comments . Hober
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E,N) ’ (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-1 Section 1.10.1.1 E AS A Add language as indicated in Express
(2)-OSHPD 1... Terms
OSHPD 4/12-2 1.10.1.2 E AS A Amend language as indicated in Express
Terms
OSHPD 4/12-3 1.10.2.1(2) E AS A Amend language as indicated in Express
Terms
OSHPD 4/12-4 1.10.2.2 E AS A Amend language as indicated in Express
Terms
OSHPD 4/12-5 | 1.10.3.1(2) E AS A Amend language as indicated in Express
Terms
OSHPD 4/12-6 | 1.10.3.2 E AS A Strike Chapter Ref.’s
OSHPD 4/12-7 ] 1.10.4.1(2) E AS A Amend language as indicated in Express
OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN lof21 Revised November 30, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code




Terms

OSHPD 4/12-8

1.10.4.2

AS

Amend language as indicated in Express
Terms

ADMINISTRATION DIVISION II
Adopt only those sections of the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter previously adopted and carry forward existing amendments of the 2010 California Building Code
(CBC) for OSHPD 1, 2, 3 & 4.

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt entire chapter as amended
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- CAC: Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-9 | Entire Chapter AS A Carry forward existing amendments
CHAPTER 3 USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
Adopt entire chapter without amendments
CBSC
Typeof | cpac, | Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section ETIIEIE (AS, AA, RESIEIES D CEIIES Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-10 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4 — Strike
Ref. to OSHPD-3; Exception
CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY
Adopt entire chapter without amendments
CBSC
Type of ) Agency ;
ltem Number Code Section SUIEIE: (ACSA%A RESTEIES G CRE Annotations A(CAtg) "
ment D ’FS) ' to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-11 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

20f21

Revised November 30, 2012




CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

Adopt entire chapter without amendments

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- Gaes Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-12 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1,2 & 4
CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION
Adopt entire chapter as amended
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- CAC: Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-13 | Entire Chapter AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1,2 & 4
CHAPTER 7 FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED CONSTRUCTION
Adopt entire chapter as amended
Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- giles Response 45-Day Comments AT
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-14 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4
CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISHES
Adopt entire chapter without amendments
CBSC
Typeof | 0. | Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section ETIIEIE (AS, AA, RESIEIES D CEIIES Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-15 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

3of21

Revised November 30, 2012




CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

Adopt entire chapter without amendments

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- GGy Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-16 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1,2 & 4
CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS
Adopt entire chapter as amended
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- CAC: Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-17 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt chapter for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4 — Carry
forward existing amendments
CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY Entire Chapter not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4
CHAPTER 12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT
Adopt entire chapter as amended — Carry forward existing amendments
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- GGy Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-18 | 1208.2 Exc. 4,5 E AS A Add OSHPD 2 & 3 to exception #4 and strike
&6 exception #5 in its entirety and renumber
exception6t0 5
OSHP 4/12-19.1 | 1224.3 Restricted E/N AS A Carol Corr OSHP agreed with this comment and
ltem added for Area Kaiser Permanente incorporated the language into the Express
45 Day Recommends: AA Terms for the 15 Day comment period. No
comments comments were submitted during 15 Day.
OSHPD 4/12-20 | 1224.4.4 N AS A Add new section title and number
OSHPD 4/12-21 | 1224.44.1 E AS A Add new subsection number

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

4 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-22 | 1224.44.1.1.1 N AS A Carol Corr OSHPD agreed with the commenter and
Airborne infection Kaiser Permanente modified the language for 45day. See OSHD's
isolation Recommends: AA FSOR for response.

OSHPD 4/12-23 | 1224.4.4.1.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12- 1224.4.4.2.1 N AS A Carol Corr OSHP agreed with this comment and

23A Specimen Kaiser Permanente incorporated the language into the Express
Collection Recommends: AA Terms for the 15 Day comment period. No
Facilities comments were submitted during 15 Day.

OSHPD 4/12-24 | 1224.4.4.2.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-25 | TABLE E AS A Amend table
1224.4.6.1

OSHPD 4/12-26 | 1224.4.6.2 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-27 | 1224.4.10.2 Carol Corr OSHP agreed with this comment and
Minimum height Kaiser Permanente incorporated the language into the Express
with fixed ceiling Recommends: AA Terms for the 15 Day comment period. No

comments were submitted during 15 Day.

OSHPD 4/12-28 | 1224.4.11.1 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-29 | 1224.4.11.1.1 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-30 | 1224.4.11.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-31 | 1224.4.11.1.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-32 | 1224.4.11.1.4 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-33 | 1224.4.11.2.2 E AS A Carol Corr OSHPD and the commenter had a conference
Wet Cleaning Kaiser Permanente call to discuss. See OSHD’s FSOR for

Recommends; FS response.

OSHPD 4/12-34 | 1224.4.11.3 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-35 | 1224.4.11.3.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-36 | 1224.4.11.4 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-37 | 1224.4.11.4.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-38 | TABLE 1224.4.11 E AS A Amend Table and footnotes

OSHPD 4/12-39 | 1224.4.18 E AS A Coordinate with DSA Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-40 | 1224.14.1.6 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-41 | 1226.14.1.7 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-42 | 1227.14.1.11 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-43 | 1224.15.3.8 E AS A Editorial

OSHPD 4/12-44 | 1224.16.1 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-45 | 1224.18.5 E AS A Amend section

OSHPD 4/12-46 | 1224.18.5.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-47 | 1224.18.5.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-48 | 1224.18.5.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN 5o0f 21 Revised November 30, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code




OSHPD 4/12-49 | 1224.18.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-50 | 1224.18.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-51 | 1224.18.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-52 | 1224.18.7 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-53 | 1224.18.7.1 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-54 | 1224.18.7.2 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-55 | 1224.18.7.3 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-56 | 1224.18.7.4 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-57 | 1224.18.7.5 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-58 | 1224.19.1.1 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-59 | 1224.20.2 E AS A Roger Richter OSHPD agrees with commenter and
California Hospital Assoc. appreciates support of modifications to entire
Recommends; AS section (1224.20.2)
OSHPD 4/12-60 | 1224.20.2.1 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-61 | 1224.20.2.3 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-62 | 1224.20.2.7 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-63 | 1224.20.2.8 E AS A Friendly reminder to add Amend section
Addendum language
OSHPD 4/12-64 | 1224.20.2.10 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-65 | 1224.20.2.11 E AS A Editorial
OSHPD 4/12-67 | 1224.20.2.16 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-68 | 1224.20.3 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-69 | 1224.29.1 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-73 | 1224.29.2.10 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-74 | 1224.29.2.10.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-75 | 1224.29.2.10.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-76 | 1224.29.2.10.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-77 | 1224.29.2.10.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-78 | 1224.29.2.11 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-79 | 1224.29.2.12 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-80 | 1224.29.2.13 E AS A Renumber section
OSHPD 4/12-81 | 1224.33.2.2 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-82 | 1224.33.3.6 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-83 | 1224.35.4 (4) E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-84 | 1225.4.1.3 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-85 | 12254131 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-86 | 1225:41.3:2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-87 | 1225.4.1.3.1 N AS A New section content using old number
OSHPD 4/12-88 | 1225.4.1.3.2 N AS A New section content using old number

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

6 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-89 | 1226.1 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-90
OSHPD 4/12-91 | 1226.2.1 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-92 | 1226.4 E AS A Amend section
OSHPD 4/12-93 | 12265 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-94 | 122654 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-95 | 1226:522 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-96 | 12266 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-97 | 122661 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-98 | 1226.6:2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-99 | 12267 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-100 | 1226.8 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-101 | 1226.8-1 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-102 | 1226.8.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-103 | 1226:9 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-104 | 1226:9:.1 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-105| 1226.9.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-106 | 1226:9.3 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-107 | 422610 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-108 | 422611 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-109 | 1226111 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-110| 1226:11.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-111 | 122612 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-112 | 1226121 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-113 | 12264211 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-114 | 12261212 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-115| 12261213 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-116 | 1226122 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-117 | 122613 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-118 | 1226.4.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-119| 1226.4.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-120| 1226.4.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-121| 1226.4.1.3 N AS A Roger Richter OSHPD agrees with commenter and
California Hospital Assoc. appreciates support of modifications.
Recommends: AS
OSHPD 4/12-122| 1226.4.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-123 | 1226.4.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-124 | 1226.4.2.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

7of21

Revised November 30, 2012



OSHPD 4/12-125| 1226.4.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-126 | 1226.4.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-127| 1226.4.2.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-128 | 1226.4.2.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-129| 1226.4.3 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-130| 1226.4.3.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-131| 1226.4.3.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-132| 1226.4.3.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-133| 1226.4.3.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-134| 1226.4.3.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-135| 1226.4.4 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-136 | 1226.4.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-137 | 1226.4.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-138 | 1226.4.5 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-139| 1226.4.5.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-140| 1226.4.5.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-141| 1226.4.6 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-142 | 1226.4.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-143 | 1226.4.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-144 | 1226.4.7 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-145| 1226.4.7.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-146 | 1226.4.7.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-147 | 1226.4.7.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-148 | 1226.4.7.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-149 | 1226.4.7.2 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-150| 1226.4.7.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-151| 1226.4.7.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-152 | 1226.4.7.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-153| 1226.4.7.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-154 | 1226.4.8 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-155| 1226.4.8.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-156 | 1226.4.8.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-157 | 1226.4.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-158 | 1226.4.9.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-159 | 1226.4.9.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-160| 1226.4.9.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-161 | 1226.4.10 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-162 | 1226.4.11 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-163 | 1226.4.12 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

8 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-164 | 1226.4.13 N AS A Roger Richter Add new title
California Hospital Assoc. OSHPD agrees with commenter.

Recommends; AS

OSHPD 4/12-165| 1226.4.13.1 N AS A

OSHPD 4/12-166 | 1226.4.13.2 N AS A Glenn Gall OSHPD agrees with commenter.
OSHPD, Architect
Recommends: AA

OSHPD 4/12-167 | 1226.4.13.2.1 N AS A Carol Corr OSHP accepted his comment and the item

Medicine Prep Kaiser Permanente was corrected.
Room Recommends: AA

OSHPD 4/12-168 | 1226.4.13.2.2 N AS A Glenn Gall OSHPD agrees with commenter and amended
OSHPD, Architect the section in 15 day language.
Recommends: AA

OSHPD 4/12-169 | 1226.4.13.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-171| 1226.4.13.5 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-172 | 1226.4.13.6 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-173 | 1226.4.13.6.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-175]| 1226.4.13.6.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-176 | 1226.4.13.7 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-177 | 1226.4.14

OSHPD 4/12-178 | 1226.4.14.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-179| 1226.4.15 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-180| 1226.4.15.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-181 | 1226.4.16 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-182| 1226.4.16.1 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-183| 1226.4.16.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-184 | 1226.4.16.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-185| 1226.4.16.2 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-186 | 1226.4.16.2.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-187 | 1226.4.16.2.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-188 | 1226.4.17 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-189 | 1226.4.17.1 N AS A Add new Section

OSHPD 4/12-190| 1226.4.17.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-191| 1226.4.17.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-192 | 1226.5 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-193 | 1226.5.1 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-194 | 1226.5.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-195| 1226.5.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-196 | 1226.5.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

9of21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-197| 1226.5.2.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-198 | 1226.5.2.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-199 | 1226.5.3 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-200| 1226.5.3.1 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-201| 1226.5.3.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-202| 1226.5.3.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-203| 1226.5.3.1.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-204| 1226.5.3.1.4 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-205| 1226.5.3.1.5 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-206 | 1226.5.3.2 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-207| 1226.5.3.2.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-208| 1226.5.3.2.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-209| 1226.5.4 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-210| 1226.5.4.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-211| 1226.5.4.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-212 | 1226.5.5 N AS A Carol Corr OSHP agreed with this comment and
Radiological/lmag Kaiser Permanente incorporated the language into the Express
ing Service Recommends: AA Terms for the 45 Day comment period. No
Space comments were submitted during 45 Day.

OSHPD 4/12-213| 1226.5.5.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-214| 1226.5.5.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-215| 1226.5.5.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-216| 1226.5.5.1.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-217| 1226.5.5.1.4 N AS A Carol Corr OSHPD made editorial correction per Ms.
Handwashing Kaiser Permanente Corr's comment.
fixtures Recommends: AA See FSOR for response.

OSHPD 4/12-218| 1226.5.5.1.5 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-219

OSHPD 4/12-220| 1226.5.5.1.7 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-221 | 1226.5.5.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-222 | 1226.5.6

OSHPD 4/12-223 | 1226.5.7 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-224 | 1226.5.8 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-225| 1226.5.9 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-226 | 1226.5.10 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-228 | 1226.5.11.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-229| 1226.5.11.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 4/12-230| 1226.5.11.1.2 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

10 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-231| 1226.5.11.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-232 | 1226.5.11.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-233 | 1226.5.11.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-234 | 1226.5.11.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-235| 1226.5.11.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-236| 1226.5.11.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-237| 1226.5.11.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-238| 1226.5.11.6.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-239| 1226.5.11.6.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-241| 1226.5.11.6.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-243| 1226.5.11.6.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-244| 1226.5.11.6.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-245| 1226.5.11.6.10 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-246 | 1226.5.11.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-248 | 1226.5.12 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-249 | 1226.5.12.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-250 | 1226.5.12.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-251| 1226.5.12.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-252 | 1226.5.12.4 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-253| 1226.5.12.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-254 | 1226.5.12.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-255| 1226.5.12.4.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-256 | 1226.5.12.4.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-257| 1226.5.12.4.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-258 | 1226.5.12.4.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-259 | 1226.5.12.4.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-260| 1226.5.12.4.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-261| 1226.5.12.4.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-262 | 1226.5.12.4.10 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-263 | 1226.5.12.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-264 | 1226.5.12.5.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-265| 1226.5.12.5.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-266 | 1226.5.12.5.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-267 | 1226.5.12.6 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-268 | 1226.5.12.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-269 | 1226.5.12.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-270 | 1226.5.12.7 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-271| 1226.5.12.7.1 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 4/12-272 | 1226.5.12.8 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

11 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-273| 1226.5.13 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-274 | 1226.5.13.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-275| 1226.5.13.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-276| 1226.5.13.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-277| 1226.5.13.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-278| 1226.5.13.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-279| 1226.5.13.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-280| 1226.5.13.1.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-281| 1226.5.13.1.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-282 | 1226.5.13.1.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-283| 1226.5.13.1.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-284 | 1226.5.13.1.10 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-285| 1226.5.13.1.11 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-286 | 1226.5.13.1.12 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-287| 1226.5.13.1.13 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-288 | 1226.5.13.1.14 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-289 | 1226.5.13.1.15 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-290 | 422614 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-291 | 1226141 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-292 | 1226:14.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-293 | 1226:14.3 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-294 | 122615 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-295| 1226151 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-296 | 1226:15.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-297 | 1226:15:3 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-298 | 1226:154 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-299 | 1226155 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-300 | 1226-15:6 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-301 | 122616 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-302 | 1226.6 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-303 | 1226.6.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-304

OSHPD 4/12-305| 1226.6.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-306 | 1226.6.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-307 | 1226.6.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-308 | 1226.6.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-309 | 1226.6.2.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-310| 1226.6.3 N AS A Add new title

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

12 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-311| 1226.6.3.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-312 | 1226.6.3.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-313 | 1226.6.4 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-314 | 1226.6.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-315| 1226.6.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-316 | 1226.6.5 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-317 | 1226.6.5.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-318| 1226.6.5.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-319| 1226.6.5.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-320| 1226.6.5.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-321| 1226.6.5.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-322 | 1226.6.5.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-323| 1226.6.5.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-324 | 1226.6.5.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-325| 1226.6.5.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-326 | 1226.6.6 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-327 | 1226.6.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-328 | 1226.6.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-329 | 1226.7 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-330| 1226.7.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-331| 1226.7.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-332 | 1226.7.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-333 | 1226.7.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-334 | 1226.7.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-335 | 122617 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-336 | 1226171 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-337 | 1226172 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-338 | 1226173 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-339 | 1226:17.31 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-340 | 1226174 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-341| 1226175 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-342 | 1226176 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-343 | 1226177 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-344 | 1226178 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-345| 1226:17.9 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-346 | 12261710 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-347 | 122617101 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-348 | 122617102 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-349 | 122617103 E AS A Strike section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

13 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-350 | 122617104 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-351 | 12261711 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-352 | 122617111 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-353 | 122617112 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-354 | 122617113 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-355 | 122617114 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-356 | 122617115 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-357 | 122617116 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-358 | 1226.8 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-359 | 1226.8.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-360 | 1226.8.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-361 | 1226.8.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-362 | 1226.8.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-363 | 1226.8.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-364 | 1226.8.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-365| 1226.8.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-366 | 1226.8.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-367 | 1226.8.2.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-368 | 1226.8.2.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-369 | 1226.8.2.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-370 | 1226.8.2.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-371| 1226.8.2.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-372 | 1226.8.2.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-373 | 1226.8.2.10 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-374 | 1226.8.2.11 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-375| 1226.8.2.12 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-376| 1226.8.2.13 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-377| 1226.8.2.14 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-378 | 1226.8.2.15 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-379 | 1226.8.3 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-380 | 1226.8.3.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-382 | 1226.8.4 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-383 | 1226.8.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-384 | 1226.8.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-385| 1226.8.5 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-386 | 1226.8.5.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-387| 1226.8.5.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-388| 1226.8.5.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-389 | 1226.8.5.1.3 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

14 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-390 | 1226.8.5.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-391 | 1226.8.5.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-392 | 1226.8.5.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-393 | 1226.8.5.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-394 | 1226.8.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-395| 1226.8.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-396 | 1226.8.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-397 | 422618 E AS A Strike title
OSHPD 4/12-398 | 1226181 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-399 | 1226:18.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-400 | 1226-18:3 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-401 | 1226:18:4 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-402 | 1226185 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-403 | 1226186 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-404 | 1226:18.7 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-405| 1226:18.8 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-406 | 1226:18.9 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-407 | 12261810 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-408 | 12261811 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-409 | 1226-18:12 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-410 | 1226-18:13 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-411 | 12261814 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-412 | 12261815 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-413| 1226.9 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-414| 1226.9.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-415| 1226.9.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-416 | 1226.9.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-417| 1226.9.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-418| 1226.9.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-419| 1226.9.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-420| 1226.9.1.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-421| 1226.9.1.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-422 | 1226.9.1.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-423 | 1226.9.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-424 | 1226.9.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-425| 1226.9.2.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-426 | 1226.9.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-427| 1226.9.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-428 | 1226.9.2.4 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

15 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-429| 1226.9.2.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-430| 1226.9.2.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-431| 1226.9.2.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-432 | 1226.9.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-433| 1226.9.3.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-434 | 1226.9.3.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-435| 1226.9.4 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-436 | 1226.9.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-437 | 1226.9.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-438| 1226.9.4.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-439 | 1226.9.5 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-440| 1226.9.5.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-441| 1226.9.5.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-442 | 1226.9.5.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-443| 1226.9.5.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-444| 1226.95.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-445| 1226.9.5.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-446 | 1226.9.6 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-447| 1226.9.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-448 | 1226.9.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-449 | 122619 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-450 | 1226191 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-451 | 1226.19.2 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-452 | 1226193 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-453 | 1226:19:4 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-454 | 1226.10 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-455| 1226.10.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-456 | 1226.10.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-457 | 1226.10.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-458 | 1226.10.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-459 | 1226.10.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-460 | 1226.10.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-461 | 1226,10.3 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-462 | 1226.10.3.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-463| 1226.10.3.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-464 | 1226.10.3.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-465| 1226.10.3.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-466 | 1226.10.3.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-467 | 1226.10.3.1.5 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

16 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-468 | 1226.10.3.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-469 | 1226.10.3.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-470| 1226.10.3.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-471| 1226.10.4 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-472 | 1226.10.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-473 | 1226.10.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-474 | 1226.10.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-475| 1226.10.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-476 | 1226.10.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-477 | 1226.11 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-478 | 1226.11.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-479| 1226.11.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-480 | 1226.11.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-481 | 1226.11.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-482| 1226.11.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-483| 1226.11.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-484 | 1226.11.1.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-485| 1226.11.1.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-486| 1226.11.1.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-487 | 1226.11.1.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-488 | 1226.11.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-489 | 1226.11.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-490 | 1226.11.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-491 | 1226.11.2.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-492| 1226.11.2.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-493| 1226.11.2.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-494 | 1226.11.2.6 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-495 | 1226.11.2.7 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-496 | 1226.11.2.8 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-497 | 1226.11.2.9 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-498 | 1226.11.3 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-499 | 1226.11.3.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-500| 1226.11.4 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-501 | 1226.11.4.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-502 | 1226.11.4.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-503 | 1226.11.4.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-504 | 1225.11.5 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-505 | 1226.11.5.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-506 | 1226.11.5.1.1 N AS A Add new section

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

17 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




OSHPD 4/12-507 | 1226.11.5.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-508 | 1226.11.5.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-509 | 1226.11.5.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-510| 1226.11.5.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-511| 1226.11.5.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-512| 1226.115.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-513| 1226.11.5.2.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-514 | 1226.11.6 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-515| 1226.11.6.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-516 | 1226.11.6.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-517 | 1226.11.6.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-518 | 1226.11.6.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-519 | 1226.20 E AS A Strike section
OSHPD 4/12-520| 1226.12 N AS A Add new definition
OSHPD 4/12-521| 1226.12.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-522 | 1226.12.1.1 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-523| 1226.12.1.1.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-524 | 1226.12.1.1.2 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-525| 1226.12.1.1.3 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-526 | 1226.12.1.1.4 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-527| 1226.12.1.1.5 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-528 | 1226.12.1.2 N AS A Add new title
OSHPD 4/12-529| 1226.12.1.2.1 N AS A Add new section
OSHPD 4/12-530| 1226.12.1.2.2 N AS A Add new section

CHAPTER 13 ENERGY EFFICIENCY Entire Chapter not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4

CHAPTER 14 EXTERIOR WALLS Adopt entire 2012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter and carry forward existing amendments of the 2010 California Building
Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4.

CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES Adopt entire 2012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter and carry forward existing amendments

of the 2010 California Building Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4.

CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN

Adopt entire chapter as amended

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

18 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




Type of

Agency

CBSC

. amend- GRE; Response 45-Day Comments . Action
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-531 | Table 1604.5 E AS A Amend table

CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC Adopt entire 2012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter without amendments for OSHPD 1, 2 & 4.

CHAPTER 27 ELECTRICAL Entire Chapter not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4

CHAPTER 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS Entire Chapter not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4

CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS Entire Chapter not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4

CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt entire 2012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter without amendments for OSHPD 2 & 4, and carry forward existing amendments of the 2010 California
Building Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1.

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- GGy Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-532 | Entire Chapter E AS A See notation under Chapter title above
CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt entire chapter without amendments
CBSC
Type of . Agency .
. amend- GRE; Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-533 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt for OSHPD 1,2, &4

CHAPTER 32 ENROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY

Adopt entire chapter without amendments

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

19 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- GRE; Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-534 | Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt for OSHPD 1,2, &4
CHAPTER 33 SAFEGAURDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt entire 20012 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter and carry forward existing amendments of the 2010 California Building Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1,2 & 4.
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-535| Entire Chapter E AS A Adopt for OSHPD 1, 2, &4
CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt entire chapter without amendment
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 4/12-536 | Entire Chapter AS A

APPENDIX A EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX B BOARD OF APPEALS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX C GROUP U — AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.
APPENDIX D FIRE DISTRICTS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code

20 of 21

Revised November 30, 2012




APPENDIX F RODENTPROOFING Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX G FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX H SIGNS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX | PATIO COVERS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX J GRADING Entire Appendix adopted with amendments carried forward for OSHPD 1, 2, & 4 — Adopt Entire Appendix without amendment for OSHPD 3.
APPENDIX K ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

APPENDIX M TSUMANI-GENERATED FLOOD HAZARD Entire Appendix not adopted for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

OSHPD 04/12 - GREEN 21 of 21 Revised November 30, 2012
Commission Action Matrix
2013 California Building Code



