

**Contract (Mandatory): 1S-05-70-06**

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	
1	7068-000-0002-6	190135	EA	PERIPHERAL SHARING DEVICE	VARIABLE	
The following is a sampling of items that may be purchased under this contract.						
<u>OPTICAL MEDIA, TAPES, &amp; STORAGE DEVICES</u>						
Bidder						
	<u>Part #</u>	<u>Index Name</u>		<u>Index Price</u>	<u>Discount %</u>	<u>Offer Price</u>
		eELP (Index Price)				
	30DP010100AKA	"		\$225.13	10%	\$201.72
	313-1540	"		\$131.99	10%	\$118.26
	312629	"		\$51.26	10%	\$45.93
	HDS722516VLAT80	"		\$99.50	10%	\$89.15
	286776-b22	"		\$297.60	10%	\$266.65
	DD707AV	"		\$94.75	10%	\$84.90
	188527-B22	"		\$506.16	10%	\$453.52
	C5141F	"		\$19.20	10%	\$17.20
	DL976B	"		\$96.00	10%	\$86.02
	DL975B	"		\$86.40	10%	\$77.41
	DD765AV	"		\$16.80	10%	\$15.05
	C7982A	"		\$64.80	10%	\$58.06
	P92290F	"		\$26.40	10%	\$23.65
	286714-B22	"		\$325.20	10%	\$291.38
	278424-B21	"		\$127.20	10%	\$113.97
	07N5574	"		\$208.86	10%	\$187.14
	91270	"		\$1424.84	10%	\$1276.66
	41277	"		\$543.44	10%	\$486.92
	41089	"		\$28.64	10%	\$25.66
	32583	"		\$114.60	10%	\$102.68
	183700PK	"		\$992.95	10%	\$889.68
	MAX-648210	"		\$5.74	10%	\$5.14
	MAX556423	"		\$2.20	10%	\$1.97

**Contract (Mandatory): 1S-05-70-06**

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	183270		"		\$26.34
	6Y080L0		"		\$67.98
	32023257		"		\$49.52
	PX-716ASW		"		\$134.40
	SW252FEN		"		\$27.19
	SDCZ2-1024-A10		"		\$79.92
	ST92011A		"		\$66.74
	DL4TK88/2		"		\$19.20
	SDX250C		"		\$40.80
	LTX100G		"		\$27.53
	CD-R80KCB100T		"		\$27.58
	DV516E/KIT/B		"		\$43.57
	MK4026GAX		"		\$83.12
	WD2500JBRTL		"		\$158.21

MEMORY UPGRADE

Bidder	Part #	Index Name	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
		eELP (Index Price)			
	MEM2600XM-32D=	"	\$718.01	10%	\$643.34
	CT512MBU2	"	\$51.06	10%	\$45.75
	D58JEV	"	\$111.72	10%	\$100.10
	EDGDM-197230-PE	"	\$103.85	10%	\$93.05
	EPUSB/1GB-2.0	"	\$91.52	10%	\$82.00
	DD727AV	"	\$187.43	10%	\$167.94
	DE983AV	"	\$329.05	10%	\$294.83
	201694-B21	"	\$511.20	10%	\$458.04
	202172-B21	"	\$1,924.80	10%	\$1,724.62
	300680-B21	"	\$850.80	10%	\$762.32
	300679-B21	"	\$184.80	10%	\$165.58
	254786-B21	"	\$306.00	10%	\$274.18
	300682-B21	"	\$1,464.00	10%	\$1,311.74

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	KTC311/256LP		"		\$161.70
	KTC6611/256		"		\$83.33
	KTM-TP390X/256-G		"		\$148.32
	KVR333X72C25/256		"		\$34.48
	JDS512-231		"		\$63.04
	SDCZ2-512-A10		"		\$41.95
	STC2021/4G		"		\$1,429.56
	STC3006/2G		"		\$518.11
	MEM-SD-NPE-256MB-A		"		\$130.80
	USQDP-2.2		"		\$179.52
				10%	\$144.88
				10%	\$74.66
				10%	\$132.89
				10%	\$30.89
				10%	\$56.48
				10%	\$37.59
				10%	\$1,280.89
				10%	\$464.23
				10%	\$117.20
				10%	\$160.85

NETWORKING & NETWORKING ACCESSORIES

Bidder

<u>Part #</u>	<u>Index Name</u>	<u>Index Price</u>	<u>Discount %</u>	<u>Offer Price</u>
	eELP (Index Price)			
3C16753-US	"	\$74.56	10%	\$66.81
AT-2000UPLUGNPL-001	"	\$39.22	10%	\$35.14
M8799LL/A	"	\$213.43	10%	\$191.23
F5D6001	"	\$20.76	10%	\$18.60
AIR-P121AG-A-K9	"	\$163.20	10%	\$146.23
DI-604	"	\$39.43	10%	\$35.33
HBR49	"	\$44.89	10%	\$40.22
H08-15355	"	\$40.45	10%	\$36.24
DG954A	"	\$43.20	10%	\$38.71
34L4801	"	\$130.66	10%	\$117.07
33118	"	\$36.84	10%	\$33.01
WRT54GS	"	\$71.99	10%	\$64.50
WG511NA	"	\$47.99	10%	\$43.00
FS108	"	\$53.44	10%	\$47.88
PD-6001/AC	"	\$37.51	10%	\$33.61

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	8670-US2		"		\$408.61
	SMC2804WBR		"		\$68.99
	X3150A		"		\$274.16
	USR5633A		"		\$50.80
					10%
					\$366.11
					10%
					\$61.82
					10%
					\$245.65
					10%
					\$45.52
<u>SCANNER</u>					
	<u>Bidder</u>				
	<u>Part #</u>	<u>Index Name</u>	<u>Index Price</u>	<u>Discount %</u>	<u>Offer Price</u>
		eELP (Index Price)			
	0102418	"	\$6,864.62	10%	\$6,150.70
	6899A002AA	"	\$2,700.00	10%	\$2,419.20
	8926A002AA	"	\$6,825.91	10%	\$6,116.02
	1640XL	"	\$1,209.26	10%	\$1,083.50
	CG01000-477801	"	\$1,044.00	10%	\$935.42
	C9932A#A2L	"	\$445.20	10%	\$398.90
	857-0053	"	\$25,093.55	10%	\$22,483.82
	118-5826	"	\$19,380.00	10%	\$17,364.48
	1108-03-580002	"	\$95.71	10%	\$85.76
	402026	"	\$859.32	10%	\$769.95
	SPKG-20529/	"			
	SPKG-20529	"	\$1,235.94	10%	\$1,107.40
	SXP4501D-WU	"	\$650.23	10%	\$582.61
<u>POWER SUPPLY &amp; PROTECTION</u>					
	<u>Bidder</u>				
	<u>Part #</u>	<u>Index Name</u>	<u>Index Price</u>	<u>Discount %</u>	<u>Offer Price</u>
		eELP (Index Price)			
	TRUE550 EPS12V	"	\$107.53	10%	\$96.35

Contract (Mandatory): 1S-05-70-06

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	SU5000RMT5U		"		
				\$2,338.80	10%
	SY12KEX-PD		"		
				\$9,785.92	10%
	SU5000RMXL25U		"		
				\$1,678.80	10%
	POW6-WHT		"		
				\$47.48	10%
	SUA1500RM2U		"		
				\$587.99	10%
	SU1400RMXL3U		"		
				\$670.91	10%
	F6C120-UNV		"		
				\$119.16	10%
	WS-CAC-2500W		"		
				\$2,088.00	10%
	ER-S400		"		
				\$17.74	10%
	EN-8420934		"		
				\$39.55	10%
	99090		"		
				\$6.00	10%
	313054-001		"		
				\$188.40	10%
	204404-001		"		
				\$863.28	10%
	192186-002		"		
				\$1,360.20	10%
	GXT2-3RTBKIT		"		
				\$309.59	10%
	ATXPOW480HS		"		
				\$74.40	10%
	PA3259U-1BRS		"		
				\$129.54	10%
	MT 6PLUS		"		
				\$75.66	10%
	SU1000RTXL2U		"		
				\$480.65	10%
					\$430.66

EXPANSION CARDS & CONTROLLER BOARDS

Bidder	Part #	Index Name	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
		eELP (Index Price)			
	3C996-SX	"	\$383.16	10%	\$343.31
	1822300	"	\$216.30	10%	\$193.80
	AT-2701FX/MT-001	"	\$139.76	10%	\$125.22
	P4C800-E DELUXE	"	\$207.77	10%	\$186.16
	100-713500	"	\$246.71	10%	\$221.05
	70SB006003007	"	\$26.71	10%	\$23.93

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	227251-001		"	s376.80	10% \$337.61
	255514-B21		"	\$134.40	10% \$120.42
	AA653A		"	\$93.37	10% \$83.66
	291969-B21		"	\$174.00	10% \$155.90
	DD697AV		"	\$55.80	10% \$50.00
	PILA8460M		"	\$33.60	10% \$30.11
	VIDEO-158PCI-64TV		"	\$55.14	10% \$49.41
	EH-850-2000		"	\$1,357.69	10% \$1,216.49
	LNE100TX		"	\$11.75	10% \$10.53
	G45FMDVP32DB		"	\$105.68	10% \$94.69
	HA501NA		"	\$59.94	10% \$53.71
	8470-WD		"	\$63.29	10% \$56.71
	VCGFX52APB		"	\$95.86	10% \$85.89
	X6758A		"	\$630.80	10% \$565.20

LARGE PROJECTOR & DISPLAY

Bidder Part #	Index Name eELP (Index Price)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
78923668145	"	\$1,299.07	10%	\$1,163.97
PB2240	"	\$1,798.80	10%	\$1,611.72
8610A002	"	\$1,582.66	10%	\$1,418.06
2300MP1	"	\$1,078.80	10%	\$966.60
CP-SX5600W	"	\$6,054.00	10%	\$5,424.38
L1510A	"	\$1,405.20	10%	\$1,259.06
L1596	"	\$1,564.80	10%	\$1,402.06
L1511	"	\$1,554.00	10%	\$1,392.38
XD50U	"	\$2,291.63	10%	\$2,053.30
LT220	"	\$1,697.24	10%	\$1,520.73
EP725	"	\$1,570.52	10%	\$1,407.19

Contract (Mandatory): 1S-05-70-06

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	PGA20X		"		\$1,743.47
	VPL-CX6		"		\$1,667.15
	TLP-T60MU		"		\$1,796.56
	PJ400		"		\$369.56
					10%
					\$1,562.15
					10%
					\$1,493.77
					10%
					\$1,609.72
					10%
					\$331.13
<u>OTHER PERIPHERALS</u>					
	<u>Bidder</u>				
	<u>Part #</u>	<u>Index Name</u>	<u>Index Price</u>	<u>Discount %</u>	<u>Offer Price</u>
		eELP (Index Price)			
	EP7640CC	"	\$70.06	10%	\$62.77
	1815700	"	\$42.74	10%	\$38.30
	AXDA2800BOX	"	\$124.84	10%	\$111.86
	3888RD-10	"	\$5.09	10%	\$4.56
	M8784G/A	"	\$53.05	10%	\$47.53
	F2N035-06	"	\$2.34	10%	\$2.10
	EQN500-0006	"	\$58.03	10%	\$51.99
	27964	"	\$9.26	10%	\$8.30
	9434A002	"	\$77.52	10%	\$69.46
	QV-R62	"	\$326.53	10%	\$292.57
	D2167	"	\$1,474.80	10%	\$1,321.42
	DSU1HZ-BBP	"	\$13.13	10%	\$11.76
	DPC-AD	"	\$29.59	10%	\$26.51
	DC366B#ABA	"	\$275.46	10%	\$246.81
	FA103A#8ZQ	"	\$500.90	10%	\$448.81
	FA106A#8ZQ	"	\$467.60	10%	\$418.97
	331004-B21	"	\$5,689.20	10%	\$5,097.52
	DF546AV	"	\$269.63	10%	\$241.59
	DE364AV	"	\$416.58	10%	\$373.26
	10K0207	"	\$44.16	10%	\$39.57
	02K6699	"	\$49.00	10%	\$43.90

ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO. SUPPLIER PART NO.	SUPPLIER NO.	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE
	BX80546PG3200E		"		\$227.94
	G2L1003P		"		\$17.64
	CUTFS40U		"		\$89.20
	64068E		"		\$33.22
	E03601QUS201B-C		"		\$20.76
	1268903		"		\$25.95
	911531-0403		"		\$18.59
	967233-0403		"		\$22.87
	32022384		"		\$27.31
	M03-00039		"		\$22.04
	2600490-100		"		\$43.40
	25528		"		\$343.54
	225370		"		\$189.28
	1035NA		"		\$855.72
	TY-ST05K		"		\$64.50
	CEST10		"		\$51.40
	DSC-F717		"		\$815.00
	SNC-Z20N		"		\$938.43
	1394_15		"		\$7.76
	CL55		"		\$40.20
	PA3082U-2PRP		"		\$87.37
	U004-006		"		\$3.14
	PPCV36		"		\$318.26
	108R00328		"		\$242.46

**PRICING WORKSHEET 6A, Optical Media, Tapes and Storage Devices Pricing**

**Bidder Name:** Hewlett-Packard  
**Submitted By:** Pai Hall

**Answer - Mandatory**

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1. Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off Index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List, Catalogue Price, Reseller List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$15.00
A	ADS	ADS DUAL LINK COMBO DRIVE KIT	DLX-195	DLX-195	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 86.40	10%	\$77.41
B	CREATIVE LABS	CREATIVE LABS CDROM 52X X1 UNIT XLXA - 10PK	30DP010100AKA	30DP010100AKA	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 225.13	10%	\$201.72
C	DELL	24X/10X/24X CD-RW AND 8X DVD-ROM COMBO DRIVE FOR DELL D-FAMILY AND X300 NOTEBOOKS	313-1540	313-1540	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 131.99	10%	\$118.28
D	EXABYTE	EX-AME 170M DOART EXATAPE 20/40GB 8MM	312629	312629	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 51.29	10%	\$45.93
E	HITACHI	HITACHI DESKSTAR 7K250 160GB ATA-6 7200 RPM 6M 3.5" HDD	HDS722516VLAT80	HDS722516VLAT80	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 89.50	10%	\$80.15
F	HP	COMPAQ U820 36.4GB SCSI HARD DRIVE	286776-B22	286776-B22	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 287.60	10%	\$258.65
G	HP	40GB ATA/100 7200 RPM	DD707AV	DD707AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 94.75	10%	\$84.90
H	HP	SDLT1 110/220 & 160/320GB DATA CARTRIDGE 10 PACK	186527-B22	186527-B22	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 505.15	10%	\$450.52
I	HP	DLT IV TK88 20/40/70/90GB DLT4000/8000	C5141F	C5141F	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 19.20	10%	\$17.20
J	HP	DVD CDRW COMBO 48X32X DRV INT EIDE	DL976B	DL976B	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 96.00	10%	\$86.02
K	HP	CDRW DR 48X32X46X CARBONITE DT	DL975B	DL975B	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 86.40	10%	\$77.41
L	HP	48X CD-ROM DRIVE	DD765AV	DD765AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 15.80	10%	\$15.05
M	HP	SDLT CLEANING 1 PACK CARTRIDGE	C7982A	C7982A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 64.80	10%	\$58.06
N	HP	1PK 2.6GB WORM OPTICAL	P9220F	P9220F	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 25.40	10%	\$22.65
O	HP	COMPAQ U820 72.8GB SCSI HARD DRIVE	286714-B22	286714-B22	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 325.20	10%	\$291.38
P	HP	80GB ATA/100 7200RPM SERVERS ONLY	278424-B21	278424-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 127.20	10%	\$113.97
Q	IBM	1GB MICRODRIVE W/ PCCARD	07N5574	07N5574	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 208.86	10%	\$187.14
R	IMATION	IMATION BLACK WATCH 9840 20GB TAPE CARTRIDGE 20PK	91270	91270	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,424.84	10%	\$1,276.66
S	IMATION	20PK LTO1 ULTRIUM 100/200GB TAPE CARTRIDGE W/O CASE	41277	41277	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 543.44	10%	\$486.92
T	IMATION	1PK LTO ULTRIUM 100 200GB TAPE CART	41089	41089	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 26.84	10%	\$23.66
U	OMEGA	CD-RW USB 2.0 EXTERNAL 52 X 24 X 52	32583	32583	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 114.80	10%	\$102.68
V	LACIE	LACIE PORSHÉ MOBILE 80 GB 5400RPM HARD DRIVE	300765	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
W	MAXELL	SUPER DLT I 110GB TAPE CARTRIDGE CD-RECORDABLE DISCS, 48X, 80 MIN., BRANDED, SLIM JEWEL CASE, SILVER, 10/PACK	183700PK	183700PK	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 892.95	10%	\$803.66
X	MAXELL	3.5" DISKETTES, IBM FORMAT, DS/HD, 10/BOX	MAX556423	MAX556423	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 5.74	10%	\$5.14
Y	MAXELL	1PK DLT IV TK68 TAPE CART 20/40 35/70 40/90GB	MAX556423	MAX556423	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 2.80	10%	\$1.97
Z	MAXELL	DIAMOND MAX PLUS9 80GB HARD DRIVE	183270	183270	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 25.94	10%	\$23.00
AA	MAXTOR	CDRW DRIVE 52X/32X/52X EIDE	0Y080L0	0Y080L0	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 67.90	10%	\$60.91
AB	MEMOREX	PLEXTOR PX716A DVD 4- RW	32029257	32029257	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 48.52	10%	\$44.37
AD	PLEXTOR	52X32X52X CDRW-EIDE DDC6 NERO B	PX-716ASW	PX-716ASW	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 194.40	10%	\$172.42
AE	SAMSUNG	SANDISK 1GB CRUIZER MINI USB FLASH DRIVE	SW252FEN	SW252FEN	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 27.19	10%	\$24.36
AF	SCANDISK	HARD DRIVE - 20 GB - PORTABLE - 2.5" - ATA-100 - 5400 RPM	SDCZ2-1024-A10	SDCZ2-1024-A10	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 78.92	10%	\$71.01
AG	SEAGATE	SONY DL4TK88/2 DLT IV 40/90GB 35/70GB CARTRIDGE	ST92011A	ST92011A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 66.74	10%	\$59.90
AH	SONY	1PK 8MM AIT-2 50GB/100GB-W/MIC	DL4TK88/2	DL4TK88/2	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 19.20	10%	\$17.20
AJ	SONY	1PK 16X BLACK IDE DVD-ROM	SDX2-50C	SDX2-50C	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 40.80	10%	\$36.56
AJ	SONY	1PK LTO1 100/200GB ULTRIUM TAPE	LTX100G	LTX100G	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 27.80	10%	\$24.67
AK	SUN	SG-XMEDLTO200GB-10 LTO2 MEDIA 200GB 10PK	SG-XMEDLTO200GB-10	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
AL	TDK	TDK CDR 80MIN 700MB 48X BRANDED SPINDLE 100PK	CD-R80KCB100T	CD-R80KCB100T	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 27.58	10%	\$24.71
AM	TEAC	TEAC 16X BLACK IDE DVD-ROM	DV516E/KIT/B	DV516E/KIT/B	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 43.57	10%	\$39.04
AN	TOSHIBA	TOSHIBA HD 40GB IDE 2.5" 5400RPM	MK4026QAX	MK4026QAX	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 83.12	10%	\$74.49
AP	WESTERN DIGITAL	CAVIAR 250GB 7200 RPM 8MB CACHE INTERNAL EIDE 1PK	WD2500JB	WD2500JBRTL	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 158.21	10%	\$141.76

PRICING WORKSHEET 6B. Memory Upgrade Pricing

Answer - Mandatory

Bidder Name: Hewlett-Packard  
 Submitted By: Pat Hill

Instructions - Part 2: Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1. Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For example, if you propose 25% off index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List, Catalogue Price, Reseller List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	CISCO	32MB DIMM DRAM FOR THE CISCO / 2600XM	MEM2600XM-32D=	MEM2600XM-32D=	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 719.01	10%	\$ 643.34
B	CRUCIAL TECHNOLOGY	CRUCIAL GIZMOT HI-SPEED 512MB USB FLASH DRIVE	CT512MBU2	CT512MBU2	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 51.06	10%	\$ 45.75
C	DELL	256 MB MODULE FOR A DELL LATITUDE C500 SERIES SYSTEM	D564JEV	D564JEV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 111.72	10%	\$ 100.10
D	EDGE MEMORY	1GB FLASH SD FOR STANDARD FLASH / DIGITAL MEDIA	EDGDM-197230-PE	EDGDM-197230-PE	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 103.05	10%	\$ 93.05
E	EP MEMORY	1GB MOBILE MINI FLASH DRIVE USB / 2.0 W/NECKSTRAP AND CABLE	EPUSB/1GB-2.0	EPUSB/1GB-2.0	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 91.62	10%	\$ 82.00
F	HP	512MB PC2700 DDR333 NON ECC DIMM	DD727AV	DD727AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 167.43	10%	\$ 167.94
G	HP	1GB DDR PC2700 2X512MB D630	DE983AV	DE983AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 329.05	10%	\$ 294.83
H	HP	512 MB X 2 - DIMM 198-PIN - SDRAM 4GB ECC PC2100 KIT COMPAQ	201694-B21	201694-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 611.20	10%	\$ 458.04
I	HP	PROLIANT DL580 G2	202172-B21	202172-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,824.80	10%	\$ 1,724.62
J	HP	2GB DDR KIT ML370G3 FOR COMPAQ PROLIANT	300690-B21	300690-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 850.80	10%	\$ 762.32
K	HP	512 MB X 2 - DIMM 184-PIN - DDR COMPAQ-SERVER OPTIONS 256MB	300679-B21	300679-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 184.80	10%	\$ 166.58
L	HP	BATTERY BACKED CACHE MODULE FOR 530X	254786-B21	254786-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 306.00	10%	\$ 274.10
M	HP	4GB COMPAQ PRO REG ECC KIT DL360 DL560	300692-B21	300692-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,464.00	10%	\$ 1,311.74
N	IBM	2 GB X 1 - DIMM 184-PIN - DDR	33L5040	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
O	IBM	1GB PC1600 ECC DDR XSERIES 255 0695 380 8986	33L3285	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
P	KINGSTON	256 MB X 1 - SD DIMM 144-PIN - SDRAM	KTC311256LP	KTC311256LP	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 181.70	10%	\$ 144.88
Q	KINGSTON	256MB 100MHZ MODULE FOR COMPAQ	KTC6811Z56	KTC6811Z56	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 83.33	10%	\$ 74.88
R	KINGSTON	256MB IBM THINKPAD 390X 2626 600X	KTM-TP390X256-G	KTM-TP390X256-G	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 148.92	10%	\$ 132.88
S	KINGSTON	256MB 333MHZ DDR PC2700 ECC	KVR333X72C25256	KVR333X72C25256	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 34.48	10%	\$ 30.89
T	LEXAR MEDIA	512MB USB SOLID STATE DRIVE	JDS512-231	JDS512-231	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 69.04	10%	\$ 56.48
U	SANDISK CORPORATION	512MB CRUZER MINI HIGH-SPEED USB 2.0 PORTABLE FLASH DRIVE	SDCZ2-512-A10	SDCZ2-512-A10	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 41.95	10%	\$ 37.59
V	SIMPLETECH	4GB 184PIN DDR PC2100 FOR COMPAQ	STC20214G	STC20214G	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,420.56	10%	\$ 1,280.99
W	SIMPLETECH	2GB DDR KIT ML370G3 FOR COMPAQ PROLIANT	STC30062G	STC30062G	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 518.11	10%	\$ 464.23
X	SMART MODULAR	CISCO 256MB 7200 VXR	MEM-SD-NPE-256MB-A	MEM-SD-NPE-256MB-A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 130.80	10%	\$ 117.20
Y	US MODULAR	2.2GB UJIKDISK™ ENCLOSURE USB 2.0 PORTABLE USB FLASH DRIVE WITH REMOVEABLE COMPACTFLASH TYPE II CARD	USQDP-2.2	USQDP-2.2	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 179.52	10%	\$ 160.85

**PRICING WORKSHEET 6C. Networking And Networking Accessories Pricing**

**Bidder Name:** Hewlett-Packard  
**Submitted By:** Pat Hall

**Answer: Mandatory**

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1. Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off Index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off Index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List, Catalogue Price, Reseller List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Networking Accessories	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	3COM	8PORT OFFICECONNECT DUAL SPEED 10/100 HUB	3C16753-US	3C16753-US	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 74.56	10%	\$ 66.81
B	ALLIED TELESYN	AT-2000U PNP ETH ISA-AUI BNC RJ45 AUTO	AT-2000UPLUGNPL-001	AT-2000UPLUGNPL-001	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 39.22	10%	\$ 35.14
C	APPLE	AIRPORT EXTREME BASE STATION WIRELESS ACCESS POINT	M8799LL/A	M8799LL/A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 213.40	10%	\$ 191.23
D	BELKIN	11MBPS 802.11B WIRELESS PCI NETWORK INTERFACE ADAPTER CARD (NIC)	F5D6001	F5D6001	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 20.76	10%	\$ 18.60
E	CISCO	CISCO AIRONET 802.11 A/B/G WIRELESS PCI ADAPTOR	AIR-P121AG-A-K9	AIR-P121AG-A-K9	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 169.20	10%	\$ 148.23
F	D-LINK	DI-604 CABLE/DSL ROUTER WITH 4 PORT SWITCH	DI-604	DI-604	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 39.43	10%	\$ 35.33
G	HAWKING TECHNOLOGY	BROADBAND ROUTER WITH 4-PORT 10/100M SWITCH	HBR49	HBR49	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 44.99	10%	\$ 40.22
H	HAYES	HAYES ACCURA V.92 56K SOFT USB HOST-BASED USB EXTERNAL MODEM	H08-15355	H08-15355	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 40.45	10%	\$ 36.24
I	HP	HUB - 4 PORTS - HI-SPEED USB	DG954A	DG954A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 49.20	10%	\$ 38.71
J	IBM	IBM 16/4 TOKEN-RING CARDBUS ADAPTER FOR THINKPAD A20/T20	34L4801	34L4801	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 130.66	10%	\$ 117.07
K	KENSINGTON	KENSINGTON DOME HUB 7-PORT USB 2.0 HUB	39118	39118	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 36.84	10%	\$ 33.01
L	LINKSYS	WIRELESS G CABLE/DSL ROUTER MODEL WRT54GS WITH SPEED BOOSTER	WRT54GS	WRT54GS	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 71.99	10%	\$ 64.50
M	NETGEAR	NETGEAR WG511 802.11G WIRELESS PC CARD	WG511NA	WG511NA	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 47.99	10%	\$ 43.00
N	NETGEAR	FS108 8-PORT 10/100 MBPS FAST ETHERNET SWITCH	FS108	FS108	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 58.44	10%	\$ 47.88
O	POWERDSINE	1-PORT POWER-OVER-LAN HUB, 48V AC	PD-6001/AC	PD-6001/AC	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 37.81	10%	\$ 33.61
P	PROXIM	AP-4000 WIRELESS ACCESS POINT 54MBPS 802.11A/B/G	8670-US2	8670-US2	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 408.61	10%	\$ 366.11
Q	SMC	BARRICADE G 2.4GHZ 54 MBPS WIRELESS CABLE/DSL BROADBAND ROUTER	SMC2804WBR	SMC2804WBR	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 68.99	10%	\$ 61.82
R	SUN	GIGASWIFT ETHERNET UTP NETWORK ADAPTER	X3150A	X3150A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 274.10	10%	\$ 245.65
S	US ROBOTICS	56 K V.92 USB 2.0 EXTERNAL MODEM	USR5693A	USR5693A	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 50.60	10%	\$ 45.52

**PRICING WORKSHEET 6D.Scanner Pricing**

**Bidder Name:**

**Submitted By:**

**Answer - Mandatory**

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. **Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1.** Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List Catalogue Price - Baselet List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Scanners	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	BELL HOWELL	BELL & HOWELL 2020D VRS FLATBED SCANNER (WITH ADF)	010241B	010241B	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 6,964.92	10%	\$ 6,150.70
B	CANON	CANON DR-3080 DUPLEX SCANNER	6899A002AA	6899A002AA	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 2,700.00	10%	\$ 2,419.20
C	CANON	CANON DR-9080C COLOR DUPLEX SCANNER	8926A002AA	8926A002AA	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 6,826.91	10%	\$ 6,116.02
D	EPSON	EPSON EXPRESSION 1640XL FLATBED	1640XL	1640XL	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,209.28	10%	\$ 1,069.50
E	FWJITSU	FWJITSU SCANPARTNER FI-4120C COLOR DUPLEX SCANNER	CG01000-477601	CG01000-477601	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,044.00	10%	\$ 935.42
F	HP	SCANJET 8250 FBSCAN COL-48BIT 4800DPI USB	C9932A#A2L	C9932A#A2L	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 445.20	10%	\$ 396.60
G	KODAK	KODAK DIGITAL SCIENCE 6590C SHEETFED SCANNER	657-0053	657-0053	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 25,093.55	10%	#####
H	KODAK	KODAK DIGITAL SCIENCE 3520D - SHEETFED SCANNER	118-5826	118-5826	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 10,980.00	10%	#####
I	MICROTEK	SCANMAKER 6000 FLATBED SCANNER	1108-03-580002	1108-03-580002	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 85.71	10%	\$ 85.76
J	RICOH	IS100 SCAN TO PRINT-SCANNER 3000 5000 AP2610	402026	402026	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 830.32	10%	\$ 769.95
K	UMAX	POWERLOOK 1120 WITH SILVERFAST AI 6.0	SPKG-20529/P/SPKG-20529	SPKG-20529/P/SPKG-20529	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,235.94	10%	\$ 1,107.40
L	VISIONEER	STROBE XP 460 PDF	SXP4501D-WU	SXP4501D-WU	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 650.23	10%	\$ 582.61

**PRICING WORKSHEET 6E. Power Supply and Protection Pricing**

**Bidder Name:** Newest Packard  
**Submitted By:** Pat Hall

Answer - Mandatory

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. **Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1.** Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off Index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List), Catalogue Price, (Reseller List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	ANTEC	TRUE550 EPS12V 550 WATT	TRUE550 EPS12V	TRUE550 EPS12V	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 107.59	10%	\$ 96.85
B	APC	SMART UPS 5000 RACKMOUNT 5000VA 5 OUTLET 208V LINE-INTERNAL W/SOFTWARE SYMMETRA 12KVA/8.4KW SCALABLE TO 16KVA/11.2KW N+1	SU5000RMT5U	SU5000RMT5U	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 2,398.90	10%	\$ 2,095.56
C	APC	APC SMART-UPS 5000VA RACK MOUNT EXTENDED RUN 5U 208V INPUT/OUTPUT POWERMANAGER 6OUTLET 6FT-CORD 120V 480J	SY12KEX-PD	SY12KEX-PD	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 8,768.92	10%	\$ 8,768.92
D	APC	SMART-UPS 1500VA USB AND SERIAL RM 2U	SU5000RMXL15U	SU5000RMXL15U	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,879.90	10%	\$ 1,504.20
E	APC	SMART UPS 1400VA RM-9U XL 120V	POW6-WHT	POW6-WHT	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 47.48	10%	\$ 42.54
F	APC	SMART UPS 1400VA RM-9U XL 120V	SUA1500RM2U	SUA1500RM2U	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 567.90	10%	\$ 528.84
G	APC	BELKIN F6C120-UNV 6-OUTLET UNIVERSAL UPS UNIT WITH AUTOMATIC VOLTAGE REGULATION	SU1400RMXL3U	SU1400RMXL3U	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 670.91	10%	\$ 601.14
H	BELKIN	BELKIN F6C120-UNV 6-OUTLET UNIVERSAL UPS UNIT WITH AUTOMATIC VOLTAGE REGULATION	F6C120-UNV	F6C120-UNV	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 119.16	10%	\$ 106.77
I	CISCO	CATALYST 6000 2500W AC POWER SUPPLY ENERGIZER BRDBND SURGE-6RCPTL 6FT CORD	WS-CAC-2500W	WS-CAC-2500W	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 2,098.00	10%	\$ 1,878.20
J	ENERGIZER	ENERGIZER BRDBND SURGE-6RCPTL 6FT CORD	ER-S400	ER-S400	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 17.74	10%	\$ 15.90
K	ENLIGHT	ATX 420W, DUAL FAN POWER SUPPLY	EN-6420994	EN-6420994	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 59.55	10%	\$ 55.44
L	FELLOWES	MIGHTY 6 OUTLET SURGE PROTECTOR	99090	99090	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 6.00	10%	\$ 5.98
M	HP	AC POWER SUPPLY	313054-001	313054-001	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 169.40	10%	\$ 169.81
N	HP	UPS R1500 XR 110V RM 1500VA 1340W	204404-001	204404-001	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 852.28	10%	\$ 775.50
O	HP	COMPAQ UPS R3000 XR - UPS - 3000 VA - UPS BATTERY	1921B6-002	1921B6-002	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 1,360.20	10%	\$ 1,218.74
P	LIEBERT	GXT 2000/3000VA RT BATT KIT 96V BATT FOR GXT 2000/3000RT	GXT2-9RTBKIT	GXT2-9RTBKIT	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 309.59	10%	\$ 277.99
Q	STARTECH	480 WATT ATX12V SILENT POWER SUPPLY WITH 12CM FAN AND 20 TO 24 ATX PSU PIN ADAPTER	ATXP0W480HS	ATXP0W480HS	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 74.40	10%	\$ 66.66
R	TOSHIBA	PRIMARY BATTERY PACK 9 CELL	PA3259U-1BR9	PA3259U-1BR9	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 129.54	10%	\$ 116.07
S	TRIIPP LITE	TRIIPP LITE ISOBAR TOUCHMASTER PLUS - SURGE SUPPRESSOR	MT 6PLUS	MT 6PLUS	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 75.66	10%	\$ 67.79
T	TRIIPP LITE	SMARTONLINE 1000VA 2U RACK/TWR 120V UPS 6OUTLET 9-19P DB9 SLOT XL	SU1000RTXL2U	SU1000RTXL2U	eELP (Index Price)	\$ 490.65	10%	\$ 490.68

PRICING WORKSHEET 6F. Expansion Cards And Controller Boards Pricing

Bidder Name: Hewlett-Packard  
 Submitted By: Pat Hink

Answer - Mandatory

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. **Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1.** Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off Index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List Category) Price, Reseller, List	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price	
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	121123	211231	MFG LIST	\$	20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	3COM	3COM 100DESX SRVR PCI	3C995-SX	30995-SX	eELP (Index Price)	\$293.16	10%	\$ 263.84	
B	ADAPTEC	ADAPTEC SCSI CARD 39160	1822300	1822300	eELP (Index Price)	\$218.30	10%	\$ 196.47	
C	ALLIED TELESYN	100MBPS FAST ETHERNET FIBER NETWORK INTERFACE CARD NIC	AT-2701FX/MT-001	AT-2701FX/MT-001	eELP (Index Price)	\$138.78	10%	\$ 124.90	
D	ASUS	ASUS P4C800-E DELUXE MOTHERBOARD	P4C800-E DELUXE	P4C800-E DELUXE	eELP (Index Price)	\$207.77	10%	\$ 187.00	
E	ATI	ALL-IN-WONDER 9090 PRO GRAPHICS CARD	100-713500	100-713500	eELP (Index Price)	\$248.71	10%	\$ 223.84	
F	CREATIVE LABS	CREATIVE LABS SOUNDBLASTER LIVE! 5.1 COMPAQ REMOTE INSIGHT BOARD LIGHTS-OUT EDITION II	70SB006003007	70SB006003007	eELP (Index Price)	\$81.71	10%	\$ 73.54	
G	HP	BATTERY BACKED WRITE CACHE BBWC ENABLER DL360 G2 G3 51+ DL380 G3	227251-001	227251-001	eELP (Index Price)	\$378.60	10%	\$ 340.74	
H	HP	NVIDIA QUADRO4 380XGL ENTRY 3D GRAP	255514-B21	255514-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$134.40	10%	\$ 120.96	
I	HP	BBWC ENABLER 64MB/128MB SMART ARRAY 641 & 642	AA659A	AA659A	eELP (Index Price)	\$93.37	10%	\$ 84.03	
J	HP	HEWLETT PACKARD NV GFRC4MX440/6 64MB VGA FH	291969-B21	291969-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$174.00	10%	\$ 156.60	
K	HP	INTEL PRO/100 M	DD697AV	DD697AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$65.80	10%	\$ 59.22	
L	INTEL	INTEL PRO/100 M	PILA8460M	PILA8460M	eELP (Index Price)	\$39.60	10%	\$ 35.64	
M	JATON	64MB GEFORCE4 MX440 PCI VIDEO CARD	VIDEO-156PCI-64TV	VIDEO-156PCI-64TV	eELP (Index Price)	\$55.14	10%	\$ 49.63	
N	KOFAX	ADRENALINE 850V PCI VIDEO IMAGE ACCELERATOR BOARD	EH-850-2000	EH-850-2000	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,357.89	10%	\$ 1,222.10	
O	LINKSYS	ETHERFAST 10/100 LAN PCI CARD	LNE100TX	LNE100TX	eELP (Index Price)	\$11.75	10%	\$ 10.58	
P	MATROX	G450 32M DDR DUAL HEADS PCI	G45FMDVP32DB	G45FMDVP32DB	eELP (Index Price)	\$106.68	10%	\$ 96.01	
Q	NETGEAR	HA501 WIRELESS CARDBUS ADAPTER	HA501NA	HA501NA	eELP (Index Price)	\$59.94	10%	\$ 53.95	
R	ORINOCO	11B/G PC CARD GOLD WORLD	8470-WD	8470-WD	eELP (Index Price)	\$63.29	10%	\$ 56.96	
S	PNY	PNY GEFORCE FX 5200 128MB DDR AGP GRAPHICS CARD	VCGFX52APB	VCGFX52APB	eELP (Index Price)	\$95.89	10%	\$ 86.30	
T	SUN	DUAL-CHANNEL ULTRA9 SCSI PCI HOST BUS ADAPTER	X6759A	X6759A	eELP (Index Price)	\$530.80	10%	\$ 477.72	

**PRICING WORKSHEET 6G. Large Projector and Display Pricing**

Bidder Name: Hewlett-Packard  
 Submitted By: Pat Hall

Answer - Mandatory

**Instructions - Part 2:** Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provided a discount in Part 1. Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have proposed in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off Index for all ABC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the ABC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an Index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Bidder Part #	Index Name (MFG List Catalogue Price - Reseller List)	Index Price	Discount %	Offer Price
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	123123	231231	MFG LIST	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	3M	S10 MMPROJ 1200LUMEN-SVGA 6.4LB	7892368145	7892368145	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,299.07	10%	\$ 1,169.97
B	BENQ	PB2240 DLP PROJECTOR	PB2240	PB2240	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,796.00	10%	\$ 1,611.72
C	CANON	CANON LV-5210 SVGA VIDEO PROJECTOR	8610A002	8610A002	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,582.06	10%	\$ 1,418.06
D	DELL	Dell 2300MP Projector with 2300 Lumens, XGA Resolution	2300MP1	2300MP1	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,078.00	10%	\$ 966.60
E	EPSON	POWERLITE 790C 2000 ANSI LUMENS; 4.9 LBS.	V11H056020	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
F	HITACHI	CP SX5600W - LCOS PROJECTOR	CP-SX5600W	CP-SX5600W	eELP (Index Price)	\$6,054.00	10%	\$ 5,424.38
G	HP	SB21 DIGITAL PROJECTOR SVGA 1000 LUMENS	L1510A	L1510A	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,405.20	10%	\$ 1,259.06
H	HP	VP6120 DIGITAL PROJECTOR	L1596	L1596	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,584.00	10%	\$ 1,402.06
I	HP	HP XB91 DLP DIGITAL PROJECTOR	L1511	L1511	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,554.00	10%	\$ 1,392.38
J	INFOCUS	INFOCUS LP70+ 1400 LUMENS XGA PROJECTOR	LP70+	NO BID	eELP (Index Price)		0%	NO OFFER
K	MITSUBISHI	XD50U	XD50U	XD50U	eELP (Index Price)	\$2,201.69	10%	\$ 2,053.90
L	NEC	LT 220 DLP 2000 ANSI PROJECTOR	LT220	LT220	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,697.24	10%	\$ 1,520.79
M	OPTOMA	OPTOMA EZPRO 725 1100 LUMENS XGA PROJECTOR	EP725	EP725	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,570.52	10%	\$ 1,407.19
N	SHARP	NOTEVISION PG-A20X LCD PROJECTOR	PGA20X	PGA20X	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,740.47	10%	\$ 1,562.15
O	SONY	VPL-CX6	VPL-CX6	VPL-CX6	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,667.15	10%	\$ 1,493.77
P	TOSHIBA	TLP T60MU LCD PROJECTOR	TLP-T60MU	TLP-T60MU	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,796.56	10%	\$ 1,609.72
Q	VIEWSONIC	PJ400 1500ANSI 600X600	PJ400	PJ400	eELP (Index Price)	\$989.56	10%	\$ 891.13

PRICING WORKSHEET 04: Other Peripherals Pricing

Bidder Name: Bidder Name  
 Submitted By: Submitted By

Answer: Mandatory

Instructions - Part 2: Fill out the yellow shaded areas only. The State of California has provided you with a list of products that represent a sample of items that may be purchased for this segment. The State has also provided you with the specific MFG name, model name and SKU# for each product. Bidders must propose an offer for ALL products from an MFG for which they provide a discount in Part 1. Your discounted price will be calculated automatically from the discount off index you have prepared in Part 1 above for a particular MFG. For Example, if you propose 25% off index for all APC products purchased by state and local agencies in this product segment, your offer for the APC product will reflect the 25% discount off index. Note that you CANNOT provide an index price for a product from a MFG for which you have not offered a discount in Part 1. Responses not adhering to these directions may not be considered.

Product	MFG Name	Model Name/Description	MFG Part #	Supplier Part #	Index Value (RFP 1.41) / (25% Index Price / RFP 1.41)	Index Price	Discount	Net Price
Example	ABC CORP	Memory	I23123	231231	MFG123	\$ 20.00	25%	\$ 15.00
A	3M	REPLACEMENT SOFT CARRY CASE	EP7640CC	EP7640CC	eELP (Index Price)	\$70.06	10%	\$ 62.77
B	ADAPTEC	SCSI EXTERNAL CABLE	1B15700	1B15700	eELP (Index Price)	\$42.74	10%	\$ 38.27
C	AID	AID ATHLON XP 2600 / 2.06 GHZ PROCESSOR	AXDA260BOX	AXDA260BOX	eELP (Index Price)	\$124.94	10%	\$ 111.85
D	APC	10FT CAT5 Crossover Cable EHM5MPL45M	3688FD-10	3688FD-10	eELP (Index Price)	\$5.09	10%	\$ 4.58
E	APPLE	APPLE SWIVEL/TILT STAND FOR / EMAC	MB7403A	MB7403A	eELP (Index Price)	\$55.05	10%	\$ 49.55
F	BELKN	6 PS/2 6-PIN MINI ON KEYBOARD/MOUSE EXTENSION CABLE	F2N035-06	F2N035-06	eELP (Index Price)	\$2.51	10%	\$ 2.10
G	BLACKBOX	IEEE 1284 TO USB PRINTER CABLE BRIDGE	EQN500-0005	EQN500-0005	eELP (Index Price)	\$58.05	10%	\$ 51.99
H	CABLES 2 GO	6FT B/D PRECISION VIDEO CABLE	27934	27934	eELP (Index Price)	\$33.20	10%	\$ 30.20
I	CAHON	BU-10 BLUETOOTH ADAPTER	9434A2X	9434A2X	eELP (Index Price)	\$77.92	10%	\$ 69.99
J	CASIO	QV-FR2 5 MEGA PIXEL DIGITAL CAMERA	QV-FR2	QV-FR2	eELP (Index Price)	\$202.55	10%	\$ 182.57
K	DELL	USB CRADLE FOR DELL AXIM X3 HANDHELD, DOES NOT INCLUDE AC ADAPTER	D2167	D2167	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,474.80	10%	\$ 1,321.42
L	FELLOWES	BODY GLOVE ZIPPED CASE	DSU1HZ-6BP	DSU1HZ-6BP	eELP (Index Price)	\$12.19	10%	\$ 11.18
M	FLUJI	PC CARD ADAPTER DUAL MEDIA / FOR ND-PICTURE CARD AND SMARTMEDIA	DPC-AD	DPC-AD	eELP (Index Price)	\$23.59	10%	\$ 21.51
N	HP	HP ADVANCED PORT REPLICATOR	DC3668ABA	DC3668ABA	eELP (Index Price)	\$275.48	10%	\$ 246.81
O	HP	HP PAQ POCKET PC H210 64MB PDA	FA1034B2Q	FA1034B2Q	eELP (Index Price)	\$505.90	10%	\$ 448.81
P	HP	HP PAQ POCKET PC H510 64MB PDA	FA1034B2Q	FA1034B2Q	eELP (Index Price)	\$487.89	10%	\$ 418.97
Q	HP	XEON MP X2 60-2MB L3 PROCESSOR OPTION KIT	331004-B21	331004-B21	eELP (Index Price)	\$5,092.81	10%	\$ 4,579.42
R	HP	MOBILE INTEL PENTIUM 4 3.06GHZ	DF548AV	DF548AV	eELP (Index Price)	\$263.03	10%	\$ 236.59
S	HP	INTEL PENTIUM 4 3.2GHZ/800 HT	DE3814V	DE3814V	eELP (Index Price)	\$416.58	10%	\$ 373.28
T	BM	BM THINKPAD W/ON CARRYING CASE MODEL	10K0207	10K0207	eELP (Index Price)	\$46.16	10%	\$ 41.57
U	BM	ULTRASM 72W AC ADAPTER FOR ALL THINKPAD A, T, R, & X SERIES	02K6629	02K6629	eELP (Index Price)	\$49.96	10%	\$ 44.99
V	INTEL	INTEL PENTIUM M 4 3.20GHZ HT PRESOTT 1MB 800FS S 478 RETAIL BOX	BX9548P0200CE	BX9548P0200CE	eELP (Index Price)	\$254.40	10%	\$ 227.54
W	KODAK	10 FT PS/2 MINI LK™ KVM CABLE	Q2L1003P	Q2L1003P	eELP (Index Price)	\$13.69	10%	\$ 12.64
X	JVC	FLOPPY DSK ADAPTER FOR SMARTMEDIA	CUTFS40J	CUTFS40J	eELP (Index Price)	\$55.65	10%	\$ 49.99
Y	KENNINGTON	KENNINGTON MICRO SAVER SECURITY CABLE	6409RE	6409RE	eELP (Index Price)	\$37.08	10%	\$ 33.22
Z	KEYTRON	104 KEY KEYBOARD-BLK	E09601 QUS2018-C	E09601 QUS2018-C	eELP (Index Price)	\$23.17	10%	\$ 20.76
AA	KODAK	KODAK PRINTER CORD 500 TRAVEL BAG	1288933	1288933	eELP (Index Price)	\$25.99	10%	\$ 23.55
AB	LABTEC	LABTEC MINI WIRELESS OPTICAL MOUSE	911511-0403	911511-0403	eELP (Index Price)	\$20.75	10%	\$ 18.69
AC	LOGITECH	INTERNET NAVIGATOR KEYBOARD LOW PROFILE ZEPH DEGREE TLT	967233-0403	967233-0403	eELP (Index Price)	\$25.28	10%	\$ 22.62
AD	MEMOPH	SCHOLIPRO MOUSE RP OFFICE	3302294	3302294	eELP (Index Price)	\$29.18	10%	\$ 27.31
AE	MICROSOFT	WIRELESS ERGONOMIC MOUSE	1XQ3-0002	1XQ3-0002	eELP (Index Price)	\$28.60	10%	\$ 25.64
AF	MINOLTA	INTERNAL DE HARD DRIVE BRACKET	2500450-100	2500450-100	eELP (Index Price)	\$48.44	10%	\$ 43.40
AG	NIKON	DIGITAL CAMERA COOLPIX 7600	25528	25528	eELP (Index Price)	\$367.42	10%	\$ 333.54
AH	OLYMPUS	OLYMPUS STYLUS 300 DIGITAL CAMERA	225370	225370	eELP (Index Price)	\$111.25	10%	\$ 100.28
AJ	PALM	MICROSD/SDIO USB BLUETOOTH/PDA	1056NA	1056NA	eELP (Index Price)	\$855.64	10%	\$ 769.52
AJ	PANASONIC	PANASONIC DESK STAND	TV-ST05K	TV-ST05K	eELP (Index Price)	\$71.99	10%	\$ 64.50
AK	SHARP	DOCKING STATION FOR BLR900 / ZALRUS PDA	CEST10	CEST10	eELP (Index Price)	\$57.37	10%	\$ 51.40
AL	SONY	SONY DSC-F717 CYBER-SHOT® DIGITAL CAMERA	DSC-F717	DSC-F717	eELP (Index Price)	\$375.60	10%	\$ 336.00
AM	SONY	SNC-229N NETWORK COLOR CAMERA	SNC-220N	SNC-220N	eELP (Index Price)	\$1,047.36	10%	\$ 940.43
AN	STARTECH	15 FT IEEE 1394 FIREWIRE CABLE 6-6 MM	1394_15	1394_15	eELP (Index Price)	\$33.69	10%	\$ 30.15
AP	TARGUS	TARGUS LAPPAC 5 NO TEBBOOK CARRYING CASE	CL55	CL55	eELP (Index Price)	\$40.87	10%	\$ 36.78
AC	TOSHIBA	ADVANCED PORT REPLICATOR II	PA3382J2PPP	PA3382J2PPP	eELP (Index Price)	\$97.51	10%	\$ 87.37
AR	TRIPLEITE	TRIPLEITE 6 USB GOLD EXT CABLE AA	U004-006	U004-006	eELP (Index Price)	\$3.60	10%	\$ 3.14
AS	VIEWSONIC	POCKET PC V68	PPCV68	PPCV68	eELP (Index Price)	\$355.20	10%	\$ 318.28
AT	XEROX	XEROX N2125 MAINTENANCE KIT	106R032B	106R032B	eELP (Index Price)	\$271.60	10%	\$ 243.46