COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX TITLE (CODE)

AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HEALTH PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT [OSHPD 07/07] CCR, TITLE 24, PART 11 (2007 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE)
LEGEND:
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s Actions: Amendments, if indicated by agency:
(CAC)s: A = Accepted S = Statutory
ACCESS = Accessihility AA = Approve as amended N = New
BFO = Building, Fire & Other AS = Approve as submitted Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):
HF = Health Facilities D = Disapprove GREEN = uncontested items
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy FS =Further Study YELLOW = challenged items
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces WI/D = Withdrawn by agency SALMON = W/D, no action required

GB = Green Building

GB CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION
Adopt chapter as shown below

CBSC
2 e CAC: Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section ETE- (AS, AA, RET OISR LY S Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-1 | 101.1 N AS A CAC: Coordinate this chapter with other
Chapters 1 in the other parts of Title 24.

OSHPD 7/07-2 | 101.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-3 | 101.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-4 | 101.3.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-5 | 101.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-6 | 101.5 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-7 | 101.5.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-8 | 101.5.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-9 | 101.5.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-10 | 101.5.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-11 | 101.5.5 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-12 | 101.5.6 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-13 | 101.6 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-14 | 101.6.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-15 | 101.6.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-16 | 101.6.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-17 | 101.7 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-18 | 101.7.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-19 | 101.8 N AS A

OSHPD 07/07 10f13 Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code




OSHPD 7/07-20 | 101.9 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-21 | 101.10 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-22 | 101.11 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-23 | 102.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-24 | 102.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-25 | 102.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-26 | 106.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-27 | 106.1.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-28 | 106.1.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-29 | 106.1.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-30 | 106.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-31 | 106.2.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-32 | 106.2.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-33 | 106.2.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-34 | 106.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-35 | 106.3.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-36 | 106.3.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-37 | 106.3.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-38 | 106.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-39 | 106.4.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-40 | 106.4.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-41 | 106.4.3 N AS A
CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt chapter as shown below
[tem Number Code Section amggs' (ADS,F,gA, Rf:%%g € 45(fsatyA(i(,)nslmFesn)ts Annotations ,&SD
(S.N) 'FS) 1 (A D, WD) al
OSHPD 7/07-42 | 201.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-43 | 201.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-44 | 201.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-45 | 201.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-46 | 202 Definitions N AS A
AUTOMATIC
OSHPD 7/07-47 | Not Used N A

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

20f13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




OSHPD 7/07-48

202 Definitions
BUILDING
ENVELOPE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-49

202 Definitions
CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-50

202 Definitions
CALIFORNIA

ELECTRICAL

CODE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-51

202 Definitions
CALIFORNIA
ENERGY CODE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-52

202 Definitions
CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL
CODE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-53

202 Definitions
CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING
CODE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-54

202 Definitions
CONDITIONED
SPACE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-55

202 Definitions
COOLING
EQUIPMENT

AS

OSHPD 7/07-56

202 Definitions
ENERGY
COMMISSION

AS

OSHPD 7/07-57

202 Definitions
ENFORCING
AGENCY

AS

OSHPD 7/07-58

202 Definitions
GREEN
BUILDING

FS

Criteria 4, 6

OSHPD coordinated a modified definition with
the Dept. of Housing & Community Dev.
(HCD)

OSHPD 7/07-59

202 Definitions
INFILTRATION

AS

OSHPD 7/07-60

202 Definitions
KITCHEN

AS

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

30f13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




OSHPD 7/07-61 | 202 Definitions N AS A
LOW-RISE
RESIDENTIAL
BUILDING
OSHPD 7/07-62 | 202 Definitions N AS A
OUTDOOR AIR
OSHPD 7/07-63 | 202 Definitions N AS A
RESIDENTIAL
BUILDING
OSHPD 7/07-64 | 202 Definitions N AS A
VAPOR
BARRIER
CHAPTER 3 GREEN BUILDING
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments eler
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-65 | 301.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-66 | 302.1 N AS A
CHAPTER 4 PLANNING AND DESIGN
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments eler
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-67 | 401.1 N
OSHPD 7/07-68 | 402.1 Definitions N W/D Typical, OSHPD withdrew for further study for
ALBEDO the next code adoption cycle.
OSHPD 7/07-69 | 402.1 Definitions N AS A OSHPD moved this definition to Appendix A.
BIORETENTION
OSHPD 7/07-70 | 402.1 Definitions N W/D
BROWNFIELD
SITE
OSHPD 7/07-71 | 402.1 Definitions N - W/D

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

4 of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




DEVELOPMENT
FOOTPRINT
OSHPD 7/07-72 | 402.1 Definitions N - WID
GREENFIELDS
OSHPD 7/07-73 | 402.1 Definitions N - WID
GREYFIELD
SITE
OSHPD 7/07-74 | 402.1 Definitions N - WID
INFILL AREAS
OSHPD 7/07-75 | 402.1 Definitions N - WID
NATIVE/ADAPT-
ED PLANTS
OSHPD 7/07-75A| 402.1 Definitions See Item 96 below. OSHPD adopted HCD's
WATTLES provisions for SWPPPs in Chapter 4.
OSHPD 7/07-76 | 403.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-77 | 403.2.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-78 | 403.2.2 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-79 | 403.3 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-80 | 403.4 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-81 | 403.4.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-82 | 403.5 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-83 | 404.1 N FS A CAC: Move to an appendix chapter, typical of
FS in Chapter 4; Criteria 4, 6. Coordinate with
HCD's provisions for SWPPPs.
OSHPD 7/07-84 | 404.2.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-85 | 404.2.1.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-86 | 404.2.1.2 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-87 | 404.2.2 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-88 | 404.2.3 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-89 | 404.3.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-90 | 404.3.2 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-91 | 404.3.3 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-92 | 404.4 N - WID
BSC 2/07-104A | 405.1 N FS A OSHPD moved to Appendix A.
BSC 2/07-105A | 405.2 N FS A OSHPD moved to Appendix A.
OSHPD 7/07-93 | 406.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-94 | 406.2 N A A See Item 75A above. OSHPD adopted HCD's
provisions for SWPPPs in Chapter 4.
OSHPD 7/07-95 | 406.3 N FS A OSHPD modified subsections in §406 and
moved them to Appendix A.
OSHPD 7/07-96 | 406.3.1 N FS A
OSHPD 07/07 50f13 Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code



OSHPD 7/07-97 | 406.3.2 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-98 | 406.3.3 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-99 | 406.4 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-100 | 406.5 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-101 | 406.5.1 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-102 | 406.5.2 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-103 | 406.5.2.1 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-104 | 406.5.2.2 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-105| 406.5.2.3 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-106 | 406.6 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-107 | 406.6.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-108 | 406.7 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-109 | 406.7.1 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-110| 406.7.2 N - WID
OSHPD 7/07-111| 406.7.3 N - WID
CHAPTER 5 ENERGY EFFICIENCY
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of CAC: Agency :B.SC
: ction
ltem Number Code Section | amend- (AS, AA, RESTDOITED Dy COTIEE Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-112 | 501.1 N AA A No criteria cited. Language clarified.
OSHPD 7/07-113 | 502.1 Definitions N AS A
BUILDING
COMMISSION-
ING
OSHPD 7/07-114 | 502.1 Definitions N AS A
ENERGY STAR
OSHPD 7/07-115 | 502.1 Definitions N AS A
DEMAND
RESPONSE
AUTOMATION
INTERNET
SOFTWARE
CLIENT
OSHPD 7/07-116 | 502.1 Definitions N AS A
GEOTHERMAL
OSHPD 7/07-117 | 502.1 Definitions N AS A

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

6 0of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




PROCESS
OSHPD 7/07-117A| 502.1 Definitions A
TIME
DEPENDENT
VALUATION
(TDV) ENERGY
OSHPD 7/07-118 | 504.1 N AS A CAC: Recommend 31 party certification for
prescriptive measures §8504.1 — 504.4.6.
OSHPD complied.
OSHPD 7/07-119 | 504.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-120 | 504.2.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-121 | 504.2.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-122 | 504.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-123 | 504.4.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-124 | 504.4.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-125 | 504.4.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-127A| 504.4.4 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-128 | 504.4.5 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-129 | 504.4.5.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-130 | 504.4.5.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-131 | 504.4.6 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-132 | 504.5 N FS A CAC: Criteria 4, 6. Agency may resubmit for
45-day comment period, typical FS action.
BSC clarified shading requirements.
OSHPD 7/07-133 | 505 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-134 | 506.1 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-135 | 506.1.1 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-136 | 507 N AS WiD
OSHPD 7/07-137 | 508 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-138 | 509 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-139 | 510 N AS WiD
OSHPD 7/07-140 | 511.1 N FS WID
OSHPD 7/07-141 | 511.1.1 N FS WID
OSHPD 7/07-142 | 511.1.2 N FS WID
OSHPD 7/07-143 | 511.2 N FS WID
OSHPD 7/07-144 | Not used
OSHPD 7/07-145 | Not used

CHAPTER 7 MATERIAL CONSERVATION AND RESOURCE EFFICIENCY
Adopt chapter as shown below

OSHPD 07/07 7 of 13
Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008



[tem Number

Code Section

Type of
amend-
ment
(SN)

CAC:
(AS, AA,
D, FS)

Agency
Response
to CAC
(A, D, WID)

45-Day Comments
(AS, AA, D, FS)

Annotations

CBSC
Action
(AS,
AA, D,
FS)

OSHPD 7/07-146

701.1

AS

A

CAC: Recommended minor changes, Criteria
4 & 6. OSHPD modified language.

OSHPD 7/07-146A

702.1 Definitions
EMBODIED
ENERGY

OSHPD added definition at recommendation

of CAC.

OSHPD 7/07-146B

702.1 Definitions
LIFE CYCLE
ASSESSMENT

OSHPD added definition at recommendation

of CAC.

OSHPD 7/07-147

702.1 Definitions
OVE

AS

OSHPD 7/07-148

702.1 Definitions
POST-
CONSUMER
CONTENT

AS

OSHPD 7/07-149

702.1 Definitions
PRE-CONSUMER
CONTENT

AS

OSHPD 7/07-150

702.1 Definitions
RECYCLED
CONTENT

AS

OSHPD 7/07-151

702.1 Definitions
RECYCLED
CONTENT
VALUE (RCV)

OSHPD 7/07-152

705.1

=

Criteria 4, 6; §8705.1 — 705.10. OSHPD
modified language at recommendation of

CAC.

OSHPD 7/07-153

705.2

OSHPD 7/07-154

705.3

OSHPD 7/07-155

7054

OSHPD 7/07-156

See Item 155

OSHPD 7/07-157

See Item 155

OSHPD 7/07-158

705.5

OSHPD 7/07-159

See ltem 158

OSHPD 7/07-160

See ltem 158

OSHPD 7/07-161

See ltem 158

Z|Z|1Z2|1Z22|12(2|2|2

ZEEEEEEEEE

> > > >

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix

2007 Green Building Standards Code

8 0of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




OSHPD 7/07-162 | 706.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-163 | 706.1.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-164 | 706.1.2 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-165 | 706.1.3 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-166 | 706.2 N AS A CAC: Coordinate documentation
requirements throughout the document
OSHPD 7/07-167 | 707.1 N AA WID Criterion 1, 88701 - 702.2.3
OSHPD 7/07-168 | 707.2 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-169 | 707.2.1 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-170 | #6%2:2 N AA WID
OSHPD 7/07-171 | 707.2.32 N AA A Renumbered
OSHPD 7/07-172 | 708.1 N AA A Criteria 4, 6; §8708.1 — 708.4. OSHPD
modified language.
OSHPD 7/07-173 | 708.2 N AA WID
OSHPD 7/07-174 | 708.3 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-175 | 708.4 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-176 | 709.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-177 | #09:+:1 N AS WID
OSHPD 7/07-178 | 709.1.21 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-179 | 709.1.32 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-180 | 710.1 N AA A Criteria 4, 6 for §710.2 for HCD, taken in one
action with §710.1
OSHPD 7/07-181 | 710.1.1 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-182 | 710.2 N AA WID
CHAPTER 8 ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of CAC: Agency EBSC
: ction
Item Number Code Section | 2mend- (AS, AA, RET OISR LY S Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
S, N) * (A, D, W/D) FS)
OSHPD 7/07-183 | 801.1 N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-183A| 802.1Definition Criteria 4, 6; §802.1. Add definition for MERV.
AGRIFIBER OSHPD also separated definitions of
PRODUCTS composite wood and agrifiber products.
OSHPD 7/07-184 | 802.1 Definitions N AA A
COMPOSITE
WOOD AND

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix

2007 Green Building Standards Code

90f 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




AGRIFIBER
PROBUCTS

OSHPD 7/07-185

802.1 Definitions
HVAC UNITS,
SMALL

OSHPD 7/07-186

802.1 Definitions
INTERIOR,
BUILDING

OSHPD 7/07-186A

802.1 Definitions
MERV

BSC added definition at recommendation of
CAC.

OSHPD 7/07-187

802.1 Definitions
MULTI-
OCCUPANT
SPACES

OSHPD 7/07-188

802.1 Definitions
SINGLE
OCCUPANT
SPACES

OSHPD 7/07-189

802.1 Definitions
VOC

=

OSHPD 7/07-190

804.1

Tn
w

WD

CAC: Criteria 4, 6. Agency may resubmit for
45-day comment period, typical FS action

OSHPD 7/07-191

804.1.2

n
9p]

WID

OSHPD 7/07-192

804.1.3

n
9p]

WID

OSHPD 7/07-193

804.2

n
w

WID

OSHPD 7/07-194

804.3

WID

CAC: Editorial changes

OSHPD 7/07-195

804.4

2122|122

No criteria cited; CAC single action for
§8804.4-804.7.2

OSHPD 7/07-196

804.4.1

OSHPD 7/07-197

Table 804.4.1

OSHPD 7/07-198

804.4.2

OSHPD 7/07-199

Table 804.4.2

OSHPD 7/07-200

804.4.3

OSHPD 7/07-201

804.4.3.1

OSHPD 7/07-202

804.4.3.2

OSHPD 7/07-203

804.4.4

22222222

ZEZEEFEE EG

>\ > > > >

OSHPD modified to coordinate with CARB
recent regulations for composite wood
products.

OSHPD 7/07-204

804.4.4.1

OSHPD 7/07-205

804.4.4.2

=|E

> (>

OSHPD 7/07-205A

804.4.4.3

OSHPD 7/07-205B

804.4.4.4

Z|IZ2 22

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix

2007 Green Building Standards Code

10 of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




OSHPD 7/07-205C| Table 804.4.4 N
OSHPD 7/07-206 | 804.4.5 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-207 | 804.4.6 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-208 | 804.4.7 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-209 | 804.5 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-210 | 804.5.1 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-211 | 804.7 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-212 | 804.7.1 N AA W/D
OSHPD 7/07-213 | 805.1 N AA A
OSHPD 7/07-214 | 805.2 N AA W/D Crit. 486
OSHPD 7/07-215 | 805.2.1 N AA W/D Crit. 486
OSHPD 7/07-216 | 805.3 N FS W/D
OSHPD 7/07-217 | 807.5 N FS A Criteria 4, 6; 88807.5 —807.5.2
OSHPD 7/07-218 | 807.5.1 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-219 | 807.5.2 N FS A
OSHPD 7/07-220 | 808 N Section reserved for future standards; no
action by CAC.
CHAPTER 9 REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of CAC: Agency XBSC
: ction
Item Number Code Section | 2mend- (AS, AA, NEETEIIED Sy S Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-221 | 901.1 N AS A CAC: Add references for IAPMO and NFPA
and include websites.
OSHPD 7/07-222 | AAMA N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-223 | ANSI N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-224 | ARI N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-225 | ASHRAE N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-226 | ASME N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-227 | ASTM N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-228 | CSA N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-229 | CTI N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-230 | DOE N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-231 | HI N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-231A| IAPMO OSHPD added reference at recommendation
of CAC.
OSHPD 07/07 11 of 13 Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code



OSHPD 7/07-232 | ICC N AS
OSHPD 7/07-232A| NFPA OSHPD added reference at recommendation
of CAC.
OSHPD 7/07-233 | NFRC N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-234 | SMACNA N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-235 | UL N AS A
OSHPD 7/07-236 | WDMA N AS A
CHAPTER 10 INSTALLER AND THIRD PARTY QUALIFICATIONS
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of CAC: Agency XB.SC
: ction
ltem Number Code Section B (AS, AA, NEETEIIED Sy ST Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, N) ’ (A, D, WID) FS)
OSHPD 7/07-237| 1001 N AS A Section reserved for future standards
OSHPD 7/07-238 | 1002 N AS A Section reserved for future standards
OSHPD 7/07-239| 1003 N AS A Section reserved for future standards
CHAPTER 11 APPLICATION CHECKLISTS AND WORKSHEETS
Adopt chapter as shown below
Type of CAC: Agency XB.SC
: ction
ltem Number Code Section B (AS, AA, NEETEIIED Sy ST Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
OSHPD 7/07-240 | APPLICATION N CAC: Coordinate with the body of the
CHECKLIST document for 45-day comment period.
(AC-OSHPD)

APPENDIX A COMMENTARY OF ADDITIONAL DESIGN CONSIDERATIONS
Adopt chapter as shown below

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

12 of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




[tem Number

Code Section

Type of
AAend-
ment
(S.N)

CAC:
(AS, AA,
D, FS)

Agency
Response
to CAC
(A, D, W/D)

45-Day Comments
(AS, AA, D, FS)

Annotations

CBSC
Action
(AS,
AA, D,
FS)

OSHPD 7/07-241

A101.1

=

OSHPD 7/07-242

A201.1

OSHPD 7/07-243

A301.1

OSHPD 7/07-244

A401.1

OSHPD 7/07-245

A402.1 Definitions
BIORETENTION

Z|IZ|1Z2|=2

CAC: Move §8in Ch. 4 to Appendix. OSHPD
complied.

OSHPD 7/07-246

A402.1 Definitions
LOW EMITTING &
FUEL EFFICIENT
VEHICLES

OSHPD added definition at recommendation
of CAC.

OSHPD 7/07-247

A403

Section reserved for future standards

OSHPD 7/07-248

A404

Section reserved for future standards

OSHPD 7/07-249

A405.1.1

OSHPD 7/07-250

A405.1.2

OSHPD 7/07-251

A405.1.3

OSHPD 7/07-252

A406.1.3

OSHPD 7/07-253

A406.1.3.1

OSHPD 7/07-254

A406.1.3.2

OSHPD 7/07-255

A406.1.3.3

OSHPD 7/07-256

A406.1.4

OSHPD 7/07-257

A406.1.5

OSHPD 7/07-258

A406.1.5.1

Z|IZ|1Z|Z2|12|1Z2|12|12|1Z2|1Z2(|=2

CAC recommended clarification of required
parking, and OSHPD modified language.

OSHPD 7/07-259

Table A406.1.5.1

OSHPD 7/07-260

A406.15.1.1

OSHPD 7/07-261

A406.1.5.1.2

OSHPD 7/07-262

A406.1.5.2

OSHPD 7/07-263

A406.1.5.2.1

OSHPD 7/07-264

Table A406.1.5.2

OSHPD 7/07-265

A406.1.6

OSHPD 7/07-266

A406.1.6.1

Z|IZ|1Z2Z22(2|2|2

OSHPD 07/07

Commission Action Matrix
2007 Green Building Standards Code

13 of 13

Rev. February 13 & 14, 2008




