STATE OF CALIFORNIA - STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

March 2, 2011

Michael Despain, Deputy Chief/Fire Marshal
Fire Prevention and Investigation Division
City of Fresno

911 H Street

Fresno, CA 93721-2510

Dear Mr. Despain:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on January 10, 2011 of the City of Fresno submittal
pertaining to Ordinance No. 2010-48 with findings and is acceptable for filing. Your
filing attests to your understanding that according to Health and Safety Code Section
17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building Standards Code shall
become effective or operative for any purpose until the finding and the modification or
change have been filed with the California Building Standards Commission (the
Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

C rique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings



g ESy Micheal Despain
: & Deputy Chief/Fire Marshal

Fire Prevention and Investigation Division
911 H Street

Fresno, California 93721-2510

(5659) 621-4181 FAX (559) 498-4323
www.fresno.gov

IR®

January 6, 2011

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park
Sacramento CA 95833-2936

RE: CITY OF FRESNO LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THE 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE

Dear Commission:

Enclosed with this correspondence is Ordinance Bill No. B-46 which adopted the
necessary Finding to modify the 2010 California Fire Code to include local amendments
modifying building standards. The actual local amendments related to building standards
are located in tabbed Section 1 of the Ordinance commencing on page 13 of the
Ordinance and have been highlighted for reference. The Finding is contained in tabbed
Section 2 of the Ordinance Bill. This Bill will be codified as Fresno Municipal Code, Article
10, Chapter 5.

The other local amendments are related to sections of the California Fire Code
addressing administrative and procedural matters which do not require the Finding related
to local climatic, topographical and geological conditions.

The Fresno City Council introduced this Ordinance Bill at its meeting on November 18,
2010 and then adopted the Ordinance Bill at its meeting on December 2, 2010 As such
this Ordinance is scheduled to go into effect on or about January 3, 2011

questions, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned.

Sincerely,

Wm________
Micheal Despain
Deputy Chief/Fire Marshal

MD:BB:amg
Enclosure

“To protect and put service above all else.”



Erreas:
W ERE==25="S REPORT TO THE GITYCOUNCIL | AGENDA ITEM NO.
COUNCIL MEETING 11-18-10

APPROVED BY

N mber 18, 2010 REPARTMENT DIRECTOR % - "%
ove J 9% 1%

CITY MANAGER

FROM: JOEL L. ARANAZ, Fire Chief
Fire Department

SUBJECT:  INTRODUCTION OF AN ORDINANCE BILL REPEALING AND REENACTING FIRE AND
LIFE SAFETY REGULATIONS IN THE FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE

RECOMMENDATIONS
It is recommended Council:

1. Adopt the finding that this project is not subject to the requirements of the California
Environmental Quality Act pursuant to CEQA Guidelines, Section 16081(b)(3) as there is clearly
no possibility the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code or amendments may have a
significant adverse effect on the environment.

2. Consider and adopt the attached resolution making express findings that modifications or
changes to the 2010 California Fire Code are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions.

3. Introduce an Ordinance Bill incorporating and adopting express findings of necessity related to
local climatic, topographical, and geological conditions, which make the City’s amendments to
the California Mechanical Code reasonably necessary, repealing Article 10 of Chapter 5, and
adding Article 10 to Chapter 5 of the Fresno Municipal Code relating to fire and life safety

regulations.
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Every three years the California Building Standards Code is reviewed and modified, where applicable, and
adopted by the California Building Standards Commission. On January 12, 2010, the Commission voted to
adopt the 2010 edition of the Code. The California Fire Code will go into effect on January 1, 2011, regardless
whether the City formally adopts it. The City of Fresno Municipal Code contains these standards, which are
adopted or medified as necessary to ensure the safety of the community. Staff is introducing the attached
Resolution and Ordinance to be considered for adoption on December 2, 2010.

BACKGROUND

The 2010 California Building Standards Codes incorporates the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code, as
amended with necessary California amendments. The 2010 California Building Standards Code will become
effective on January 1, 2011, and is mandated by the California Building Standards Commission for statewide

adoption and enforcement,

The City of Fresno has the authority to make necessary modifications to the State Code. Modifications that are
administrative in nature do not require express findings, and summary of proposed administrative amendments




Report to City Council

Introduction of an Ordinance Bill Repealing and Reenacting Fire and Life
Safety Regulations in the Fresno Municipal Code

November 18, 2010

Page 2

to the 2010 California Fire Code is attached to this Staff Report. However, non-administrative modifications to
the California Fire Code must be based upon express findings of necessity relating to refating to local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions.

FINDINGS REGARDING LOCAL CLIMATIC, TOPOGRAPHICAL, AND GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS

The express findings relating to local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions, including an analysis of
the modifications, may be found in the proposed Resolution and Ordinance. The following is a brief summary
of the local climatic, topographical, and geological conditions, which make the local amendments to the
California Fire Code reasonably necessary, inciuding extreme temperatures, limited water supply and
pressure, poor air quality and sunny days, and lower density development facilitated by local topography.

CLIMACTIC CONDITIONS — EXTREME TEMPERATURES

As documented in the 2025 Fresno General Plan' and the Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130 for
the General Plan, during the summer months the City of Fresno experiences periods of what can only be
described as extreme heat. For example, Exhibit 1 to the attached Resolution is a chart setting forth the high
temperatures in Fresno, San Francisco, and San Diego for each day from July 1, 2008, through July 31, 2008,
as reported by the National Weather Service. During this approximately 31-day period, the average high
temperature in Fresno was 103.4 degrees, the average high temperature in San Diego was 81.2 degrees, and
the average high temperature in San Francisco was 68.8 degrees. Furthermore, during this 31-day period, the
average temperature in Fresno was 87.8 degrees, the average temperature in San Diego was 76.3 degrees,
and the average temperature San Francisco was 61.7 degrees. Finally, during this 31-day period Fresno
experienced 20 days where the maximum temperature exceeded 100 degrees, while neither San Diego nor
San Francisco experienced such temperatures at any time during the 31-day period. Though Health & Safety
Code Section 179858.7 does not require the local conditions to be unique to a particular jurisdiction, the
temperature chart demonstrates the temperatures experienced in Fresno are extreme as compared to
temperatures experienced in other parts of California.

Due to the extreme heat Fresno experiences during the summer months, Fresno firefighters responding to fires
and other incidents requiring the evacuation of a building are regularly exposed to temperatures in excess of
105 degrees, when accounting for their protective gear, exposing them to the probability of heat cramps, heat
exhaustion, and possibly heat stroke.

GEOLOGICAL — LIMITED WATER SUPPLY AND WATER PRESSURE

The Fresno Metropolitan area is arid area, which receives an average of 10 to 12 inches of precipitation per
year occurring primarily in the winter months. Furthermore, the Fresno City Metropolitan Area relies primarily
on groundwater for its municipal water supply. The underground aquifer is in a state of overdraft estimated at
approximately 10,000-acre feet per year. Finally, local rainfall alone, even if fully captured, would meet only 20
percent of the Fresno Metropolitan Area's water needs.

""The 2025 Fresno General Plan at p. 166 states, “Fire Hazards. Fresna's high summer temperatures, intense sunlight, and low rainfall potentiate fires
by drying and pre-heating combustible material and by fostering spontaneous combustion of flammable material. Fresno's estimated maximum wind
speed (used to design structures) is 70 mph, which could fan blazes to a high intensity.”

2 Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130 at p. states, ” The climate of the FMA {Fresno Metropolitan Area} is characterized by hot, dry summers
... Temperatures in the FMA range from a mean monthly maximum of 97.9 {degrees} F in July to a mean monthly minimum of 36.3 [degrees] F in

December.




Repott to City Council

Introduction of an Ordinance Bill Repealing and Reenacting Fire and Life
Safety Regulations in the Fresno Municipal Code

November 18, 2010

Page 3

CLIMATIC/TOPOGRAPHICAL ~ POOR AIR_QUALITY CAUSED BY TQPOGRAPHY OF SAN JOAQUIN
VALLEY AIR BASIN, LARGE NUMBER OF SUNNY DAYS AND INVERSIONS THAT FORM DURING
WINTER MONTHS

As a result of the San Joaquin Valley's climate and topography, the San Joaquin Valley Air Basin (SJVAP) is
predisposed to poor air quality. High mountain ranges surrounding the Valley frequently create air layer
inversions, which prevent mixing of air masses. The large number of sunny days per year, and high
temperatures in the summer, favor the formation of ozone. The area is so sunny that the City of Fresno was
ranked the second highest major California city for sunshine, with an estimated 79 percent annual average of
possible sunshine for more than a 40-year period.” In the winter, inversions form that often trap particulate

matter.”

The Federal EPA and California Air Resources Board have classified the San Joaguin Valley Air Basin as
severe non-attainment for Ozone and serious non-attainment (federal) non-attainment (state) for PM10.
Ozone is formed by a complex series of chemical reactions between reactive organic gases (ROG), oxides of
nitrogen and sunlight. PM,, is suspended particulate matter that is less than 10 microns in size. Given its
small size, PMy, can remain airborne for long periods and can be inhaled, pass through the respiratory system,
and lodge in the lungs. In general, non-attainment means the federal standard has been exceeded more than

twice per year.®

Smoke is composed primarily of carbon dioxide, water vapor, carbon monoxide, particulate matter,
hydrocarbons, and other organic chemicals, nitrogen oxides, trace minerals, and several thousand other
compounds. Particulate matter is the principal pollutant of concern from some for the relatively short-term
exposures (hours to weeks) typically experienced by the public, Particulate matter in wood smoke has a size
range near the wavelength of visible light (.4-7 micrometers). Because these particles can be inhaled into the
deepest recesses of the lungs, they are thought to represent a greater health concern than larger particles.
Another pollutant of concern during some events is carbon monoxide.® The San Joaquin Valley Air Poliution
Control District states, "Emissions from buming include fine particulate, hydrocarbons, oxides of nitrogen,
oxides of sulfur, carbon monoxide, and toxic air contaminants that contribute to our air quality problems.”

TOPOGRAPHICAL — FRESNO'S DEVELOPMENT PATTERN

Due to the relatively low density growth pattern in the Fresno area, 20 fire stations are spaced approximately
four miles apart resulting in an average of a two-mile running distance for the designated first-in company.
This average two-mile travel distance increases the response time to fires, which result in an increase in the
size and intensity of fires.

FINDINGS REGARDING THE REASONABLY NECESSITY OF THE PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE GIVEN LOCAL CLIMATIC, TOPOGRAPHICAL, AND GEOLOGICAL

CONDITIONS

As set forth in detail in the attached proposed Resolution and Ordinance, each of the amendments requiring
express findings of necessity to the California Fire Code are reasonably necessary because of these local
climatic, topographical, and geological conditions. The amendments may be generally characteri,zed as

3 See hitp/iwww.ncdc.noaa.govioalclimate/ontinelcedipctposrank. txt

4 Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130, 2025 Fresno General Plan, p. V-C1

5 Master Environmental impact Report No. 10130, 2025 Fresno General Plan, p. V-C1-C3

6 Wildfire Smoke ~ A Guide for Public Health Officials ( 2001) Published by the Washington State Depariment of Health, p. 3.




Report to City Council

Introduction of an Ordinance Bill Repealing and Reenacting Fire and Life
Safety Regulations in the Fresno Municipal Code

November 18, 2010

Page 4

relating to (1) solar panel installation; (2) fire sprinkler systems; (3) luminous exit markings; (4)
additional regulation of lumber yards, woodworking, recycling, and waste handling facilities; and (5)
additional regulation of motor fuel dispensing and repair garages, locations of above-ground tanks,
the amount of Class 1 and Class Il liquids at farms and construction sites in above-ground tanks and
basement storage of flammable liquids.

SOLAR PANEL INSTALLATION

Local sunny conditions are conducive to a growing prevalence and use of solar panel arrays in the City of
Fresno. The presence of solar panel arrays on the roofs of buildings present fire ground operational issues
including restricted access points to the roof, delay in deploying ground ladders restricted locations for effective
roof venting, and live direct current conductors on the roof and inside the attic. Solar panel placement done
without regard to firefighter access and safety can result in additional working time on roofs, delay in fire
suppression efforts, greater exposure by firefighters to health risks associated with exposure to sustained high
temperatures, and increase in fire duration creating more smoke affecting air quality and requiring increased
use of water. By establishing a layout for solar panel arrays that takes into account fire ground operation
needs, fewer firefighters and less time will be needed to effect roof venting operations. This section
incorporates Solar Photovoltaic Instaflation Guidelines promulgated by a California State Fire Marshal task
force that included fire, building, and solar industry participation.

FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

Fire sprinkler systems have proven effective in suppressing and extinguishing structural fires using a small
fraction of the water used with traditional fire suppression methods and resulting in the smaller fires or shorter
duration and thus in the generation of far less smoke that effects air quality. Furthermore, because the fire
sprinklers will limit the size and duration of fires, fewer fire personnel will be required to respond to said fires.
This reduces the number of fire personnel who would be exposed to the health risk associated with sustained
exposure to high temperatures and also addresses extended run time due to topography-related low density
growth pattern in the Fresno. The modifications proposed in this category maintain existing amendments
approved by Council in 2007, which continue a proactive fire sprinkler installation emphasis for community fire
protection that commenced in 1979.

LUMINOUS EXIT MARKINGS

Luminous exit markings greatly assist individuals in evacuating buildings without the use of fire personnel.
Accordingly, requiring these markings will facilitate the unassisted evacuation of buildings. Therefore, fewer
fire personnel will be needed at the scene of the fire to assist in the evacuation of a building in which
photoluminescent exit markings have been installed. This modification continues an existing amendment first

approved by Council in 2008,

ADDITIONAL REGULATION OF [LUMBER YARDS, WOQDWORKING, RECYCLING, AND WASTE
HANDLING FACILITIES

These additional regulations will serve to reduce the possibility of spontaneous combustion of piles of wood
and wood waste and facilitate the suppression and extinguishing of fires at these sites. This will result in less
poliutants being released into the air and in fewer fire personnel having to respond to said fires and a
shortening in the time fire personnel will be required to remain at the scene of the fires. These modifications
are a continuation of requirements approved by Council initially in 2003 after the disastrous Crippen Fire in

southwest Fresno.




Report to City Council

Introduction of an Ordinance Bill Repealing and Reenacting Fire and Life
Safety Regulations in the Fresno Municipal Code

November 18, 2010

Page 6

ADDITIONAL REGULATION OF MOTOR FUEL DISPENSING AND REPAIR GARAGES, LOCATIONS OF
ABOVE-GROUND TANKS, THE AMOUNT OF CLASS | AND CLASS Il LIQUIDS AT FARMS AND
CONSTRUCTION SITES IN ABOVE-GROUND TANKS AND BASEMENT STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE

LIQUIDS.

Fresno's very hot, dry conditions make all combustible materials (grass, weeds, buildings, roof, etc.) highly
combustible, which increases the general fire hazard. High temperatures also make all flammable and
combustible liquids and gases much more volatile, increasing the fire hazard. Therefore, increased regulation
of the storage of certain classes of fuels and gases is reasonably necessary to reduce the fire risk associated
with the ignition of fuel and gases. The modifications are a continuation of amendments approved by Council
back to at least to 1978, which control the risk of low flash point hazardous materials in our climate.

SUMMARY

Local amendments proposed for adoption are limited to those felt essential to effectively administer Code
responsibilities in daily operations and to maintain previous amendments approved by Council relating to fire
and life safety. Staff recommends adoption of the standards as proposed.

FISCAL IMPACT

No financial impact.
ENVIRONMENTAL FINDING

Staff has conducted a preliminary environmental evaluation of this ordinance and resolution, and this project is
not subject to the requirements of the California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to CEQA Guidelines,
section 15061(b)(3) as there is clearly no possibility that the adoption of the California Fire Code or the
amendments may have a significant adverse effect on the environment.

JLAMD:BB:amg:m¢ 111010

Attachments:

2010 California Code Amendments Summary Sheet.

Notice of Exemption, dated November 10, 2010.

Ordinance Incorporating And Adopting Express Findings Of Necessity Related To Local Climatic, Topographical And
Geological Conditions That Make The City's Amendments To The California Fire Code Reasonably Necessary,
Repealing Article 10 Of Chapter 6 And Adding Article 10 To Chapter 5 Of The Fresno Municipal Code Relating To
Fire And Life Safety Regulations.

Resolution Of The Council Of The City Of Fresno, California, Making And Adopting Express Findings That
Modifications Or Changes To The California Fire Code Are Reasonably Necessary Because Of Local Climatic,
Geological And Topographicat Conditions.




SONSS! SARRISIURLDE 8Je Sluled pue s8s4d

S8nss! sAjensIuLUpE Sie sywisd pue AJSACSS 1509
salelisiiwpe sie syjwied sjuswsinbal 018SIg
|OUOD UOHIYIOH Iy UINbeof UBS U} YIM SBIBUIDICOD
$8NSS| sAlBASIILLPE ale sjwisd pue sos4

BiNjBU Ul SALRISIUIUPE 8i8 suonoadsul jo fousnbali
obenbue; oapensiwpy

sbenfiug} eanesunupy

(shuswyedep Aj10 uypm
UOIOE JUSUWSDIONUE JO UOHBUIPIODD SAJBASIUILDY

DN 241 1O suoisiacid sy usemieq
uoneuploos aInsus o) afenfue| sayeasILILPY

SABIISIUNLPE S| UoIBiLLSg
sbenbue| sanensiunupy
abenbue| sagessiuiwpy

NOSY3Y

2010188

ueipAy a1y Buipiaord 101ISIT SBIBAA JO UOISIAICY
181eAA AUD Bu; 03 @ouensst pued Sislep 'SJURIPAY
a4 104 sjwiad asn Butpsebal juswipusatie Buysixy

$1S00 J9ACDRS 0] uoloas Juned jeuoyeiado

3y} 01 Siuone (eioads, Buippe uswpuswe Bulsixy

08I DAVAPS O} pajeial siuswennba)
ued Buuing usdo uc sfenfue; sppy

SN BU Ul PBUSHIEISS USQ SBY 89 B 81oUm AJUO

pasnbes aie spuuied BuiAioads abenbue| sppy

yonoadsty jo Asusnbal suilusiep

ued Jaly) aiid sy eyl Buiues uoroes-gns sppy

uonusaald a1y 10 Juswyedsp
g ]O Ju9WYSIgeIS? Uo juslpuaswe D4 Bunsixy

8poQ Bulping duoISIH S1EIS BILIOUED
BY] $80UBIE] JUBWIpUBLIE DN Bunsixg

wswipedsg weawsbeuepy
B0IN0SBY pue Juswdojeas(l oyl Yum sabueyo
Aouednooo Bulleuipioos uswpusiue D4 Buisixg

Aidde suonoisas suoz auy sssym
UoR08s 8pe) seiivads Juatupuswe D+ Bulsixg

SOASO|dXS

pue ‘syuey seb ‘pinbi sjgewiwie); Buipnou
spiezey payiseds Bugeinbas 10 esodind oy seuoz
aly pauysp buiuielsl Juswpuse D4 Bunsixg

sasodind

{efis| 104 sapn BuipreBal uswpuswe D4 Bunsixg

040 010¢ 3y} 4oy sbenbue] uoidopy

NOLL4IY2S3Q

SjueipAH 814
slusAg jeadg
pUB 'SMOUS 9pEI L ‘SUGIUXT

Buiuing usdo

SHuia4 [euciessd( paumbay
Aouanbaidq uonoadsuy
ereusn)

sBuipjing suoisiy

AouednooQ jo ebueyn

me Ag peysiiqe;s3 sy

SOUO7 Bl
aplL

8po0
81i4 BILIOJBD 8y} 10 uondopy

1L

}93US AlBWING sjuswipusWy SANBASIUIIPY P07 8iid BILIOED 007

G1'9'601L0G6-01

€1'5'601L05-01

ZL'9'S0L0S-01

965010604

e y0L05-01

L E0L0S01

S'C0L0G-0L

2010801

¢'L'10L05-0L

L' E0L0G-0L

L' 10L0S-0)

0010801

NOILLO3S Dl



. SIopIo Miom dols
ypm A)dwod o) sunjie) 10} SUCHEND SABHSIUILUPE

SSNSSI SAIBHSIILUDE 318 SUCHELD SAJRISIUIUDY pue sanjeuad (o0} UO Juswpuawe BuRsixy Adwog o1 ainyey ¥ 1110604
sBuipjing syesun sieqe 0} souBUIPIO
Buipiing snossbueq sy} Ul seunpasoosd sARASILIWDE sluswsleqe Joj soueupiO) Buipling
1B00] Uim 8p0Q ity spodwod pue $8jeuipioo)  snolabue( seousisal JUSLIpUSWE SN Bunsixg jelausg 1'0LL0OS-0)
aajelsiupe s | Jsideun D4 Jepun jusuisiege 2ouesinu oygnd Buoioue
suonoe [ebs; uo Jusds s JYels 10§ SIS00 JO ALsA0DEY ut A1aa00a1 1500 Bumoyie Jusiusinbs) e sppy A1on008y 1509 ?'60106-01
£ 3Py
'} Jsideyd DN i suolsiacid Bunsixe ypm sanfeuad safjjeuad uone|oA 8p0od Uo Bulkjze
30 UORBSILIWPE 84} SHOdWOD puE SBIBUIPIOOD  UOREOYPOW JOUI YJiM JUSLLPUSLUE Ol Bunsixg Saljjeusd UoHBIOIA £'60L05-0L
SOOROU 4O AUBAIEP B PBYILSO 1] Juswalinba
SAJEHSIUILDE B8 SS0N0U 10 AISAlBD JO) SPOUISIN Bunsiap uonoss Juswipuswe Jpy4 Bunsixg BOINBS L'Z260L06-0L
wasweda(] wawebeuep sounossy
{shuswpedsp AU uiyim pue juswdoBrag sy AQ palejsiuipe ssaoold
UDRLOE JUSWSDI0IUS O UOKBUIPIOOD SALRIISILILLDY sfeadde Bulieuploos Juswpuswe DY Bunsixg sfeaddy o pleog Q01L0G6-01
Suel 547 to) paiinbei si nwisd
SENSS) SAJRASILILLPE SIB SHUWISd  UOLONIISUOD B 2J8YM PIOYSSIL} WNWIUIL B SppY SBEO-47] 01°2°60106-01
suonoadsur aoususlUEL 129A-an) Buissaum
Joj abieyo e s|qeUs pue paiunbal sle spuwlad usym SWIBISAS
Sensst sajensiuiwpe sie syued pue ses4 U0 sbenbue) sayipows JustpuswE D4 Bunsixg repjuudg sa4 oyewoINy L"2°S0L0G-01

S4 B4} Ul paysiigelss
usaqg sey a9} & alauym Ajuo paunbai Ajuo
SeNssl saensiuiLIpe ale sjwisd pue see4  ale spuuad UOONRSUCD Builioads uoisinoid sppy sy uononsuoD pasnbay 26010601

suolosdsul esie abeiols spising
abse| uo Juads swy 10] A4BA00SI 1500 ‘sywied
SSNSs| sajeAsIuWPE ale s)iwisd pue ses4 abelos JoLisixs 10§ JuBLUpUBLIE D4 Busixg obei01g Jouaxg 89'9°G0L0G-0L

NOSV3IM NOILLdIYDS3q ERNiiS NOILDAS DN

193YS Aleluling sjusipusly SAEASIUILPY 907 il BILIOYIRD 0102



aNss| sAlRASIIWPE e St suosadsuyl Jo Aousnbaiy
‘DN 8ul JO suoISIACID JBUI0 YIM BPOD) ait4 spodwony

SPJEPUBIS SHIOM O1aNd LM 8poD
2ii4 94} SpOdLLIOD pue SSIBUIpIO0S ABALBASIUIUDY

BOUBLPIO Bupling snolabueq sy Uim 3pos
2414 8y} spodwWoD pue $8jeUIPICDD AIBARRASILILDY

eoueupiO Buiping snoisBue sy ypm apor)
84 By} SHOdLUOD pue $81UIPIO0O AlaNIBASIUILDY

BARBSIUIUPE St 8DUSWIWIOD 1$NW dnuead
24-1s0d UBUM O] SE BUI| BUIl B JO LONBUILISIS(]

SALBASIWDE S IN000
ou Aewt Buidwnp eieum uonRUILLIBISP 'SUOLOLISEl
Burdwnp ebaj yim opos sl SOIBUIPIOO]

NSS! BARRISIIWPR e S| suonosdsus jo Aouanbaiy
DA 88U} JO sUOISIA0LD 18I0 YIM BPOD) Blig Spoduwon

TeUSIB 2u14 JO Bl DU} SBULBP YBIUD) B4 By} S1 A
U} J0} [BIOIO BP0 Bl BU] UOIBILIBIO SARBASIILLDY

joynewW sAjeASIuILPE
UB ‘SSDIAIDS 10 1SOD JBACISI 0] 8P00) JUBLILIBACS)
aU3 Jopun Auoyine ypm opo) a4 spodwon

NOSv3Y

suonoadsut uo suoneinfias usiqeiss

0} sal soleg pue usddun sy Joye papoeus
SJUSWIPUBLLE JO SBHSS B JO 3U0 ‘sjuswiaiinbal
abe10}s 8pISIN0 |BUOIIPPE 10} SUOI0SS

89P0 81l JBYI0 Sa0USISE jUSWpUSLE Bunsixg

SPIBHOG JaS PUB JRIPAY 10] pJEpUB)S
SHIOAA JaNd SBdUBIBIRL JUSIpUSLUE Bunsixg

siobysiy
101 Bupieoeid Bulutem 1o} soueuiplQ Buiping
snosabueq sy Bupusisal Jusuipuswe Bulsixy

sbuipiing psuopueqge Buipienbojes
Buipiefal uswseieqge Joj sourupiO Buping
snosebueQ oy Buduslsal Juslupusuie Bunsixg

Sugep oy
10 {BAOUIBI SSIPPE 0} JUSWpUSLIE D4 BURSIXT

Swdwnp
iefaly ssaippe o} JusLipustuz O BulsIxg

saiy

soueg pue uaddug sy Jeye paveuS SjuswpusiLe
O S8U9S B JO 8UO ) sy} ‘saniioe) Buipuey

8jsem pue Buiohoss Je sjuswalinbal [euolIppR 0]
61 JoldeyD S8ouURISRl JUBLLPUSILR D4 Bulysixg

B[ [BYS.IBW B4} PUE Aloyine
s8I0 alid Buiprebal Juswpuswie Bunsixg

SBOIUBS uopoadsul
B4l IO} IBA0DBI 1502 Bupmolje uonoas sppy

NOLLdI¥OSAa

abei01g SpISO

10} SyuBWBNNbaY |BUCHIPPY

jeieusn

Spleseld

S3SIWal4 PauopuRgY

SHAa[ JO [2AOWIS Y

[BLSIBIN
2ISBAA SjgisSNqwo) 1o Buidwing

Saiife
Buypuey aisepn pue Buioisey

SUOIIULB( |B1BUSO)

Sa2IIaS uonoadsU| I0) 984

EREARS

}98US AlBWIWNG SjUBWIPUSWY SARISIUIPY 3P0 8114 BILIOMED (10Z

£'£GLE06-01

L C1€05-04

§'11206-04

L1 LEE0S-0t

g'v0e0s-0L

G y0e05-01

¥ $0c05-0L

c020S-01

g'eLios0t

NOILLOTS D4



suB|d JO MBINSI SAIJRLSILILLPE 3] 104 SMO|2
'8pOs 8li4 8yl O g¢ a1deyD Yim aoue)dwoD SINsus
0} SUOISIAOIA IBLIO Yim SHOdWOD pUB Sa1eUIpIonD

SOAISOUX® JO ainornuBRWw
pue abeiols sy) Buqiyord mey jo suoisiaold
YUM 8p0Q ll4 243 SHOdUWoD pue Saeuipioo)

SAIRASIUILIPE S Sauyy

SAHELSIUIUPE JO MBIASI DARBASIUILLDE PUB UORDS|103
JUBWDOIOUS BY) {/GGT) UONDag ‘apol Asies

PUE UYESH PUB $'690ES UONOSS P07 JUSWUIBACS
YIM 8P0OJ Bt B spoduod pue $31BUIPI00T)

BARRJSIUIUDE BlE Sainpsaooid
pug suopdo JUsLWISoIoUD (DAL B JO suoisiAcld
J8UI0 YIm apog il 9y} sHoduiod PUB S8jBUIPIcOT

"D 8Us Jo suoisinoad
HBYI0 Ynm apod i 8y sHoduwiod pue SajBUIpIooD)
O 84 jo suoisiaoud
OO0 WIM BpOY Bl B3 s1odlod puB S3)BUIPIce)

SBNSS! AElSIUILIpE
8Je S80[]0U UOJ081100 JO S0UBNSS! PUB SSREUSd

NOSVv3IY

suonefjeIsu; ©d7 104
epiuans ueld Suuinbai wewpuswe D4 Bunsixg

saAsoldxs
o Buumpoeinuew pue abeicis Bunenbasi
(UoHEDYIPOW YIM) JUSWIPUSWIE DN Bunsixs

SN 8|EsS puB SHIOMBH sues pue ajes Buneinbal
{uonEOIPOW YiM) JusWpuaLe D4 Bunsixg
spiezey

apebyiw o) suswannbas Budyoads Jog suondo
S0 UIM {100 8POS B4l U} 01 UODSS Si

10 abenbue Buikjueo Juswpuswe D4 Buisixg

“Apadosd oy sssooe eyeb pue Buipiing 104
sjuswaanbay |00} Uo JuawpusWE D4 Bulsixg

sBuipyng 1o Buissaippe
10} sjuswalinbal D4 Bugsixe sereuipioon

JL2PIAUL UB 0 SBINGLIUCD 820U UCRO81I0D
e ypm Aiduiod o) aunye) Usym og Ajeuad Asaods)
1500 Juapioul uo stuswsnbal D4 Bulsixg

NOiLdI¥Os3a

SIUBWNIO(] UOIONIISUGD

S9AISO|dXT 40 UORIGIYOIY

SHIOMBI1 JO UORIGIYOI]

SWwslsAg
UoHI910Id 9114 JEUOIPDY

SS300Y SISIWALd PENOoT]

UCHEOURUSP| SISl

sasuodssy
JuSpiouy jeusie snopiezey
pue uoissaiddng Joj sfieyn

JLLE

199YS AlWiNg sjuswpusily SARASIUIWPY SPO7) Sl eIuwolieD 0107

£108e5-01

£0LE5-01

Z0ees-04

£v'10805-0}

80505-01

}'G0S0S-01

£ 10¥06-01

NOLLD3S DN



Applicant:

Project L.ocation:

Project Description:

Exempt Status:

Reason for
Exempt Status:

NOTICE OF EXEMPTION

CITY OF FRESNO
Environmental Assessment

City of Fresno

Fresno Fire Department
911 H Street

Fresno, CA 93721

Citywide

An ordinance of the City of Fresno adopting the 2010 California Fire
Code as amended.

The project is not subject to the requirements of CEQA pursuant to
Section 16061(b)(3) of the Guidelines for California Environmental
Quality Act.

The adoption of this ordinance is exempt from having to comply with the
requirements of CEQA, pursuant to CEQA Guidelines Section
16061(b)(3) which states: “CEQA only applies to project which have the
potential for causing a significant effect on the environment. Where it
can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility that the activity in
question may have a significant effect on the environment, the activity is
not subject to CEQA”

This exemption is applicable as the State of California has preempted the
field related to fire standards and has already adopted the California Fire
Code to go into effect on January 1, 2011, regardless of the City’s action.
There is no possibility the City’s activity in adopting the 2010 California
Fire Code will have a significant effect on the environment.

Date: November 10, 2010

Prepared by: Byron Beagles, Fire Prevention Engineer
City of Fresno

Sy <

JoelAranaz, FireCCHief
Fresno Fire Department
City of Fresno

(559) 621-4002




ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FRESNO
PROPOSED AND INITIATED BY
MOVED BY SECONDED BY

BILL NO. B~ 1,

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FRESNO, CALIFORNIA, INCORPORATING AND
ADOPTING EXPRESS FINDINGS OF NECESSITY RELATED TO LOCAL CLIMATIC,
TOPOGRAPHICAL, AND GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS THAT MAKE THE CITY'S
AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE REASONABLY NECESSARY,
REPEALING ARTICLE 10 OF CHAPTER 5, AND ADDING ARTICLE 10 TO CHAPTER
5 OF THE FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY
REGULATIONS

THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FRESNO DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS;:

SECTION 1. The express findings of Resolution No. %16~ 24 gntitled “A
RESOLUTION OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FRESNO, CALIFORNIA, MAKING
AND ADOPTING EXPRESS FINDINGS THAT MODIFICATIONS OR CHANGES TO
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE ARE REASONABLY NECESSARY BECAUSE OF
LOCAL CLIMACTIC, GEOLOGICAL, AND TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS,” required
for modifications or changes to the California Fire Code, which are reasonably
necessary because of local climactic, geological, or topographical conditions, are
incorporated and adopted herein as if set forth in full. The modifications or changes to
the California Fire Code are specifically listed below, and the incorporated express
findings regarding to those modifications may be generally characterized as relating to
(1) solar panel installation; (2) fire sprinkler systems; (3) luminous exit markings; (4)
additional regulation of lumber yards, woodworking, recycling, and waste handling
facilities; and (6) additional regulation of motor fuel dispensing and repair garages,
locations of above-ground tanks, the amount of Class 1 and Class |l liquids at farms and
construction sites in above-ground tanks and basement storage of flammable liquids.

SECTION 2. Atticle 10 of Chapter 5 of the Fresno Municipal Code is repealed.

SECTION 3: Article 10 of Chapter 5 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to
read:

ARTICLE 10
FIRE PREVENTION
Section 10-50100 Adoption of the California Fire Code

10-50101.1 Title
10-50101.1 .1 Fire Zones




10-50101.1.2
10-50102.3
10-50102.5
10-560103.1
10-50104.3.2
10-50105.6
10-560105.6.12
10-501056.6.13
10-50105.6.15
10-50105.6.48
10-50105.7
10-50105.7 1
10-50105.7.10
10-50108
10-560109.2.1
10-50109.3
10-50109.4
10-50110.1
10-60111.4
10-60113.6
10-60202
10-50304 4
10-50304.5
10-50304.6
10-50307.1.1
10-50311.1.1
10-50311.5
10-50312.1
10-50315.3.3
10-50505.1
10-50506
10-50605.11
10-50901.4.3
10-50903.1
10-50903.2.1
10-560803.2.2
10-60903.2.3
10-50903.2 4
10-50803.2.7
10-560903.2.9
10-50903.2.10
10-50903.3.1
10-50903.3.8
10-50903.4.3

10-50903.3.5.1.2

10-50912.2.3.
10-51024.1

Limits Established By Law

Change of Occupancy

Historic Buildings

General

Inspection Frequency

Required Operational Permits
Open Burning

Exhibits, Trade Shows, and Special Events
Fire Hydrants

Exterior Storage

Required Construction Permits
Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems
LP-Gas

Board of Appeals

Service

Violation Penalties

Cost Recovery

General

Failure to Comply

Fee for Inspection Services
General Definitions

Recycling and Waste Handling Facilities
Dumping of Combustible Waste Material
Removal of Debris

Prohibited Open Burning
Abandoned Premises

Placards

General

Additional Requirements for Outside Storage
Premise Identification

Locked Premises Access

Solar Panel Installations

Additional Fire Protection Systems
General

Group A

Group B

Group E

Group F

Group M

Groups S-1

Groups 8-2

Installation Regquirements

Floor Control Valves

Floor Control Valves

Residential Combination Services
Address Identification

General




10-51901 .1
10-51907.2
10-51907.3
10-51807.6
10-51908.3
10-51908.4
10-51808.7
10-51908.11
10-561908.12
10-52206.2.3

10-53302
10-53303
10-53404.2.9.6.1

10-53404.3.5.1
10-53406.2.4
10-53801.3

Scope

Size of Piles

Pile Fire Protection

Security

Size of Piles

Pile Separation

Pile Fire Protection

Security

Baled Material and Idle Pallets
Above-Ground Tanks Located Qutside of
Buildings, Above Grade

Prohibition of Fireworks

Prohibition of Explosives

Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are
Prohibited

Basement Storage

Permanent and Temporary Tanks
Construction Documents



ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 10-50100. ADOPTION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE.
Section 10-50100 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

100. Adoption of the California Fire Code. The 2010 California Fire
Code, as promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, which
incorporates the adoption of the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code as
amended with necessary California amendments, and the 2009 International Fire
Code, including Appendix Chapters E and F, are hereby adopted and amended
by the City of Fresno for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life and property protection from fire, hazardous
materials, or explosions, except such portions as fully as if set out at length
herein. The Council does hereby find it is reasonably necessary to make certain
changes and modifications to the requirements contained in the rules and
regulations adopted pursuant to Sections 17922 et seq. and 18935 et seq. of the
California Health and Safety Code; such change or modifications are herein more
particularly set forth,

SECTION 10-50101.1. TITLE.
Section 101.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

101.1. Title. This code shall be known as the Fresno Fire Code, may be
cited as such, and shall be referred to herein as “this Code.” When used here,
“CFC” means the 2010 California Fire Code, with such amendments as adopted
by the State of California and the 2009 International Fire Code, including
appendix Chapters E an F, as adopted and amended in this article.

SECTION 10-50101.1.1. FIRE ZONES.
Section 10-50101.1.1 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

101.1.1. Fire Zones. For the purpose of this Code, the entire city shall be
divided into three fire zones classified and known as Fire Zone No. 1, Fire Zone
No. 2, and Fire Zone No. 3. The boundaries and limits of each such Fire Zone
are shown upon a map designated Zone Map No.168, Fresno, California, dated
June 9, 1974, consisting of one sheet on file in the office of the fire code official,
which with any amendments thereto, is hereby adopted and made a part of this
chapter as though fully set forth herein.

Whenever in this Code reference is made to any Fire Zone, such
reference shall be construed to mean one of the Fire Zones designated on said
map and amendments thereto.



SECTION 10-50101.1.2. LIMITS ESTABLISHED RY LAW.
Section 10-560101.1.2 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

101.1.2. Limits Established by Law. The limits referred to in Sections
3506.2 and 3804.2 of the California Fire Code shall mean Fire Zones 1 and 2.
The limits referred to in Section 3302 of the California Fire Code shall mean Fire
Zones 1, 2, and 3.

SECTION 10-50102.3. CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY.
Section 102.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

102.3. Change of Use or Occupancy. No change shall be made in the
use or occupancy of any structure, which would place the structure in a different
division of the same group or occupancy or in a different group of occupancies,
unless such structure is made to comply with the requirements of this code and
the California Building Code. Subject to the approval of the fire and building
code official, the use or occupancy of an existing structure shall be allowed to be
changed, and the structure is allowed to be occupied for purposes in other
groups without conforming to all the requirements of this code and the California
Building Code for those groups, provided the new or proposed use is less
hazardous, based on life and fire risk, than the existing use.

SECTION 10-50102.6. HISTORIC BUILDINGS.
Section 102.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

102.6. Historic Buildings. The provisions of this Code relating to the
construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation, or moving of
buildings or structures shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures
identified and classified by the state or local jurisdiction as historic buildings when
such buildings or structures do not constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.
Fire protection in designated historic buildings and structures shall be provided in
accordance with Part 8 of Title 24 of the 2010 California Historic Building Code.

SECTION 10-50103.1. GENERAL.
Section 103.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.1. General. The department of fire prevention is established within
the jurisdiction under the direction of the fire code official. The function of the
department shall be the implementation, administration, and enforcement of the
provisions of this code. Whenever the terms “department of fire prevention,”
“fire prevention bureau,” or “fire prevention division” are used in this Code or the
Fresno Municipal Code, the terms shall mean “Fire Prevention and Investigation
Division.”



SECTION 10-50104.3.2. INSPECTION FREQUENCY.
Section 10-50104.3.2 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

104.3.2. Inspection Frequency. The fire code official shall be authorized
to establish a minimum inspection frequency for all occupancy groups where not
already determined by the State of California Health and Safety Code.

SECTION 10-50105.6. REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS.
Section 105.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6. Required Operational Permits. The fire code official is authorized
to issue operational permits for the operations set forth in Section 105.6.1
through Section 105.6.48. Required permits will be issued only for those
operations where a permit fee has been established by Master Fee Schedule
resolution.

SECTION 10-50105.6.30. OPEN BURNING.
Section 105.6.30 of the California Fire Code is amended o read:

105.6.30. Open Burning. An operational permit is required for any open
burning, which has been approved by the San Joaquin Valley Air Poliution
Control District.

SECTION 10-50105.6.13.  EXHIBITS, TRADE SHOWS AND SPECIAL
EVENTS.

Section 105.6.13 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6.13. Exhibits, Trade Shows, and Special Fvents. An operational
permit is required to operate exhibits, trade shows, and special events.

SECTION 10-50105.6.15. FIRE HYDRANTS.
Section 105.6.15 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

106.6.15.  Fire Hydrants. A permit is required to use fire hydrants
intended for fire suppression purposes, which are installed on water systems and
accessible to public roadways, alleys, or public utility easements on private
property.  Such permit shall be obtained from the Water Division of the
Department of Public Utilities of the City, or person responsible for the provision
of water to such fire hydrants or water systems within a waterworks district. Also
see Sections 901.6 and 901.8.




Exception: A permit is not required for authorized employees of the water
company, which supplies the system or the fire department to use or
operate fire hydrants or valves.

SECTION 10-50105.6.48. EXTERIOR STORAGE.
Section 10-501105.6.48 of the Fresno Municipal code is added to read:

105.6.48. Exterior Storage. An operational permit is required for the
exterior storage of more than 5,000 square feet of tires, pallets, bin boxes, wood
or plastic products, other combustible finished materials or wood chips, hogged
material, fines, compost, and raw product associated with yard waste and
recycling facilities.

SECTION 10-50105.7. REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS.
Section 105.7 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1058.7. Required Construction Permits. The fire code official is authorized
to issue construction permits for work as set forth in Section 105.7.1 through
Section 105.7.14. Required permits will be issued only for those operations
where a permit fee has been established by Master Fee Schedule resolution.

SECTION 10-50105.7.1. AUTOMATIC FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS.
Section 105.7.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

108.7.1. Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems. A construction permit is
required for installation of or modification to an automatic fire extinguishing
system.

SECTION 10-50105.7.10. LP-GAS.
Section 105.7.10 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1056.7.10. LP-Gas. A construction permit is required for installation or
modification of LP-Gas tanks with a capacity (single or aggregate) in excess of
125 gallons.

SECTION 10-50108. BOARD OF APPEALS.
Section 108 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

108.1. General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions,
or determinations by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of the Fresno Fire Code, there shall be and is hereby created a
board of appeals (hereafter referred to as the “Building Standards Appeals
Board”) consisting of members who are qualified by experience and training to

2




pass on matters pertaining to building construction and hazards of fire,
explosions, hazardous conditions, or fire protection systems, who are not
employees of the City of Fresno. '

The Building Standards Appeals Board shall perform the following appeal duties:

a) Determine the suitability of alternate materials, engineering designs,
methods of construction, and equipment.

b) Provide reasonable interpretations of the provisions of the Fresno Fire
Code and other relevant codes.

Exception: Appeals of administrative citations, fees, penaities, or
charges that may be levied by the Fire Department such as suppression
costs, mitigation costs, clean-up costs, re-inspection charges, false atarm
charges, or failure to comply with written citations or notices, shall comply
with Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 1, Article 4.

The building official shall serve as an ex officio member of and shall act as
secretary to said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the board.
The Building Standards Appeals Board shall be appointed by the Mayor and shall
hold office at the pleasure of the Mayor.

The Building Standards Appeals Board shall adopt rules of procedure for
conducting its business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to
the appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

108.2.  Limitations of Authority. The Building Standards Appeals Board
shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of
this code nor shall the board be empowered to waive requirements of this code.
An economic condition shall not be considered as a basis for an appeal of the
provisions of this code.

SECTION 109.2.1. SERVICE,
Section 109.2.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

109.2.1. Service. A notice of violation issued pursuant to this code shall
be served upon the owner, operator, occupant, or other person responsible for
the condition of violation either by personal service, mail, or by delivering the
same to, and leaving it with, some person of responsibility upon the premises.
For unattended or abandoned properties, a copy of such notice shall be sent by
first class mail to the last known address of the owner, occupant, or both. The
fire code official is authorized to issue an administrative citation for abatement of
violations of this code in accordance with Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 1,
Article 3 and written policy.




SECTION 50109.3. VIOLATION PENALTIES
Section 109.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

109.3. Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall
erect, install, aiter, repair, or do work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate issued
used under provisions of this code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. Upon
failure to comply with a written notice of violation, the fire code official is
authorized to impose penalties or seek legal action in accordance with Fresno
Municipal Code, Chapter 1, Article 3. Each day that a violation continues shall be
deemed a separate offense.

109.3.1. Abatement of Violation. In addition to the imposition of
the penalties herein described, the fire code official is authorized to
institute appropriate action to prevent unlawful construction or to restrain,
correct or abate a violation; or to prevent illegal occupancy of a structure
or premises; or to stop an illegal act, conduct of business or occupancy of
a structure on or about any premises. Such action is subject to the cost
recovery provisions of Section 109.4,

SECTION 10-50109.4. COST RECOVERY,
Section 109.4 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

109.4. Cost Recovery. The Fire Chief or designee may seek recovery of
any direct or indirect costs for fire prevention, fire suppression, hazardous
material incident response, and protection of the public from fire and life safety
hazards. Additionally, acts caused from serious negligence or carelessness, an
intentional wrongful act, malice, or failure to comply with a written notice of
violation will be subject to the cost recovery program set forth in Fresno
Municipal Code, Chapter 1, Article 5, and the Master Fee Schedule.

SECTION 10-50110.1. GENERAL.
Section 110.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

110.1. General. If during the inspection of a premises, a building or
structure or any building system, in whole or in part, constitutes an inimical threat
to human life, safety or health, the fire code official shall issue such notice or
orders to remove or remedy the conditions as shall be deemed necessary in
accordance with this section and shall refer the building to the building official for
any repairs, alterations, remodeling, removing, or demolition as may be required



by Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 11, Article 4, Dangerous Building
Regulations.

SECTION 10-50111.4. FAILURE TO COMPLY.
Section 111.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

111.4. Failure to Comply. Any persons who shall continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to
an administrative citation or other judicial or administrative action in accordance
with Section 109.3.

SECTION 10-50113.6. FEES FOR FIRE INSPECTIONS.
Section 10-50113.6 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

113.6. Fees for Fire Inspections. The fire code official shall be authorized
to charge a fee for fire inspections of existing buildings and properties within the
City of Fresno. Fees for such services shall be in accordance with the Master
Fee Schedule.

DEFINITONS
SECTION 10-50202. GENERAL DEFINITIONS.

The following definition in Section 202 of the California Fire Code is
amended to read:

FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The fire chief charged with the administration and
enforcement of the code, or a duly authorized representative.

The following definition in Section 202 of the California Fire Code is added to
read:

FIRE MARSHAL. The chief fire officer of the Fire Prevention and Investigation
Division of the fire department or a duly authorized representative, who is
charged with the prevention and investigation of fires.

GENERAL PRECAUTIONS AGAINST FIRE
SECTION 10-50304.4. RECYCLING AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES.

Section 10-50304.4 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

10



304.4. Recycling and Waste Handling Facilities. See Chapter 19 of the
CFC for specific requirements related to recycling and waste handling facilities.

SECTION 10-50304.5. DUMPING OF COMBUSTIBLE WASTE MATERIAL.
Section 10-50304.5 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

304.5. Dumping of Combustible Waste Material. No owner or occupant of
any lot or premises shall maintain thereon any rubbish or waste material likely to
become easily ignited, and, provided further, no person shall place, deposit, or
leave any plies of dirt, metallic cans, combustible waste, or rubbish on any
property not owned or controlled by such person or persons.

SECTION 10-50304.6. REMOVAL OF DEBRIS.
Section 10-50304.8 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

304.6. Removal of Debris. Any person having in their possession or
under their control, upon any premises, any kind of materials, which have been
rendered useless or un-merchandisable by reasons of any fire on the premises,
or any other debris resulting from such fire, must commence to remove the same
from the premises within twenty-four hours after notice to do so from the Fire
Department, and must thereupon proceed with and diligently carry on the work of
such removal until the same has been completed.

SECTION 10-50307.1.1. PROHIBITED OPEN BURNING.
Section 10-50307.1.1 of the Fresno Municipal Code is amended to read:

304.7.1.1. Prohibited Open Burning. Notwithstanding other provision in
Section 307, open burning is prohibited as follows: '

1. Open burning that is offensive or objectionable because of
smoke emissions or when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances
make such fires hazardous shall be prohibited.

2. Open burning in violation of the rules promulgated by the San
Joaquin Valley Air Pollution Control District.

3. The fire code official is authorized to order the immediate
extinguishment of any unauthorized opening burning and may issue
administrative citations and seek to recover costs in accordance with
Sections 109.3 and 109.4 of this Code.

11




SECTION 10-50311.1.1. ABANDONED PREMISES.
Section 311.1.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

311.1.1. Abandoned Premises. Buildings, structures, and premises for
which an owner cannot be identified or located by dispatch of a certificate of
mailing to the last known or registered address, which persistently or repeatedly
become unprotected or unsecured, which have been occupied by unauthorized
persons or for illegal purposes, or which present a danger of structural collapse
or fire spread to adjacent properties shall be considered abandoned, declared
unsafe, and abated by demolition or rehabilitation in accordance with the Fresno
Municipal Code, Chapter 11, Article 4 (Dangerous Building Ordinance).

SECTION 10-50311.5. PLACARDS.
Section 311.5 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

311.5. Placards. Any building determined to be unsafe pursuant to
Section 110 of this code shall be marked as required by Fresno Municipal Code
Section 11.418(d) (Dangerous Building Ordinance).

311.5.1. Informational Use. The use of these placards shall be
informational only and shall not in any way limit the discretion of the on-
scene incident commander.

SECTION 10-50312.1. GENERAL.
Section 10-50312.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

312.1. General. Vehicle impact protection required by this Code shall be
provided by posts that comply with Section 312.2 of the CFC or by other
approved physical barriers that comply with 312.3 of the CFC

Exception: Fire hydrants and fire sprinkler risers may be protected
in accordance with Public Works Standard W-23 (Fire hydrant installation
with protector posts).

SECTION 10-50315.3.3. ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR OUTSIDE
STORAGE.

Section 10-50315.3.3 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

: 315.3.3. Additional Requirements for Qutside Storage. Outside storage
of tires shall be in accordance with Chapter 25 of the CFC. OQutside storage of
idle pallets, plastic or wooden finished products, baled material, or similar

12




products shall be in accordance with Fire Prevention Division Standard “Outdoor
(Exterior) Storage Requirements.” Outdoor storage at lumber vyards,
woodworking, recycling, and waste handling facilities shall be in accordance with
Chapter 18 of the CFC. An approved water supply for firefighting purposes shall
be provided in accordance with Section 508 of the CFC.

FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
SECTION 10-50505.1. PREMISE IDENTIFICATION.
Section 505.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

505.1 Address lIdentification. New and existing buildings shall have
approved address numbers placed in a position that is plainly legible and visible
from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with
their background. Address numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm)
high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) unless larger size
numbers are specified by the Policy. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers
or alphabetical letters. The requirements of Fresno Municipal Code Section
12-1300 et seq. shall be followed.

SECTION 10-50506. LOCKED PREMISES ACCESS.
Section 506 of the California Fire Code is renamed and amended to read:

506.1. Where Required. Where access to or within a structure or an area
is restricted because of secured openings, the fire code official is authorized to
require a key box to be installed in an approved location. Installation
requirements and key box contents shall be in accordance with Fire Prevention
and Investigation Division Standards.

506.1.1 Locks. An approved lock or remote opening device shall
be installed on gates or similar barriers when required by the fire code
official in accordance with Fire Prevention and Investigation Division
Standards.

506.2. Key Box Maintenance. The operator of the building or premises
shall immediately notify the fire code official and provide the new key when a lock
is changed or re-keyed. The key to such lock shali be secured in the key box.

BUILDING SERVICES AND FEATURES
SECTION 10-50605.11. SOLAR PANEL INSTALLATIONS.

Section 10-50605.11 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:
13



605.11. Solar Panel Installations. The installation of solar panels shall
comply with the California Electrical Code and the latest revision of the “Solar
Photovoltaic Installation Guidelines” prepared by the California Office of the State
Fire Marshal.

605.11.1. DC Roof Top Disconnects. There shall be a separate
emergency DC disconnect on the roof to disconnect solar panels from DC
wiring running through and on the building to the inverter. This disconnect
must be permanently labeled in reflective, fade-resistant material (see
CSFM Guidelines on marking) that states: “Emergency DC Disconnect.”
This provides a safety mechanism for firefighting ensuring power has been
disabled as close to the source as possible. Disconnects, provided in a
NEMA 3R box, shall be installed as close to the array as possible to
eliminate any substantial length of energized wiring that cannot be shut
down. Commercial installation where multiple disconnects are present will
be evaluated and approved on a case by case basis.

FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS
SECTION 10-50801.4.3. ADDITIONAL FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS.
Section 901.4.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

901.4.3. Additional Fire Protection Systems and Appliances. In
occupancies of a hazardous nature, where special hazards exist in addition to
the normal hazards of the occupancy, or where the fire code official determines
access for firefighters or fire apparatus is unduly difficult, the fire code official
shall have the authority to require additional safeguards. Such safeguards
include, but are not limited to, fire detection systems, fire alarm systems,
automatic fire-extinguishing systems, standpipe systems, or portable or fixed
extinguishers. Fire protection equipment required under this section shall be
installed in accordance with this code, applicable referenced standards, and
written Fire Prevention and Investigation Division Standards.

SECTION 10-50803.1. GENERAL.

Section 903.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to add the following sub-
sections:

803.1.2. Determination of Building Area. For purposes of determining

building area for automatic fire sprinkler system requirements, the following
criteria shall be used:

14




1. Fire walls, fire barriers, fire partitions, or horizontal fire
assemblies as defined in this code shall not be considered to create
separate buildings or fire areas for determining automatic fire sprinkler
requirements,

Exceptions:

(a) Party walls located on a lot line between two
buildings in accordance with California Building Code,
Section 706.

(b) Fire walls without openings installed in
accordance with California Building Code, Section 706 and
with specific fire wall requirements in Section 903.2 of this
code based on occupancy.

2. Determination of building area for combustible construction shall
be measured to the building perimeter roof drip line, including architectural
features, such as, but not limited to, mansards, towers porte cocheres,
etc., with the exception of 44" maximum depth roof eaves. For non-
combustibfe construction, building area shall include all perimeter roof
areas exceeding 44" that are required by NFPA 13 to have fire sprinkler
protection under the projection. The area of open shafts or courts need
not be included in calculating floor area. When multiple buildings are
considered as one building per California Building Code Section 705.3, the
combined floor areas shall be used to determine the automatic fire
sprinkler requirements.

903.1.3. Applicability to Existing Buildings. For existing buildings an
automatic fire extinguishing system shall be installed in those circumstances
described in this sub-section. Installation requirements shall be as set forth for
new buildings by Sections 903.2.1 through 803.2.10.

1. Building Additions. When additions exceed 25% of the existing
building square footage and the total proposed building area exceeds
5,000 square feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout the building. The 25% threshold shall be cumulative over the
life of the building.

Exception: Building additions of non-combustible construction and
non-combustible uses such as covered pedestrian walkways,

2. Change of Occupancy. In existing buildings over 5,000 square
feet, when a Change of Occupancy, in accordance with the California
Building Code, is made and the proposed new occupancy is more

15




hazardous to life and safety than the existing occupancy an automatic fire
extinguishing system shall be installed throughout the building.

Exceptions:

(a) If the area in which the Change of Occupancy
occurs is less than 25 percent of the actual floor area of the
existing building and the area of the new occupancy is 5,000
square feet or less and fire sprinklers are not required based
on occupancy by Section 903, an automatic fire sprinkler
system is not required for any portion of the building. The
25% limitis cumulative over the life of the building.

(b) If the area in which the Change of Occupancy
occurs exceeds 25% but is less than 50% of the actual floor
area of the existing building, only that portion of the building
changing occupancy is required to have an automatic fire
extinguishing system installed. An approved fire separation
shall be required between portions of the building with fire
sprinklers and those portions without.

(c) If individual or cumulative Change of Occupancies
exceeds 50% of the overall floor area of the existing building,
then the entire building shall have an automatic fire
extinguishing system installed throughout.

3. Fire Damage Repairs. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be installed as a condition of damage fire damage repair building permit
as follows:

(a) When a fire occurs in any existing occupancy,
and the building permit repair costs exceed 50% of the
current building valuation, an automatic fire extinguishing
system shall be installed throughout the building as requwed
for a new building in Section 903.

(b) When a fire occurs in an R occupancy and
building permit fire repair costs in the kitchen area of the
dwelling unit(s) exceeds $5,000, a single fire sprinkier head
or approved automatic extinguishing system shall be
installed in the kitchen per Fire Prevention and Investigation
Division Standards.

(c) Fire damage repair costs and building valuation
shall be based on the ICC Building Valuation Tables in use

16



by the Development and Resource Management
Department at the time of the issuance of the fire damage
repair permit.

4. R-2 Condominium Conversions. Existing R-1 or R-2 buildings
proposed for conversion to condominiums shall have an automatic fire
sprinkler systems installed as a condition of approval.

5. A-2 Occupancies. In existing A-2 occupancies with occupant
loads of 100 or more, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in
the A-2 fire area as a condition of any building permit application that
increases the occupant load of the assembly fire area as determined by
the California Building Code Section 1004.

SECTION 10-50903.2.1. GROUP A.
Section 903.2.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.2.1.1. Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-1 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more,

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit
discharge serving such occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex.

903.2.1.2. Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for
Group A-2 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit
discharge serving such occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex.

903.2.1.3. Group A-3. An automatic sprinkier system shall be provided
for Group A-3 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

17




1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit
discharge serving such occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex.

903.2.1.4. Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-4 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit
discharge serving such occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex.

- 903.2.1.5. Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-5 occupancies in the following areas: concession stands, retail
areas, press boxes, and other accessory use areas in excess of 1,000 square
feet,

SECTION 10-50903.2.2. GROUP B.

903.2.2. Group B Ambulatory Health Care Facilities. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all fire areas containing a Group B
ambulatory health care facility occupancy when either of the following conditions
exist at any time:

1. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self preservation.
2. One or more care recipients who are incapable of self-
preservation are located at other than the level of exit discharge
serving such an occupancy.
903.2.2.2. All Other Group B Occupancies. An automatic fire sprinkler

system shall be installed throughout all other B occupancies with a fire ar greater
than 5,000 square feet.

18




SECTION 10-50903.2.3. GROUP E.

903.2.3. Group E. Except as provided for in Section 903.2.3.1 for a new
public school campus an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
E occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 5,000 square
feet in area.

2. Throughout every portion of educational buildings below the
lowest level of exit discharge serving that portion of the building.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system is not required in
any area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area
where every classroom throughout the building has at least one
exterior exit door at ground level.

3. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories,
vocational shops and other such areas where hazardous materials in
quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable quantifies are used or
stored. ‘

4. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 12,000 square
feet in area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls
of less than four hour fire resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 10-50903.2.4. GROUP F.
Section 903.2.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.2.4. Group F. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing a Group F occupancy with a fire area over 5,000
square feet.

Exception: F-2 occupancies of non-combustible construction and
where contents stored, used, or manufactured are classified by this code
as non-combustible. Minor accessory uses such as administrative offices
and break rooms that, in total, do not exceed 10% of the building area are
allowed and such uses are not required to have fire sprinklers unless the
area exceeds 5,000 square feet. An operational statement shall be
submitted to the Development Department with building plan submission
and the owner shall execute a covenant running with the land agreeing to
the installation of the required automatic extinguishing system if the use
should change from the approved noncombustible limitation.

19



903.2.4.1. Woodworking Operations. An automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout all Group F-1 occupancy fire areas that contain
woodworking operations in excess of 2,500 square feet (232 m?), which generate
finely divided combustible waste or which use finely divided combustible
materials. A fire wall of less than four-hour fire resistance rating without
openings, or any fire wall with openings shall not be used to establish fire areas.

SECTION 10-50003.2.7. GROUP M.
Section 903.2.7 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.27. Group M. Automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following
conditions exist:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale of
upholstered furniture.

3. Throughout any Group M structure greater than 24,000 square
feet in area and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than four hour fire resistance rating without openings.

903.2.7.1. High Piled Storage. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided as required in Chapter 23 of the CFC in all buildings of Group M where
storage of merchandise is in high-piled or rack arrays.

SECTION 10-50803.2.9. GROUP 8-1.
Sections 903.2.9 of the California Fire Code are amended to read:

903.2.8. Group S-1. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy with a fire area over
5,000 square feet or in buildings with repair garages servicing vehicles parked in
basements.

903.2.9.1. Bulk Storage of Tires. Buildings and structures where the area
for the storage of tires exceeds 20,000 cubic feet shall be equipped throughout
with an automatic fire sprinkler system in accordance with 903.3.1.1.

SECTION 10-50903.2.10. GROUP S-2.

Sections 903.2.10 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

20



903.2.10. GROUP S-2.  An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings containing a Group S-2 occupancy with a fire area
over 5000 square feet

Exceptions:

1. S-2 occupancies of non-combustible construction and
with contents stored, used or manufactured that are classified as
non-combustible. Minor accessory uses such as administrative
offices and break rooms that, in total, do not exceed 10% of the
building area and any single accessory use area does not exceed
5,000 square feet do not require fire sprinkiers. An operational
statement shall be submitted to the Development Department with
building plan submission and the owner shall execute a covenant
running with the land agreeing to the installation of the required
automatic extinguishing system if the use should change from the
approved non-combustible limitations.

2, Detached S-2 occupancy carports of non-combustible
construction, without exterior walls, used exclusively for the parking
of motor vehicles that meet the setback requirements to real and
assumed property lines per Table 602 of the California Building
Code. Installation of solar panels on the roof of such carports is
permissible when using this exception.

SECTION 10-50903.3.1. INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS.
Section 903.3.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.3.1. Standards. Sprinkler systems shall be designed in accordance
with Sections 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, and 903.3.1.3. Automatic fire sprinklers or
fire sprinkler systems not required by the California Fire or Building Codes may
be of any type approved by the fire code official.

903.3.1.1. NFPA 13 Sprinkler Systems. Where the provisions of
this code require that a building or portion thereof be equipped throughout
with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with this section,
sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13 as
amended in Chapter 47 except as provided for in sub-sections 903.1.1.1
through 903.3.1.1.4.

903.3.1.1.2. Concealed Spaces Within Composite Wood Joist
Construction. In residential occupancies, the “Residential
Sprinklers” hydraulic design method in NFPA 13 shall not be used
in lieu of protecting the combustible concealed spaces within

21




floor/ceiling assemblies by either providing fire sprinklers in the
concealed spaces, completely filling the floor ceiling assembly with
approved insulation, or utilizing the 3,000 square foot minimum
density/area design method.

903.3.1.1.3.  Group R Mixed Occupancy Buildings. Mixed
occupancy buildings containing Group R occupancies shall be
provided with automatic sprinkler systems in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 (NFPA 13). The R-2 or R-3 residential portion of
a mixed occupancy building shall be provided with fire sprinkler
piping and control valves arranged so that the automatic sprinkler
system can remain in service independent of non-residential
occupancies.

Exception:  Mixed occupancy buildings where a
vertical fire barrier with no openings is provided in
accordance with California Building Code, Section 707
separating the R occupancy from other uses may have
automatic fire sprinkler systems installed in the residential
portion in accordance with Sections 903.3.1.2 (NFPA 13R)
or 903.3.1.3 (NFPA 13D) as applicable. Separate control
valves shall be installed as indicated above unless otherwise
approved by the fire code official.

903.3.1.1.4. Joint Live Work Units Quarters. Where joint
live/work residential dwelling units are constructed as permitted by
Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 11, Article 7, automatic sprinkler
systems shall be designed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1
(NFPA 13).

903.3.1.2. NFPA 13R Sprinkler Systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in
Group R occupancies up to and including three stories in height shall be
permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R as amended
in Chapter 47 except where prohibited in Sections 903.3.1.1.3 and 903.3.1.1.4

903.3.1.2.1. Balconies and Decks. Sprinkler protection shall be
provided for exterior balconies, decks, ground floor patios, and entryways
(enclosed on two or more sides) of dwelling units where the building is of
Type V construction, provided there is a roof or deck above. Sidewall
sprinklers that are used to protect such areas shall be permitted to be
located such that their deflectors are within 1 inch (25 mm) to 6 inches
(1562 mm) below the structural members and a maximum distance of 14
inches (356 mm) below the deck of the exterior balconies, decks, and
entryways that are constructed of open wood joist construction,

22




SECTION 10-50903.3.8. FLOOR CONTROL VALVES.
Section 10-50903.3.8 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.3.8. Floor Control Valves, Floor control valves and water flow
detection shall be provided in accordance with Section 903.4.3.

SECTION 10-50903.4.3. FLOOR CONTROL VALVES.
Section 803.4.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.4.3. Floor Control Valves., Approved supervised indicating - control
valves and water flow switches shall be provided at the point of connection to the
riser on each floor in buildings with three or more levels or where the floor level of
the highest story is located more than 30 feet above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access. The fire sprinkler system monitoring panel or remote
annunciator panel shall be provided at an approved location readily accessible to
the fire department indicating floor of activation of these devices.

Exception: NFPA 13R and 13D systems.
SECTION 10-50903.3.5.1.2. RESIDENTIAL COMBINATION SERVICES.
Section 903.3.5.1.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.3.5.1.2. Residential Combination Services. A single combination
water supply shall be allowed only when approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 10-50912.2.3. ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION.,
Section 10-50912.2.3 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

912.2.3. Address Identification. For new and existing buildings, the fire
code official is authorized to require approved address or building area
identification signage as needed to readily determine the building or area of a
building protected by fire department connections.

MEANS OF EGRESS
(Luminous Egress Path Markings)

SECTION 10-51024.1. GENERAL.

Section 10-51024.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

23




1024.1. General. Approved luminous egress path markings delineating
the exit path shall be provided in all new buildings three or more stories above
grade or below grade in accordance with Sections 1024.1 through 1024 .5.

Exceptions:

1. Luminous egress path markings shall not be required on
the level of exit discharge in lobbies that serve as part of the exit
path in accordance with Section 1027.1, Exception 1.

2. Luminous egress path markings shall not be required in
open parking garages that serve as part of the exit path in
accordance with Section 1027.1, Exception 3.

3. R-3 occupancies.

1024.1.1. Existing Buildings. Existing Group R-1, R-2, |, and E buildings
with 3 or more stories above or below grade and all buildings over three stories
above grade or three or more stories below grade shall be retrofitted with
luminous exit path markings in the enclosed stairways and associated exit
pathways to the exterior no later than January 1, 2012. Exceptions 1, 2, and 3
above are applicable to retrofit requirements. Buildings subject to these retrofit
provisions may use the Fresno Fire Department “Uniform Standard for
Photoluminescent Exit Path Markings” or California Fire Code, Sections 1024 .2
through 1024.5 as an installation standard. Stairway exit path makings in
existence at the time of the initial effective date of Ordinance No. 2007-27
adopted on March 20, 2007, may continue to exist as installed subject to the
approval of the fire code official.

1024.1.2. Maintenance. Luminous egress path markings required in this
section shall be maintained in accordance with Sections 1024.1 through 1024.5
or the Fresno Fire Department “Uniform Standard for Pholuminescent Exit Path
Marking” as applicable. -

LUMBER YARDS, WOODWORKING, RECYCLING,
AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES

SECTION 10-51901.1. SCOPE.
Section 1901.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:
1901.1. Scope. The storage, manufacturing and processing of timber,

lumber, plywood, veneers, wood by-products, compost and yard waste, un-baled
recycled products, and similar materials shall be in accordance with this chapter.

24



The title of this Chapter shall be “LUMBER YARDS, WOODWORKING,
RECYCLING, AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES.”

SECTION 10-51907.2. SIZE OF PILES,
Section 1907.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1907.2. Size of Piles. Piles shall not exceed 20 feet (6.1 m) in height, 50
feet (156.2 m) in width and 250 feet (76.2 m) in length. Piles shall be separated
from adjacent piles or other exposures (including, but not limited to, property
lines, other storage, and buildings) by means of fire department access
roadways. A 120 foot (36.6 m) by 90 foot (27.5 m) area shall be maintained
available for use by the Fire Department for interim storage of pile breakdown
material during fire suppression activities.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow the pile size
to be increased when additional fire protection is provided in accordance
with Chapter 9. The increase shall be based on the capabilities of the
system installed.

SECTION 10-51907.3. PILE FIRE PROTECTION.
Section 1907.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1907.3. Pile Fire Protection. An approved water supply for firefighting
purposes shall be provided in accordance with Section 507. Automatic sprinkler
protection shall be provided in conveyor tunnels and combustible enclosures that
pass under a pile. Combustible or enclosed conveyor systems shall be protected
by automatic sprinkler protection.

SECTION 10-51907.6. SECURITY.
Section 10-51907.6 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

1907.8. Security. Areas shall be surrounded with an approved fence.
Fences shall be a minimum of 6 feet (1.8 m) in height. ‘

SECTION 10-51908.3. SIZE OF PILES.
Section 1908.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1908.3. Size of Piles. Piles shali not exceed 20 feet (6.1 m) in height, 50
feet (16.2 m) in width and 250 feet (76.2 m) in length. A 120 foot (36.6 m) by 90
foot (27.5 m) area shall be maintained available for use by the Fire Department
for interim storage of pile breakdown material during fire suppression activities.

25



Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow the pile size
to be increased when additional fire protection is provided in accordance
with Chapter 8. The increase shall be based on the capabilities of the
system installed.

SECTION 10-51908.4. PILE SEPARATION.
Section 1908.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1908.4. Pile Separation. Piles shall be separated from adjacent piles or
other exposures (including but not limited to, property lines, other storage, and
buildings) by means of Fire Department access roads.

SECTION 10-51908.7. PILE FIRE PROTECTION.
Section 1908.7 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1908.7. Pile Fire Protection. An approved water supply for firéﬁghting
purposes shall be provided in accordance with Section 507. Automatic sprinkler
protection shall be provided in conveyor tunnels and combustible enclosures that
pass under a pile. Combustible or enclosed conveyor systems shall be protected
by automatic sprinkler protection.

SECTION 10-51908.11. SECURITY.
Section 10-51908.11 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:

1908.11. Security. Areas shall be surrounded with an approved fence.
Fences shall be a minimum of 6 feet (1.8 m) in height.

SECTION 10-561908.12. BALED MATERIAL AND IDLE PALLETS.
Section 10-51908.12 of the Fresno Municipal Code is added to read:
1908.12. Baled Material and Idle Pallets. For exterior storage of recycled
baled material and idle pallets see Section 10-50315.3.3 and Fire Preventfon and
Investigation Division Standards.

MOTOR FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES AND REPAIR GARAGES

SECTION 10-52206.2.3. ABOVE-GROUND TANKS LOCATED OUTSIDE OF
BUILDINGS, ABOVE GRADE.

Section 2206.2.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

26




1. Above-ground tanks used for outside above grade storage of Class |
and Il liquids shall be listed and labeled as protected above-ground tanks in
accordance with Chapter 34. Such tanks shall be located in accordance with
Table 2206.2.3.

2. Above-ground tanks used for above grade storage of Class lll-A liquids
are allowed to be protected above-ground tanks, or when approved by the fire
code official, other above-ground tanks that comply with Chapter 34. Tank
locations shall be in accordance with Table 2206.2.3.

3. Tanks containing fuels shall not exceed 12,000 gallons (45 420 L) in
individual capacity or 48,000 gallons (181 680 L) in aggregate capacity.
Installations with the maximum allowable aggregate capacity shall be separated
from other such installations by not less than 100 feet (30 480 mm).

4. Tanks located at farms, construction projects, or rural areas shall
comply with Section 3406.2.

FIREWORKS AND EXPLOSIVES
SECTION 10-63302. FIREWORKS ORDINANCE.
Section 3302 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:
3302.1. Short Title.

This Section shall be known and cited as the “Fireworks Ordinance.”
When used, "this Section" means the Fireworks Ordinance.

3302.2. Findings and Intent.

(a) This Section governs the imposition, enforcement, collection
and administrative review of all administrative fines related to: the
possession, use, storage, sale and/or display of those fireworks classified
as dangerous fireworks in California Health and Safety Code, Section
12505 et seq. or the possession, use, storage, sale and/or display of Safe
and Sane fireworks on or at dates, times, and/or locations other than
those permitted by this Section. The administrative fines are imposed
under authority of Government Code, Section 53069 .4; Health and Safety
Code, Section 12557, and, the police power of the City of Fresno.

(b) The issuance of an administrative citation to any person

constitutes but one remedy of the City to redress violations of this Section,
By adopting this Section, the City does not intend to limit its authority to

27




employ any other remedy, civil or criminal, to redress any violation of this
Section which the City may otherwise pursue.

(c) The imposition of administrative fines under this Section shall
be limited to persons who possess, use, sell and/or display, or the seizure
of 25 pounds or less of dangerous fireworks or persons who possess, use,
sell and/or display Safe and Sane fireworks on or at the dates, times, and/
or locations other than those permitted by this Section.

(d) Administrative fines collected pursuant to this Section shall not
be subject to Health and Safety Code, Section 12706. The administrative
fines collected shall be allocated in compliance with Health and Safety
Code, Section 12557, which requires the City to provide cost
reimbursement to the California State Fire Marshal for reimbursement of
costs, including, but not limited to transportation, and disposal.
Regulations are to be adopted by the California State Fire Marshal setting
forth this allocation. Unless and until such regulations have been adopted
by the State of California, the City shall hold in trust a $250.00 fee in
addition to any fine collected to cover the reimbursement to the California
State Fire Marshal for the cost of transportation and disposal of the
dangerous fireworks. This fee is non-refundable.

(e) Due to the serious threat of fire or injury posed by the use of
dangerous fireworks or Safe and Sane fireworks on or at dates, times,
and/or locations other than those permitted by this Section, this Section
imposes strict civil liability upon the owners of residential real property for
all violations of this Section existing on that property. Each contiguous
use, display, and/or possession shall. constitute a separate violation and
shall be subject to a separate administrative fine.

() The Fire Chief or designee may seek cost recovery for any
costs imposed on the Fire Department due to negligence, an intentional
wrongful act, carelessness, or malice as set forth in Fresno Municipal
Code, Chapter 1, Article 5, Article 10, Section 109.4, and the Master Fee
Schedule. "

(9) This section shall not apply to the public display of fireworks in
accordance with Section 3308,

(h) This section shall not apply to the storage and handling of Safe

and Sane fireworks in accordance with the California Building Code for
Class 1.4G fireworks.

28



3302.3. Definitions.

(a) "Dangerous fireworks" shall include any items or materials
listed as such in California Health and Safety Code, Section 12505.

(b) “Eligible organizations" means an organization or corporation,
which has met all of the following criteria continuously for a minimum of
one year preceding the filing of the application for a permit to display for
sale or sell Safe and Sane fireworks.

(i) The organization and/or corporation must be a duly
organized non-profit and tax-exempt charitable, religious, civic,
patriotic, or community service organization or corporation with a
current and valid 26 U.S.C Section 501(c)(3)(19) tax exemption
from the Internal Revenue Service,

(i) The organization must be headquartered within and
clearly affiliated or identified with the City of Fresno.

(i) The organization must be one which provides direct and
regular community services and benefits to the citizens of the City
of Fresno.

(iv) The organization must hold its regularly scheduled
meetings within the City of Fresno.

(c) "Exempt fireworks" means any special item containing
pyrotechnic compositions which the California State Fire Marshal, with the
advice of the State Fire Advisory Board, has investigated and determined
to be limited to industrial, commercial, and agricultural use, or religious
ceremonies when authorized by a permit granted by the authority having
jurisdiction.

(d) "Fireworks" means any device containing chemical elements
and chemical compounds capable of burning independently of the oxygen
of the atmosphere and producing audible, visual, mechanical, or thermal
effects which are useful as pyrotechnic devices or for entertainment.
These items include, but are not limited to:

(i) Devices designated by the manufacturer as fireworks.
(i) Torpedoes, skyrockets, roman candles, rockets, Daygo

bombs, sparklers, party poppers, paper caps, chasers, fountains,
smoke sparks, aerial bombs, and fireworks kits.

29



(e) "Safe and Sane fireworks” means any fireworks which do not
come within the definition of "dangerous fireworks" or “exempt fireworks."
All Safe and Sane fireworks shall be labeled with the Safe and Sane
fireworks seal as authorized by the California State Fire Marshal.

3302.4. General Prohibition Against Possession, Sale, Use and/or
Display of Fireworks.

Except as otherwise provided in this Section, no person shall possess,
sell, use, display, explode or discharge any fireworks within the City of Fresno.

3302.5. Safe and Sane Fireworks: Exceptions.

{(a) The sale and/or display of Safe and Sane Fireworks shall be
permitted only during that period beginning at noon on June 28 and
ending at noon on July 6 of the same year.

(b) Safe and Sane fireworks shall not be sold to any person under
the age of sixteen (16).

(c) The use and discharge of Safe and Sane fireworks within the
City of Fresno is permitted 365 days a year, between the hours of 7:00
a.m. and 10:00 p.m., except for the period of June 28 to July 6 when use
and discharge will be allowed between the h ours of 7:00 a.m. and 12:00
am.

3302.6. Safe and Sane Fireworks Permits: Permits Required.

(a) It is unlawful for any person to sell Safe and Sane fireworks
within the City of Fresno without a permit issued by the Fire Chief or
designee.

(b) The Fire Chief is authorized to promulgate administrative rules
and procedures necessary for the successful and effective implementation
of this Section including rules and procedures governing the submission of
applications for permits to sell Safe and Sane fireworks, inspections of
fireworks stands, operation of fireworks stands, and such regulations
relating to the sale of Safe and Sane fireworks as may be necessgary for
the protection of life and property. Said administrative rules and
procedures shall be in writing and subject to approval by the City Attorney.

(¢c) The Fire Chief or designee shall be responsible for reviewing
applications for permits to sell Safe and Sane fireworks.

3302.7. Safe and Sane Fireworks: Applications.
30




(@) All organizations or corporations interested in obtaining a
permit to sell Safe and Sane fireworks shall submit an application to the
Fire Department on forms provided by the Fire Department. There is a
non-refundable application fee established by resolution of the City
Council and set forth in the Master Fee Schedule. This application fee
shall be in addition to any fee or tax imposed by any other chapter or
article of the Fresno Municipal Code.

(b) The Fire Chief or designee shall designate the time period
when applications will be accepted.

(¢) No organization shall submit more than one application.
Submittal of more than one application shall be grounds for denial of all
applications submitted by that organization.

(d) There shall be allowed a maximum of one fireworks stand for
every five thousand (5,000) population in the City. A maximum of fifty new
stands will be issued permits on an alternating two-year cycle.

(e) Participants are selected by lottery, which shall take pldce at a
time and location determined by the Fire Chief or designee.

(fy The newly selected participants, as well as the previous year's
participants, shall submit additional information as required by the Fire
Department which shall be reviewed prior to issuance of any permits to
sell Safe and Sane fireworks for the upcoming fireworks season.

3302.8. Safe and Sane Fireworks: Issuance of Permits.

{a) No permit to sell Safe and Sane fireworks shall be issued to
any organization except non-profit and tax-exempt organizations or
corporations organized primarily for charitable, religious, civic, patriotic, or
community service as defined in Section 10-53302.3(b).

(b) Upon notification that the organization has been selected by
lottery to participate in the upcoming fireworks season, each crganization
shall provide additional information as required by the Fire Department
including, but not limited to:

(i) A non-refundable fee established by resolution of the
City Council and set forth in the Master Fee Schedule. This fee
shall be in addition to any fee or tax imposed by any other chapter
or article of the Fresno Municipal Code.

31




(i) An executed Indemnification and Hold Harmless
Agreement as required by the City's Risk Manager or the Risk
Manager's designes.

(i) Throughout the life of the permit, the applicant shall pay
for and maintain in full force and effect policies of insurance as
required by the City's Risk Manager or Risk Manager's designee.
The policies of insurance shall name the City, its officers, officials,
agents, employees and authorized volunteers as additional insured.
The applicant shall submit proof of insurance in a manner
authorized by the City's Risk Manager or Risk Manager's designee.

(iv) Other information as may be required by the Fire
Department pursuant to administrative rules and procedures
promulgated by the Fire Chief pursuant to Section 10-53302.6(b).

(c) Permits shall be issued upon review of all information
submitted by the organization and inspection and approval of the
organization’s temporary fireworks stand,

3302.9. Safe and Sane Fireworks: Operator Safety Seminar.

Each year, one or more representatives from each organization that is
granted a permit to sell or display fireworks shall attend a stand operator safety
seminar conducted by the City of Fresno Fire Department or the fireworks
industry. Failure of an organization to have a responsible individual attend the
seminar shall result in the revocation of the permit.

3302.10. Revocation of Permits.

The Fire Chief or designee may revoke the permit of any organization that
violates the provisions of this Section or any rules or regulations promulgated
pursuant to Section 10-53302.6(b). Notice of revocation shall be made in writing
by the Fire Department to the organization. The Fire Chief or his designee may
reinstate a permit upon proof that the permit holder is in compliance with all
provisions and rules pertaining to this Section.

3302.11. Administrative Fines.

In addition to any other remedy available at law, any person or entity who
possesses, uses, stores, sells and/or displays dangerous fireworks or any person
or entity who possesses, uses, sells and/or displays Safe and Sane fireworks on
or at dates, times, or locations other than those permitted by this Section are
subject to an administrative fine of not less than one-thousand dollars ($1,000.00).

32




3302.12. Seijzure of Fireaworks.

The Fire Chief or designee shall seize, take, remove or cause to be
removed, at the expense of the owner, all stocks of fireworks offered or exposed
for sale, stored or held in violation of this Section. Such seizure shall be subject
to cost recovery in accordance with Section 109.4.

3302.13. Appeals.

(a) A citation issued for failure to comply with the provisions of this
Section shall be appealed pursuant to Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 1,
Article 4.

(b) The denial of an application for a fireworks permit shall be
appealed pursuant to Fresno Municipal Code, Chapter 1, Article 4. If no
appeal is filed within the time prescribed, the action of the Fire Chief or
designee shall be final.

(c) A minor and the parent(s) or guardian(s) having custody and
control of said minor, are jointly and severally liable to the City for any
administrative citation and/or penalty issued for failure to comply with the
provisions of this Section.

(d) The administrative citation penaity may become a special
assessment or a lien against the property of any person who is issued a
citation for violation of the provisions of this Section. This shall include the
property of a minor who is issued a citation and/or the property of the
parent(s) or guardian(s) having custody and control of the minor or private
property owner that allows the illegal use or storage on their property. The
procedures set forth in Section 1-506 shall be followed for the imposition
of a special assessment or lien,

SECTION 10-53303. PROHIBITION OF EXPLOSIVES.
Section 3303 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

3303. Prohibition of Explosives. The possession, storage, use and
handling of explosives are prohibited within the limits established by law.

Exception:  Storage and sale of small arms ammunition, small
arms primers, smokeless powder and black sporting powder in
accordance with Title 19, Chapter 10, Article 12 of the California Code of
Regulations and Section 307 of the California Building Code.

33




FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS

SECTION 10-53404.2.9.6.1. LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS
ARE PROHIBITED.

Section 3404.2.9.6.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:
3404.2.96.1. Locations Where Above-ground Tanks are Prohibited.
Storage of Class | and I liquids in above-ground outside of buildings shall be in
accordance with the protected above-ground tank provisions of Section 2206.2.3.
Exceptions:
1. Bulk plants and terminals.

2. Refineries.

3. Standby generators with integral base tanks for Class I
liquids when installed per Fire Prevention and Investigation Division
Standards. :

4. For above-ground tanks at farms and construction site,
see FMC 10-53406.2.4.

SECTION 10-53404.3.5.1. BASEMENT STORAGE.
Section 3404.3.5.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:
3404.3.5.1. Basement Storage. Class | liquids shall not be stored in
basements. Class Il and llIA liquids shall be allowed to be stored in basements,

provided that automatic fire suppression and other fire protection are provided in
accordance with Chapter 9.

SECTION 10-563406.2.4. PERMANENT AND TEMPORARY TANKS.
Section 3406.2.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:
3406.2.4. Permanent and Temporary Tanks. The aggregate capacity of
permanent and temporary above-ground tanks containing Class | and Il liquids

shall not exceed 1,100 gallons (4163.9L). Tanks shall be constructed in
accordance with Section 3404.2.

Exception: Protected above-ground tanks meeting the
requirements of Section 2206.2.3.

34




LIQUIFIED PETROLEUM GASES
SECTION 10-53801.3. CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.
Section 3801.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

3801.3. Construction Documents. Where a single container or aggregate
of containers is more than 125 gallons in water capacity, the installer shall submit
construction documents for such installation.

SECTION 4: If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this
ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect
the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City Council of the City of
Fresno hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each section,
subsection, clause or phrase thereof, regardless if any one or more sections,
subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

35




KhkRhhkkhkhkhkkhRkhkhhkhkhkrrkkdk

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF FRESNO ) ss.
CITY OF FRESNO )

|, REBECCA E. KLISCH, City Clerk of the City of Fresno, certify that the
foregoing ordinance was adopted by the Council of the City of Fresno, at a regular

, 2010.

meeting held on the day of
AYES
NOES
ABSENT
ABSTAIN
Mayor Approval :

, 2010

Mayor Approval/No Return:

Mayor Veto:

, 2010

, 2010

Council Override

, 2010

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
CITY ATTORNEY), OFF)C/E/E,///“‘

-/
BX- /ﬂ (7
éééﬁﬁfégugu ON L. CHAFFIN

Senior Deputy City Attorney

REBECCA E. KLISCH
City Clerk

BY:

Deputy

36




RESOLUTIONNO. 2 (30~ Z 7%
A RESOLUTION OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
FRESNO, CALIFORNIA MAKING AND ADOPTING EXPRESS
FINDINGS THAT MODIFICATIONS OR CHANGES TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE ARE REASONABLY NECESSARY
BECAUSE OF LOCAL CLIMACTIC, GEOLOGICAL AND
TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS

WHEREAS, the State of California has adopted the 2009 edition of the International
Fire Code, with amendments, which was entitled the 2010 California Fire Code. The 2010
California Fire Code has been incorporated into Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of
Regulations and will take effect on January 1, 2011; and,

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 authorizes the City, by
ordinance, to make changes or modifications to the requirements contained in the provisions
of the California Fire Code and other regulations adopted pursuant to California Health &
Safety Code Section 17921(a) that result in more stringent local requirements; and,

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7
require more stringent local requirements be supported by express findings made by a city
that such modifications or changes are “reasonably necessary because of local climactic,
geological or topographical conditions”; and,

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Fresno intends this Resolution to fulfill the
requirements of the California Health & Safety Code regarding modifications or changes to
the California Fire Code including express findings of reasonable necessity because of local
climactic, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Fresno that said

Council expressly finds each of the various proposed modifications or changes to the

California Fire Code, which are enumerated below, are reasonably necessary because of
1




local climatic, geological and topographical conditions in the area encompassed by the City
of Fresno, as follows;
A. LOCAL CONDITIONS:

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5, local climatic,
topographical or geological conditions make the amendments to the California Fire Code

reasonably necessary.

1. CLIMATIC — EXTREME TEMPERATURES

1.1 As documented in the 2025 Fresno General Plan' and the Master
Environmental Impact Report No. 101307 for the General Plan, during the summer months
the City of Fresno experiences periods of what can only be described as extreme heat.
Attached as Exhibit 1 and incorporated by reference is historical data compiled by the
National Weather Service documenting temperatures experienced in Fresno during the
months of May through October, This data shows that during the months of July and
August, Fresno's daily high temperature has averaged in excess of 90 degrees. Attached as
Exhibit 2 and incorporated by reference is a chart setting forth the high temperatures in
Fresno, San Francisco, and San Diego for each day from July 1, 2006, through July 31,
2006, as reported by the National Weather Service. During this approximately 31-day
period, the average high temperature in Fresno was 103.4 degrees, the average high
temperature in San Diego was 81.2 degrees, and the average high temperature in San
Francisco was 68.8 degrees. Furthermore, during this 31-day period, the average
temperature in Fresno was 87.8 degrees, the average temperature in San Diego was 76.3
degrees, and the average temperature in San Francisco was 61.7 degrees. Finally, during
this 31-day period Fresno experienced 20 days where the maximum temperature exceeded
100 degrees, while neither San Diego nor San Francisco experienced such temperatures at
any time during the 31-day period. These extreme local climatic conditions are
representative of the high-temperatures typically affecting Fresno during the summer
months.

Although Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 does not require the local conditions
to be unique to a particular jurisdiction, the temperature chart demonstrates that the
temperatures experienced in Fresno are extreme as compared to temperatures experienced

1 The 2025 Fresno General Plan at p. 166.states, "Fire Hazards. Fresno's high summer temperatures,
intense sunlight, and low rainfall potentiate fires by drying and pre-heating combustible material and by
fostering spontaneous combustion of flammable material. Fresno’s estimated maximum wind speed (used
to design structures) is 70 mph, which could fan blazes to a high intensity.”

2 Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130 at p. states, “ The climate of the FMA [Fresno Metropolitan
Areal] is characterized by hot, dry summers ... Temperatures in the FMA range from a mean monthly maximum
of 97.9 [degrees] F in July to a mean monthly minimum of 36.3 [degrees] F in December.

2



in other parts of California.

1.2 The Heat Stress Index published by the Federal Emergency Management
Agency in its publication entitled Emergency Incident Rehabilitation sets forth the stress
placed on the human body when exposed to various temperatures and humilities. This Heat
Stress Index is attached as Exhibit 3 and incorporated by reference. A note under the Heat
Stress Chart states that 10 degrees should be added to the temperature when protective
clothing is worn and an additional 10 degrees should be added when the person is standing
in direct sunlight. According to this chart, a person exposed to temperatures between 90
and 105 degrees is subject to heat cramps and heat exhaustion if exposure to these
temperatures is prolonged and there is physical activity. A person exposed to temperatures
of 105 to 130 degrees is likely to experience heat cramps and heat exhaustion.
Furthermore, heat stroke is possible if exposure is prolonged and there is physical activity.
A person exposed to temperatures above 130 degrees or greater faces a high risk of
suffering from heat stroke.

1.3 Because of the extreme heat Fresno experiences during the summer months,
Fresno Firefighters responding to fires and other incidents requiring the evacuation of a
building, are regularly exposed to temperatures in excess of 105 degrees, when accounting
for their protective gear, exposing them to the probability of heat cramps, heat exhaustion
and possibly heat stroke.

2. GEOLOGICAL - LIMITED WATER SUPPLY AND WATER PRESSURE

2.1 The Fresno Metropolitan area is arid area that receives an average of 10 to 12
inches of precipitation per year occurring primarily in the winter months. Furthermore, the
City of Fresno primarily relies on groundwater for its municipal water supply. The
underground aquifer is in a state of overdraft estimated at approximately 10,000-acre feet
per year. Finally, local rainfall alone, even if fully captured, would meet only 20 percent of
the Fresno Metropolitan Area's water needs.

2.2 Due to the hot, dry summers in the Fresno area, domestic water demand
substantially reduces the ability of the public water system to dependably meet the larger fire
flow demand in many areas of the City.

3. CLIMATIC/TOPOGRAPHICAL -~ POOR AIR QUALITY CAUSED BY TOPOGRAPHY
OF SAN JOAQUIN VALLEY AIR BASIN, LARGE NUMBER OF SUNNY DAYS AND
INVERSIONS THAT FORM DURING WINTER MONTHS

3.1 As a result of the San Joaquin Vailey's climate and topography, the San
Joaquin Valley Air Basin (SJIVAP) is predisposed to poor air quality. High mountain ranges
surrounding the Valley frequently create air layer inversions that prevent mixing of air
masses. The large number of sunny days per year, and high temperatures in the summer,
favor the formation of ozone. The area is s0 sunny the City of Fresno was ranked the
second highest major California city for sunshine, with an estimated 79% annual average of



possible sunshine for more than a forty-year period.” In the winter, inversions form that often
trap particulate matter.*

3.2  The Federal EPA and California Air Resources Board have classified the San
Joaquin Valley Air Basin as severe non-attainment for Ozone and serious non-attainment
(Federal) non-attainment (State) for PMu. Ozone is formed by a complex series of chemical
reactions between reactive organic gases (ROG), oxides of nitrogen and sunlight. PMiois
suspended particulate matter that is less than 10 microns in size. Given its small size, PMio
can remain airborne for long periods and can be inhaled, pass through the respiratory
system, and lodge in the lungs. In general, nonattainment means that the Federal standard
has been exceeded more than twice per year.®

3.3 Smoke is composed primarily of carbon dioxide, water vapor, carbon
monoxide, particulate matter, hydrocarbons and other organic chemicals, nitrogen oxides,
trace minerals and several thousand other compounds. Particulate matter is the principal
pollutant of concern from some for the relatively short-term exposures (hours to weeks)
typically experienced by the public. Particulate matter in wood smoke has a size range near
the wavelength of visible light (.4-.7 micrometers). Since these particles can be inhaled into
the deepest recesses of the lungs they are thought to represent a greater health concern
than larger particles. Another pollutant of concern during some events is carbon monoxide.°
The San Joaquin Valley Air Pollution Control District states "Emissions from burning include
fine particulate, hydrocarbons, oxides of nitrogen, oxides of sulfur, carbon monoxide, and
toxic air contaminants that contribute to our air quality problems."

4. TOPOGRAPHICAL ~ FRESNO'S DEVELOPMENT PATTERN

4.1 Due to the relatively low density growth pattern in the Fresno area, the City of
Fresno's nineteen fire stations are spaced approximately four miles apart resulting in an
average of a two mile running distance for the designated first-in engine company.

4.2 This average two mile travel distance increases the response time to fires
which result in an increase in the size and intensity of fires.

B. REASONABLE NECESSITY
The Council of the City of Fresno expressly finds the modifications and changes to
the California Fire Code are reasonably necessary due to the local conditions set forth

above since they reduce the risks to life, property, public health and safety that result from

3 See hitp://www.ncdc.noaa.govioalclimate/online/ccd/petposrank. txt.

4 Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130, 2025 Fresno General Plan, p. V-C1.

5 Master Environmental Impact Report No. 10130, 2025 Fresno General Pian, p. V-C1-C3.
4




the City of Fresno’s climatic, geological and topographical conditions. The modifications and
changes are further reasonably necessary and justified for the reasons set forth below.

In adopting the California Fire Code as the City of Fresno Fire Code, the City of
Fresno proposes to make certain modifications or changes whose effect is to impose more
stringent requirements locally than are mandated by the California Fire Code. These are
specifically listed below, but may be generally characterized as relating to (1) solar panel
installation; (2) fire sprinkler systems; (3) luminous exit markings; (4) additional regulation of
lumber yards, woodworking, recycling, and waste handling facilities; and (5) additional
regulation of motor fuel dispensing and repair garages, locations of above-ground tanks, the
amount of Class 1 and Class Il liquids at farms and construction sites in above-ground tanks
and basement storage of flammable liquids. These requirements are reasonably necessary
to address risks created by local climatic, geological or topographical conditions set forth
above for the following reasons:

1. INSTALLATION OF SOLAR PANELS IN ACCORDANCE WITH CALIFORNIA STATE

FIRE MARSHAL GUIDELINES: FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 10-
50605.11

1.1 The City of Fresno was ranked the second highest major California city for
sunshine, with an estimated 79% annual average of possible sunshine for more than a forty-
year period. Local sunny conditions are conducive to a growing prevalence and use of solar
panel arrays in the City of Fresno. These solar panel arrays are commonly located on the
roofs of buildings to take advantage of local sunlight conditions given structural designs
resulting from the local topography and arid conditions. The presence of solar panel arrays
on the roofs of buildings present fire ground operational issues including restricted access
points to the roof, delay in deploying ground ladders, restricted locations for effective roof
venting, and live direct current conductors on the roof and inside the attic. Solar panel
placement done without regard to firefighter access and safety can result in additional
working time on roofs, delays in fire suppression efforts, greater exposure by firefighters to
health risks associated with exposure to sustained high temperatures, and increase in fire
duration creating more smoke affecting air quality and requiring increased use of water.

8 Wildfire Smoke — A Guide for Public Health Officials ( 2001) Published by the Washington State
Department of Health, p. 3; Fire Suppression Training — Requirements for Fire Fighter Training Exercises
(July 28, 2008),

5



1.2 By establishing a layout for solar panel arrays that takes into account fire
ground operation needs, fewer firefighters and less time will be needed to affect roof venting
operations. As such, this ordinance mandating installation of solar arrays in accordance with
California State Fire Marshal established guidelines is reasonably necessary to protect the
health and safety of firefighters and other emergency personnel in light of Fresno's extremely
high temperatures during the summer months and to lessen the time delays in properly
venting and overhauling building fires thus reducing smoke generations affecting air quality
and fire suppression water use from such fires.

2. MORE RESTRICTIVE REQUIREMENTS FOR INSTALLATION OF FIRE
SPRINKLERS: FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE AMENDMENTS SECTIONS 10-
50803.1, 10-50903.2.1 THROUGHT 10-50903.2.10 AND 10-60903.3.1 THROUGH
10-50912.2.3

2.1 The Fresno Municipal Code Amendments contain more restrictive
requirements for installation of fire sprinklers than those in found in the California Fire Code.
The requirements are located at Fresno Municipal Code Section 10-50903.1 (requiring
retrofitting of fire sprinklers under prescribed conditions based on fire damage, building
additions, a change of use to a higher life safety hazard or condominium conversions),
Sections 10-50903.2.1 through 10-50903.2.10 (requiring fire sprinklers at a reduced square
footage threshold) and Sections 10-60903.3.1 through 10-50912.2.3 (requiring more
restrictive installation details to assist responding firefighters). The amendments are
reasonably necessary to address risks created by local climatic, geological or topographical
conditions.

2.2 Approximately thirty percent of all residential fires start in the kitchen.’
Furthermore, studies and testing performed by the United States Fire Administration has
resulted in the United States Fire Administration concluding that a single low flow residential
sprinkler in the kitchen was able to control both the cooking oil fire and an appliance fire on
the countertop.®

2.3 Studies performed by the city of Scottsdale, Arizona established in over 90
percent of the cases where automatic fire sprinklers were activated, the fires were controlled
with one fire sprinkler. Those one sprinkler activations deposited an average of 276 gallons
of water in the structure, compared to an estimated average of 4,876 gallons that would have
been sprayed by fire department hoses had sprinklers not been available.® In summary, fires
in buildings with sprinkier systems use thousands of gallons of water less to extinguish the

7 January 10, 2006 Staff Report to City Council relating to requiring Automatic Fire Sprinklers stated,
"Nationally over the past ten years, more than 16 percent of all residential fire deaths, more than 29 percent
of all injuries, and 30 percent of all residential fires were the direct result of kitchen fires." Exhibit B to
January 10, 2006 Staff Report was a table showing that since 1996 on average 30 percent of fires in the
Fresno Metropolitan Area that started in kitchen.
8 U.8. Fire Administration, "Localized Suppression Systems for the Kitchen,” December 28, 2006,
g January 10, 2006 Staff Report to Fresno City Council relating to Mandating Automatic Fire Sprinkler
Systems in new Residential Occupancies.

6



fire than fires that occur in non-sprinklered property. '

2.4 Fires in non-sprinklered buildings generate orders of magnitude more smoke
than fires controlled with automatic fire sprinklers. As set forth above, smoke contains
particulate matter and other pollutants which contribute to the San Joaquin Valley's sever
non-attainment status relating to PMyo and ozone.

2.5 As such, this ordinance mandating more restrictive fire sprinkler installation
standards is expressly found to be reasonably necessary to address risks created by local
climatic, geological or topographical conditions, including limiting fire personnel's exposure to
extreme temperatures, reducing the amount of water necessary to extinguish fires, reducing
the amount of smoke generated by such fires and addressing extended run time due to
topography-related low density growth pattern in the Fresno.

3. INSTALLATION OF LUMINOUS EXIT PATH MARKINGS SHALL BE PROVIDED IN
ALL ENCLOSED STAIRWAYS IN ALL NEW BUILDINGS WITH THREE OR MORE
STORIES: FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE, SECTION 10-51024.1 ’

3.1 Reports and studies related to building evacuation have concluded that the use
of luminous egress markings indicators are effective in guiding occupants out of a building,
with or without the use of electrical power."" This is because luminous exit path markings
are not dependent upon electricity for illumination and they are placed at floor level as this is
where the most visibility is in the event of smoke.” Traditional electrical exit lighting is
located higher (above doorways) which is obscured when smoke fills a room or hallway.

3.2 By making it easier for individuals to evacuate buildings unassisted, fewer
firefighters will have to respond to fires to assist with evacuation and/or firefighter resources
can be directed toward fire suppression efforts to reduce fire intensity and duration.
Accordingly, fewer firefighters will be exposed to health risks associated with exposure to
sustained high temperatures and shorter fire duration can reduce smoke generations
affecting air quality and fire suppression water use from such fires. As such, this ordinance
mandating installation of luminous egress path markings in certain occupancies three stories
or more is expressly found to be reasonably necessary to protect the health and safety of
firefighters and other emergency personnel in light of Fresno's extremely high temperatures,
air quality, limited water supply and pressure, and extended run time due to topography-
related low density growth pattern in the Fresno. :

4. REQUIREMENTS REGARDING LUMBER YARDS, WOODWORKING, RECYCLING,
AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES: FRESNO MUNICIPAL CODE, SECTIONS

10 "Cost/Benefit to Society for Having Sprinklers in One-and-Two-Family Dwellings — A Pessimistic

Analysis"
11 Amy, James D.; The Path at Your Feet - The Shift in Emergency Lighting; International Fire Protection

Magazine.
12 Amy, James D.; The Path at Your Feet — The Shift in Emergency Lighting; International Fire Protection

Magazine.
7



10-51901.1, 10-51907.2, 10-51907.3, 10-51907.6, 10-51908.3, 10-51908.4, 10-
©1908.7, 10-561908.11 AND 10-51908.12

4.1 In 2003, the City of Fresno Fire Department was involved in costly and time
consuming fire suppression activities at two separate wood waste and green waste recycling
facilities. Neither of these two facilities was in compliance with the requirements of Chapter
19 of the California Fire Code. After review of the suppression activities of both incidents,
the City of Fresno Fire Department has concluded that even if the facilities had been in
compliance with Chapter 19, the City would not have had the necessary equipment to rapidly
suppress the fires. As a result, the fires lingered for numerous days, causing health and
safety issues for the residents of the City and impacting air quality.

4.2 The City of Fresno currently has a number of wood waste and green waste
recycling facilities within its boundaries and anticipates more like facilities as the City
endeavors to reduce the amount of solid waste processed in landfills,

4.3  The Fresno Fire Department has concluded that it does not have adequate
equipment to quickly engage and control a fire.

4.4 Winter conditions in Fresno and the entire Central Valley include rain and other
moisture issues (Tule Fog). The green waste/recycling business is very well known for the
problem of spontaneous combustion associated with it when the right amount of moisture
creates a chemical reaction that develops heat which in turn, if unchecked, starts fires in the
green waste piles. As set forth above, much of the year, Fresno has very hot, dry
conditions. This makes all combustible materials more so, which increases the general fire
hazard. As set forth above, this causes an obvious heat exposure to the firefighters that are
responding to and addressing the emergency.

4.5  The larger the pile of wood product, the more heat retained and the more fikely
the pile will spontaneously combust. The larger the pile, the more difficult the fire is to fight,
and as a result, the fire will burn longer, causing smoke to linger in the valley, creating a
continuous health hazard to the residents and negatively affecting air quality.

4.6  The amendments to the California Fire Code reducing the dimensions of the
size of the piles of such wood materials, and imposing additional safety measures, is
necessary to ensure the City of Fresno's Fire Department’s ability to quickly engage such
fires and control them. By requiring pile size restrictions, separation and access the fire
crews may more readily abate the emergency and/or hazard. On-site water mains and
hydrant system will provide a more readily available source of water for firefighting, and will
reduce the time it takes the fire crews to set up and extinguish a fire. The less time it takes
to start the extinguishment process, the less time the fire has to spread and intensify.
Access to a limited-size pile of green waste/recyclable material via all-weather roads will
reduce the response time required by the Fire Department to set up and address a fire
problem. Perimeter fencing provides a higher level of security for the business site and
thereby reduces the threat of a possible arson-caused fire. Wood by-product stored in piles
has a tendency to spontaneously combust and spread within a large pile.

8



4.7 The amendments relating to the storage of wood product are necessary to
reduce, or attempt to reduce, air pollution in the San Joaquin Valley caused by wood fires,
which is detrimentally enhanced by the above described local climatic, geologic and
topographical conditions in the San Joaguin Valley.

5 REGULATION OF MOTOR FUEL DISPENSING AND REPAIR GARAGES,
LOCATIONS OF ABOVE-GROUND TANKS, THE AMOUNT OF CLASS 1 AND
CLASS Il LIQUIDS AT FARMS AND CONSTRUCTION SITES IN ABOVE-GROUND
TANKS AND BASEMENT STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE LIQUIDS: FRESNO

10-563404.3.5.1

5.1 The following describes when particle classes of liquids and gases reach
boiling if temperatures remain at over 100°F:

Class | flammable liguids: Some of these liquids, such as gasoline and
acetone, have boiling points (rapid release of ignitable vapors) at
temperatures of 100-130 degrees F. Elevated ambient temperatures for
these liquids increases the generation of flammable vapors and increases
the chance of ignition.

Class Il combustible liguids: These liquids have flash points (the
temperature at which a liquid emits ignitable vapors) at or above 100°F.
Local climatic conditions in the summer cause many common combustible
liquids such as charcoal lighter fluid or paint thinner to be in a state of
ready ignition from a spark or open flame.

For flammable and combustible liquids and gasses, the range of
ignitability as a percentage of vapor volume in air increases with rise in
temperature. For example: gasoline vapor at room temperature will ignite
(lower flammability limit or LFL) at 1.07 percent of air volume; at 100°F
gasoline will ignite at .94 percent of air volume. ™

5.2 Assetforth above, much of the year Fresno has very hot, dry conditions. This
local condition makes all combustible materials (grass, weeds, buildings, roof, etc.) highly
combustible, which increases the general fire hazard. High temperatures also make all
flammable liquids and gases much more volatile, increasing the fire hazard.

53  Therefore, increased regulation of the storage of certain classes of fuels and
gases is reasonably necessary to reduce the fire risk associated with the ignition of fuel and
gases caused by local conditions. ‘

LRt Rttt R e T



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )

COUNTY OF FRESNO ) ss.
CITY OF FRESNO )

I, REBECCA E. KLISCH, City Clerk of the City of Fresno, certify that the foregoing
ordinance was adopted by the Council for the City of Fresno, at a regular meeting held
on the day of , 2010.

AYES

NOES

ABSENT

ABSTAIN
Mayor Approval : , 2010
Mayor Approval/No Return: , 2010
Mayor Veto: , 2010
Council Override , 2010

REBECCA E. KLISCH
City Clerk

BY:

Deputy

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
CITY ATTORNEYS OFFICE

BY: : ////0//0
ON L. CHAFFIN
r Deputy City Attorney
Attachments:

o Exhibit"1" — Historical temperature data compiled by the National Weather Service
o Exhibit "2" - Maximum Temperatures Chart
o Exhibit "3" - Heat Stress Index

13 NFPA Fire Protection Handbaook 18th Edition
10




Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: May

National Weather Service

San Joaquin Valley - Hanford, CA

Normals, Means & Extremes EXHIBIT 1
May - Fresno, CA esTene
Values in red represent the extremes for the month.
» Temperature Degree Days Precipitation D
a ) N a
é v N;:‘l:m e, High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. | Low Min. }g:;;:)g }:(%%?5 iﬁgfl‘)l?)g :S\:%%}E Daily Sr:ggg \l‘o N;;i?:xﬁn i
T 79151 ]651101/1947(57 /1955162 /2006{38/1899] 3 {2409] 3 46 10.02| 10.63 }0.67 /19951 1
2 179 52 ] 651101/ 1947]60/ 1908164 / 1947{40/ 1964} 2 {2411] 3 49 10,02} 10.65 j0.57/ 1908} 2
3179152 165(99/1947152/71892}63/2004{38/1964] 2 |2413}] 3 52 10.02) 10.67 {10.80/1892) 3
4 | 79152 1 66 [100 /200458 / 1930}64 /2004|397 1950 2 |2415] 3 55 10.024 10.69 10.20/ 1998{ 4
5 18015266 {99/1990(57/1921165/1989|36/ 19751 2 12417] 4 59 10.02] 10.71 }1.02/2005] 5
6 | 80153166 |100/1987|58/1921]69/1992141/1975) 2 i2419] 4 63 10.02] 10.73 [0.48/7 1994} 6
7 | 80| 531 67 {103/ 1987|567 1905}69 / 198936/ 1965} 2 {2421 4 67 10.02] 10.75 11.02/ 1905} 7
8 | 80 153167 {101/2001{59/1977171/ 198703971933} 2 |2423} 4 71 }0.02} 10.77 J0.38 / 1918} §
9 181 {33167 1101/2001{57/1922{66/2001|39/1922] 2 |2425{ 4 75 [0.01} 10.78 10.63/ 1989} 9
10 {81 [ 54167 199/1993]60/1933|66/ 193141 /1922] 2 [2427] 4 79 10.01} 10.79 10.16/ 1900} 10
11} 81} 54| 68 {100/2001162 /1900|707 1987{40 /1909 1 {2428| 5 84 10.01] 10.80 §1.64/ 1900} 11
12 182154 | 68 |100/ 198754 /1998168 / 1987142 / 1907 1 24291 5 89 10.01] 10.81 ]0.33/1998] 12
13 1 82| 54 ] 68 1103/ 1976{64 / 199866/ 1987144 / 1956] 1 |24301 5 94 10.01F 10.82 ]11.60/ 1931 13
14 1 821 551 68 1102/ 1972|164/ 195766 / 1996}43 / 1955) 1 |2431} 5 99 10.01] 10.83 |0.56/1894] 14
15 1 82| 551 69 {102/ 1927160/ 1953]70 /1 2006[42 / 1955] 1 12432 5 104 0.01] 10.84 10.83/1987] 15
16 1 831551 69 1103/ 1970|164 /1930F71 /2008|407 1894] 1 {2433] 5 109 10.014 10.85 [0.13/2005] 16
17 [ 83 | 55 | 69 [106/2009(64 / 199473 /2008144 / 1974] 1 [2434f 6 115 10,011 10.86 10.44/1915) 17
18 1 83 1 551 69 |103/2008|63/1994]73 /2008142 /1893] 1 24351 ¢ 121 10.01] 10.87 {0.86/1957] 18
19 1 84 1 56 1 70 {103 /72008163 /1972{70 /2009142 /1896 1 12436] 6 127 10.011 10,88 10.30/ 1925} 19
20 184 |1 561 70 1102/ 1947{61/1921§71/1897]|44 7/ 1962] 1 {2437} ¢ 133 10.01] 10.89 {0.65/ 1925] 20
21 1 84 1 56 170 {104/ 1892{56/ 1933169 /2001142 /1975 1 12438) ¢ 139 10.01] 10.90 {0.28 / 2006} 21
22 1 85| 56 1 70 {1047 196767 /2010[71 /1892143 /1909] | |2439] 7 146 10.01] 10.91 [0.15/ 1958} 22
23 1 85| 56 | 71 [103/71967{65/1916[71 /2000|144 /1960f 1 |2440} 7 153 10.01] 10.92 10.23/ 1990} 23
24 | 851 57 | 71 1103 /1924{64 /1916|687 1943141 /1953 1 |2441} 7 160 {0.01} 10.93 ]0.22/1931] 24
25 1851 57 { 71 |1027 1890[59/ 1906/68 / 1890}42 / 1930} 1 {2442] 7 167 10.01} 10.94 10.24/1901| 25
26 | 851 57 | 71 103/ 1974{66/ 1946[68 / 1951140/ 1953] 1 12443 7 174 10.011 10.95 10.94/ 1946{ 26
27 186157172 1104/1974155/ 1971169/ 19511467 1998] 0 2443 7 181 10.01] 10.96 {0.63/ 1971} 27
28 186 | 58172 1107/ 1984|158 /1953169 / 2009{45/ 1927 ¢ {24431 8 189 10.01} 10.97 11.34/ 1906] 28
29 | 86 | 58 | 72 107/ 1984]69 /198872 /1939|457 1906 © [2443) 3 197 10.01{ 10.98 10,46/ 1906{ 29
30 { 87 | S8 | 72 1109/ 1910|164 /1948|767 1984145/ 19881 0 12443] 8 205 10.01] 10.99 [0.38 7/ 1948 30
3V 187§ 581 72 {110/ 1910168/ 197172/ 191046/ 1923} © {24431 8§ 213 10.01] 11.00 [0.15/ 1961 31
Avg.182.7]154.9168.8 37 170 0.39 Avg,
? MaX'N:::;l Ave High Max. | Low Max. | Righ Min. | Low Min, ’(’sa‘:[‘;‘)g Ef{;%i:‘l igﬁ:{;‘)& E%%E Daily sr:g{ia:o N&fmn ?
¢ Temperature Degree Days Precipitation e
hitp://www.wrh.noaa.gov/hnx/fat/mormals/fatO5nrm. htm 11/5/2010



Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: May

National Weather Service San Joaquin Valley - Hanford, CA
Normals, Means & Extremes EXHIBIT 1
PAGE 2A OF 8
June - Fresno, CA
Values in red represent the extremes for the month,
D Temperature Degree Days Precipitation b
a Normal . [Nermat] .. .. |Nonmal Nonnal 4
. . . . {Heating Cool .1 Scas Record
é T . e High Max. | Low Max, | High Min. | Low Min. (éjs“’;:;’ ;Lg;t (3;;;? 1800?)35(2 Daily :)zizu Ma.b\*(;:::um é
i 105/ 60/ T/ 44 / 0.60/ |
87 58 73 1910 1953 2001 1955 1 124441 9 222 10.01 11.01 1899
2 106/ 671/ 70/ 45/ 0.33/ 2
87 59 73 1960 1985 1960 1902 1 |24451 9 231 10.014 11.02 1685
3 167/ 6o/ 72/ 44/ 0.24/ 3
g8 59 73 1912 1936 1937 1908 1 |2446) 9 240 10.014 11.03 1945
4 105/ 72/ 73/ 46/ 031/ 4
88 59 73 1996 1954 1912 1908 1 124471 9 249 10.01] 11.04 1993
5 107/ 577 727 48/ 1.30/ 5
88 59 74 1981 1894 1926 1954 0 [2447) 9 258 10.01} 11.05 1993
6 107/ 63/ 757 46/ 1.80/ 6
88 59 74 1903 1894 1926 1954 0 124471 10 | 268 {0.01] 11.06 1998
7 107/ 66/ 76/ 46/ 1.08/ 7
89 59 74 1977 1914 1903 1956 0 12447 10 {278 {0.01} 11.07 1931
8 105/ 69/ 76/ 47/ 0.56/ g
89 60 74 1973 2000 1903 1650 0 ]2447| 10 | 288 {0.01] 11.08 2000 ’
9 108/ 66/ 707 48/ 0.16/ 9
89 60 75 1902 1954 1903 1901 0 2447 10 | 298 10.01] 11.09 1957
10 106/ 65/ 70/ 46/ 0377 10
89 60 75 1986 1976 1939 1954 0 |24471 10 { 308 {0.01} 11.1 1976
1 106/ 71/ 72/ 47/ 0.247/ i
90 60 75 1979 1894 1918 1894 0 24471 11 | 319 ]0.01] 1L.11 1907
D 107/ 66/ 73/ 47/ ‘ 0.01/ 12
90 60 75 1985 1998 1985 1952 0 [2447] 11 330 10.01] 11.12 1891
13 107/ 69/ Tt/ 47/ 0.12/ 13
) 90 61 76 1949 1922 1985 1907 0 (2447} 11 341 10.01} 11,13 1922 )
14 108 / 65/ 72/ 43/ 1.66/ 14
91 61 76 1966 1962 2007 1507 0 [2447] 11 | 352 10.01311.14 1939
15 109/ 68/ 771 47/ 0.66/ 15
91 61 76 1961 1995 2000 1907 0 [2447] 12 | 364 {0.01} 11.15 1995 i
16 110/ 71/ 74/ 46/ 0.04/ 16
) 91 61 76 1961 1921 1985 1995 0 |2447] 12 | 376 {0.01} 11.16 1929 ’
17 107/ 68 / 757 49/ 0.08/ 17
91 61 76 1917 1909 1985 1939 0 [2447] 12 | 388 {0.01}11.17 1909
18 106/ 717 727 50/ 0.06/ 18
92 62 77 1945 1909 1918 1908 0 124471 12 | 400 J0.01} 11.18 1894
19 106/ 72/ 757 51/ 0.08/ 19
92 62 77 1962 1897 1918 1893 0 24471 12 | 412 10.01]11.19 1914
20 110/ 787 757 50/ 0.01/ 20
92 62 77 1920 1897 1918 1908 0 24471 13 | 425 ]0.01f 11.2 1988
1 110/ 771/ 75/ 51/ 21
92 62 77 2008 1944 2008 1912 0 2447 13 {438 (0.0} 11.2] 0
9 108/ 717 76/ 49/ 0,01/ 22
93 63 78 1981 1912 1921 1923 0 |2447] 13 {451 {001} 11.22 1921
23 109/ 74/ 757 50/ 73
93 63 78 1895 1912 2006 1893 0 124471 13 {464 {0.01} 11.23 | Te./1952] ~
24 1o/ | 57 ) 764 | s1/ 001/ |24

http://www.wrh.noaa,.gov/hnx/fat/normals/fatO6nrm.htm 11/5/2010



EArHBDL)
. PAGE 2B OF 6
Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: May

93 63 78 1929 1975 2006 1912 0O 24471 14 [ 4781 0 | 11.23 1988
95 112/ 72/ 80/ 47/ 0.06/ 25
; 93 63 78 1925 1996 1925 1975 0 {24471 14 | 492] 0 11.23 1899
2% 108/ 69/ 77/ 48/ 0127 2%
94 63 79 1993 1913 1925 1963 0 (2447) 14 | 506 O |11.23 1941
27 110/ 76/ 77/ St/ 0.06/ Y
" 94 64 79 1925 1906 1973 1955 0 {2447] 14 [ 520} 0 ]11.23 1996 -
28 108/ 71/ 77/ 5t/ 0.01/ 28
) 94 64 79 2610 1952 1926 1906 0 (2447} 14 | 5341 0 111.23 1920
29 110/ 77/ 78/ 49/ 0.12/ 29
94 64 79 1891 1982 1977 1963 0 (24471 15 1549 O |11.23 1982
1 12/ 68/ 751 537 0.19/ 30
95 64 79 1891 1982 1984 1970 0 j24471 15 | 564 ] 0 |11.23 1982
Avg. 1 909 | 61.2 ] 76.1 4 351 0.23 Avg.
. Normal
po | Mex | M} oAve § o ncating|Normall coonng NomalE - gens Record | D
? — High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. { Low Min. (gj‘;;)i’ é)e;l)s;l; (:x);n';)& ESoc%s‘gl(; Daily :;EZ” Max?mrum ?
¢ Temperature Degree Days Precipitation ¢

http:/fwww . wrh.noaa.gov/hnx/fat/normals/fatO6nrm. htm 11/572010



. PAGE 3 OF 6
Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: July

National Weather Service San Joaquin Vatley - Haniord, CA

Normals, Means & Extremes

July - Fresno, CA

Values in red represent the extremes for the month.

D Temperature Degree Days Precipitation D
a ] vy a
; o N:::m o High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. | Low Min. 1(152:1';)& g?é}gg (;g:)‘l‘;f’ Egzi;;:::{:j Daily SI:%&:{'Z‘:G f\ﬁiﬁﬁﬁﬂ (t,
1 195})641]80 114/ 1891182/ 1982180/ 193453 /1975] © 0 15 1579 10.01f 0.01 | Tr./1916] |
2 [ 95| 65]80{110/1942}70/1916{78/1924|51/1956] O 0 15 15941 0| 001 |Tr. /1961 2
3195165180 1110/2001178/1910{78/2001{50/ 1901} 0 0 16 | 6101 0 | 0.01 {0.14/1925] 3
4 1961651480 [112/1889]|79/1955|81 /200151 /1951 O 0 16 1626 0 | 0.01 {Tr./18% | 4
S 196 |65} 80 {112/1991]77/1909|77 /1991152 /1948 0 0 16 16421 0} 001 §Tr./1970}) 5
6 1961|6580 |111/2007]83/1903]|77/2007|50/1955] 0O 0 16 16581 0 | 0.01 J0.01/2001} 6
7 19616581 {111/190584/1891J76/1936{53/19031 0 0 16 16741 0 | 0.01 J6.07/2001}F 7
8 196166181 [115/1905]84/ 189181/ 1896{51/1891} O 0 16 16901 0 | 001 JTr./1968] 8
9 196|661 81 {113/1905{78/1936|81/2008|55/19831 0O 0 17 17071 0 | 0.01 [0.01/1950] 9
10 } 97 166181 §112/2008{81 /1974|182 /2008{54/1904] 0 0 17 §724 1 0 | 0.01 10.01/1950] 10
11 197166181 {110/ 1961182/ 1888{78/2002{52/1974] O 0 17 [ 7411 0 | 0.01 {0.01/1908] 11
12 1 97 | 66 | 81 [109/2002182/ 1995|81/1999{54 / 1965] 0 0 17 | 758 1 ¢ | 0.01 {0.22/1992] 12
13197166181 1110/ 1983184/ 1932|183/ 1999{55/1903] 0O 0 17 17751 0} 0.01 {Tr./1969] 13
14 197166182 1110/1972{89/1920)81/1935|55/1920f O 0 17 17921 0] 001 | Tr. /1992 14
15197166182 |111/1972|83/71975{79/ 1911154/ 1905] 0 0 17 18094 0§ 001 |Tr./ 1976} 15
16 97 1 66| 82 (111/1925(83/1958|80/ 1984|154 /19161 0 0 17 18261 0 001 [0.01/1976] 16
17 1 97 | 66| 82 {114/ 1925178/ 1987§79/ 1925156/ 1987] O 0 17 1843 0 | 0.01 [0.01/1995] 17
18 197167182 {111/1899]81 /1987183 /1925{54/ 1987} 0O 0 17 1860 { 0 } 0,01 |Tr./2006] 18
19 197 167 {82 {112/2009|88 /1987179 / 2006{54 / 1932} O 0 17 18771 0 } 001 |Tr. /20031 19
2019716782 [111/1908}81 /1973178 /1938154 / 1903} 0O 0 18 18951 0 | 0.01 {0.04/1985] 20
20197167182 1112/1908179/1987}82/2006|56/ 19731 0 0 18 1913 0 ] 001 {0.08/1979] 21
22 7167 |82 1112/2006]83/1896i84 / 2006/56 /1903 0O 0 18 19311 0 | 0.01 {0.33/1913] 22
23 1971 67§ 82 [113/2006]84 /1918{90/2006|55/1897F 0 0 18 19491 0 | 0.01 §Tr./2007} 23
24 1 97| 67 | 82 [113/2006]87 /1999{85 /2006{55/ 1903} O 0 18 19671 0 001 {Tr./1965] 24
25 197 ] 67 1 82 |113/2006)76/ 1913482 /200656 / 1889} O 0 18 19851 0 ] 0.01 j0.06/1896] 25
26 197167 | 82 [113/ 1931184/ 1965{80/ 1931156/ 1955} O 0 18 {1003] 0 | 0.01 |Tr./ 19641 26
27 197 |1 67 82 {114/ 1933183/ 1941179/ 1933152/ 1897} O 0 17 11020} 0 | 0.01 | Tr./ 19081 27
28 | 97 167182 1110/ 198089/ 1913{82 /1980155718921 0O 0 17 110371 0 1 0.01 10.02/1958] 28
29 1 97| 661 82 {113/ 1898}87/1896{78 / 2003{57/1919] 0O 0 17 {1054 O } 001 | Tr. /20031 29
30 | 97 | 66 ] 82 |114/ 1898}80 /1966183 /2003{57/1975] 0O 0 17 11071] 0 | 0.01 {0.03/1966] 30
31 197 1661 82 {114/ 1908183 /1976{81 /190853 /1895 0 0 17 [1088] 0 | 0.01 {Tr. /2003 | 31
Avg.|96.6166.1181.4 0 524 0.01 Avg.
](; M )::i:m Ave High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. } Low Min. I(ig:)(;:)g E%Eg:s ((jg;};;)g Ef%}%:z‘: Daily S§§i3:0 M%i(i::::\?m I?)
e Temperature Degree Days Precipitation ¢

http://www wrh.noaa. gov/hnx/fat/normals/fat07nrm.htm 11/5/2010




Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: September

National Weather Service

Normals, Means & Fxtremes

September - Fresno, CA

Values in red represent the extremes {or the month,

CAMIDH |

PAGE 4A OF 6

San Joaquin Valley - Hanford, CA

http://www . wrh.noaa.gov/hnx/fat/normals/fat09nrm.htm

D Temperature Degree Days Precipitation 1
& fr 1 . -y 4
! — N:::%g = High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. | Low Min. '(‘(f;‘ff;f E%;ii: ((8;':;)‘3’ E:;}Efi Daily S};’j%;[\:idfo hfiﬁfﬁ}‘f}‘m !
1 92163178 [107/ 188873 /196476 /2007}151/19641 0 0 13 115791 0 | 0.02 J0.32/2000f 1
2 19216378 1108/ 195576 /2000(77 7 1998148 /1964F 0 0 13 113921 0 | 0.02 |0.07/1997} 2
3192163177 [111/71955171/71912{77/2003|52/1964] © 0 13 11605] O | 0.02 ]042/1985] 3
4 192163177 [107/71988]74/ 1912175/ 1998{51 /1912 O 0 13 {1618 O | 0.02 {0.92/1978] 4
S 19163177 {105/1984|73/1978]73/ 1991147/ 1887} 0 0 13 {163110.01] 0.03 0.28/ 1972} 5
6 | 9162177 106/ 198875/ 1965|767/ 1998149 / 1887 0 0 2 1164310.01f 0.04 10.04/1969] 6
7 191§ 62| 77 1108/ 1904{78 / 1978]73/ 1998150/ 1964] © 0 12 1165510.01} 0.05 J0.22/1958] 7
8§ 1911062176 1108/1904{76/ 1931174 /199814971897 © 0 12 1166710011 006 |Tr./1997] 8
9 | 9162176 [107/1904{75/1985}76/ 1888}50/ 1964} © 0 12 1167910.01] 0.07 [0.02/1960f 9
10 | 901 621 76 1108/ 1888|68 / 1952}76 / 1888|487/ 1952} O 0 12 ]1691}0.01] 0.08 [0.48/1976] 10
FE 19062 ) 76 111/ 1888|172/ 1952)72/ 1888[44 /1952 © 0 1 }170210.011 0.09 104271976} 11
12 1901 61} 76 1105/ 1983173/ 1893170/ 1960|148 / 1952] O ¢ 11 J1713(0.01} 0.10 J0.06/ 18951 12
13 190 | 61| 75 {106/ 1983174 / 1915}70 / 2006{48 / 1370} 0 0 11 {1724{0.011 0.11 [0.01/1895] 13
14 189161175 105/ 1971170/ 1910f71 / 2000{47 / 19031 O 0 11 }1735{0.01] 0.12 }0.27/ 1910} 14
15 189161 | 75 1104/ 1983174/ 1982169 / 1998145 / 1970} 0O 0 11 11746{0.01] 0.13 }0.73/1910] 15
16 1 89 1 60 75 1105/ 1937170/ 1908471/ 1983149/ 1955} 0 0 10 1756§0.01] 0.14 1026/ 1891} 16
17 | 88 1 60 | 74 {105/ 1979173 / 1950174 / 1984}48 / 1965} 0 0 10 11766{0.011 0.15 j0.27/ 1989} 17
18 1 88 | 60| 74 1107/ 1913167/ 196378 / 1984{48 / 1978} © 0 10 {177610.01] 0.16 {0.61 /1989 18
19 | 88 | 60 | 74 1057 1922|707 1989|75/ 1984}44 / 1978} © 0 10 11786]0.01} 0.17 {0.63/1959] 19
20 1 88 1 60§ 74 1104/ 1939173 /2007170 / 1984146/ 1978] © ¢ S 1179510.01} 0.18 10.09/1939] 20
21 87 [ 59| 73 {102/1949]72 /1945174 / 198342 / 1968] ¢ 0 9 11804]0.01] 0.19 j0.14 /1916 21
22 1 87 159 | 73 1104 /1949167 / 1923172 / 1999141 / 1968] © 0 9 J181310.01} 0.20 {047/ 1887] 22
23 1 871 59| 73 |105/ 1949166 / 1904{66 / 1991}47/1968] 0 0 9 1182210.01} 0.21 [0.24/1958] 23
24 187 1 591 73 1102/ 1899162 / 1904166 / 1991146/ 19451 0 0 8 [1830]0.01} 0.22 ]0.76/1904] 24
25 F 86 | 58 | 72 1100/ 1978]|70 / 1986{69 / 200243 / 1948] 0 0 g [1838]0.01} 0.23 10.85/1982] 25
26 1 86 | 58 1 72 1107/ 196364 / 1898]66 / 1978143 / 1948} 0 0 8 |1846]0.01] 0.24 |1.12/1898| 26
27 | 86 | 58 | 72 {105/ 1888166/ 1986}68 / 1963{44 / 1948} © 0 7 |185310.01] 0.25 10.13/1938] 27
28 185 {57 { 71 1104/18871{64 /1911167 /2010143 /19711 1 i 7 1186010.01] 0.26 |0.18/1994] 28
20 | 85 | 57 | 71 11027 1992|637/ 1919472/ 2010{43 / 1905] 1 2 7 |186710.01 0.27 |1.12/1890f 29
30 | 85| 57 | 71 101 /2010|156 /1894171 /2010{37 /1950 1 3 6 1187310.01] 0.28 [0.73 /1894 30
Avg.|88.8{60.4]74.6 3 307 0.26 Avg.
? MZX.NP:(:;I e High Max. | Low Max, | High Min. | Low Min. [;(?j:;;;“l i{%g)z ((ngii'i;})g E%i;{i? Daily 9?%}}}3({0 ?vil:ﬁx?::rjm %)
¢ Temperature Degree Days Precipitation ¢
11/5/2010



LA
. . PAGE 4B OF 6
Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: Qctober

National Weather Service San Joaquin Vatley - Hanford, CA

Normals, Mcans & Extremes

October - Fresno, CA

Values in red represent the extremes for the month.

D Temperature Degree Days Precipitation D
. - . PN a
| Max.r\fi; :'::%'AVE‘ High Max. | Low Max. § Migh Min. | Low Min. 1(‘(5;:“‘";; :{ggg (éj‘f"i‘li;)&’ I{%}}E Daily S?%}::::o Aﬁtjl‘]’)’\‘fm !
1 1841 5770 {100/ 1987165 / 1894|170/ 2010{39 / 1971} 0 3 6 |187910.01] 0.29 }1.46/1976} 1
2 1841 561 70 1101/ 198058/ 1916171 /20101407 1891 © 3 6 | 188510.01] 0.30 10.35/1939] 2
3 184156170 1101/1980}62/ 1916368 /20011417 1908] © 3 6 |189110.01] 0.31 10.20/1900f 3
4 1831561 701102/1980j64/1916|69/1917]42/1957] © 3 5 1189610.01] 0.32 ]0.64/1994] 4
5 J 83| 5569|101/ 198064 / 1916[66 7 1904140/ 1969 0 3 5 11901§0.02] 0.34 |1.69/1925) 5
6 18355169199/ 1987164/1939{68/1892{37/1969] 0 3 S 11906]0.02] 0.36 |2.38/1904} 6
7 182 557168196/199659/1923164 /1983{39/1969] 1 4 4 11910]0.02] 0.38 j0.67/1973] 7
& 1 B2 541 68[99/1980165/1923164/1996}35/1949] 1 5 4 |191410.02] 0.40 [0.24/1904] 8
9 181 {54168 |[98/1996 165/ 1960165/ 1996[39/1949] 1 6 4 1191810.02| 0.42 10.29/1920] 9
10 {81 | 54167 199/1991 159 /2000627 1936[42 / 1890] 1 7 4 1192240.02§ 0.44 10.76 /2000 10
11| 8154 167197/1950 )53/ 1899164/ 1991]38/1893] 1 8 4 11926]0.02} 0.46 [0.57/1904) 11
12 § 80 1 53167 (95/1964}60/1910162/20101397 1969} 1 3 1192910021 0.48 [0.20/ 18991 12
13 180§ 53 166[95/1991157/1899163 /20101407 1981] 1 10 3 11932]0.02}) 0.50 J1.28/72009] 13
14 179 | 53| 66 {100/ 1978]54 /189964 /201041 / 1981} 1 11 3 |193510.02] 0.52 J0.48/1935] 14
15 | 791 52| 66 {99/1961 |61/ 1899164/ 19451367 1966] 2 13 3 11938§0.02] 0.54 [0.23/1946] 15
16 1 78 | 52 1 65 196/1961 {58/ 1971[63 /20093671966 2 15 3 11941]0.02F 0.56 |0.42/1963] 16
17178 152165([97/1959162/1892{62/2009|36/1893] 2 17 2 11943]0.02) 0.58 |0.54/1934] 17
18 177 {51} 6419571903 161/1936[62/2005]36/1949] 2 19 2 |194510.02] 0.60 [0.67/1936] 18
19 {77 ] 5116419271921 |59/1949161/ 1979[30/1949] 3 22 2 11947}0.02] 0.62 {0.75/2004] 19
200771 51| 64|94/ 1927156/ 1941157/ 1991{35/ 1949} 3 25 2 }194910.02] 0.64 [0.38/1889] 20
21 176 | 50| 63 193/2003 158 /1941|607 1992{34/1949] 3 28 2 1195110.02} 0.66 |0.67/1985] 21
22 176 1 50| 63 192/ 1948 {63 / 1889164 / 1982|135/ 1961f 3 31 2 11953]0.02] 0.68 10.56/1889] 22
23 175150 62 190/1965157/1956{64/ 1982135/ 1975 4 35 1 }195410.021 0.70 |1.17/1889] 23
24 1 75149162 195/1959 |59/ 189763 /1982]36/ 1956} 4 3 1 11955]0.02) 0.72 ]0.35/ 1940} 24
25 174149162 191/1966 (61 /1998|627 198236/ 1971 4 43 1 }1195640.03] 0.75 10.33/1927] 25
26 1731491 61 [89/2003|56/2004158/1927f35/1939] 5 48 [ 11957]0.03} 0.78 {1,05/2004] 26
27 1 73 148 1 61 | 89/2003 |58/ 189661 / 1987]35/1970] 5 53 1 ]195810.03] 0.81 |1.28/1896] 27
28 | 72 1 48 | 60 |89 /2003 {58/ 1971161/ 1987|33/1970f S 58 1 11959]0.03] 0.84 10.99/1974] 28
29 1721481 60 {88/ 1915|557/ 1996{61/1914{29/ 1971} 6 64 1 11960§0.03}1 0.87 ]1.50/1996| 29
30 F 711 47| 59 191 /1887 157/ 1975{60/1983{27/ 19721 6 70 T 1196110.03] 0.90 §1.43/1992] 30
31171147159 [90/1949 157 /1974|617 2008[32 /1972 6 76 1 11962]0.03] 0.93 10.93/1934; 31
Avg.]78.1}51.9165.0 73 39 0.65 Avg.
I?) MaX'N:::;I e High Max. } Low Max. § High Min. | Low Min. l(ig::;;);; E%%)E\: ((32):;;;5 t%ggs:og Daily Si:%f)gllo M}.'ii?x(:.fx!m l:
¢ Temperature Degree Days Precipitation <

http://www.wrh.noaa.gov/hnx/{at/normals/fat ] Onrm.htm 11/5/2010




Fresng Normg

Is, M eang
Na(ionai Weath

and Extremes: Aug
er Servige

Ne,

ust

Tmaly, Meang & )‘.‘xu’cmc—s

g Fresno

nonth,

San Joaquin Valiey - 14

» CA

Valyes in reg ICPresen, the CX{remey for the
n Tem Peratyre T

LA

PAGE 5 oF 8

antord, CA

Precipitation

I

a

Record !
Maxinium g

Y

[




LATHDED

Fresno Normals, Means and Extremes: August PAGEEOFS
1891 | 1930 | 1913 | 1973 1920
25 |94 | 61 | 7 :12(‘)% 179552 17991/3 159266 0 | o | 14 [1483] 0] 001 |Tr./1967] 25
26 [ o3 foa | oo | oo | el B2 0 o | w4 fraor] o foor | S0 | 2
271 93 [ 64 | 191 Joon | ks | e | e | 0 | o | e Jisuf o foor | SOLf s
28 | 93 | 64 | 78 igg . s |l 2 o ] o | e fises| o | oo PO %

109/ 797 76/ 521
1915 2010 1915 1895

1069/ 80/ 81/ 497 0.15/
30 93 63 78 1988 1957 2007 1966 0 ¢ 14 115537 0 1 0.01 1896 30

29 93 64 78 0 0 14 115391 0 { 0.01 {Tr./72000} 29

107/ 69/ 75/ 50/ 025/
31 92 63 78 2007 1964 2007 1887 0 G 13 {156610.01] 6.02 1964 31
Avg, | 948 1 649 | 769 0 478 0.01 Avg.
. Max. Min. Avg. i [Normal] . Nomal N(‘tr‘?‘a} .
l,: High Max. | Low Max. | High Min. | Low Min. I(ig:;}n})g Scason (('g;);;")g Scason | Daily Sc,(s(?on ?\;;i?x(:udm [.)
] Normal Y Ho Dae] Y o Date Date X
° Temperature Degree Days Precipitation ¢

http://www.wrh.noaa.gov/hnx/fat/normals/fatO8nrm.htm 11/5/2010




2 11giHx3 20822 TS (Glo0s0r]

N

&

z 13 889 €8s 218 848 yEoL i

I} %9 5/ g5 Le/L
89 0g 78 OE/L
79 632 L8 837l
9 £8 85 82/
»9 o8 901t L2
ot 72 gt 9¢ii
=9 9/ eit SeiL
it cg eLL V2L
£e £g 33 RN o771
8 686 Zii 33id
o/ 28 Sloh XA
€L 08 60t 022
8L B84 01 6i/L
‘s 5/ oL 8
08 8z 801 Lij2
07 o8 101 914
55 98 0L St/
¥Q 8 01 ZLIL
L £8 886 eLiL
95 28 Gs [ANIA
29 64 101 L1/
19 3L L0} 0L
pis 52 01 14
(594 L8 eCl 872
Y4 574 96 L4
£9 2L £6 9/
29 8L 96 S/
19 82 68 Pz
g og L0t E/L
i 74 10t il
L9 £8 86 |74

DAY ATTHINOW HOIH DAY dR31L HDIH DAY HOIH "OAY  dWSL HBIH DAY HDIH DAY dW3L 3lva
OOSIONVYH-A OOSIONYEd  OOSIONVHA  ATHINOW OO3NANYS ODFANYS ATHINOW ONSIH4 HOIH
NYS NY¥S NYS QR3IG NYS ONS3IHL ONS3ZHd
SIHNLYHIdNIL NAWIXYIN 5002 Aanre




S D2 PO TIPSO X M SO
EXHIBIT 3

HEAT STRESS INDEX

RELATIVE HUMIDITY
10%  20% 0% 40% BO%  60% 0% BO%  90%

10499 104 [ 110 120 [182
f02]87 101 [ 108 17 135
0|65 e 108|110 120 | 108

@ le3 g7 100 [ 106 110 125
Wwogg gt 85 S8 104 Ligg. 120 128
Wood B8] 83 85 100 105|111 12 |
B ooje | m, w0 16 102 ||
ki p0 |84 B8 90 L 92 9 100 [i08 114
£ e ey 83 7 B9 |G 95 100|108 15
G 85 jeo 84 m 87 50 |92 98 100 | 109
émmLm @ 65 86 69 |91, 83 6D
g2 |7 w 81 84 86 89 L 9185 |
ol 7 w_?_swguj By 85 86 89
% 1lyz vs 77 78 79| g0 8 81 85
wilyg 72 5 ve v 77 77 18 75
74lee 70 9w v4 18 75 13 W T
NOTE: Add 10°F when prctsctive cloling is wom and add 10'F when l direct simlighL
HUMITURE °F DANGER JNJURY THREAT
GATEGORY
BELOW 60" NONE LITTLE DR NO DANGER UNDER NORMAL
CIRCUMSTANCES
80" - 90’ CAUTION EATIGUE POSSIBLE IF EXPOSURE 1§ PROLONGED
AND THERE 18 PHYSICAL ACTIVITY
90" - 105" EXTREME HEAT CRAMPS AND HEAT EXHAUSTION
CAUTION POSSIELE IF EXPOSURE 15 PROLONGED AND
THERE 18 PHYSICAL ACTIVITY
105° - 130° DANGER HEAT CRAMPS OR EXHAUSTION LIKELY, HEAT
STROKE POSSIBLE IF EXPOSURE 18 PROLONGED
AND THERE IS PHYSICAL ACTIVITY
ABOVE 130° EXTREME HEAT STROKE IMMINENTI -
DANGER
Table £1

(40306{C)az/jwf]

EXHIBIT 3




