STATE OF CALIFORNIA — STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916 FAX (916)263-0959

February 15, 2011

Otis Ginoza, Deputy City Manager
City of Lawndale

14717 Burin Ave.

Lawndale, CA 90260

Dear Mr. Ginoza;

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on January 12, 2011 of the City of Lawndale
submittal pertaining to Ordinance Numbers 1050-10 and 1051-10 with findings and is
acceptable for filing. Your filing attests to your understanding that according to Health
and Safety Code Section 17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building
Standards Code shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the finding
and the modification or change have been filed with the California Building Standards
Commission (the Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely, %

Enrique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings



e 14717 BURIN AVENUE ® LAWNDALE, CALIFORNIA 90260 ® (310) 973-3230
G=

January 10, 2011

Mr. David Walls, Executive Director
California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833

Re: CITY OF LAWNDALE ADOPTION OF THE 2010 CALIFORNIA CODES
AND FINDINGS OF LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Dear Mr. Walls:

Enclosed, please find copies of Ordinances adopting the California Building,
Residential, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, and Green Building Standards Codes.
The package also includes the City’s amendments to these Codes together with
appropriate Findings for these amendments in accordance with the requirements of
Section 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code. Each of the changes and
modifications to the building standards was found to be reasonably necessary based
upon local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions.

The Lawndale City Council made these Findings and approved the Ordinances at its
meeting on December 20, 2010. The Ordinances include Nos. 1050-10 and 1051-10
(Urgency Ordinance) adopting and amending the California Building, Residential,
Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, and Fire Codes, respectively.

If you should have any questions, please contact Ms. DeDe Davis Tran, Aééofciape. )
Planner, at 310-973-3232. g

Sincerely, ‘

3
gﬁ%ri P s

Deputy City Manager
City of Lawndale

Enclosures






ORDINANCE NO. 1050-10

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF LAWNDALE, CALIF ORNIA,
AMENDING LAWNDALE MUNICPAL CODE TITLE 15 TO UPDATE
THE UNIFORM CODES ADOPTED BY THE CITY BY REFERENCE
BY ADOPTING THE 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY
BUILDING, ELECTRICAL, MECHANICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE CODES
AND ADDING NEW CHAPTERS WITHIN TITLE 15 TO ADOPT
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AND
THE 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY RESIDENTIAL CODE AND
ADOPTING LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THESE COUNTY CODES

SUMMARY: This ordinance will update the uniform codes adopted by the City by
adopting the 2011 Los Angeles County Building, Electrical, Mechanical, Plumbing and
Fire Codes, and adopting the 2011 Los Angeles County Residential Code and the 2010
California Green Building Standards Code.

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.9, the City of Lawndale ("City")
adopts portions of certain Los Angeles County codes as the City's codes; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Code ("California Building Code") establishes
statewide codes and regulations for building construction and fire safety and is published every three

years by order of the California legislature; and

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building and Fire Codes are based on the International Code
Council's ("ICC") 2009 International Building and Fire Codes; and

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building Code was published by the State last July 4, 2010
and becomes effective on January 1, 2011; and

WHEREAS, a local jurisdiction has the right granted by the State to establish more restrictive
building standards given that the amendments are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,

geological, and/or topographic conditions; and

WHEREAS, Los Angeles County has updated portions of its codes by adopting such local
amendments and incorporating them as the County's 2010 California Building Code (Title 26 Los
Angeles County Building Code), the 2010 California Electrical Code, (Title 27 Los Angeles County
Electrical Code), the 2010 California Plumbing Code (Title 28 Los Angeles County Plumbing Code),
the 2010 California Mechanical Code (Title 29 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code), and the 2010
California Fire Code (Title 32 Los Angeles County Fire Code); and

WHEREAS, Los Angeles County has also adopted, with local amendments, the two new state
codes, the 2010 California Residential Code (Title 30 Los Angeles County Residential Code) and the
2010 California Green Building Standards Code (Title 31 Los Angeles County Green Building

Standards Code); and



WHEREAS, the City has historically adopted certain county codes with their local amendments
as a uniformity of standards serves to minimize conflict and confusion in addressing the public health

needs of the community; and

WHEREAS, the County's amendments to the 2010 California Green Building Standards Codes
are complicated and require further analysis that the City does not desire to adopt those amendments at

this time; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the 2011 Los Angeles County Building, Electrical,
Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire, and Residential Codes with all local amendments proposed by the

County; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code and
the 2010 California Residential Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section 50022.3, after the first reading
of the title of the ordinance, this ordinance was duly noticed and agendized for a public hearing before
the City Council on December 20, 2010; and

WHEREAS, at its public meeting of December 20, 2010, evidence was heard and presented
from all persons interested in effecting said proposal, from all persons protesting the same and from
members of the City staff, and the City Council having reviewed, analyzed and studied said proposal;

and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to update the City's Building, Electrical, Mechanical,
Plumbing and Fire Codes and adopt a Residential Code and Green Building Standards Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAWNDALE,
CALIFORNIA, DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The recitals above are true and correct and incorporated herein by this reference.

SECTION 2. Section 15.04.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Building Code as amended by Title 26 Los Angeles
County Building Code together with their appendices is adopted by the city as the city’s
building code, which regulates the erection, construction, enlargements, alteration,
repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment, height,
area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or structures
within the city, and provides for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore,
are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby repealed.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 3. Section 15.04.040 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A. The 2011 Los Angeles County Building Code, adopted in this chapter as
the building code of the city, is amended to read as set forth in Sections 15.04.050

through 15.04.160.
B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Building Code, as adopted by Section

15.04.010 is hereby amended as set forth in section 15.04.050 through 15.04.160

follows:
Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the

unincorporated area of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within it
corporate limits the area of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this

chapter."

SECTION 4. Sections 15.04.120, 15.04.130, 15.04.140 and 15.04.150 of the Lawndale
Municipal Code are hereby deleted.

SECTION 5. Sections 15.04.075 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby renumbered as
section 15.04.110 and section 15.04.100 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby renumbered as

section 15.04.140.

SECTION 6. Section 15.04.050 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.050 Building Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
building code, as adopted in Section 15.04.010, and any other provision of this code,
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 7. Section 15.04.060 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.060 Building Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the building code, as set forth in Section 15.04.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 8. Section 15.04.070 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.070 Building Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the building code, adopted by reference in Section 15 .04.010,
be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the building code adopted
herein shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 9. Section 15.04.090 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.090 Section 105.6 amended-Board of Appeals-Tenure.

Section 105.6 of the County Building Code is amended by deleting therefrom the words
'and Building Rehabilitation Appeals Board."

SECTION 10. Section 15.04.100 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.100 Section 106.4 amended—Application for Permits.

The first sentence in the first paragraph of Section 106.4 of the County Building Code is
amended to read as follows:

106.4—Plans and Specifications. Within each application for a building permit, and
when required by the building official for enforcement of any provisions of this code,
four sets of plans and specifications shall be submitted."

SECTION 11. Section 15.04.120 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"Section 107.2 entitled 'Plan Checking or Review fees for a Building or Structure' of the
County Building Code is amended by adding a fourth paragraph to read as follows:

In addition to the fees established by this subsection, an applicant may request and
receive, if available, overtime plan checking. Said request shall be in writing after filing
a regular application for plan checking. All fees incurred for overtime plan checking
shall be established by the city council, by resolution from time to time."

SECTION 12. Section 15.04.130 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.04.130—Revision of fees by resolution.

Revision of fees by resolution. Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter,
such fees may be revised and new fees established by the city council, by resolution

from time to time."

SECTION 13. Section 15.04.150 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.150 Section 1503.4 amended—Roof drainage.

Section 1503.4 of the California Building Code, as adopted by reference in the
county building code, is amended to read as follows:

Roof conductors. The water from the roof of all buildings shall be carried by
means of conductors under the sidewalks and through the curb, into the gutter.
Overflows shall be installed at each low point of the roof to which the water drains.
Concealed roof drainage pipes shall be installed as required for soil, waste or vent
piping.
Exception: Buildings of groups R or M occupancies, the walls of which are ten
feet or more from the street property line, need not comply with the above.

Exception: In cases of hardship or where compliance with the provisions of
section 1503.4 are impractical due to terrain, building location or other physical factors,
the city council of the city of Lawndale may waive the requirements of such section and
may impose such conditions as it may deem necessary upon such waiver."

SECTION 14. Section 15.04.160 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.160 Section 3410A amended—Moved Structures
Section 3410A of the county building code is amended to read as follows:

Section 3410A. Moved Structures.

(@)  The building official shall prepare and submit to the city's city clerk a
written report containing his findings as to whether the condition of the building or
structure admits of practicable and effective repair, as well as his recommendation as to
whether a relocation building permit should be issued. The city cletk shall set a hearing
before the city's planning commission to occur within forty-five (45) days of the
submission of the report and shall notify by first class mail, postage prepaid, the
applicant and owners of record of property within three hundred (300) feet of the
proposed site for the relocation of the building or structure of the time and place of said
hearing, and the street address and a legal description sufficient for identification of the
premises upon which the building or structure is to be relocated. At the hearing, the
planning commission shall review the report of the building official and hear all

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



competent evidence offered by any person. The planning commission shall thereafter
approve, conditionally approve or disapprove such relocation building permit.

(b)  Before approving or conditionally approving a relocation building
permit, the planning commission shall find or require that:

(1) The building meets all requirements of this code and the city's
zoning code.

2) The building fits the lot (physically) with required setbacks,
yards, passageways, driveways and parking.

(3)  The building, when completed, will comply with all building
code and fire department requirements.

4) The building, when completed, will be compatible structurally
and in appearance with surrounding structures and the general neighborhood,

(5) All damage to the building due to moving will be repaired.

(6)  If necessary, the building will be repainted inside and outside. If
necessary, stucco walls will be refinished. If necessary, sandblasting shall be done.

(7 If necessary, all floors will be refinished. Worn or deteriorated
resilient floors will be replaced.

(8) The building will be reroofed, if moved in sections. In other
instances the building will be reroofed, if necessary.

(9)  The wiring shall comply with the current electrical code.

(10)  Adequate vented heat shall be provided.

(11)  Proof of lot ownership has been provided.

(12)  Complete plans and specifications have been submitted to the
city.

(13)  All work will be completed within ninety days of the date the
permit is issued.

(14)  The building will not be occupied and the gas and electricity will
not be connected until all work is completed.

(15) A satisfactory termite clearance report shall be presented to the
planning commission.

(¢)  In addition to fees otherwise required under the building code, a fee of
two hundred dollars shall be paid to the city clerk to cover administrative costs related
to processing the application for a permit. Said fee may be waived or reduced by the
planning commission if the application is made by a charitable or religious nonprofit
organization.

(d)  Any person aggrieved by the decision of the planning commission may
appeal to the city council by filing such an appeal according to Lawndale Municipal
Code Chapter 17.12 Hearings and Appeals."

SECTION 15. Section 15.08.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Electrical Code as amended by Title 27 the 2011
Los Angeles County Electrical Code together with their appendices is adopted by the
city as the city's electrical code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby

repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 16. Section 15.08.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2011 Los Angeles County Electrical Code, adopted in this chapter as
the electrical code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 82-8 is added, to read as follows:

Section 82-8.—Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised

and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.'

B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Electrical Code, as adopted by Section
15.08.010, is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

SECTION 17. A new section 15.08.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.08.050 Electrical Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
electrical code, as adopted in Section 15.08.010, and any other provision of this code,
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 18. A new section 15.08.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.08.060 Electrical Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the electrical code, as set forth in Section 15.08.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 19. A new section 15.08.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.08.070 Electrical Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the electrical code, adopted by reference in Section 15.08.01 0,
be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the electrical code
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 20. Section 15.12.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Mechanical Code as amended by Title 29 the 2011
Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, together with their appendices are adopted by
the city as the city's mechanical code, to regulate the erection, construction,
enlargements, alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy,
use, equipment, height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential
buildings or structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances

are hereby repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 21. Section 15.12.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read,
in its entirety, as follows:

"A. The 2011 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, adopted in this chapter
as the mechanical code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 114 is added, to read as follows:

Section 114—Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised

and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, as adopted by Section
15.12.010 is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

SECTION 22. Section 15.12.040, of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby amended to read,
in its entirety, as follows:

"A. It is unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, install, alter,
repair, relocate, add to, replace, use or maintain heating, ventilating, comfort cooling or
refrigeration equipment in the jurisdiction, or cause the same to be done, contrary to or
in violation of any of the provisions of this code. Maintenance of equipment which was
unlawful at the time it was installed, and which would be unlawful under this code if
installed after the effective date of this code, constitutes a continuing violation of this

code.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code."

SECTION 23. A new section 15.12.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.12.050 Mechanical Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
mechanical code, as adopted in Section 15.12.010, and any other provision of this code,
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 24. A new section 15.12.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.12.060 Mechanical Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the mechanical code, as set forth in Section 15. 12.010, shall not
be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or
use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 25. A new section 15.12.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code
0



"15.12.070 Mechanical Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the mechanical code, adopted by reference in Section
15.12.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the
mechanical code adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 26. Section 15.16.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A. The 2010 California Plumbing Code as amended by Title 28 the 2011
Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, together with their appendices are adopted by the
city as the city's plumbing code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,
height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby

repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 27. Section 15.16.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, adopted in this chapter as the
plumbing code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 103.1 is added, to read as follows:

Section 103.1—Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised
and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.

B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, as adopted by Section
15.16.010, is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter.”

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 28. A new section 15.16.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.050 Plumbing Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
plumbing code, as adopted in Section 15.16.010, and any provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail."

SECTION 29. A new section 15.16.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.060 Plumbing Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the plumbing code, as set forth in Section 15.16.010 shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 30. A new section 15.16.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.070 Plumbing Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the plumbing code, adopted by reference in Section
15.16.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the plumbing
code hereby adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 31. Section 15.20.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A. The 2010 California Fire Code as amended by Title 32 the 2011 Los
Angeles County Fire Code together with their appendices are adopted by the city as the
city's fire code for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing the creation and
maintenance of conditions dangerous to life and property due to hazards of fire and

explosions.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,

and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 32. Section 15.20.040 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.20.040 Fire Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the fire
code, as adopted in Section 15.20.010, and any other provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail."

SECTION 33. Section 15.20.050 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.20.050 Fire Code - Penalty

A. No person, firm or corporation shall violate any provision of the fire
code or any permit or license granted pursuant to the chapter, or any rule, regulation or

policy promulgated pursuant thereto.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code." ~

SECTION 34. A new section 15.20.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.20.070 Fire Code - Amendments Generally

The 2011 Los Angeles County Fire Code, as adopted by Section 15.20.010, is hereby
amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

SECTION 35. A new section 15.20.080 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.20.080 Fire Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the fire code, as set forth in section 1520.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 36. A new section 15.20.090 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.20.090 Fire Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the fire code, adopted by reference in section 15.20.010, be
rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the fire code hereby
adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 37. A new Chapter 15.24, entitled "RESIDENTIAL CODE" is added to the
Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in its entirety, as follows:

"15.24 Residential Code

15.24.010 Residential Code - Adoption

15.24.020 Residential Code - Penalty

15.24.030 Residential Code - Amendments Generally
15.24.040 Residential Code - Conflict

15.24.050 Residential Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby
15.24.060 Residential Code - Severability

15.24.010 Residential Code - Adoption

A. The 2010 California Residential Code as amended by Title 30 Los
Angeles County Residential Code together with their appendices are adopted by the city
as the city's residential code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,
height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby
repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter.

15.24.020 Residential Code - Penalty

A. No person shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove,
convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause the
same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provision of this 2010 California
Residential Code, including other codes duly adopted by this chapter.

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to
Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section

1.08.020 of this code.
15.24.030 Residential Code - Amendments Generally

The 2011 Los Angeles County Residential Code, as adopted by Section 15.24.010, is
hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter.

15.24.040 Residential Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
residential code, as adopted in Section 15.24.010, and any provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail.

15.24.050 Residential Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the residential code, as set forth in Section 15.24.010, shall not
be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or
use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code.

15.24.060 Residential Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the residential code, hereby adopted by reference in Section
15.24.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the residential
code hereby adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 38. A new Chapter 15.28, entitled "GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE," is
added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in its entirety, as follows:

"15.28 Green Building Standards Code

15.28.010 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Penalty

15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code - Conflict

15.28.040 Green Building Standards Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby
15.28.050 Green Building Standards Code - Severability

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code
14



15.28.010 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption

A. The 2010 California Green Building Standards Code which regulates the
erection, construction, enlargements, alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion,
demolition, occupancy, use, equipment, height, area, security, abatement, and
maintenance of certain residential buildings or structures within the city, provides for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore, are hereby adopted by

reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this section.

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Penalty

A. No person shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove,
convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause the
same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provision of this 2010 California

Green Building Standards, including other codes duly adopted by this chapter.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code.

15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of 2010
California Green Building Standards Code, as adopted in Section 15.28.010, and any
provision of this code, each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other.
In the event any apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be
so construed, the city's community development director shall determine which

provision shall prevail.

15.28.040 Green Building Standards Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, as set forth in
Section 15.28.010, shall not be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or
authorizing any business or use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this

code.

15.28.050 Green Building Standards Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, adopted
by reference in Section 15.28.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



“action in a court of competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation,
the remaining provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and
the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code hereby adopted shall remain in full

force and effect."

SECTION 39. Section 1.08.020 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to include the
following in the table:

"15.12.010  Mechanical Code — County Code Adopted
15.20.010 Fire Code — County Code Adopted
15.24.020 Residential Code - Adoption

15.24.030 Residential Code — Penalty

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption
15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code- Penalty"

SECTION 40. The City Council hereby makes a finding of reasonable necessity for the
amendments as stated separately for each such amendment and identified in the Los Angeles County
Titles 26, 27, 28, 29, 30 and 32. These amendments to the Los Angeles County Codes, incorporating
the uniform and international codes, are reasonably necesshry due to the local climatic, geological
and/or topographical conditions characterized by hot, dry summers and the high potential for seismic
activity which make structures particularly vulnerable to rapidly spreading fires and structural damage.

SECTION 41. The adoption of this Ordinance has been determined to be exempt from the
California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to State Guidelines Section 15061 (b)(3) as a project
that has no potential for causing a significant effect on the environment.

SECTION 42. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of any court of any competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City
Council hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each and every section,
subsection, sentence, clause and phrase thereof not declared invalid or unconstitutional without regard
to whether any portion of the ordinance would be subsequently declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 43. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this ordinance, and
shall make a minute of the passage and adoption thereof in the records of and the proceedings of the
City Council at which the same is passed and adopted. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect
thirty (30) days after its final passage and adoption, and within fifteen (15) days after its final passage,
the City Clerk shall cause it to be published in a newspaper of general circulation and shall post the
same at the City Hall and the United States Post Office, Lawndale Branch.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 20th day of December, 2010.

Zéw% £ o

Harold E. Hofmann, Mayo

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code
16



ATTEST:

State of California )
County of Los Angeles ) SS
City of Lawndale )

I, Paula Hartwill, City Clerk of the City of Lawndale, California, do hereby certify that the City
Council duly introduced the foregoing Ordinance No. 1050-10 at its regular meeting held on the 6th
day of December, 2010, and duly approved and adopted said ordinance at its regular meeting held on
the 20th day of December, 2010, by the following roll call vote:

AYES: Hofmann, Pullen-Miles, Rudolph, Osborne, Kearney

NOES: None
ABSENT: None
ABSTAIN: None

Mt >t G 2/l

(ﬁ"i Paula Hartwill, Q{y Clerk Date

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Ordinance No. 1050-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code






ORDINANCE NO. 1051-10

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF LAWNDALE, CALIFORNIA,
AMENDING LAWNDALE MUNICPAL CODE TITLE 15 TO UPDATE
THE UNIFORM CODES ADOPTED BY THE CITY BY REFERENCE
BY ADOPTING THE 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY
BUILDING, ELECTRICAL, MECHANICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE CODES
AND ADDING NEW CHAPTERS WITHIN TITLE 15 TO ADOPT
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AND
THE 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY RESIDENTIAL CODE AND
ADOPTING LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO THESE COUNTY CODES

SUMMARY: Effective January 1st, this ordinance will update the uniform codes
adopted by the City by adopting the 2011 Los Angeles County Building, Electrical,
Mechanical, Plumbing and Fire Codes, and adopting the 2011 Los Angeles County
Residential Code and the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code.

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.9, the City of Lawndale ("City")
adopts portions of certain Los Angeles County codes as the City's codes; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Code ("California Building Code") establishes
statewide codes and regulations for building construction and fire safety and is published every three
years by order of the California legislature; and

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building and Fire Codes are based on the International Code
Council's ("ICC") 2009 International Building and Fire Codes; and

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building Code was published by the State last July 4, 2010
and becomes effective on January 1, 2011; and

WHEREAS, a local jurisdiction has the right granted by the State to establish more restrictive
building standards given that the amendments are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,

geological, and/or topographic conditions; and

WHEREAS, Los Angeles County has updated portions of its codes by adopting such local
amendments and incorporating them as the County's 2010 California Building Code (Title 26 Los
Angeles County Building Code), the 2010 California Electrical Code, (Title 27 Los Angeles County
Electrical Code), the 2010 California Plumbing Code (Title 28 Los Angeles County Plumbing Code),
the 2010 California Mechanical Code (Title 29 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code), and the 2010
California Fire Code (Title 32 Los Angeles County Fire Code); and

WHEREAS, Los Angeles County has also adopted, with local amendments, the two new state
codes, the 2010 California Residential Code (Title 30 Los Angeles County Residential Code) and the
2010 California Green Building Standards Code (Title 31 Los Angeles County Green Building

Standards Code); and



WHEREAS, the City has historically adopted certain county codes with their local amendments
as a uniformity of standards serves to minimize conflict and confusion in addressing the public health

needs of the community; and

WHEREAS, the County's amendments to the 2010 California Green Building Standards Codes
are complicated and require further analysis that the City does not desire to adopt those amendments at

this time; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the 2011 Los Angeles County Building, Electrical,
Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire, and Residential Codes with all local amendments proposed by the

County; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code and
the 2010 California Residential Code; and

WHEREAS, Government Code Sections 36934 and 36937 expressly authorize the City Council
to adopt an urgency ordinance for the immediate preservation of the public peace, health or safety; and

WHEREAS, this matter was agendized for a duly noticed public hearing before the City
Council on December 20, 2010, and evidence was heard and presented from all persons interested in
affecting said proposal, from all persons protesting the same and from members of the City staff, and the
City Council has reviewed, analyzed and studied said proposal; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to update the City's Building, Electrical, Mechanical,
Plumbing and Fire Codes and adopt a Residential Code and Green Building Standards Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAWNDALE,
CALIFORNIA, DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The recitals above are true and correct and incorporated herein by this reference.

SECTION 2. Section 15.04.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A. The 2010 California Building Code as amended by Title 26 Los Angeles
County Building Code together with their appendices is adopted by the city as the city’s
building code, which regulates the erection, construction, enlargements, alteration,
repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment, height,
area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or structures
within the city, and provides for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore,
are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby repealed.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 3. Section 15.04.040 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read. in its
entirety, as follows: ’

"'/.X. The 2011 Los Angeles County Building Code, adopted in this chapter as
the building code of the city, is amended to read as set forth in Sections 15.04.050

through 15.04.160.
B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Building Code, as adopted by Section

15.04.010 is hereby amended as set forth in section 15.04.050 through 15.04.160

follows:
Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the

unincorporfitefi area of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its
corporate limits the area of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this

chapter."

SECTION 4. Sections 15.04.120, 15.04.130, 15.04.140 and 15.04.150 of the Lawnd
Municipal Code are hereby deleted. of the Lawndale

. SECTION 5. Sectigns 15.04.075 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby renumbered as
section 15.04.110 and section 15.04.100 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby renumbered as

section 15.04.140,

SECTION 6. Section 15.04.050 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read. in its
entirety, as follows: ’

"15.04.050 Building Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
building code, as adopted in Section 15.04.010, and any other provision of this code
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event an):
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 7. Section 15.04.060 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read. in its
entirety, as follows: ’

"15.04.060 Building Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the building code, as set forth in Section 15.04.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 8. Section 15.04.070 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

Urgeney Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.04.070 Building Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the building code, adopted by reference in Section 15 .04.010,
be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the building code adopted
herein shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 9. Section 15.04.090 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.090 Section 105.6 amended-Board of Appeals-Tenure.

Section 105.6 of the County Building Code is amended by deleting therefrom the words
'and Building Rehabilitation Appeals Board."

SECTION 10. Section 15.04.100 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.100 Section 106.4 amended—Application for Permits.

The first sentence in the first paragraph of Section 106.4 of the County Building Code is
amended to read as follows:

106.4—Plans and Specifications. Within each application for a building permit, and
when required by the building official for enforcement of any provisions of this code,
four sets of plans and specifications shall be submitted."

SECTION 11. Section 15.04.120 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"Section 107.2 entitled Plan Checking or Review fees for a Building or Structure' of the
County Building Code is amended by adding a fourth paragraph to read as follows:

In addition to the fees established by this subsection, an applicant may request and
receive, if available, overtime plan checking. Said request shall be in writing after filing
a regular application for plan checking. All fees incurred for overtime plan checking
shall be established by the city council, by resolution from time to time."

SECTION 12. Section 15.04.130 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.04.130—Revision of fees by resolution.

Revision of fees by resolution. Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter,
such fees may be revised and new fees established by the city council, by resolution

from time to time."

SECTION 13. Section 15.04.150 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.150 Section 1503.4 amended—Roof drainage.

Section 1503.4 of the California Building Code, as adopted by reference in the
county building code, is amended to read as follows:

Roof conductors. The water from the roof of all buildings shall be carried by
means of conductors under the sidewalks and through the curb, into the gutter.
Overflows shall be installed at each low point of the roof to which the water drains.
Concealed roof drainage pipes shall be installed as required for soil, waste or vent
piping.

Exception: Buildings of groups R or M occupancies, the walls of which are ten
feet or more from the street property line, need not comply with the above.

Exception: In cases of hardship or where compliance with the provisions of
section 1503.4 are impractical due to terrain, building location or other physical factors,
the city council of the city of Lawndale may waive the requirements of such section and
may impose such conditions as it may deem necessary upon such wajver."

SECTION 14. Section 15.04.160 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.04.160 Section 3410A amended—Moved Structures

Section 3410A of the county building code is amended to read as follows:

Section 3410A. Moved Structures.

(a) The building official shall prepare and submit to the city's city clerk a
written report containing his findings as to whether the condition of the building or
structure admits of practicable and effective repair, as well as his recommendation as to
whether a relocation building permit should be issued. The city clerk shall set a hearing
before the city's planning commission to occur within forty-five (45) days of the
submission of the report and shall notify by first class mail, postage prepaid, the
applicant and owners of record of property within three hundred (300) feet of the
proposed site for the relocation of the building or structure of the time and place of said
hearing, and the street address and a legal description sufficient for identification of the
premises upon which the building or structure is to be relocated. At the hearing, the
planning commission shall review the report of the building official and hear all

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



competent evidence offered by any person. The planning commission shall thereafter
approve, conditionally approve or disapprove such relocation building permit.
(b)  Before approving or conditionally approving a relocation building

permit, the planning commission shall find or require that:

(1) The building meets all requirements of this code and the city's
zoning code.

(2)  The building fits the lot (physically) with required setbacks,
yards, passageways, driveways and parking.

(3)  The building, when completed, will comply with all building

code and fire department requirements.
(4)  The building, when completed, will be compatible structurally

and in appearance with surrounding structures and the general neighborhood.

(5)  All damage to the building due to moving will be repaired.

(6)  If necessary, the building will be repainted inside and outside. If
necessary, stucco walls will be refinished. If necessary, sandblasting shall be done.

(7)  If necessary, all floors will be refinished. Worn or deteriorated
resilient floors will be replaced.

(8)  The building will be reroofed, if moved in sections. In other
instances the building will be reroofed, if necessary.

(9)  The wiring shall comply with the current electrical code.

(10)  Adequate vented heat shall be provided.

(11)  Proof of lot ownership has been provided.

(12) ~ Complete plans and specifications have been submitted to the

city.

(13)  All work will be completed within ninety days of the date the
permit is issued.
(14)  The building will not be occupied and the gas and electricity will
not be connected until all work is completed.

(15) A satisfactory termite clearance report shall be presented to the
planning commission.

(¢)  In addition to fees otherwise required under the building code, a fee of
two hundred dollars shall be paid to the city clerk to cover administrative costs related
to processing the application for a permit. Said fee may be waived or reduced by the
planning commission if the application is made by a charitable or religious nonprofit

organization.
(d)  Any person aggrieved by the decision of the planning commission may

appeal to the city council by filing such an appeal according to Lawndale Municipal
Code Chapter 17.12 Hearings and Appeals."

SECTION 15. Section 15.08.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Electrical Code as amended by Title 27 the 2011
Los Angeles County Electrical Code together with their appendices is adopted by the
city as the city's electrical code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby

repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 16. Section 15.08.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2011 Los Angeles County Electrical Code, adopted in this chapter as
the electrical code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 82-8 is added, to read as follows:

Section 82-8 —Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised

and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.'

B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Electrical Code, as adopted by Section
15.08.010, is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

SECTION 17. A new section 15.08.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.08.050 Electrical Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
electrical code, as adopted in Section 15.08.010, and any other provision of this code,
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 18. A new section 15.08.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.08.060 Electrical Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the electrical code, as set forth in Section 15 .08.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 19. A new section 15.08.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.08.070 Electrical Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the electrical code, adopted by reference in Section 15.08.010,
be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the electrical code
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 20. Section 15.12.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Mechanical Code as amended by Title 29 the 2011
Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, together with their appendices are adopted by
the city as the city's mechanical code, to regulate the erection, construction,
enlargements, alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy,
use, equipment, height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential
buildings or structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances
are hereby repealed.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 21. Section 15.12.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read,
in its entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2011 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, adopted in this chapter
as the mechanical code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 114 is added, to read as follows:

Section 114—Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised
and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Mechanical Code, as adopted by Section
15.12.010 is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

SECTION 22. Section 15.12.040, of the Lawndale Municipal Code is hereby amended to read,
in its entirety, as follows:

"A. It is unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, install, alter,
repair, relocate, add to, replace, use or maintain heating, ventilating, comfort cooling or
refrigeration equipment in the jurisdiction, or cause the same to be done, contrary to or
in violation of any of the provisions of this code. Maintenance of equipment which was
unlawful at the time it was installed, and which would be unlawful under this code if
installed after the effective date of this code, constitutes a continuing violation of this

code.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code."

SECTION 23. A new section 15.12.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.12.050 Mechanical Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
mechanical code, as adopted in Section 15.12.010, and any other provision of this code,
each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any
apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed,
the city's community development director shall determine which provision shall

prevail."

SECTION 24. A new section 15.12.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.12.060 Mechanical Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the mechanical code, as set forth in Section 15.12.010, shall not
be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or
use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 25. A new section 15.12.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and
Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.12.070 Mechanical Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the mechanical code, adopted by reference in Section
15.12.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the
mechanical code adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 26. Section 15.16.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Plumbing Code as amended by Title 28 the 2011
Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, together with their appendices are adopted by the
city as the city's plumbing code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,
height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby

repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

SECTION 27. Section 15.16.030 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, adopted in this chapter as the
plumbing code of the city, is amended as follows:

Section 103.1 is added, to read as follows:

Section 103.1—Revision of fees by resolution.
Irrespective of any of the fees specified in this chapter, such fees may be revised
and new fees established by the city council, by resolution from time to time.

B. The 2011 Los Angeles County Plumbing Code, as adopted by Section
15.16.010, is hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its cotporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter."

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 28. A new section 15.16.050 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.050 Plumbing Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
plumbing code, as adopted in Section 15.16.010, and any provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail."

SECTION 29. A new section 15.16.060 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.060 Plumbing Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the plumbing code, as set forth in Section 15. 16.010 shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 30. A new section 15.16.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.16.070 Plumbing Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the plumbing code, adopted by reference in Section
15.16.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the plumbing
code hereby adopted shall remain in full force and effect.”

SECTION 31. Section 15.20.010 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"A.  The 2010 California Fire Code as amended by Title 32 the 2011 Los
Angeles County Fire Code together with their appendices are adopted by the city as the
city's fire code for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing the creation and
maintenance of conditions dangerous to life and property due to hazards of fire and
explosions.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter."

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 32. Section 15.20.040 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.20.040 Fire Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the fire
code, as adopted in Section 15.20.010, and any other provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail."

SECTION 33. Section 15.20.050 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to read, in its
entirety, as follows:

"15.20.050 Fire Code - Penalty

A. No person, firm or corporation shall violate any provision of the fire
code or any permit or license granted pursuant to the chapter, or any rule, regulation or

policy promulgated pursuant thereto.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code."

SECTION 34. A new section 15.20.070 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.20.070 Fire Code - Amendments Generally

The 2011 Los Angeles County Fire Code, as adopted by Section 15.20.010, is hereby
amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter,"

SECTION 35. A new section 15.20.080 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

"15.20.080 Fire Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the fire code, as set forth in section 15.20.010, shall not be
construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or use
which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code."

SECTION 36. A new section 15.20.090 is added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in
its entirety, as follows:

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



"15.20.090 Fire Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the fire code, adopted by reference in section 15.20.010, be
rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions,
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the fire code hereby
adopted shall remain in full force and effect."

SECTION 37. A new Chapter 15.24, entitled "RESIDENTIAL CODE" is added to the
Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in its entirety, as follows:

"15.24 Residential Code

15.24.010 Residential Code - Adoption

15.24.020 Residential Code - Penalty

15.24.030 Residential Code - Amendments Generally
15.24.040 Residential Code - Conflict

15.24.050 Residential Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby
15.24.060 Residential Code - Severability

15.24.010 Residential Code - Adoption

A. The 2010 California Residential Code as amended by Title 30 Los
Angeles County Residential Code together with their appendices are adopted by the city
as the city's residential code, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargements,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, use, equipment,
height, area, security, abatement, and maintenance of certain residential buildings or
structures within the city, and provide for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefore, are hereby adopted by reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby
repealed.

B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,
together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk's office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this chapter.

15.24.020 Residential Code - Penalty

A. No person shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove,
convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause the
same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provision of this 2010 California
Residential Code, including other codes duly adopted by this chapter.

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to
Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code.

15.24.030 Residential Code - Amendments Generally

The 2011 Los Angeles County Residential Code, as adopted by Section 15.24.010, is
hereby amended as follows:

Wherever reference is made to the County of Los Angeles or to the unincorporated area
of the County, such area shall be deemed to include within its corporate limits the area
of the city for purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this chapter.

15.24.040 Residential Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of the
residential code, as adopted in Section 15.24.010, and any provision of this code, each
provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other. In the event any apparently
conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be so construed, the city's
community development director shall determine which provision shall prevail.

15.24.050 Residential Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption hereby of the residential code, as set forth in Section 15.24.010, shall not
be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or authorizing any business or
use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this code.

15.24.060 Residential Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the residential code, hereby adopted by reference in Section
15.24.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of
competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining
provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and the residential
code hereby adopted shall remain in full force and effect.”

SECTION 38. A new Chapter 15.28, entitled "GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE," is
added to the Lawndale Municipal Code to read, in its entirety, as follows:

"15.28 Green Building Standards Code

15.28.010 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Penalty

15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code - Conflict

15.28.040 Green Building Standards Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby
15.28.050 Green Building Standards Code - Severability

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



15.28.010 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption

A. The 2010 California Green Building Standards Code which regulates the
erection, construction, enlargements, alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion,
demolition, occupancy, use, equipment, height, area, security, abatement, and
maintenance of certain residential buildings or structures within the city, provides for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore, are hereby adopted by

reference, and conflicting ordinances are hereby repealed.
B. All of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the codes,

together with their appendices, one copy of which will be on file and accessible to the
public for inspection at the city clerk’s office, are referred to, adopted and made part of
this chapter as if fully set forth in this chapter with the exceptions, deletions, additions,
and amendments thereto as set forth in this section.

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Penalty

A. No person shall erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove,
convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause the
same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provision of this 2010 California

Green Building Standards, including other codes duly adopted by this chapter.
B. A violation of this section is punishable as an infraction pursuant to

Section 1.08.030 of this code or punishable as a misdemeanor pursuant to Section
1.08.020 of this code.

15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code - Conflict

Whenever an apparent conflict or inconsistency exists between any provision of 2010
California Green Building Standards Code, as adopted in Section 15.28.010, and any
provision of this code, each provision shall be construed so as to supplement the other.
In the event any apparently conflicting or inconsistent provisions may not reasonably be
so construed, the city's community development director shall determine which

provision shall prevail.

15.28.040 Green Building Standards Code - No Entitlement Created Hereby

The adoption of the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, as set forth in
Section 15.28.010, shall not be construed for any purpose as creating any entitlement or
authorizing any business or use which is prohibited by any provision contained in this

code.

15.28.050 Green Building Standards Code - Severability

The city council hereby declares that should any provision, section, paragraph, sentence
or word of this chapter or the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code, adopted
by reference in Section 15.28.010, be rendered or declared invalid by any final court

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



action in a court of competent jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation,
the remaining provisions, sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this chapter and
the 2010 California Green Building Standards Code hereby adopted shall remain in full

force and effect."

SECTION 39. Section 1.08.020 of the Lawndale Municipal Code is amended to include the
following in the table:

"15.12.010  Mechanical Code — County Code Adopted
15.20.010 Fire Code — County Code Adopted
15.24.020 Residential Code - Adoption

15.24.030 Residential Code — Penalty

15.28.020 Green Building Standards Code - Adoption
15.28.030 Green Building Standards Code- Penalty"

SECTION 40. The City Council hereby makes a finding of reasonable necessity for the
amendments as stated separately for each such amendment and identified in the Los Angeles County
Titles 26, 27, 28, 29, 30 and 32. These amendments to the Los Angeles County Codes, incorporating
the uniform and international codes, are reasonably necessary due to the local climatic, geological
and/or topographical conditions characterized by hot, dry summers and the high potential for seismic
activity which make structures particularly vulnerable to rapidly spreading fires and structural damage.

SECTION 41. This ordinance is declared to be an urgency measure pursuant to the authority
conferred upon the City Council of the City of Lawndale by Government Code Sections 36934 and
36937. As such, it shall be in full force and effective immediately upon its adoption by a four-fifths
(4/5) vote of the City Council and shall become operative on January 1, 2011. This ordinance shall
apply to all projects submitted for plan check on or after that date. In accordance with the requirements
of Government Code Sections 36937(b), the City Council hereby declares that the provisions contained
herein are necessary for the immediate preservation of the public peace, health or safety for the
following reasons: (1) the latest adopted State Building and Fire laws become effective January 1,
2011. Tt is essential that the City adopt the above stated Codes and modifications necessitated by local
topographical, geological, and climatic conditions by that date; and (2) in the absence of legislation
effective by that date, technical codes adequate to meet the City’s special circumstances will not be in
effect and hazards will be posed which would immediately threaten the public peace, health, and

safety.

SECTION 42. The adoption of this Ordinance has been determined to be exempt from the
California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to State Guidelines Section 15061 (b)(3) as a project
that has no potential for causing a significant effect on the environment.

SECTION 43. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of any court of any competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City
Council hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each and every section,
subsection, sentence, clause and phrase thereof not declared invalid or unconstitutional without regard
to whether any portion of the ordinance would be subsequently declared invalid or unconstitutional.

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code



SECTION 44. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this ordinance, and
shall make a minute of the passage and adoption thereof in the records of and the proceedings of the
City Council at which the same is passed and adopted. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect
immediately after its final passage and adoption, and within fifteen (15) days after its final passage, the
City Clerk shall cause it to be published in a newspaper of general circulation and shall post the same
at the City Hall and the United States Post Office, Lawndale Branch.

THIS URGENCY ORDINANCE IS PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 20th day

of December, 2010.
b§i%£;ﬂ%@{/Zfi;zgé;%ziéﬂ»ﬂ//

Hatold E. Hofmann, Mayoﬂ

ATTEST:

State of California )
County of Los Angeles ) SS
City of Lawndale )

I, Paula Hartwill, City Clerk of the City of Lawndale, California, do hereby certify that the City
Council duly approved and adopted the foregoing Ordinance No. 1051-10 at its regular meeting held
on the 20th day of December, 2010, by the following roll call vote:

AYES: Hofmann, Pullen-Miles, Rudolph, Osborne, Kearney
NOES: None
ABSENT: None
ABSTAIN: None

[Pt 5t G /oty oo
Paula Hartwill, @ity Clerk Date
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Tiffaﬁ{{/ ¥ Israel{ ,Q(ﬂ{/ Attorney

Urgency Ordinance No. 1051-10
Adopting 2011 County Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fire and

Residential Codes and the 2010 Green Building Standards Code






BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS

Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

701A1

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter 7A to include additions, alterations, and/or
relocated buildings. Many areas of the County have been designated as Fire
Hazard Severity Zones due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire risk as new
buildings.

701A3

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter 7 A to include additions, alterations, and/or
relocated buildings. Many areas of the County have been designated as Fire
Hazard Severity Zones due to the increased risk of fire caused by low humidity,
strong winds, and dry vegetation. Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings
have the same fire risk as new buildings.

701A.3.1

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter 7 A to include additions, alterations, and/or
relocated buildings. Many areas of the County have been designated as Fire
Hazard Severity Zones due to the increased risk of fire caused by low humidity,
strong winds, and dry vegetation. Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings
have the same fire risk as new buildings.

703A.5.2 &
703A5.2.2

Climatic

Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs due to the increased risk of
fire in the County caused by low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation.

704A.3

Climatic

Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs due to the increased risk of
fire in the County caused by low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in high
fire severity zones.

705A.2

Climatic

Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs and requires the use of Class
A roof covering due to the increased risk of fire in the County caused by low
humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in high fire severity zones.

1029.4

Geological

The greater Los Angeles/Long Beach region is a densely populated area having
buildings constructed over and near a vast array of earthquake fault systems
capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent
1994 Northridge Earthquake. The proposed amendment is intended to prevent
occupants from being trapped in a building and to allow rescue workers to easily
enter after an earthquake.

12071,
1207.11,
1207.12

Climatic and
Topographic

Sound Transmission — "Soundproofing" buildings adjacent to Airport (LAX). The
purpose of this section is to establish uniform minimum noise insulation
performance standards to protect persons from the effects of excessive noise
(sound), hearing loss or impairment, and interference with speech and sleep. The
amendment requires other types of buildings, such as, long-term care facilities,
single-family dwellings, private schools, and places of worship to be
"soundproofed.” Based on the local topographic conditions in the Los Angeles
Basin, which includes the surrounding hills and mountains, such as the Santa
Monica Mountains, and the climatic conditions of local wind blowing off shore, such
as the Santa Ana winds, many planes are required to land and take off near the
airports (LAX) to fly over areas where there are buildings including single family
home, long-term care facilities, private schools and places of worship and other
residential buildings, apartment houses, hotels, etc. The noise from these planes
creates a hardship for the citizens, therefore, requiring the buildings to be
"soundproofed.”

1403.3

Climatic
Geological

Section amended to limit the deflection of lateral support of veneer and prohibit its
usage as part of the structural design strength of walls, due to the increased risk of
significant earthquakes in the County. The Structural Engineers Association of

HOA.738871.4

182




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

Southern California (SEAOSC) and LA City Post Northridge Earthquake committee
discovered significant loss of veneer from buildings due to inadequate design and
construction. As deflection limitation in out-of-plane directions is not covered in this
Code, this amendment will prevent loosening and spalling of veneer in a significant
earthquake.

1405.7
through
1405.7.2

Geological

Section amended to require proper anchorage of masonry or stone veneer, due to
the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County. Investigations following
the Northridge earthquake discovered numerous cases where veneer pulled away
from wood stud framing. Most of it was due to corrosion and weakness in the
anchor ties and mesh connections to the framing. Where sheathing was beneath
the veneer, nail attachments were often not attached to the wall framing below.
SEAOSCI/LA City Post Northridge Earthquake committee findings indicated
significant loss of veneer from buildings due to inadequate design and construction.
Therefore, additional reinforcement for heavy veneer, stone and masonry veneer is
needed to minimize such occurrences in the event of future significant earthquakes.

1507.3.1

Geological

Section amended to require concrete and clay tiles to be installed over solid
structural sheathing boards only, due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County. The changes in Section 1507.3.1 are needed because
there were numerous observations of tile roofs pulling away from wood framed
buildings following the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. Where sheathing beneath the
tile roofs was not nailed adequately or the nails were not attached on each side of
each tile or the nail just pulled out over a period of time because the shank of the
nails were smooth. Northridge SEAOSC/LA City Post Northridge Earthquake
committee findings indicated significant problems with tile roof due to inadequate
design and/or construction. Therefore, the amendment is needed to needed to
minimize such occurrences in the event of future significant earthquakes.

Table
1507.3.7

Geological

Table amended to require proper anchorage for clay or concrete tiles from sliding or
rotating due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County. Design
provisions developed based on detailed study of the 1994 Northridge and the 1971
Sylmar earthquakes need to be incorporated into the local building code.

1613.6.7

Geological

The inclusion of the importance factor in this equation has the unintended
consequence of reducing the minimum seismic separation distance for important
facilities such as hospital, school, police, and fire station, etc., from adjoining
structures. The deletion of the importance factor from Equation 16-44 will ensure
that a safe seismic separation distance is provided. This amendmentis a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and
is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1613.8
through
1613.8.1

Geological

The steel Buckling Restrained Braced Frame (BRBF) system was first approved for
use in the 2003 NEHRP Provisions. The values for the approximate period
perimeters C, and x were also approved as part of that original BSSC Proposal 6-
6R (2003). It was an oversight that these parameters were not carried forward into
the 2005 Edition of the ASCE 7. Currently, these two factors can be found in
Appendix R of AISC 341-05. There, they function only as a placeholder that will be
removed in the next version upon approval by ASCE 7 Task Committee on Seismic.
This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

1613.8.2

Geological

Observed damages to one- and two-family dwellings of light frame construction
after the Northridge Earthquake may have been partially attributed to vertical

HOA.738871.4

183




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

irregularities common to this type of occupancy and construction. In an effort to
improve quality of construction and incorporate lessons learned from studies after
the Northridge Earthquake, the modification to ASCE 7-05 Section 12.2.3.1 by
limiting the number of stories and height of the structure to two stories will
significantly minimize the impact of vertical irregularities and concentration of
inelastic behavior from mixed structural systems. This amendment is a continuation
of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary
due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1613.8.3

Geological

The importance factor, |, was dropped from equation 12.8-16 by mistake while
transcribing it from NEHRP Recommended Provisions (2003) equation 5.2-16. For
buildings with importance factor, |, higher than 1.0, stability coefficient should
include the importance factor. The modification is consistent with the provisions
adopted by OSPHD and DSA-SS as reflected in Section 1615.10.7 of the 2010
California Building Code. SEAOSC Steel Committee had supported the proposed
modification during the 2007 code adoption process. This amendmentis a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and
is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1613.8.4

Geological

A joint Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC),

Los Angeles County, and Los Angeles City Task Force investigated the
performance of concrete and masonry construction with flexible wood diaphragm
failures after the Northridge earthquake. It was concluded at that time that
continuous ties are needed at specified spacing to control cross grain tension in the
interior of the diaphragm. Additionally, subdiaphragm shears need to be limited to
control combined orthogonal stresses within the diaphragm. Recognizing the
importance and need to continue the recommendation made by the task force, but
also taking into consideration the improved performance and standards for
diaphragm construction today, a proposal to increase the continuous tie spacing
limit to 40 ft in lieu of 25 ft and to use 75 percent of the allowable code diaphragm
shear to determine the depth of the sub-diaphragm in lieu of the 300 plf is deemed
appropriate and acceptable. The Los Angeles region is within a very active
geological location. The various jurisdictions within this region have taken
additional steps to prevent roof or floor diaphragms from pulling away from concrete
or masonry walls. This decision was made due to the frequency of this type of
failure during the past significant earthquakes. This amendment is a continuation of
an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

1613.9
through
1613.9.10.5

Geological
Topographical

Section is added to improve seismic safety of buildings constructed on or into
hillsides. Due to the local topographical and geological conditions of the sites within
the Los Angeles region and their probabilities for earthquakes, this technical
amendment is required to address and clarify special needs for buildings
constructed on hillside locations. A joint Structural Engineers Association of
Southern California (SEAOSC) and both the Los Angeles County and Los Angeles
City Task Force investigated the performance of hillside building failures after the
Northridge earthquake. Numerous hillside failures resulted in loss of life and millions
of dollars in damage. These criteria were developed to minimize the damage to
these structures and have been in use by both the City and County of Los Angeles
for several years with much success. This amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

17041

Geological
Topographical

Section amended to remove the exemption of Group U from special inspection
requirements. One of the significant problems discovered from the studies after the
Northridge Earthquake was the extent of poor quality in construction, especially for

HOA.738871.4

184




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

residential wood frame accessory structures. The provisions to require that special
inspectors be provided for work listed under Section 1704 to observe the actual
construction will ensure that acceptable standards of workmanship are provided.

1704 .4

Geological

Results from studies after the 1994 Northridge Earthquake indicated that a
significant portion of the damages were attributable to lack of quality control during
construction resulting in poor performance of the building or structure. Therefore,
the amendment restricts the exceptions to the requirement for special inspection.
This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

1704.8

Geological

Studies after the Northridge Earthquake revealed that great confusion exists in the
field over what is required by the Code in the way of special inspection beyond just
piles and caissons. Connecting grade beams used in driven deep foundations will
generally act like concrete beams and should not be treated like typical footings.
Section 1704.4 requires concrete beams to have special inspection, but exempts
the footings of buildings three stories or less in height. This amendment clarifies
that the grade beams that connect driven deep foundations are not exempt from
special inspection even if they are used as part of the foundation system. They are
an essential part of the driven deep foundation system and should receive the same
level of inspection, particularly since this type of system must resist the higher
demand of seismic loads in this region. The amendment is necessary due to the
increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1704.9

Geological

Studies after the Northridge Earthquake revealed that great confusion exists in the
field over what is required by the Code in the way of special inspection beyond just
piles and caissons. Connecting grade beams used in cast-in-place deep
foundations will generally act like concrete beams and should not be treated like
typical footings. Section 1704.4 requires concrete beams to have special
inspection, but exempts the footings of buildings three stories or less in height. This
amendment clarifies that the grade beams that connect cast-in-place deep
foundations are not exempt from special inspection even if they are used as part of
the foundation system. They are an essential part of the cast-in-place deep
foundation system and should receive the same level of inspection, particularly
since this type of system must resist the higher demand of seismic loads in this
region. The amendment is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

1705.3

Geological

In Southern California, very few detached one- or two-family dwellings not
exceeding two stories above grade plane are built as "box-type" structures,
specially for those in hillside areas and near the oceanfront. Many with steel
moment frames or braced frames, and or cantilevered columns can still be shown
as "regular” structures by calculations. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, the language in Sections 1705.3 ltem 3 of
the California Building Code would permit many detached one- or two-family
dwellings not exceeding two stories above grade plane with complex structural
elements to be constructed without the benefit of special inspections. By requiring
special inspections, the quality of major structural elements and connections that
affect the vertical and lateral load resisting systems of the structure will greatly be
increased. The exception should only be allowed for detached one- or two-family
dwellings not exceeding two stories above grade plane assigned to Seismic Design
category A, B, and C.

HOA.738871.4

185




Code Condition
Section

Explanation of Amendment

17101 Geological

The language in Sections 1710.1 of the California Building Code permits the owner
to employ any registered design professional to perform structural observations with
minimum guidelines. However, it is important to recognize that the registered
design professional responsible for the structural design has thorough knowledge of
the building he/she designed. By requiring the registered design professional
responsible for the structural design or their designee who were involved with the
design to observe the construction, the quality of the observation for major
structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral load resisting
systems of the structure will greatly be increased. Additional requirements are
provided to help clarify the role and duties of the structural observer and the method
of reporting and correcting observed deficiencies to the building official. This
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

1710.2 Geological

With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region,
the language in Sections 1710.2 ltem 3 of the California Building Code would permit
many low-rise buildings and structures with complex structural elements to be
constructed without the benefit of a structural observation. By requiring a registered
design professional to observe the construction, the quality of the observation for
major structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral load
resisting systems of the structure will greatly be increased. An exception is
provided to permit simple structures and buildings to be excluded. This amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous Code adoption cycles,
and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1807.1.4 Climatic
Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that a wood foundation is
effective in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being
subject to deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant
moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood retaining walls, when
they are not properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed
very poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically
accustomed to construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southern California
region and are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment
of wood that makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet applications. The
proposed amendment takes the necessary precautionary steps to reduce or
eliminate potential problems that may result by using wood foundations that
experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of wood-
destroying organisms. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment
adopted during previous Code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the
increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1807.1.6 Geological

With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, it
is deemed necessary to take precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result by following prescriptive design provisions that do not take
into consideration the surrounding environment. Plain concrete performs poorly in
withstanding the cyclic forces resulting from seismic events. In addition, no
substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced foundation
walls are effective in resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher
risk of failure. It is important that the benefit and expertise of a registered design
professional be obtained to properly analyze the siructure and take these issues
into consideration. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted

HOA.738871.4

186




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

during previous Code adoption cycles.

1809.3

Geological

With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, it
is deemed necessary to take precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result for under-reinforced footings located on sloped surfaces.
Requiring minimum reinforcement for stepped footings is intended to address the
problem of poor performance of plain or under-reinforced footings during a seismic
event. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous Code adoption cycles.

1809.7 and
Table
1809.7

Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced footings
are effective in resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of
failure. Therefore, this amendment requires minimum reinforcement in continuous
footings to address the problem of poor performance of plain or under-reinforced
footings during a seismic event. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, it is deemed necessary to take precautionary
steps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by following
prescriptive design provisions for footings that do not take into consideration the
surrounding environment. It was important that the benefit and expertise of a
registered design professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and
take these factors into consideration. This amendment reflects the
recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed in the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. This amendmentis a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

1809.12

Climatic
Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that timber footings are effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effects of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Timber footings, when they are not properly
treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly. Most
contractors are typically accustomed to construction in dry and temperate weather
in the Southern California region and are not generally familiar with the necessary
precautions and treatment of wood that makes it suitable for both seismic events
and wet applications. The proposed amendment takes the necessary precautionary
steps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by using timber
footings that experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does
not experience temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and
proliferation of wood-destroying organisms. This amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous Code adoption cycles, and is necessary due
to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1908.1 and
1908.1.11
through
1908.1.14

Geological

This amendment is intended to carry over critical provisions for the design of
concrete columns in moment frames from the UBC. Increased confinement is
critical to the integrity of such columns and these modifications ensure that it is
provided when certain thresholds are exceeded. In addition, this amendment carries
over from the UBC a critical provision for the design of concrete shear walls. It
essentiaily limits the use of very highly gravity-loaded walls from being included in
the seismic load resisting system, since their failure could have catastrophic effect
on the building. Furthermore, this amendment was incorporated in the code based
on observations from the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. Rebar placed in very thin
concrete topping slabs has been observed in some instances to have popped out of
the stab due to insufficient concrete coverage. This modification ensures that
critical boundary and collector rebars are placed in sufficiently thick slabs to prevent

HOA.738871.4

187




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

buckling of such reinforcements. This amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous Code adoption cycles, and is necessary due
to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1908.1.2

Geological

By virtue of ACI 318 Section 21.1.1.7(d), intermediate precast structural walls
designed under Section 21.4, material requirements intended under provisions
21.1.4,21.1.5, 21.1.6, and 21.1.7 would be excluded for structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. The amendments to ACI 318 Chapter 21 are
needed to ensure that structural walls designed under ASCE 7 Table 12.2-1 using
the intermediate wall panel category would conform to ductility requirements
comparable to special structural walls; and conformance to the long standing
practice of ACI 318 to impose special requirements for high seismic design regions.
This amendment gives explicit requirements under which design and detailing need
to conform to special structural wall system provisions in ACI-318 Section 21.9,
which covers both cast-in-place as well as precast. This amendment further gives
building officials the tools to enforce minimum life safety building performance under
earthquake forces in Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. This amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and
is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1908.1.3

Geological

The design provision for wall pier detailing was originally introduced by SEAOC in
1987 to legacy Uniform Building Code (UBC) and was included in the 1988 UBC
through the 1997 UBC (2002 CBC). The wall pier detailing provision prescribed
under Section 1908.1.4 was intended for high seismic zones equivalent to current
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. Section 1908.1.3 was added as a complement
of wall pier detailing in Seismic Design Category C (formerly seismic zones 2A and
2B under the legacy model code). ACI| 318 Commentary R 21.1.1 emphasized "it is
essential that structures assigned to higher Seismic Design Categories possess a
higher degree of toughness," and further encourages practitioners to use special
structural wall systems in regions of high seismic risk. ASCE 7 Table 12.2-1 permits
intermediate precast structural wall system in Seismic Design Category D, E, or F.
Current Section 1908.1.3 is not limited to just structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category C. The required shear strength under 21.3.3, referenced in current
Section 21.4.5, is based on V,under either nominal moment strength or two times
the code prescribed earthquake force. The required shear strength in 21.6.5.1,
referenced in Section 21.9.10.2 (IBC 1908.1.4), is based on the probable shear
strength, V. under the probable moment strength, M,,. In addition, the spacing of
required shear reinforcement is 8 inches on center under current Section 21.4.5
instead of 6 inches on center with seismic hooks at both ends under Section
21.9.10.2. Requirement of wall pier under Section 21.9.10.2 would enhance better
ductility. The current practice in commercial buildings constructed using precast
panel wall systems is to have large window and door openings and/or narrow wall
piers. Wall panels varying up to three stories high with openings resembles a wall
frame which is not currently recognized under any of the defined seismic-force
resisting systems other than consideration of structural wall systems. Conformance
to special structural wall system design and detailing of wall piers ensures minimum
life safety performance in resisting earthquake forces for structures in Seismic
Design Category D, E, or F. The modification separates wall piers designed for
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C from those assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E, or F. This modification is consistent with the amendment
adopted by DSA-SS as reflected in Section 1916.4.4 of the 2010 Edition of the
California Building Code. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment

HOA.738871.4

188




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the
increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1908.1.8

Geological

This amendment requires minimum reinforcement in continuous footings to address
the problem of poor performance of plain or under-reinforced footings during a
seismic event. This amendment reflects the recommendations by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City
Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed in 1994
Northridge Earthquake. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment
adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the
increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

1909.4

Geological

With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, it
is deemed necessary to take precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result by permitting a reduced edge thickness of the footing that
support walls without taking into consideration the surrounding environment. In
addition, no substantiating data has been provided to show that the reduced edge
thickness is effective in resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher
risk of failure. It is important that the benefit and expertise of a registered design
professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and take these issues
into consideration. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted
during previous code adoption cycles.

HOA.738871.4

189




Code Condition Explanation of Amendment
Section
204.11 Geological A number of significant technical modifications have been made since the adoption

HOA.738871.4

of AISC 341-05. One such change incorporates AWS D1.8/D1.8M by reference for
welding related issues. This change will be included in AISC 341-10 which is to be
incorporated by reference into the 2012 Edition of the International Building Code.
This proposed amendment is consistent with actions taken by both DSA-SS and
OSHPD to incorporate such language in the 2010 Edition of the California Building
Code. AWS D1.8/D1.8M requires that all seismic force resisting system welds are
to be made with filler metals classified using AWS Ab standards that achieve the
following mechanical properties:

Mechanical Properties for Demand Critical Welds
Classification
Properly 70 ksi (48D B0 ksi {550
MPa) MPa)
;‘?’{"Msj,‘;?"“"" 58 {400) min. 68 (470) min.
Tensile
Strength, 70 {(480) min. 80 (550} min.
ksi {MPa)
Elongation (%) 22 min. 19 mun.
CVN
Toughness, 40 {c4) min. @ TO °F (20 *C) b.c
ft-bf (1)
® For LAST of +50 °F (+10 °C). For LAST less than + 50 °F {+10
*C}, see AWS D1.8/D1 .8M Clause 6.3 6.
* Tests conducted in accordance to AWS D1.8/D1.8M Annex A
meeting 40 fi-Ibf {54 J) min. at a temperature lower than +70 °F
{20 C) also meet this requirement.

In addition to the above requirements, AWS D1.8/D1.8M requires, unless otherwise
exempted from testing, that all demand critical welds are to be made with filler
metals receiving Heat Input Envelope Testing that achieve the following mechanical
properties in the weld metal:

Filler Metal Classification Properties for
Seismic Force Resisting System Welds
Classification
Property 70 ksi (480 80 ksi {550
MPa) MPa)
2?'(",“?;"“”" 58 {400) min. 68 (470) min.
Tensile
Strength, 70 {480} min. 80 (550} min.
ksi (MPa)
Elongation, % 27 min. 19 mun.
CVN
Teughness, 20 27y min. @0 °F {18 °C)*
flbf ()
*Filler metals classified as meeting 20 f-Ibf (27 J)min_ata
temperature lower than 0 °F (—18 °C) also meet this
requirement.

The amendment is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in

the County.
190




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

2304.9.1
and Table
2304.9.1

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern California area and the expected
higher level of performance on buildings and structures, this proposed local
amendment limits the use of staple fasteners in resisting or transferring seismic
forces. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC

Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code Committee showing that stapled wood
structural shear panels do not exhibit the same behavior as nailed wood structural
shear panels. The test results of stapled wood structural shear panels appeared
much lower in strength and drift than nailed wood structural shear panel test results.
Therefore, the use of staples as fasteners to resist or tfransfer seismic forces shall
not be permitted without being substantiated by cyclic testing. This amendment is a
continuation of a similar amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles,
and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

2304.11.7

Climatic
Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood used in retaining or
crib walls is effective in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event
while being subject to deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of
constant moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood used in
retaining or crib walls, when it is not properly treated and protected against
deterioration, has performed very poorly. Most contractors are typically accustomed
to construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southern California region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that
makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the necessary precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate
potential problems that may result by using wood in retaining or crib walls that
experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of wood-
destroying organisms. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted
during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the increased risk of
significant earthquakes in the County.

2305.4

Geological

The overdriving of nails into the structural wood panels still remains a concern when
pneumatic nail guns are used for wood structural panel shear wall nailing. Box nails
were observed to cause massive and multiple failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick
plywood during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. The use of clipped head nails
continues to be restricted from use in wood structural panel shear walls where the
minimum nail head size must be maintained in order to minimize nails from pulling
through sheathing materials. Clipped or mechanically driven nails used in wood
structural panel shear wall construction were found to perform much worse in
previous wood structural panel shear wall testing done at the University of California
Irvine. The existing test results indicated that, under cyclic loading, the wood
structural panel shear walls were less energy absorbent and less ductile. The
panels reached ultimate load capacity and failed at substantially less lateral
deflection than those using same size hand-driven nails. This amendment reflects
the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAQSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated
the poor performance observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake. This amendment is
a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and
is necessary due to the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

HOA.738871.4

191




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

2305.5

Geological

Many of the hold-down connectors currently in use do not have any acceptance
report based on dynamic testing protocol. This amendment continues to limit the
allowable capacity to 75% of the acceptance report value to provide an additional
factor of safety for statically tested anchorage devices. Cyclic forces imparted on
buildings and structures by seismic activity cause more damage than equivalent
forces which are applied in a static manner. Steel plate washers will reduce the
additional damage which can result when hold-down connectors are fastened to
wood framing members. This amendment reflects the recommendations by the
Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the

Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed
in the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. This amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to
the increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

2306.2.1
and Tables
2306.2.1(3)
through
2306.2.1(4)

Geological

The Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the
Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the damages to buildings and
structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake recommended reducing
allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms that
were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with
a report to the Governor from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of
California recommending that code requirements be "more thoroughly substantiated
with testing." The allowable shear values for wood structural panel shear walls or
diaphragms fastened with staples are based on monotonic testing and do not take
into consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a
repeating and fully reversible manner. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing
was conducted by a private engineering firm to determine if wood structural panels
fastened with staples would exhibit the same behavior as wood structural panels
fastened with common nails. The test result revealed that wood structural panels
fastened with staples appeared to be much lower in strength and stiffness than
wood structural panels fastened with common nails. It was recommended that the
use of staples as fasteners for wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms not
be permitted to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E and F unless it can be substantiated by cyclic testing. Furthermore,
the cities and unincorporated areas within the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing of shear walls and
diaphragms designed for high levels of seismic forces by requiring wood sheathing
be applied directly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels
placed over gypsum sheathing. This amendment is intended to prevent the
undesirable performance of nails when gypsum board softens due to cyclic
earthquake displacements and the nail ultimately does not have any engagement in
a solid material within the thickness of the gypsum board. This amendment
continues the previous amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle.

HOA.738871.4

192




Code
Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

2306.3 and
Tables
2306.3
through
2306.3(2)

Geological

The Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the
Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the damages to buildings and
structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake recommended reducing
allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms that
were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with
a report to the Governor from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of
California recommending that code requirements be "more thoroughly substantiated
with testing." The allowable shear values for wood structural panel shear walls or
diaphragms fastened with stapled nails are based on monotonic testing and do not
take into consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a
repeating and fully reversible manner. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing was
conducted by a private engineering firm to determine if wood structural panels
fastened with stapled nails would exhibit the same behavior as wood structural
panels fastened with common nails. The test result revealed that wood structural
panel fastened with stapled nails appeared to be much lower in strength and
stiffness than wood structural panels fastened with common nails. It was
recommended that the use of stapled nail as fasteners for wood structural panel
shear walls or diaphragms not be permitted to resist seismic forces in structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E and F unless it can be substantiated by
cyclic testing. Furthermore, the cities and unincorporated areas within the

Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of
the framing of shear walls and diaphragms designed for high levels of seismic
forces by requiring wood sheathing be applied directly over the framing members
and prohibiting the use of panels placed over gypsum sheathing. This amendment
is intended to prevent the undesirable performance of nails when gypsum board
softens due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail ultimately does not
have any engagement in a solid material within the thickness of the gypsum board.
This amendment continues the previous amendment adopted during the 2007 code
adoption cycle, and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

2306.7

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern California area and the expected
higher level of performance on buildings and structures, this amendment limits the
location where shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster or gypsum board are used in
multi-level buildings. The poor performance of such shear walls sheathed with other
materials in the 1994 Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City
Task Force and formed the basis for this amendment. Considering that shear walls
sheathed with lath, plaster or gypsum board are less ductile than steel moment
frames or wood structural panel shear walls, the cities and unincorporated areas of
the Los Angeles region have taken the necessary measures to limit the potential
structural damage that may be caused by the use of such walls at the lower level of
multi-level building that are subject to higher levels of seismic loads. This
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles.

HOA.738871.4

193




Code Condition Explanation of Amendment
Section
2308.3.4 Geological With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region,

interior walls can easily be called upon to resist over half of the seismic loading
imposed on simple buildings or structures. Without a continuous foundation to
support the braced wall line, seismic loads would be transferred through other
elements such as non-structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. The purpose
of this amendment is to limit the use of the exception to structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category A, B or C where lower seismic demands are expected.
Requiring interior braced walls be supported by continuous foundations is intended
to reduce or eliminate the poor performance of buildings or structures. This
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles.

2308.12.2 Geological

Additional weight attributed to the use of heavy veneer substantially increases loads
to conventionally braced walls in an earthquake. Moreover, normal to greater than
normal wall loads that occur in an earthquake can seriously overstress wood
bearing walls in combined seismic/gravity load combinations. Numerous
conventionally framed veneer covered structures sustained serious damages in the
Northridge Earthquake as a result of the heavy weight of the veneer. This
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code
adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the increased risk of significant
earthquakes in the County.

2308.12.4 Geological
and Table
2308.12.4

This amendment specifies minimum sheathing thickness and nail size and spacing
s0 as to provide a uniform standard of construction for designers and buildings to
follow. This is intended to improve the performance level of buildings and structures
that are subject to the higher seismic demands placed on buildings or structure in
this region. This proposed amendment reflects the recommendations by the
Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los
Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed in
1994 Northridge Earthquake. This amendment is a continuation of an amendment
adopted during previous code adoption cycles, and is necessary due to the
increased risk of significant earthquakes in the County.

2308.12.5 Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern California area and the expected
higher level of performance on buildings and structures, this amendment limits the
use of staple fasteners in resisting or transferring seismic forces. In September
2007, limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter
Structural Code Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear panels do
not exhibit the same behavior as nailed wood structural shear panels. The test
results of stapled wood structural shear panels appeared much lower in strength
and drift than nailed wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the use of
staples as fasteners to resist or transfer seismic forces shall not be permitted
without being substantiated by cyclic testing. This amendment is a continuation of a
similar amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

3401.8.1 to | Geological
3401.8.3

The greater Los Angeles/Long Beach region is a densely populated area having
buildings constructed over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of
producing major earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent 1994
Northridge Earthquake. The purpose of the amendments is to prevent inadequate
construction or bracing to resist horizontal forces, thus becoming a hazard to life or
property in the event of an earthquake.

HOA.738871.4

194




Code Condition Explanation of Amendment
Section
3401.9 Geological The greater Los Angeles/Long Beach region is a densely populated area having
buildings constructed over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of
producing major earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent 1994
Northridge Earthquake. The purpose of the amendment is to save lives in the event
of an earthquake when panics occur and glass shatters.
J101.1 Geological This section is revised to include erosion and sediment control measures to address
Topographical | the complex and diverse set of soil types and geologic conditions that exist in the
Climate Los Angeles County region.
J103.1 - Geological This section is revised to provide adequate control of grading operations typical to
J103.2 Topographical | the Los Angeles County region due to the complex and diverse set of soil types,
Climate climates, and geologic conditions that exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J104.2.1 - Geological Sections revised or added to provide adequate control of grading operations typical
J104 .4 Topographical | to the Los Angeles County region due to the complex and diverse set of soil types,
Climate climates, and geologic conditions that exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J105.1- Geological Sections revised or added to provide adequate control of grading operations typical
J105.14 Topographical | to the Los Angeles County region due to the complex and diverse set of soil types,
Climate climates, and geologic conditions that exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J106.1 Geological Section revised to require more stringent cut slope ratios to address the complex
Topographical | and diverse set of soil types and geologic conditions that exist in the Los Angeles
Climate County region.
J106.2 Geological Section added to require drainage terraces to address the complex and diverse set
Topographical | of soil types, climates, and geologic conditions which exist in the Los Angeles
Climate County region.
J107.1- Geological Sections revised to provide more stringent fill requirements for slope stability, and
J107.7 Topographical | settlement due to the complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and geologic
Climate conditions which exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J107.8 - Geological Sections revised to provide more stringent inspection and testing requirements for
J107.9 Topographical | fill slope stability due to the complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and
Climate geologic conditions which exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J108.1 - Geological Sections revised to provide more stringent slope setback requirements to address
J108.4 Topographical | the complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and geologic conditions which
Climate exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J109.1 - Geological Sections revised to provide more siringent drainage and terracing requirements to
J109.3 Topographical | address the complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and geologic conditions
Climate which exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J109.5 Geological Subsection added to provide for adequate outlet of drainage flows due to the
Topographical | diverse set of soil types, climates, and geologic conditions which exist in the
Climate Los Angeles County region.
J110 - Geological Sections revised or added to provide for State requirements of storm water pollution
J110.8.5 Topographical | prevention and more stringent slope planting, and slope stability requirements to
Climate control erosion due to the complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and
geologic conditions that exist in the Los Angeles County region.
J111 Geological Section revised to reference additional standards for soils testing due to the
Topographical | complex and diverse set of soil types, climates, and geologic conditions that exist in
Climate the Los Angeles County region.

HOA.738871.4

195




Residential Code Amendments

Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R301.1.3.2

Geological

After the 1994 Northridge Earthquake, the Wood Frame
Construction Joint Task Force recommended that the
quality of wood frame construction needs to be greatly
improved. One such recommendation identified by the
Task Force is to improve the quality and organization of
structural plans prepared by the engineer or architect so
that plan examiners, building inspectors, contractors, and
special inspectors may logically follow and construct the
presentation of the seismic force-resisting systems in the
construction documents. For buildings or structures
located in Seismic Design Category Do, D1, D2 or E that
are subject to a greater level of seismic forces, the
requirement to have a California licensed architect or
engineer prepare the construction documents is intended
to minimize or reduce structural deficiencies that may
cause excessive damage or injuries in wood frame
buildings. Structural deficiencies such as plan and vertical
irregularities, improper shear transfer of the seismic force-
resisting system, missed details or connections important
to the structural system, and the improper application of
the prescriptive requirements of the California Residential
Code can be readily addressed by a registered design
professional.

R301.1.4

Geological
Topographical

This technical amendment is for buildings constructed on
hillsides. Due to the local topographical and geological
conditions of the sites within the greater Los Angeles
region and their susceptibility to earthquakes, this
amendment is required to address and clarify special
needs for buildings constructed on hillside locations. A
joint Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC), Los Angeles County, and

Los Angeles City Task Force investigated the performance
of hillside building failures after the Northridge earthquake.
Numerous hillside failures resulted in loss of life and
millions of dollars in damage. These criteria were
developed to minimize the damage to these structures and
have been in use by the City and County of Los Angeles
for several years.

HOA.684523.11

37




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R301.2.2.2.5

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the type of irregular conditions as
specified in the 2010 California Residential Code. Such
limitations are recommended to reduce structural damages
in the event of an earthquake. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls and
all associated elements when designed for high levels of
seismic loads.

R301.2.2.3.5.1

Geological

The term "one" in AlISI S230, Section B1 conflicts with
Table B1-1, whereas in the table it states the "thinnest
connected steel sheet." The term "one" in the AISI S230,
Section B1 language can misleadingly be interpreted as
though one of the sheets can be 33 mils and the other
sheet thicker, but that you still qualify for a reduction factor;
this is not the intent of the tables. For example, in a steel-
to-steel connection consisting of a 33 mils and 44 mils,
and if in any part of the code it is required to provide (4)
No. 8 screws; according to Table B1-1 the factor 1.0 would
apply to the required number of screws and thus a
reduction of screws would not be allowed.

R322.1.4.1

Geological
Topographical

This amendment is intended to clarify who should perform
studies and analyses for design flood elevations. Based
on our vast experience with drainage and grading sites, we
have concluded that registered civil engineers are highly
equipped to perform such design and analyses.

R327

Climatic

States that Chapter R327 requirements are applicable to
all occupancy groups as wildfire exposure impacts all
types of buildings and structures. This amendment is
needed due to the high-fire severity zones caused by low
humidity, strong winds and dry vegetation.

R327.1.1

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

R327.1.3

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

HOA.684523.11

38




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R327.1.31

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Additions,
alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire
risk as new buildings.

R327.3.5.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.3.56.2.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.4.3

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.5.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof and would require the use of Class A roof
covering.

R401.1

Geological

Wood foundations, even those that are preservative-
treated, encounter a higher risk of deterioration when
contacting the adjacent ground. The required seismic
anchorage and transfer of lateral forces into the foundation
system necessary for 2-story structures and foundation
walls could become compromised at varying states of
wood decay. In addition, global structure overturning
moment and sliding resistance is reduced when utilizing
wood foundations as opposed to conventional concrete or
masonry systems. However, non-occupied, single-story
storage structures pose significantly less risk to human
safety and should be able to utilize the wood foundation
guidelines specified in this Chapter.

R403.1.2
R403.1.3
R403.1.5

Climatic
Geological

This proposed amendment requires minimum
reinforcement in continuous footings and stepped footings
to address the problem of poor performance of plain or
under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. This
amendment reflects the recommendations by the
Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that
investigated the poor performance observed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous

HOA.684523.11

39




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

code adoption cycles. Interior walls can easily be called
upon to resist over half of the seismic loading imposed on
simple buildings or structures. Without a continuous
foundation to support the braced wall line, seismic loads
would be transferred through other elements such as non-
structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. Requiring
interior braced walls be supported by continuous
foundations is intended to reduce or eliminate the poor
performance of buildings or structures.

R404.2

Climatic
Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that
wood foundations are effective in supporting structures
and buildings during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by presence of water in the soil as
well as other materials detrimental to wood foundations.
Wood foundations, when they are not properly treated and
protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are
typically accustomed to construction in dry weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar
with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that
makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet
applications. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, coupled with the
dryer weather conditions here as oppose to the northern
and eastern part of the country, it is the intent of this
proposal to take the necessary precautionary steps to
reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result from
the use of wood footings and foundations that does not
take into consideration the conditions of this surrounding
environment.

R501.1

Geological

There is no limitation for weight of mechanical and
plumbing fixtures and equipment in the CRC Code.
Requirements of ASCE 7-05 and CBC are necessary that
limits equipment weight up to 400 pounds, mounted at 4
feet or less above the floor or attic level without
engineering design.

R503.2.4

Geological

Section R502.10 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum floor opening size
nor does Section R503 provide any details to address the
issue of shear transfer near larger floor openings. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures

HOA.684523.11

40




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

in this region, it is important to ensure that a complete load
path is provided to reduce or eliminate potential damages
caused by seismic forces. Requiring blocking with metal
ties around larger floor openings and limiting opening size
is consistent with the requirements of Section
R301.2.2.2.5.

602.3.2

Geological

The cities and county of the Los Angeles region have
taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of
the framing of the shear walls when designed for high
levels of seismic loads by eliminating single top plate
construction. The performance of modern day braced wall
panel construction is directly related to an adequate load
path extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system.

Table R602.3(1)

Geological

In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building
Code.

Table R602.3(2)

Geological

In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building

HOA.684523.11

41




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

Code.

Table
R602.10.1.2(2)

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment continues to reduce/eliminate the allowable
shear values for shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster, or
gypsum board. The poor performance of such shear walls
sheathed with other materials in the 1994 Northridge
Earthquake was investigated by the Structural Engineers
Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the

Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls
when designed for high levels of seismic loads. In
addition, this proposed amendment is consistent with the
conventional framing provisions of the 2010 California
Building Code.

Table
R602.10.2

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed
amendment specifies minimum WSP sheathing thickness
and nail size and spacing so as to provide a uniform
standard of construction for designers and buildings to
follow. This is intended to improve the performance level
of buildings and structures that are subject to the higher
seismic demands placed on buildings or structure in this
region. This proposed amendment reflects the
recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association
of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles
City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake.
This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
cyclic testing data was provided to the structural code
committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. In addition, the test results
of the stapled wood structural shear panels appeared
much lower in strength and drift than the nailed wood
structural shear panel test results.

Figure

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many

HOA.684523.11

42




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R602.10.3.2

failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. Box nails were
observed to cause massive and multiple failures of the
typical 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood during the Northridge
Earthquake. The cities and county of the Los Angeles
region have taken extra measures to maintain the
structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls when
designed for high levels of seismic loads. The proposal for
minimum lap splice requirement is consistent with Section
12.16.1 of ACI 318-05. The performance of modern day
braced wall panel construction is directly related to an
adequate load path extending from the roof diaphragm to
the foundation system. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

R602.10.3.3

Geological

The proposal to change the minimum lap splice
requirement is consistent with Section 12.16.1 of ACI 318-
05.

Figure
R602.10.3.3

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. Box nails were observed to cause massive and
multiple failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick plywood during
the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

Table
R602.10.4.1

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)

HOA.684523.11

43




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC

Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code Committee showing
that stapled wood structural shear panels do not exhibit
the same behavior as the nailed wood structural shear
panels. As a matter of fact, the test results of the stapled
wood structural shear panels appeared much lower in
strength and drift than the nailed wood structural shear
panel test results. Therefore, the use of staples as
fasteners for shear walls sheathed with other materials
shall not be permitted without being substantiated by cyclic
testing. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption
cycles.

Figure
R602.10.4.1.1

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. The proposal in which
"washers shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by
3 inches in size" is consistent with Section R602.11.1 of
the 2010 California Residential Code and Section
2308.12.8 of the 2010 California Building Code.

R602.10.7.1

Geological

The performance of modern day braced wall panel
construction is directly related to an adequate load path
extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system. Interior braced wall panels, therefore, are also
directly dependent upon the adequacy of the foundation

HOA.684523.11

44




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

system. In addition, the proposed amendment for Section
R403.1.2 specifies that all exterior walls and required
interior braced wall panels in buildings shall be supported
with continuous footings.

R606.2.4

Geological

The addition of the word "or" will prevent the use of
unreinforced parapets in Seismic Design Category Dg, Dy,
or D5, or on townhouses in Seismic Design Category C.

Table
R802.5.1(9)

Geological

The number of nails required for the heel joint connection
per Table R802.5.1(9) can be excessive depending on the
rafter slope, spacing, and roof span. This footnote will
help to prevent splitting of connecting wood members
when large numbers of nail are required as stated in the
National Design Specification for Wood Construction
(NDS).

R802.8

Geological

This proposed amendment provides provisions to ensure
that the ends of wood members and the points of bearing
have adequate lateral support to prevent rotation and to
help stabilize the members during construction. This
proposed amendment is consistent with and similar to
requirements contained in the NDS.

R802.10.2

Geological

Wood trusses are engineered structural elements that
require engineered design and calculations. This
amendment provides clarifications that all wood truss
design drawings are to be prepared by a registered
professional.

R803.2.4

Geological

Section R802 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum size of roof
openings, nor does Section R803 provide any details to
address the issue of shear transfer near larger roof
openings. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, it is important to
ensure that a complete load path is provided to reduce or
eliminate potential damage caused by seismic forces.
Requiring blocking with metal ties around larger roof
openings and limiting the size of openings is consistent
with the requirements of Section R301.2.2.2.5.

R1001.3.1

Geological

The performance of fireplaces/chimneys without
anchorage to the foundation has been observed to be
inadequate during major earthquakes. The lack of
anchorage to the foundation results in overturn or
displacement.

HOA.684523.11

45




SECTION 53. This ordinance shall become operative on January 1, 2011.

[3ORESBLDNGMYCC]

HOA.684523.11 46



ELECTRICAL CODE AMENDMENTS

CODE SECTION

CONDITION

EXPLANATION

690.19

Geological

Emergency situations
caused by seismic events
may require the
disconnection of electrical
power in a building.
Presently, the CEC does
not require a disconnecting
means for conductors for
multi-arrayed solar
photovoltaic systems.

HOA.716089.6







Plumbing Code Amendments

CODE SECTION

CONDITION

EXPLANATION

K3.0

Geological, Topographical,

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions.

K4.0(C)

Geological, Topographical

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions.

K6.0(E)

Geological, Topographical

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions.

K6.0(H)

Geological, Topographical

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions.

K7.0(B)

Geological, Topographical

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions.

K10.0(A)(5)

Geological

To establish more restrictive
requirements to prevent earth
movement based on local soil and
seismic conditions.

K11.0(F)

Geological

To establish more restrictive
requirements to prevent earth
movement based on local soil and
seismic conditions.

Table K-3

Geological, Topographical

To establish more restrictive
requirements for protection of local
groundwater due to local soil
conditions, sewer capacity, and
sewage treatment.

Table K-4

Geological, Topographical

To establish consistency with
requirements of the County Health
Department, for sewer capacity, and
sewage treatment due to local soil
conditions.

Table K-5

Geological, Topographical

To establish consistency with

HOA.730522.3

15




CODE SECTION CONDITION EXPLANATION

requirements of the County Health
Department for sewer capacity, and
sewage treatment, due to local soil
conditions.

HOA.730522.3 16




TABLE

MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS

CODE SECTION

CONDITION

EXPLANATION

501

Climatic

Additional Health
Department requirements
are necessary due to local
air quality concerns.

510.1.7

Geological

To reduce damage during a
seismic event.

604.2

Geological

To reduce damage during a
seismic event.

1119.4

Geological

To reduce the potential for
release of toxic refrigerant
caused by shifting
equipment during a seismic
event.

HOA.716090.5







five (ode Prorendirg e,

standards contained in this code and identified in the table below shall be applicable

onlgint in th‘e Disjfict wNjch havefratified e aforesaid sections in

e section 13869.

accordance with California He nd Safety

. Local . .y
Section Condition Explanation and Findings
Local amendment requiring brush clearance in order
30412— | Climatic and to maintain defensible space for fire operations that

is necessary due to Los Angeles County's unique
climate and topography to reduce risk of fire and to
minimize the spreading of fire to structures.

Vegetation Topographical

Prevents storage of combustible materials under
stairways to help prevent fire in stairways from

316.2.2.1 - preventing safe exit in event of fire. Necessary

Storage under | Climatic because of increased danger of fire in

stairways Los Angeles County due to hot and windy
conditions.

Local amendment requiring brush clearance under
electrical transmission lines in order to prevent fires

32511 - Climatic and caused by powerlines and to maintain defensible
Support . space for fire operations that is necessary due to
Topographical . . .
clearance Los Angeles County's unigue climate and
topography to reduce risk of fire and to minimize the
spreading of fire to structures.
Local amendment requiring clearance away from
electrical transmission lines in order to prevent fires
325.1.2 — N caused by powerlines and to maintain defensible
; Climatic and . . X
Line Topoaraphical space for fire operations that is necessary due to
clearance pograp Los Angeles County's unique climate and
topography to reduce risk of fire and to minimize the
spreading of fire to structures.
Local amendment requiring clearance of trees and
30513 other growth from aerial cables in order to prevent
S o fires and to maintain defensible space for fire
Self- Climatic and . .
\ . operations that is necessary due to Los Angeles
supporting Topographical . . .
aerial cable County's unique climate and topography to reduce

risk of fire and to minimize the spreading of fire to
structures.

HOA.734555.1 161




32521 -
Clearances

Climatic and
Topographical

Local amendment creating defensible space for fire
operations that is necessary due to Los Angeles
County's unique climate and topography to reduce
risk of fire and to minimize the spreading of fire to
structures.

32522 -
Extra Hazard

Climatic and
Topographical

Local amendment creating defensible space for fire
operations that is necessary due to Los Angeles
County's unique climate and topography to reduce
risk of fire, to minimize impacts of fire in fire hazard
severity zone, and to reduce possibility of wildland
fires spreading to structures.

325.10 -
-Roadway
Clearance

Climatic and
Topographical

Local amendment requiring clearance of roadways
to provide adequate access for firefighting
apparatus, to create defensible space for fire
operations, and to reduce the possibility of wildland
fires spreading to structures Necessary due to Los
Angeles County's unique climate and topography.

326.7 — Fire
protection
facilities
required

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Local amendment to require fire safety measures
including but not limited to water supply, firebreaks,
posting of fire watchers, access roads, restriction of
activities during high fire hazard and other
conditions to maintain reasonable fire safety.
Necessary due to Los Angeles County's unique
climate and topography to reduce risk of fire, to
reduce the possibility of wildland fires spreading to
structures, and to minimize impacts of fire. Further
necessary because risk of fire is increased due to
the prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles
County.

326.12.2 -
Chimneys

Climatic and
Topographical

Local amendment to reduce the threat of fires by
requiring spark arrestors on chimneys that is
necessary due to Los Angeles County's unique
climate and topography to reduce risk of fire and to
minimize impacts of fire. Such spark arrestors
reduce the likelihood of embers exiting a chimney
and igniting a fire.

326.14 —
Roadway
Clearance

Climatic and
Topographical

Local amendment requiring clearance of roadways
to provide adequate access for firefighting
apparatus, to create defensible space for fire
operations, and to reduce the possibility of wildland
fires spreading to structures Necessary due to Los
Angeles County's unique climate and topography.

HOA.734555.1

162




503.1.2 -
Additional
access

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Provides for additional access requirements
necessary because of terrain, climate or other
factors that limit access. Necessary to ensure
adequate response times due to the unique climatic
and topographical conditions that increase the risk
of fires in fire hazard severity zones. Further
necessary because risk of fire is increased due to
the prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles
County.

503.2.1 —
Dimensions

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Requires unobstructed clearance to sky on fire
apparatus access roads with exception for protected
tree species. Necessary to prevent obstruction of
access roads by tree limbs or other obstructions and
thus allow for quick response times to fires and
other emergencies. Necessary to ensure adequate
response times due to the unique climatic and
topographical conditions that increase the risk of
fires in fire hazard severity zones. Further
necessary because risk of fire is increased due to
the prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles
County.

503.2.5 -
Dead-ends

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Provides for more stringent width, turning radius and
grade specifications for access roads to ensure
access for fire apparatus. Necessary due to unique
climatic and topographical conditions that increase
the risk of fires. Further necessary because risk of
fire is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

503.4 —
Obstruction
of fire
apparatus
access roads

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Adds speed bumps to list of prohibited obstructions
to fire apparatus access roads. Speed bumps
reduce response times to fires and other
emergencies because fire apparatus have to slow
down to pass over them or drive around them.
Necessary to ensure adequate response times due
to the unique climatic and topographical conditions
that increase the risk of fires in fire hazard severity
zones. Further necessary because risk of fire is
increased due to the prevalence of earthquakes in
Los Angeles County.

503.4.1 -
Traffic
calming
devices

Climatic,
Geological, and
Topographical

Requires fire code official approval to install traffic
calming devices. Such devices can reduce
response times to fires and other emergencies.
Necessary to ensure adequate response times due

HOA.734555.1

163




to the unique climatic and topographical conditions
that increase the risk of fires in fire hazard severity
zones. Further necessary because risk of fire is
increased due to the prevalence of earthquakes in
Los Angeles County.

g?os’tgct_io!:n"ien Requires additional fire protectio_n system_s including
recreational flre-ﬂ_ow and access, for recreational ve_hlcle,
vehicle mobile home, and manufactured housing parks,
mobile’ Climatic sales lots, and storage lots. Necessary to ensure
home. manu- Geologiéal and adequate water suppiy gnd access to such locations
facturé d Topograph’icaf due t'o‘ the uniqge climatic anq topographicgl
housing conditions thgt increase the risk of fires in fire
parks, sales h_azard .se\{er'lty zones. Further necessary because
lots, a;n d risk of fire is mcreased due to the prevalence of
storage lots earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
Provides various design and location requirements
for solar photovoltaic systems installed on roofs of
buildings for residential and commercial structures.
504.5 — Roof | Climatic Access and spacing requirements ensure firefighter
top éccess Geologiéal and | @ccess to the roof, provide access pathwa}ys to
and safety Topograph‘ical specific areas of the roof, provide for venting cut-out
areas, and to provide emergency egress from the
roof. Necessary because of increased danger of fire
in Los Angeles County due to climatic and
topographical conditions. '
507.5.1.1 - Requires a draft hydrant for swimming pools and
Poo.l dréﬂ spas located in the fire hazard s.everi'ty zone in order
system infire | Climatic to provide a source of water to fight fires. Necessary
hazard Geologiéal and because of unique climatic and topographical
severity Topograph’ical conditions that increase the risk of fires in fire
ZONES hazard severity zones. Further necessary because
’ risk of fire is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
Provides posting of sign to notify fire department of
507510 — draft hydrant for swimming pools and spas in fire
Draﬁ System Climatic hazard sgverity zone. Necessary because of
identification Geologiéal, and ynique'chmati.c and t_opographical Condition§ that
sign Topographical increase the risk of fires in fire hazard severity

zones. Further necessary because risk of fire is
increased due to the prevalence of earthquakes in
Los Angeles County.

HOA.734556.1-

164




901.7.7 -

Prohibits obstruction of fire protection equipment.
Necessary because of unique climatic and

Obstruction to | Climatic, topographical conditions that increase the risk of
fire protection | Geological, and | fires in fire hazard severity zones. Further
equipment Topographical necessary because risk of fire is increased due to
the prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles
County.
Provides sighage requirements for water control
901.7.8 - valves in order to facilitate fire fighter identification
Above- Climati and use of said valves in an emergency. Necessary
ground water G imatic, because of unique climatic and topographical
eological, and " ! . _
control valve Topographical conditions that increase the risk of fires in fire
signs hazard severity zones. Further necessary because
risk of fire is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County. ‘
901.7 11 — Provide_s clearance rc_equiremen_ts for v_vater‘ (_:ont.rol
Cleér épace valves in ordgr to facilitate fire fighter identification
around Climatic, and use of salq valve%s in an emergency. Necessary
water control Topographical ;
: hazard severity zones. Further necessary because
valve signs . N
risk of fire is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
903.1.2 -
Occupancies
in Fire Provides an additional level of protection to
Hazard occupancies in case of a fire by requiring installation
Severity of automatic fire sprinklers. Necessary because of
Zones and in Climatic, unique climatic and topographical conditions that
the Malibu- Geological, and | increase the risk of catastrophic fires in fire hazard
Santa Monica | Topographical severity zones and due to the topography that

Mountains or
San Gabriel
Southface
areas

reduces response times to fires. Further necessary
because risk of fire is increased due to the
prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

HOA.734555.1

165




Requires red paint on fire department connections
subject to rust or corrosion in order to identify them

lg d1e2n't7i-w Climatic, to firefighters and protect from the elements.
fication Topographical | Necessary because of increased danger of fire in
Los Angeles County due to hot and windy
conditions.
Requires breakable caps or plugs for fire hose
012.8 — couplings to protect them from the elements and to
Breakable Climatic, ensure easy access to the fire department
caps or Topographical | connection during fires. Necessary because of
plugs increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County due
to hot and windy conditions.
Requires Spray booths to have automatic fire
sprinkler system protection under specified
914.9.1 - conditions. Necessary because of increased
Spray Climatic danger of fire in Los Angeles County due to hot and
booths windy conditions. Further necessary because the
risk of fire is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
Requirements for sighage warhing against elevator
use in an emergency. Necessary to ensure proper
1007.9.1 — Climatic notice and ev&ouation inbcase of fir;a or o’(herd
: - emergency. Necessary because of increase
ﬁigl?j’%?e of gfc?loglcal, danger of fire in Los Angeles County due to hot and
buildings Topographical windy conditions. Further necessary because risk
of fire and need for evacuation is increased due to
the prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles
County.
, Provides for additional public safety
1107.9 — evacuation/landing area on high-rise buildings.
Helisiops for Climatic; Necessary due to large number of high-rise
high rise Topographical buildings in Los Angeles County and difficulty in
evacuating high-rise buildings in case of fire or other
emergency.
Provides for requirements for helistops in fire hazard
1107.10 — ~ severity zones to enable helicopters and associated
Heli si ops in water tenders and support equipment to safely
fire hazard Climatic: operate to conduct operations to combat fires in
severity zones: Topogre{phical those areas. Necessary because of increased
1107.10.1 ’ dgnger of fire in Los Angeles County due to hot and
Sy rfa.ce;. windy conditions and topography that hinders the

ability for fire apparatus to gain access to remote
portions of the County.

HOA.734555.1

168




Provides for a hydrant next to helistops in fire
hazard severity zones to enable helicopters to fill
their tanks to facilitate water drops on wildland fires

1107.10.2 - Climatic; in those areas. Necessary because of increased
Hydrant - Topographical danger of fire in Los Angeles County due to hot and
windy conditions and topography that hinders the
ability for fire apparatus to gain access to remote
portions of the County.
Provides for requirements for fire apparatus access
to helistops in fire hazard severity zones to enable
support equipment and apparatus associated with
1107.10.3 - Climatic; helicopter operations to combat fires in those areas.
Access Topographical Necessary because of increased danger of fire in
the county due to hot and windy conditions and
topography that hinders the ability for fire apparatus
to gain access to remote portions of the County.
Provides for spray booths to be equipped with
1504 .4 - Fire Climatic automatic fire sprinklers. Necessary because of
Protection increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County due
to hot and windy conditions.
Sections 1603, | Prowdfas requn'ementg fo.r'frutt and crop ripening
1604. 1605 o operatlons to prevent lgnmon'of ethylene gas and
1606, 1607 — | Climatic and reduce risk of fire and explosion. Necessary
Frui ’ Geological because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
ruit and Crop County due to hot and wind diti dt
Ripening ounty due to hot and windy conditions and to
reduce risk of fires and explosion from earthquakes.
1910 - Storage
of Combustible
Idle Pallets,
1818;0 Provides requirements for the safe storage of
19 10'3’ Climatic combustible pallets to reduce risk. of_ﬁre. Necessary
191014’ because of increased da_nger of flrg in Los Angeles
1910'5: County due to hot and windy conditions.
1910.6, Table
1910.4.1,
Table 1910.4.2
Provides for increased separation for aisles.
N Necessary because of unique climatic conditions
Table 2306.2 ggggg?cz?d that increase the risk of fires. Further necessary

because risk of fire is increased due to the
prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

HOA.734555.1

169




2306.7.1 -

Requires installation of smoke and heat vents.
Necessary because of increased danger of fire in

Vents Climatic Los Angeles County due to hot and windy
conditions.
Provides for effectiveness of sprinkler systems by
2308.2.2 - prohibiting solid shelves, which would restrict water
Racks with Climatic from extinguishing fire on shelves. Necessary
solid shelving ' because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
County due to climatic conditions.
Increased clearance requirements for combustible
Climatic and vegetation near tents and membrane structures.
2404.21 - : : X X
. Topographic Necessary to increase fire and life safety around
Combustible X
vegetation such structures and to c‘reat.e defensibie space.
) Necessary because of fire risk due to climate and
unique topography of Los Angeles County.
Geological Requirements for protective devices to be installed
on fuel gas and oxygen lines to increase safety and
2605.9 — 4 ) ,
reduce risk of explosion and fire. Necessary
Backflash : - -
- because risk of leaks or tank failure is increased
Prevention .
due to the prevalence of earthquakes in Los
Angeles County.
Creates requirements for floors in buildings where
Climatic and hazardous materials are used or stored. Necessary
Geological to increase fire and life safety and to minimize fire
2703.11.3.8 - \
danger from hazardous materials. Necessary .
Floors . : : )
because risk of fire and spillage of hazardous
materials is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
Geological Requirements for secondary containment of
flammable and combustible liquids that are
3404.2.8.3 — necessary to increase fire and life safety and to
Secondary prevent fires involving flammable and combustible
Containment liquids from spreading. Necessary because risk of
leaks or tank failure is increased due to the
prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles County.
Require foam deluge system. Necessary because
3404.2.8.16.1 | Climatic and of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County
— System Geological due to climatic conditions and because risk of leaks

requirements

or tank failure is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

HOA.734555.1

170




3404.29.1.1 -
Required foam
fire protection
systems

Geological and
Climatic

Requires all above-ground tanks exceeding 1,500
square feet of liquid surface area used for the
storage of Class | or Class Il flammable liquids to be
provided with foam fire protection. Necessary
because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
County due to climatic conditions and because risk
of leaks or tank failure is increased due to the
prevalence of earthquakes in Los Angeles County

3404.2.9.6.1
.3 - Location
of tanks for
boilover
liquids

Geological and
Climatic

Provides for additional spacing between tanks to
reduce fire danger and help prevent fire from
spreading to adjacent tanks. Necessary because of
increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County due
to climatic conditions and because risk of leaks or
tank failure is increased due to the prevalence of
earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

3404.3.7.6 -
Construction

Geological and
Climatic

Construction and fire access requirements for liquid
storage rooms. Necessary because of increased
danger of fire in Los Angeles County due to climatic
conditions and because risk of explosion or
container failure is increased due to the prevalence
of earthquakes in Los Angeles County.

3406.5.1.1 -
Location

Geological and
Climatic

Provides increased distances for bulk transfer and
process transfer operations so that they are farther
away from the public and other buildings.
Necessary because of increased danger of fire in
Los Angeles County due to climatic conditions and
because risk of leaks or tank failure is increased
due to the prevalence of earthquakes in Los
Angeles County

3406.5.1.19
- Liquid
transfer

Geological and
Climatic

Class |, 1I, or lll liquids shall be transferred from a
tank vehicle or tank car only into an approved
atmospheric tank or approved portable tank.
Necessary because of increased danger of fire in
Los Angeles County due to climatic conditions and
because risk of leaks or tank failure is increased
due to the prevalence of earthquakes in Los
Angeles County

3804.4 —
Multiple
container
installation

Geological and
Climatic

Requirements for LP gas storage tank distances.
Necessary because of increased danger of fire in
Los Angeles County due to climatic conditions and
because risk of leaks or tank failure is increased
due to the prevalence of earthquakes in Los
Angeles County

HOA.734655.1

171




Creates requirements for fire access roads for

35) ?2;(;;/2;3' Climatic and outdoor operations to enable fire apparatus to gain
4605.1.1 — " | Topographical access to fight fires. Necessary to increase fire and
acces';s. o life safety and to minimize risk of fire spreading
piles; beyond storage areas. Necessary because risk of
4605’ 12 fire due to climate and topography in Los Angeles
o County.
Local amendment providing that defensible space
requirements shall also comply with Chapter 3 of
49071 — Climatic and thi'_s code. Necessary due to Los Angeles County's
Ge né ral Topographical unique climate and topography to reduce risk of fire
and to minimize impacts of fire in fire hazard
severity zone.
4908.1 — Fuel
Modification Local amendment creating defensible space for fire
Plan in Fire operations that is necessary due to
Hazard | Climatic and Los Angeles County's unique climate and
Severity Topographical topography to reduce risk of fire and to minimize
Zone, impacts of fire in fire hazard severity zone.
4908.1.1 Plan
Modification
5004 — fire Creates requirements for fire access roads and
apparatus Climatic and storage requirements for tire storage in automobile
access roads: Topographical wrecking yards. Necessary to enable fire apparatus
5006 — ’ and fire fighters to gain access to fight fires and
housekeeping respond to emergencies. Necessary because risk of
- 5008 tires: fire due to climate and topography in Los Angeles
’ ’ County.
APPENDIX B | Topographical Provides for increased fire-flow to allow for more
B105.1 - and Climatic water to be available to fight fires. Necessary
One-family because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
dwellings County due to climatic and topographical conditions.
APPENDIX B Topographical Provides for increased fire-flow to allow for more
B1051.1 — and Climatic water to be available to fight fires. Necessary
Two-farﬁily because of increased danger of fire in
dwellings Los Angeles County due to climatic and

topographical conditions.

HOA.734555.1

172




APPENDIX B | Topographical Provides for increased fire-flow to allow for more
B105.2 — and Climatic water to be available to fight fires. Necessary
Buildings because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
other than County due to climatic and topographical conditions.
one-and two-
family
dwellings '
APPENDIX B Topog(aphfcal Provides for increased fire-flow at mobile home parks
B105.3 — and Climatic in Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones to allow for
M o more water to be available to fight fires. Necessary
obile home becal . .

parks ecause of mcregseq danger of fire in Los Ang_e]es

- County due to climatic and topographical conditions.
APPENDIX B | Topographical Provides for increased fire-flow for subdivisions of
B105.4 — and Climatic land to allow for more water to be available to fight
Land fires. Necessary because of increased danger of fire
subdivision in Los Angeles County due to climatic and
projects topographical conditions.
APPENDIX Topographical Provides for hydrant spacing on streets to ensure
C, Section and Climatic hydrants are accessible to firefighters. Necessary
C102.2 - because of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles
Location on County due to climatic and topographical conditions.
street
APPENDIX Topographical Provides for hydrant spacing to ensure that water is
C, Section and Climatic available to fight fires. Necessary because of
C105.2 - ' increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County due
One-family to climatic and topographical conditions.
dwelling
APPENDIX Topographical Provides for hydrant spacing for cul-de-sacs to
C, Section and Climatic ensure that there is adequate water supply available
C105.2.1 -~ to fight fires. Necessary because of increased
Cul-de-sac danger of fire in the County due to climatic and
hydrant topographical conditions.
location
APPENDIX Topographical Provides for hydrant spacing for buildings other than
C, Section and Climatic single family dwellings to ensure that there is
C105.2.2 - adequate water supply available to fight fires.
Buildings Necessary because of increased danger of fire in the
other than County due to climatic and topographical conditions.
one-family
dwelling
units.

HOA.734555.1

173




APPENDIX
C, Section
C106 — On-
site hydrants

Topographical
and Climatic

Provides requirements for on-site hydrants to ensure
that there is adequate water supply available to fight
fires. Necessary because of increased danger of fire
in Los Angeles County due to climatic and
topographical conditions.

APPENDIX K
- Roof
Obstructions,
K103.1,
K103.2,
K103.2.1,
K103.2.1.1,
K103.2.1.2,
K103.2.1.3,
K103.2.2,
K103.2.2.1,
K103.2.3,
K103.2.4,
K103.3,
K103.4,
K103.4.2,
K103.2.1,
K103.4.2.2,
K103.4.2.3,
K103.4.2.4,
K103.4.3,
K103.4.3.1,
K103.4.3.2,
K103.4.3.2.1,
K103.4.3.2.2,
K103.4.3.2.3,
K103.4.3.2.4,
K103.4.3.2.5,
K103.4.3.2.6,
K103.5,
K103.5.1

Topographical
and Climatic

Provides various design and location requirements
for solar photovoltaic systems installed on roofs of
buildings for residential and commercial structures.
Access and spacing requirements ensure firefighter
access to the roof, provide access pathways to
specific areas of the roof, provide for venting cut-out
areas, and to provide emergency egress from the
roof. Necessary because of increased danger of fire
in Los Angeles County due to climatic and
topographical conditions.

HOA.734555.1

174




Appendix
K104.1,
K104.2,
K104.2.1,
K104.2.2,
K104.2.2.2,
K104.2.2.3,
K104.2.3,
K104.2.3.1,
K104.2.3.2
K104.2.3.2.1,
K104.2.3.2.2,
K104.2.3.2.3,
K104.2.3.2.4,
K104.2.3.5,
K104.2.3.6,

Topographical
and Climatic

Provides various design and location requirements
for roof gardens and landscaped roofs for residential
and commercial structures. Access and spacing
requirements ensure firefighter access to the roof,
provide access pathways to specific areas of the
roof, provide for venting cut-out areas, and to provide
emergency egress from the roof. Necessary because
of increased danger of fire in Los Angeles County
due to climatic and topographical conditions.

K104.3

SECTION This ordinance shall become effective on January 1, 2011.

[TITLE322010AMENDMENTSKCC]

HOA.734555.1

175







