STATE OF CALIFORNIA — STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY JERRY BROWN, Governor

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

January 10, 2011

Brian Cowen, EIT, Building Inspector
Public Services Department

City of Morro Bay

955 Shasta Avenue

Morro Bay, CA 93442

Dear Mr. Cowen:;

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on December 10, 2010 of the City of Morro Bay
submittal pertaining to Ordinance NO. 564 with findings and is acceptable for filing. Per
Health and Safety Code Section 17958.8 no modification or change to the California
Building Standards Code shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the
finding and the modification or change have been filed with the California Building
Standards Commission (the Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-09186.

Sincerely,

’\~ /c W / /

!Jgne Taylor 7
Senior Archltect

cc: Chron
Local Filings



m City of Morro Bay

Morro Bay, CA 93442 ¢ 805-772-6200
www.morro-bay.ca.us

December 3, 2010

Mr. Dave Walls, Executive Director
California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833-2936

Dear Mr. Walls,

Pursuant to the applicable provisions of the California Health and Safety Code,
the City of Morro Bay has established more restrictive building standards than
those contained in the California Building Standards Code.

In compliance with California Health and Safety Code § 17958.7(a), the City
hereby submits a copy of the changes and related findings for filing.

You may contact me at (805) 772-6214 with any questions.

Sincerely,

Brian Cowen, Building Inspector

Attachment: Portions of Ordinance No. 564

cc: Rob Livick, Public Services Director
Rob Schultz, City Attorney
Andrea Leuker, City Manager

FINANCE ADMINISTRATION FIRE DEPARTMENT PUBLIC SERVICES
595 Harbor Street 595 Harbor Street 715 Harbor Street 955 Shasta Street
HARBOR DEPARTMENT CITY ATTORNEY POLICE DEPARTMENT RECREATION AND PARKS

1275 Embarcadero Road 955 Shasta Avenue 850 Morro Bay Boulevard 1001 Kennedy Way



ORDINANCE NO. 564

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF MORRO BAY;
REPEALING, AMENDING, AND REENACTING TITLE 14
OF THE MORRO BAY MUNICIPAL CODE
(BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION)

THE CITY COUNCIL
CITY OF MORRO BAY, CALIFORNIA

CERTAIN STATE AND MODEL CODES RELATING TO FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY AS
FOLLOWS:

. 2010 California Building Code (volumes 1 and 2)
. 2010 California Residential Code
. The appendix to Chapter 33 of the 1997 Uniform Building Code
. 2010 California Electrical Code
. 2010 California Mechanical Code
. 2010 California Plumbing Code
. 2009 Uniform Solar Energy Code
. 2006 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code
9. 2010 California Energy Code
10. 2010 California Historical Building Code
" 11. 2010 California Fire Code
12. 2010 California Existing Building Code
13. 2010 California Green Building Code
14: 1997 Uniform Housing Code
15. 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings

0O ~J N Lh - W DO e

WHEREAS, Government Code § 50022, et.seq. and Health and Safety Code § 17922
‘authorize the City to adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code as provided in
Titles 24 and 25 of the California Code of Regulations and other codes, including, without
limitation, the Uniform Housmg Code and Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings; and

WHEREAS, Pursuant to Health and Safety Code § 17950 and 18938(b), the California
Building Standards Code is applicable to all occupancies throughout the State of California,

whether or not the City takes affirmative action to adopt the California Building Standards Code;
and .



WHEREAS, Health and Safety Code § 17960, requires a local building department to
- enforce State- Housing Law, the California Building Standards Code, and the implementing
regulations of the Department of Housing and. Community Development for residential
structures; and

WHIEREAS, Health and Safety Code § 17958.5 allows the City may make those changes
or modifications to the requirements contained in the provisions published in the California
Building Standards Code as it determines, pursuant to the provisions of Health and Safety Code
§ 17958.7, are reasonably necessary because -of local climatic, geological, or topographical
conditions; and

WHEREAS, Pursuant to Health and Safety Code § 18941.5, certain express findings
have been made and are as follows: ‘

FINDINGS

1. The topographic, underlying geologic and surface soil conditions of the hillsides of the
City of Morro Bay are of a gradient and composition such that movement has historically
been known to occur. Soils testing has revealed the presence of potentially hazardous
geologic conditions, including expansive soils, questionable soils, soils prone to
liquefaction and seasonally high ground-water. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary to
adopt regulations for grading operations that are more restrictive than those adopted by
the State of California and codified in the California Building Standards Code. More
particularly, this finding supports the adoption and modification of Appendix J- of the
California Building Code.

2. Due to topographic and geologic conditions, development in Morro Bay has historically
been constrained such that building occurred predominantly in the flatter areas, a scarcity
of which resulted in the creation of small lots and the construction of structures in relative
close proximity to one-another. These conditions are known to be conducive to the
spread of fire and therefore, it is reasonably necessary to adopt standards more restrictive
than those adopted by the State of California and codified in the California Building
Standards Code for the installation of automatic fire sprinklers on new and existing
buildings, limiting the use of wood shakes or shingles, requiring that elevator cars be
constructed to accommodate an ambulance stretcher, and to otherwise establish
construction and fire prevention regulations more restrictive than those adopted by the
State of California and codified in the California Building Standards Code to reduce and
minimize the potential for loss of and damage to life and property resulting from fire, hazardous
materials, explosions and to protect firefighters and emergency personnel during
emergency operations. More particularly, this finding supports the modification of
California Building Code sections 1505.1 and 3002.4, California Fire Code sections
903.3.1.1 and 4504.1, California Residential Code sections R313.1 and R313.2,
California Electrical Code Article 230-70(A)(1), the deletion of Sections 903.2 through
903.2.10.1 of the California Fire Code and the addition of section R313.3.3.5 to the
Residential Code, and sections 308.1.1.1, 901.4.5, 903.2 and 3310 to the Fire Code.



Chapter 14.03

BUHLDING CODE

14.03.010 —Modiﬁcaﬁons. of the California Building Code.

The California Building Code, adopted in Section 14.01.020, is hereby modified, amended, and/ or
supplemented as follows: '

A. Adoptappendices H, I and J. Delete appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, G and K.

B. Amend Section 1505.1 to read as follows:

1505.1 General. Roof assemblies shall be divided into the classes defined below. Class A, B,
and C roof assemblies and roof coverings required to be listed by this section shall be tested in
accordance with ASTM E 108 or UL 790. In addition, fire-retardant-treated wood roof coverings
shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D 2898. The minimum roof coverings installed on
buildings shall comply with Table 1505.1 based on the type of construction of the building.

For the purposes of this section, any building surface flatter than forty-five degrees to the
horizontal shall be considered a roof and shall not be covered by wood shakes or shingles, except
as otherwise allowed by this Code. '

Exception: Skylights and sloped glazing that comply with Chapter 24 or Section 2610.

" C. Amend Section 3002.4 to read as follows:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher. Where elevators are provided, at

- Jeast one elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors. The
elevator car shall be of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24
inches by 84 inches with not less than 5-inch radius corners, in the horizontal, open position and
shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The
symbol shall not be less than 3 inches high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the-
hoistway door frame. ' '

D. Delete the text of Appendix J and amend Appendix J by reference to contain the text of the
Appendix to Chapter 33 of the 1997 Uniform Building Code, which shall have the same force and
effect as if printed here in its entirety and is hereby modified, amended, and/ or supplemented as
follows:

1. Amend Section 3309.2 to read as follows:



3309.2 Administration. The provisions of Division II of Chapter 1 of the California
Building Code shall apply to the administration and enforcendent of this chapter.

2.  Amend Section 3309.7 to read.as follows:

3309.7 Liquefaction Study. A study of the liquefaction potential of the site shall be
provided, and the recommendations incorporated into the plans.

Exception: The Building Official may waive this requirement where it is determined by the
geotechnical engineer or engineering geologist that the potential for liquefaction at the site is
fow.

3. Delete Section 3309.9.

4. Delete Section 3310.



Chapter 14.04

RESIDENTIAL CODE

14.04.010 Modifications of the California Residential Code.

The California Residential Code, adopted in Sectien 14.01.020, is hereby modified; amended, and/ or
supplemented as follows:

A. Delete Division II of Chapter 1. Administration and Enforcement of the Residential Code shall
“be as set forth in the California Building Code. Fees shall be as prescribed in the Master Fee
Schedule.

B. Adept Appendices Hand O. Delete Appendices A, B, C,D,E,F, G, J, K, L, M, N;P,QandR.

C. Amend Section R313.1 and R313.2 to read as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse and One and Two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. -
An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all new townhouses and one
and two family dwellings, and in all existing townhouses and one and two family dwellings
where alteration results in an increase in floor area in excess of 50 percent, or 1000 square feet.
This section shall be applicable to mobile homes and factory-built housing not located in a mobile
home or special occupancy park. -

R313.2 Determination of Floor Area. For the purposes of this section, floor area shall be
defined as the area within the exterior walls of the building under consideration. The floor area of
a building, or portion thereof, not provided with surrounding walls, shall include the usable area
under the horizontal projection of the roof or floor above. ‘

For the purposes of this section, buildings shall be considered separate when:

1. The fire separation distance as defined in CBC Sec. 702.1 is not less than that permitted in
CBC Table 705.8 where unprotected openings are allowed in an exterior wall of a non-
sprinklered building, or

2. The buildings are structurally independent, the adjoining walls are constructed of fire-
' resistant construction as prescribed in CBC Table 602 without openings or penefrations,
projections comply with CBC Section 705.2, and parapets are constructed where required by

CBC Section 705.11.

D. Add Section R313.3.3.5 fo read as follows:

R313.3.3.5 Waterflow Alarm. A local waterflow alarm and remote inspector’s test Valvé,
installed in accordance with NFPA 13, shall be installed on all sprinkler systems.



Chapter 14.05

ELECTRICAL CODE

14.05.010 Modifications of the California Electrical Code.

The California Electrical Code, adopted in Section 14.01.020, is hereby modified, amended, and/ or
supplemented as follows:

A. Adopt annexes A and B. Delete annexes C, D, E, F, G and H. Administration and Enforcement
of the Electrical Code shall be as set forth in the California Building Code. Fees shall be as
prescribed in the Master Fee Schedule.

B. Amend Article 230-70(A)(1) to read as follows:

230-70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location. A service disconnecting means shall be installed at a
readily accessible location either outside the building or other structure, or inside nearest the point of
entrance of the service conductors.

The disconnecting means shall be accessible to emergency personnel, either directly or by a remote
actuating device, without requiring travel through the building interior.



Chapter 14.06

MECHANICAL CODE

14:06.010 Modifications of the California Mechanieal Code.
The -California Mechanical Code, adopted in Section 14.61.020, is hereby ‘modified, amended, and/ or

supplemented as follows:

A. Delete Division I of Chapter 1 and Table 1-1. Administration and Enforcement of the
Mechanical Code shall be as set forth in the California Building Code. Fees shall be as
prescribed in the Master Fee Schedule.

B. Adopt appendices A, B, C and D.



Chapter 14.07

PLUMBING COBE
Sections:
14.67.010 Modifications of the California Plumbing Code
14.07.020 Retrofitting with water-saving devices reguired.

14.07.030 Required sewer backwater valve.

14.07.016 Modifications of the California Plumbing-Code.

The California Plumbing Code, adopted in Section 14.01.820, is hereby modified, amended, and/ or
supplemented as follows:

A. Delete Division II of Chépter 1 and Table 1-1. Administration and Enforcement of the Plum‘bing
Code shall be as set forth in the California Building Code. Fees shall be as prescribed in the
Master Fee Schedule. ’

B. Adopt appendices A, B, G, I and L. . Delete appendices D and K.

C. Add Section 709.5 to read as follows:

709.5 A Backwater Valve, extended to aﬂd accessible from grade for maintenance, shall be
installed on every Building Sewer.

Exception: Installation of a Backwater. Valve shall not be required when, to the satisfaction of

the Building Official, it is determined that the intent and purpose of this section is otherwise met.
D. Amend Section 713.0 to read as follows:

713.0 Sewer Required.

713.1 Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and every premises having
drainage piping thereon shall have a connection directly to a public or private sewer.

713.2 Private Sewage Disposal Systems shall not be permitted.



14.08.090. Modifications of the California Fire Code.
The California Fire Code, adopted in Section- 14.61.020, is hereby modified, amended, and/ or
supplemented as follows: ‘

A.  Adopt Appendix Chapter 4 and appendices B, C, D, and H. Delete appendices A, E, F, G, Land J.

B. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:
Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Morro
Bay.

C. Section 103.1 is amended to read as follows:
Section 103.1 General. The Fire Department of the City of Morro Bay is hereby established and

the person in charge thereof shall be known as the Fire Chief. Where the Code uses the term Fire
Official, it shall mean the Fire Chief.

D. Section 113.2 is amended to read as follows:
113.2 Schedule of permit fees.
Fees shall be paid in accordance with the Master Fee Schedule.

E. Section 507.5.4 is amended to read as follows:
507.5.4 Obstruction. Unobstructed access to fire hydrants shall be maintained at all times. The
fire department shall not be deterred or hindered from gaining immediate access to fire protection
equipment or fire hydrants. '
The Fire Chief shall have the authority to remove or cause to be removed, without notice, any
vehicle, vessel, or object that is in violation of this section. The owner of said item, so removed,

. shall be responsible for all towing, storage, or other costs incurred therein.

F. Section 308.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

308.1.1.1 Burning Prohibited in Residential Neighborhoods. Open burning, bon fires,
recreational fires, and all other outdoor fires are prohibited in residential neighborhoods.

Exception:

Barbeques and p-ortable outdoor fireplaces that conform with the following pfovision are allowed.



Fires shall be conducted at a safe distance from combustible materials and in accordance
with the applicable manufacturer’s instructions to prevent the spread of fire to adjacent
structures or other combustible materials:

Fire shall be contained in a non-combustible container, not to exceed 3 feet in diameter
and 2 feet in height.

Fuel loading shall not exceed 3 feet in diameter or 2 feet in height.
Fire shall be fueled by propane, natural gas, charcoal, dried wood, commercial fire logs,
or pellets. Fuels shall not include green waste, yard trimmings, pressure treated wood,

trash, plastic, or other noxious or hazardous materials.

Ground fires, sub-surface or pit-fires, and earth floored fire rings are prohibited.

. If in the opinion of the Fire Chief or his or her designee, a fire is potentially hazardous or

smoke is causing a nuisance, the fire shall be extinguished immediately.

G. Section 901.4.5 is added to read as follows: -

901.4.5 Partial Sprinkling of Buildings. Partial sprinkling of buildings shall not be permitted,
except where otherwise allowed by NFPA 13R, 13D, and Section 903.3.1.1.1. :

H. Delete Sections 903.2 through 903.2.10.1.

[.  Add Section 903.2 to read as follows:

903.2 Where Required. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout:

2.

All new buildings exceeding 1000 square feet of floor area.
Exceptions:
a. A structure containing only Group ‘A, Division 5 occupancy.

b. Agricultural accessory buildings and greenhouses.

All pew buildings and structures on the west side of Embarcadero Road.

Exception:

Installation of an automatic fire sprinkler system shall not be required when, to the satisfaction of
the Fire Chief and the Building Official, it is demonstrated that the proposed construction, use,
and occupancy are minor in scope and nature, that the installation of an automatic fire sprinkler
systern would be impractical, and that the intent and purpose of this section is otherwise met.



¥

3. All existing buildings exceeding 1000 square feet of floor area, where an automatic fire
sprinkler system does-not already exist, and a change in the character of use-or occupancy is
made, which increases the fire hazard level.

4. Al existing buildings, where alterations result in:

a. An increase in floor area in excess of 50 percent, or
b. An increase in floor area in excess of 1000 square feet.

903.2.1 Determination of Floor Area. For the purposes of this section, floor area.shall be
defined as the area within the exterior walls of the building under consideration. The-floor area of
a building, or portion thereof, not provided with surrounding walls, shall include the usable area-
under the horizontal projection of the roof or floor above.

For the purposes of this section, buildings shall be considered separate when:

1. The fire separation distance as defined in CBC Sec. 702.1 is not less than that permitted in
CBC Table 705.8 where unprotected ope*lmgs are allowed in an exterior wall of a non-
sprinklered bu11dmg, or

2. The buildings are structurally independent, the "adjoining walls are constructed of fire-
resistant construction as prescribed in CBC Table 602 without openings or penetrations,
projections comply with CBC Section 705.2, and parapets are constructed where required by
CBC Section 705.11.

Amend Section 903.3.1.1 to read as follows:

903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where other provisions of this code require that a
building or portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with this section, or where a building contains two or more occupancies or uses,
sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13 as amended in Chapter 47
except as provided in Section 903.3.1.1.1.

. Section 4504.1 is amended to read as follows:

4504.1 General. Piers, marinas, docks, fuel docks, wharves and similar boat mooring facilities
shall be equipped with fire protection equipment in accordance with Section 4504.2 through
4504.6 and as otherwise required by the Chief.

Section 3310 1s added to read as follows:

3310. Sale and Use of Fxreworks Unlawful. The sale or use of fireworks, pyrotechnics, and
others explosives shall be unlawful.



Exceptions:

¢

I. The use of fireworks, approved by the State Fire Marshall as “safe and sane,” shall” be
permitted on private property ondy.

2. Public fireworks displays may be allowed, subject to the approval of a permit by the Chief.

3. Pyrotechnics for use in movie industry operations may be allowed, subject to the approval of
a permit by the Chief.

4. This section shall not apply to the sale and use of State Fire Marshall approved and listed
party poppers and snap caps.



Chapter 14.069

EXISTING BUELBING CODE

14.09.010 Modifications of the California Existing Building Code

‘The California Existing Building Cede, adopted in Section 14.01.020, is hereby modified, amended, and/
or supplemented as follows and shall be the technical strengthening provisions for buildings subject to
Chapter 14.18 of this title:

A. Amend Section A102.1 of Appendix Chapter A1 to read as-follows:

A102.1 General. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all existing buildings having at least
one unreinforced masonry bearing wall. The elements regulated by this chapter shall be determined
in accordance with Table Al-A. Except as provided heréin, other structural provisions of the building
code shall apply. This chapter does not apply to the alteration of existing electrical, plumbing,
mechanical or fire safety systems. '

Exception: This section shall not apply to detached one-family or two-family dwellings and
detached apartment houses containing less than five dwelling units and used solely for residential

purposes.



SECTION TWO. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect
thirty (30) days from and after its passage and, before the expiration of fifieen (15) days
after its passage, shall be published once.in a newspaper of general circulation-printed
and published in the City of Merro Bay, orin the alternative, the City Clerk may cause to
be published a summary of this Ordinance and a certified copy of the text of this
Ordinance shall be posted inthe office of the City Clerk five (5) days prior tothe date of
adoption of this Ordinance, and within fifteen (15) days after adoption, the City clerk
shall cause to be published the aforementioned summary and shall post in the office of
the City Clerk a certified copy of this Ordinance. Any publication of the Ordinance or
summary or posting of the Ordinance shall include the names of the members of the City
Council voting for and against the same..

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting the of the City Council of Morro Bay, held
on the 25th day of October, 2010 by motion of Councilmember Winholtz, seconded by
Councilmember Borchard.

‘PASSED AND ADOPTED on the 8™ day of November, 2010 by the following

vote:
AYES: Borchard, Grantham, Smukler, Winholtz, Peters
NOES: None

ABSENT: None

}ANCE PETERS/ngor
ATTEST: "

BRIDGHJT KESSLING, Ci%Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ROBERT SCHULTZ, c@omey




