STATE OF CALIFORNIA — STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916 FAX (916) 263-0959

July 5, 2011

Christina Horrisberger, Assistant Planner
Planning and Economic Development Dept.
City of Pacifica

1800 Francisco Blvd.

Pacifica, CA 94044

Dear Ms. Horrisberger:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on June 6, 2011 of the City of Pacifica electronic
submittal pertaining to Ordinance No. 779-C.S. with findings and is acceptable for filing.
Your filing attests to your understanding that according to Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building Standards Code
shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the finding and the modification
or change have been filed with the California Building Standards Commission (the
Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

J: ML Lw)

/Enrlque M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

Smcerely,

CC: Chron
Local Filings




Stjbject: Pacifica Green BUiIding Ordinance Filing

From: horrisbergerc@ci.pacifica.ca.us [mailto:horrisbergerc@ci.pacifica.ca.us]
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2011 10:15 AM

To: Rodriguez, Enrique (CBSC)@DGS

Subject: Pacifica Green Building Ordinance Filing

Hi Enrique,

Thanks for speaking with me the other day.

To confirm the details of our conversation, Pacifica intends to enforce the provisions of the state mandated Cal Green
requirements on all applicable projects. Some projects may also be required to comply with an acceptable green
building rating system {(or implement equivalent green building measures), such as LEED or Green Point Rated. Those
projects would have flexibility in which measures they choose to use and still meet Cal Green requirements when
applicable.

Please let me know if further clarification is needed.

Have a great weekend!

Christina Horrisberger

Assistant Planner
mailto: horrisbergerc@ci.pacifica.ca.us

City of Pacifica

Planning & Economic Development Department
1800 Francisco Bivd.

Pacifica, CA 94044

(650} 738-7341

www.cityofpacifica.org




PLANNING AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CITY HALL » 170 Santa Maria Avenue ° Pacifica, CA 94044 o (650) 738-7341 o Fax (650) 359-5807

Seenic Sucifica

June 6, 2011

Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833

RE: Filing of the City of Pacifica’s ordinance entitled, “An Ordinance of the City Council
of the City of Pacifica Adding Chapter 21 to Title 8 of the Pacifica Municipal Code to
Require Green Building Measures for Construction Projects.”

Dear Sir or Madam:

At their regular meeting of December 13, 2010 the City Council of the City of Pacifica adopted the above
referenced ordinance requiring incorporation of green building measures for construction projects. The
above referenced Ordinance was necessary due to local geographic, topographic and/or climatic
conditions, specific to the City of Pacifica, that were not accounted for in the state Building Code.
Findings to that affect are contained within the Ordinance, as are specific modifications to the CBSC.
Please refer to Sections 1 and 4 of the enclosed Ordinance for more specific information.

The Ordinance was approved by the California Energy Commission (CEC) on May 31, 2011. Copies of
the Ordinance and CEC approval are attached.

S 'é;‘erly,

ristina Horrisberger
Assistant Planner

Enclosures: Adopted Ordinance
CEC Resolution

Path of Portola 1769 » San Francisco Ba 1y Discovery Site



ORDINANCE NO. 779-C.S.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PACIFICA
ADDING CHAPTER 21 TO TITLE 8 OF THE PACIFICA MUNICIPAL
CODE TO REQUIRE GREEN BUILDING MEASURES FOR
CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS

The City Council of the City of Pacifica does hereby ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. FINDINGS, The City Council of the City of Pacifica hereby finds and
declares as follows:

a. The proposed new Chapter 21 of Title 8 of the Pacifica Municipal Code,
“Green Building,” preserves and enhances the environment, in that it sets
forth minimum green building requirements within the City of Pacifica
for all construction projects requiring a building permit;

b. The City of Pacifica’s General Plan sets forth goals for preserving and
improving the natural and built environments of the City, protecting the
health of its residents and visitors and fostering its economy;

c. The demolition, design, construction, and maintenance of buildings and
structures within the City has a significant impact on the City’s
environmental sustainability, resource usage and efficiency, greenhouse
gas emissions, waste management, and the health and productivity of

residents, workers, and visitors;

d. Green building practices recognize the relationship between natural and
built environments, Green building design, siting, construction, and
operation can have a significant positive effect on energy and resource
efficiency, reduction of waste and pollution generation, and the health and
productivity of a building's occupants over the life of the building;

e. Green building benefits are spread throughout the systems and features of
the building to foster healthy indoor air quality. Green buildings may use
recycled content building materials, consume less natural resources and
produce less waste than conventional buildings;

f. Summer ambient temperatures, average load demand and peak load
demand of energy are important factors concerning public health and
safety in the San Francisco Bay Area. A reduction of total and peak

_energy use, as a result of incremental energy conservation measures
required by this ordinance, will have local and regional benefits;

g. It is critical to the economic and environmental health of the City of
Pacifica that the City provide leadership to both the private and public
sectors in the arena of energy efficiency, Smart Growth and “green”

construction;



h. The City Council of the City of Pacifica makes the finding of necessity
that adoption of this ordinance, which includes modifications to Health
and Safety Code Sections 17958. 17958.5 and 17958.7, is reasonably
necessary, because of local climatic, geologic or topographical
conditions. Specifically, the Council finds that the following local

conditions exist in Pacifica:

il.

iv,

Sea level rise: Pacifica is located adjacent to the Pacific Ocean and
significant areas of the City would be impacted by sea level rise due
to global warming. According to a paper prepared by researchers
from Scripps Institution of Oceanography, the University of
California San Diego, the U.S. Geological Survey, Santa Clara
University, the Department of Boating and Waterways, and
Hydrologic Research Center, sea level is projected to rise 16” by
2050 and 55" by 2100 (source: A Report on Sea Level Rise
Preparedness; Staff Report to the State Lands Commission,
December 2009). The Pew Center on Climate Change has reported
that this would result in the erosion of beaches, marshes and
wetlands and increased salinity of estuaries, marshes, streams and
aquifers. In recent years, Pacifica’s coastal bluffs have undergone
significant erosion causing property damage and displacement of
Pacifica residents, Increased salinity has the potential to negatively
impact fresh water supplies and damage or destroy crops in low
lying farmlands.

Impacts on water: Water quality and quantity are at risk as a result
of changing temperatures. With warmer temperature, more
precipitation will fall in the form of rain instead of snow, shortening
the winter snowfall season and accelerating the rate at which the
snowpack melts in the spring. Not only does such snow melt
increase the threat of spring flooding, it will decrease the Sierra’s
capacity as a natural water tower, resulting in decreased water
availability for agricultural irrigation, hydroelectric generation and
the general needs of a growing population. The Sierra snow-pack is
the primary source of the Tuolumne River, the primary source of
water for Pacifica,

Natural disasters: Climate models predict a 4°F temperature
increase in the next 20 to 40 years, with an increase in the number
of long dry spells, as well as a 20-30% increase in precipitation in
the spring and fall. More frequent and heavier precipitation causes
flooding and mudslides, which would incur considerable costs in
damages to property, infrastructure and even human life. In
addition, the increases of wildfires due to continued dry periods and
higher temperatures is another expected impact of continued climate
change. In these conditions, fires burn hotter and spread faster.
Public health impact: Warming temperatures and increased
precipitation can also encourage mosquito-breeding, thus
engendering diseases that come with mosquitoes, such as West Nile
Virus, a disease of growing concern in Pacifica and the surrounding

region.



i.

v.  Impacts on plants and vegetation: Native plants and animals are
also at risk as temperatures rise. Scientists are reporting more
species moving to higher elevations or more northerly latitudes in
response. Increased temperatures also provide a foothold for
invasive species of weeds, insects and other threats to native
species. The increased flow and salinity of water resources could
also seriously affect food web and mating conditions for fish that
are both of economic and recreational interest to residents;

This proposed Ordinance is intended to preserve and enhance the
environment within the City of Pacifica and is not subject to the
California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) of
the CEQA Guidelines, because there is no possibility that the ordinance
may have a significant negative impact on the environment and is exempt
from the requirements of CEQA pursuant to Section 15308 of the CEQA
Guidelines, which exempts actions taken by regulatory agencies for the
enhancement and protection of the environment;

Nothing in this Ordinance shall require the Applicant to use covered
products, as defined in the federal Energy Policy and Conservation Act
(42 US.C. § 6201 et seq), that exceed any applicable federal energy
conservation standards for such products; and

This ordinance is intended to ensure that all buildings subject to it will
consume no more energy than what is permitted by the 2008 California
Building Energy Efficiency Standards (Title 24, Part 6) of the California

Building Code.

SECTION 2. PURPOSE. It shall be the purpose of the Green Building Ordinance
to enhance public health and welfare by encouraging green building measures in
design, construction and maintenance of buildings. The green building practices
referenced in this chapter are intended to achieve the following goals:

a.

b.

To encourage the conservation of natural resources;
To reduce waste generated from construction projects;

To increase energy and water efficiency and decrease energy and water
usage;

To reduce the operating and maintenance costs for buildings;

To promote the health and productivity of residents, workers and visitors
to the City;

To promote healthier indoor environments; and

To implement Smart Growth measures.




SECTION 3. DEFINITIONS. For the purpose of this chapter, unless otherwise
apparent from the context, the following terms are defined as set forth below:

a,

b.

h.

“Applicable Projects” are as described in Section 4 of this chapter.

“Applicant” shall mean the property owner, or a person or persons
authorized by the property owner, to act as their agent in processing
building and/or development permits issued by the City.

“Build It Green™” shall mean the non-profit organization that
administers the GreenPoint Rated residential green building verification

program.

“City sponsored project” shall mean any construction project for which
the City of Pacifica participates in the initiation of, or development or
redevelopment of, or provides equlty or funding for, that upon completion
will provide a community service and/or accommodate City staff.

“Construction project” shall mean any activity that involves the
construction, renovation or demolition of a building and that requires

issuance of a building permit.

“Dwelling” means a single unit of residence for a family of one or more
persons. Examples of dwelling units include condominiums, apartment
units within apartment buildings, and other types of dwellings in which
sleeping accommodations are provided but toileting or cooking facilities
are shared by the occupants of more than one room or portion of the

building.

“Enhanced Commissioning” means the credit, in the Energy and
Atmosphere category of the applicable LEED™ Rating System checklist,
intended to ensure that certified buildings are designed, constructed, and
calibrated to operate as intended.

“Graywater” shall mean untreated wastewater that has not been
contaminated by any toilet discharge, has not been affected by infectious,
contaminated, or unhealthy bodily wastes, and does not present a threat
from contamination by unhealthful processing, manufacturing, or
operating wastes. Graywater includes, but is not limited to, wastewater
from bathtubs, showers, bathroom washbasins, clothes washing machines,
and laundry tubs, but does not include wastewater from kitchen sinks or

dishwashers.

“Green building” shall mean a whole systems approach to design,
construction, location and operation of buildings and structures that helps
to mitigate the environmental, economic, and social impacts of
construction, demolition and renovation of buildings. Green building
practices recognize the relationship between the natural and built



environments and seek to minimize the use of energy, water and other
natural resources and promote a healthy, productive indoor environment.

“Green Building Compliance Official” shall mean the Building Official
of the City of Pacifica or his or her designee. .

. “GreenPoint Rated (GPR)” shall mean the version of the applicable
GreenPoint Rated system approved by Build It Green™, in effect at the
time of project application for a building permit.

“GreenPoints” shall mean credits assigned under the applicable
GreenPoint Rated Checklist for a residential construction project.

. “Hardship” means a verifiable level of project related difficulty or
adversity, beyond the control of the applicant, as a result of which the
applicant cannot reasonably comply with the requirements of this
Chapter. Examples of hardship include, but are not limited to, situations
where the cost of achieving compliance with this chapter is
disproportionate to the overall cost of the project, where there is a lack of
commercially available green building materials and technologies to
comply with this chapter’s requirements, where physical conditions
associated with the project site make it impractical to comply with this
chapter or where compliance would impair the historic integrity of a

listed historic structure.

. “LEED® certification” shall mean having earned a “Certified” or higher
rating in the applicable Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design

(LEED) Rating System.

. “LEED Gold certification” shall mean having earned a “Gold” rating in
the applicable Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design (LEED)

Rating System.

. “LEED Rating System” shall mean the applicable version of the

Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design (LEED) rating system,
approved by the U.S. Green Building Council (USGBC), in effect at the
time of project application for a building permit.

“LEED Silver certification” shall mean having earned a “Silver” rating in
the applicable Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design (LEED)

Rating System.

“Mixed-use project” shall mean a construction project that includes both

dwelling and non-residential units.

“Non-residential project” shall mean a construction project that does not
include dwelling units.



t. “Project valuation” shall mean the value of a construction project, as
determined by the formula, in effect at the time of project application,
used to calculate building permit fees by the City’s Building Division.
This includes the aggregate value of: (1) the construction project for
which the applicant seeks the development and/or building permit; (2)
any pending construction projects that were not considered Applicable
Projects under this Ordinance and have not yet received all final City
approvals for completion of the project; and (3) any construction projects
that were not considered Applicable Projects under this Ordinance and
received final City approvals for completion of the project less than one
year prior to the submittal of an application for the building and/or

development permit.

u, “Qualified green building professional” shall mean a LEED Accredited
Professional or Build It Green Certified GreenPoint Rater or Advisor, or
similar qualifications if acceptable to the Green Building Compliance

Official.

v. “Rainwater harvesting” shall mean the gathering, or accumulating and
storing, of rainwater for reuse on-site.

w. “Recycled Water” shall mean non-potable wastewater that has been
treated and is suitable for beneficial reuse.

x. “Residential project” shall mean a construction project that consists of
one or more dwelling units, Accessory buildings may be included in

residential projects.

y. “Smart Growth” means development that revitalizes central cities and
older suburbs, supports and enhances public transit and promotes walking

and bicycling.

z. “Solar power” shall mean energy from the sun that is converted into
thermal or electrical energy.

aa. “USGBC” shall mean the United States Green Building Council.

SECTION 4. STANDARDS FOR COMPLIANCE.

a. Project Applicability and Requirement Table. The purpose of the following
table is to establish minimum compliance levels and minimum requirements for new
construction projects and alterations and additions to existing buildings, with more
intensive projects requiring a higher degree of green building measure
implementation, and with more intensive green building measure implementation
required over time. In addition to the following requirements, all buildings within the
jurisdiction of the City of Pacifica must demonstrate compliance with the 2008
California Building Energy Efficiency Standard (Title 24, Part 6) of the California

Building Code.



PROJECT TYPE | Applicable Minimum Minimum Minimum
Projects’ Reguirements: Requirements: | Reguirements:
Year 1 Following Year2 Year3
Ordinance Adoption Following Following
Ordinance Ordinance
Adoption Adoption and
afterward
City Sponsored AllLEED® LEED Silver certification | LEED Gold Meet Year 2
eligible required certification requirement and
projects. required obtain Enhanced
Commissioning
credit
Non-residential,
Mixed-use and
Multi-family
Residential of 4
or more units
Level 1 Project Include LEED checklist, | LEED Meet Year 2
valuation indicating all measures certification requirement and
under with which the project required. obtain Enhanced
$100,000 complies. Commissioning
, credit
Level 2 Project LEED certification LEED Silver Meet Year 2
valuation required, certification requirement and
$100,000 ~ required. obtain Enhanced
199,999 Commissioning
credit
Level 3 Project LEED Silver certification | LEED Gold Meet Year 2
valuation required. certification requirement and
$200,000 or required. obtain Enhanced
more Commissioning
credit
1-3 Residential
Units
Level 1 Project GPR or LEED checklist, | Same as year 1. | Same as year 1.
valuation indicating all measures
under with which the project Revised Revised
$100,000 complies. requirements to | requirements to

be determined at
annual review.

be determined at
annual review.

! Determine project valuation using City of Pacifica’s building permit formula,




1-3 Residential
Units (continued)

Level 2 Project GPR or LEED checklist, | Same as year 1. | Same as year 1.
valuation indicating all measures
$100,000 — with which the project Revised Revised
199,999 complies. In addition, requirements to | requirements to
energy efficiency at least | be determined at | be determined at
15% beyond Title 24 annual review. annual review,
requirements must be
attained.
Level 3 Project Certified under GPR OR | Same as year 1. | Same as year 1.
valuation LEED
$200,000 or Revised Revised
more AND requirements to | requirements to
where the be determined at | be determined at
project results annual review. annual review.
in individual
dwellings of
less than
2,800 square
feet in size,
not including
the garage.
Level 4 a) New Certified under LEED Same as year 1. | Same as year 1.
residential OR GPR system, If the
construction GPR system is used, a Revised Revised

projects with
one or more
dwelling of
2,800 square
feet or larger,
not including
the garage

b) Alterations
and additions
to residential
projects that
result in one
or more
dwelling of
2,800 square
Teet or more
of floor area,
not including
the garage
AND project
valuation of
$100,000 or
more.

minimum of 100 points
shall be obtained,

requirements to
be determined at

annual review,

requirements to
be determined at
annual review.




All Construction | All projects In addition to the above, | In addition to Same as Year 2
and/or that include construction and the above,
Demolition building demolition waste shall be | construction and
Projects construction | diverted from landfills demolition
and/or and/or incinerators—for | waste shall be
demolition residential projects to the | diverted from
extent required to attain | landfills and/or
GPR certification; for all | incinerators—
other projects to the for residential
extent required to earn 1 | projects to the
LEED point extent required
Documentation indicating | to attain GPR

compliance with this
provision is required.

certification; for
all other projects

to the extent
required to earn
2 LEED points
Documentation
indicating
compliance with
this provision is
required.

SECTION 5. SUBMITTAL AND REVIEW OF GREEN BUILDING
DOCUMENTATION.

a. Submission of green building documentation. In order to receive the
necessary permit(s), in conjunction with any application for approval of a
development permit or building permit, the applicant shall submit to the
Green Building Compliance Official documentation, prepared by a qualified
green building professional, indicating the measures that will be taken to
achieve the applicable green building standards required by. this Chapter
("Green Building Documentation"). The Green Building Documentation shall
include:

) The applicable GPR or LEED green building project checklist in
the plan set;

2) Any other documentation that may be necessary to show
compliance with this Chapter, as determined by the Green
Building Compliance Official,

b. Review and acceptance of Green Building Documentation. The Green
Building Compliance Official shall only accept the Green Building
Documentation if such documentation indicates that the covered project can
achieve the applicable green building standards, as set forth in this Chapter, If
the Green Building Compliance Official determines that these conditions
have been met, the Green Building Documentation shall be accepted as

complete.



In the event that the Green Building Compliance Official determines that the
documentation is incomplete or insufficient to indicate that the covered
project will meet the required green building standards, the Green Building
Compliance Official shall identify the reasons for the determination and

) identify any additional information that is needed. The Green Building
Compliance Official may retain the services of a consultant having expertise
in green building techniques to review and evaluate the material and provide
recommendations as to methods for compliance with the requirements of this
Chapter. The cost of such consultant shall be paid by the applicant.

SECTION 6. FINAL CERTIFICATION.

a. A Certificate of Occupancy shall not be issued until and unless the Green
Building Compliance Official has determined that the project has
implemented green building measures substantially in accord with this

chapter.

SECTION 7. VOLUNTARY ACTIONS.

[:8

Renewable Energy. Applicants are encouraged to install renewable
energy systems.

Rainwater Harvesting. Applicants are encouraged to install rainwater
harvesting systems.

Water Reuse, Applicants are encouraged to install systems to facilitate
the use of graywater, and of recycled water in the future.

Subdivisions. Applicants are encouraged to cluster buildings, minimize
impervious surface cover, and utilize site design that discourages
automobile usage and promotes outdoor activity, Applicants are
encouraged to refer to LEED for Neighborhood Design as a guideline.

Non-covered Projects. Applicants are encouraged to incorporate green
building measures to the maximum extent practicable, even in cases
where no formal certification is required. :

SECTION 8. ALTERNATIVE COMPLIANCE,

a. The Green Building Compliance Official may accept an alternative to the
criteria set forth in this Chapter, if the Green Building Compliance Official
finds that the alternative includes measures that increase energy and resource
conservation to an extent consistent with the intent of this Chapter.

SECTION 9. EXCEPTIONS.

a. In the event of hardship, the Green Building Compliance Official may grant
exceptions to this Chapter. Applications for exceptions shall be filed with the

10



Green Building Compliance Official on a form provided by the City. The
application form must be complete, signed and accompanied by documents
that enable the City to reasonably determine that a hardship exists. In order to
grant an exception, the Green Building Compliance Official must find that
hardship exists, that the project is as nearly in compliance with the
requirements set forth in this Chapter as is reasonably possible and that the
project fully complies with the requirements of the 2008 California Building
Energy Efficiency Standards (Title 24, Part 6) of the California Building

Code.

SECTION 10. APPEALS.

a. Any pcfson aggrieved by decisions of the Green Building Compliance
Official may appeal the decision to the City Council. The appellant shall file
the appeal in accordance with Title 1, Chapter 4 of this Code.

SECTION 11. SEVERABILITY.

a. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this chapter
is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any
court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remainder of this chapter. The City Council declares that it would have
adopted this chapter and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or
portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,
subsections, phrases or portions be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

* * * *
The foregoing ordinance was introduced at the City Council meeting held on the 22™
* day of November, 2010 and adopted at the meeting held on the 13th day of
December, 2010, by the following vote:

AYES, Councilmembers: Lancelle, Vreeland, Nihart & Digre
NOES, Councilmembers: None
ABSENT, Councilmembers: DeJarnatt

ABSTAIN, Councilmembers: None A/L g

Sue Digre, Mayor(y

ATTEST: /

WQJQW

Kathy O’Connell,@ity Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Aoeitin. .S )oalk

Cecilia M. Quick, City Attormney

11



RESOLUTION NO: 11-0831-1j

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
STATE ENERGY RESOURCES
CONSERVATION AND DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION

RESOLUTION: California Energy Commission approval of the City of Pacifica’s locally
adopted building energy standards to require greater energy efficiency than the 2008
Building Energy Efficiency Standards.

WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica has submitted an application to the Energy Commission
for approval of a local ordinance with energy efficiency requirements meeting or
exceeding those required by the 2008 Building Energy Efficiency Standards, and

WHEREAS, Public Resources Code Section 25402.1(h)(2) and Title 24, Part 1, Section
10-106 establish a process for local governments to apply to the Energy Commission
for approval to adopt new versions of Building Energy Efficiency Standards that require
additional energy efficiency measures or set more stringent energy budgets; and

WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica submitted an application to the Energy Commission that
meets all of the documentation requirements pursuant to Public Resources Code
Section 25402.1(h}(2) and Section 10-106; and

WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica has made a written commitment to actively enforce
compliance both with the locally adopted energy standards and the 2008 Building
Energy Efficiency Standards; and

WHEREAS, the Energy Commission commends the City of Pacifica for seeking to
achieve additional energy demand reductions, energy savings and other benefits
exceeding those of the 2008 Building Energy Efficiency Standards;

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that on May 31, 2011 the Energy Commission
approves the City of Pacifica's locally adopted energy standards, and that these local
standards may be enforced by the City of Pacifica.

Dated: May 31, 2011 STATE ENERGY RESOURCES
CONSERVATION AND DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION

g

ROBERT B. WEISENMILLER, Chair

7




STATE OF CALIFORNI]A — STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX(916) 263-0959

February 8, 2011

Kathy O’Connell, City Clerk
City Clerk’s Office

City of Pacifica

170 Santa Maria Ave.
Pacifica, CA 94044-2506

Dear Ms. O’'Connell:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on December 14, 2010 of the City of Pacifica
submittal pertaining to Ordinance Numbers 13.10 and 14.10 with findings and is
acceptable for filing. Per Health and Safety Code Section 17958.8 no modification or
change to the California Building Standards Code shall become effective or operative
for any purpose until the finding and the modification or change have been filed with the
California Building Standards Commission (the Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

P 4/

frique M. Rodriguez e
Associate Construction Analyst

CC: Chron
Local Filings



CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE

TEL. (650) 738-7301
FAX (650) 359-6038
CITY ATTORNEY
TEL. (650) 738-7400
FAX (650) 359-8947
CITY CLERK

TEL. (650) 738-7307
EAX (650) 359-6038
CITY COUNCIL

TEL. (650) 738-7301
FAX (650) 359-6038
FINANCE

TEL. (650} 738-7392
FAX (650) 738-7411
FIRE ADMINISTRATION
TEL. (650} 991-8138
FAX (650) 991-8090
HUMAN RESOURCES
TEL. (650) 738-7303
FAX (650) 359-6038
PARKS, BEACHES &
RECREATION

TEL. (650} 738-7381
FAX (650) 738-2165

PLANNING
TEL. (650) 738-7341
FAX {650) 359-5807
e Building
TEL. (650) 738-7344
e Code Enforcement
TEL. (650) 738-7341

POLICE DEPARTMENT
TEL. {650) 738-7314
FAX {650) 355-1172
PUBLIC WORKS
TEL. (650} 738-3760
FAX {650) 738-9747
e Engineering
TEL. (650) 738-3767
FAX (650) 738-3003
e Field Services
TEL. {650) 738-3760
FAX {650} 738-9747

MAYOR

ClTY HALL Mary Ann Nihart

170 Santa Maria Avenue e Pacifica, California 94044-2506 MAYOR PRO TEM
www cityofpacifica.org Peter DeJarnatt

COUNCIL

Sue Digre
James M. Vreeland, Jr.

lL.en Stone

February 1, 2011

Dave Walls, Executive Director

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833

Re: Local Amendments to California Building Codes

(Corrected letter the December 13" letter stated that the ordinance would go into effect
lanuary 1, 2010)

Dear Mr. Walls:

As required by law, the City of Pacifica hereby submits its local amendments to the various
Building Standards Codes which were adopted with appropriate findings on November 22,
2010 and are scheduled to go into effect on January 1, 2011.

Should you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me at (650) 738-7303.
Sincerely,

W% Ol ntld.

Kathy O’Connell
City Clerk

Path of Portola 1769 « San Francisco Bay Discovery Site



ORDINANCE NO. 778-C.S.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF PACIFICA REPEALING
CHAPTERS 1 (“BUILDING CODE”), 2 (“MECHANICAL CODE"), 3
(“PLUMBING CODE”), AND 4 (“ELECTRICAL CODE”) OF TITLE 8

(“BUILDING REGULATIONS”) OF THE PACIFICA MUNICIPAL CODE, AND
ADDING THERETO NEW CHAPTERS 1 (“BUILDING CODE”), 2
(“MECHANICAL CODE”"), 3 (“PLUMBING CODE"), 4 (“ELECTRICAL CODE"),
AND 8 (“RESIDENTIAL CODE”) AND MAKING AMENDMENTS THERETO,;
AND REPEALING ARTICLE 1 (“CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE”) OF CHAPTER 3
(“FIRE PROTECTION”) OF TITLE 4 (“PUBLIC SAFETY”) OF THE PACIFICA
MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADDING THERETO A NEW ARTICLE 1 (“FIRE
CODE”) AND MAKING AMENDMENTS THERETO.

WHEREAS, the State of California has adopted and published the 2010
California Building Standards Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24),

and,

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building Standards Code contains,
amongst other parts, the California Building Code (Title 24, Part 2), California
Residential Code (Title 24, Part 2.5), California Electrical Code (Title 24, Part 3),
California Mechanical Code (Title 24, Part 4), California Plumbing Code (Title 24,
Part 5), California Fire Code (Title 24, Part 9), and California Green Building
Standards Code (Title 24, Part 11); and,

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Building Standards Code becomes
effective January 1, 2011; and,

WHEREAS, Sections 17922, 17958, and 18941.5 of the California Health
& Safety Code provide that the governing body of every city or county shall adopt
ordinances or regulations imposing the same requirements as those contained in
the most recently adopted version of the California Building Standards Code;

and,

WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the
California Health & Safety Code provide that a city or county may make such
changes or modifications to the requirements contained in the California Building
Standards Code which are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the California
Health & Safety Code provide that prior to making any change or modification to
the California Building Standards Code authorized by the Health & Safety Code,
the City Council of Pacifica is required to make an express finding that such
modifications or changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions; and,




WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica is comprised of a number of cul-de-sacs
off of Highway 1, which divides the City into distinct districts. Each of these
districts is isolated from each other by the topography of the City. The City is
bordered to the west by the Pacific Ocean and to the east by hills that separate
the City from the other communities; and,

WHEREAS, a series of overpasses span Highway 1. The collapse of one
or more of these overpasses would greatly restrict access to the majority of the
City. Highway 1 narrows at two points in the City. A major accident at these
choke points also restricts the ability to provide emergency services throughout
the City. Several of the districts within the City, such as Vallemar, Rockaway, and
Pedro Point have narrow roads in which parking is either not permitted or is
limited to one side of the street only. The roads are steep, between 10 to 19
percent in grade, and wind along the contours of the hillsides. These conditions
add to the response times of emergency vehicles and also limit the number of
emergency vehicles that can be sent to any particular address in these areas;

and,

WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica is subject to ground tremors from large
seismic events along the San Andreas, Loma Prieta, and Seal Cove faults. A
part of the City is within the Alquist/Priolo special studies zone, as shown in the
Alquist-Priolo Earthquake Fault Zone Act of 1972. Seismological evidence
indicates there is a probability of an earthquake in the region ranging form 5 to 7
on the Richter Scale. This potential for earthquakes influences fire protection
planning. A major seismic event would create a Citywide demand on fire
protection service, which would be beyond the response capacity of the fire
department. Structural damage to the overpasses on Highway 1 would seriously
delay emergency vehicle access to major parts of the City; and,

WHEREAS, the City of Pacifica is unique in its climatic conditions.
According to records found at the National Weather Service, the average yearly
rainfall for the City is approximately 25" to 30", with a high of 65" in 1995. This
rainfall normally occurs from November to April. During the summer months,
there is generally no measurable precipitation. Temperatures for this dry period
can range into the 80's to 90's Fahrenheit and are frequently accompanied by
light to gusty winds. With the extensive Urban-Wild land interface that surrounds
the City, the potential for a major fire is high; and,

WHEREAS, Pacifica is located adjacent to the Pacific Ocean and
significant areas of the City are subject to extreme wave heights, severe bluff
erosion and flooding which cause damage to public facilities and private property,
especially during heavy rainfall and El Nino winters; and,



WHEREAS, due to its proximity to the Pacific Ocean, Pacifica is at risk
from a potential tsunami hazard if a major earthquake occurs in the Pacific
Ocean resulting in a wave run-up. The approximate wave run-up height of 20 feet
presents a risk to structures and individuals in the area, as there are
approximately 900 existing dwelling units within Pacifica’s tsunami run-up area,
as well as important community services and facilities; and,

WHEREAS, Pacifica is framed by ridges of the Coast Range on the east
and is home to 37 mountain summits and peaks. Hillside stability is a critical
hazard. Slope failures and surficial landslides are a significant hazard, and runoff
from heavy rain or groundshaking are most likely to activate landsliding in the
hilly terrain; and,

WHEREAS, Pacifica is exposed to more extreme weather than elsewhere
in the Bay Area, including strong winds, almost constant exposure to salt air and
frequent heavy rains during the winter months. The off-shore high pressure
system and upwelling of deeper, cold water just off the coast resulting in frequent
summer fog; and,

WHEREAS, adoption of this ordinance will update the City of Pacifica’s
building standards for all types of buildings to reflect the most recent
improvements in design and construction techniques, and will provide a level of
safety to building occupants intended by the State in it's code adoption process;

and,

WHEREAS, the California Building Code, the California Residential Code,
and California Fire Code have not fully addressed the climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions in the City of Pacifica; and,

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Pacifica expressly finds and
declares in accordance with Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of
the California Health & Safety Code that the amendments, additions, and
deletions to the Building Standards set forth in the California Building Standards
Code as proposed in this ordinance are reasonably necessary because of the
aforementioned local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions;

WHEREAS, the City Council of Pacifica is not required to make an
express finding for amendments necessary for to carryout the application of the
Building Standards Code and/or that do not otherwise modify a Building

Standard; and,

WHEREAS, certain amendments to the California Building Standards
Code have been recommended by the Tri-Chapter Uniform Code Committee
(“TUCC") and the Pacifica Fire Marshall.




NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PACIFICA
DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Chapter 1 (“Building Code”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of the
Pacifica Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety; however, such repeal
shall not affect or excuse any violation of said chapter that occurred prior to the
effective date of this ordinance; nor shall such repeal impeded, impact, or negate
any administrative, civil, or criminal enforcement of said chapter that that
commenced prior to the enforcement date of this ordinance.

SECTION 2. A new Chapter 1 (“Building Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 1
BUILDING CODE

Sec. 8-1.01 — Adoption of the California Building Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 35, including Appendix C (“Group U — Agricultural
Buildings”), Appendix G (“Flood-Resistant Construction”), and Appendix J
(“Grading”), of that certain Code designated as the California Building Code,
2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part 2], published by the International Code Council
and amended by the State of California, which is on file in the office of the City
Clerk for public record and inspection, is hereby adopted by reference and made
a part of this chapter as though set forth in this chapter in full, subject, however,
to the amendments, additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter, and said
Code shall be known as the Building Code for the City.

Sec. 8-1.02 — Amendments: Section 1.8.8.1 (“Appeals Board: General”)

Section 1.8.8.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

1.8.8.1 General. Whenever reference is made in any provision of
Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code to the
“Board of Appeals”, it shall mean the Emergency Preparedness and
Safety Commission. The Emergency Preparedness and Safety
Commission will hear appeals, and such appeals shall be
processed in accordance with the Provisions of the Section 113 of
the Pacifica Building Code.

Sec. 8-1.03 — Amendments: Section 101.1 (“Title”)




Section 101.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building
Code of the City of Pacifica, hereafter referred to as “this Code.”

Sec. 8-1.04 — Amendments: Section 101.4 (“Referenced codes”)

Section 101.4 of the California Building Code is hereby deleted in its entirety, and a new
Section 101.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

101.4 Referenced codes. The other codes listed in Sections
101.2.1 through 101.4.8 and referenced elsewhere in this code
shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the
prescribed extent of each such reference.

101.4.1 Electrical. The provisions of the California
Electrical Code, as adopted and amended by the Pacifica Municipal
Code, shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including
alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures,
fittings and appurtenances thereto.

101.4.2 Gas. The provisions of California Mechanical
Code and California Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation of
gas piping from the point of delivery, gas appliances and related
accessories as covered in this code. These requirements apply to
gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet
connections of appliances and the installation and operation of
residential and commercial gas appliances and related accessories.

101.4.3 Mechanical. The provisions of the California
Mechanical Code, as adopted and amended by the Pacifica
Municipal Code, shall apply to the installation, alterations, repairs
and replacement of mechanical systems, including equipment,
appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances, including
ventilating, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration
systems, incinerators and other energy-related systems.

101.4.4 Plumbing. The provisions of the California
Plumbing Code, as adopted and amended by the Pacifica
Municipal Code, shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair and
replacement of plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances,
fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a
water or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system.



The provisions of the International Private Sewage Disposal Code
shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.

101.4.5 Property maintenance. The provisions of the
1997 Uniform Housing Code, as adopted by Section 8-7.01 of the
Pacifica Municipal Code, and Title 25 (“Property Maintenance and
Nuisance Abatement”) shall apply to existing structures and
premises; equipment and facilities; light, ventilation, space heating,
sanitation, life and fire safety hazards; responsibilities of owners,
operators, and occupants; and occupancy of existing premises and
structures.

101.4.6 Residential. The provisions of the California
Residential Code, as adopted and amended by the Pacifica
Municipal Code, shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, removal and demolition of detached one- and
two-family dwellings or townhouses not more than three stories
above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and
their accessory structures.

101.4.7 Fire protection. The provisions of the California
Fire Code, as adopted and amended by the Pacifica Municipal
Code, shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures,
processes and premises from the hazard of fire and explosion
arising from the storage, handling or use of structures, materials, or
devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or public
welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the
construction, extension, repair, alterations, removal, and
maintenance of fire suppression and alarm systems or fire hazards
in the structure or on the premises from occupancy or operation.

101.4.8 Energy. The provisions of the California Energy
Code, Title 24, Part 6 shall apply to all matters governing the
design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency.

Sec. 8-1.05 — Amendments: Section 105.3.3 (“Application for Permit:
Improvements required prior to the issuance of building permits and

exceptions”)

Section 105.3.3 of the California Building Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

105.3.3 Improvements required prior to the issuance of
building permits and exceptions.



A. The City Engineer shall require, prior to the issuance of a
building permit for the construction of any structure or improvement
upon unimproved property within the City where such permit is
required and where no public improvements, including street
paving, sidewalk, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities
exist, the construction of such public improvements along such
property, constructed in accordance with the City of Pacifica's
Engineering Standards, as part of the construction of such structure
or improvements.

B. When it is not impractical to establish grades prior to the
completion of construction of the structure, the City Engineer may
require an executed agreement by the property owner stating
he/she will construct public improvements, including street paving,
sidewalks, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities at such
time as the City may deem it feasible.

C. Sidewalks shall not be required prior to the issuance of a
building permit for the construction of any structure or
improvements upon unimproved property in areas where the
Council has, by resolution, deemed that sidewalks are not required.
The City Engineer may require an executed agreement by the
property owner stating he/she will construct the improvements at
such time the City may again require them.

Sec. 8-1.06 — Amendments: Section 105.4.1 (“Validity of permit: Hours of
Construction”)

Section 105.4.1 of the California Building Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

105.4.1 Hours of Construction. The hours of construction for any
project for which a building permit is required within the City of
Pacifica shall be limited to the hours of 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. on
Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday, Thursday, and Friday. The hours
of construction shall be limited to 9:00 am. to 5:00 p.m. on
Saturday and Sunday.

Sec. 8-1.07 — Amendments: Section 105.5 (“Expiration”)

Section 105.5 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

105.5 Expiration of Permit - Generally.

A. Except as set forth in Section 105.5.1, every permit issued
for property within the City of Pacifica shall expire by limitation and
become null and void as follows:



(1) If work authorized by such permit is not commenced
within 180 days from the issuance date of such permit.

(2) If work authorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days from the issuance date of such permit, such permit
shall expire by limitation and become null and void 180 days after
the date of the last successful inspection by the City’s Building
Division. For purposes of this section, “successful inspection” shall
mean an required inspection (as provided in Section 110.3 of this
Coe or elsewhere in this Code) in which work inspected was
determined by the Building Official or his/her designee to meet all
applicable minimum code requirements and the inspection was
documented as successful.

(3) Notwithstanding any provision of Subsections
105.5(A)(1) and 105.5(A)(2), no permit shall be extended, and
therefore, no permit shall be valid, for any period exceeding two (2)
years from the original date of issuance.

B. In the event of permit expiration, before work authorized
pursuant by the expired permit can be commenced or
recommenced, a new permit shall first be obtained (hereafter, a
“renewal permit”). To obtain a renewal permit, the applicant may be
required to resubmit plans and specifications, if deemed necessary
by the Building Official and/or Chief Planning Official. The applicant
must pay all applicable fees, including but not limited to, a plan
check fee and building permit fees, in the amount then established
by resolution of the City Council. If renewal permits are applied for,
a mandatory site inspection shall be performed by the Building
Division to determine compliance of existing conditions and
materials with this Code. All work to be performed under a renewal
permit must be performed in accordance with all applicable
technical codes, regulations, laws, and ordinances in effect on the
date of issuance of the renewal permit. Renewal permits are
subject to expiration as set forth in (i), above.

C. In the event of permit expiration, any work performed under
that permit is “unpermitted” as defined in Section 113.1 of this
chapter, and is subject to the legalization provisions of
Section 117 of this chapter.

Sec. 8-1.08 — Amendments: Section 105.5.1 (“Expiration of Permit for
Unpermitted Structures or Grading”)



Section 105.5.1 of the California Building Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

105.5.1 Expiration of Permit for Unpermitted Structures or
Grading. Notwithstanding any provision of Section 105.5, if a
building permit was issued in order to bring an “unpermitted
structure” or “unpermitted grading” (as each of these terms are
defined in Section 114.1.1 and 114.1.2, respectively, of this
chapter) or other unlawful, substandard, or hazardous condition into
compliance with any applicable law, ordinance, rule or regulation,
such permit shall expire by limitation and become null and void
sixty (60) days after the date on which the permit was issued. The
Building Official may, in his or her sole discretion, extend the
validity of the permit for a period not exceeding 180 days beyond
the initial 60 day limit upon written request by the applicant filed
with the Building Official prior to the expiration date of the original
permit, if the Building Official determines that substantial progress
has been made toward completing the work authorized by the
permit.

Sec. 8-1.09 — Amendments: Section 105.6 (“Suspension or revocation”)

Section 105.6 of the California Building Code is hereby deleted in its entirety, and
a new Section 105.6 is hereby added to read as follows:

105.6 — Suspension or Revocation of Permit. The Building
Official may, in writing, suspend or revoke a permit issued under
the provisions of this Code, or other relevant laws, ordinances,
rules, or regulations, whenever the permit is issued in error or on
the basis of incorrect, inaccurate, or incomplete information, or in
violation of any ordinance or regulation of any of the provisions of
this Code

The Building Official may also, in writing, withhold
inspections or approvals, or suspend or revoke a permit, where
work is being performed in violation of approved plans, conditions
of the permit, or applicable laws, and/or where work is being
concealed without approval from the Building & Safety Division,
and/or where work is not in accordance with the direction of the

Building & Safety Division.
Sec. 8-1.10 — Amendments: Section 109.2 (Fees: Schedule of permit fees”)

Section 109.2 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:




109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures,
electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations
requiring a permit, fees and charges for each permit shall be
assessed and paid as required, in accordance with the most current
fee schedule adopted in the City of Pacifica Municipal
Administrative Policy #2.

Sec. 8-1.11 — Amendments: Section 109.4 (Fees: Work commencing before
permit issuance”)

Section 109.4 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Whenever
any work for which a permit is required by this Code has been
commenced without first obtaining such permit, an investigation
and processing fee equal to the amount of the required permit fee
or as otherwise established by the most current fee schedule
adopted in the City of Pacifica Municipal Administrative Policy #2
shall be collected at the time of application for the required permit
and prior to the issuance of the required permit, irrespective of
whether a permit is subsequently issued.

Sec. 8-1.12 — Amendments: Section 111.2.1 (Certificate of Occupancy:
Certificate Issued: Improvements prior to occupancy of structures and
utility service exceptions”)

Section 111.2.1 of the California Building Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

111.2.1 Improvements prior to occupancy of structures and
utility service exceptions.

A. No new structure for which a building permit is required shall
be occupied or otherwise used, nor shall utility services be supplied
thereto, until such public improvements, including street paving,
sidewalk, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities required by
Section 105.3.3 have been installed and approved by the City
Engineer and until such time as the Planning Director has been
satisfied that all planning department requirements for the project
have been met.

B. When it is, in the opinion of the City Engineer and/or the
Planning Director, not practicable to complete public improvements
including street paving, sidewalk, gutter and/or curb, miscellaneous
facilities or planning department conditions prior to completion of
construction of the structure, a completion bond in an amount



determined by the City Engineer and/or Planning Director to be
adequate to insure completion shall be posted for the completion of
the required improvements. The Building Official may authorize the
installation of gas and/or electric utilities in commercial buildings for
the purpose of testing equipment prior to completion of construction
when the Building Official has determined that such utilities are
necessary for the testing of required equipment prior to the final
inspection of the building.

Sec. 8-1.13 — Amendments: Section 113 (“Board of Appeals”)

Section 113 of the California Building Code is hereby deleted in its entirety, and a
new Section 113 is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 113
APPEALS

113.1 Scope of Appeal.
A. Notwithstanding the provisions of the Technical Codes, an

appeal is limited to the following orders, decisions, or
determinations of the Building Official or his/her designee:

(1)  Denials of the proposed use of alternative materials,
design or method of construction, installation, and/or equipment;

(2) Orders to Vacate and/or Not Enter a building,
structure or premises; however, such order shall not be stayed
during the pendency of the appeal;

(3)  Orders to Demolish a building or structure; however,
an order to vacate that may be issued in conjunction with the Order
to Demolish shall not be stayed during the pendency of the appeal.

B. The right of appeal shall not exist for determinations of the
Building Official, or a designee thereof, that a violation of any
provision of the Technical Codes exists in a building or structure, or
portion thereof, or on any premises.

113.2 Appeal Procedure. Any person who is aggrieved by an
order, decision or determination of the Building Official as provided
in Section 113.1 may appeal said order, decision or determination.
Such appeal shall be in writing and must be filed with the City Clerk
within ten (10) business days from the date of service of the order,
decision or determination being appealed. The appeal must specify
the basis for the appeal in detail, provide a mailing address and
telephone number for the appellant, and include the applicable



appeal fee. If a timely appeal is not received by the City Clerk, the
right to appeal is waived and the order, decision or determination of
the Building Official is deemed final and binding. Appeals shall be
heard as follows:

(1)  Appeals shall be heard before the Emergency
Preparedness and Safety Commission (“Commission”). As soon as
practicable after receiving the request, the City Clerk shall set a
date for the Commission to hear the appeal, which date shall be not
less than ten (10) calendar days nor more than forty-five (45)
calendar days from the date the appeal was received. The City
Clerk shall give each party written notice of the time and place of
the hearing at least ten (10) calendar days prior to the date of the
hearing, either by causing a copy of the notice to be delivered to
the party personally, or by mailing a copy thereof, postage prepaid,
addressed to each appealing party at the address(es) shown on the
request. Continuances of the appeal hearing may be granted by the
Commission on request of the appealing person for good cause
shown, provided such request is made no later than 24 hours prior
to the scheduled hearing, or upon request of the Building Official or
his or her designee for good cause shown, or on the Commission’s
own motion.

(2)  Atthe time and place set forth in the notice of hearing,
the Commission shall hear the testimony of the appealing
person(s), the Building Official, and/or their witnesses, as well as
any documentary evidence presented by these persons concerning
the order, decision or determination being appealed. Only those
matters or issues specifically raised in the written appeal shall be
considered in the hearing. Appeal hearings are informal, and formal
rules of evidence and discovery do not apply.

(3) Upon the conclusion of the appeal hearing, the
Commission shall, on the basis of the evidence presented at the
hearing, determine whether the order, decision or determination
should be affirmed, modified, or rescinded. A copy of the
Commission’s written decision shall be served upon the appealing
person by first class mail or by personal service. Notwithstanding
any other provision of the Pacifica Municipal Code, the
determination of the Commission shall be final and binding.

(4) If the appellant fails to appear, the Commission shall
cancel the hearing and send a notice thereof to the appellant by
first class mail. A cancellation of a hearing due to non-appearance
of the appellant shall constitute the appellant’s waiver of the right to



appeal. In such instances, the order, decision or determination of
the Building Official shall be final and binding.

Sec. 8-1.14 — Amendments: Section 114.1 (“Violations: Unlawful Acts”)

Section 114.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

114.1 Unlawful Acts. Irrespective of whether a notice of violation
has been issued pursuant to Section 114.2 of this Code, it shall be
unlawful and subject to immediate administrative, civil, or criminal
prosecution for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct,
alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish, occupy or maintain
any building, structure, equipment, installation or land regulated by
the Technical Codes, or cause or permit the same to be done, in
conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of the Technical

Codes.

114.1.1 Unpermitted Structures. No person shall own,
use, occupy, or maintain an unpermitted structure. For purposes of
this section, “unpermitted structure” shall be defined as any building
or structure, or portion thereof, that was erected, constructed,
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, removed, connected,
converted, demolished, or equipped, at any point in time by any
person, without the required permit(s) having first been obtained
from the Building Official or with a valid permit as issued by the
Building Official which subsequently expired and became null and
void.

114.1.2 Unpermitted Grading. No person shall own, use,
occupy or maintain unpermitted grading. For purposes of this
section, “unpermitted grading” shall be defined as any land which
has been excavated, cut, filled, graded, compacted or terraced, at
any point in time by any person, without the required permit(s)
having first been obtained from the Building Official or with a valid
permit as issued by the Building Official which subsequently
expired and became null and void.

Sec. 8-1.15 - Amendments: Section 114.4 (“Violations: Violation penalties”)

Section 114.4 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

113.4 Violation Penalties. Any person, firm or corporation who
violates any provision of the Technical Codes, or fails to comply
with any of the requirements thereof, or who erects, constructs,



alters, repairs or maintains a building, structure, installation or
equipment, or excavates, cuts, fills, grades, compacts or maintains
fand in violation of approved construction documents or directive of
the Building Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the
provisions of the Technical Codes, shall be deemed guilty of a
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof shall be subject to the
punishments set forth in Chapter 2 of Title 1 of the Pacifica
Municipal Code.

Each and every day, or portion thereof, during which any
violation of the Technical Codes occurs or continues constitutes a
separate and distinct offense.

Sec. 8-1.16 - Amendments: Section 117 (“Procedure for legalizing
unpermitted structures or grading”)

Section 117 of the California Building Code is added to read as follows:

117. Procedure for Legalizing Unpermitted Structures or
Grading.

117.1 Permits. Any person who wishes to legalize an “unpermitted
structure” or “unpermitted grading” (as each of these terms are
defined in Sections 114.1.1 and 114.1.2, respectively, of this Code),
shall obtain all applicable permits. Unpermitted structures and
grading shall comply with all current Technical Code requirements
and other required approvals pursuant to the Pacifica Municipal
Code in order to be legalized.

Permits obtained to legalize unpermitted structures or
grading shall expire as set forth in Section 105.5.1 of this code.

117.2 Plans.
117.2.1 Structures. Prior to the issuance or granting of any

permit to legalize an unpermitted structure, plans showing the plot
plan, exterior elevations, existing structures proposed structures,
and proposed finish materials shall be submitted to the Building
Official and Planning Director for review and approval.

117.2.2 Grading. Prior to the issuance or granting of any
permit to legalize unpermitted grading, a grading and drainage plan
showing the original grade and existing unpermitted grade on the
premises and the existing grade on adjoining properties, and a soils
report shall be submitted to the Building Official and Planning
Director for review and approval.



117.3 Inspections. Unpermitted structures or unpermitted grading
for which a permit has subsequently been obtained shall be subject
to inspection by the Building Official in accordance with, and in the
manner prescribed in, the Technical Codes. The Building Official
may require the removal of finish materials in order to expose
framing elements, electrical components, plumbing fixtures, or
mechanical systems, or may require the removal of fill, to verify that
installation, construction, or grading was performed in conformance
with the Technical Codes.

117.4 Investigation Fees.

117.4.1 Investigation. Whenever any work for which a
permit is required by this code has commenced on land or in
connection with any type of structure without first obtaining said
permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may
be issued for such work. For purposes of this section, “special
investigation” shall include, but is not limited to, inspecting premises
and structures, reviewing permit, license and other records of the
City or other agencies, reviewing plans, taking photographs,
engaging in conferences and communications with other officials of
the City or other agencies, and engaging in conferences and
communications with owners or other responsible persons
concerning the unpermitted structure or grading.

117.4.2 Fee. A special investigation fee shall be paid prior
to the issuance of a permit for an unpermitted structure or
unpermitted grading. The fee shall be assessed as provided in
Section 108.4.2 of this chapter.

The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provision of this code nor
from any penalty prescribed by law.

117.5 Unpermitted Structures or Grading Which Cannot be
Legalized. |If the Planning Director determines that the City's
zoning regulations prohibit legalization of any unpermitted structure,
the structure shall be demolished or, if previously permitted,
restored to its original approved condition, with all requisite permits,
inspections and approvals.

If the Building Official determines that an unpermitted structure
cannot be made to conform with current applicable Technical Code
requirements, the structure shall be demolished or, if previously
permitted, restored to its original approved condition, with all
requisite permits, inspections and approvals.



If the Building Official determines that unpermitted grading and/or
lot drainage cannot be made to conform with current applicable
Technical Code requirements, the land shall be fully restored to the
condition that preceded the unpermitted grading, with all requisite
permits, inspections and approvals.

Sec. 8-1.17 — Amendments: Section 202 (“Definitions”)
Section 202 of the California Building Code is amended to include the following:

Building Code. Chapter 1 (“Building Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Mechanical Code. Chapter 2 (“Mechanical Code”) of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Plumbing Code. Chapter 3 (“Plumbing Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Electrical Code. Chapter 4 (“Electrical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Residential Code. Chapter 8 (“Residential Code”) of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings.
Chapter 5 (“Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica
Municipal Code.

Technical Codes. Chapters 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, and 8 of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Sec. 8-1.18 — Amendments: Section 903.2 (“Automatic Sprinkler Systems:
Where required”)

Section 903.2 of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Required Installations.
A. Newly Constructed Buildings and Structures. An
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all new

occupancies and locations.
1. Exception. Detached U-1 occupancies not exceeding

1,000 square feet in size.



B. Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic fire
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings when an

addition is added to the building.
1. Exception. When an addition to an R-3 occupancy is

less than 1000 square feet in size and when an addition to all other
occupancies is less than 500 square feet in size, no sprinklers are
required in either the addition or the existing building.

Sec. 8-1.19 — Amendments: Section 1507.1.1 (“Requirements for Roof
Coverings: Wood Shakes and/or Shingles Prohibited”)

Section 1507.1.1 of the California Building Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

1507.1.1 Wood Shakes and/or Shingles Prohibited. The use of
wood shakes or wood shingles for roofs on new construction is
prohibited. Existing wood shake or wood shingle roofs may be
recovered or repaired by using fire retardant treated shakes or
shingles. Additions or alterations to existing structures may have
wood shake or wood shingle roofs of fire retardant treated shakes
or shingles if the existing roof covering is of wood shake or shingle
construction.

Sec. 8-8.19 — Amendments: Section 1510.5 (“Reroofing: Reinstallation of
Materials”)

Section 1510.5 of the California Building Code is hereby amended by the
addition of the following paragraph:

The use of wood shakes or wood shingles for roofs on new
construction is prohibited. Existing wood shake or wood shingle
roofs may be recovered or repaired by using fire retardant treated
shakes or shingles. Additions or alterations to existing structures
may have wood shake or wood shingle roofs of fire retardant
treated shakes or shingles if the existing roof covering is of wood
shake or shingle construction.

Sec. 8-1.19 — Amendments: Appendix J103.1 (“Grading: Permits Required”)

Section J103.1 of Appendix J the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

J103.1 Permits required.
A. Except as exempted in Section J103.2, no grading shall be

performed without first having obtained a permit therefor from the



building official. A grading permit does not include the construction
of retaining walls or other structures.

B. No grading, excavating or filling shall be conducted between
the hours of 6:00 p.m. and 7:00 a.m. of any day, or on Saturday or
Sunday at any time, without the prior approval of the Building
Official. The Building Official shall notify the Department of Public
Safety whenever such approval has been granted.

C. The period between November 1 and March 31, inclusive, is
hereby determined to be the period in which heavy rainfall normally
occurs in the City of Pacifica. No grading, excavating or filling
requiring a grading permit pursuant to Appendix J of the California
Building Code as herein amended shall be authorized by the
Building Official during that period unless he or she determines in
writing that such work will not endanger the public health or safety
and that appropriate erosion control devices or methods will be
provided.

D. Any grading, excavating or filling which requires a grading
permit and, having been granted said permit, either begins during
or extends into the period between November 1 and March 31,
inclusive, shall be protected by temporary devices to prevent
erosion. Proposed erosion control devices or methods shall be
submitted with the grading plans to the Building Official and
approval of both the grading plan and the erosion control devices
and methods must be obtained not later than October 31. All such
approved erosion control devices or methods shall be installed not
later than November 1 for previously approved ongoing earthwork
operations. For earthwork operations approved by the Building
Official to start between November 1 and March 31, inclusive, all
approved erosion control devices must be in place before
earthwork activities may commence.

E. When determined by the Building Official that a bond is
required in order to insure that the work will be completed in
accordance with the approved plans, specifications and conditions
of approval, due to the nature, location, time of year or amount of
work to be done, such bond shall be in conformance with City of
Pacifica Administrative Policy #48. Surety bonds, cash bonds,
instruments of credit or other forms of security shall comply with the
provisions of City of Pacifica Administrative Policy Number 48.

SECTION 3. Chapter 2 (“Mechanical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of
the Pacifica Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety; however, such
repeal shall not affect or excuse any violation of said chapter that occurred prior
to the effective date of this ordinance; nor shall such repeal impeded, impact, or
negate any administrative, civil, or criminal enforcement of said chapter that that
commenced prior to the enforcement date of this ordinance.




SECTION 4. A new Chapter 2 (“Mechanical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 2
MECHANICAL CODE

Sec. 8-2.01 — Adoption of the California Mechanical Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 17, including Appendix B (“Procedures To Be
Followed To Pace Gas Equipment Into Operation”) and Appendix C (“Installation
and Testing of Oil (Liquid) Fuel-Fired Equipment”), of that certain Code
designated as the California Mechanical Code, 2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part
4], published by the International Code Council and amended by the State of
California, which is on file in the office of the City Clerk for public record and
inspection, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this chapter as
though set forth in this chapter in full, subject, however, to the amendments,
additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter, and said Code shall be known
as the Building Code for the City.

SECTION 5. Chapter 3 (“Plumbing Code”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of
the Pacifica Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety; however, such
repeal shall not affect or excuse any violation of said chapter that occurred prior
to the effective date of this ordinance; nor shall such repeal impeded, impact, or
negate any administrative, civil, or criminal enforcement of said chapter that that
commenced prior to the enforcement date of this ordinance.

SECTION 6. A new Chapter 3 (“Plumbing Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 3
PLUMBING CODE

Sec. 8-3.01 — Adoption of the California Plumbing Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, .equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 16A, including Appendix A (‘Recommended Rules
for Sizing the Water Supply System”), Appendix B (“Explanatory Notes on
Combination Waste and Vent Systems”), Appendix D (“Sizing Storm Water
Drainage Systems”), Appendix | (‘Installation Standards”), and Appendix K



(“Private Sewage Disposal Systems”), of that certain Code designated as the
California Plumbing Code, 2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part 5], published by the
International Code Council and amended by the State of California, which is on
file in the office of the City Clerk for public record and inspection, is hereby
adopted by reference and made a part of this chapter as though set forth in this
chapter in full, subject, however, to the amendments, additions, and deletions set
forth in this chapter, and said Code shall be known as the Building Code for the

City.
Sec. 8-3.02 — Amendments: Section 719.7 (“Cleanouts”)

Section 719.7 is hereby added to the California Plumbing Code to read as
follows:

719.7 Cleanouts. When a main sewer is located in the street,
alley, or easement, there shall be provided a cleanout within the
City right-of-way at the property line. The riser shall be of cast iron,
the same size as the drain served, brought up to grade level by a
wye and branch fitting, and the top of same shall be provided with a
regulation cleanout of four inch (4”) minimum size within a sidewalk
box, with removable cover.

SECTION 7. Chapter 4 (“Electrical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of
the Pacifica Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety; however, such
repeal shall not affect or excuse any violation of said chapter that occurred prior
to the effective date of this ordinance; nor shall such repeal impeded, impact, or
negate any administrative, civil, or criminal enforcement of said chapter that that
commenced prior to the enforcement date of this ordinance.

SECTION 8. A new Chapter 4 (“Electrical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 4
ELECTRICAL CODE

Sec. 8-4.01 — Adoption of the California Electrical Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 9, including Article 89, of that certain Code
designated as the California Electrical Code, 2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part 3],
published by the International Code Council and amended by the State of
California, which is on file in the office of the City Clerk for public record and
inspection, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this chapter as



though set forth in this chapter in full, subject, however, to the amendments,
additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter, and said Code shall be known
as the Building Code for the City.

Sec. 8-4.02 - Care and Maintenance

The ordinary care and maintenance of an established installation of electrical
equipment by the owner, operator, or user thereof shall not require an electrical
permit, except that ordinary care and maintenance shall not be construed as
including additions to such installations or other work, such as the repair or
replacement of any electrical wiring, appliance, or apparatus which is a fixed part
of such installation. The replacement of lamps and fuses and plug-in apparatus
and the repair of plug-in apparatus and similar work shall be construed as
ordinary care and maintenance.

Sec. 8-4.03 Raceways

Raceways exposed to the elements shall be of rigid galvanized aluminum or rigid
nonmetallic conduit.

SECTION 9. A new Chapter 8 (“Residential Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read as follows:

CHAPTER 8
RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sec. 8-8.01 — Adoption of the California Residential Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 10, including Appendix H (“Patio Covers") and
Appendix J (“Existing Buildings and Structures”), of that certain Code designated
as the California Residential Code, 2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part 2.5],
published by the International Code Council and amended by the State of
California, which is on file in the office of the City Clerk for public record and
inspection, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this chapter as
though set forth in this chapter in full, subject, however, to the amendments,
additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter, and said Code shall be known
as the Building Code for the City.

Sec. 8-8.02 — Amendments: Section R101.1 (“Title”’)

Section R101.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:




R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Residential
Code of the City of Pacifica, hereafter referred to as “this Code.”

Sec. 8-8.03 — Amendments: Section R105.3.3 (“Application for Permit:
Improvements required prior to the issuance of building permits and

exceptions”)

Section R105.3.3 of the California Residential Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

R105.3.3 Improvements required prior to the issuance of
building permits and exceptions.

A The City Engineer shall require, prior to the issuance of a
building permit for the construction of any structure or improvement
upon unimproved property within the City where such permit is
required and where no public improvements, including street
paving, sidewalk, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities
exist, the construction of such public improvements along such
property, constructed in accordance with the City of Pacifica’s
Engineering Standards, as part of the construction of such structure
or improvements.

B. When it is not impractical to establish grades prior to the
completion of construction of the structure, the City Engineer may
require an executed agreement by the property owner stating
he/she will construct public improvements, including street paving,
sidewalks, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities at such
time as the City may deem it feasible.

C. Sidewalks shall not be required prior to the issuance of a
building permit for the construction of any structure or
improvements upon unimproved property in areas where the
Council has, by resolution, deemed that sidewalks are not required.
The City Engineer may require an executed agreement by the
property owner stating he/she will construct the improvements at
such time the City may again require them.

Sec. 8-8.04 — Amendments: Section R105.4.1 (“Validity of permit: Hours of
Construction”)

Section R105.4.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

R105.4.1 Hours of Construction. The hours of construction for
any project for which a building permit is required within the City of
Pacifica shall be limited to the hours of 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. on
Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday, Thursday, and Friday. The hours



of construction shall be limited to 9:00 am. to 5:00 p.m. on
Saturday and Sunday.

Sect. 8-8.05 — Amendments: Section R105.5 (“Expiration”)

Section R105.5 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R105.5 Expiration of Permit - Generally.

A. Except as set forth in Section R105.5.1, every permit issued
for property within the City of Pacifica shall expire by limitation and
become null and void as follows:

(1) If work authorized by such permit is not commenced
within 180 days from the issuance date of such permit.

(2) If work authorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days from the issuance date of such permit, such permit
shall expire by limitation and become null and void 180 days after
the date of the last successful inspection by the City's Building
Division. For purposes of this section, “successful inspection” shall
mean an required inspection (as provided in Section R109.1 of this
Coe or elsewhere in this Code) in which work inspected was
determined by the Building Official or his/her designee to meet all
applicable minimum code requirements and the inspection was
documented as successful.

(3) Notwithstanding any provision of Subsections
R105.5(A)(1) and R105.5(A)(2), no permit shall be extended, and
therefore, no permit shall be valid, for any period exceeding Two (2)
years from the original date of issuance.

B. In the event of permit expiration, before work authorized
pursuant by the expired permit can be commenced or
recommenced, a new permit shall first be obtained (hereafter, a
“renewal permit). To obtain a renewal permit, the applicant may be
required to resubmit plans and specifications, if deemed necessary
by the Building Official and/or Chief Planning Official. The applicant
must pay all applicable fees, including but not limited to, a plan
check fee and building permit fees, in the amount then established
by resolution of the City Council. If renewal permits are applied for,
a mandatory site inspection shall be performed by the Building
Division to determine compliance of existing conditions and
materials with this Code. All work to be performed under a renewal




permit must be performed in accordance with all applicable
technical codes, regulations, laws, and ordinances in effect on the
date of issuance of the renewal permit. Renewal permits are
subject to expiration as set forth in (ii), above.

C. In the event of permit expiration, any work performed under
that permit is “unpermitted” as defined in Section R113.1.1 of this
chapter, and is subject to the legalization provisions of
Section R115 of this chapter.

Sec. 8-8.06 — Amendments: Section R105.5.1 (“Expiration of Permit for
Unpermitted Structures or Grading”)

Section R105.5.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

R105.5.1 Expiration of Permit for Unpermitted Structures.
Notwithstanding any provision of Section R105.5, if a building
permit was issued in order to bring an “unpermitted structure” (as
this term is defined in Section R113.1.1 of this chapter) or other
unlawful, substandard, or hazardous condition into compliance with
any applicable law, ordinance, rule or regulation, such permit shall
expire by limitation and become null and void sixty (60) days after
the date on which the permit was issued. The Building Official may,
in his or her sole discretion, extend the validity of the permit for a
period not exceeding 180 days beyond the initial 60 day limit upon
written request by the applicant filed with the Building Official prior
to the expiration date of the original permit, if the Building Official
determines that substantial progress has been made toward
completing the work authorized by the permit.

Sec. 8-8.07 - Amendments: Section R105.6 (“Suspension or revocation”)

Section R105.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety and a new Section R105.6 is
hereby added to read as follows:

R105.6 — Suspension or Revocation of Permit. The Building
Official may, in writing, suspend or revoke a permit issued under
the provisions of this Code, or other relevant laws, ordinances,
rules, or regulations, whenever the permit is issued in error or on
the basis of incorrect, inaccurate, or incomplete information, or in
violation of any ordinance or regulation of any of the provisions of
this Code.

The Building Official may also, in writing, withhold
inspections or approvals, or suspend or revoke a permit, where



work is being performed in violation of approved plans, conditions
of the permit, or applicable laws, and/or where work is being
concealed without approval from the Building & Safety Division,
and/or where work is not in accordance with the direction of the

Building & Safety Division.
Sec. 8-8.08 — Amendments: Section 108.2 (Fees: Schedule of permit fees”)

Section R108.2 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures,
electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations
requiring a permit, fees and charges for each permit shall be
assessed and paid as required, in accordance with the most current
fee schedule adopted in the City of Pacifica Municipal
Administrative Policy #2.

Sec. 8-8.09 — Amendments: Section R108.6 (Fees: Work commending
before permit issuance”)

Section R108.6 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. Whenever
any work for which a permit is required by this Code has been
commenced without first obtaining such permit, an investigation
and processing fee equal to the amount of the required permit fee
or as otherwise established by the most current fee schedule
adopted in the City of Pacifica Municipal Administrative Policy #2
shall be collected at the time of application for the required permit
and prior to the issuance of the required permit, irrespective of
whether a permit is subsequently issued.

Sec. 8-8.10 — Amendments: Section R110.3.1 (Certificate of Occupancy:
Certificate Issued: Improvements prior to occupancy of structures and
utility service exceptions”)

Section R110.3.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

R110.3.1 Improvements prior to occupancy of structures and
utility service exceptions.

A. No new structure for which a building permit is required shall
be occupied or otherwise used, nor shall utility services be supplied



thereto, until such public improvements, including street paving,
sidewalk, gutter and/or curb and miscellaneous facilities required by
Section R105.3.3 have been installed and approved by the City
Engineer and until such time as the Planning Director has been
satisfied that all planning department requirements for the project
have been met.

B. When it is, in the opinion of the City Engineer and/or the
Planning Director, not practicable to complete public improvements
including street paving, sidewalk, gutter and/or curb, miscellaneous
facilities or planning department conditions prior to completion of
construction of the structure, a completion bond in an amount
determined by the City Engineer and/or Planning Director to be
adequate to insure completion shall be posted for the completion of
the required improvements. The Building Official may authorize the
installation of gas and/or electric utilities in commercial buildings for
the purpose of testing equipment prior to completion of construction
when the Building Official has determined that such utilities are
necessary for the testing of required equipment prior to the final
inspection of the building.

Sec. 8-8.11 — Amendments: Section R112 (“Board of Appeals”)

Section R112 of the California Residential Code is hereby deleted in its entirety,
and a new Section R112 is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION R112
APPEALS

R112.1 Scope of Appeal.

A. Notwithstanding the provisions of the Technical Codes, an
appeal is limited to the following orders, decisions, or
determinations of the Building Official or his/her designee:

(1) Denials of the proposed use of alternative materials,
design or method of construction, installation, and/or equipment;

(2) Orders to Vacate and/or Not Enter a building,
structure or premises;, however, such order shall not be stayed
during the pendency of the appeal;

(3) Orders to Demolish a building or structure; however,
an order to vacate that may be issued in conjunction with the Order
to Demolish shall not be stayed during the pendency of the appeal.



B. The right of appeal shall not exist for determinations of the
Building Official, or a designee thereof, that a violation of any
provision of the Technical Codes exists in a building or structure, or
portion thereof, or on any premises.

R112.2 Appeal Procedure. Any person who is aggrieved by an
order, decision or determination of the Building Official as provided
in Section 112.1 may appeal said order, decision or determination.
Such appeal shall be in writing and must be filed with the City Clerk
within ten (10) business days from the date of service of the order,
decision or determination being appealed. The appeal must specify
the basis for the appeal in detail, provide a mailing address and
telephone number for the appellant, and include the applicable
appeal fee. If a timely appeal is not received by the City Clerk, the
right to appeal is waived and the order, decision or determination of
the Building Official is deemed final and binding. Appeals shall be
heard as follows:

&) Appeals shall be heard before the Emergency
Preparedness and Safety Commission (“Commission”). As soon as
practicable after receiving the request, the City Clerk shall set a
date for the Commission to hear the appeal, which date shall be not
less than ten (10) calendar days nor more than forty-five (45)
calendar days from the date the appeal was received. The City
Clerk shall give each party written notice of the time and place of
the hearing at least ten (10) calendar days prior to the date of the
hearing, either by causing a copy of the notice to be delivered to
the party personally, or by mailing a copy thereof, postage prepaid,
addressed to each appealing party at the address(es) shown on the
request. Continuances of the appeal hearing may be granted by the
Commission on request of the appealing person for good cause
shown, provided such request is made no later than 24 hours prior
to the scheduled hearing, or upon request of the Building Official or
his or her designee for good cause shown, or on the Commission’s
own motion.

(2) At the time and place set forth in the notice of hearing,
the Commission shall hear the testimony of the appealing
person(s), the Building Official, and/or their witnesses, as well as
any documentary evidence presented by these persons concerning
the order, decision or determination being appealed. Only those
matters or issues specifically raised in the written appeal shall be
considered in the hearing. Appeal hearings are informal, and formal
rules of evidence and discovery do not apply.




(3) Upon the conclusion of the appeal hearing, the
Commission shall, on the basis of the evidence presented at the
hearing, determine whether the order, decision or determination
should be affirmed, modified, or rescinded. A copy of the
Commission’s written decision shall be served upon the appealing
person by first class mail or by personal service. Notwithstanding
any other provision of the Pacifica Municipal Code, the
determination of the Commission shall be final and binding.

(4) If the appellant fails to appear, the Commission shall
cancel the hearing and send a notice thereof to the appellant by
first class mail. A cancellation of a hearing due to non-appearance
of the appellant shall constitute the appellant’'s waiver of the right to
appeal. In such instances, the order, decision or determination of
the Building Official shall be final and binding.

Sec. 8-8.12 - Amendments: Section R113.1 (“Violations: Unlawful Acts”)

Section R113.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R113.1 Unlawful Acts. Irrespective of whether a notice of
violation has been issued pursuant to Section R113.2 of this Code,
it shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect,
construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish, occupy or
maintain any building, structure, equipment, installation or land
regulated by the Technical Codes, or cause or permit the same to
be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of the
Technical Codes.

R113.1.1 Unpermitted Structures. No person shall own,
use, occupy, or maintain an unpermitted structure. For purposes of
this section, “unpermitted structure” shall be defined as any building
or structure, or portion thereof, that was erected, constructed,
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, removed, connected,
converted, demolished, or equipped, at any point in time by any
person, without the required permit(s) having first been obtained
from the Building Official or with a valid permit as issued by the
Building Official which subsequently expired and became null and
void.

Sec. 8-8.13 - Amendments: Section R113.4 (“Violations: Violation
penalties”)

Section R113.4 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:



R113.4 Violation Penalties. Any person, firm or corporation
who violates any provision of the Technical Codes, or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof, or who erects,
constructs, alters, repairs or maintains a building, structure,
installation or equipment in violation of approved construction
documents or directive of the Building Official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of the Technical Codes, shall
be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof
shall be subject to the punishments set forth in Chapter 2 of Title 1
of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Each and every day, or portion thereof, during which any
violation of the Technical Codes occurs or continues constitutes a
separate and distinct offense.

Sec. 8-8.14 — Amendments: Section R115 (“Procedure for legalizing
unpermitted structures”)

Section R115 of the California Residential Code is added to read as follows:

R115 Procedure for Legalizing Unpermitted Structures.

R115.1 Permits. Any person who wishes to legalize an
“unpermitted structure” (as this term is defined in Sections R113.1.1
of this Code), shall obtain all applicable permits. Unpermitted
structures shall comply with all current Technical Code
requirements and other required approvals pursuant to the Pacifica
Municipal Code in order to be legalized.

Permits obtained to legalize unpermitted structures shall
expire as set forth in Section R105.5.1 of this code.

R115.2 Plans.

R115.2.1 Structures. Prior to the issuance or granting of
any permit to legalize an unpermitted structure, plans showing the
plot plan, exterior elevations, existing structures proposed
structures, and proposed finish materials shall be submitted to the
Building Official and Planning Director for review and approval.

R115.2.2 Grading. Prior to the issuance or granting of any
permit to legalize unpermitted grading, a grading and drainage plan
showing the original grade and existing unpermitted grade on the
premises and the existing grade on adjoining properties, and a soils
report shall be submitted to the Building Official and Planning
Director for review and approval.



R1156.3 Inspections. Unpermitted structures or unpermitted
grading for which a permit has subsequently been obtained shall be
subject to inspection by the Building Official in accordance with,
and in the manner prescribed in, the Technical Codes. The
Building Official may require the removal of finish materials in order
to expose framing elements, electrical components, plumbing
fixtures, or mechanical systems, or may require the removal of fill,
to verify that installation, construction, or grading was performed in
conformance with the Technical Codes.

R115.4 Investigation Fees.

R115.4.1 Investigation. Whenever any work for which a
permit is required by this code has commenced on land or in
connection with any type of structure without first obtaining said
permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may
be issued for such work. For purposes of this section, “special
investigation” shall include, but is not limited to, inspecting premises
and structures, reviewing permit, license and other records of the
City or other agencies, reviewing plans, taking photographs,
engaging in conferences and communications with other officials of
the City or other agencies, and engaging in conferences and
communications with owners or other responsible persons
concerning the unpermitted structure or grading.

R115.4.2 Fee. A special investigation fee shall be paid prior
to the issuance of a permit for an unpermitted structure or
unpermitted grading. The fee shall be assessed as provided in
Section R108.4.2 of this chapter..

The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provision of this code nor
from any penalty prescribed by law.

R115.5 Unpermitted Structures Which Cannot be Legalized.

If the Planning Director determines that the City’s zoning
regulations prohibit legalization of any unpermitted structure, the
structure shall be demolished or, if previously permitted, restored to
its original approved condition, with all requisite permits,
inspections and approvals.

If the Building Official determines that an unpermitted
structure cannot be made to conform with current applicable
Technical Code requirements, the structure shall be demolished or,
if previously permitted, restored to its original approved condition,
with all requisite permits, inspections and approvals.



Sec. 8-8.15 — Amendments: Section R202 (“Definitions”)
Section R202 of the California Building Code is amended to include the following:

Building Code. Chapter 1 (“Building Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Mechanical Code. Chapter 2 (“Mechanical Code”) of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Plumbing Code. Chapter 3 (“Plumbing Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Electrical Code. Chapter 4 (“Electrical Code”) of Title 8 (“Building
Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Residential Code. Chapter 8 (“Residential Code”) of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings.
Chapter 5 (“‘Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings”) of Title 8 (“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica
Municipal Code.

Technical Codes. Chapters 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, and 8 of Title 8
(“Building Regulations”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code.

Sec. 8-8.16 — Amendments: Section R313.1 (“Townhouse Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems”)

Section R313.1 of the California Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems.

A. Newly Constructed Buildings and Structures. An
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all newly
constructed townhouses in accordance with the provisions of this

Section.

1. Exception. Detached U-1 occupancies not exceeding
1,000 square feet in size.
B. Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic fire

sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all townhouses when
an addition is added to the building.

1. Exception. When an addition to an R-3 occupancy is
less than 1000 square feet in size and when an addition to all other



occupancies is less than 500 square feet in size, no sprinklers are
required in either the addition or the existing building.

Sec. 8-8.17 — Amendments: Section R313.2 (“One- and Two Family
Dwellings Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems”)

Section R313.2 of the California Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R313.1 One- and Two-Family Dwellings Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems.

A Newly Constructed Buildings and Structures. An
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all newly
constructed one- and two-family dwellings in accordance with the

provisions of this Section.

1. Exception. Detached U-1 occupancies not exceeding
1,000 square feet in size.
B. Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic fire

sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all one- and two-
family dwellings when an addition is added to the building.

1. Exception. When an addition to an R-3 occupancy is
less than 1000 square feet in size and when an addition to all other
occupancies is less than 500 square feet in size, no sprinklers are
required in either the addition or the existing building.

Sec. 8-8.18 — Amendments: Section R905.1.1 (“Requirements for Roof
Coverings: Wood Shakes and/or Shingles Prohibited”)

Section R905.1.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby added to read as
follows:

R905.1.1 Wood Shakes and/or Shingles Prohibited. The use of
wood shakes or wood shingles for roofs on new construction is
prohibited. Existing wood shake or wood shingle roofs may be
recovered or repaired by using fire retardant treated shakes or
shingles. Additions or alterations to existing structures may have
wood shake or wood shingle roofs of fire retardant treated shakes
or shingles if the existing roof covering is of wood shake or shingle
construction.

Sec. 8-8.19 — Amendments: Section R907.5 (“Reroofing: Reinstallation of
Materials”)

Section R907.5 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended by the
addition of the following paragraph:




The use of wood shakes or wood shingles for roofs on new
construction is prohibited. Existing wood shake or wood shingle
roofs may be recovered or repaired by using fire retardant treated
shakes or shingles. Additions or alterations to existing structures
may have wood shake or wood shingle roofs of fire retardant
treated shakes or shingles if the existing roof covering is of wood
shake or shingle construction.

SECTION 10. Article 1 (“California Fire Code”) of Chapter 3 (“Fire Protection”) of
Title 4 (“Public Safety”) of the Pacifica Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its
entirety; however, such repeal shall not affect or excuse any violation of said
chapter that occurred prior to the effective date of this ordinance; nor shall such
repeal impeded, impact, or negate any administrative, civil, or criminal
enforcement of said chapter that that commenced prior to the enforcement date
of this ordinance.

SECTION 11. A new Article 1 (“Fire Code”) of Chapter 3 (“Fire Protection”) of
Title 4 ("Public Safety”) is hereby added to the Pacifica Municipal Code to read

as follows:

ARTICLE 1
FIRE CODE

Sec. 4-3.101 — Adoption of the California Fire Code.

For the purpose of regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of all buildings and structures and grading in the City of
Pacifica, Chapters 1 through 49, including Appendix B (“Fire-Flow Requirements
for Buildings”), Appendix C (“Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution”), Appendix
D (“Fire Apparatus Access Roads”), Appendix F (*Hazard Ranking”), and
Appendix J (“Emergency Responder Radio Coverage”) of that certain Code
designated as the California Residential Code, 2010 Edition [CCR Title 24, Part
9], published by the International Code Council and amended by the State of
California, which is on file in the office of the City Clerk for public record and
inspection, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this chapter as
though set forth in this chapter in full, subject, however, to the amendments,
additions, and deletions set forth in this chapter, and said Code shall be known
as the Building Code for the City.

Sec. 4-3.102 — Establishment and duties of the Bureau of Fire Prevention

(@) The California Fire Code shall be enforced by the Bureau of Fire
Prevention in the Fire Department of the City, which Bureau is hereby
established and which shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire Chief.




(by  The Fire Marshal in charge of the Bureau of Fire Prevention shall be
appointed in accordance with the provisions of Article 4 of Chapter 5 of Title 2 of
this Code and Council Resolution No. 82-69.

(c) The Fire Chief may detail such members of the Fire Department as shall

from time to time be necessary.
Sec. 4-3.103 — Definitions.
Section 201.5 of the California Fire Code is added to read as follows:

201.5 Definitions.

(@)  Wherever the word "jurisdiction" is used in said California
Fire Code, it shall be held to mean the City of Pacifica.

(b)  Wherever the term "Corporation Counsel" is used in said
California Fire Code, it shall be held to mean the City Attorney.

(c) Wherever the words "Fire Code Official' are used in said
California Fire Code, they shall be held to mean the Fire Marshal.

Sec. 4-3.104 - Amendments: Section 3302 (“Dangerous Fireworks
Prohibited”)

Section 3302 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

3302 Dangerous Fireworks Prohibited. Except as hereinafter
provided, it shall be unlawful for any person to possess, store, offer
for sale, expose for sale, sell at retail, or use or explode any
fireworks, except those designated as "safe and sane" and
approved by the State Fire Marshal. No person under the age of
eighteen (18) shall be permitted to purchase or sell "safe and sane"
fireworks. The Fire Chief shall have the power to adopt reasonable
rules and regulations for the granting of permits for supervised
public displays of fireworks by a jurisdiction, fair association,
amusement park, or other organization or for the use of fireworks
by artisans in the pursuit of their trade. Every such use or display
shall be handled by a competent operator approved by the Fire
Chief and shall be of such character and so located, discharged, or
fired so as, in the opinion of the Fire Chief after proper
investigation, not to be hazardous to property or endanger any
person, and shall be in accordance with Chapter 33 of said
California Fire Code.

Sec. 4-3.105 — Amendments: Section 903.2 (“Automatic Sprinkler System”)

Section 903.2 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:



903.2 Required Installations.

A. Newly Constructed Buildings and Structures. An
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in all new
occupancies and locations.

1. Exception. Detached U-1 occupancies not exceeding
1,000 square feet in size.
B. Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic fire

sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings when an
addition is added to the building.

1. Exception. When an addition to an R-1 or R-3
occupancy is less than 1000 square feet in size and when an
addition to all other occupancies is less than 500 square feet in
size, no sprinklers are required in either the addition or the existing

building.

Sec. 4-3.106 — Amendments: Section 2206.1 (“Establishment of limits of
districts in which storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside
aboveground tanks is prohibited”)

Section 2206.1 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding the following
paragraph at the end of the section:

The storage of flammable or combustible liquids in aboveground
outside storage tanks is prohibited in all areas of the city except for
those areas with the zoning designation of Public Facilities District.
Notwithstanding the foregoing, the Fire Chief may grant a permit for
such storage in other areas of the city if the Chief determines, in
each case, that the storage is required for the conduct of a lawful
use upon the property, will not constitute a safety hazard, and will
otherwise comply with all applicable provisions of this code and all
other ordinances, rules and regulations of the city. The Chief may
impose such conditions and requirements upon the issuance of the
permit, as the Chief deems necessary or appropriate.

Sec. 4-3.107 — Amendments: Section 2207.1 (“Establishment of limits in
which storage of liquefied petroleum gases is to be restricted”)

Section 2207.1 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding the following
paragraph at the end of the section:

The aggregate storage of liquefied petroleum gas at any one
installation in excess of two thousand (2,000) gallons is prohibited
in all areas of the city except for those areas with the zoning
designation of Public Facilities District. Notwithstanding the
foregoing, the Fire Chief may grant a permit for such storage in
other areas of the city if the Chief determines, in each case, that the
storage is required for the conduct of a lawful use upon the



property, will not constitute a safety hazard, and will otherwise
comply with all applicable provisions of this code and all other
ordinances, rules and regulations of the city. The Chief may impose
such conditions and requirements upon the issuance of the permit,
as the Chief deems necessary or appropriate.

Section 12. Severability

If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause, or phrase
of this Ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portion of this Ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council hereby declares
that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph,
sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses, or phrases
be declared unconstitutional.

Section 13. Effective Date.

The City Clerk shall cause this ordinance to be published in a newspaper of general
circulation as required pursuant to state law and shall cause this ordinance to be
entered into the Pacifica municipal code.

The foregoing ordinance was introduced on November 8, 2010 and passed and adopted
at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Pacifica held on the 22™ day of
November, 2010 by the following vote:

AYES, Councilmembers: Lancelle, DeJarnatt, Nihart and Digre
NOES, Councilmembers: None

ABSENT, Councilmembers: Vreeland

ABStain, Councilmembers: None

e poy )
o e

“ Sue Digre, Mayor

APPROVED AS TO FORM: ATTEST:

O Kho O Cones

Cecilia Quick, City Attorney Kathly O’Cor@en, City Clerk




