STATE OF CALIFORNIA —~ STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

March 4, 2011

Ana Gonzalez, City Clerk
City of Woodland

300 First Street
Woodland, CA 95695

Dear Ms. Gonzalez:

This letter is to acknowledge receipt on January 10, 2011 of the City of Woodland
submittal pertaining to Ordinance Nos. 1522 and 1523 with findings and is acceptable
for filing. Your filing attests to your understanding that according to Health and Safety
Code Section 17958.7 no modification or change to the California Building Standards
Code shall become effective or operative for any purpose until the finding and the
modification or change have been filed with the California Building Standards
Commission (the Commission).

This letter attests only to the filing of these local modifications with the Commission,
which is not authorized by law to determine the merit of the filing.

As a reminder, local modifications are specific to a particular edition of the Code. They
must be readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the
next triennial edition of the Code is published. In addition, should you receive Fire
Protection District ordinances for ratification, it is required to submit the ratified
ordinances to the Department of Housing and Community Development [H&SC Section
13869.7(c)], attention State Housing Law Program Manager, rather than the’
Commission.

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

ique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings



City of Woodlond

Fire Department Chief / Administration
532 Court Street Operations / Prevention
Woodland CA 95695 530-661-5860 Office

530-661-5869 Fax

December 20, 2010

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833-2936

RE: Filing of local conditions and adopted standards

Please file the attached local Ordinances with findings of local conditions and adopted standards from
the City of Woodland.

The two local Ordinances 1522 and 1523 adopt the California Codes and make amendments which are
more restrictive and reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical
conditions. These Ordinances include the adoption and amendments of the 2010, California Fire Code,
California Building Code, California Plumbing Code, California Electrical Code, California Mechanical
Code, and the California Residential Code.

Please forward the return letter of filing to:

City of Woodland
300 First St.
Woodland, CA 95695
Attn: City Clerk

Any additional questions or comments can be directed to the undersigned. ] ‘

Sincerely,

Russ Cole h
Fire Marshal

':‘: PRINTED ON RECYCLED PAPER Oitg Oé qheeg



ORDINANCE NO. _1522

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOODLAND
AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 9 OF AND ADDING
SECTION 9-9-29 TO THE WOODLAND MUNICIPAL CODE, ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, PART 9), BASED ON THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE
CODE, 2009 EDITION, WITH ERRATA, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, AND THE WHOLE INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE, 2009 EDITION, WITH ERRATA, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, INCLUDING CHAPTER 1, APPENDIX
CHAPTER 4, APPENDIX B, APPENDIX C, APPENDIX D, APPENDIX E,
APPENDIX F, APPENDIX G, APPENDIX H AND APPENDIX J FOR THE
PURPOSE OF PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS
HAZARDOUS TO THE LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE OR EXPLOSION,
TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND
CHANGES THERETO; AMENDING SECTIONS 6-1-2 AND 6-1-9 OF THE
WOODLAND MUNICIPAL CODE AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE
2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND THE 2010 CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, RELATED TO FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS;
AMENDING SECTION 6-1 OF THE WOODLAND MUNICIPAL CODE
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS OF THE 2010
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, THE 2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE, THE 2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE; THE 2010 CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE AND THE 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;
AND AMENDING SECTION 14A-1-3 OF THE WOODLAND MUNICIPAL
CODE RELATED TO NUISANCE ABATEMENT.

‘ WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq.
the City of Woodland (“City”) may adopt by reference the 2010 California Fire Code,
based on the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, with errata, published by
International Code Council (ICC), as adopted by the State of California pursuant to Title
24, Part 9 of the California Code of Regulations; and

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 and 18941.5
authorize cities to adopt the codes contained in Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations with changes and modifications determined to be reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, topographic or geologic conditions; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 50022.1 and California Health & Safety Code
Section 17958.5 and 18941.5, the City is considering the adoption of an ordinance on
December 7, 2010, which proposes the adoption by reference of the 2010 California
Building Code and 2010 Residential Code with the proposed amendments as provided
therein; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the 2010 California Fire Code, based on
the International Fire Code, 2009 Editiox}, with errata, published by International Code



Council (ICC), as adopted by Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of Regulations (“Fire
Code”) with necessary amendments to assure the Fire Code is tailored to the particular
fire protection needs of the City as required by local climatic, topographic and geologic
conditions and assure that a maximum level of fire protection is provided to residents,
businesses and other occupants; and

WHEREAS, the City further desires to make additional necessary amendments to
the 2010 California Building Code to assure that the maximum level of fire protection is
provided to residents, businesses and other occupants; and

WHEREAS, the City further desires to make additional necessary amendments to
the 2010 California Residential Code to assure that the maximum level of fire protection
is provided to residents, businesses and other occupants; and

WHEREAS; the City further desires to adopt administrative provisions of the
2010 California Building Code, the 2010 California Residential Code, the 2010
California Electrical Code and the 2010 California Mechanical Code; and

WHEREAS, the City wishes to correct a cross-reference in Woodland Municipal
Code section 14A-1-3 related to the location of the City’s fire prevention regulations,
including the Fire Code; and

WHEREAS, the City held a public hearing on November 16, 2010 at which time
all interested persons had the opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of
adopting the Fire Code as amended herein and adopting and amending the California
Building Code, California Residential Code, California Plumbing Code, California
Electrical Code and California Mechanical Code as provided herein; and

WHEREAS, the City published notice of the aforementioned public hearing
pursuant to California Government Code Section 6066 on October 29, 2010 and
November 9, 2010; and

WHEREAS, any and all other legal prerequisites relating to the adoption of this
Ordinance have occurred;

The City Council of the City of Woodland does hereby ordain as follows:

1. Purpose. The purpose of this Ordinance is to, amend Sections 6-1, 6-1-2, 6-1-9,
14A-1-3 and certain sections in Chapter 9 of and add Section 9-9-29 to the City of
Woodland Municipal Code, adopting by reference the 2010 California Building
Standards Code, Title 24, California Code of Regulations, Part 9, (California Fire Code),
based on the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, with errata, published by the
International Code Council, and the whole International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, with
errata, published by the International Code Council, including Chapter 1, Appendix
Chapter 4, Appendix B, Appendix C, Appendix D, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix
G, Appendix H, and Appendix J together with certain additions, insertions, deletions and
changes thereto, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions
hazardous to the life and property from fire or explosion; adopting and amending certain



sections of the 2010 California Building Code and the 2010 California Residential Code,
related to fire protection systems; adopting by reference administrative provisions of the
2010 California Building Code, 2010 California Residential Code, 2010 California
Plumbing Code, 2010 California Electrical Code and 2010 California Mechanical Code;
and correcting a cross-reference.

2. Authority. The City Council enacts this Ordinance under the authority granted to
the City as follows:

(@) California Government Code Section 50022 et seq. authorizes the City to
adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code and authorizes the City to
adopt other uniform codes by reference; and

(b)  California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 and 18941.5 authorize
the City to adopt the 2010 California Fire Code, the 2010 California Building Code, and
the 2010 California Residential Code with modifications determined to be reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions.

3. Findings. The City Council hereby finds that the proposed amendments to the
2010 California Fire Code, the 2010 California Building Code, and the 2010 California
Residential Code are more restrictive than the standards adopted by the California
Building Standards Commission, and are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geologic or topographic conditions, based on the express findings and determinations,
marked in relation to the respective amendments provided in this ordinance, described in
“Exhibit A” attached hereto, and hereby adopted by the City Council as the findings to
support the modifications to the 2010 California Fire Code, the 2010 California Building
Code, and the 2010 California Residential Code.

4. Amendment. Section 9-1 through Section 9-9-28 of the Woodland Municipal
Code are hereby amended to read in full as follows:

Sec. 9-1 California Fire Code — Adopted.

There is hereby adopted by the City for the purpose of prescribing regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, explosion, or
hazardous materials, those certain Codes and known as the 2010 California
Building Standards Code, Title 24, California Code of Regulations, Part 9,
(California Fire Code), based on the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, with
errata, published by the International Code Council and the whole International
Fire Code, 2009 Edition, with errata, published by the International Code Council,
including Chapter 1, Appendix Chapter 4, Appendix B, Appendix C, Appendix E,
Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix H and Appendix J save and except such
portions as are deleted, modified or amended by Section 9-9 of this Chapter, of
which Codes one (1) copy has been and is now filed in the office of the City Clerk
of the City of Woodland and the same are hereby adopted and incorporated as
fully as if set out at length herein, and from the date on which this chapter shall
take effect, the provision thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the City.



Sec. 9-2 Establishment and duties of the bureau of fire prevention.

A. The California Fire Code as adopted and amended herein shall be enforced
by the Bureau of Fire Prevention of the Fire Department of the City which is
hereby established and which shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire
Marshal.

B. The Fire Marshal in charge of the Bureau of Fire Prevention shall be
appointed by the Chief of the City on the basis of examination to determine his or
her qualifications for the position.

C. The Chief of the City shall recommend to the City Manager the
employment of technical staff members, who, when such authorization is made,
shall be selected on the basis of examination to determine their qualifications for
the position.

D. The Fire Marshal, members of the Fire Prevention Division, and personnel
assigned as Fire Arson Investigators shall be peace officers and have the powers
as such as established in Section 830.37(a) of the California Penal Code. Other
members of the Fire Department shall be peace officers and have the powers as
such as established in Section 830.37(b) of the California Penal Code.

Sec. 9-3. (Reserved)

Sec. 9-4. Establishment of limits of districts in which the storage of
compressed natural gas is to be prohibited.

The limits referred to in Section 2208.3.2 and 3001.1.1 of the California Fire
Code in which the storage of compressed natural gas storage is prohibited, are
hereby established as follows: The storage of compressed natural gas is restricted
in all zones except highway commercial, service commercial and industrial zones
in the city as defined in the zoning ordinance of the city.

Sec 9-5. Establishment of limits of districts in which the storage of stationary
tanks of flammable cryogenic fluids are to be prohibited.

The limits referred to in Section 3506.2 of the California Fire Code in which the
storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is prohibited is
hereby established as follows: Restricted in all zones except that a use permit may
be granted by the chief for storage in those zones defined in the zoning ordinance
of the city as general commercial, service commercial, highway commercial and
industrial zones.

Sec. 9-6. Establishment of limits in which storage of liquefied petroleum
gases is to be restricted.

The limits referred to in Section 3804.2 of the California Fire Code, in which
storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby established as follows:



The storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted to the highway commercial,
service commercial and industrial zones in the city as defined in the zoning
ordinance of the city. The aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not
exceed two thousand gallons water capacity; except that at the discretion of the
chief after consideration of special features such as topographical conditions,
nature of occupancy and proximity to buildings, capacity of proposed tanks,
degree of private fire protection to be provided and facilities of the fire
department, a permit may be granted for such use.

Sec. 9-7. Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of explosives
and blasting agents to be prohibited.

~ The limits referred to in Section 3301.2 of the California Fire Code as added by
the City of Woodland, in which storage of explosives and blasting agents is
prohibited, are hereby established as follows: Prohibited in all zones defined in
the zoning ordinance of the city except that a permit may be issued for
installations in existence prior to the adoption of the ordinance codified in this
chapter.

Sec. 9-8. Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable or
combustible liquids in outside aboveground tanks; bulk plants or terminals;
and bulk transfer operations is to be prohibited.

A. The limits referred to in Section 3404.2.9.6.1 of the California Fire Code
in which storage of Class I and II liquids in outside aboveground tanks is
prohibited, are hereby established as follows: Prohibited in all zones defined in
the zoning ordinance of the city except that a permit may be issued for
installations in existence prior to the adoption of the ordinance codified in this
chapter.

B. The limits referred to in Section 3406.4.5.1 of the California Fire Code as
added by the City of Woodland in which bulk plants or terminals for flammable
or combustible liquids are prohibited, are hereby established as follows:
Prohibited in all zones defined in the zoning ordinance of the city except that a
permit may be issued for installations in existence prior to the adoption of the
ordinance codified in this chapter.

C. The limits referred to in Section 3406.5.1.1.1 of the California Fire Code
as added by the City of Woodland in which bulk transfer and process transfer
operations of flammable or combustible liquids are prohibited, are hereby
established as follows: Prohibited in all zones defined in the zoning ordinance of
the city except that a permit may be issued for installations in existence prior to
the adoption of the ordinance codified in this chapter.

Sec. 9-9 Amendments.

The California Fire Code, as described above and adopted by reference in Section
9-1, is hereby amended, modified and revised as set forth in this chapter.



Sec. 9-9-1. Section 202 — Definitions.
Section 202 is amended by adding the following definitions as follows:
Fire Marshal. Shall mean the Chief of the bureau of fire prevention.

Jurisdiction. As used in the California Fire Code and International Fire Code
shall be held to mean the City of Woodland.

Sec. 9-9-2. Section 307.1.1 — Prohibited Burning.
Section 307.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

307.1.1 Prohibited burning. Open buming is prohibited in the City of
Woodland. Any burning, open or otherwise that constitutes a nuisance which is
injurious to health, or is indecent or offensive to the senses, or is offensive, or
objectionable because of smoke emissions or when atmospheric conditions or
local circumstance make such fires hazardous shall be prohibited. The fire code
official is authorized to order the extinguishment by the owner, occupant, other
responsible person or the fire department of any burning that creates or adds to a
hazardous or objectionable situation.

Sec. 9-9-3. Section 308.1.4 — Open flame cooking devices.
* Section 308.1.4 is amended by deleting exceptions #2 and #3 to read as follows:

308.3.1 Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and other open-flame
cooking devices shall not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 feet
(3048 mm) of combustible construction.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings.
Sec. 9-9-4. (Reserved)
Sec. 9-9-5. Section 503.1.4 — Access Road Design.
Section 503.1.4 is added to read as follows:

503.1.4 Access Road Design. The fire code official may evaluate access road
designs in terms of total response efficiency. The fire code official is authorized
to make modifications to access road network designs, access road route and
inter-connectivity with new or existing roads so that response efficiency is
maintained

Sec. 9-9-6. Section 503.2.1.1 — Parking of vehicles on fire apparatus access
roads.

Section 503.2.1.1 is added to read as follows:



503.2.1.1 Parking of vehicles on fire apparatus access roads. For the parking of
vehicles on a fire apparatus access road, roadway widths shall be increased to
accommodate the parking of vehicles as follows:

1. Roadways 20 feet (6096 mm) in width, no parking permitted,

2. Roadways 28 feet (8534 mm) in width, parking permitted on one side
only. Parking is permitted on the side of the street absent fire hydrants,
and

3. Roadways 36 feet (10 973 mm) in width when parking is not restricted.
Sec. 9-9-7. Section 503.2.4 — Minimum Turning Radius.
Section 503.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.4 Minimum turning radius. A fire department access road shall have a
minimum standard turning radius of 28 feet (6096 mm) inside and a 48 foot (12
192 mm) outside diameter. This dimension may be increased when determined
by the fire code official.

Sec. 9-9-8. Section 505 — Premises Identification.
Section 505 is deleted in whole and is amended to read as follows:
SECTION 505 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION

505.1.1 Residential dwellings. All residential dwellings shall display a
lighted street number in a prominent location on the street side of the
residence entrance in such a position that the number is easily visible to
approaching emergency vehicles. The numerals shall be no less than four
inches in height. If the house number is located on the garage wall it shall be
on the wall closest to the front entrance.

505.1.2 Commercial buildings. All commercial buildings shall display a lighted
street number in a prominent location, visible from the street. The numerals shall
be no less than six inches in height. This standard may be modified by the Fire
Marshal.

505.3 Directories. When required by the fire code official, complexes with
multiple buildings may be required to provide directories, premises maps and
directional signs. The scale, design and location of directory signs shall be
approved by the fire code official and may be required to be illuminated.

505.3.1 Multiple-family dwelling complex. There shall be positioned at each
entrance of a multiple-family dwelling complex an illuminated diagrammatic
representation of the complex which shows the location of the viewer and the
unit designations within the complex. In addition, each individual unit within



the complex shall display a prominent identification number, not less than
four inches in height and illuminated which is easily visible to approaching
vehicular and/or pedestrian traffic. The scale, design and location of directory
signs shall be approved by the fire code official.

Sec. 9-9-9.  Section 507.6 — Painting of fire hydrants.
Section 507.6 is added to read as follows:

507.6 Painting of fire hydrants. No unauthorized persons shall paint any fire
hydrant in such a manner so as to prevent such hydrant from being immediately
discernible. Appropriate hydrant colors shall be as stated in the most current City
of Woodland Standard Specifications and Details.

Sec. 9-9-10. Section 603.8 — Incinerators.
Section 603.8 is amended to read as follows:

603.8 Incinerators. Commercial and industrial incinerators, and chimneys shall
be constructed in accordance with the California Building Code and the California
Mechanical Code. Free-standing non-commercial incinerators are prohibited in
the City of Woodland.

Sec. 9-9-11. Section 901.6.3 — Resale inspection-residential sprinkler systems.
Section 901.6.3 is added to read as follows:

901.6.3 Resale inspection-residential sprinkler systems. All residential
occupancies up for resale and equipped with a NFPA 13D sprinkler system or
sprinkler system meeting the requirements of the California Residential Code, are
required to be inspected by a representative from the Woodland Fire Department
and all necessary repairs shall be completed prior to the closing of escrow.

Sec. 9-9-12. Section 903.1 — Automatic Sprinkler Systems — General.
Section 903.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.1 General. Automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section and
the following:

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in the occupancies and locations
set forth in this Chapter 9 and in the locations and according to the conditions
described below:

(1)  Inall Group R, Occupancies.
a. Group R, Division 2 multifamily dwelling occupancies not
exceeding 2 stories or more that 5000 square feet may have



@)

€)

automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with
NFPA 13 R.

b. Group R, Division 3 and 4 occupancies shall have
automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with
NFPA 13 D and local amendments.

Group R, Division 3 Occupancies which incur damage to the
structure by fire or other natural or manmade causes which result
in damage to the structure in excess of fifty percent of the assessed
value shall cause the building or structure to have automatic
sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13 D and
local amendments.

In all other buildings in which the total floor area of all floors is
five thousand square feet or more, or any building which are three
or more stories regardless of height.

Exceptions:

1. Group U occupancies,. not including private garages
attached to R-3 Occupancies.

2. In storage and bulk handling facilities for grain, including

grain elevators and flat storage buildings, automatic fire

sprinklers shall not be required in areas where the grain is

stored, provided:

a. An automatic fire extinguishing sprinkler system is not
otherwise required for code compliance,

b. The floor area of the building or structure does not
exceed the maximum basic allowable floor area
permitted for specific types of construction as specified
in Table 503 and including the allowable increases for
clear yard spaces as specified in the California Building
Code, and

c. The construction of the building or structure complies
with all other code provisions for the properly assigned
group occupancy classification and type of
construction.

Fire walls shall not be considered to create a separate occupancy
for the purpose of automatic fire sprinkler systems required under
the provisions of this ordinance. The floor area shall be the total
floor area of the building irrespective of area fire walls as set forth
in California Building Code Section 706.1.

Notwithstanding other provisions of this section, the requirement
described in this Section 903.1 shall be applied to alterations,



repairs, additions and changes of occupancy of existing buildings
as follows:

a. Where there is no change of occupancy, alterations or repairs
not increasing floor area, total height, or number of stories of
an existing building may be made without making the entire
building comply with this section.

b. Buildings classified as other than Group R, Division 3 or 4.
Whenever, after the date of adoption of the ordinance codified
in this section, where an addition or the sum of all additions
made to an existing building or structure increases the floor
area by more than twenty-five percent of the existing building
floor area, or increases the number of stories beyond two, shall
require an automatic fire extinguishing system installed
throughout, including areas not previously protected.

Exception: Buildings not exceeding five thousand square feet
after the addition, or where sprinklers are not otherwise
required by code.

c. Group R, Division 3 and 4 occupancies, including attached
Group U occupancies. Whenever, after the date of adoption of
the ordinance codified in this section, where an addition or the
sum of all additions made to an existing building or structure
increases the floor area by more than fifty percent of the
existing building floor area, or increases the floor area by more
than 1000 square feet, or increases the number of stories
beyond two, shall require an automatic fire extinguishing
system installed throughout, including areas not previously
protected.

d. No change shall be made in the character of the occupancy or
use of any existing building or structure unless the entire
building or structure is made to comply with this section.

Exceptions:

1. The character of the occupancy of existing buildings may
be changed subject to the approval of the building official
and the approval of the fire chief, and the building may
be occupied for purposes in other occupancy groups
without conforming to all the requirements of this section
or the California Building Code for those groups,
provided the new or proposed use is not more hazardous,
based on life and fire risk, than the existing use.

10



2. No change in the character of occupancy of a building
shall be made without a certificate of occupancy, as
required by California Building Code. The building
official may issue a certificate of occupancy pursuant to
the intent of the above exception without certifying that
the building complies with all provisions of this section
and provisions of the California Building Code.

(4)  NFPA 13D Reference in this code to the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) Standard 13D shall refer to the 2010 Edition
of said standard.

a. Section 4.2.1 of NFPA 13D is amended to read as follows:

42,1 All systems shall be hydrostatically tested for leakage at
not less than 200 psi. pressure for thirty minutes.

b. Section 7.6 is amended to read as follows:

7.6 A local water flow alarm shall be provided on all sprinkler
systems. The local alarm shall consist of a listed and approved
exterior Horn/Strobe device installed in a location fronting the
property. The Horn/Strobe shall have a minimum of 110
candela output. An approved interior alarm device shall be
installed and interconnected with all smoke detectors to be
clearly audible in all bedrooms over the background noise
levels with all intervening doors closed.

c. Section 8.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

8.6.3 Sprinklers shall not be required in clothes closets, linen
closets, and pantries that meet all of the following conditions:

(1) The area of the space does not exceed 24 fi2(2.2 m?).
(2) The least dimension does not exceed 3 ft (0.9 m).

(3) The walls and ceilings are surfaced with noncombustible or
limited-combustible materials as defined in NFPA 220,
Standard on Types of Building Construction.

(4) The area is not a utility closet which contains heat or flame
producing appliances, a closet with attic access or a bedroom
closet.

(5)  In other areas and occupancies as required in Section 903 of the
California Building Code.

11



Sec. 9-9-13. Section 903.4.2.1 — Alarms — Outside audible warning devices.
Section 903.4.2.1 is added to read as f(;llows:

903.4.2.1 Outside audible warning devices. Outside audible warning devices
attached to water flow valves shall be of the approved and listed horn/strobe type.

Sec. 9-9-14. Section 907.7.2.1 — Fire alarm circuits.
Section 907.7.2.1 is added to read as follows

907.7.2.1 Fire alarm circuits. A dedicated branch circuit shall be provided for
fire alarm equipment. This circuit shall be energized from the common use area
panel board and shall have no other outlets. The alarm over current protection
(circuit breaker) shall be painted red and labeled as such on the panel directory.

When providing a fire alarm circuit in a multiple occupancy type building
(multiple metering), the circuit shall be energized from the main meter panel
board.

Sec. 9-9-15. Section 907.10 — Sprinkler system installations-manual pull and
alarm panel smoke detection.

Section 907.10 is added to read as follows:

907.10 Sprinkler system installations-manual pull and alarm panel smoke
detection. A manual fire alarm box shall be installed at an approved location to
initiate a fire alarm signal. Smoke detection shall be required in unoccupied
rooms containing fire alarm control panels. Both devices shall activate the fire
alarm control panel and initiate an interior notification appliance which shall
notify occupants in each tenant space.

Sec. 9-9-16. Section 912.3.1.1 — Locking fire department connection caps
required.

Section 912.3.1.1 is added to read as follows:

912.3.1.1 Locking fire department connection caps required. Locking fire
department connection caps shall be required and installed on all new and existing
fire department connections

Sec. 9-9-17. Section 2206.2.3 — Above-ground tanks located outside, above
grade.

Section 2206.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

2206.2.3 Above-ground tanks located outside, above grade.

12



Above-ground tanks shall not be used for automotive fuel dispensing stations
open to the public for retail sales. Above-ground tanks shall not be used for the
storage of Class I, II or ITIA liquid motor fuels except as provided by this section.

Sec. 9-9-18. Section 2208.3.2 — Established limits and maximum capacity.
Section 2208.3.2 is‘added to read as follows:

2208.3.2 Established limits and maximum capacity. The storage of compressed
natural gases is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of
districts in which such storage is prohibited.

Sec. 9-9-19. (Reserved)
Sec. 9-9-20. Section 2703.4 — Material Safety Data Sheets.
Section 2703.4 is amended to read as follows

2703.4 Material Safety Data Sheets. Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS)
shall be readily available on the premises for hazardous materials regulated by
this chapter. When a hazardous substance is developed in a laboratory,
available information shall be documented. The fire code official is
authorized to require the Material Safety Data Sheets be kept in a key box at
an approved location.

Exception: Designated hazardous waste.
Sec. 9-9-21. Section 2704.14 — Enclosures.
Section 2704.14 is added to read as follows:

2704.14 Enclosures. Two means of access shall be provided when an enclosure
is provided on three or more sides of a hazardous material container, tank or
storage area. The two points of access shall be placed a distance apart equal to
not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of
the enclosure. Each access shall be a minimum of three feet in width. -When
provided, the method of locking or securing the enclosure shall be approved by
the fire code official.

Sec. 9-9-22. Section 3001.1.1 — Estgblished limits and maximum capacity.
Section 3001.1.1 is added to read as follows:

3001.1.1 Established limits and maximum capacity. The storage of compressed
natural gases is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of
districts in which such storage is prohibited.

Sec. 9-9-23. Section 3301.2 — Prohibited and Limited Acts.

13



Section 3301.2 is added to read as follows:

3301.2 Prohibited and Limited Acts. Storage of explosive materials is
prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which
such storage is prohibited.

Sec. 9-9-24. Section 3406.4.5.1 — Established limits.
Section 3406.4.5.1 is added to read as follows:

3406.4.5.1 Established limits. Bulk plants or terminals for receiving or storage of
flammable or combustible liquids are prohibited within the limits established by
law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.

Sec. 9-9-25. Section 3406.5.1.1.1 — Established limits.
Section 3406.5.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

3406.5.1.1.1 Established limits. Bulk transfer and process transfer operations for
receiving or transferring flammable or combustible liquids are prohibited within
the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such operations is
prohibited.

Sec. 9-9-26. Division II — Administration.
Chapter 1, Division II - Administration is hereby amended as follows:
A. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of
Woodland, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

B. Section 105.1.4 is added to read as follows:

105.1.4 Sale or delivery without permit. No person shall sell, deliver or cause
to be delivered, any hazardous commodity to any person not in possession of a
valid permit when such permit is required by the provisions of this code.

C. Section 105.3.3 is amended to read as follows:

105.3.3 Occupancy and use, prohibited before approval. The building or
structure shall not be occupied prior to the fire code official issuing a permit
that indicates that applicable provisions of this code have been met. No
appliance, device, equipment, or system shall be operated or used until the
installation has been approved and permitted by the fire code official and all
applicable provisions of this code have been met. It shall be the duty of the
permit applicant or contractor or both to cause the work to remain accessible
and exposed for inspection purposes.

14



D. Section 105.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

105.4.1 Submittals. Construction documents shall be submitted in one or
more sets with each application for a permit and in such form and detail as
required by the fire code official. The construction documents shall be
prepared by a registered design professional where required by the statutes of
the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed. Except as otherwise
determined by the fire code official, plans for the construction, alteration,
repair, or conversion of buildings or portions thereof which are classified as
high-rise buildings, Use Groups A, E, H, I, L and R occupancies, except
Group R-3 occupancies, shall be submitted for review prior to obtaining a
building permit. The Fire Department shall check for compliance with state
and local laws and regulations that relate to fire and life safety.

E. Section 105.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

105.1.1 Permits and fees. Permits required by this code shall be obtained from
the fire code official. Permit fees, if any, shall be paid prior to issuance of the
permits. Issued permits shall be kept on the premises designated therein t all
times and shall be readily available for inspection by the fire code official.

Permit fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule”.

F. Section 108.1 is amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of appeals established. In order to hear and decide appeals of
orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official relative to
the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby
created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be known as the fire
code board of appeals and consistent of the membership appointed by the
council under the provisions of the Building Code in use in the city. The board
of appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and shall hold office at its
pleasure. The Fire Chief shall be an ex officio member of said board but shall
have no vote on any matter before the board. The board shall adopt rules of
procedure as established for the building code board of appeals for conducting
its business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the
appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

The fee for appeals shall be as set forth in the “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule”. Where there is no fee established within the
Fire Prevention Fee Schedule, the fee shall be consistent with the City of
Woodland Building Code and as stipulated in the City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule.

G. Section 108.4 is added to read as follows:

108.4 Procedures for appeals.

15



H.

(a) Whenever the fire code official disapproves an application or refuses to
grant a permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the
code do not apply or that the meaning and the intent of the code have been
misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, an appeal therefore may be taken to
the board of appeal by any person. A written notice of the appeal must be
filed in triplicate, along with any applicable fees for appeal application,
with the office of the Fire Chief within ten days after the date of the
decision or action being appealed, the Fire Chief shall transmit to the
board of appeals all his records pertaining to the decision or action being
appealed.

(b) The filing of the notice of appeal shall stay all proceedings by all
parties in connection with the matter upon which the appeal is taken until
determination of the appeal is hereinafter provided. Notwithstanding the
foregoing, in the event a violation of this code is so imminently dangerous
to life or other property that such condition must be immediately corrected
or isolated, the fire code official may require immediate correction or
abatement of the dangerous condition. In such event, the violator may
appeal any of the matters set forth in subsection (a) and/or the fire code
official’s determination pursuant to this subsection (b) at the public
hearing.

(c) The board of appeals shall set the matter for public hearing not more
than thirty days after the filing of the notice of appeal. The secretary to the
board of appeals shall notify the appellant of the time and place for such
hearing. At the hearing, the appellant and interested person shall be
afforded the opportunity to present written and/oral testimony. The board
of appeals may continue the hearing from time to time.

(d) Notice of the decision of the board of appeals shall be provided by
certified mail to the party initiating the appeal.

(e) A decision of the board of appeals may be appealed to the city council
by an interested party by filing a written notice of appeal with the city
clerk within five days of the date of the mailing of the notice of decision
of the board of appeals. Upon receipt of the notice of appeal, the city clerk
will place the matter before the city council at its next regularly scheduled
meeting. The city council may continue the hearing from time to time.

(f) The city council may reverse, or affirm wholly or partly, or modify any
decision of the board of appeals and may make such decisions as the facts
warrant. The decision of the city council is final.

Section 109.3 is amended to read as follows:

109.3 Violation penalties.

16



Persons who shall violate any provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall
subject the violator to any or all of the following: suit for civil remedy or criminal
penalty, or the administrative penalties provided in Article VII of Chapter 14A of
the Woodland Municipal Code.

The criminal penalty for the first offense shall be punishable as an infraction as
defined by the California Penal Code, as amended from time to time. The criminal
penalty for a second offense or more, shall be punishable as a misdemeanor as
defined by the California Penal Code, as amended from time to time. Each day
that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a
separate offense. Nothing in this paragraph shall be construed as precluding the
application of the administrative penalties provided in Article VII of Chapter 14A
of the Woodland Municipal Code.

Sec. 9-9-27. Appendix B — Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings.
Appendix B Section B105.2 is amended to read as follows:

B105.2 Buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings. The minimum
fire-flow and flow duration for buildings other than one- and two-family
dwellings shall be as specified in Table B105.1.

Exceptions:

1. A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent, as
approved by the fire code official, is allowed when the building is
provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. The resulting fire-flow shall not be
less than 1500—gallons per minute for the prescribed duration as
specified in Table B105.1.

2. Group B, S-2 and U occupancies having a floor area not
exceeding 1,100 square feet (93 m2), primarily constructed of
noncombustible exterior walls with wood or steel roof framing, having
a Class A roof assembly, with used limited to the following or similar
uses:

2.1. California State Parks buildings of an accessory nature
(restrooms).

2.2. Safety roadside rest areas, (SRRA), public restrooms.2.3.
Truck inspection facilities, (TIF), CHP office space and vehicle
inspection bays.

2.4. Sand/salt storage buildings, storage of sand and salt.

17



S.

Sec. 9-9-28. Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution.
Appendix C Section C102.2 is added to read as follows:

C102.2 Hydrants shall be required on both sides of the street whenever one or
more of the following conditions exist:

(a) Streets having median center dividers that make access to hydrants
difficult, cause time delay, and/or create undue hazard.

(b) When traffic loads would make it difficult to detour traffic.
(c) Width of street in excess of 88 feet from curb to curb.

Amendment. Section 9-9-29 is hereby added to the Woodland Municipal Code

to read in full as follows:

6.

Sec. 9-9-29. Section 901.10 Working space and clearance.
Section 901.10 is added to read as follows:

901.10 Working space and clearance. A working space of not less than 30
inches (762 mm) in width, 36 inches (914 mm) in depth and 78 inches (1981 mm)
in height shall be provided in front of fire protection equipment including, but not
limited to: fire sprinkler control valves, fire department connections, hose
connections, risers, hood system manual pull station, fire alarms control panels,
fire pumps, and specialized fire protection storage tanks (dry chemical, foam,
CO2, clean agent). Where the fire protection equipment is wider than 30 inches
(762 mm), the working space shall not be less than the width of the equipment.
No storage of any materials shall be located within the designated working space.
Direct access to the working space shall be provided from aisles or access
roadways. Modifications to the working space dimensions shall be approved by
the fire code official.

Amendment. Section 9-11 of the Woodland Municipal Code is hereby amended

to read in full as follows:

Sec. 9-11. Citation Program - Issnance of Citations.

The fire marshal and designated members of the fire prevention bureau of the
Woodland fire department have the discretionary duty to enforce a statute or
ordinance made pursuant to Sections 853.5 and 853.6 of the State Penal Code and
subject to the provisions hereof.

A person may be arrested without a warrant whenever the fire marshal or
designated members of the fire prevention bureau have reasonable cause to
believe that the person to be arrested has committed, in the their presence, a
violation of a statute or ordinance, which he or she has the discretionary duty to

18



enforce. The fire marshal or designated members of the fire prevention bureau
may issue a notice to appear and to release such a person on his or her written
promise to appear in court pursuant to Sections 853.5 or 853.6 of the State Penal
Code, as applicable.

The fire marshal and designated members of the fire prevention bureau will be the
designated officers of the Woodland fire department to exercise such arrest and
citation authority as to specified violation.

The chief of the Woodland fire department shall establish and cause to be
administered a special enforcement training program designed to instruct those
members of the fire department who will exercise such arrest and citation
authority, regarding the provisions of the statutes and ordinances to be enforced,
the evidentiary prerequisites to proper prosecution for violation thereof, the
appropriate procedures for making arrests or otherwise prudently exercising such
arrest and citation authority and the legal and practical ramifications and
limitation attendant thereto.

The fire marshal and fire prevention designated members of the bureau shall be
appropriately instructed to deposit executed citations or notices within the
appropriate agency for filing with the court after review for legal sufficiency.

7. Amendment. Subsection (h) is hereby added to Section 6-1-2 of the Woodland
Municipal Code to read as follows:

(h) Chapter 9 of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows:
(1)  Section 903.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.1 General. Automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section
and the following:

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in the occupancies and locations
set forth in this Chapter 9 and in the locations and according to the conditions
described below:

1) Inall Gréup R, Occupancies.

a. Group R, Division 2 multifamily dwelling occupancies not
exceeding 2 stories or more that 5000 square feet may have
automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA
13R.

b. Group R, Division 3 and 4 occupancies shall have automatic
sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13 D and
local amendments.

19



@)

Group R, Division 3 Occupancies which incur damage to the
structure by fire or other natural or manmade causes which result
in damage to the structure in excess of fifty percent of the assessed
value shall cause the building or structure to have automatic
sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13 D and
local amendments. -

In all other buildings in which the total floor area of all floors is

five thousand square feet or more, or any building which are three or more
stories regardless of height.

€)

Exceptions:

1. Group U occupancies, not including private garages
attached to R-3 Occupancies.

2. In storage and bulk handling facilities for grain, including
grain elevators and flat storage buildings, automatic fire sprinklers
shall not be required in areas where the grain is stored, provided:

a. An automatic fire extinguishing sprinkler system is not
otherwise required for code compliance,

b. The floor area of the building or structure does not exceed
the maximum basic allowable floor area permitted for
specific types of construction as specified in Table 503 and
including the allowable increases for clear yard spaces as
specified in the California Building Code, and

c. The construction of the building or structure complies with
all other code provisions for the properly assigned group
occupancy classification and type of construction.

Fire walls shall not be considered to create a separate occupancy
for the purpose of automatic fire sprinkler systems required under
the provisions of this ordinance. The floor area shall be the total
floor area of the building respective of area fire walls as set forth in
California Building Code Section 706.1.

Notwithstanding other provisions of this section, the requirement

described in this Section 903.1 shall be applied to alterations, repairs,
additions and changes of occupancy of existing buildings as follows:

a. Where there is no change of occupancy, alterations or repairs
not increasing floor area, total height, or number of stories of
an existing building may be made without making the entire
building comply with this section.

20



b. Buildings classified as other than Group R, Division 3 or 4.
Whenever, after the date of adoption of the ordinance codified
in this section, where an addition or the sum of all additions
made to an existing building or structure increases the floor
area by more than twenty-five percent of the existing building
floor area, or increases the number of stories beyond two, shall
require an automatic fire extinguishing system installed
throughout, including areas not previously protected.

Exception: Buildings not exceeding five thousand square feet
after the addition or where sprinklers are not otherwise
required by code.

c. Group R, Division 3 and 4 occupancies, including attached.
Group U occupancies. Whenever, after the date of adoption of
the ordinance codified in this section, where an addition or the
sum of all additions made to an existing building or structure
increases the floor area by more than fifty percent of the
existing building floor area, or increases the floor area by more
than 1000 square feet, or increases the number of stories
beyond two, shall require an automatic fire extinguishing
system installed throughout, including areas not previously
protected.

d. No change shall be made in the character of the occupancy or
use of any existing building or structure unless the entire
building or structure is made to comply with this section. '

Exceptions:

1. The character of the occupancy of existing buildings may
be changed subject to the approval of the building official and
the approval of the fire chief, and the building may be occupied
for purposes in other occupancy groups without conforming to
all the requirements of this section or the California Building
Code for those groups, provided the new or proposed use is not
more hazardous, based on life and fire risk, than the existing
use.

2. No change in the character of occupancy of a building shall
be made without a certificate of occupancy, as required by
California Building Code. The building official may issue a
certificate of occupancy pursuant to the intent of the above
exception without certifying that the building complies with all
provisions of this section and provisions of the California
Building Code.

21



(4)  NFPA 13D Reference in this code to the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) Standard 13D shall refer to the 2010 Edition of said
standard.

a. Section 4.2.1 of NFPA 13D is amended to read as follows:

4.2.1 All systems shall be hydrostatically tested for leakage at
not less than 200 psi. pressure for thirty minutes.

b. Section 7.6 is amended to read as follows:

7.6 A local water flow alarm shall be provided on all sprinkler
systems. The local alarm shall consist of a listed and approved
exterior Horn/Strobe device installed in a location fronting the
property. The Horn/Strobe shall have a minimum of 110
candela output. An approved interior alarm device shall be
installed and interconnected with all smoke detectors to be
clearly audible in all bedrooms over the background noise
levels with all intervening doors closed.

¢. Section 8.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

8.6.3 Sprinklers shall not be required in clothes closets, linen
closets, and pantries that meet all of the following conditions:

(1) The area of the space does not exceed 24 ft* (2.2 m?).
(2) The least dimension does not exceed 3 ft (0.9 m).

(3) The walls and ceilings are surfaced with noncombustible or
limited-combustible materials as defined in NFPA 220,
Standard on Types of Building Construction.

(4) The area is not a utility closet which contains heat or flame
producing appliances, a closet with attic access or a bedroom
-closet.

(5) In other areas and occupancies as reciuired in Section 903 of the
California Building Code.

(2)  Section 903.4.2.1 is added to read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Outside audible warning devices. Outside audible warning devices
attached to water flow valves shall be of the approved and listed horn/strobe type.

(3)  Section 907.6.2.1 is added to read as follows

22



8.

907.6.2.1 Fire alarm circuits. A dedicated branch circuit shall be provided for
fire alarm equipment. This circuit shall be energized from the common use area
panel board and shall have no other outlets. The alarm over current protection
(circuit breaker) shall be painted red and labeled as such on the panel directory.

When providing a fire alarm circuit in a multiple occupancy type building
(multiple metering), the circuit shall be energized from the main meter panel
board.

(4)  Section 907.9 is added to read as follows:

907.9 Sprinkler system installations-manual pull and alarm panel smoke
detection. A manual fire alarm box shall be installed at an approved location to
initiate a fire alarm signal. Smoke detection shall be required in unoccupied
rooms containing fire alarm control panels. Both devices shall activate the fire
alarm control panel and initiate an interior notification appliance which shall
notify occupants in each tenant space.

(5)  Section 912.3.1.1 is added to read as follows:

912.3.1.1 Locking fire department connection caps required. Locking fire
department connection caps shall be required and installed on all new and existing
fire department connections.

Amendment. Subsection (k) is hereby added to Section 6-1-9 of the Woodland

Municipal Code to read as follows:

9.

(k) In addition to meeting the minimum requirements as set forth in the 2010
California Residential Code as adopted, automatic fire sprinklers shall be
required, extended, modified and meet the provisions as set forth in Section 6-1-2
of Article I, Chapter 6, and Chapter 9 of the City of Woodland Municipal Code
amending sections of the 2010 California Building Code, 2010 California Fire
Code and 2010 NFPA 13D pertaining to residential sprinklers in Group R
occupancies.

Amendment. Subsection (a)(1) is hereby added to Section 6-1 of the Woodland

Municipal Code to read as follows:

10.

(1)  Chapter 1 of the 2010 Edition of the California Building Code is hereby
adopted and included in the Building Code of the City of Woodland.

Amendment. Subsection (b)(1) is hereby added to Section 6-1 of the Woodland

Municipal Code to read as follows:

(1)  Chapter 1 of the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code is hereby
adopted and included in the Residential Code of the City of Woodland.

23



11.  Amendment. Subsection (c)(1) is hereby added to Section 6-1 of the Woodland
Municipal Code to read as follows:

(1)  Article 89 of the 2010 Edition of the California Electrical Code is hereby
adopted and included in the Electrical Code of the City of Woodland.

12. Amendment. Subsection (d)(1) is hereby added to Section 6-1 of the Woodland
Municipal Code to read as follows:

(1) Chapter 1 of the 2010 Edition of the California Mechanical Code is hereby
adopted and included in the Mechanical Code of the City of Woodland.

13. Amendment. Subsection (e)(1) is hereby added to Section 6-1 of the Woodland
Municipal Code to read as follows:

(1)  Chapter 1 of the 2010 Edition of the California Plumbing Code is hereby
adopted and included in the Plumbing Code of the City of Woodland.

14. Amendment. Subdivision (7) of Section 14A-1-3 of the Woodland Municipal
Code is hereby amended by to read as follows:

(7) Any act, omission or condition in violation of Chapters 6, 7, 9, 11, 14, 15, 16
and 25 of this code;

15. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances. All former ordinances or portions of
ordinances conflicting or inconsistent with the provisions of this ordinance or of the
California Fire Code, including applicable portions of Ordinance No. 1489, and any other
ordinance in conflict herewith are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.

16.  Superseding Ordinances. No ordinance adopted after the adoption of this
ordinance shall implicitly supersede or repeal any provision of this ordinance unless that
ordinance expressly indicates an intention to do so. Specifically, Sections 7 through 13
of this Ordinance shall not be implicitly superseded or repealed by any later adopted
ordinance unless that ordinance expressly so provides.

17.  Severability. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause
or phrase added by this Ordinance, or any part thereof, is for any reason held to be
unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective by any court of competent jurisdiction, such
decision shall not affect the validity or effectiveness of the remaining portions of this
Ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council hereby declares that it would have
passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase
thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more subsections, subdivisions,
paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases are declared unconstitutional, invalid or
ineffective. '

18.  Publication. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this ordinance and
shall cause a summary thereof to be published in the Daily Democrat, a newspaper of
general circulation, printed and published in the city of Woodland and county of Yolo, at

24



least five (5) days prior to the meeting at which the proposed ordinance is to be adopted
and shall post a certified copy of the proposed ordinance in the office of the City Clerk,
and with fifteen (15) days of its adoption, shall cause a summary of it to be published,
including the vote for and against the same, and shall post a certified copy of the adopted
ordinance in the office of the City Clerk, in accordance with California Government Code
Section 36933.

19. CEQA. The City Council finds that the changes made to the Fire Code and
Building Code are enacted to mitigate the threats posed to public peace, health and safety
from earthquakes, high winds and fire. Therefore, it can be seen with certainty that
adoption of this Ordinance will not have a significant adverse effect on the environment
and is therefore exempt from California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to Section
15061(b)(3) of the CEQA Guidelines, California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Chapter
3. Staff is directed to file a notice of exemption within five (5) days of the adoption of
this Ordinance.

20.  Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect upon the later of thirty days after
its adoption or January 1, 2011.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Woodland this 16%
day of November 2010, by the following vote:

de and Pimentel

AYES: Council Members Davies, Dote, Marble, )
NOES: None '
ABSENT: None
ABSTAIN: None

Arfémio Pime/n’wf, Mayor

ATTEST:
Ana Gonzalez, Ci@/@

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

oo M

Andrew Morris, City Attorney

25



Exhibit A

Findings to Support Amendments to the
2010 Editions of the California Fire Code, California Building Code and California
Residential Code

This Exhibit A provides the express findings and determinations (where necessary pursuant to
California Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17985.7 and/or 18941.5) justifying the City of
Woodland’s amendments to the 2010 Edition of the California Fire Code, the 2010 Edition of the
California Building Code and the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code (codified in
Title 24 of the California Building Standards Code) as reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geologic or topographic conditions.

CITY OF WOODLAND - PROFILE

The City of Woodland, incorporated in 1871, lies near the heart of the Great Central Valley of
California. It is situated 18 miles to the West of the State Capitol in Sacramento and 81 miles
Northeast of San Francisco. Woodland is the County Seat of Yolo County.

The City of Woodland encompasses an area of approximately 10.5 square miles with a
population in excess of 50,614 based upon 2000 figures as provided by the City of Woodland
Community Development Department. The City of Woodland Fire Department, through a
Contractual Agreement with the Springlake Fire Protection District, also provides fire protection
for approximately 55.5 square miles of rural area surrounding the City, devoted principally to
winter grain and summer row crop farming.

The City is the largest industrial area in Yolo County and has experienced a steady, well-planned
growth. Woodland is also a key area for the many processing and service activities demanded by
the extensive agricultural industries in the region.

Woodland is transcended by several major roadways including Interstate 5 and State Route 113.
California Northern Railway maintains a major North-South rail link through Woodland while
Yolo Shortline Railway also maintains a local spur line in town from Sacramento. Both rails and
highways have created barriers within the town which have significantly affected emergency
response routes.

Sec 9-9 Amendments to California Fire Code

Amendment Fire Code Subject of Amendment Justification
Section, Section (see below
pursuant to Impacted key to

Ord. No. justifications)
9-9-1 202 Adds definitions D

9-9-2 307.1.1 Prohibits burning D




9-9-3 308.3.1 Amends exception to open flame cooking devices | D
9-9-5 Add 503.1.4 | Fire code official authority related to fire access D
road designs
9-9-6 Add Parking of vehicles on fire apparatus access roads | D
503.2.1.1
9-9-7 503.2.4 Regulation of minimum turning radius on fire D
apparatus access roads
9-9-8 505 Regulations regarding premises identification D
9-9-9 Add 507.6 | Painting of fire hydrants D
9-9-10 603.8 Prohibition of free-standing non-commercial D
incinerators
9-9-11 Add 901.6.3 | Resale inspection of residential occupancies with | D
NFPA 13D sprinkler systems
9-9-12 903.1 Regulations regarding installation of automatic A,B,C
sprinkler systems
9-9-13 Add Outside audible alarm warning devices AB,C
903.4.2.1
9-9-14 Add Fire alarm circuits A, B,C
907.7.2.1 ‘
9-9-15 Add 907.10 | Sprinkler system installations A,B,C
9-9-16 Add Locking fire department connection caps D
912.3.1.1
9-9-17 2206.2.3 Use of above-ground tanks D
9-9-18 Add Establish location limits for storage of D
2208.3.2 compressed natural gases
9-9-20 2703.4 Material safety data sheets D
9-9-21 Add Enclosures on hazardous material containers, D
2704.14 access
9-9-22 Add Establish location limits for storage of D
3001.1.1 compressed natural gases
9-9-23 Add 3301.2 | Establish limits regarding location and quantity of | D
explosive materials stored
9-9-24 Add Establish location limits for receiving and storing | D
3406.4.5.1 of flammable or combustible liquids
9-9-25 Add Establish location limits for bulk and process D
3406.5.1.1.1 | transfer operations of flammable or combustible

liquids




9.9-26.A.—H. | 101.1, Administration D
105.1.4,
105.3.3,
105.4.1,
105.1.1,
108.1,
108.4, 109.3
9-9-27 Appendix Fire-flow requirements for buildings A, B,C
B, B105.2
9-9-28 Appendix Fire hydrant locations and distribution D
C,add
C102.2
9-9-29 Add 901.10 | Working space and clearance D
Sec 6-1-2 Amendments to California Building Code
Amendment Building Amendment Justification
Section, Code (see below
pursuant to Section key to
Ord. No. Impacted justifications)
6-1-2(h)(1) 903.1 Regulations regarding installation of automatic A,B,C
sprinkler systems
6-1-2(h)(2) Add Outside audible alarm warning devices A,B,C
903.4.2.1
6-1-2(h)(3) Add Fire alarm circuits A, B, C
907.6.2.1
6-1-2(h)(4) Add 907..9 | Sprinkler system installations-Manual pull and A,B,C
alarm panel smoke detection
6-1-2(h)(5) Add Locking fire department connection caps D
912.3.1.1
Sec 6-1-9 Amendments to California Residential Code
Amendment Residential Amexidment Justification
Section, Code (see below
pursuant to Section key to
Ord. No. Impacted justifications)
6-1-9(k) Chapter Additional minimum requirements A,B,C




R313

Justifications KEY: Findings to Support Amendments to California Fire Code and
California Building Code

A. CLIMATIC CONDITIONS

The climate within the City of Woodland is similar to other areas in California’s Central Valley.
The normal rainfall for Woodland is 17.28 inches. Winter storms are responsible for the heaviest
intensity of precipitation, with 89 percent of total annual precipitation falling between November
and April.

Winds play a major role in Woodland’s climatological make-up. Winter storms bring occasional
strong South winds with speeds up to 45 mph. There are also intermittent Summer periods of dry
North winds when the humidity will drop well below 10 percent, greatly adding to the potential
of a fire conflagration hazard where non-rated wood shake and shingle roof construction
currently exists.

Summer sunshine is in abundance in Woodland, averaging 95 percent of the possible hours of
daylight. The winter months produce 40 percent of possible sunshine affected somewhat by
occasional periods of winter fog, which may persist for several days or weeks at a time.

The average annual temperature for Woodland is 61.5 F with higher temperatures in the mid- to
upper 90°s during the summer months and lows down to the mid- 30’s during the winter months.
The record high of 114 F was recorded in June of 1938 while the record low of 15 F was
established in January of 1937.

Due in part to the winter and spring rains, we generally experience an extensive growth of
vegetation during the spring which dries out each summer creating hazardous fuel conditions.
Because the City is surrounded by farm land, an exposure problem exists during early summer
grain harvest season. Many of the grain fields in the farm land surrounding the City are planted
up to the City limits (in some instances, residential neighborhoods). The proximity of burning
fields to neighborhoods creates a rural interface problem which greatly increases the chance of a
major conflagration if the right conditions exist (low humidity, wind, etc.). Thus, the growth of
vegetation, coupled with dry land grain farming, equates to an explosive fire potential prior to
and during the grain harvest period.

All of Woodland’s water comes from 19 wells which are distributed throughout the City and
interconnected with a gridded main system. The drought years of 1977 and 1978 resulted in
record low water depths which required the lowering of all City pumps from 50 to 75 feet to
maintain an adequate water supply. Drought conditions occurring from 1988 through 1990,
1994, and once again in 2006-2007 placed the subsurface water supply in jeopardy. Additionally,
scarce water supplies during this period caused normal fire hydrant flushing and water main
maintenance to be severely restricted causing potential silting of the existing grid system.




Due to the dependency on subsurface water supplies recharged with winter and spring rains, the
system capacity is a concern, especially as the City expands, putting additional demands on the
entire distribution system. This fact is paramount in the adoption of amendments to the Fire Code
and Building Code related to fire sprinkler systems within the City, in that early detection and
extinguishment through automatic sprinklers is unsurpassed in major fire operations, and
consequently, the application of tens of thousand of gallons of water to control and extinguish a
major conflagration.

B. GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS

Woodland lies in the heart of the great Central Valley of California, 18 miles west of the State
Capitol in Sacramento. This Greater Sacramento Area is one of the fastest growing regions in the
State. Woodland comprises an area of 10.5 square miles. Through a contractual Agreement with
the Springlake Fire Protection District, an additional 55.5 square miles is now the responsibility
of the Woodland Fire Department. Since the Agreement provides for equal fire protection in the
District and the City, staffing and resources are severely stressed if concurrent incidents occur.

The City of Woodland is within an active seismic area. The City is thus subject to moderate to
strong to severe shaking and surface ruptures resulting from earthquake faults located within or
near the City. These local earthquake faults have the potential to cause severe personal and
property damage and fire hazards. Moreover, there is also a potential for damage to roadways,
water supplies and the impairment of access allowing fire equipment to respond to emergencies
in the event of a severe earthquake. Much of Woodland’s downtown area is comprised of
construction dating back to the late 1800’s and early 1900’s. Balloon construction, lack of
accessibility, and buildings built too close together greatly add to the fire extension problem
inherent to this area, especially exacerbated in the event of seismic activity.

The City has also experienced a tremendous growth in the industrial area. Several major
distribution centers have been completed, many exceeding 500,000 square feet, the sheer size of
these buildings and the different commodities they house can quickly overwhelm the
Department’s ability to mitigate an incident of fire caused by any seismic activity.

C. TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITONS

1. Road conditions. Traffic congestion is a growing problem for the City. Its close
proximity to the Sacramento and San Francisco Bay Area metropolitan areas is changing
Woodland from an agricultural to a bedroom community. The impact of current and planned
developments and associated traffic flow will continue to have an effect on response times and
delivery of fire service.

The City is transcended by a major California highway running North-South — Interstate 5. In
addition, California Northern Railroad has a line running North-South, while Yolo Shortline
Railroad has a branch line running East-West. Flammable liquids and hazardous materials are
transported through the City limits by the above-mentioned routes.



The roadway system throughout the City is comprised of surface roads with alley ways running
parallel to the surface roads, but to the rear of the addresses. The alley ways are narrow,
extremely overgrown with vegetation and not provided with protection by fire hydrants.
Accessibility and availability of water are of major concern.

The City derives its water from 19 wells located throughout the City. Due to increased demand
by new development, water conservation is of great importance.

2. Road conditions due to flooding. Woodland is essentially flat with Cache Creek
forming the Northern Boundary of the Springlake Fire Protection District. Cache Creek flooded
during the heavy storms of 1995 closing County Road 98, which is a major artery into town.
Fortunately for Woodland, a majority of the flood waters diverted into a borrow pit along I-5
sparing the Northwest corner of Woodland from a one to two foot projected flooding level and
which would have created significant response problems to this area. However, during major
storms or prolonged rains, some of the streets in the City are actually designed and used for flood
control purposes, thus making fire and emergency access difficult during flood conditions. As a
consequence, many of the streets within the City are impaired during such flood conditions and
such flooding causes physical damage to the streets and the accumulation of debris, all of which
hinder access to fire equipment for the purpose of responding to fire and other emergencies.

D. Administrative/Procedural/Public Safety Amendments.

1. This amendment is necessary for administrative or procedural clarification and to
establish administrative standards for the effective enforcement of the building standards of the
City of Woodland and does not modify a building standard pursuant to California Health &
Safety Code Section 17958, 17958.7, and/or 18941.5.

2. This amendment does not modify a building standard pursuant to California
Health & Safety Code Section 17958, 17958.7, and/or 18941.5 and is reasonably necessary
to safeguard life and property within the City of Woodland.



ORDINANCE NO. 1523

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOODLAND
AMENDING SECTIONS 6-1, 6-1-1, 6-1-2, 6-1-3, 6-1-4, 6-1-5, 6-1-6, 6-1-7, AND 6-1-8 OF
AND ADDING SECTIONS 6-1-9 AND 6-1-10 TO ARTICLE I OF CHAPTER 6 OF THE

WOODLAND MUNICIPAL CODE, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2010 EDITION
OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS, TITLE 24), CONSISTING IN PART OF THE 2010 CALIFORNIA .
BUILDING CODE, THE 2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2010
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE,
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AND THE 2010 CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE; THE 1997 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM CODE FOR
THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS; THE 1997 EDITION OF THE
UNIFORM HOUSING CODE; AND THE 1997 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM
SECURITY CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS,
DELETIONS AND CHANGES THERETO

WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section 50022.1 ef seq. the City
of Woodland (“City”) may adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code, 2010
Edition as provided in Title 24 and 25 of the California Code of Regulations and other codes,
including, without limitation, the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, the
Uniform Housing Code, and the Uniform Security Code; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission (“Commission”) recently
adopted the 2010 Edition of the California Building Standards Code; and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7 and 18941.5 authorize
cities to adopt the California Building Standards Code with modifications determined to be
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the California Building Standards Code with the
necessary amendments to assure the Codes are tailored to the particular safety needs of the City
as required by its unique climatic, geological and topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City held a public hearing on December 7, 2010 at which time all
interested persons had the opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of adopting the
Codes as amended herein; and

* WHEREAS, the City published notice of the aforementioned public hearing pursuant to
California Government Code Section 6066 on November 22, 2010 and November 29, 2010; and

WHEREAS, any and all other legal prerequisites relating to the adoption of this
Ordinance have occurred. '

The City Council of the City of Woodland does hereby ordain as follows:

82093.0000615352544.5



1. Purpose. The purpose of this Ordinance is to amend Sections 6-1, 6-1-1, 6-1-2, 6-1-3, 6-
1-4, 6-1-5, 6-1-6, 6-1-7 and 6-1-8 of and add Sections 6-1-9 and 6-1-10 to the City of Woodland
Municipal Code, adopting by reference the 2010 Edition of the California Building Standards
Code as provided in Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations (“California Building
Standards Code”), including the California Building Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of
Regulations, Tifle 24, Part 2), which incorporates and amends the International Building Code,
2009 Edition, the California Residential Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of Regulations,
Title 24, Part 2.5), which incorporates and amends the International Residential Code, 2009
Edition, California Electrical Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part
3), which incorporates and amends the National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, the California
Mechanical Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 4), which
incorporates and amends the Uniform Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, the California Plumbing
Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 5), which incorporates and
amends the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, the California Green. Building Standards
Code, 2010 Edition (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 11), together with Appendix
G not included in the 2010 California Residential Code and Appendix I not included in the 2010
California Plumbing Code, and with certain additions, insertions, deletions and changes thereto;
adopting by reference the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997
Edition, the Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, and the Uniform Security Code, 1997
Edition, together with certain additions, insertions, deletions and changes thereto, to regulate the
eréction, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair; moving, removal, demolition, conversion,
occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, electrical, plumbing, mechanical, and maintenance of
all buildings or structures in the City of Woodland; provide for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees set forth in the City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee Schedule; and provide
for penalties for the violation of the codes adopted herein.

2. Authority. The City Council enacts this Ordinance under the authority granted to the
City as follows:

@) California Government Code Section 50022 et seq. authorizes the City to adopt
by reference the California Building Standards Code and authorizes the City to adopt other
uniform codes by reference;

(b)  California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 and 18941.5 authorize the City
to adopt the California Building Standards Code with modifications determined to be reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions :

3. Findings. The City Council hereby finds that the proposed amendments to the 2010
California Building Standards Code are more restrictive than the standards adopted by the
California Building Standards Commission, and are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geologic or topographic conditions, based on the express findings and determinations,
marked in relation to the respective amendments provided in this ordinance, described in
“Bxhibit A” attached hereto, and hereby adopted by the City Council as the findings to support
the modifications to the California Building Standards Code.

82093.00006\5352544.5 2



40

Amendment. Article I to Chapter 6 of the City of Woodland Municipal Code is hereby

amended in its entirety by amending Sections 6-1, 6-1-1, 6-1-2, 6-1-3, 6-1-4, 6-1-5, 6-1-6, 6-1-7
and 6-1-8 and adding Sections 6-1-9 and 6-1-10 to read as follows:

CHAPTER 6

BUILDING CODES

Sections:

Article I. General Provisions

6-1  Adoptions of the Codes and Related Appendices

6-1-1 Violation of Codes — Penalties

6-1-2 Amendments to the California Building Code

6-1-3 Amendments to the California Electrical Code

6-1-4 Amendments to the California Mechanical Code

6-1-5 Amendments to the California Plumbing Code

6-1-6 Amendments to the Uniform Code Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
6-1-7 Amendments to the Uniform Housing Code

6-1-8 Amendments to the Uniform Security Code

6-1-9 Amendments to the California Residential Code

6-1-10 Amendments to the California Green Building Standards Code

Sec. 6-1 Adoption of Codes

(a)

(b)

(©

(d

The 2010 Edition of the California Building Code contained in Part 2 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2009 Edition of the
International Building Code published by the International Code Council, is hereby
adopted by reference as the Building Code of the City of Woodland;

The 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code contained in Part 2.5 of Title 24 of
the California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2009 Edition of
the International Residential Code published by the International Code Council, together
with Appendix G, not included in the 2009 California Residential Code, is hereby
adopted by reference as the Residential Code of the City of Woodland;

The 2010 Edition of the California Electrical Code contained in Part 3 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2008 Edition of the
National Electrical Code published by the National Fire Protection Association, is hereby
adopted by reference as the Electrical Code of the City of Woodland;

The 2010 Edition of the California Mechanical Code contained in Part 4 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2009 Edition of the
Uniform Mechanical Code published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials, is hereby adopted by reference as the Mechanical Code of the City
of Woodland;

82093.0000615352544.5 3



©

®

&)

Ly

@

@

The 2010 Edition of the California Plumbing Code contained in Part 5 of Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, which incorporates and amends the 2009 Edition of the
Uniform Plumbing Code published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials, together with and Appendix I, not included in the 2009 California
Plumbing Code, is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Woodland;

The 2010 Edition of the California Green Building Standards contained in Part 11 of Title
24 of the California Code of Regulations is hereby adopted as the Green Building
Standards Code of the City of Woodland;

The Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, published
by the International Conference of Building Officials, is hereby adopted by reference as
the Dangerous Buildings Code of the City;

The Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition published by the International Conference of
Building Officials, as referenced and adopted by the California Department of Housing
and Community Development in Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations pursuant
to Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, 17958.9 and 17959 of the California Health and
Safety Code is hereby adopted by reference as the Housing Code of the City;

The Uniform Security Code, 1997 Edition published by the International Conference of
Building Officials, is hereby adopted by reference as the Security Building Code of the
City;

The above-identified codes in this Section 6-1 (hereinafter collectively referred to as the
"Codes") are adopted for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the erection,
construction, modification, repair, maintenance, demolition, use and occupancy of
buildings and structures. One copy of each of the Codes shall be maintained for use and
examination of the public in the Office of the Building Official.

Sec. 6-1-1 Violation of Codes - Penalties

Violation of any provision of the Codes shall subject the violator to any or all of the
following: suit for civil remedy or criminal penalty, or the administrative penalties
provided in Article VII of Chapter 14A of the Woodland Municipal Code.

The criminal penalty for the first or second offense shall be punishable as an infraction as
defined by the California Penal Code, as amended from time to time. The criminal
penalty for a third offense or more, shall be punishable as a misdemeanor as defined by
the California Penal Code, as amended fiom time to time. Nothing in this paragraph shall
be construed as precluding the application of the administrative penalties provided in
Article VII of Chapter 14A of the Woodland Municipal Code.

See. 6-1-2  Amendments to California Building Code

The provisions of this Section 6-1-2 shall constitute local amendments to the cross-
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Building Code, and shall be

82093.00006\5352544.5 4



@

(b)

©

deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective
provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-2.

Section 105.3 is amended by adding Item 8 at the end of the text of that section to read as
follows: '

“8,  The permittee or his authorized agent shall provide a list of the subcontractors
whose services are required and will be part of the ptime contract. The permittee, who
shall be the owner of the improvements for which the permit is to be issued or the general
contractor who has assumed the prime contract shall be responsible for the fees for all
permits required for the completion of improvements for which the building permit

" applied for is to be issued. None of the forgoing shall be construed to prevent

subcontractors from applying for and receiving permits upon payment of fees in
accordance with other applicable ordinances.”

Section 105.5 is deleted and replaced with the following:

“105.5 Expiration, Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site
authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work.
authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days.
A permit will be considered abandoned if the department has no record of inspections for
a period of 180 days. Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of

 this code shall expire and become null and void two years from the date of issuance, with
the exception of plumbing, electrical, and mechanical repair or alterations, and building

maintenance repairs which shall expire and become null and void one year from the date
of issuance. The building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more
extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.”

Section 108.2 is amended by adding at the end of the text of that section, a new paragraph
to read as follows: ' :

“Permit fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits issued covering work performed on
buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by any City, County, State, Federal
government agency, ot any public agency or district.

In addition, Capital Improvement Facilities Fees shall be as set forth below.

(1) Facilities Fees.

(i) Capital improvement facilities fees are hereby established as a condition of the
issuance of building permits in the city. In addition to the citywide capital
improvement facilities fee (the major projects financing plan fee or “MPFP”), the
Spring Lake infrastructure fee (“SLIF”) is hereby established as a condition of the
issuance of building permits in the Spring Lake specific plan area. The City
Council shall, by separate resolutions, set forth the specific amounts of the MPFP
and the SLIF, identify the specific public improvements to be financed thereby,

82093.00006\5352544.5 5



describe the estimated costs of these facilities, describe the reasonable
relationship between such facilities and the various types of new developments,
and describe the relationship between the need for the public facility and the
vatious types of new developments.

(ii) Facilities fees shszli be paid by each applicant concurrent with the issuance of a
building permit.

(2) Limited Use of Facilities Fees. The revenues raised by payment of these facilities fees
shall be placed in separate and special accounts, and such revenues, along with any
interest earnings on each account, shall be used solely to:

(i) Pay for the City’s future construction of each category of facilities described in
the resolution enacted pursuant to Section 108.2(1)(i) above, or to reimburse the
city for those facilities identified in the resolution which have been constructed by
the city with funds advanced from other sources;

(ii) Reimburse developers who have installed such identified facilities which are
oversized with supplemental size, length, or capacity; or

@ii)Allow temporary borrowing between categories of facilities fee accounts,
consistent with Government Code Section 66006(a).

(3) Supplemental Fees. An applicant may propose a project, the impact upon public
facilities of which, in the judgment of the director of public works, is significantly
greater than that used to calculate the standard fees. The director of public works may
make such a determination on a case-by-case basis and may impose a supplemental
fee on such project.

The determination shall be made based upon the application for a development
permit, or upon the application for a building permit if no development permit is.
required, and any additional information requested by the director of public works.
The director of public works may require the developer to submit engineering data,
calculations, or other project information which is necessaty to make a determination -
pursuant to this paragraph.

(4) Administrative Guidelines, The City Council shall, by resolution, adopt
Administrative Guidelines to provide procedures for the calculation, adjustment,
reimbursement, credit, deferral, or waiver of the Capital Improvement Facilities Fees.
However, in no event shall facilities fees be waived unless an alternative source of
funding to replace the fees has been secured.”

(d)  Section 114 is amended to read as follows:
“Section 114 Violations

114.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure

82093.00006\5352544.5 6



(©)

®

or equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in conflict with ot in
violation of any of the provisions of this code.

114.2 Notice of violation. The building official is authorized to serve a notice of violation
or order on the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, extension,
repair, moving, removal, demolition, or occupancy of a building or structure in violation
of the provisions of this code, or in violation of a permit or certificate issued under the
provisions of this code. Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the illegal action or
condition and the abatement of the violation.

"114.3 Prosecution of violation. If the notice of violation is not complied with prompitly,

the building official is authorized to request the legal counsel of the jurisdiction to institute
the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation,
or to require the removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the building or
structure in violation of the provisions of this code or of the order or direction made

pursuant thereto.

114.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents ot directive of
the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code,
shall be subject to penalties as prescribed in Section 6-1-1 of the Woodland Municipal

Code.”

Section 406.1.3 is amended by adding, at the end of the text of that section, a new
paragraph to read as follows:

“All concrete driveways designed to access Group U occupancies associated with private
garages or carports shall be constructed with the following requirements:

() The minimum thickness of concrete driveway slabs supported directly on the
ground shall not be less than 4 inches.

(i) The minimum conciete mix shall be 5 sacks per cubic yard of concrete.

(iii)The concrete driveway shall be reinforced with not less than No.3 bar at 18 inches
on center in both directions placed at mid height of the slab or an approved
alternate.

(iv) The concrete driveway shall be underlain by a minimum of three inches of gravel
base material.” :

Section 1910.1 is amended by deleting and replacing the first paragraph with a new
paragraph to read as follows:

“1910.1 General. The thickness of concrete floor slabs supported directly on thé ground
shall not be less than 4 inches (101.6 mm). A 10-mil (0.010 inch; 0.25 mm) polyethylene
vapor retarder with joints lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm) shall be placed between

82093.00006\5352544.5 : 7



the base course or subgrade and the concrete floor slab, or other approved equivalent
methods or materials shall be used to retard vapor transmission through the floor slab.
The_minimum concrete mix shall be 5 sacks per cubic yard of concrete. The floor slab
shall be reinforced with a minimum No. 4 bar 18 inches on center in both directions. All
soils having a Plasticity Index (PI) of 15 or greater, determined in accordance with
ASTM D 4318, shall be considered expansive requiring floor slabs designed complying
with CBC 1808.6.2.” : |

(g)  The following local regulation related to asphalt paving (not involving regulations

contained in the California Bilding Standards Code) is hereby adopted to include the
following requirements for asphalt paving: -

@ The minimum structural section of on-site asphalt paving shall be 3 inches
of asphalt concrete over 8 inches of Class IT aggregate base.

(i)  The Class IT aggregate base shall be compacted to a minimum 95% over
subgrade compacted to 92 %.

(iii)  The shipping areas, or other areas paved in anticipation of regular truck

: traffic, the minimum structural section shall be based upon the
recommendations of the certified soils engineering report according to an
appropriate traffic index for the anticipated use.

Sec. 6-1-3 Amendments to California Electrical Code

(@)

The provisions of this Section 6-1-3 shall constitute local amendments to the cross-
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Electrical Code and shall be
deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective
provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-3.

Section 89.108.4.2 is amended by adding, at the end of the text of that section, a new
paragraph to read as follows:

“Permit fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits issued covering work performed on
buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by any City, County, State, Federal
government agency, or any public agency or district.”

Sec, 6-1-4 Amendments to California Mechanical Code

(a)

The provisions of this Section 6-1-4 shall constitute local amendments to the cross- '
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Mechanical Code and shall be
deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective
provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-4.

Section 115.2 is deleted, and is replaced with the following:

82093.00006\5352544.5 8



“Permit fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits issued covering work performed on
buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by any City, County, State, Federal -
government agency, or any public agency or district.” -

Sec. 6-1-5  Amendments to California Plumbing Code

(8)

(b)

(©)

(d)

The provisions of this Section 6-1-5 shall constitute local amendments to the cross-
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, and shall be
deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective
.provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-5.

Section 102.3 is amended to read as follows:
“Section 102.3 Violations and Penalties.

102.3.1 Violations, It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect,
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, demolish, equip, use, or
maintain any plumbing or permit the same to be done in violation of this code.

102.3.2 Penalties. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any provision of this code
shall be subject to penalties as prescribed in Section 6-1-1 of the Woodland Municipal
‘Code.”

Section 103.4.1 is deleted, and is replaced with the following:

“Permit fees and Plan Review fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of
Woodland Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits issued covering work
performed on buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by any City, County,
State, Federal government agency, or any public agency or district.”

Section 103.4.2 is amended by deleting the last paragraph in the section, and replacing it
with the following:

“Permit fees and Plan Review fees for each permit shall be as set forth in the “The City of
Woodland Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits issued covering work
performed on buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by any City, County,
State, Federal government agency, ot any public agency or district.”

Section 609.3 is amended by adding, at the beginning of the text of that section, a new
paragraph to read as follows: '

“Water piping within a building shall not be installed in or under a concrete slab resting
on the ground without prior approval of the Building Official.”

Sec. 6-1-6 Amendments to the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous

Buildings

82093.00006\5352544.5 9



The provisions of this Section 6-1-6 shall constitute local amendments to the oross-
referenced provisions of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings and shall be deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said
Code with the respective provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-6.

(a) Section 201 is amended, by adding at the end of the text of that section, the following new
subsections: '

“201.4 Authority to Disconnect Utilities. The Building Official or the Building
Official's authorized representative shall have the authority to disconnect a utility service
or energy supplied to the building, structure or building equipment therein regulated by
this Code, or the City of Woodland’s Building Code, Residential Code, Mechanical
Code, Plumbing Code, or Electrical Code, in case of emergency where necessary to
climinate an immediate hazard to life or property. The Building Official shall, whenever
possible, notify the serving utility, the owner and occupant of the building, structure or
building service equipment of the decision to disconnect prior to taking such action, and
shall notify such serving utility, owner and occupant of the building, structure or building
service equipment, in writing, of such disconnection immediately thereafter.

201.5 Authority to Condemn Building Service Equipment., When the Building
Official ascertains that building service equipment regulated in the City of Woodland’s
Building Code, Residential Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, or Electrical Code
has become hazardous to life, health, or property, or has become unsanitary, the Building
Official shall order in writing that such equipment either be removed or restored to a safe
or sanitary condition, as appropriate. The written notice itself shall fix a time limit of
compliance with such order. Defective building service equipment shall not be
maintained after receiving such notice,

When such equipment or installation is to be disconnected, a written notice of such
disconnection and causes therefore shall be given within 24 hours to the serving utility,
the owner, and occupant of such building, structure, or premises.

When any building service equipment is maintained in violation of the City of
Woodland’s Building Code, Residential Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, or
Electrical Code; and in violation of a notice issued pursuant to the provisions of this
section, the Building Official shall institute appropriate action to prevent, restrain,
correct, or abate the violation.

201.6 Connection after Order to Disconnect, Persons shall not make connections from
an energy, fuel or power supply nor supply energy or fuel to building service equipment
which has been disconnected or ordered to be disconnected by the Building Official or
the use of which has been ordered to be discontinued by the Building Official until the
Building Official authorizes the reconnection and use of such equipment.”

Sec. 6-1-7 Amendments to Uniform Housing Code

The provisions of this Section shall constitute local amendments to the cross-referenced
provisions of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Housing Code and shall be deemed to

82003,0000615352544.5 10



replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective provisions set forth
in this chapter.

(a)  None.
Sec. 6-1-8 Amendments to Unifox;m Security Code

The provisions of this Section shall constitute local amendments to the 1997 Edition of
the Uniform Security Code.

(a) Section 1020 is hereby added to read as follows:
“Section 1020 Residential Buildings.
(a) Street numbers and other identifying data shall be displayed as follows:

(1) All residential dwellings shall display a lighted street number in a prominent
location on the street side of the residence entrance in such a position that the
number is easily visible to approaching emergency vehicles. The numerals
shall be no less than four inches in height. If the house number is located on
the garage wall it shall be on the wall closest to the front entrance.

(2) There shall be positioned at each entrance of a multiple-family dwelling
complex an illuminated diagrammatic representation of the complex which
shows the location of the viewer and the unit designations within the complex.
In addition, each individual unit within the complex shall display a prominent
identification number, not less than four inches in height and illuminated
which is easily visible to approaching vehicular and/or pedestrian fraffic.

(3) The above two sections may be modified by the Fire Marshal.
(b) Lighting in multiple-family dwellings shall be as follows:

(1) Aisles, passageways, and recesses related to and within the building complex
shall be illuminated with an intensity of at least twenty-five one hundredth
foot-candles at the ground level during the hours of darkness. Lighting devices
shall be protected by weather and vandalism resistant covers.

~ (2) Open parking lots and carpotts shall be provided with a maintained minimum
of one foot-candle of light on the parking surface during the hours of
darkness. Lighting devices shall be protected by weather and vandalism
resistant covers.”

(b) Section 1021 is hereby added to read as follows:

“Section 1021 Commercial Buildings.

82093.00006\5352544.5 11



(2) Windows shall be deemed accessible if less than twelve feet above ground.
Accessible windows having a pane exceeding ninety-six square inches in an area
with the smallest dimension exceeding six inches and not visible from a public or
private thoroughfare shall be protected in the following manner:

(1) Fully tempered glass or burglary resistant glazing (Fire Department approval
required); or

(2) The following window barriers may be used but shall be secured with non-
removable bolts:

(b) Inside or outside iron bars of at least one-half-inch round or one by one-quarter-
inch flat steel material spaced not more than five inches apart and securely
fastened; or

(c) Inside or outside iron or steel grills of at least one-eighth inch material with not
more than a two-inch mesh and securely fastened.

(1) If a side or rear window is of the type that can be opened, it shall, where
applicable, be secured on the inside withl either a slide bar, bolt, crossbar,
auxiliary locking device, and/or padlock with hardened steel shackle, a
minimum four pin tumbler operation.

(2) The protective bars or grills shall not interfere with the operation of opening
windows if such windows are required to be openable by the Building Code or
by the Fire Code for required access openings for firefighting purposes. (Fire
Department approval required).

(d) All exterior transoms exceeding ninety-six square inches on the side and rear of
any building or premises used for business purposes shall be protected by one of
the following:

(1) Fully tempered glass or rated burglary resistant glazing (Fire Department
approval may be required); or .

(2) The following barriers may be used but shall be secured with non-removable
bolts:

i.  Outside iron bars of at least one-half inch round or one by one-quarter-
inch flat steel material, spaced no more than five inches apart and
securely fastened, or

ii.  Outside iron or steel grills of at least one-eighth inch with not more than
a two-inch mesh and securely fastened;

iii.  The protective bars or grills shall not interfere with the operation of
opening the transoms if such transoms are required to be openable by the
Building Code.

82093.00006\5352544.5 12



(e) Roof openings shall be equipped as follows:

(1) All skylights on the roof of any building or premises used for business
purposes shall be provided with:

i. Rated burglary resistant glazing; or

ii. Tron bars of at least one-half-inch round or one by one-fourth-inch flat
steel material under the skylight and securely fastened.

iii. Steel grill of at least one-eighth-inch material with a maximum two-inch
mesh under the skylight and securely fastened. :

(2) All hatchway openings on the roof of any building or premises used for
business purposes shall be secured as follows:

i. If the hatchway is of wooden material, it shall be covered on the inside
with at least sixteen U.S. gauge sheet metal, or its equivalent, attached
with screws.

ii. The hatchway shall be secured from the inside with a slide bar or slide
bolts. (Fire Department approval required.)

iii., Outside hinges on all hatchway openings shall be provided with non-
removable pins when using pin-type hinges.

(3) All air duct or air vent openings exceeding ninety-six square inches on the
roof or exterior walls of any building or premises used for business purposes
shall be secured by covering the same with either of the following:

i. Iron bars on at least one-half inch round or one by one-fourth inch flat
steel matetial spaced no more than five inches apart and securely
fastened; or

ii. Iron or steel grills of at least one-cighth-inch material with a maximum
two-inch mesh and securely fastened.

(4) If the barrier is on the outside, it shall be secured with bolts which are non-
removable from the exterior.

(5) The above (3) and (4) must not interfere with venting requirements creating a
potentlally hazardous condition to health and safety or conflict w1th thie
provisions of the Building Code or Mechanical Code.

(f) Permanenitly affixed ladders leading to roofs shall be fully enclosed with sheet
metal to a height of eight feet. This covering shall be locked against the ladder
with a case hardened hasp, secured with non-removable screws or bolts. Hinges
on the cover shall be provided with non-removable pins when using pin-type

82093.00006\5352544.5 13



hinges. If a padlock is used, it shall have a hardened steel shackle, locking at both
heel and toe, and a minimum five pin tumbler operation with non-removable key
when in an unlocked position.

() A building located within eight feet of utility poles or similar structures which can
be used to gain access to the building's roof, windows, or other openings shall
have such access area barricaded or fenced with materials to deter human

climbing.

(h) The following standards shall apply to lighting, address identification and parking
areas:

(1) The address number of every commercial building shall be internally
illuminated during the hours of darkness so that it shall be easily visible from
the street. The numerals in these numbers shall be no less than six inches in
height. This standard may be modified by the Fire Marshal.

(2) All exterior commercial doors, during the hours of darkness, shall be
illuminated with a minimum of one foot-candle of light. All exterior bulbs
shall be protected by weather and vandalism resistant cover(s).

(3) Open parking lots, and access thereto, providing more than ten parking spaces
and for use by the general public, shall be provided with a maintained
minimum of one foot-candle of light on the parking surface from dusk until
the termination of business every operating day.” St

Sec. 6-1-9 Amendments to the California Residential Code

The provisions of this Section 6-1-9 shall constitute local amendments to the cross-
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code, and shall be
deemed to replace the cross-referenced section in said Code with the respective
provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-9.

(8)  Section R105.3 is amended by adding Item 8 at the end of the text of that section to read
as follows: ‘

“8,  The permittee or his authorized agent shall provide a list of the subcontractors
whose services are required and will be part of the prime contract. The permittee, who
shall be the owner of the improvements for which the permit is to be issued or the general
contractor who has assumed the prime contract shall be responsible for the fees for all
‘permits required for the completion of improvements for which the building permit
applied for is to be issued. None of the forgoing shall be construed to prevent
subcontractors from applying for and receiving permits upon payment of fees in
accordance with other applicable ordinances.” '

(b) Section R105.5 is deleted and replaced with the following:

82093.00006\5352544.5 14




“Section R105.5 Expiration, Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work
on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or
if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period
of 180 days. A permit will be considered abandoned if the department has no record of
inspections for a period of 180 days. Every permit issued by the Building Official under
the provisions of this code shall expire and become null and void two years from the date
of issuance, with the exception of plumbing, electrical, and mechanical repair or
alterations, and building maintenance repairs which shall expire and become null and
void one year from the date of issuance. The building official is authorized to grant, in
writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.”

(©) Section R108.2 is amended to read as follows:

“R108.2 Schedule of permit fees, On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical
and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, the fee for each permit shall be as
set forth in the “The City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee Schedule,” except for permits
issued covering work performed on buildings or structures owned, leased, or operated by
any City, County, State, Federal government agency, or any public agency or district.”

(d)  Section R113 is amended to read as follows:
“Section R113 Violations.

R113.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure -
or equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in conflict with or in
violation of any of the provisions of this code. '

R113.2 Notice of violation. The building official is authorized to serve a notice of
violation or order on the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration,
extension, repair, moving, removal, demolition or occupancy of a building or structure in
violation of the provisions of this code, or in violation of a detail statement or a plan
approved thereunder, or in violation of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions
of this code. Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the illegal action or condition
and the abatement of the violation,

R113.3 Prosecution of violation. If the notice of violation is not complied with in the
time prescribed by such notice, the building official is authorized to request the legal
counsel of-the jurisdiction to institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to
restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require the removal or termination of the
unlawful occupancy of the building or structure in violation of the provisions of this code
or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto.

R113.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or, repairs a
building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of
the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code,

$2093.0000615352544.5 15



©

®

(8)

)

@

shall be subject to penalties as prescribed in Section 6-1-1 of the Woodland Municipal
Code.”

Section R403.1.8 is amended by deleting the “Exception” and replacing with:
“Note: Refer to Section i{506 for alterations, additions, and accessory buildings.”
Section R506 is amended by adding after the section heading:

“Note: This section is limited to alterations, additions, and accessory buildings.”

Section R506.1 is amended to read as follows:

R506.1 General, Concrete slab-on-ground‘ floors shall be a minimum 4 inches
(101.6mm) thick (for expansive soils, see Section R403.1.8). The specified compressive
strength of concrete shall be as set forth in Section R402.2.

Section R506.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

“R506.2.3 Vapor retarder. A 10 mil (0.010 inch; 0.25 mm) polyethylene or approved
vapor retarder with joints lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm) shall be placed between
the concrete floor slab and the base course or the prepared subgrade where no base course

exists.
Exception: The vapor retarder may be omitted:
1. From detached garages, utility buildings and other unheated accessory structures.

2. For unheated storage rooms having an area of less than 70 square feet (6.5 m2) and
carports. '

3. From driveways, walks, patios and other flatwork not likely to be enclosed and heated
at a later date.

4. Where approved by the building official, based on local site conditions.”
Section R506.2.4 of the California Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

“R506.2.4 Reinforcement support. Where provided in slabs on ground, reinforcement
shall be supported to remain in place from the center to upper one third of the slab for the
duration of the concrete placement. Reinforcement shall be a minimum of #4-bar at 18
inches on center in both directions.”

Appendix G, Section AG105.2 is amended by deleting the first sentence of Item 1 and

replacing it with the following:

“],  The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 inches (1524 mm) above grade
measured on the side of the bartier which faces away from the swimming pool.

82093.0000615352544.5 16




Sec, 6-1-10 Amendments to California Green Building Standards Code

The provisions of this Section 6-1-10 shall constitute local amendments to the cross-
referenced provisions of the 2010 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code, and shall be deemed to replace the cross-referenced sectlon in said Code with the
respective provisions set forth in this Section 6-1-10.

(8  None.
5. Severability. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or

phrase added by this Ordinance, or any patt thereof, is for any reason held to be unconstitutional
or invalid or ineffective by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the
validity or effectiveness of the remaining portions of this Ordinance or any part thereof. The
City Council hereby declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more
subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases are declared
unconstitutional, invalid or ineffective.

6. Publication. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this ordinance and shall
cause a summary thereof to be published at least five (5) days prior to the meeting at which the
proposed ordinance is to be adopted and shall post a certified copy of the proposed ordinance in
the office of the City Clerk, and with fifteen (15) days of its adoption, shall cause a summary of
it to be published, including the vote for and against the same, and shall post a certified copy of
the adopted ordinance in the office of the City Cleik, in accordance with California Government
Code Section 36933,

7. Effective Date. This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements,
orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
thirty (30) days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption. '

8. CEQA. The City Council finds that-the changes made to the Codes are enacted to
mitigate the threats posed to public peace, health and safety from earthquakes, high winds and
fire. Therefore, it can be seen with certainty that adoption of this Ordinance will not have a
significant adverse effect on the environment and is therefore exempt from California
Environmental Quality Act pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) of the CEQA Guidelines. Staff is
directed to file a notice of exemption within five (5) days of the adoption of this Ordinance.

82093.00006\5352544.5 17



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Woodland this 7th day of
December 2010, by the following vote: ’

AYES: Council Member Davies, Dote, Marble and Pimentel
NOES: None :
ABSENT: Council Member Monroe
ABSTAIN: ‘None ... © o %

ATTEST:

oG/

Ana B. Gonzalez, City Qler

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Andrew J, Mortis, City Attorney

82093.00006\5352544.5 18



Exhibit A

" Findings to Support Amendments to the
2010 Edition of the Califomia Building Standards Code

This Exhibit A provides the express findings and determinations (where necessary pursuant to
California Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.7 and/or 18941.5) justifying the City of
Woodland’s amendments to the 2010 Edition of the California Building Code, the 2010 Edition
of the California Electrical Code, the 2010 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, the 2010
Edition of the California Plumbing Code and the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code
(codified in Title 24 of the California Building Standards Code) as reasonably necessary because
of local climatic, geologic or topographic conditions.

Sec 6-1-2 Amendments to California Building Code

Amendment Building Code | Amendment Justification
Section, pursuant | Section (see below
to Ord. No. Impacted key to
. ' justifications)
Sec. 6-1-2(a) Section 105.3 | Adds text regarding subcontractors A
and permits
Sec. 6-1-2(b) Section 105.5 | Deletes and replaces the text regarding | A
expiration of permits
Sec. 6-1-2(c) Section 108.2 Adds text authorizing permit fees,as | A
established by separate City Council
resolutions ‘
Sec. 6-1-2(d) Section 114 Amends text regarding violationsand | A
. _ penalties
Sec. 6-1-2(¢) Section 406.1.3 | Adds text regarding concrete B
driveways
| Sec. 6-1-2(f) Section 1910.1 | Deletes and replaces the first B
paragraph regarding concrete floor
slabs
Sec. 6-1-2(g) N/A Adds local language related to asphalt | B
paving

82093.0000615353023.2



water piping

Sec 6-1-3 Amendments to California Electrical Code
Amendment Electrical Code | Amendment Justification
Section, pursuant | Section (see below
to Ord. No. Impacted for
. justifications)
Sec. 6-1-3(a) Section Adds text regarding how permits fees | A
89.108.4.2 are set forth in “The City of Woodland
Comprehensive Fee Schedule”
Sec 6-1-4 Amendments to California Mechanical Code
Amendment Mechanical Amendment Justification
Section, pursuant | Code Section (see below
to Ord. No. Impacted for
' justifications)
Sec. 6-1-4(a) Section 115.2 Deletes text and adds text regarding A
how permits fees are set forth in “The
City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee
Schedule”
Sec 6-1-5 Amendments to California Plumbing Code
Amendment Plumbing Amendment Justification
Section, pursuant | Code Section (see below
to Ord. No. | Impacted for
justifications)
Sec. 6-1-5(a) Section 102.3 Amends text regarding violations and | A
penalties
Sec. 6-1-5(b) Section 103.4.1 | Deletes text and adds text regarding A
how permits fees are set forth in “The
City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee
Schedule”
Sec. 6-1-5(c) Section 103.4.2 | Deletes text and adds text regarding A
how permits fees are set forth in “The
City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee
Schedule”
Sec. 6-1-5(d) Section 609.3 Adds text regarding installation of C

82093.00006\5353023.2




Sec 6-1-9 Amendments to California Residential Code
Amendment Plumbing Amendment Justification
Section, pursuant | Code Section (see below
to Ord. No. Impacted for
justifications)
Sec. 6-1-9(a) Section R105.3 | Adds text regarding subcontractors A
and permits
Sec. 6-1-9(b) Section R105.5 | Deletes and replaces the text regarding | A
expiration of permits
Sec. 6-1-9(c) Section R108.2 | Deletes text and adds text regarding | A
how permits fees are set forth in “The
City of Woodland Comprehensive Fee
. : Schedule”
Sec. 6-1-9(d) Section R113 Amends text regarding violationsand | A
penalties
Sec. 6-1-9(e) Section Deletes text and adds text regarding B
R403.1.8 foundations and floor slabs
Sec. 6-1-9(f) Section R506 Adds text regarding a note that this B
section refers to alterations, additions
and accessory buildings
Sec. 6-1-9(g) Section R506.1 | Deletes and replaces text regarding B
concrete floor slabs
Sec. 6-1-9(h) Section Amends text regarding vapor retarders | B
R506.2.3
Sec. 6-1-9(1) Section Amends text regarding reinforcement |'B
R506.2.4 for ground slabs ‘
Sec. 6-1-9() Appendix G, Amends text regarding barrier around | A
Section outdoor swimming pool
AG105.2

Justifications KEY: Findings to Support Amendments to California Building Code,
California Electrical Code, California Mechanical Code, California Plumbing Code and
California Residential Code

A — This amendment is necessary for administrative clarification, and does not modify a building
standard pursuant to California Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.7 and/or 18941.5.
This amendment establishes administrative standards for the effective enforcement of the

building standards in the City of Woodland.

82093.0000615353023.2




B — This amendment is reasonably necessary because of the following local climatic, geological,
or fopographical conditions:
@) Local soil conditions (clay soils) tend to be highly expansive, thereby

subject to shrinking and swelling during seasonal drying and wetting
conditions, and can cause damage to the foundation and other parts of a

structure;

(ii)  The minimum requirements set forth in the amendment is a more
restrictive standard, which will better avoid damage due to the pumping
action caused by local expansive soils;

@ii) The type and thickness of the materials set forth in the amendment are
more restrictive and will better prevent damage, which can occur from the
local condition of highly expansive soils in the City of Woodland.

C — This amendment is reasonably necessary because of the following local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions: '

® City of Woodland is within an active seismic area; and

(i)  Local soil conditions (clay soils) tend to be highly expansive (i.e.
shrink—swell behavior); and

(iii)  The local climate is characterized by markedly delineated rainy
and dry seasons, which tend to maximize the expansive
characteristics of the soil; and

(iv)  City of Woodland has hard water, which is corrosive to ferrous and
. non-ferrous metals; and

(v)  The ground water table is unusually high in many places;

(vi)  Therefore, restrictions on the installation of water piping in ot
under a concrete slab floor as set forth in the amendment is a more
restrictive standard which will better prevent damage which can
result from these local conditions desctibed here in items (i)

through (v).

82093,0000615353023.2




