STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

June 18, 2014

Joseph Chen

Building and Safety Division
City of Indio

100 Civic Center Mall

Indio, CA 92201

RE: Ordinance #1639
Dear Mr. Chen:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on June 16'2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,
Jique M. Rodriguez—{
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



CITY OF INDIO
100 CIVIC CENTER MALL  INDIO, CA 92201 . -
760.342.6500 » FAX 760.342.6556 « WWW.INDIO:ORG _

R VI |

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, STE 130
Sacramento, CA 95833 - 2936

Re: Technical amendment justification:s to the 2013 California Building Code and
2013 California Residential Code.

Enclosed please find:

¢ City of Indio ordinance adopting the 2013 Building Standards Codes with
amendments.
e Technical justifications to amendments.

Sincerely, =
oF o
U
Plans Examiner rry
Building & Safety Division -

760) 391 4110



ORDINANCE NO. 1639

CRDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO, CALIFORNIA
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013 EDITIONS OF THE CALIFORNIA
ADMINISTRATIVE, HISTORICAL BUILDING, EXISTING BUILDING, ENERGY,
MECHANICAL, PLUMBING, ELECTRICAL, RESIDENTIAL AND GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODES TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN APPENDICES
AND AMENDMENTS THEREFORE, AND AMENDING CHAPTER 151 OF THE
INDIO MUNICIPAL CODE

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Sections 151.001, 151.005, 151.006, 151.010, 151.011,
151.014, 151.015, 151.017, 151.020, 151.025, 151.030, 151.040, 151.041 and
151.050 of Chapter 151 (Buildings) of Title XV (Land Usage) of the Indio Municipal
Code are hereby repealed; provided, however, that such repeal shail not affect or
excuse any violation of any said Chapter or codes occurring prior to the effective
date of the ordinance adopting this provision.

Section 2. A new Section 151.001, 151.005, 151.006. 151.010, 151.011,
151.014, 151.015. 151.017, 151.020, 151.025, 151.030, 151.040, 151.041 and

151.050 are hereby added to Chapter 151 (Buildings) of Title XV (Land Usage) of
the Indio Municipal Code to read as follows:

“CHAPTER 151: BUILDINGS

General Provisions
151.001 Appeals

California Administrative Code

151.005 Adoption of California Administrative Code
1561.006 Conflicting Provisions

Califoria Building Code

151.010 Adoption of California Building Code
151.011 Amendments and additions to Building Code

California Historical Building Code

151.014 Adoption of California Historical Building Code



California Existing Building Code
161.015 Adoption of California Existing Building Code
California Energy Code
1561.017 Adoption of California Energy Code
California Mechanical Code
151.020 Adoption of California Mechanical Code
California Plumbing Code
151.025 Adoption of California Plumbing Code
California Electrical Code
151.030 Adoption of California Electrical Code
California Residential Code

161.040 Adoption of California Residential Code
151.041 Amendments and additions to Residential Code

California Green Building Standards Code
161.050 Adoption
GENERAL PROVISIONS
§ 151.001 APPEALS.

Appeals under this chapter, including appeals as to any decision, order or
determination of an official arising from or relating to the most recent version of the
California Building Codes or any other Codes adopted by this chapter, may be
appealed to the Indio Consolidated Appeals Board in the manner specified with
respect to appeals under Chapter 95B of this code. One purpose of this appellate
provision is to allow due process of law to persons affected by administrative
orders related to the use, maintenance, or change of occupancy of buildings and
structures, including but not limited to requirements governing alteration, additions,
repair, demolition, moving, or vacation.

CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
151.005 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE



The 2013 California Administrative Code (CAC) as published by the
International Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference and shall become the
administrative code of the City of Indio for regulating the erection, construction,
enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion,
occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all buildings and/or
structures in the City. The 2013 California Administrative Code is on file for public
examination in the office of the Building Official.

151.006 CONFLICTING PROVISIONS

In the event of a conflict between any provisions contained in the
Administrative Code and the administrative provisions of the Code of Indio, the
more specific provision shall be given effect, unless another applicable provision is
determined by the Building Official to more fully provide for the public health and
safety and/or that it will more fully promote the intent of the Code of Indio.

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
151.010 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Except as provided in this chapter, the 2013 California Building Code
(CBC), incorporating the 2012 International Building Code, as published by the
International Code Council, and as amended herein, is hereby adopted by
reference and shall become the building code of the City of Indio for regulating the
erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition,
conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all
buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California Building Code is on file
for public examination in the office of the Building Official

161.11 AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO BUILDING CODE

(A) Chapter 1, Section 101.2 Scope, is amended as follows:
101.2. Delete the paragraph entitied “Exception” in its entirety

(B) Chapter 1, Section 101.4.4, is amended to read as follows:

101.4.4 Property maintenance. The provision of all of the adopted codes,
laws and pertinent regulations shall apply to existing structures and premises.

(C) Chapter 1, Section 105.2 is amended by deleting Items (2) and (4) in
their entirety and amending Item (1) under the heading “Building” to read as
follows:



1. Non permanent, one story detached accessory structures used as tool
and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet, may be excluded provided the proposed work meets City
of Indic Zoning regulations.

(D} Chapter 1 Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows:

105.5. Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on
the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time of the work is commenced. The
Building Official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time,
for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in
writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. At the discretion of the Building Official
work shall be considered abandoned whenever substantial progress has not been
made within 180 days from the date of permit issuance or extension, if given.
Every permit issued or extended as part of code enforcement actions shall become
invalid if substantial progress has not been made within the time period determined
by the Building Official.

(E) Chapter 1, Section 107.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

107.3.1 Approval of construction documents. When the Building Official
issues a permit, the construction documents shall be approved in writing, or by
stamp, as "Approved”. One set of construction documents so reviewed shall be
retained by the Building Official. The other set shall be returned to the applicant
and shall be kept at the site of work, and shall be open to inspections by the
Building Official or duly authorized representatives.

(F)  Chapter 1, Section 108.1 is amended to read as follows:

108.1 General. The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for
temporary structures or temporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of
service, but shall not be permitted for more than 180 days or as determined by the
Building Official. The Building Official is authorized to grant extensions for
demonstrated cause.

(G) Chapter 1 Section 109.4 and Section 109.5 are amended to read as
follows:

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Whenever any work
for which a permit is required by this code has been commenced without first
obtaining said permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may be
issued for such work.




109.5 Related fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall
be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee set forth in Section
108.2, The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from
compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed
by law.

(H) Chapter 16, Section 1613.6 is hereby added to read as follows:

1613.6 ASCE 7, Section 12.2.3.1, Exception 3. Modify ASCE 7 Section
12.2.3.1 Exception 3 to read as follows:

3. Detached one and two family dwellings up to two stories in height of light
frame construction.

()  Chapter 18, Section 1807.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood
foundation systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA
PWF. Lumber and plywood shali be treated in accordance with AWPA U1
(Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall be
identified in accordance with Section 2303.1.8.1. Permanent wood foundation
systems shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E
orF.

(J) Chapter 18, Table 1809.7, Footnotes (c) and (g) are hereby deleted
without replacement.

(K) Chapter 18, Section 1809.12 (Timber Footings) is amended to add at
the end of that section the following sentence to read as follows:

Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, Eor F.

(L) Chapter 18, Section 1810.3.2.4 (Timber) is amended to add at the end
of that section the following sentence to read as follows:

Timber deep foundation elements shall not be used in structures assigned
to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE

151.014 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE



The 2013 California Historical Building Code (CHBC) as published by the
International Code Council is hereby adopted by reference and shall become the
historical building code of the City of Indio for regulating the erection, construction,
enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion,
occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all buildings and/or
structure in the City. The 2013 California Historical Building Code is on file for
public examination in the office of the Building Official.

CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE

161.015 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE

The 2013 California Existing Building Code (CEBC), incorporating the 2012
International Existing Building Code, as published by the International Code
Council is hereby adopted by reference and shall become the existing building
code of the City of Indio for regulating the erection, construction, enlargement,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment
use, height, area and maintenance of all buildings and/or structure in the City. The
2013 California Existing Building Code is on file for public examination in the office
of the Building Official.

CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE
151.017 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE

The 2013 California Energy Code (CEC), as published by the International
Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference and shall become the energy code
of the City of Indio for regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment use, height,
area and maintenance of all buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013
California Energy Code is on file for public examination in the office of the Building
Official.

CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE
151.020 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE

The 2013 California Mechanical Code (CMC), incorporating the 2012
Uniform International Mechanical Code, as published by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, is hereby adopted by reference
and shall become the mechanical code of the City of Indio for regulating the
erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition,
conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all
buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California Mechanical Code is on
file for public examination in the office of the Building Official.

6




CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE
151.025 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE

The 2013 Califernia Plumbing Code (CPC), incorporating the 2012
International Plumbing Code, as published by the international Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials is hereby adopted by reference and shali
become the plumbing code of the City of Indio for regulating the erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition,
conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all
buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California Plumbing Code is on file
for public examination in the office of the Building Official.

CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE

151.030 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE

The 2013 California Electrical Code (CEC), incorporating the 2011 National
Electrical Code including all Appendix Chapters published by the National Fire
Protection Association, as modified by the State of California, is hereby adopted by
reference and shall become the electrical code of the City of Indio for regulating
the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal,
demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance
of all buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California Building Codes is
on file for public examination in the office of the Building Official.

CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE
151.040 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

Except as provided in this chapter, the 2013 California Residential Code
(CRC), incorporating the 2012 International Residential Code, as published by the
International Code Council, and as amended herein, is hereby adopted by
reference shall become the residential building code of the City of Indio for
regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and
maintenance of all buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California
Residential Code is on file for public examination in the office of the Building
Official.



151.041 AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO RESIDENTIAL CODE

{A)  Chapter 3, Section R301.1.3.2 (Woodframe structures greater than two
stories) is amended to add at the end of that section the following language
to read as follows:

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved
and stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwelfings
of wood framed construction more than one story in height or with a
basement located in Seismic Design Category Dg, Dy, D3 or E.

(B) Chapter 4, Section R401.1 is amended to read as follows:

R401.1. Appiication. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design
and construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for all buildings. In
addition to the provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of
foundations in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1)
shall meet the provisions of Secticn R322. Wood foundations shall be
designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.

Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be
used for wood foundations only in the following situations:

1. In buildings that have no more than two floors and a roof.

2. When interior basement and foundation walls are constructed at
intervals not exceeding 50 feet (15240 mm).

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Dy, D1, D, shall not be
permitted.

(C) Chapter 4, Section R404.2 is amended to read as follows:

R404.2 Wood foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed
in accordance with the provisions of Section R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with
the details shown in Figures R403.1 (2) and R403.2(3). Wood foundation walls
shall not be used for structures located in Seismic Design Category Dg, D4, D2,

(D) Chapter 6, Table R602.3(1) shall have the following language added to
the table to read as foliows:

Staples shall not be used as wood structural panel fasteners in Seismic
Design Category Dy, D4, D5,

(E) Chapter 6, Table R602.3(2) shall have the following language added to
the table to read as foliows:




Staples shall not be used as wood structural panel fasteners in Seismic
Design Category Dy, D4, D3,

(F)  Chapter 8, Section R803.2.4 is added to read as follows:

Openings in horizentai diaphragms. Openings in horizontal diaphragms
shall conform with Section R503.2,

CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
151.50 ADOPTION

Except as provided in this chapter, those certain building codes known and
designated as the 2013 California Green Building standards Code (CGBC), is
hereby adopted by reference and shall become the green building standards code
of the City of Indio for regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration,
repair, moving, removai, demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment use, height,
area and maintenance of all buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013
California Green Building Standards Code is on file for public examination in the
office of the Building Official.

Section3.-..-Section 151.999 of Chapter 151 (Buildings) of Title XV (Land
Usage) is hereby amended to read as follows:

161.999 PENALTY

(A) Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions or failing
to comply with any of the mandatory requirements of this Chapter or any of the
code adopted herein by reference or who fails to comply therewith, or who violates
or fails to comply with any order made thereunder, or who builds in violation of any
detailed statement of specifications or plans submitted and approved thereunder or
any certificate or permit issued thereunder and from which no appeal has been
taken or who fails to comply with such an order as affirmed or modified by the City
Council or by a court of competent jurisdiction, with the time fixed herein, shall
severally for each and every such violation and noncompliance respectively be
guiity of a misdemeanor. The imposition of one penalty for any violation shall not
excuse the violation or permit it to continue; and any and all such person, firm or
corporation shall be required to correct or remedy the violations or defects within a
reasonable time. Any such person, firm or corporation shall be guilty of a separate
offense for each and every day during which any violation is committed, continued
or permitted. In addition, any violation of any of the codes adopted herein is a
nuisance that may be abated as such pursuant to the provisions of this Municipal
Code.

(B) The application of the penalty set out in division (A) above shall not
be held to prevent the enforced removal of the prohibited condition.



Secticn 4. Severability. If any section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, ciause or phrase of this ordinance or its application to any
person or circumstance, is for any reason heid to be invalid or unenforceable by a
court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unenforceability shall not affect
the validity or -enforceability of the remaining sections, subsections, subdivisions,
paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases of this ordinance, or its application to
any other person or circumstance. The City Council declares that it would have
adopted each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause,
phrase hereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases hereof be declared
invalid or unenforceable,

Section 5. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Ordinance
and shall cause the same to be published or posted in the manner prescribed by
law.

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 6th day of November, 2013, by
the following vote:

AYES: Miller, Torres, Ramos Watson, Wil Holme
NOES: None g

ELAINE HOLMES, MAYOR
ATTEST:

NTHIA HERNANDEZ,
ITY CLERK

10




**** TECHNICAL JUSTIFICATIONS ****

151.010 ADOPTION CF CALIFORMIA BUILDING CODE

Except as provided in this chapter, the 2013 California Building Code
(CBC), incorporating the 2012 International Building Code, as published by the
International Code Council, and as amended herein, is hereby adopted by
reference and shall become the building code of the City of indio for regulating the
erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition,
conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and maintenance of all
buildings and/or structure in the City. The 2013 California Buiiding Code is on file
for public exarninaticn in the office of the Building Official

151.11 AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO BUILDING CODE

(H) Chapter 16, Section 1613.56 is hareby added {o read as foliows:

1613.6 ASCE 7. Section 12.2.3.1, Exception 3. NModify ASCE 7 Section
12.2.3.1 cxception 3 o read as follows:

3. Detached one and two family dwellings up 1o two stories in height of light
frame construction.

Rationale:

Observed damages to one and two family dwellings of light frame construction
after the Northridge Earthquake may have been partially attributed to vertical
irregularities common fo this type of occupancy and construction. In an effort to
improve quality of construction and incorporate lessons leamed from studies after
the Northridge Earthquake, the proposed modification to ASCE 7-05 Section
12.2.3.1b by limiting the number of stories and height of the structure to two stories
will significantly minimize the impact of vertical irregularities and concentration of
inelastic behavior from mixed structural systems. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault
systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the



surrounding area. The proposed modification to limit mixed structural system to
two stories is intended to improve quality of construction by reducing potential
damages that may result from vertical irregularities of the structural system in
buildings subject to high seismic load and therefore need to be incorporated into
the code to assure that new buildings and structures and additions or alterations to
existing buildings or structures are designed and constructed in accordance with
the scope and objectives of the California Building Code.

{n Chapter 18, Section 1807.1.4 is amended to read as foilows:

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood
foundation systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA
PWF. Lumber and plywood shali be treated in accordance with AWPA U1
(Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall be
identified in accordance with Section 2303.1.8.1. Permanent wood foundation
systems shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E
orF.

Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood foundation systems, when they are not
properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly
and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southem Califomia region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood
that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience
relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of
wood-destroying organisms. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Climatic and Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley
region is a densely populated area having buildings and structures constructed
over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent Brawley Earthquake in 2012.
These are the same fault systems that produced the Northridge Earthquake in
1994 where devastated the surrounding area. In addition, the region is within a

2



climate system capable of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,
including but not limited to those caused by the Banning Pass. This region is
susceptible to more active termite and wood attacking insects and microorganisms.
The proposed modification to prohibit the use of wood foundation systems as well
as limit prescriptive design provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or
deficiencies due to the proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore
need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures
and additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the Califomia Building
Code.

(J) Chapier 18, Tabie 1808.7, Fooinotes (c) and (g) are hereby deleted
without renlacement.

Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced footings
are effective in resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of
failure. Therefore, this proposed amendment requires minimum reinforcement in
continuous footings to address the problem of poor performance of plain or under-
reinforced footings during a seismic event. With the higher seismic demand placed
on buildings and structures in this region, precautionary steps are proposed to
reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by following prescriptive
design provisions for footing that does not take into the consideration the
surrounding environment. It was important that the benefit and expertise of a
registered design professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and
take these issues into consideration. This amendment reflects the
recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southem Califonia.
This proposed amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during the
previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault

3



systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the
surrounding area. The proposed modification to limit the use of the prescriptive
design provisions and under-reinforced or plain concrete is to ensure that the
proper analysis of the structure takes into account the surrounding condition and
therefore need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and
structures and additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are
designed and constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the
California Building Code.

() Chapter 18, Seciion 1802.12 {Timber Footings) is amended {0 add at
the end of that section the Tollowing sentence {0 read as follows:

Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, Eor F.

.Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood foundation systems, when they are not
properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly
and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southem Califomia region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood
that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience
relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of
wood-destroying organisms. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Climatic and Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley
region is a densely populated area having buildings and structures constructed
over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012.
These are the same fault systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in
1994 where devastated the surrounding area. In addition, the region is within a
climate system capable of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,

4



including but not limited to those caused by the Banning Pass. This region is
susceptible to more active termite and wood attacking insects and microorganisms.
The proposed modification to prohibit the use of wood foundation systems as well
as limit prescriptive design provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or
deficiencies due to the proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore
need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures
and additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the California Building
Code.

{L) Chapter 8, Section 1810.3.2.4 {Timber) is amended to add 2t the end
of that section the following sentencs to read as follows:

Timber deep foundation elements shall not be used in structures assigned
to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood foundation systems, when they are not
properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly
and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southem California region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood
that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience
relatively rapid decay due fo the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of
wood-destroying organisms. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Climatic and Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley
region is a densely populated area having buildings and structures constructed
over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012.
These are the same fault systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in
1994 where devastated the surrounding area. In addition, the region is within a
climate system capable of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,
including but not limited to those caused by the Banning Pass. This region is
susceptible to more active termite and wood attacking insects and microorganisms.

5



The proposed modification fo prohibit the use of wood foundation systems as well
as limit prescriptive design provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or
deficiencies due to the proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore
need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures
and additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the California Building
Code.

CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE
161.040 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

Except as provided in this chapter, the 2013 California Residential Code
(CRC), incorporating the 2012 International Residential Code, as published by the
International Code Council, and' as amended herein, is hereby adopted by
reference shall become the residential building code of the City of Indio for
regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy equipment use, height, area and
maintenance of all buildings and/or examination in the office of the Building Official.

151.041 AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO RESIDENTIAL CODE

(A) Chapter 3, Section R301.1.3.2 (Woodframe structures greater than two
storiee) is ameaded to add at the end of that section the following language
to read as Iollows:

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved
and stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings
of wood framed consfruction more than one story in height or with &
basement located in Seismic Dasign Category Dy, D¢, Do or E.

Rationale:

After the 1994 Northridge Earthquake, the Wood Frame Construction Joint Task
Force recommended that the quality of wood frame construction need to be greatly
improved. Once such recommendation identified by the Task Force is to improve
the quality and organization of structural plans prepared by the engineer or
architect so that plan examiners, building inspectors, contractors and special
inspectors may logically follow and construct the presentation of the seismic force-
resisting systems in the construction documents. For buildings or structures



located in Seismic Design Category DO, D1, D2 or E that are subject to a greater
level of seismic forces, the requirement tc have a California licensed architect or
engineer prepare the construction documents is intended to minimize or reduce
structural deficiencies that may cause excessive damage or injuries in wood frame
buildings. Structural deficiencies such as plan and vertical irregularities, improper
shear transfer of the seismic force-resisting system, missed details or connections
important to the structural system, and the improper application of the prescriptive
requirements of the California Residential Code can be readily addressed by a
registered design professional.

Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault
systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the
surrounding area. The proposed modification to require construction documents for
wood frame construction greater than one story in height or with a basement to be
approved and stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer is intended to
assure that both the structural design and prescriptive requirement of the code are
properly utilized and presented and therefore need to be incorporated into the code
fo assure that new buildings and structures and additions or alterations to existing
buildings or structures are designed and constructed in accordance with the scope
and objectives of the California Building Code.

(B) Chnanpter 4, Seciion R401.1 is ammended io read as follows:

R401.1. Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design
and construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for all buildings. In
addition to the provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of
foundations in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R3G1.2(1)
shall meet the provisions of Seciion R322. Wood foundations shall be
designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.

cxception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be
used for woed foundations onily in the following situations:

1. in buildings that have no inivre than two flcors and a roof.

2. When interior basement and foundation walls are constructerd at
intervals not exceeding 50 fest {15240 mim).

Woed foundations in Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy, Dy shall not be pernmitied.



Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood foundation systems, when they are not
properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly
and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southem Califomia region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood
that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience
relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of
wood-destroying organisms. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Climatic and Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley
region is a densely populated area having buildings and structures constructed
over and near a vast array of fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012.
These are the same fault systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in
1994 where devastated the surrounding area. In addition, the region is within a
climate system capable of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,
including but not limited to those caused by the Banning Pass. This region is
susceptible to more active termite and wood attacking insects and microorganisms.
The proposed modification to prohibit the use of wood foundation systems as well
as limit prescriptive design provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or
deficiencies due to the proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore
need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures
and additions or alterations fo existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the California Building
Code.

ey M hemrnbnw 4 Camtiomem [PAHE | N - Y WEPIR. U J, | e
(o Chapter 4, Seclion R404.2 iz amended o read as Toliows:

R404.2 YWoed foundation walls. Weod foundation walis shali te constructed
in accordance with the provisions of Section R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with
the details show in Figures R403.1 (2) and R403.2(3). Wood foundation wails

P

shall not be used for structures located in Seismic Design Category Dy, Oy, Dy



Rationale:

No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective
in supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the
soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood foundation systems, when they are not
properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very poorly
and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southem Califomia region and
are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood
that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience
relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience
temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of
wood-destroying organisms. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption cycles.

Findings:

Local Climatic and Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley
region is a densely populated area having buildings and structures constructed
over and near a vast amray of fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes, including but not limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012.
These are the same fault systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in
1994 where devastated the surrounding area. In addition, the region is within a
climate system capable of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,
including but not limited to those caused by the Banning Pass. This region is
susceptible to more active termite and wood aftacking insects and microorganisms.
The proposed modification to prohibit the use of wood foundation systems as well
as limit prescriptive design provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or
deficiencies due to the proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore
need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures
and additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the Califomia Building
Code.

e # > T D -‘” aball @ s $F i Tomtnsionst Tonpnsantom o ool pd 3 4o

() Chapter §, Table R602.3{1} shall have the following language added to
- 11

the table o read as follows:

Stapies shail not be used as wood structural panal fasteners in Seismic
Design C'%tegory Do, 4, Da,



Rationale:

The Structural Engineers Association of Southem Califommia investigated the
damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear
walls or diaphragms that were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That
recommendation was consistent with a report to the Govemor from the Seismic
Safety Commission of the State of Califomia recommending that code
requirements be “‘more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear
values for wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms fastened with staples
are based on monotonic texting and does not take into consideration that
earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and fully reversible
manner.

Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault
systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the
surrounding area. The proposed modification to place design and construction
limits on staples as fasteners used in wood structural panel or diaphragms not
substantiated with cyclic testing will help to maintain minimum quality of
construction and performance standards of structures and therefore need to be
incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures and
additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the California Building
Code.

{£) Chaptler 6, Tabie R5602.3(2) shall have the following language added to
the takie fo read as follows:

Staples shall not be used as weod structural panel fastensrs in Seismic
Design Category Do, Dy, Oy,

Rationale:

The Structural Engineers Association of Southern California investigated the

damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear

10



walls or diaphragms that were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That
recommendation was consistent with a report to the Govemor from the Seismic
Safety Commission of the State of Califomia recommending that code
requirements be ‘more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear
values for wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms fastened with staples
are based on monotonic texting and does not take into consideration that
earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and fully reversible
manner.

Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault
systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the
surrounding area. The proposed modification to place design and construction
limits on staples as fasteners used in wood structural panel or diaphragms not
substantiated with cyclic testing will help to maintain minimum quality of
construction and performance standards of structures and therefore need to be
incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures and
additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the California Building
Code.

(F) Chapter 8, Section R803.2.4 is added io read as follows:

Openings in horizontal diaphragms. Gpenings in horizontal diaphragms
shall conform with Section R503.2.

Rationale:

Section R802 of the Code does not provide any prescriptive criteria to limit the
maximum roof opening size nor does Section R803 provide any details to address
the issue of shear transfer near larger roof openings. With the higher seismic
demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, it is important to ensure
that a complete load path is provided to reduce or eliminate potential damages
caused by aseismic forces. Requiring blocking with metal ties around larger roof
openings and limiting opening size is consistent with the requirements of Sections
R301.2.2.2.5.

11



Findings:

Local Geological Conditions — The greater Coachella Valley region is a densely
populated area having buildings and structures constructed over and near a vast
array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, including but not
limited to the recent Brawley earthquake in 2012. These are the same fault
systems that produced the Northridge earthquake in 1994 where devastated the
surrounding area. The proposed moadification to place design and construction
limits on staples as fasteners used in wood structural panel or diaphragms not
substantiated with cyclic testing will help to maintain minimum quality of
construction and performance standards of structures and therefore need to be
incorporated into the code to assure that new buildings and structures and
additions or alterations to existing buildings or structures are designed and
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the Califomia Building
Code.

12



STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
s e ——— = == — P A AR A AUA T

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

February 21, 2014

Dale Frailey

Fire Marshal

City of Indio Fire Services
46-990 Jackson Street
Indio, CA 92201

RE: Ordinance #1640
Dear Mr. Frailey:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on December 4, 2013.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of loca! code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

}n_cerelyl KJ._K_

JE'grique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



Data Fralle

e Marsha

December 2. 2013

Californiz Building Standards Commissian

STHE G VI S T
SO0 Nawimas P idrive. Spiie 130

Nacramento. Calitforma 95533-2936
Ri Oy of Ingdhio Five Cade Ovdinance
[he City of Indio has adopied the 2013 Edition of the Califorma Fire Code.

The City of Indio has made changes and modifications 1o the 2013 Ediion of the California i
Code that are reasonabhy necessary due 1o local conditions in the € 1[} ;::u.‘.- further advise f.%-‘..':I ;",':;-;.

tions are ol an adiminisimtive or precedural nalurg

remainder of said changes ¢

e R "
concern themselves with subiects not covered h' the Code or are rensom '1" Y NeLes \""‘\ G SaTequan

i al J
Ihe encloss | Resalution. contai “'T“ OUr BNdmes o 1805 15 108 vour fles

3 R P
ce at (7600 34707354

i, please @ dephone this ol

I addinonal informmanion |

sineerely,

Caprain Dal
Fire \{;|r~.n;11



RTERIRTE TN
hENEaX o) ]

TS
i

ORDINANCE MO. 16840

ORDINANCE OF THE CiTY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO, CALIFORNIA,
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013 CALIFDRNIA FIRE CODE TOGETHER
WiTH CERTAIN APPENDICES AND AMENDMENTS THERETO AND AMENDING
CHAPTER 83 OF THE INDIO MUNICIRAL CODE

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF JNDIO CALIFORMiA, DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chanter 83 {Fire Code) of Titie X (General R aulations; of
the indio Municipal Geode is hereby rapealed: providad, howaver, that such repsai sha!l
net affect or exeuse any violation of aav said Chapter or codes ocourring orior to the
gfiacive date of the ordinance adopting this provision

Section 2. A new Unapier 93 (Fire Codel is hereby added 1o Title 1X
(Genera Reguiations) of the stic Muntipal Cods te reed as follows:,

CHAPTER 83 FIRE CODE

T i iy
OELNNN

§2.01 Adoption

g0z Enforcement

93.03 Defintions

23.04 Establishment of geographic bmits in which the storege of Class |

and Class K fiquids inaboveground tanks nutside of bsiigings ars
prohibites

3.08 Esmablishment of geographic fimits in which the storage of iquafied
pelroleum gas is prohibited .

.08 Eslablishment of geographic imits in which the storage of
explusives and blasting agents are prohibited

83.07 Amendments ang Additions 1o the Fire Code

53.08 Fire Agperatus

83.88 Henafty

o3
{42
-y
£

©r

§93.07 ADDPTICA.

Excep! a3 hereinafter provided, the 2073 Calfornia Fire oode, tased on the
2012 International Five Code, published by the international Code Counct, inciuding
Appendic 8, BB, C, CC, E F. G.and | and as amendaed hersin, is hereby adented oy
referenca. In addition, the Fire Chief has promuigated Fire Department Standards ang
Guidalines. which is-ncerporated hersin, angd wasether with the 2013 Californiz Firs
Code are collectively declares as the Fire Code for the City of indic “Fire Coda”). Said
=ire Code s for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing the safeguarding of fifs
ano oroperty from fire and sxpiosion. hazards anzing from ine storage, handling ang
uss of hazardous substances, materials -devices, ang from consitions hazardous o fife

Ingdio Fe {oge Aconiion
el g e

Flepe 1 of 17



and propery B ine ccoupancy of pulidings and premvises as hereir provided and for
nroviding for the issuance of permits. A copy of the Fire Cade shall be maintained in
the office of the City Cierk and shall be mads avatlabie for public inspection.
§ 93.02 ENFORCEMENT.

The Fire Code shall be enforced by the Fire Chie’,

§ 83.03 DEFINITIONS.

Eorthe purpose of this chapier, the foilowing definitions shall appiy unless the
context clearly indicates or recuires & aifferent meaning.

JURISDICTION. The City of Incio.
CORPORATE COUNSEL. The City Attorney for the Gity of Indio.

§93.04 ESTABLISHMENT OF GEOGRAPH!C LIMITS IN WHICH THE STORAGE
OF CLASS | AND CLASS Il LIQUIDS IN ABOVE-GROUND TANKS CUTSIDE OF
BUILDINGS ARE PROHIBITED:

The Ionation referred to in Chapter 57 of the California #ire Code in which storage of
Class | and Class Il liguids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings are prohibited are
heredy as jollows: RL, RM, RH, NC, CC. Ri-M-

§93.05 ESTABLISHMENT OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS IN WHICH THE STORAGE
OF LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GAS 1S PROHIBITED:

The Iccation referred to in Chapter 61 of the California Fre Code in which the
storage of iquefied petroleum gas is prohibited are hereby as foliows: RL, RM, RH. NC,
GC, P, CO. RM-MH, EE

§ 93.06 ESTABLISHMENT OF GECGRAPHIC LIMITS IN WHICH THE STORAGE OF
EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING AGENTS ARE PROHIBITED: -

The losation referred to in Chapter 55 of the Caiifornia Fire Code in which the
starage of explosives and blasting agents are prohibited are hereby s foliows: RL. R,
R NC, CC, P, CO, RM-MH, EE RC
§93.07 AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS 7O THE FIRE CODE

A. Chapter 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION,

i1y Section 101 4 of the Fus Coge is hereby amenaed o raad as
follows.

I . -‘,—', }:"I {‘ar:_f_ on




Saction 101.4 Saverabiity.

if any section. subsaciion, peragraph. semence, Siguse or phrase of
this  ordinance/cods Is for any regson held to be invalid of

unconstitutional, such invalidity er un .zr.rzsumnona?i’a:y shiali not afect
the validity or constitulionality o i the remaining cotions of this

srdinancafoode.

23 Section 102 4 of the Fire Code i herabw amenden {o read as
SO

Section 102.4 Liabiity,

Any lability against the City of Indiv or Riverside County or State of
Californis or any officer or emploves shall be as provided for in ihe
California Govarmnmen: Code and soplicable cass iaw

Suppression, invesiigation and rescue or smergansy medical
ich are RGOS rable shall tz:" in agcordance with Calffornia
Fealth and Safsty Code Saections 13008 and 13008 .1

Any person whe neglgently or iq‘a'at‘s"r*a"rf- or i woiation of aw,
CAUSSE 3n 2MIrgency response, including bui not kmited 1o, 2 traffic
cewient or spi’* of toxic or flammable fiu:as or chemicals, is liable for
inz.2osts of securing such "-”’f“""’“’ﬂ:*.‘. reluding those costs set out in
qu"r"r’““n' Cede Section 53137, &t seg. Any expense ‘z**'“rm'* by the

L E=

fire gepanment for securing such an amergency situation snafl

coneliute & debl of such person end shall s coliactable by the City of
incho, o polifical subdmswn thereof f ingomorated, in the same
manner a3 in the case of 2 obligation undsr contract, expressed or
impliez.

b Bection 1041 of tha Fire Cods & heraby ameanded 1o raad as

radd * * . i Pov- Vg T e § '»‘7...=;'.~,~"'_...’" '] )
Saston 1041 Authority of the Fire Thiel ang the Fire Depariment

¢ to adn z.nsrc" infarpret, and enforce the
: Code. Under the Fire t., fs d're" n, the Riverside
=nt is suthorized 1o anforce ail pradinancas of the

(2) The suppression or exlinguishmeant of dangerous or hazardou

Indic

1"0‘
i



{3} The storags. use. end handbng of hazardous materiais.

4] The instatiation and maintenanse of automatic, manual, and other
private fire alarm systems and fire extingtisring aquipment.

(51 The mainienance end regulation of fire escapes.

{6) The maintenance of firs protection and the eliminalicn of fire
hazards on land and in buiidings. structures, anc oiher property,
inciuding those under cunstruction,

(7% The mamtenance of means of egress,

{8} The investigaiion of the cause. origin, and circumsiance of firg and
unauthorized relsases of hazardous materials.,

{4¢:  Sectior 104.2.1 s hereby added to Fire Cods to read as follows

Section 104.2 1 Permit Feg

A fee shall be charged for eanh permit issued. The fee scheduleshall
bhe estabiishad by the City Councll of the City of Indie.

{51 Section 104.3.2 is hereby acded to Fire Code to read as foliows:

Section 104.3.2 Fire Department Personnel and Peace Cfficers.

1) The Fire Chief and his or her designees are authorized and
directed {o enforce afl applicable State fire iaws and the provisions
of this code and shall perform such related duties as may be fixes
ny the City Council, and for such purposes, he or she shall have the
power of 2 peace cfiicer.

2} The following persens are harsby authorizec to interpret and
enforce the provisions of the indio Fire Code and to make arrests
and issue cuations as authorized by iaw.

1 The Unit Chisf and Peace Ofizers and public officers of the
California Deparlment of Forestry and Fire Protection
ICALEIRES,

2. The Fire Chniel, Peace Cfficers, and Public Officers of the
Riverside County Fire Department

3 Tha Palize Chiet and any Police Officer of any oty served by

-t o e Sefb o 1 b

F’;""”Eﬂ"} ';QL Y Fira e&art"}e' .

4. The Fire Lode Cffizial and members of the Fire Pravention
Bureau that serves the Sity of inzio

§. Cfficers of the California Highway Patrol.

iy ey P e Lt - §
NS0 My Lasls ii‘-.;@'v,f:..,-’,

Page 4 ol *T



5. The iaw enforcemant officars of the Fedara! Sureay of Lang
Managsment '

£ baction 104,5.7 18 hareby adued i the Firs Code (o read as
foliowe:

ublic and lzgel documents, photogrephs, efe.,
aotivities are avallable as authorized _m ‘_.,

thr aug iﬂe Fl ;)wa d‘-‘!ﬁﬂi"s Cusicdian of Racords. Al gosument
requests snallbe in wribing

7y £ AAT 5 T ia b PR ey e » o

{7} beclicn 105.4.7 is hereby added {o the Firz Code 16 r2ad as
foilowe:

o ' P A g I -

dection 1056.4 7 Commencement of Work

T*ze construciion of ingtaliation of any fire grotection system shall not
be permitizd without sppioved plans. Beginning work prior o

approval of ' plang wilt result in & tiple (300°%) permit fee andror

inspection being charged, uniess prior agproval has been giantad by

tha fire code offioial

E. Chapter 2 DEFINITIONS

{1} . ahct;f"".. 202 of the Fre Code i3 hereby amended te inciude the

:v!bwmg e at of definitions:
Section 202 Genesal Definitions

FIRE CHIEF OR CHIEF. 8hall mean the Firs Chigf of the County of
Rivereide ar hisfna authorized representative.

FIRE MARSHAL Tha Supenviser of the Bureau of Fire Pravention,
Shali serve as the Fire Code m: I under the diraction of the Fire

ey
i
Chief or hisg/har authorizaed renrosentative.

HAZARDOUS FIRE AREA. Land other than statz designalsd firs
hazard 's—:-_ae.'sé; «:, andfor loca! desi g’xa?-u FHSZ which is coverad
vith grass, gn“a':" brush, or forest, whather privatsly or wubize-"x- pwneg

ris of such inzcoessible incation tha a T.‘“;‘.
-laf*:x walld present an abnormally diffizull _io:- of
: rasuli In a"«‘a and unusual damags th |
or resuliing amsicw S-::.r: areas are gesignaied on the map

inwg Fire Code Adagiion
FPags hof {7



“Hazardous Fire Areas of Riverside County” on file in the office oi the
Fire Chief,

A& _TERATION OR AL TERED. Any change. addition, or modificaton in
canstruc.‘an of occupancy or structural rapair or change in primary
function: to an existing structure made by, cn behalf of, or for the use

f a public accommodation, or commercial facility or part thereof,
Alterations include, but are not limited 10; remodeiing, renovation,
rehabilitation, reconstruction, historic restoration, fire damage
rastoration, changes or rearrangement of the struciural parts or
elements, and changes or rearrangemsant in the p\an configuration of
walis and full height partitions.

SKY LANTERNS. A unmanned device wiih 2 combustibie fuel
sourse that incorporates an open flame in order to make the device
airborne.

C. Chapter 3 GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

{1} Section 308.1.8,2 is hereby adder! fo the Fire Code 1o r2ad as
follows:

Section 308.1.5.3 Sky Lanterns

No person shall release or cause to be released an untethered sky
lantern.

D. Chapter 4 EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS

(1) A new paragraph {16 is hereby added tc Section 404.2 of the Fire
Code to read as follows:

Secticn 404 2 Where Required

18. Windowless buiidings having an cccupan: load of 50 o mare.
E. Chapter 5§ FIRE SERVICE FEATURES

(1Y Beciinn 802,71 of the Fire Cede s hereby amended to read as
toliows,

P’

Section 5631 Where Required

Where Requirad. Firs apparatus eccess roads shall be provided and
meintainad in accordance with Section 303171 through 503.1.3. The

Cadp Acsption

Pags 80/ 17



Firs Depanmant shall bs the enly zuthority aulnorized 1o desighate
tire lanes,

ire Cougs is hereby amendad to read as

Sk ROV T3 s i sty
Saction 802 2 2 Authornity

e 2 officia! sivali be the only auinotity authorized 10
ueb:ma:: hean:}a 2LUS AT0EST foads, firg lanes, and mogify the

i) wi dgna where they are madeauate for fire or rescues
opgrations

szolion 5033 of the Fire Coda is hershy armented in dd as

o

Sestion 8508 .2 Marking

Fire Apparatus access roads (wheve reguired) shall be identified by
curbs pn*'ﬁe: r-*;— on both the top and 43»&, giong the entire fength of
e apparalus access road. YWhere no curb exists or & rolied cumd
talad, *_” ch witge red sfFip or app ’zwec: oostzd signs appliad
e full iength of ths fire apparatus access road snal be instalied
kings s:-.afi bs rae'ﬁtamﬂq i 2 clean anc ;ﬂg ible condiuen at al!

EXCTEPTION: On schoal grounds this reguiremert shall be
mmemsaniad as approved by the fire (:Odt:: official.

£)  Declon 8041 of the Fire Code is hereby amended lo reac as
ipllows:

Sectior 554 1 Reqguired

Exterior doors and apenings raguired by this code or the Califarnia
a

Bullding Coge shall be maintainzd readiiv accessible 1o i @mergency

access by Ine fire departmant. An approvad access walivay leading
framn the firs apparatus access reads 1o exienor openings shall be

proviga whan *equma oy the firz code official, Finisheo grade st
b= f a' :! t;cn sioia on all sides of the buliding whare ground
i the only means to reach the highest point on the
> exterior. Distance { :,v*. th= buliging shall be "a ARG
&8 oy the fire -.n«:L official. Obstrustions wiill not be

are with ground ladder placamant,




f2; Section 8387 of the Caitfornia Frre Code is hereby amended to
read & ToHOWE:

Saction 505,71 Address identification

New and existing huiidings shal have azproved address numbers,
building numbers o approved puliding KWentification placed in a
pesition: that iz plain’y lagible and visible from the street or road
fronting the property, as anproved by the fire code official. These
numbers shall contrast with ther bacskgroans. Where required by the
fire code official. address numbers, shall be provided in additional
approved locations to faciitate emergency response. Where access is
by means of & private road and the heilding cannot be viewed from
the nublic way. 3 monument, poie of other sign or means as approvecd
by the fire code official shall b2 used tc identfy the structura.

{81 Bection 507.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to
read as folicws:

Section 507 1 Recuired Water Supply

An approved permanent water supply capable of supplying the
required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided by the deveioper
prior to the commencement of construction to all premises upon
which puildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or
moves inte or within the jurisdiction.

(7;  Sexticn 507.5.5 of the California Fire Cede is hersby amended o
read as follows:

Section 5C7.5.5 Clear Space Around Hvydrants

A 3402 clear space shall be maintained arounc the circumference of
the fire hvdrants, fire deparimen: connections, exteriar fire protecticr
gystem control valves, or any other extsrior fire protection system
compenent that may require immediate access, except as atherwise
required or approved.

{8  Section B07.5.7 is hereby added to the Fira Code 1z read as
follows:

Section 5078 7 Hydrant Identification

The fire code aﬁc:a‘ shall designate a spacific type marker devize 1o
be instalied at gach fre hyedrant losation wihin the sitv. Markers shai

Indro Fira Code Azionlion
. cuft &
Page §of 17



e visually indicating fire hydrant location during the daviig gl nuurs
ant hours of darkness.

1. Foreach new frg hydrant instalied, “EE deveinpes, coniracior, or
;:mtaii' shall install 5 marker davice in scoordence with =
tandard methat of instzlistion o f?::ﬂb&u by the fire code Lf‘ oial

2. Any Hydran marke: damaged or removed dur ing the 2 0f
street consiruztion or repair shell be mmed:a!elv rapra" r the
3 contracior, develaper. Or persan responsible far the removal or
damags.
{8y Seclion 87 5.6 s hareby added to the Fire Code 1o read as

e 1 p— ~
TOROWE

Saction $07.5.8 Fira Hydrant Tyoe and V\.

re hydrant tvoe ang number : outiets shall be reguired as
aexe"m ned by the firg codes offiial
Supar Hydrant - Standard, ane 4-inch outler and fwo 7 Vinon
outiets
3uper hyarant — Znhgnoad, teo 4-inch putiets, and one 2 Yein Late)
sutlets.
{1C) Sechon £11 is hereby addad to the Fire Code to read 2s foiows:

Section 511 Fire Depanment Breathing Anparatus Alr Supniy

All bulldings having foors used for human occugancy iocaizd more
then saventy five (75} gt or more above or below he iowes: leve!
of fire department vehicuilar pooss s chall bz equinped with an
a'f';:-r:;vea’ breatning spparatus air rafilin ng system. Such sysiam
hail provide an a“eqkate, prasaurized air supaly through 2
ae::“(anm‘ piping sgszem u_, “the repignishment of zelf contained
- oreathing spparatus camied by nr., suppression, rescue, and oiher
' peraonna! in tha ne,.g.n ancs of their duties. Lacation and
specification of e::casr stations, :md the installation of such
breathing spparatus air refilling svatem shall be mads
ac “c"‘s.“ & with the requil i::"?“‘*?‘v of tha fire code offical.

F. Chapter § EUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEWS

nonior

-4 X



{1 Section 506.10.1.2 ot the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as

gotion 808,150,172 Manua! Qparation

Whizn reguired by the fire code official, aulomatic crossover valves
anai be capable of marua Gp?'anc" The manual vaives shali be
located in an apx:roved ion immediately outside of the
machineny room, ina sac ire meta! Dox requwase,.‘an* marked
as Emergency Controls.

G. Chapter ¢ FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

{1}  Seciion §01.3.7 is hereby added i¢ the Fire Code'to read as
foliows,
Seciion 807 .5 1 Modification

No person shail remove or modify any fire protection system
nstailed or maintained under the provisicns i’:u the California Fue
Code wilnout anproval by the fire coge officia

(2)  Section 202.2 of the Fire Code (s hereby amenued {0 read as
follows:

Section 803 2 Where Reqguired

Ir addition to other provisions of this secticn. an approved
automatic fire sprinkier system shall be instaiied in any huilding or
poriion of 2 buiiding hersafter constructed when the required fire -
fiow exceads 1.50C galions per minute or greaier,

1. To determine the required fire flow, the fire code official shall be
guided by Appendix B and the Insurancea Sarvices Office
methcd
"1 an existing buiiding hereaftar remedaled, or altered
‘alteration) where the required fire ficny exceeds or is changed
“'t’. excead 2 ‘*3{3 anm an automate fire sprinkler sysiem shall
be instalied inascordance with the provisions of this section.
3. Eash porhen c:-’" a hiﬁh, G s&pa:‘a‘""e:i by one or more fire wails
may be consideren 3 senarate firg f?ox:,r calculation arga
;‘- ovided the fire wal are of masonry construction (4 hour fire
reting), contain no apanings and constructad in accordance with
e C.d*ar"fa Building Coce.

[}3

Indip & e ;‘? o Adoption

"”’:"“ Dafiv



One-and-Twa familv dweliings shal! have an automatic fire
sprinkier system regardless of squars "'}Ot'%g@ or required fire
flow In gocardance with the California Residential ~’" Code

2%

(3)  Bection 812.2.1 of the Fire Coda is hareby amendad o read as
7

f:“ne*‘f cennections shall be locaiad in the front access
= of & gs, fully visibie ang racognizabie from the strest or
hearest pomf of fre neoafifnmn ve ,msie ALCESE OY a5 olEnise
: : Thz location of fire denartment
e s

A“E‘:f :’: > T..Ju{\;‘h‘—#r

4";"
a

1. Within 50 feet of an apgrovad reedway or driveway and
arranged sc that hose ines can be readily atiacnead to the iniets
without interference from any nearby objects including buildings
fences, posts, plantings. or other Fire Deparimant connections
and/or othenwisz approved by the Frre Code Dfficial

2. Within 80 feat of an approvaed fire hydram

3. o that the inlet height shall not be less than 24 inches o7 more
than 48 inches sbove grade

4. Guard posts or oiher approved means mav be recuired to
pratact fire dapatment iniel conneclions from vehicuiar
damage,

H. Chapter 34 TIRE REBUILDING AND TIRE STORAGE

i1} Secupn 340510 is heveby adved 1o the Frre Code {o read as

o g pp——
action 3403 10 Dead-End Alsise

No dead-end aisies shall be allowed within the facility.
I. Chapter 56 EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS

(11 SDection BBOB.2 is hereby edded iorest 25 follows:

i3
[+
&
5%

Sestion 5808.2 Safe and Sane Firaworks

§ s sromy AL ey t 5 . - O > o g

s seclion ;g (o read precissly 2s the operative languags of 8§ 101.2
. v, 1 Py PP - 4 ~ 1} Py o~ C S 3 ..
“'-;L-,-;:“ 101.8, inciusive, of Chapter 101 of the City of ingic Code.

Incr Fire Jode Afoption

Pare 110857



Fireworks Defined, Firaworis 10 be regulated pursuant to the permitting
process herein established are those classified by the State Fue Marshai as
“Safe and Sane fireworks,” and includes any fireworks which do not come
within the definition of "dangerous fireworks" or "exempt fireworks,” under
Health and Safety Code Seolion 12508 and 12508.

Appiication for Permil.

{4) Timing. in addition to the requisite license from the State Fire
Marshal pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 12500 et al,,
application must be made to the City Cicrk for a retail sales permit on or
before the last Friday in March of the caiendar year for which the permit i
sought. Permit applications may be obtained from the Cffice of the City
Clerk.

(B) Eligibility and Gramiing of Permits. Eligibility shall orly be open
{0 those tax-exsmpt organizations as dsfined under Code Section 501ic)(2}
of the Internal Ravenue Tode, one parmit per each tax-exempt identification
number. Every year, the Citv Clerk shall raview ali applications for
timeliness and proper qualifications and shall isste a maximum of nine
permits in any given year to qualified, tmely applicants, one of which shali
go to the indic Youth Task Foroe. If the City Clerk shall have in excess of
nine timely applications, the Tlty Clerk shzl! select a total of eight permittees
from the pool of qualified, timely applicanis based on a lottery.

(C) Notice. Applicanis shall be notified of the granting or denial of
the permit on or before the first Monday in May of 2ach calendar year.
Retail sajes of firaworks shail be authorized only diuring the period of 12
noan on the 28th of June through 12 .noon on the Bth of July of the same
calendar year ana such license shall expire at the end of such period. No
temporary fireworks stand may be erected prior to the 18th of June or
remain in place afer the 5th of .luly of the same caiendar year.

Permit £uthority. The City Clerk may grant or deny the issuance of a
permit for erection of a temporary firewerks stand and the retall sales of
fireworks pursuant fo the delegation of guch authority by the city. If an
applicant believes its application was improperly excluded from the pooi of
gualitied and timely applications, the apoiicant may receive a hearing By 1he
City Manager to appeal the daniai of & permit, at which time the City
Manager may reverse, moediy, or sustain the deniai.

Sermir Regquirements. The foliowing provisions apply {2 each of the
nine permitiess for the reail sale of fireworks:

{1} Each application shal be accompanied by a filing fee of
250,00 io defrav the citv's cost of providing cublic safety services

intiz; S Uare desoslits
i Fe LAt Sdemis




reny

2y Onece 553!.1%(* sermits shall not pe ransforable, assignable or
ranewabie, Any paomit issusd shall be vald oriv for the dates and isoation
specified in the permit. Dniy ons temporary firgworks stand may be
sperated by each paminee.

"

NS4 e: for the mingmum coverage

. for potentiai ’2Jt§v§v #Ebiiity and properiy
-.rarraac* in '“:) nEsion n;ﬂ" the as:r*:rati r f ‘1&1 mporary maw:nif:s f@ 3
The sity must be namsd 2z 2n lional insured under the msurang ic

PrOgPoN 2 | J oy
2 City of Indip Special

(%)  zach permit eu.ve.u
Evenie Businses Licens

11 iee & requiras to oblam @ Siate Board of

{(8) ix‘ln it requiramenis must be compigied and r?t.' mat o the
City Clerk by & QC p, anduna st of the calengar yaar for which the nermai

is sought.

!Vl .

ate Fire

ach organiz
Warshal .;;-r:.. uant 1o Hea

tion must be issued 2 Hgenss from th
n and Safety Code Seclion 12800, &t

e S
{s&

i

:\r,_ec primarniy for veteran, youth, patriotic, weiare, civic
batermant, o :t‘.arﬁama DUMINSRT,

{8) Eachorganization musi be & nonprofit assogiation or
iow pr

.r’r\

(%7  Each *r"w? zauen must have s pimeipal and cermanem
meetng placs within the feraoria: itmils of the city, must have been
organized ang established ior a minimum of ane year continuously
ﬂwc:e'i,! ¢ the filing of the apolicelionfor the retall sales permil, and must
have e bons fide meribe: of gt lgast 20 mambears. 1he majority of whom
reside i1 the city

)

e TN

it e e i Ly mF I wwnrar SPT PO 1 P oy = b1
-ﬂc; Faiiure 10 maet any of the reguiremenis will resull in revocation

cis Stand Reguirernents, Eashiof the nine
t submit 1o the Frre Chiel a piot plan aoproved by

the awr 0e i; upon which the appiicart wil gonstruct s

o oy B ey S50t | "
tz m_ Tha Fire Chief shall make en investigation of the
a-...- t”,n. .}e fﬂi\:v'l |,‘.

4 PP pans g .«..‘ bt o - . ¥

£y vy fireworks stend erectan fordne relail aals of
= ! T gl 14 e . 4. % §w
firaworks must be consiructed under tne suparvision of the City Building
pit

é”...
ey
V:!
2.
i1
=
=
ih)
4
o

a;.;a*tm».a it s will feasenanly ensure the safety

indio Fire Code Acaplior

Page 139117



of salespersons and pairons. An electsdical permit must be obtained it 2
femporary power pole is required.

2y The ta'“po*a' v Hireworks stand shall have at ieast two exits,
each & least 30" in widlh, in iscations 10 be approved by the Fire Chief,
The stand shati be iocated at least 28’ from any cther structure or property
ine of adjoining iand. Minimum setback from the pubiic sidewalk shall be
ten feet. Mo stand shall have a floor area in excess of 260 square feet,

(3) Al lzast two water base fire extinguishers shall be present in
each temporary firewarks stand. The extinguishers snhall be subject to
- } —r J
inspaction by the Fire Thisf.

43  There shall be at Ieas‘ one adult present in the temporary
ftrewsms stand who is 21 years of age or over during all-hours of retail
sales. No person under 18 years of age shall sell firaworks ai such stara,

{57 No smoking shall be aliowed in the femporary fireworks stand
nor within ten feet therasf No alcohuiic bevaerages shall be allowes on the
premises.

68y All weeds and .cnm?aus'tibbe matena! shall be cisared from the
location of the stand including a distance of at least 25 surrounding the
stand.

{7} Signs stating "ND SMOKING" and "NO SALES TO ANYONE
UNDER SIXTEEN {18) YEARS OF AGE," and all permits must be pested in
a conspicuous place.

181 An.alert night waitchman, at least 21 vears of age, must be
provided by the permittee to guard the temporary fireworks stand during the
hours of storage.

Public: Display. Notwithstanding eny other provision of tus chapter,
fireworks may be lawfully possessed and used for public & sp ay within the
city. as defined in Healii and Safety Code Sections 12575 nraugh 125877,

upon written authorization by the Fire Chief.

Vipiaton, Failure to ramove the wmpara»* fir2werks stand in
acoordance with this chapter will resull in the assessment of 2 penalty of
S50 par day that the stand ramains in placa, or portion therec “‘ The Fire
Chief may re voke the permit granted W any permitiea that is operating a
temporary fraworks stand in viclation of the provisions of the permit, or of
this f**ap*er Such permitise shall not be el t!lb:e: iora new permit for a
narian of one vesr thereafter.

Boofel i b f g ecds
ke Fire Lo Agaphon
Famm 2HoENT



J. APPENDIX

=

yainee of the Jailfarnis Fire Cod iz shgl bz
nout amengments or daistions and shall be nart

2. A;mr:zns*.x ;".‘.-’3
&, Appendix &£
£ Appendix F
5. Appendix G
. Apoandix |

K. APPENDIXR

{1;  Appendix B of ths California Fire Code is hereby adopted as

) Seciion B10Z 1 of Appendix B of the Firs Code is herebv amended
" w"e“ ac ;l".. f

FIRE-FLOW, The flow rate of 2 water supply. measured at 20
pounds per squang innn reexaua :rasgare that is availakis Tor fire
fighting. The determination of ihis flow depends upon the size,
construction, eocougancy and expesure of a building or buiidings
within and surrounding ths hlock or group complex.

3} Section 8104.2 of Appendix B of the Fye Code is hersby amendad
to read as foliows:

Seoting B104 2 Ares Sepsration

Portons of suildings -which are separated by firewalis, with
howr ﬂi‘“ registiye rating ang withouw! pa. Yiy .::s construgtsd in
BOSGIRAN0E Wil b tha Calfornia Butiding £, may be considered

as szparge fire fiow arss calnuiations.

- - d - i ] £ n '+ F 1
Segiion B105.2, Excention No. (1) of Appandix B of the

o e, o~ - e o & F -
is herghy amanded to read as foliows:

nliv dwellings

indro e Code Agoption

Page 5o 1T



1. Acsduction in reguirst fire flow of up to 50 percent as
aoproved, is aliowed when the buliding is provided with an
aporoved automatic fire sprinkier system insiaiied in accordance
with Section 832.2.1.1 oy 838.3.1.2. The resulting fire-flow shail
notl be iese than 1,500 gallons per minute for the nressribed
duration as speciied in Tabie B105.1

L.  APPENDIXC

24y

(1) Appendix T of the California Fire Code is hereby adopted as
amended hereir,

(2}  Section C102 1 of Appendix C of the Fire Code is hereby amended
to raad as follows:

Sectiop C1G2 1 Fue Hydrant Locations

Fire hydrants shzll be provided at stres! intersections. cui-de-sacs,
along required fire apparatus access roads, and adjacent public
streats.

§83.08 FIRE APPARATUS,

{A} In all iocations where access for fire apparatus for fire suppression or rescue
purposes is unduly difficult or subject to cbstructicn, the Fire Chisf may designate fire
lanes and cause them to be posted as such,

(B} No person shall obstruct such fire janes in any manner that would deter or
hinder the Fire Department from gaining immeciate access anc use of such designated
fire lanes.

§93.99 PENALTIES.

(A) It shall be uplawfui for any person, firm, corporation or association of persons
fc vioiatz any provision of this Chanter , o1 10 viglate the provisions of any permit
granted pursuant fo this ordinance. Any person. firm, corporation or association of
persons vioiating any provision of this Chapter or the provisions of any permit granied
pursuant to this ardinance, shall be deemed guilty of an infraction or misdémeanor as
herein atter speciied. 3uch person orentily shall be deemed guilty of 2 separats
offerse for each and every day or portion thersof during which any violation of any of
tha provisions of this Chapler or the provisions of any permiit granted pursuant to this
Chaptzr | s commitied, continued. or permitted. In additicn, any violation of any of the
code adopies herem I8 & nuisance that mavy Le abated as sush pursuani o the
nrovisions of tus Municipal Code.

Any person firm, corporation or assaciation of persons so convicted shali be: {1}

”
1

guiliy of an infraction offense and punished by 2 fine not exceeding two nundred doliars

P i
Indin. =iz oo Adoplion

6 pf T
age 15 af {



; *, a::auz

[i>2ex n?w“ ced

he ap wa‘tm of the :.anwh penaily anall not o2 halg 4o prevent

removal of prahib

Section 3. T any =astion :~:"tue"" n sUubdivision,

agraph, s2nience, clause or phrese of this ¢ Fication o any persan

Of QICUMS za'a.,e is for am reasssn hald to be nv or gnanforceablz by & court o

““'Jf chon, suc imvalidib i affect the vefidlty or

of  the -amammc : dwisions, paragraphs

uses or ""tfas of ihis ordwmance, orils aa;zi:::at:o ic any othar n‘wso'z or
Tha ;.J:;—- Coui i”‘!' ;;’:e 'a.'e‘s th;‘ 'w-'*u!{;é 7

b i <
..gs- w.,.:’ﬂ' S

Section 4,

! cause the sams W law.
Se;t:ons Effective Uz This wrdinanue shall go into afiagt on

FASSED, APPROVELD AND ADOPTED thus

foliowing vote

day of November. 2013 by the

AVYES: fdilier, Torres, Ramos
NOES: ""m&

s -
e
7 e

ITES
*

e
et

(¢

BT
Fagt

Gﬂ\. His HERNANDE” uﬂ."i"
CITY CLERK



g —

RESOLUTION NOQO, 8663

RESOLUTION OF CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO, CALIFORNIA, MAKING
EXPRESS FINDINGS AND DETERMINATIONS THAT MODIFICATIONS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE ARE REASONABLY NECESSARY BECAUSE OF L.OCAL
CLIMATIC, GEOLOGICAL OR TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO DUES HMEREBY FIND,
DETERMINE. RESOLVE AND ORDER AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Recials

A Certain ouilding standards and other related model codes are
adopted by the Siate of California in the California Building Siandards Code and
pecome auvpiicavie n the City unless amended by the (itv purstiant 1o Health and
Satety Code Section 17053

B. Healtth and Safely Code Section 17958 5 authotizes the City
Councit 1o maks reasonably necessary changes or mcdifications to the State adopiec:
buliding cades. inciuding the 2013 Caifornia Fire Code. adopted by the California
Building Standarcs Commission and based upon the 2012 edtion of the Interaational
fre Code, based on certain locai congitions

C. The City of Indic has determined and recommended that the
modifications {o the 2012 California Fye Code, contained herein, are - reasonabiy
necessary due to foca! conditrons

B. Health and Safety Code Secticn 17958.7 requires the City Counci
1o make exprese findings of the necessity for modifications to the duilding standards
centained inthe 2013 California Fire Code

~Section2.  The City Council of the City ¢ Indio hereby expressly finds that the
amendments and modifications to building standards comained n 2013 California Fire
Code as acopted by the Ciy (amendments related to life-safetv in Chapters 1. 2 3, 4
5 3.8, 34, B&. Appendix B, and Appendix T} are reasonably necessary due fo the loca
climatic. geciogical or topcgraphical conditions as set forth herain,

A, Geographic and Topographic Conditions

1 Riverside County and the City of Indic arelocaied in Seismic Zone
four 4. There are earthguake faulls tha! run ihroughow Riverside Coumy. The San
Andreas Fault Zone 1s a known active fault and runs directly adiacent to the cilies
rortharn borger. NMany large quakes have ocowrred on tes faull incluaing the 2004
Parkfigid magritude 6.0 , the 1988 Loma Priela magnitude 7.1, and e 1307 Ean

~ y

Franoisco magniiude 7.8 guakes. A regent Umiversity of Cabfomia Studv. by Yun
Flaikc, predicis that the San Andreas Faull, soscifically the Scuthern segment, s



overdue for a large quaxe of magnitude 7.0 or iarger. Tius study further specifically
pradicts substantial damage to Paim Springs and the surrounding areas, There are
areas within the city limits and sphere of infiuence which are subject to not only
earthquake aciivity, but wind erosion. blown sand, fiooding and brush covered open
spaces. Placement of muliiple occupancy buildings, Jocation of artenal roads and fire
department staffing constraints, have made it difficult for the fire depariment to provide
staffing sufficient to concentrate fire companies and personnel to controf fires in single
and multi-story retail. commerciai and industnal buitdings, making enhanced, buiit-in
protection necessary.

2. Traffic and circulation congestion presently -existing in the City of
Indio often places fire department search and rescue response time to building collapse
anc fire occurrences al risk. This condition makes the need for enhanced on-site
protection for property and occupants riecessary.

B. Climatic Conditions

1. Generally. indic has ar and climate Hot dry Santa Ana winds are
sommon to Indic. These winds constitute a contributing factor which causes small fires
ofiginating in high/medium density development presently being sonstructed in Indio,
which spread guickly and create the need for an increased level of protection. This
added protection, including. but not limited to, on-site protection, will suppiement normal
Fire Department response available in new deveiopment, and provide immediate fire
protection for life and safety of multiple-occupancy occupants during fire occurrence.

Section 3. Specific Amendments and References to Findings.

Local climatic, geographic and topographic sonditions impact fire prevention
efforts, and the frequency, spread, acceleration, intensity and size of fire involving
buildings in this community. Further, they impact potential damage io ali structures from
earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is found to be reasonably necessary that
provisions of the California Building Standards Gode be modified to mitigate the effects
of the above conditions.

Califorria Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that the modification
or change be expressiy marked and identified as to which each finding refers
Tharefore, the City Council finds tha! the following table sets forth 2013 California Fire
Code and related Code provisions constituting building standards that have been
modifizd pussuant to Ordinance No. (20 . and the associated focal climatic, geo'ogicai
andiar tapagraphical conditions described above « Section 2 supporting muodification

Caiifornia Fire Code Section Eindings in Section 2
1014 A-1 and Administrative
1034 A-1 and Administrative

1041 A-1 and Admimistraiive



.}.::
Y

o4 2.1 arig Aomimstrative
10432 A<t and Adrmnistrative

ek A-1 and Admunigtrative
105.4.7 A-1 ang Adminstrative
202 A1, A2, and B-1
30883 &1 and B-1
4042 A AZ and B
5034 £-1, A-2 ang B-1
50322 A, and A-Z
5033 A-1, A-2 and B
504 7 41 A2 and 5-°
.,.r:]" 1 A-1.anc A-Z
85071 A1 A-Z and 51
5375 A1 A2 and B4
8O :- 7 AT A-2 and B-1
807.5. A1 A-2 and 81
511 A1 A-2 and B-1
BEC6.9C.1.2 At ann A2
g01.21 A-1. A2 and 8-1
802z A-1 A-Z anc.B1
i2.2.1 B-1, A2 and B-1
340F 50 A-1, A-2 and 8-1
“aﬁﬁ' 2 Administrativa
8192 Aammistrative
b “.4._2 A1 AZ ang B
5106.2 A1, A2 and B-1
TGz A A1, A-Z and B

‘Bection 4. The City Counci! fings and detsrminas that the current indio Fire
Code codified in Title IX. Chapter 23 of the Code of indic, as acopted in Ordinance Mo,
1540 zoncurrent with this Resolution {the "New Fire Code™ and the recommendad non-
adminigtrative amendments thereto impose substantiaity the same requirements as, anc
are thus equivalent to or excaed, uniform industry codes and current California Buiiding
Standards Code requirements. To the extent that the New Fire Code 15 not found to be
eguivaient 1o or to exceed ganeral regwrements contained in uniform industry codes
ang current Califorrua Buiiding Standards Sooe requirements, the City Councii finds that
sucn amencmants in Ordinance Nc, 1840 lhe ordinance are necessary as result of
Jnigue local conditions dentified hereundar,

Section 5. The City Clerk of the City of Indic 15 harety diracted ‘o file thes
Fessiution and a copy of the New Fire Code Ordinanca, Orainance No. 1640 with the
California Buiding Standargs Tommission and to preserye sad Resolulion ang
Ordinance as pubiic racards.

Section 8. The Cidy Clerk shall cerdify (o tie adaotion of this resclution.



PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 16" day of October, 2013, by the
foliowing vote:

AYES: Miller, Torres, Ramos Watson, Wison, Holmes

NOES: None f s

ELAINE HOLMES, MAYOR

ATTEST:

Fd
T v d . L WA
£ o 2 W c v L 7
- T o “im G e, .
ks L R e

CYNTHIA HERNANDEZ, CNIG
CITY CLERK




RESOLUTION NO. 9663

'RESOLUTION OF CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO, CALIFORNIA, MAKING
EXPRESS FINDINGS AND DETERMINATIONS THAT MODIFICATIONS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE ARE REASONABLY NECESSARY BECAUSE OF LOCAL
CLIMATIC, GEOLOGICAL OR TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF INDIO DOES HEREBY FIND,
DETERMINE, RESOLVE AND ORDER AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Recitals

A. Certain building standards and other related model codes are
adopted by the State of California in the California Building Standards Code and
become applicable in the City unless amended by the City pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Section 17958.

B. Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5 authorizes the City
Council to make reasonably necessary changes or modifications to the State adopted
building codes, including the 2013 California Fire Code, adopted by the California
Building Standards Commission and based upon the 2012 edition of the International
Fire Code, based on certain local conditions,

C. The City of Indio has determined and recommended that the
modifications to the 2013 California Fire Code, contained herein, are reasonably
necessary due to local conditions.

D.  Health and Safsty Code Section 17958.7 requires the City Council
to make express findings of the necessity for modifications to the buﬂdlng standards
contained in the 2013 California Fire Code.

Section 2. The City Counclil of the City of Indio hereby expressly finds that the
amendments and modifications to building standards contained in 2013 California Fire
Code, as adopted by the City (amendments related to life-safety in Chapters 1, 2, 3, 4,
5, 8, 9, 34, 56, Appendix B, and Appendix C) are reasonably necessary due to the local
cllmatlc geological or topographical conditions as set forth herein.

A. Geographic and Topographic Conditions

1. Riverside County and the City of Indio are located in Seismic Zone
four (4). There are earthquake faults that run throughout Riverside County. The San
Andreas Fault Zone is a known active fault and runs directly adjacent to the cities
northem border. Many large quakes have occurred on this fault including the 2004
Parkfield magnitude 6.0 , the 1989 Loma Prieta magnitude 7.1, and the 1907 San
Francisco magnitude 7.8 quakes. A recent University of California Study, by Yuri
Fialko, predicts that the San Andreas Fault, specifically the Southem segment, is



overdue for a large quake of magnitude 7.0 or larger. This study further specifically
predicts substantial damage to Palm Springs and the surrounding areas. There are
areas within the city limits and sphere of influence which are subject to not only
earthquake activity, but wind erosion, blown sand, flooding and brush covered open
spaces. Placement of multiple occupancy buildings, location of arterial roads and fire
department staffing constraints, have made it difficult for the fire department to provide
staffing sufficient to concentrate fire companies and- personnel to control fires in single

and multi-story retail, commercial and industrial buildings, making enhanced, built-in
protection necessary.

2 Traffic and circulation congestion presently existing in the City of
Indio often places fire department search and rescue response time to building collapse
and fire occurrences at risk. This condition makes the need for enhanced on-site
protection for property and occupants necessary.

B. Climatic Conditions

1. Generally, Indio has an arid climate. Hot, dry Santa Ana winds are
common to Indio. These winds constitute a contributing factor which causes small fires
originating in high/medium density development presently being constructed in Indio,
which spread quickly and create the need for an increased level of protection. This
added protection, including, but not limited to, on-site protection, will supplement normal
Fire Department response available in new development, and provide immediate fire
protection for life and safety of multiple-occupancy occupants during fire occurrence.

Section 3. Specific Amendments and References to Findings.

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions impact fire prevention
efforts, and the frequency, spread, acceleration, intensity and size of fire involving
buildings in this community. Further, they impact potential damage to all structures from
earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is found to be reasonably necessary that

provisions of the California Building Standards Code be madified to mitigate the effects
of the above conditions.

California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that the modification
or change be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers.
Therefore, the City Council finds that the following table sets forth 2013 California Fire
Code and related Code provisions constituting building standards that have been
modified pursuant to Ordinance No./e4 0 , and the associated local climatic, geclogical
and/or topographical conditions described above in Section 2 supporting modification.

California Fire Code Section Findings in Section 2

101.4 A-1 and Administrative
1034 A-1 and Administrative
104.1 A-1 and Administrative




104.2.1 A-1 and Administrative

104.3.2 A-1 and Administrative
104.6.5 A-1 and Administrative
105.4.7 A-1 and Administrative
202 ' e A-1, A-2, and B-1
308.6.3 ik i :“: _ A-1 , and B-1 N
404.2 I A-1, A-2, and B-1
503.1. A-1, A-2 and B-1
503.2.2 . A-1, and A-2

503.3 A-1, A-2 and B-1

504.1 A-1, A-2 and B-1

505.1 A-1and A-2

507.1 A-1, A-2 and B-1
507.5.5 A-1, A-2, and B1
507.5.7 A-1, A-2 and B-1
507.5.8 A-1, A-2, and B-1

511 A-1, A-2 and B-1
606.10.1.2 A-1, and A-2

901.3.1 A-1, A-2 and B-1

803.2 A-1, A-2 and B-1
912.2.1 A-1, A-2 and B-1
3405.10 A-1, A-2 and B-1
5608.2 Administrative

B102.1 Administrative

B104.2 A-1, A-2, and B-1
B105.2 A-1, A-2, and B-°
C102.1 A-1, A-2, and B-1

Section4. The City Council finds and determines that the current Indio Fire
Code, codified in Title IX, Chapter 93 of the Code of Indio, as adopted in Ordinance No.
1640 concurrent with this Resolution {the “New Fire Code”) and the recommended non-
administrative amendments thereto impose substantially the same requirements as, and
are thus equivalent to or exceed, uniform industry codes and current California Building
Standards Code requirements. To the extent that the New Fire Code is nat found to be
equivalent to or to exceed general requirements contained in uniform industry codes
and current California Building Standards Code requirements, the City Council finds that
such amendments in Ordinance No. 1640 the ardinance are necessary as result of
unique local conditions identified hereunder.

Section5. The City Clerk of the City of Indio is hereby directed to file this
Resolution and a copy of the New Fire Code Ordinance, Ordinance No. 1640 with the
California Building Standards Commission and to preserve said Resolution and
Ordinance as public records.

Section 8. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this resolution.



PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 16™ day of October, 2013, by the
following vote:

AYES: Miller, Torres, Ramos Watson, Wilson, Holmes

NOES: None /f‘éﬁ; /;

ELAINE HOLMES, MAYOR

ATTEST:

CYNTHIA HERNANDEZ, CM
CITY CLERK




