STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY _ GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

August 4, 2014

Robert Akiyama
Chief Building Official
City of Piedmont

120 Vista Avenue
Piedmont, CA 94611

RE: Ordinance #713 N.S.
Dear Mr. Akiyama:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received frcm your agency on July 19, 2014.

Our review finds the submitta! to contain one ordinance medifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modifications are accepted for filing and are enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited iaw for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Divisiocn of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commiission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely, ﬁ
,/Bﬁ.rique M. Rodrigf

Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



CITY OF PIEDMONT

CALIFORNIA

-ht"

_ r.x-;
coalsHe.. 1B
g

o,

-”Uu.:r-!-"n:/.'
é‘

June 17, 2014

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA. 95833

RE: City of Piedmont Amendments to 2013 California Code of Regulations, Title 24

On February 3, 2014, the City Council of the City of Piedmont adopted the 2013 California
Administrative, Building, Residential, Mechanical, Plumbing, Electrical, Energy, Fire, Green
Building Standards, Reference Standards, Historical and Existing Building Codes and local
amendments, additions and deletions under Ordinance No. 713 N.S. The findings for the code
amendments, additions and deletions based on climatic, topographical and geological conditions
are provided in Exhibit A of the Ordinance.

Please find a certified copy of the ordinance attached.

Sincerely,

Robert Akiyama
Chief Building Official

Attachment

120 VISTA AVENUE / PIEDMONT / CALIFORNIA 94611 / 510: 420-3040



ORDINANCE NO. 713 N.S.

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, AMENDING CHAPTERS 5 AND 8 OF THE
PIEDMONT CITY CODE AND REPEALING CHAPTER 14 FROM THE CITY
CODE

The City Council of the City of Piedmont hereby ordains as follows:

SECTION 1. BACKGROUND.

It is the intent of the City Council of the City of Piedmont in adopting this Ordinance to
adopt the 2013 California Code of Regulations, Title 24 and update existing sections of
Chapters 5 and 8 of the City Code to comply with the 2013 California Code of
Regulations. In addition, the Council intends to repeal Chapter 14 of the City Code as
adoption and amendment of the California Plumbing Code is now contained within
Chapter 5. This action provides for the updating of Piedmont law by adopting the latest
versions of a number of codes including, but not limited to, the California Administrative
Code, the California Residential Code, the California Building Code, the California
Mechanical Code, the California Plumbing Code, the California Electrical Code, the
California Energy Code, the California Historical Building Code, the California Existing
Building Code, the California Green Building Standards Code, the California Referenced
Standards Code, and the California Fire Code.

SECTION 2. FINDINGS.

Pursuant to Section 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the City Council,
in its ordinance adopting the California Building Standards Code and uniform industry
codes, may adopt local amendments which are more restrictive than those adopted by the
State of California in Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, based on local
climatic, geological and topographical conditions.

The City Council finds that, in order to best protect the health, safety and welfare of the
citizens of Piedmont, it is necessary to adopt the building standards contained in the
California Code of Regulations, Title 24 with such more restrictive local amendments as
may be warranted by local climatic, geological and topographical conditions.

Exhibit A to this Ordinance, incorporated herein by this reference, contains findings
(“Findings™) to support the local amendments adopted below through the amendment and
restatement of Chapters 5 and 8 of the City Code, while Exhibit B, incorporated herein by
this reference, identifies and relates each provision of Chapters 5 and 8 to the Finding or
Findings that support it (“Findings Identification Document”). The City Council héteby
adopts the Findings and Findings Identification Document.



SECTION 3. AMENDMENT OF CHAPTER 5.

Chapter 5 of the City Code is hereby amended and restated in its entirety to read as set
forth in attached Exhibit C, incorporated herein by this reference.

SECTION 4. AMENDMENT OF CHAPTER 8.

Chapter 8 of the City Code is hereby amended and restated in its entirety to read as set
forth in attached Exhibit D, incorporated herein by this reference.

SECTION 5. REPEAL OF CHAPTER 14,
Chapter 14 of the City Code is repealed in its entirety.
SECTION 6. POSTING AND EFFECTIVE DATE

This Ordinance shall be posted at City Hall after its second reading by the City Council
for at least thirty (30) days and shall become effective thirty (30) days after such second
reading.

I hereby certify that the foregoing ordinance was passed and adopted by Resolution 13-14
at a regular meeting of the Piedmont City Council on February 3, 3014, by the following
vote:

Ayes: Chiang, Fujioka, Keating McBain, Wieler
Noes: None
Absent: None

Attest: %

(Jjﬁn O. Tulloch, City Clerk




EXHIBIT A
FINDINGS

Finding A.: The City has made minor modifications to the administrative standards of
the construction codes. The modified standards are similar to those found in the
administrative chapters of the various 2013 California Building Standards Code
precluding the need for a finding.

Finding B: This minor modification clarifies the 2013 California Building Standards
Code requirements precluding the need for a finding.

Finding C: The City finds that making amendments and additions to the 2013 California
Residential Code (CRC) and the 2013 California Building Code (CBC) that make more
restrictive provisions for fire safety is reasonably necessary based on climatic,
topographical and geological conditions described below.

Climatic

The average annual precipitation rate in Piedmont is 23 inches per year. Ninety-seven
percent of precipitation occurs in the months of October through April, creating a dry
season of five months per year. Additionally, periodic drought conditions extend the dry
season and exacerbate fire hazard. Average relative humidity ranges between 60% to
80%, but can drop to 20%. Normal wind pattern originates from the marine area to the
west producing light, westerly winds of 9 mph. Occasionally, reverse wind flows from
the inland valleys produce higher than normal easterly winds and carry with them warm
air mass which result in severe fire hazard conditions. Average high temperatures in the
dry season range from 66 degrees F to 72 degrees F; however, seasonal spikes can push
temperatures in the upper 90’s degrees F. The confluence of low precipitation, high
temperatures, low relative humidity and high winds can create conditions of high fire
hazard.

Topographical

Piedmont is a hillside community and most of the structures are single family dwellings
built on sloping terrain. In most areas, the dwelling units are located in close proximity
to one another and in many cases are less than 8 feet apart. Fires can easily spread from
house to house and are more readily spread upslope in the direction of prevailing winds.
Some areas of Piedmont are also located in a Wildland-Urban Interface zone.

Geological

Piedmont is located in a seismically active region and is within 2 kms of the Hayward
Fault. A major earthquake could restrict response time and overwhelm the capacity of
firefighting personnel to control earthquake related fires.

Summary
The 1991 Oakland/Berkeley Hills fire had a devastating impact on those communities in
the fire zone which experienced significant loss of life and property. The fire zone of this



event crossed into the Piedmont city limits but did not damage any structures. Piedmont
has the same climatic, geological and topographical conditions as those areas affected by
the nearby 1991 fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary to amend and/or add this
provision to the 2013 CRC or 2013 CBC.

Finding D: Exceptions 1 and 2 of this code section preclude the requirement in habitable
rooms for natural ventilation and natural light respectively, which could result in
construction of habitable rooms without any direct exterior means of escape or rescue.
The local conditions outlined in Finding C increase the potential severity of fire hazard.
Without direct exterior means for emergency escape or rescue, building occupant safety
would be diminished in a fire event.

Finding E: Reduction of ceiling height of habitable rooms would be detrimental to
occupant survivability and firefighter safety in a fire event. Since heat and smoke both
rise, less room height results in less stratification of heat, lower visibility and less
breathable air. The local conditions outlined in Finding C increase the potential severity
of fire hazard. Increasing the minimum ceiling height of habitable rooms would enhance
builidng occupant and firefighter safety in a fire event.

Finding F: Due to the hillside topography of Piedmont, the historical development
pattern took the form of narrow, deep lots, as opposed to the typical suburban form of
wide, shallow lots. As a result, most of the dwellings are in close physical proximity to
one another. Limiting exterior sources of mechanically generated sound contributes to
the health and overall well being of the community.

Finding G: This provision is mandated by the Bay Area Air Quality Management
District (BAAQMD) precluding the need for a finding.



EXHIBIT B

Identification of Specific Findings Related
to the
Proposed Amendments and Additions
2013 California Building Standards Code

CHAPTER 5 - BUILDING CODE

5.2.1 Section R105.1 — Permits Required
See Finding A.

5.2.2 Section R105.2 — Work Exempt from Permit
See Finding A.

5.2.3 Section R105.3.1 — Action on Application
See Finding A.

5.2.4 Section R105.5 — Expiration
See Finding A.

5.2.4.(1) Section R106.3.3 — Construction Documents — Phased Approval
See Finding A.

5.2.5 Section R108.2 — Schedule of Permit Fees
See Finding A.

5.2.5.(1) Section R108.3 — Building Permit Valuations
See Finding A.

5.2.6 Section R108.4 — Related Fees
See Finding A.

5.2.7 Section R108.7 — Government Agency Exemption
See Finding A.

5.2.8 Section R109.1 — Types of Inspections
See Finding A.

5.2.9 Section R112 Board of Appeals
See Finding A.

5.2.10 Section R303.1 — Habitable Rooms
See Finding C & D




5.2.11 Section R304.4 — Height Effect on Room Area

See Finding B.

5.2.12 Section R305.1 Ceiling Height

5.2.13

5.2.14

See Finding C & E

Section R305.1.2 — Under Floor Area

See Finding B.

Section R313.1 — Townhouse Automatic Sprinkler Systems
See Finding B.

5.2.15 Section R313.2 — One and Two Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Systems

5.2.16

5.2.17

See Finding B.

Section R327.7.10 — Deck Fire Protection

See Finding C.

Section R401.3 — Drainage

See Finding B.

5.2.18 Section R401.4.1.1.3 — Approval, Building Permit Conditions, Appeal

5.2.19

5.2.20

5.2.21

5222

5223

5.2.24

5.2.25

See Finding B.

Section R401.4.1.3 — Foundation and Soils Investigations — Where Required
See Finding B.

Section R403.1.6.1 Foundation Anchorage

See Finding B.

Section R404.1.3 — Design Required

See Finding B.

Section R405.1 Concrete or Masonry Foundations
See Finding B.

Section R703.5 — Wood Shakes and Shingles

See Finding C.

Section R902.1 — Roof Covering Materials

See Finding C.

Section R1001.1 — General

See Finding G.



5.2.26 Section R1003.9.2 — Spark Arrestors
See Finding B.

5.2.27 Section R1004.1 - General
See Finding B.

5.2.28 Appendix K — General
See Finding C & F

5.4.1 Section 105.1 — Permits Required
See Finding A.

5.4.2 Section 105.2 — Permits — Work Exempt from Permits
See Finding A.

5.43 Section 105.3.1 — Action on Application
See Finding A.

5.4.4 Section 105.5 — Expiration
See Finding A.

5.4.4.(1) Section 107.3.3 — Censtruction Examination of Documents - Phased Approval:
See Finding A.

5.4.5 Section 108-2 109.2 — Schedule of Permit Fees
See Finding A.

5.4.5.(1) Section 109.3 — Building Permit Valuations
See Finding A.

5.4.6 Section 109.5.1 — Related Fees
See Finding A.

5.47 Section 109.7 — Government Agency Exemption
See Finding A.

5.4.8 Section 110.1 — Inspections, General
See Finding A.

5.4.9 Section 210 711.10— Protection of Underside of Floors
See Finding C.

5.4.10 Section [F] 903.2 — Automatic Sprinkle Systems Where required

See Finding B.




54.11

5.2.12

5.4.13

Section 1505.1 — Roof Assemblies Fire Classification — General
See Finding C.

Section 1510.1 — Reroofing — General
See Finding C.

Section 1803.2 — Geotechnical Investigations Required
See Finding B.

5.4.14 Section 1805.4.3 — Drainage Discharge
See Finding B.

5.4.15 Section 1807.2 — Retaining Walls
See Finding B.

5.4.16 Section 2308.6 — Foundation Plates or Sills
See Finding B.

5.4.17

5.4.18

5.4.19

5.4.20

5.6.1

5.6.2

5.6.3

5.64

5.6.5

Section 1406.2.12— Wood Shingle Siding and Other Wood Siding
See Finding C.

Section 2111.1.1— Masonry Fireplace Prohibited Location
See Finding G.

Section 2802— Spark Arrester
See Finding B.

Section 1207.4— Mechanically Generated Noise Sources
See Finding F.

Section 108.0 Board of Appeals
See Finding A.

Section 114.1- Fees General
See Finding A.

Section 114.2— Permit Fees
See Finding A.

Section 114.3 — Plan Review Fees
See Finding A.

Section 115.0— Inspections
See Finding A.



58.1

5.8.2

5.83

5.84

3.85

5.8.6

5.8.7

588

5.89

5.8.10

5.10.1

5.10.2

Section 102.3— Board of Appeals
See Finding A.

Section 103.4— Fees
See Finding A.

Section 103.4.1— Plan Review Fees
See Finding A.

Section 1101.1 — Where Required
See Finding B.

Section 1101.5 — Subsoil Drains
See Finding B.

Delete Section 1101.5.3
See Finding B.

Delete Section 1101.5.5

See Finding B.

Section 1601.3— Permit
See Finding B.

Add new - Subsection 601.8
See Finding B.

Section 1602.1.1— Clothes Washer System
See Finding A.

Section 89.108.4.2 — Fees

See Finding A.

Add new Subsection 89.108.4.3 (a) — Plan Review Fees
See Finding A.

CHAPTER 8 - FIRE PREVENTION

8.3

8.7.1

Definitions
See Findings A & C.

Authority to Abate
See Finding C




8.7.2 Abatement Procedure
See Finding C

8.8.1 Section 105.6.48 Christmas tree sales
See Finding C

8.8.2 Section 105.6.49 Temporary water supply
See Finding C

8.8.31 Section 5608.1 Fireworks
See Finding C

10



EXHIBIT C

Chapter 5

BUILDING CODE
§5.1 2013 California Residential Code — Adopted
§5.2 2013 Piedmont Residential Code — Amendments
§5.3 2013 California Building Code — Adopted
§5.4 2013 Piedmont Building Code — Amendments
§5.5 2013 California Mechanical Code — Adopted
§5.6 2013 Piedmont Mechanical Code — Amendments
§5.7 2013 California Plumbing Code — Adopted
§5.8 2013 Piedmont Plumbing Code — Amendments
§5.9 2013 California Electrical Code — Adopted
§5.10 2013 Piedmont Electrical Code — Amendments
§5.11 2013 California Energy Code — Adopted
§5.12 2013 California Green Building Standards Code — Adopted
§5.13 2013 California Referenced Standards Code — Adopted
§5.14 2013 California Administrative Code — Adopted
§5.15 2013 California Historical Building Code - Adopted
§5.16 2013 California Existing Building Code - Adopted

SEC. 5.1 2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE — ADOPTED"

The 2013 California Residential Code, California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5,
including Appendices G & K, prepared by the California Building Standards
Commission, and as amended in sections 5.2 of this code, is hereby adopted by reference
as the Piedmont Residential Code. The City Council may from time to time designate by
resolution which edition of the California Residential Code is currently applicable, since
the California Residential Code is periodically revised, and the edition currently
designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to in the Piedmont Residential
Code. One copy of the Piedmont Residential Code and the California Residential Codes
shall be kept on file at the Department of Public Works. (Ord. No. 254 N.S., 6/65; Ord.
No. 275 N.8., 12/67; Ord. No. 312 N.S., 8/73; Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. No. 571
N.S., 11/95, 607 N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713
N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.2 2013 PIEDMONT RESIDENTIAL CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following provisions replace and, some cases, amplify certain sections of the 2013
California Residential Code as adopted in Section 5.1 of this Chapter.

1 For state law as to adoption by reference, see Gov. C. § 50022.2 to 50022.10.

11



5.2.1 Section R105.1 — Permits Required: Section R105.1 is amended to
include the following provisions: “A building permit will also be required for the
following:

(@ an on-grade improvement capable of use for parking vehicles and located
in the front yard setback, the side yard setback of a corner lot or the rear
yard setback of a through lot.

(b) on-grade stairs with 4 (four) or more risers that are part of the primary
entrance/exit to and from the structure.

(c) construction, repair or replacement of a public sidewalk curb or gutter.

(d A building permit will be required for building alternations and property
improvements which have received Design Review approval and would,
by their nature, not ordinarily require a building permit as defined in
Section 5.2.1. The purpose of the building permit is to verify
conformance to the approved design and any Conditions of Approval.”
(Ord. No. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)

5.2.2 Section R105.2 — Work Exempt from Permits: Delete section in its
entirety and replace with the following: “Permits shall not be required for the following.
Exemption from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this
code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/1 1)

5.2.2(2) Building

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the projected floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet, it is not located within the front setback, and is
less than 7 feet in height measured from the lowest adjacent grade to the
highest roof projection. Not more than one (1) accessory structure is
allowed on any single parcel.

2. Fences 6 feet high or less which are not located in the front yard setback,
the side yard setback of a corner lot, or the rear yard setback of a through
lot, and is not within 2 feet, measured horizontally, of a retaining structure
that compensates for a change in grade.

3. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches high.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 30 inches in height, measured from the
top of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

12



5. Platforms, walks and driveways not more than 12 inches above grade and
not over any basement or story below.

6. Painting, papering, interior floor covering, and similar finish work.
7. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

5.2.2(b) Electrical

1. Listed cord-and-plug connected temporary decorative lighting.
2. Reinstallation of attachment plug receptacles but not the outlets therefore.
3. Repair or replacement of branch circuit overcurrent devices of the required

capacity in the same location.

4, Installation or maintenance of communications wiring, devices,
appliances, apparatus or equipment.

5.2.2(c) Gas

1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances, portable patio
heaters and portable barbeques.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment
or make such equipment unsafe.

3. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping
system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

5.2.2(d) Mechanical

1. Portable heating appliances.

2. Portable ventilation appliances.

3. Portable cooling units.

4, Steam, hot- or chilled-water piping within any heating or cooling

equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment
or make such equipment unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative coolers.

13



7. Self-contained refrigeration systems containing 10 pounds or less of
refrigerant or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower or less.

8. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping
system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

5.2.2(¢) Plumbing

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided,
however, that if a trap, drain pipe, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes
defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same with
new material, the same shall be considered as new work and a permit shall
be procured and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages including the removal and reinstallation of
water closets, or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures,
provided such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

Exceptions to Exemption: Unless otherwise exempted, if separate plumbing,
electrical and mechanical construction is required as part of the construction of the
exempted items, a separate building permits for the plumbing, electrical and mechanical
construction will be required for the above-exempted items.” (Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.3 Section R105.3.1 — Action on Application: Replace the second and third

sentence with the following: “Such applications may be reviewed by other departments
of this jurisdiction to verify compliance with any applicable laws under their jurisdiction.
Except as provided below, if the building official finds that the work described in an
application for a permit and the plans, specifications and other data filed therewith
conform to the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws and ordinances, and
that the fees specified in Section 5.2.5 have been paid, the building official shall issue a
permit therefore to the applicant. The building official shall not issue any new permit for
a particular site until all expired building permits have been finally approved and all work
originally done without permits has been covered by a building permit, inspected and
finally approved. If the Director of Public Works determines that an emergency exists,
the Director of Public Works may authorize issuance of a building permit without first
requiring permit compliance on prior improvements." (Ord. No. 564 N.S., 4/95; Ord. No.
571 N.S. 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.4 Section R105.5 — Expiration: Add the following sentence after the first
sentence of Section 105.5: “For purposes of this section, the term “work™ shall include
successful inspections by the building official as defined in Section R109 — Inspections.”
(Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

14



5.2.4.(1) Section R106.3.3 — Construction Documents — Phased Approval:
Delete this section in its entirety.

5.2.5 Section R108.2 — Schedule of Permit Fees: Add the following sentence to
the end of this section to read as follows: “The fee for each permit shall be charged
according to the City of Piedmont Building Permit Fee Schedule as adopted by the City
Council from time to time.”

5.2.5.(1) Section R108.3 — Building Permit Valuations: Add the following
sentence at the end of R108.3: “In determining the value of the construction, the building
official shall consider the contract price for the work to be performed or, if there is no
contract, such other evidence as the building official may consider relevant.” (Ord. No.
548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.6 Section R108.4 — Related Fees: Add a new Section R108.4.1 to read as
follows: "An SMIP (Strong Motion Instrumentation Program) fee set by State of
California from time to time will be charged. The minimum SMIP fee will be $0.50."
(Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.7 Section R108.7 — Government Agency Exemption: Add a new Section
R108.7 to read as follows: "No building permit fee shall be required for any project or
improvement to be built by or at the direction of the City of Piedmont, the County of
Alameda, the State of California and the United States of America." (Ord. No. 548 N.S.,
10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.8 Section R109.1 — Types of Inspections: A new paragraph shall be added
at the end of Section R109.1 to read as follows: “A survey of the lot may be required by
the building official to verify that the structure is located in accordance with the approved
plans. In the case of a new residence or a detached structure, the building official shall
require a survey by a licensed land surveyor prior to approving the foundation. The
foundation survey shall include the related setbacks, the elevation of the existing grades,
and the elevations of the foundation. At the completion of the framing and roof
sheathing, the survey shall include the elevations of all floors and the maximum roof
height, to verify that the structure is built according to the approved drawings.” (Ord.
No. 564 N.S., 4/95; Ord. No. 571 N.S,, 11/95, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

5.2.9 Section R112 Board of Appeals: Delete this section in its entirety.

5.2.10 Section R303.1 — Habitable Rooms: Delete exceptions 1. and 2.

5.2.11 Section R304.4 — Height Effect on Room Area: Amend section to read as
follows: “Portions of a room with a sloping ceiling measuring less than 5 feet, or a furred
ceiling measuring less than 7 feet, 6 inches from the finished floor to the finished ceiling
shall not be considered as contributing to the minimum required habitable area for that
room.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

15



5.2.12 Section R305.1 Ceiling Height: Delete section in its entirety and replace
with: “Habitable space, other than kitchens, shall have a ceiling height of not less than 7
feet 6 inches. Kitchens, bathrooms, toilet rooms, hallways, laundry rooms and portions
of basements containing these spaces shall be permitted to have a ceiling height of not
less than 7 feet.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

Exceptions:

1. For rooms with sloped ceilings, at least 50 percent of the required floor
area of the room must have the prescribed ceiling height and no portion of
the required floor area may have a ceiling height of less than 5 feet.

2. Bathrooms with stoped ceilings shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6
feet 8 inches at the center of the front clearance area for fixtures. The
ceiling height above fixtures shall be such that the fixture is capable of
being used for its intended purpose. A shower or tub equipped with a
showerhead shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6 feet 8 inches above
a minimum area 30 inches by 30 inches at the showerhead.

3 Existing non-habitable space contained within the existing building
envelope that is converted to habitable space shall be permitted to have a
ceiling height of not less than 7 feet.”

5.2.13 Section R305.1.2 — Under Floor Area: Add the following new section:
“Portions of basements with ceiling heights of less than 6 feet 8 inches shall be
considered under floor areas and shall be separated from the portions of the basement
with ceiling heights of 6 feet 8 inches or greater by construction conforming to Chapter 6,
2013 California Residential Code. Such under floor areas shall be unfinished.

Exception:  Existing under floor areas may be finished with the approval of the
building official.”

5.2.14 Section R313.1 — Townhouse Automatic Sprinkler Systems: Add to
exception: “However, if at any time a building is demolished or destroyed for any reason
to the extent of more than seventy percent (70%) of the physical building, then an
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required. The amount of physical building
destruction or demolition shall be determined by the building official.” (Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11)

5.2.15 Section R313.2 — One and Two Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Systems:
Add to exception: “However, if at any time a building is demolished or destroyed for any
reason to the extent of more than seventy percent (70%) of the physical building, then an
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required. The amount of physical building
destruction or demolition shall be determined by the building official.” (Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11)

16



5.2.16 Add Section R327.7.10 — Deck Fire Protection: “The exposed underside of
decks which are located less than 10 feet from any structure regulated by this code shall
be protected by the installation of materials approved for one hour fire resistant
construction on the horizontal exterior underside.

Exceptions:

()

@)

G)

4

Where exterior walls enclose the underside of the deck completely to
grade.

Where the underdeck area is equipped with an automatic fire suppression
system which complies with Section R313. .

Where the deck, whether cantilevered or supported on posts, is less than
one foot above grade or more than 15 feet above grade.

Where the deck, whether cantilevered or supported on posts, is constructed
as follows:

Horizontal framing members 4 x 8 (nominal) and larger
Posts 6 x 6 (nominal) and larger
Decking:

(A)  3x (nominal) decking

(B)  Ignition-resistant materials that comply with the
performance requirements of both SFM Standard 12-7A-4
and SFM Standard 12-7A-5.

(C)  Exterior fire retardant wood.
(D)  Non-combustible material.

(E)  Any material that complies with the performance
requirements of SFM Standard 12-7A-4A when attached
exterior wall covering is also either non-combustible or
ignition-resistant material.

Exception: Wall materials may be of any material that
otherwise complies with this chapter when the decking
surface material complies with the performance
requirements of ASTM E 84 with a Class B flame spread
rating.

17



(5)  Decks constructed over noncombustible paving which extends at least 3
feet beyond the edge of the deck and permanently prevents the growth of
plant material.

The alteration or repair of an existing deck, or balcony shall meet the above requirements,
except that if the number of linear feet of horizontal framing members to be repaired and
replaced is less than 50% of the total linear feet of all framing members, materials like
those used on the original construction may be used." (Ord. 548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. 554
N.S. 5/94, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.17 Section R401.3 — Drainage: Add the following to the end of the section:
"Provisions shall be made for the control and drainage of surface and subsurface water
around buildings. Whenever plans for an improvement to real property indicate the
possibility of change in either surface or subsurface drainage, or both, a plan for drainage
control shall be submitted which shall provide for no increase or other adverse change in
drainage on any property adjacent to that on which the improvement is to be located. The
methods by which storm water is to be managed shall be according to the latest approved
provisions of the Alameda County Clean Water Program. If adhering to these provisions
is not reasonable due to site specific conditions, then the storm water discharge shall be
managed with one or more of the following exceptions:

(1)  Underground, rigid; pipe via gravity flow down to the face of curb of a
street bordering the property. Any piping occurring under the city
sidewalk or other city improvements shall be cast iron pipe.

(2)  Direct all concentrated storm water to a catch basin and sump pump to
deliver water to the face of curb of a street bordering the property.

3) Gravity flow through neighboring property to the face of curb on a lower
street subject to the approval of the Director of Public Works, and a
written agreement and recorded easement mutually agreed to by the
affected neighbors.

(4)  Any other method determined by the building official to be reasonable and
appropriate under the circumstances. The building official shall require
plans by a civil engineer, if necessary based on the characteristics of the
site." (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

5.2.18 Section R401.4.1.1.3 — Approval, Building Permit Conditions, Appeal:

Delete section in its entirety.

5.2.19 Add Section R401.4.1.3 — Foundation and Soils Investigations — Where
Required:

18



1. "For any building on a site having a slope of twenty percent (20%) or
greater, a soils report shall be prepared by a geotechnical engineer licensed
by the State of California.

2. At discretion of the building official based on the characteristics of the site
and the nature of the construction proposed.” (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93,
Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.20 Section R403.1.6.1 Foundation Anchorage: Add the following sentence at
the end of the-second paragraph: “All anchor bolts, seismic ties, and any other
mechanical or structural connectors to be embedded in new concrete shall be installed
and be in place at the time of the foundation form inspection.” (Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord.
No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.21 Section R404.1.3 — Design Required: Amend the section as follows:
“Concrete or masonry foundation walls shall be designed in accordance with accepted
engineering practice when either of the following conditions exists:

1. Walls are subject to hydrostatic pressure from groundwater.

2. Walls supporting more than 30 inches of unbalanced backfill that do not
have permanent lateral support at the top or bottom.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

5.2.22 Section R405.1 Concrete or Masonry Foundations: Delete this section in
its entirety and replace with: “Drains shall be provided around all concrete or masonry
foundations that retain earth and enclose habitable or usable spaces located below grade.
Perforated pipe or other approved systems or materials shall be installed at or below the
area to be protected and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means into an approved
drainage system. Perforated pipe shall be surrounded with an approved filter membrane
or the filter membrane shall cover washed gravel or crushed rock covering the drain pipe.
Perforated pipe shall be placed on a minimum of 2 inches of washed gravel or crushed
rock at least one sieve size larger than the perforations and covered with not less than 6
inches of the same material.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.23 Section R703.5 Wood Shakes and Shingles: Add the following at the end
of the first paragraph of R703.5 to read as follows:

¢)) "All wood shingles and shakes shall be fire-retardant-treated to a Class B
rating, or Class C if the wall assembly, treatment of underlayment, or the
proposed finish is a fire-rated equivalent approved by the building official.

(2)  Exterior wall finishes of existing structures where openings are infilled,

but not additions to existing structures, may be replaced to match the
existing wall finish, if wood shakes and shingles installed on sidewalls are

19



Class-B fire-treated. (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord.
No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

(3)  Framing to receive wood siding or wood shingles and shakes siding shall
be covered with tight-fitting minimum 1/2" wood underlayment or
1/2"exterior grade gypsum sheathing." (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord.
607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.2.24 Section R902.1 — Roof Covering Materials: Delete section in its entirety
and replace with: “Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904
and R905. A minimum Class A roofing shall be installed. Class A roofing required by
this Section to be listed shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or ATM E 108.

Exceptions:

1. Class A roof assemblies include those with coverings of brick, masonry
and exposed concrete roof deck.

2. Class A roof assemblies also include ferrous or copper shingles or sheets,
metal sheets and shingles, clay or concrete roof tile, or slate installed on
noncombustible decks.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

3. Class A roof assemblies include minimum 160z/ft? copper sheets installed

over combustible decks.”

5.2.25 Section R1001.1 — General: Amend the section as follows: “Masonry
fireplaces shall be constructed in accordance with this section and the applicable
provisions of Chapters 3 and 4. Construction of new masonry fireplaces is prohibited
where the firebox opens to enclosed or habitable spaces.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord.
No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.26 Section R1003.9.2— Spark Arresters: Add after the first sentence of
Section R1003.9.2, the following: “This shall be required when a building permit is
issued for an improvement on the lot on which the house is located which is of a value in
excess of one thousand dollars ($1,000.00). The spark arrester must be installed before
final inspection approval." (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.27 Section R1004.1 — General: Add the following sentence after the second
sentence: “Wood burning fireplaces and stoves shall be EPA certified.” (Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11)

5.2.28 Appendix K. Add a new Section AK103.2 — Mechanically Generated
Noise Sources to read as follows: “Machines and other devices located on the exterior of
structures which generate sounds perceptible outside the perimeters of the lot on which
they are located shall be installed with such sound transmission control measures to

20



adequately minimize or eliminate the transmission of the sound to a level not to exceed
50 decibels, A-weighted, beyond property perimeters. This section is directed to and
includes, but is not limited to pool and spa filter systems, air conditioning units, and
exterior mounted blowers for exhaust systems.” (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607
N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.3 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Building Code of Regulations, Parts 1 and 2 of Title 24, including
the California Building Code, Volumes 1 and 2 and Appendices D, F, G, H, 1, & J,
prepared by the California Building Standards Commission, and as amended in sections
5.4 of this code, is hereby adopted by reference as the Piedmont Building Code. The City
Council may from time to time designate by resolution which edition of the California
Building Code is currently applicable, since the California Building Code is periodically
revised, and the edition currently designated by Council resolution shall be the one
referred to in the Piedmont Building Code. One copy of the Piedmont Building Code and
the California Building Codes shall be kept on file at the Department of Public Works.
(Ord. No. 254 N.S., 6/65; Ord. No. 275 N.S., 12/67; Ord. No. 312 N.S., 8/73; Ord. No.
548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, 607 N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No.
696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.4 2013 PIEDMONT BUILDING CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following provisions replace and, some cases, amplify certain sections of the 2013
California Building Code as adopted in Section 5.3 of this Chapter.

5.4.1 Section 105.1 — Permits Required: Section 105.1 is amended to include
the following provisions: “A building permit will also be required for the following:

€))] an on-grade improvement capable of use for parking vehicles and located
in the front yard setback, the side yard setback of a comer lot or the rear
yard setback of a through lot.

(b) on-grade stairs with 4 (four) or more risers that are part of the primary
entrance/exit to and from the structure.

(c) construction, repair or replacement of a public sidewalk curb or gutter.

(d) A building permit will be required for building alterations and property
improvements which have received Design Review approval and would,
by their nature, not ordinarily require a building permit as defined in
Section 5.4.1. The purpose of the building permit is to verify
conformance to the approved design and any Conditions of Approval.”
(Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord.
No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

21



54.2 Section 105.2 — Permits — Work Exempt from Permits: Section 105.2 is
amended with the following:

“Building:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the projected floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet, it is not located within the front yard setback, and
is less than 7 feet in height measured from the lowest adjacent grade to
the highest roof projection. Not more than one (1) accessory structure is
allowed on any single parcel.

2. Fences 6 feet high or less which are not located in the front yard setback,
the side yard setback of a corner lot, or the rear yard setback of a through
lot, and is not within 2 feet, measured horizontally, of a retaining structure
that compensates for a change in grade.

3. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions not
over 5 feet 9 inches in height.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 30 inches in height, measured from the
top of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class L, II or III-A liquids.

5 Platforms, walks and driveways not more than 12 inches above grade and
not over any basement or story below and re not part of an accessible
route..

6. Painting, papering interior floor covering and similar finish work.

7. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.”

(Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.3 Section 105.3.1 — Action on Application: Replace the second and third

sentence with the following: “Such applications may be reviewed by other departments
of this jurisdiction to verify compliance with any applicable laws under their jurisdiction.
Except as provided below, if the building official finds that the work described in an
application for a permit and the plans, specifications and other data filed therewith
conform to the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws and ordinances, and
that the fees specified in Section 5.4.5 have been paid, the building official shall issue a
permit therefore to the applicant. The building official shall not issue any new permit for
a particular site until all expired building permits have been renewed and finally
approved, and all work originally done without permits has been issued a building permit,
inspected and finally approved. If the Director of Public Works determines that an
emergency exists, the Director of Public Works may authorize issuance of a building

22



permit without first requiring permit compliance on prior improvements." (Ord. 564
N.S., 4/95; Ord. No. 571 N.S. 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.4 Section 105.5 — Expiration: Add the following sentence after the first
sentence of Section 105.5: “For purposes of this section, the term “work” shall include
successful inspections by the building official as defined in Section 110 — Inspections.”
(Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.4.(1) Section 107.3.3 —Examination of Documents - Phased Approval: Delete
this section in its entirety. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.5 Section 109.2 — Schedule of Permit Fees: Add the following sentence to
the end of this section to read as follows: “The fee for each permit shall be charged
according to the City of Piedmont Building Permit Fee Schedule as adopted by the City
Council from time to time.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.5.(1) Section 109.3 — Building Permit Valuations: Add the following
sentence at the end of 109.3: “In determining the value of the construction, the building
official shall consider the contract price for the work to be performed or, if there is no
contract, such other evidence as the building official may consider relevant." (Ord. No.
548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S,, 11/95, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.4.6 Section 109.5.1 — Related Fees: Add a new Section 109.5.1 to read as
follows: "An SMIP (Strong Motion Instrumentation Program) fee set by State of
California from time to time will be charged. The minimum SMIP fee will be $0.50."
(Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.4.7 Section 109.7 — Government Agency Exemption: Add a new Section
109.7 to read as follows: "No building permit fee shall be required for any project or
improvement to be built by or at the direction of the City of Piedmont, the County of
Alameda, the State of California and the United States of America." (Ord. No. 548 N.S.,
10/93; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

5.4.8 Section 110.1 — Inspections, General: A new paragraph shall be added at
the end of Section 110.1 to read as follows: "A survey of the lot may be required by the
building official to verify that the structure is located in accordance with the approved
plans. In the case of a new residence or a detached structure, the building official shall
require a survey by a licensed land surveyor prior to approving the foundation. The
foundation survey shall include the related setbacks, the elevation of the existing grades,
and the elevations of the foundation. At the completion of the framing and roof
sheathing, the survey shall include the elevations of all floors and the maximum roof
height, to verify that the structure is built according to the approved drawings.” (Ord.
No. 564 N.S., 4/95; Ord. No. 571 N.S., 11/95, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

23



5.4.9 Section 711.10 — Protection of Underside of Floors: Add the following:
“The exposed underside of floors for habitable space, uninhabitable space which supports
or is attached to habitable space, or decks which are located less than 10 feet from any
structure regulated by this code, shall be protected by the installation of materials
approved for one-hour fire-resistant construction on the horizontal exterior side. Gypsum
sheathing may be covered by combustible finish materials.

Exceptions:
€)) Where exterior walls enclose the under floor area completely to grade.

(2)  Where the underfloor area is equipped with an automatic fire suppression
system which conforms with the Piedmont Fire Code.

(3)  Abalcony or deck, whether cantilevered or supported on posts, is less than
one foot above grade or more than 15 feet above grade.

(4) A balcony or deck, whether cantilevered or supported on posts, which is
constructed as follows:

Horizontal framing members 4x8 (nominal) and larger
Posts 6x6 (nominal) and larger
Decking:

(A)  3x (nominal) decking

(B)  Ignition-resistant materials that comply with the
performance requirements of both SFM Standard 12-7A-4
and SFM Standard 12-7A-5.

(C)  Exterior fire retardant wood.
(D)  Non-combustible material.

(E)  Any material that complies with the performance
requirements of SFM Standard 12-7A-4A when attached
exterior wall covering is also either non-combustible or
ignition-resistant material.

Exception: Wall materials may be of any material that
otherwise complies with this chapter when the decking
surface material complies with the performance
requirements of ASTM E 84 with a Class B flame spread
rating.

24



(5)  Decks constructed over noncombustible paving which extends at least 3
feet beyond the edge of the deck and permanently prevents the growth of
plant material.

The alteration or repair of an existing deck, or balcony shall meet the above requirements,
except that if the number of linear feet of horizontal framing members to be repaired and
replaced is less than 50% of the total linear feet of all framing members, materials like
those used on the original construction may be used." (Ord. 548 N.S., 10/93; Ord. 554
N.S. 5/94, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.10 Section [F] 903.2 — Automatic Sprinkle Systems Where required: Add the

following to the section: “Any previously non-conforming structure that is demolished or
destroyed for any reason to the extent that more than seventy percent (70%) of the
physical building is demolished or destroyed shall be provided with approved automatic
sprinkler system as described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.79. The amount of
physical building destruction or demolition shall be determined by the building official.”
(Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.11 Section 1505.1 — Roof Assemblies Fire Classification — General: Delete
section in its entirety and replace with the following: “Class A roof assemblies and roof
coverings shall be installed. Class A roof assemblies and roof coverings shall be tested in
accordance with ASTM E 108 or UL 790. In addition, fire retardant-treated wood roof
coverings shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D 2898.

Exception: ~ Skylights and sloped glazing that comply with Chapter 24 or Section
2610.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.2.12 Section 1510.1 — Reroofing — General: Delete section in its entirety and
replace with the following: “Materials and methods of application used for recovering or
replacing an existing roof covering shall comply with the requirements of Section 1505.1.

Exception:  Reroofing shall not be required to meet the minimum design slope
requirements of one-quarter unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2 percent
slope) in Section 1507 for roofs that provide positive roof drainage.

Reroofing of an existing structure, regardless of existing roofing materials, shall conform
to the requirements of a Class-A roof for the materials used in the installation. Class-A
roofing materials may be installed over previous roof material layers if final assembly
meets requirements of California Building Code Chapter 15.

Patches and repairs exceeding 100 square feet shall meet the requirements for reroofing.
Patches and repairs of 100 square feet or less may match existing materials, including
sheathing and roofing materials, provided that all wood shingles and shakes are fire
treated to a Class-B rating.” (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11)

25



5.4.13 Section 1803.2 — Geotechnical Investigations Required: After the first

sentence add the following: “Geotechnical investigations shall be required:

1. For any building on a site having a slope of twenty percent (20%) or
greater.

2. At discretion of the building official based on the characteristics of the site
and the nature of the construction proposed.” (Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.14 Section 1805.4.3 — Drainage Discharge: Delete section in its entirety and
replace with the following: “Provisions shall be made for the control and drainage of
surface and subsurface water around buildings. Whenever plans for an improvement to
real property indicate the possibility of change in either surface or subsurface drainage, or
both, a plan for drainage control shall be submitted which shall provide for no increase or
other adverse change in drainage on any property adjacent to that on which the
improvement is to be located. The methods by which storm water is to be managed shall
be according to the latest approved provisions of the Alameda County Clean Water
Program. If adhering to these provisions is not reasonable due to site specific conditions,
then the storm water discharge shall be managed with one or more of the following
exceptions:

(1)  Underground, rigid pipe via gravity flow down to the face of curb of a
street bordering the property. Any piping occurring under the city
sidewalk or other city improvements shall be cast iron pipe.

(2)  Direct all concentrated storm water to a catch basin and sump pump to
deliver water to the face of curb of a street bordering the property.

(3)  Gravity flow through neighboring property to the face of curb on a lower
street subject to the approval of the Director of Public Works, and a
written agreement and recorded easement mutually agreed to by the
affected neighbors.

(4)  Any other method determined by the building official to be reasonable and
appropriate under the circumstances. The building official shall require
plans by a civil engineer, if necessary, based on the characteristics of the
site." (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

5.4.15 Section 1807.2 — Retaining Walls: Add the following sentence at the end
of 1807.2: "A retaining wall, any portion of which exceeds 30 inches in height measured
from the top of the footing to the top of the retaining wall, shall be designed by a
registered civil or structural engineer or architect." (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607
N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11)

26



5.4.16 Section 2308.6 — Foundation Plates or Sills: Add the following sentence
at the end of the paragraph: “All anchor bolts, seismic ties, and any other mechanical or
structural connectors to be embedded in new concrete shall be installed and be in place at
the time of the foundation form inspection.” (Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11)

5.4.17 Section 1406.2.12— Wood Shingle Siding and Other Wood Siding:
Exterior wall coverings shall be permitted to be constructed of wood shingle siding and
other wood siding complying with the following limitations:

(1)  Ali wood shingle siding shall be fire-retardant treated to a Class B rating,
or Class C rating if the wall assembly, treatment of underlayment, or the

proposed finish is a fire-rated equivalent approved by the Building
Official.

(2)  Exterior wall finishes of existing structures where openings are infilled,
but not additions to existing structures may be replaced to match the
existing wall finish, if wood shingles siding installed is Class-B fire
treated.

(3)  Framing to receive wood shingle siding or other wood siding shall be
covered with tight-fitting minimum 1/2" wood underlayment or 1/2"
exterior grade gypsum sheathing. (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607
N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.18 Section 2111.1.1— Masonry Fireplace Prohibited Location: Construction

of masonry fireplaces is prohibited where the firebox opens to enclosed or habitable
spaces. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.19 Section 2802— Spark Arrester: Add the following at the end of Section
2802: “A spark arrester shall be required when a building permit is issued for an
improvement on the lot on which the house is located which is of a value in excess of one
thousand dollars ($1,000.00). The spark arrester must be installed before final inspection
approval.” (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord.
No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.4.20 Add a new Section 1207.4— Mechanically Generated Noise Sources to
read as follows: "Machines and other devices located on the exterior of structures which

generate sounds perceptible outside the perimeters of the lot on which the machine or
other device is located shall be installed with such sound transmission control measures
to adequately minimize or eliminate the transmission of the sound to a level not to exceed
50 decibels, A-weighted, beyond property perimeters. This section is directed to and
includes, but is not limited to, pool and spa filter systems, air conditioning units, and
exterior mounted blowers for exhaust systems.” (Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607
N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

27



SEC. 5.5 2013 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Mechanical Code, Part 4 of Title 24 and its appendices, prepared by
the California Building Standards Commission, is adopted by reference, subject to any
changes, additions or deletions set forth in this chapter. The Council, by resolution, may
from time to time designate which edition of the California Mechanical Code is currently
applicable, since said California Mechanical Code is periodically revised and the edition
so designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to throughout this Code.
One copy of the California Mechanical Code shall be kept on file at the Department of
Public Works. (Ord. No. 276 N.S., 3/68; Ord. No. 548 N.S., 10/93, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99;
Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.6 2013 PIEDMONT MECHANICAL CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following listed sections of the 2013 California Mechanical Code, adopted by
Section 5.5, are amended to read as follows:

5.6.1 Section 108.0 Board of Appeals: Delete Section this section in its entirety.
(Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.6.2 Section 114.1— Fees General: In the first sentence, supplant “in the fee
schedule, Table 114.1-1”, with the following Section 114.1: “the Building Permit
Fee Schedule set by City Council resolution from time to time.” (Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.6.3 Section 114.2— Permit Fees: In the first sentence, supplant, “Table 114.1”,
with the following: “the Building Permit Fee Schedule set by City Council resolution
from time to time” and add the following subsections:

(a) “The determination of value or valuation under any provisions of this
Code shall be made by the building official. The value to be used in
computing the mechanical permit and mechanical plan review fees shall
be the total value of all construction for which the permit is issued.

(b)  SMIP (Strong Motion Instrumentation Program) Fee of $0.07 per
$1,000.00 valuation will be charged. The minimum SMIP fee will be
$0.50.

(c) The City of Piedmont, the County of Alameda, the State of California and
the United States of America shall be exempted from the paying of any fee
for any building permit.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)

5.6.4 Section 114.3 — Plan Review Fees: Replace the entire third paragraph,
with the following: “Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional
plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in the

28



Building Permit Fee Schedule set from time to time by City Council resolution.” (Ord.
No. 232 N.S.,, 12/62; Ord. No. 255 N.S., 6/65; Ord. No. 275 N.S., 12/67; Ord. No. 312
N.S., 8/73; Ord. No. 359 N.S., 2/78; Ord. No. 411 N.S., 10/80, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord.
No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.6.5 Section 115.0— Inspections: Section 115.6 Reinspections: Delete the third
paragraph. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.7 2013 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Plumbing Code, Part 5 of Title 24, and its appendices, prepared by
the California Building Standards Commission, is adopted by reference, subject to any
changes, additions or deletions set forth in this chapter. The Council, by resolution, may
from time to time designate which edition of the California Plumbing Code is currently
applicable, since said California Plumbing Code is periodically revised and the edition so
designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to throughout this Code. One
copy of the California Plumbing Code shall be kept on file at the Department of Public
Works. (Ord. No. 276 N.S. 3/68; Ord. No. 312 N.S., 8/73; Ord. No. 359 N.S., 2/78, Ord.
607 N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.8 2013 PIEDMONT PLUMBING CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following listed sections of the 2013 California Plumbing Code, adopted by Section
5.7, are amended to read as follows:

5.8.1 Section 102.3— Board of Appeals: Delete this section in its entirety. (Ord.
No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.2 Section 103.4- Fees: In the first sentence, supplant “in the fee schedule,
Table 103.4” with the following: “the Building Permit Fee Schedule set by City
Council resolution from time to time” and the following subsections:

(a “The determination of value or valuation under any of the provisions of
this code shall be made by the building official. The value to be used in
computing the plumbing permit and the plumbing plan review fees shall
be the total value of construction work for which the permit is issued.”

(b "SMIP (Strong Motion Instrumentation Program) Fee of $0.07 per
$1,000.00 valuation will be charged. The minimum SMIP fee will be
$0.50."

(c) "The City of Piedmont, the County of Alameda, the State of California
and the United States of America shall be exempted from the paying of
any fee for any building permit." (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713
N.S. 02/14)

29



5.8.3 Section 103.4.1— Plan Review Fees: At the end of the fourth paragraph,
supplant “Table 103.4” with “the Permit Fee Schedule set by City Council
resolution from time to time.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)

5.8.4 Section 1101.1 — Where Required: Revise this section to read as follows:
“Roofs, paved areas, yards, courts, courtyards, vent shafts, light wells, or similar
areas having rain water shall be drained into a separate storm sewer system or to
some other place of disposal satisfactory to the Authority Having Jurisdiction.”
(Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.5 Section 1101.5 — Subsoil Drains: Revise Section 1101.5.1 to read as
follows: “Subsoil drains shall be piped to a storm drain, to an approved water
course, or to the front street curb or gutter.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No.
713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.6 Delete Section 1101.5.3 in its entirety. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No.
713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.7 Delete Section 1101.5.5 in its entirety. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No.
713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.8 Section 1601.3— Permit: Delete the following exception in its entirety: “A
construction permit shall not be required for a clothes washer system meeting the
requirements of section 1602.1.1.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)

5.8.9 Add new Subsection 601.8 to read as follows: “When a new water service
piping is installed, and a ground driven electrode is nonexistent, one must be
driven and the proper electrical connections made as described in the current
electrical code.” (Ord. No. 276 N.S., 3/68; Ord. No. 312 N.S., 8/73; Ord. No. 359
N.S., 2/78; Ord. No. 411 N.S., 10/80, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S.
01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

5.8.10 Section 1602.1.1— Clothes Washer System: Delete this section in its
entirety. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.9 2013 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Electrical Code, Part 3 of Title 24, and its annexes, prepared by the
California Building Standards Commission, is adopted by reference, subject to any
changes, additions or deletions set forth in this chapter. The Council, by resolution, may
from time to time designate which edition of the California Electrical Code is currently
applicable, since said California Electrical Code is periodically revised and the edition so
designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to throughout the Code.
Revisions to the California Electrical Code will be adopted upon receipt of same. One

30



copy of the California Electrical Code shall be kept on file at the Department of Public
Works. (Ord. No. 359 N.S., 2/78, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. No. 696
N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.10 2013 PIEDMONT ELECTRICAL CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following listed sections are added to the 2013 California Electrical Code adopted by
Section 5.9 to read as follows:

5.10.1 Section 89.108.4.2 — Fees: Add the following sentence and subsections to
the end of the paragraph to read as follows: “A fee for each electrical permit shall be paid
to the building official in accordance with the Building Permit Fee Schedule set by City
Council resolution from time to time.

(a) The determination of value or valuation under any of this Code shall be
made by the building official. The value to be used in computing the
electrical permit and electrical plan review fee shall be the total value of
all construction work for which the permit is issued.

(b) SMIP (Strong Motion Instrumentation Program) Fee of $0.07 per
$1,000.00 valuation will be charged. The minimum SMIP fee will be
$0.50.

(©) The City of Piedmont, the County of Alameda, the State of California and
the United States of America shall be exempted from the paying of any fee
for any building permit.” (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)

5.10.2 Add new Subsection 89.108.4.3 (a) — Plan Review Fees: “When a plan or

other data is required to be submitted, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting plans and specifications for review. Said plan review fees shall be charged at
the rate shown in the Building Permit Fee Schedule set by City Council resolution from
time to time. Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan
review. an additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in the Building
Permit Fee Schedule set by City Council resolution from time to time." (Ord. No. 359
N.S., 2/78; Ord. No. 411 N.S., 10/80, Ord. 607 N.S. 6/99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord.
No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.11 2013 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE ADOPTED

The 2013 California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6 including all of its appendices is
hereby adopted by reference. The City Council may from time to time designate by
resolution which edition of the California Energy Code is currently applicable, since the
California Energy Code is periodically revised, and the edition currently designated by
Council resolution shall be the one referred to in the Piedmont Building Code. One copy

31



of the currently adopted California Energy Code shall be kept on file at the Department
of Public Works. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.12 2013 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE —
ADOPTED

The 2013 California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24, Part 11 is hereby adopted
by reference. The City Council may from time to time designate by resolution which
edition of the California Green Building Standards Code is currently applicable, since the
California Green Building Standards Code is periodically revised, and the edition
currently designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to in the Piedmont
Building Code. One copy of the currently adopted California Green Building Standards
Code shall be kept on file at the Department of Public Works. (Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11,
Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.13 2013 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Referenced Standards Code, Part 12 of Title 24, including all of its
appendices is hereby adopted by reference. The City Council may from time to time
designate by resolution which edition of the California Referenced Standards Code is
currently applicable, since the California Referenced Standard Code is periodically
revised, and the edition currently designated by Council resolution shall be the one
referred to in the Piedmont Building Code. One copy of the currently adopted California
Referenced Standards Code shall be kept on file at the Department of Public Works.
(Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.14 2013 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Administrative Code, Part 1 of Title 24, and its appendices,
prepared by the California Building Standards Commission, is adopted by reference,
subject to any changes, additions or deletions set forth in this chapter. The Council, by
resolution, may from time to time designate which edition of the California
Administrative Code is currently applicable, since said California Administrative Code is
periodically revised and the edition so designated by Council resolution shall be the one
referred to throughout this Code. One copy of the California Administrative Code shall
be kept on file at the Department of Public Works (Ord. No. 332 N.S., 9/75; Ord. No.
334 N.S., 12/75; Ord. No. 359 N.S., 2/78, Ord. 607 N.S. 6./99, Ord. No. 696 N.S. 01/11,
Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SEC. 5.15 2013 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Historical Building Code, Part 8 of Title 24, including all of its
appendices is hereby adopted by reference. The City Council may from time to time
designate by resolution which edition of the California Historical Building Code is
currently applicable, since the California Historical Building Code is periodically revised,
and the edition currently designated by Council resolution shall be the one referred to in

32



the Piedmont Building Code. One copy of the currently adopted California Historical
Building Code shall be kept on file at the Department of Public Works. (Ord. No. 713
N.S. 02/14)

SEC.5.16 2013 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE — ADOPTED

The 2013 California Existing Building Code Part 10, Title 24, and its appendices,
prepared by the California Building Standards Commission, is adopted by reference,
subject to any changes, additions or deletions set forth in this chapter. The Council, by
resolution, may from time to time designate which edition of the California Existing
Building Code is currently applicable, since said California Existing Building Code is
periodically revised and the edition so designated by Council resolution shall be the on
referred to throughout this Code. One copy of the California Existing Building Code shall
be kept on file at he Department of Public Works. (Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

33



EXHIBIT D

Chapter 8

FIRE PREVENTION!
§ 8.1 Adoption of California Fire Code
§8.2 Establishment and duties of bureau of fire prevention
§83 Definitions
§84 REPEALED
§8.5 REPEALED
§ 8.6 REPEALED
§8.7 Fire hazard abatement
§ 8.8 California Fire Code — Amendments
SECTION 8.1 ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

The 2013 California Fire Code, based on the 2012 International Fire Code, as adopted
and/or amended by the office of the California State Fire Marshal, including Appendices
A through K, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to any changes set forth in the
chapter. The Council, by resolution, may from time to time designate which edition of
the California Fire Code is currently revised, and the edition so designated by Council
resolution shall be the one referred to throughout this Code. One copy of Chapter 8 of the
Piedmont Municipal Code and the California Fire Code shall be kept on file at the
Department of Public Works. (Ord. No.315 N.S., Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. 675 N.S.
12/07, Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

SECTION 8.2 ESTABLISHMENT AND DUTIES OF BUREAU OF FIRE
PREVENTION

(@) The California Fire Code shall be enforced by the Bureau of Fire Prevention in
the Fire Department of the City of Piedmont, which is hereby established, and which
shall be operated under the supervision of the Chief of the Fire Department. (Ord. No.
315N.8.; Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02)

(b)  The person in charge of the Bureau of Fire Prevention shall be the Fire Marshal
and shall be appointed by the Fire Chief. (Ord. 315 N.S., 592 N.S. 10/97)

() The Fire Chief, members of the Fire Prevention Division, and personnel assigned
as Fire Arson Investigators shall be peace officers and have the powers as such as
established in Section 830.37(a) of the California Penal Code. Other members of the Fire
Department shall be peace officers and have the powers as such as established in Section
830.37(b) of the California Penal Code.

! For charter provisions as to the chief of the fire department, see Char. §3.09. For state law generally as to fires and
fire protection, see H. & S.C. §13000 et seq.

34



SECTION 8.3 DEFINITIONS

For the purposes of this chapter, certain words and phrases are defined and certain
provisions shall be construed as herein set out unless it shall be apparent from their
context that a different meaning is intended:

(@ Abatement Authority. The Chief of the Piedmont Fire Department or his
designee.

(b) Corporation Counsel. Wherever used in the California Fire Code it shall be held
to mean the City Attorney for the City of Piedmont. (Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02)

() Defensible Space. The area between a house or unimproved property and an
oncoming fire where the vegetation has been modified to reduce the wildfire
threat and which provides an opportunity for firefighters to safely defend the
house.

(d) Fire Prevention Engineer or Chief of the Bureau of Fire Prevention.. Whenever
used in the California Fire Code these terms shall be held to mean the Fire

Marshal of the City of Piedmont. (Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02)

(e) Flammable Vegetation. Vegetation which is dry, dead, or dying; pyrofites which
have a high resin or sap content including but not limited to Arborvitae, California
Bay, Cedar, Cypress, Douglas Fir, Eucalyptus, Fir, Juniper, Palm, Pine, Spruce,
Yew, California buckwheat, California sagebrush, Chamise or greasewood,
Laurel sumac, Manzanita, Pampas grass, Rosemary, Scotch broom, Spanish
Broom, Sugar bush, and Toyon; and which is over six (6) inches in height.

® Hazardous Fire Areas. Areas of the city identified by the Fire Marshal in which
the combination of aspect, slope and/or density of naturally occurring flammable
vegetation create an additional fire hazard. These areas shall be established by the
Fire Marshall and maps indicating the properties subject to this definition shall be
made available to the public.

(g) Jurisdiction. Whenever used in the California Fire Code, it shall be held to mean
the Piedmont Fire Department. (Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02)

(h) Vegetative Growth. Plant material including but not limited to grasses, weeds,
vines, shrubs and trees which occur naturally or are part of a landscaped area.
(Ord. No. 315 N.S., Ord. 592 N.S. 10/97)

(i) Temporary fire department access road for construction. An approved temporary

roadway for emergency vehicle use during the construction of residential and
commercial projects.

() Temporary water supply. Water stored for firefighting purposes in an approved

35



above ground system during the construction of residential or commercial

projects.
SECTION 8.4 REPEALED (See 2013 California Fire Code) (Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)
SECTION 8.5 REPEALED
SECTION 8.6 REPEALED (See 2013 California Fire Code) (Ord. No. 713 N.S.
02/14)
SECTION 8.7 FIRE HAZARD ABATEMENT

Fire hazard abatement in the City of Piedmont may be enforced pursuant to the California
Fire Code or its successor codes. (Ord. 634 N.S. 12/02, Ord. 675 N.S. 12/07)

8.7.1 Authority to Abate. The Abatement Authority may abate any fire hazard within
the City of Piedmont and make the expense of abatement (1) a personal obligation
of the property owner, and (2) a lien against the property on which the fire hazard
exists or is maintained which may be assessed and collected with ordinary
municipal taxes, pursuant to the provisions of the California Fire Code or its
successor codes. (Ord. 675 N.S. 12/07)

8.7.2 Abatement Procedure. The abatement procedure for fire hazards shall be in
accordance with procedures set forth in Sections 6.5 through 6.16 of the Piedmont
Municipal Code. (Ord. 592 N.S. 10/97, Ord. 675 N.S. 12/07)

SECTION 8. CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE — AMENDMENTS

The following sections of the California Fire Code adopted in Section 8.1 of this Code
are amended to read as follows:

8.8.1 Section 105.6.48 Christmas tree sales: A permit is required to use a property for
the purpose of selling cut Christmas trees.

8.8.2 Section 105.6.49 Temporary water supply: A permit is required to use an
approved temporary water supply for construction of residential projects, sub-
divisions, and commercial projects

8.8.3 Section 5608.1 Fireworks: The possession, manufacture, storage, sale, handling
and use of fireworks are prohibited. The possession, manufacture, storage, sale,
handling and use of fireworks or pyrotechnic materials within the jurisdiction of
the City are prohibited.

Exceptions:
1. Snap Caps and Party Poppers classified by the State Fire Marshal as
pyrotechnic devices. (Ord. No. 713 N.S. 02/14)

36



