STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
—_— -_—

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

October 31, 2014

Patricia Athenour
City Clerk

City of Pinole
2131 Pear Street
Pinole, CA 94564

RE: Ordinance # 2014-01

Dear Ms. Athenour:

This letter is.to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on October 23, 2014 .

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

"gp{;ique M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



O’'Brien, Laurie@DGS
m

From: Patricia Athenour <PAthenour@ci.pinole.ca.us>

Sent: Thursday, October 23, 2014 1:43 PM

To: CrdinanceFilings@DGS

Subject: FW: City of Pinole Building Code Adoption with Local Amendments
Attachments: 0-2014-01.pdf; Building Code Findings.PDF

To: Building Code Standards Commission

Attached please find Ordinance 2014-01, Adopting By Reference the 2013 Codes and Resolution 2014-56 Supporting
Loca! Modificaticns. If you have any questions, please contact Planning Manager Winston Rhodes at 510-724-9832 or

email / wrhodes@ci.pinole.ca.us
Pateivic £ oienoar, HMHC

Pinole City Clerk
2131 Pear Sireet
Pinole CA 94564
Ph: 510.724.8928

Pinole City Hall office hours: Monday through Thursday - 8 am to 4:30 PM. Closed Fridays.



]

CITY OF PINOLE

wmgri23 P 220 ORDINANCE NO. 2014-01
. serereadi o B ”‘ La":
m‘@RﬁlN‘ ESOF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PINOLE REPEALING

AND-REPLACING CHAPTERS 15.02 THROUGH 15.24 OF TITLE 15 “BUILDINGS
AND CONSTRUCTION” OF THE PINOLE MUNICIPAL CODE AND REPEALING
CHAPTER 15.40 “FIRE CODE” OF TITLE 15 OF THE PINOLE MUNICIPAL CODE iN
ORDER TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE, WITH MODIFICATIONS TO ADDRESS
UNIQUE LOCCAL CONDIT!IONS, THE 2013 EDITIONS OF THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE, THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE CALIFORNIA
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE, THE
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, THE CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, AND THE
2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE .

WHEREAS, currently Title 15 “Buildings and Construction” of the City of Pinocle
Municipal Code adopts the building standards contained in the 2013 versions of the
California Building Code, the California Residential Code, the California Fire Code, the
California Green Building Standards Code, the California Plumbing Code, the California
Mechanical Code, and the California Electrical Code, California Administrative Code, as
such Codes are approved by the State Building Standards Commission (collectively, the
“California Building Standards Code"); and

WHEREAS, the updated California Building Standards Code became effective
within the City on January 1, 2014, took full effect on July 1, 2014 and Title 15 was
updated by default to mcorporate the California Building Standards Code without local
amendments; and

WHEREAS, Section 17922 of the California Health and Safety Code requires
local agencies to adopt the building standards contained in the California Building
Standards Code; and

WHEREAS, Section 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code allows
local agencies to enact modifications to those building standards provided that such
modifications are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions so long as a local agency adopts such findings; and

WHEREAS, the City adopted findings justifying local modifications based on
local climatic, geologic, and topographic conditions on September 16, 2014; and

WHEREAS, a duly noticed public hearing was advertised in the West County
Times on October 2, 2014 and October 9, 2014 as required by Government Code
section 65090; and

WHEREAS, the City Council held a public hearing related to this Ordinance on



Council Ordinance 2014-01

October 21, 2014 and considered the staff report and public testirony received: and

WHEREAS, the City CoUﬁ‘c:iI"ﬁ_nds that h:o;::édditional en\iirqnme_ntal review- |s

welfare.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY ‘OF PINOLE DOES ORDAIN
as follows: _ L Sk | '

SECTION 1. The forgoing Reditals are triis-and correct andincofporated hersin by this

reference. L Lo

designated as :the: California Building Standards::Code, 2013 Edition; comprising Title:

24, Parts 1, 2 (Vol. 1.and 2), 2.5, 3, 4, 5,.6,9, 11,..and 12 Califomia.Code of

Regulations, together with all appendices”thereto; the'i2009 Intemational. Property



Council Ordinance 2014-01 o

SECTION3. Y
Chapters15 02, 15.04,15.06, 15. o'a' 15.10, 15.12, .'5'14 15118, '1518 15, 2'0"'1522

o Tile1d

BUILDINGS AND.CONSTRUCTION

Chapters: e S S 1)
... ADOPTION OF UNIFORM BUILDING CODES

15.02 General Provnszons : , . L
15.04 California Building Code ‘ S o
15.06 California Residential Code.. - e -
15.08 California Green Building Standards Code .
15.10 Califérnia Electrical Code | : Wi
15.12 California Plumbing Code - . - LE
15.14 California Mechanical. Code
16.16 Housmg and Propert'y' 'Malntenance Code
15.18 Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
15.20 California Fire Code. ::.
15.22 Administrative Code i

16.24 Violation - Penaity



Council Ordinance 201 4-01

Sections:
15.02.010  Title..
15.02.020  Organization.

15.02.030 Codes adopted by reference. RPN SRR
15.02.040 Expiration of permits... . ' B

15.02.050 Premises identification numbering, * =
15.02.060 Construction permit fees — set by City Council.

15.02.070 Permitted hours and condition: of construction, penalties.

15.02.080  Misrepresentations in‘permit application. - .
15.02.090 Disconnection of utility service. 1 : ' .

15.02.010 TITLE. -

and shall be cited as such. . L

15.02.020 ORGANIZATION.

A building division is established in accordance with the ‘bro.vis.io_nsi of California.

Building Code, 2013 Edition, adopted in Chapter 15.04, This division shall be a part of
and shall-operate under the direction of the Community.: Development Director. - The
building division is authorized to.direct and enforce.all of the provisions of this Title and

any of the Codes adopted in this Title:

15.02.030 CODES ADOPTED BY REFERENCE. oL

For the plirpose -of establishing - proper regulations for blilding construction,
maintenarice of housing ‘standards, installation of electrical,: plumbing and: mechanical

15.02.040 EXPIRATION OF PERMITS, (" N CoE

All permits’ié;éﬂediby the building division shall expire one Hundred eighty (180)



15.02.050 PREMISES lDENTIFICATlON NUMBERING

A. Every main structure or building constructed altered, repalred or moved |nto the

City shall be assrgned ‘a street address identification: iumber by the Building Official and:

approved by the Fire Code Offi cial (as-defined in 15.04.030.0f this Code).:

B. Ident|flcat|on numbers shaII be plaoed on. the street srde -of the bulldlng or

the surroundlng .color. Numbers shall - be lnstatled pnor to f nal_ lnspectlon and.
occupancy of the: bmldlng or structure. - SRR

D. The owner or hIS or- her de5|gnated agent shall be responsmle for the
maintenance -of |dent|ﬁcat|on numbers

E. Any changes to the- assrgned street: ldentn" cation numbers muist be approved by -

the Building Official and Fire Code Off cial. e

F. The fee for ass;gmng or modrfyrng a street address shall be set by resolution of_’ )

the City Council.

Total Estimated Cost ____________ Total Tlme Allowed
e T N L
Over $1,000 to and'ineludmg $10, 000 | emonths T
‘Over $10i000 to and-: mc.udmg 1 12months

$100,000 o i = T e

Over $100,000 to and _,mcludmg' “ |+ 18 months . - e S
$1,000,000 B EEENRT S
Over $1,000,000 to and mctudmg,"' ) 24 months ]
$2,000,000; - -

Over $2,000,000° to and mcludjn:g,: ~ T30months s
$10000000 - | | :
Qve_r$10'5,d(5)'6',000“_. T T 36 months P



Council Ordina_nce. 2014-01

16.02.060 CONSTRUCTION PERMIT FEES - SET BY COUNCIL. ¢

All constructron permit fees mcludlng burldlng, plumblng, mechanlcal eIectrlcaI -

swimming pools and solar shall be set by resolutron of the: City Council and reflected in
the City's Master Fee- Schedule Lo :

15.02.070 PERMITTED HOURS AND CONDITION:: OF CONSTR.U.CTION

PENALTIES.

Thanksglvrng, but no lnspectlons erI be performed

B. Saturday work is “aliowed in_commercial zones only, from nine a.m. (9 00 a.m.) to
six p.m. (6:00 p: m) as long as: rt is interior work:‘and does not: generate S|gn|f|cant
n°|se PR

C. Exceptlons for residential. .property owners.

1. - Homeowners performlng addltlons repairs, or remodellng are allowed to

five p.m. (5:00 p.m:). | G
2, By written au‘thonzatlon of the Burldlng OffICIaI a resldentrelmbroperty
owner with a valid permit to construct a single-family: residence for: .personal occupancy

shall be aliowed to work on weekends .and holidays bétween nine a.m. (8:00 a.m.) and.
five p.m. (5:00 p.m.). ThIS -authorization shall be granted ‘to applicants who ‘have not

built a residence.in the City in the previous five (5) year penod and w__ho affirm in wntlng B

their intention to reSIde at the subject property



Council Ordmance 2014 01

15.02.080 MISREPRESENTATIONS iNPERMIT APPLfiC:AT-lON |

mlsrepresentation or false statement contalned in-an apphcatlon for-a pemut Or:: for--. )

violations' of this Title in connectnon with work done under the: permlt R

15.02.090 DISCONNECTION OF UTILITY SERVICE

to be in woiatuon of any state or county law or regulatlon relatmg thereto or to the pubhc’

health, safety. or welfare, or he may order this done. If he/she finds that the violation ™ -

involvés an immediate danger to person(s). or to. other propeities or to the public health,

safety or welfare, he/she may :have the action.taken as quickly as he/she deems:

necessitated by the danger; otherwise-he/she shall give ten. (10) days advance notice -
thereof by mail to the:utility and the owier of the property as shown:on'the last
assessment roil and by consplcuously postmg notlce of his orders and the. actaon taken |

Chapter 15.04 i i
BUILDING cooe .

Sections:

15.04.010 Adoption:byreferenoe R =
1_§.Q_4_M Coplesonﬂe e



CouncHOrdmance2014-01' IR RN - b | N

A. Section 105 2 (Work Exempt from Permit) of the CBC Chapter 1. subsectlon 1 |s:-'. :
amended to read- asfollows o KT T

amended addlng subsectron 14 to’ read as follows:

14 Detached decks under 100 square feet and- under 30 mches in helght for

has been pursued in good faith, ora permlt has been issued: except ‘that the.-: .
building official is authorized ‘to. grant one or more extensrons of up to (6)
months. The extensnons shall be requested |n wntlng and justlf ed_._cause
one (1) year after which tlme the appllcatlon explres and a new:plan review fee::ﬁ
must be paid. The code in effect at the time the newest apphcatlon |s made :
shall be the code thatis enforced

jOb. 2R SRS LR o



Council Ordinance. 2014-01

contractor‘s license.

1105.'8.2 A permrt may be |ssued for work in & smgle-famrly dwellrng used
exclusrvely for living purposes, including any -accessory buildings, if the permittee. - -

is the bona fide.owner of the structure occupied by. or designed to be occupied - by -

the owner, in which:case the owner-himself fulfills. the role of contractor for all e

F. Section 107.2. 1 (Informatron on Constructron Documents) of CBC
Chapter1 is-amended to read: ' o T i

this code and all. retevant Iaws ordrnances rules and regulatrons The
first sheet of each set-of pIans shall give the house and street address of

property lines Iab‘ele'd and fully drmensroned the etevatron of the top and:__
toe of cuts: and fills, and :the “locaticn of the proposed burldrng with’

approve references on the plans to a specrt“ o sectron or part of this code
or other ordrnances or laws.



Council Ordinance 20q4-o1

specrf ed |n Chapter 15. 20 have been met. .

H. Chapter 1 Division II-'Subsection 107.6 (Standard plang).is added to read:

as follows:

107.6.1 — Standard plans. The building official may:approve a set.of -
plans for .a- building or structure as a “standard plan,” provrded the
applicant has. made proper: ‘application, submiittéd complete séts of plans,
and pald the plan checkrng fee as requued by the Clty of Plnole When it
three plot plans shall bé submitted, and & plan-checkrng“fee equal to
orie-half of the full: plan-checkrng fee requrred by the: City of Pinole shall.
be paid at the time applrcatron is made for such identical structure. Such

duplrcate plans shall be  compared, stamped and kept. on:the. jobas

requrred by Calrforma Burldmg Code section [A] 107 3 1 In case of any.

the end of the sectlon

At the trme of. ﬁrst lnspectron by the Crty bulldlng ofﬁcral _a__hcensed Land i

structure is placed accordrng to the approved set of plans The wrltten

certrt’ catlon must rnclude the srte address and permrt number Thlsjg

ean 10 .....



Council Ordinance 2014-01 ... B

fcllowmg def nlt|on

Accessory Living Unit: is a.second dwelllpg uniton the same lot as a smgle— ______
family dwelling with or without a separate entrance from the exterior. Gy

L. Section 202 of Chapter 2 (Definitions) of the CBC is amended to: mclude the
followmg définition: ::'2:2355:. :

read as follows

1Address numbers Apartment Condbmimum and:' ‘l'"ownhOUSe

visible from sald vehlcular and walkwayentranoe SRE
a. An apartment condomlnlum or townhouse complex shalI be

11



Counci Ordinanoe:2014:-'01 S

rear of the buudrng shall have ldentlcal addresses at both Iocatlons ; - Ml

3. lndustrral - Individual unrts within:a building shall-be addressed front i o
and back Indrwdual burldlngs shall be marked at'd. pornt clearly vrsrble =

automatlcally lighted at: mght

O. Section 902 of the CBC is- amended to add the foIIowmg definiion: ;;_ﬁ:i%%"

903.2.1. 1 Group A1, An automatlc spnnkler system. shaII be provrded for

Group A-1 occupancles where one of the foIIowrng condrtlons exrsts e

1. The ﬂ,re, area exoeeds 5 000 square feet
2. The fire area has an oocupant Ioad of 300 or"m'ore . SR
3. The f re: area |s Iocated on. a ,,ﬂoor other than a Ie\rel of exrt, drscharg:e -

4. The ﬁre area contarns a multl-theater complex

......................



Council Ordinanc_e 20—‘_&4-01

more burldlngs by f rewalls of less: than four-hour fi re res1stance rating*i
without openings. : '

1. Thefire aréa exceeds 5,000 square fest. ..

2: The flre area ‘has an occupant load of 300 or more. — i

3. The ﬁre .area is located ‘on a ﬂoor other than a Ievel of exrt dlscharge;-:

openings. g g ;;-:,;;--j o

903.2.4 .. Groub' F-1.. - iAn automatic. sprinkler system shall: be prowded;:'j_ :
throughout atl buildings ccntalnlng Group F-1. occupancy where .one of the. ..

follewing conditions ‘exists: .:_.:3 _ Lo i

1. A -.G_roup F-1 fire ar3'ea; exceeds 5,000square feet. o R



Council Ordina_noe_:2014-61 T

2, A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three storles above grade
plane. - o
3. ‘The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas:on all roors mcludlng any

mezzanrnes ‘exceeds 10, 000 square feet.

903.2. 7 = Group M. An -automatic . spnnkler system shall be . provrded
throughout buildings containing Group M occupancy where one of the’ followrng
condrtlons eX|sts ' oo : L i

1.. A Group Mfire area exceedsS 000 sq:uare feet:: h e - o
2 A: Group ‘M fire area |s ‘jocated more: than three storles 'ab'ove grade plane
3. The combrned area of all Group M flre areas on all ﬂoors |nclud|ng any

90329 Group S1 An automatlc sprlnkler system shall be provrded
throughout::all :buildings | contarnlng Group S-1 occupancy where one of the

following condltlons emsts

1. A Group S 1-fire. area exceeds 5, 000 square feet

2. A Group S- 1 frre area is Iocated more than three storres above grade-
plane B O
3 The comblned area of 'aII Group S-'1' ﬁre areas on all ﬂoors mcludrng ‘ahy

basements, with: a f ife area conta_imjn'g a repalr garage exceedlng 5 000 square aL
feet. .



Council Ordinance 2014-01 .~ . = ... . oo

follows

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parkrng garage exceeds 5 000 square """
feetor - ...

2 Where ‘the. enclosed parklng garage is tocated beneath other occupancy
groups: -+ & . b, i

R: Subsection:1505.1. 5 (Shmgles and shakes) is:added to Chapter 15 (Roof ng)
of the California Burldlng Code to read as follows: -

shake . or shlngles shaII be permrtted regardless of class desrgnatron See

Section 1505.1.1: of the California Building Code for rooflng standards |n very i
high fire. hazard severityzones ‘ D RPN G

T. Subsection 1907.1.2 (Minimum slab thickness) is adéiéd fo Chapter 19.:::: o
(Concrete) .of the Cahforma Bulldlng Code to read as fol!ows . S e T

" 15



V. Subsectlon 2304 1126 of th‘e CBC |s amended to add the followmg sentence at' .
the end thereof: . T _:.‘:;.:: *



Council Ordinance 204401 ...

Sections:

15,06.010 ] Adoption by reference L
15.06.020 Copies on file. S e 3

15.06.030 ¢ Amendments made in the Callfornla Resrdentrai Code e T

15.02. 010, and all amendments thereto sha|l be kept on f Ie |n the burldlng ofﬁcral' )

office for mspectlon by the publlc : t

15.06.030 Amendments made in the Callforma ResldentIaE Code

def nition to read as foIIows
Pcol: Any outside: body of water created: by artrﬂclal means any portlon of whlch

exceeds erghteen inches (1 8“) in depth

‘All-new roof covenngs shall be a class B-or better roof covenng g
assemblyas defined by CBC 1505 T o T

17



slabs supported dlrectly on the ground in all occupancres except “r
occupancres that are not attached to another structure Non-engmeered:"

each way

E. Subsectlon R1007. (Woed burmng stoves).is added to- Chapter 10 (Chlmneys L
and Frreplaces) of the’ Callfomra Res1dent|al Code to read as follows e

be one of the followrng S Re

1. A pellet fueled ‘wood devrce

and approved pl'IOl' to plastenng or ﬁllmg W|th water The barrrer shall
comply wrth the followung Bl

- l: 18 .....



notbe Iessthan11gauge o

d. Access gates shall:comply with the requirements: of-items a.
throughi ¢&. Pedestrian access gates: shall be self-closing and have:a

seIf-Iatchrng devroe wrth the tatchmg serwce “at least 60" above'_._-

water area shall provrde a separatron fence and gate meetrng the
requrrements of Items a, b, c. and d: . R

EXCEPTION: When: approved by the burldlng official, one of the

following may be used: i __-f;;;;;_ %

:.seconds rmmedlately after the door and its screen:: If present

are opened, and be capablé of providing a'sound pressure. level_ &
.;of not less than 85 dba - when measured rndoors at 10 feet -

Ionger than 15 seconds The deactrvatron swrtch shall be, '
;Iocated at least. 60 rnches (1, 524 mm) above the threshold of -

19



Sectiohs: ' : : . o SRR

ASTM-ES 13-89 shall be consndered in oompllance w1th Pool )
Enclosure Reqmrements : o G

comply W|th the requwements of Item e.

2. Any pool spa or hot tub for whlch a buuldmg permlt was lssued prlor to BRI

15.08.010 'Adoptics'n'byr'efefendé R ;gﬂiQQ?iiE. :
15.08.020 -: Coplesonflle : ' '-;.-:;..

COde E PR ' N 'ff

20



chapter - L ;;';gss.“ ;

18.08.020 Copies on file. - ;;_g;fii:_ |

The California Green Building: Standards Code is: amended and changed in the Ei,'.;”-I i

following respects: B5, PN

B. Section 1043 3'is added to: the Calrfornla Green Building Standards Code fo |

read as follows: : NPT

Section 101 3.3 When the: total cost ofa resldentlal constructlon project exceeds o

a valuation threshold-of 20,000 dollars-or more based on the January 2011 “ENR

US20 Cities “ average construction-cost index, the project is encouraged fo_ .

comply wnth one or more of the followmg for the exrstmg dwelling:: The ltem(s) S

" o R-30 e '3'253'3

Exempt Those buildings with no attic, or madequate attic space between roof R

and celllng be'ow |nadequate space ls defined as that where the roof slope is

| T~ L



Exempt: Ducts betweén ﬂoors inside interior walls or otherW|se maccesslble _

without aiteration.

3.

Exempt: Hot water pipes between floors, |n5|de interior walls or othervwse
|nacces5|ble without alteration. ..’ - 5'::§Zi.;

7.
8.

11. Conslderatlons may be made for other energy |mprovements if. approved by’:-.

the Building Official. items from: the list performed ‘within 6 months: of the
permlt apphcatlon may also be consudered W|th verlﬁcatlon ST

| R



Council O!'dlnan082014-01 ) R R 5

| Cha'pte‘r“1510 e
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICALCODE R

Sections: Dow ol i

15.10.010 - Adoptuonbyreference S ',f'iiiz:i 3r

15.10.020° :Copy on file. % ° i _—
15.10.030 Amendments made in the California Electr-cal Code i

15.10.010 Adoption by reference. HE ff";?f

.Chapter16.12...
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE

Sections:

156.12.010 Adoptlon by reference

15.12.020: Copy on file. _-;:;‘:g:'_; T

156.12.030 Amendments made in the Callforma Plumblng Code

gy e



CALIFORNIAMECHANICALCODE

24



ChaptGI' 15 16 ;;ff; - ’ o '.:::.: i i
CAL'FORNlA HOUS'NG AND PROPERTY MAINTENACE CODE SR

Sections: | BROOT R

15.16.010  Housing and Property Maintenance Code = Adoptlon ' SRS

15.16.020  IPMC 102.3.Amended - Application of othef codes. . e O RV o
15.16.030 IPMC 304.:14 Amended ~ Insect screens. i TN =
15.16.040  IPMC 307.3.1 Amended — Disposil of garbage. =~ .. T i . U E

15.16.050 IPMC.602.4 Amended = 0ccup|ed wotk spaces e o
15.16.060° House moving - B o L
15.16.070 Comphance ‘with constructron requrrements o : o - B

15.16.010  HOUSING AND PROPERTY _MAINTENANCE 't':"onE ADOPTION """"

Property Malntenance Code (IPMC) except as amended by the changes addrtrons and

deletions set forth in thrs Chapter L e g

15.16.020 IPMC" 102.3 AMENDED APPLICATIGN OF OTHER cones G

15.16.030 IPMC30414AMENDED INSECTSCREENS SR e

e | 2'5 ...........



COU“Cllordlnance2014-o1 RO o S - F i

During the entire year, every door, window and otherioutside openingfnéahiired for
ventilation of habitable rooms, food:preparation areas, food service:areas. or any areas.
where products t6.bé included or utilized in food for human consumption’ are processed,

manufactured; packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting: screens
of minimum 16.mesh per inch (16.mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door- used for . .
insect control shall'have a self-closing device in good working condition:: R

Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means, suchas
air curtains ior insect repellent fans, are employed. SR 1

15.16.040. 1PMC 307.3.1/AMENDED ~DISPOSAL OF GARBAGE. 5" - S

Section 308:3:1 of the IPMC is amenided as follows: e R

ntenc i -aj igrator unit in the 'structure
available to the ogcupants in each dwelling unit’ shall:be deleted in its:entirety. .

occupied.

Exceptions: - . B : R : C
1. Processing, storage’.and ‘operation areas ‘that require:cooling or special*. -
temperature conditions. -
2.-  Areas in which .persons ‘are primarily erigaged in vigorous physica
activities. ;- i .: : S

B. Housé moving, as permitted in this section, is allov

and hours as stated ‘on the permit.and on the routes as approved by:the o
director of public:works and the: chief of police. . .~ - U s o T e

C. The bﬁ.ilc‘i'ingjf’dépaﬁméht fna{yiii;sléUe:a permit for. house nioVingéf\&hé_nﬁ -
the person, firm or corporation has applied for such.permit and has complied * .. .,
with thefollpwing: SRR G R O

tie R



bodily i |njury ‘and twenty-f ve thcusand dollars property damage,

4. Payment of a perrmt fee of flfty doilars for each day or’ palt_.

8. Postatime schedule with the public services deparlment building -

department and police department at: least twenty-four hours in advance of

any actual move.

27



Sections: . o o | R

15.18.010  Abatement of dangerous buﬂdlngs - Adoption o "5;3;55333_ 3

15.18.020  Section 801.3 Amended —-Costs o o
15.18.030° ‘Section 912 Amended — Cost Recovery S

16.18.010 ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS . i ~

The abatement of dangerous burldlngs code for the city is the 1997 Ed|t|on of .
Abatement of Dangerous Burldmgs Code as adopted and printed- by the Intematlonal

Conference of BUIldIng Officials. : =°* =~ L e )

15.18.020 SECTION 801:3 AMENDED = COSTS. e _','

follows

912. All money recovered by payment of the: change or assessment or from the sale of::

the property at foreclosure sale.shall be paid to the Finance Drrector of the Clty ‘who
shall credit the same to the General _Fund '

Sections:

15.20.020 Establishment and duties of bureau of frre preventron A
15.20.030. Amendmentsito the California: Fire:Code. ;:“:;:. _ ;}‘g}iz.i__ v
15.20.040 - Appeals.. ' B
15.20.050 New materials, processes or occupancy WhICh may requrre penmts
15.20.060 Violation — Penalty R o TR

15.20.010 Fire:Code — Adoptron 3 SR o S e e

28



forth in thls Chapter
15.20.020 ESTABLISHMENT AND DUTIES OF BUREAU OF FIRE PREVENTION

16.20.030 AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

Chapter1. - | Admlnlstratlon

Chapter 1 is adopted in.its entlrety except as amended below.

‘5. Where not othenmse limited by law, the provnsnons of this code shall apply
to vehicles, ships; boats, and other:mobile vehrcles when fixed |n a speclﬁc Iocatlon.

within the boundaries of thls junsdlotutm :

Section 105.6 is amended. to read

105.6 Required operatlonal permuts The Flre Code Offi C|al is- authonzed to‘
issue operational permrts for the operations set forth in: Chapter 1 Sectlons 105 6 1
thl'ough 105.6. 54 _ .';:5:. . _ onet ool o s

Section 105 6 is amended by addlng subsectlons 105 648 through 105657 to
read: - -

105.6. 49 Battery systems A permit is requnred to operate statlonary Iead-"
acid battery systems havmg a: I|qu.d capacrty of - more than:50: gallons (189 L) pursuant
to Section 608 :

------- i 29 I - o e ve weae



Council Ordinance. 2,'0:14140:1 .

105.6.50 Chrlstmas tree sales A perrnlt is requ1red to use a property for the

purpose of sellmg cut Christmas trees L T b

105 6.51 Flrework aerlal dlsplay A permlt is reqwred to conduct a: ﬁrework

3312.1. S E | G

105.6.54 Tire storage A permit is requ1red to store more than one: thousand

(1,000) cubic feet (28 3m3) of tires inside buildings pursuant to Chapter 34 N .

Section 1057|samended toread: . RS R

105.7 Requrred construc’non permlts The:Fire Code Ofﬁcral lis authonzed to*5
issue construction perrmts for, the operatlons set forth m Chapter 1, Sectlons 105. 74

through105721 L L

jurlsdlctlon where a bunldlng permit: IS requwed

105.7.17 Medlcal gas systems. : A constructlon permlt is reqwred for the
installation of or’ modlflcatlon toa medlcal gas system: pursuant to Sectlon §306. . g :

105.7.18 R Refrlgeratlon equupment A perm|t___|s_. reqwred to “ihstall a

mechanical refrlgeratlon unit or system regulated by Chapter 6 of the QFC IR S

~ 30 »



buildings erther constructed or moved into ‘the Department pursuant to Sectlon 507 of
the CFC.

105.7.21 ~ Solar: photovoltalc power :'systems. A constructlon penmt is
required to rnstall or modlfy solar photovoltalc power systems

Section 108. 1 |s amended to read

1081 Board of Appeals estabhshed in order to hear and decide“appeals of ..

otherwise specified, each ten “ 0) days that pl'Ohlblted conditions are maintalned shall

~ constitute a separate offense.’ The appllcatlon of the aforesald penalty shall not be held:.- ;

layer of asphalt or ooncrete that is desrgned to carry the rmposed we:ght Ioads of f re

apparatus. o ST R BB

31



Council Ordin'anpe "20:1.4:#0'1 :

Drlveway A prlvate roadway that provides access to no more than two single-
family dwelllngs BT

Fire Code Oﬁ' cnal The Fire Code Official is the Flre Chlef or hisiher desngnee

aCtlvatIng event ':' : i

Response tlme The elapsed time from reoelpt of call to the arnval of the f rst umt--' :'

on scene.. . g

32




Council Ordinance 2014-01 . = .

m;tlgated in accordance ‘Wwith Section 319

Section 304. 11.'4 is ad_de_d .as follows-:

eqUIpment free from accumulatlons of Ilnt and- combustible matenals ' };:;;;_

Section 319:1.4 Exception 1 is amended toread:: ° g mle

Exceptlon1 Residential Occupanczes ST [

319 Extenor Flre Hazard Control

319. 1 General

319.1.1 Junsdlctlonal Authority. .. The City Cou_n_ql of the Clty of
Pinole, as the supervising, legislative-and executive: authonty of the. junsdlction has‘the
authority :to act pursuant:tePart 5 (commencing. with’ Section: 14875), Division:12, of the

Health and Safety Code; to clear or order the clearlng .of rubbish, litter: or_other

flammable matetial- where such flammable material endangers the: publlc the safety by: -

creating a fire hazard. Such fire hazard abatement shall be conducted |n accordance-

with provisions of sald Part 5 and/or this’ Ordlnance

319 1 2 Cont racf'for Serwces The City Councnl of Plnole delegates:f'

...... -‘ 33 . R B




as to become when dry, a fire menace to adjacent |mproved property

Weeds that are. othervvlse noxious or dangerous

endanger the publrc safety by creatlng a ﬁre hazard S :Et::gﬁi :

Rubblsh Waste matter I|tter trash refuse debris and dirt’ on streets or’, -

private property within the junsdlctlon which. may become a ﬁre hazard E

-319. 4 Abatement of Hazard

31941 Prohlbltlon ' No person who has any ownershlp or'“"

e . 34 .........




Council Ordinance:2_014'-051 3

319.4.2 Specrflc Requrrements The Flre Department shall develop
m:mmum abatement -standards for Iand in residentlal rural andlor rural resudent:al -

.319.4.2. 1 Clearanée of Weeds from Streets. The Fire. Code OfF C|ai s

authorlzed to cause areas; within 10 feet (3048 mm) -on'each: srde of portlons of streets -

flammable vegetat!on and other:. combustlble growth. The Fite iCode Off cial;’ lsz:}_ s

authorized to enter ! upon private property to do s0.

319.5.. Abatement Proced ures.

31951 Abatement ‘Order. The Flre Code Oﬁ' cual may. order the'.
abatement of the weeds and rubblsh descrlbed |n Sectlons 304.1 2 and 319 2, above _

equallzed assessment ro!l ‘or as their names and addresses are known to the Flre Code

Official. As an- alternatlve to malllng, the’ notlce may be posted upon the affected... :

of the abatement hearing.. :Copies of the. nidtice wil be headéd- with the words “Notice to

Abate Weeds and Rubbish” in letters at: Ieast one inch” high. The notlce will. be |n

substantially the following form: - -

NOTICE TO ABATE WEEDS AND RUBBISH

Notice is' hereby given on : [date] that in acoordance wrth the Sectron
15 20. 030 of the Clty of Plnole Munrclpal Code weeds and rubbish: constrtute a

enforced

'35




Council Ordinance 2014-01" . ...

If you have-any questions, please call (name.of. Fire Code, Official) at (contact

info). -

City Council showing the cost of removing the weeds -and rubbish on’or in front of each

separate lot or parcel ofland, or both. - - : e
31955  Noticé arid Hearing on:Costs of Abatement. -Before the cost

report regarding the cost of abatement is:submitted to the: €ity Council, a.copy of the

report Wil be posted for at least five (5) days on or near the. door of the City . Council

Chambers with a:notice of the time and when the report will be submitted to the City:

Council for confirmation-or.the City Council may.diréct staff to mail a'Notice-of -Potential -

Lien to'each property owner at issue in the:icost report at least five (5) days prior to the

City Council hearing on the report.::Such Notice of Potential Lien shallinclude the cost:

property, and the time and: date of the City fQéun’pil hearing:on 5suc_h costs. i E

At thé tire fixed for receiving and considering the report. thé City Council

will hiear it and any objections-of any of the.property oWners, liable to be, assessed for ™ - -

y 35 .........




Council Ordinance:20}4:01

attaches upon recordatlon in.the oft" ce of the County Recorder of a certif ed copy of
the Resolution of Confirmation. . :

318. 5 6 . .Cost Assessments Upon cor't" irmat .on of the re'port of cost

dellnquency as provrded for ordinary county taxes AII laws appllcable to the levy,
collection; and enforcement of county taxes are appllcable to these assessment taxes

319.6 : Attemate Mltlgat-on in lieu of orderlng abatement as prowded |n" L
Sectlon 31951 the Fire Ccede Ofﬂcral may’ order the preparatlon of =

of fi rebreakslfuelbreaks .

319.7 Subsurface Fires. =~

319.7.1- -Peat F|re It is the duty of -each.person, firm, corporatlon ‘oF

association hot to perrmt a ‘peat fire in or:a fire lnvolvmg combustible vegetable matters
under the surface -of :the natural ground to. remam -upon the property Itis herebyE

319 7 2 .Fire- Suppressuon Costs If there.. exrsts upon the: Iands or
property -of any person as herein defined: a subsurface’ flre mvolvmg the burmng or

combustion of peat vegetable matter or vegetatlon and the owner ‘or: occupant thereof:.;_ :

......... 3 7



3202  Definitions: 5;-5;;;,:

320 3 3 . Weldlng and cuttlng Weldmg and cuttlng operatlons shall

320. 3 8 g Burnlng operatlons The burnmg of salvaged vehlcles and

38



Chapter 4. - Emergency Planmng and Preparedness

Chapter 4 is adopted in its entlrety except as follows: : ¥ i;g“-' §

Section 401.5:1 is amended by adding a new subsectlon 401 54.1 to read

503.1 4 '- Access to Open Spaces When eXIstmg access to -open land or‘." =

space; or to fire trall systems maintained:for public or private ‘use, is obstructed: by new

development of. any. kind, the developer shall provide. an.alternate means .of access into.. .
the area that is. sufﬁcnent to aliow’ access for fire - personnel and apparatus The ~

X ... . 39



60366 """ Sparks from chlmneys A chlmney that |s used W|th erther a

Mechanlcal Code

Chapter 8 Int:erlor lesh Decoratlve Materlals and Furmshmgs R 1-

Section 806 is amended by addlng subsections’ 806 1 4 806. 1. 5 and 806 1 6 to
read: : S :

806.1. 4 Flame retardance Cut trees shall be: treated by a Callfornla State

..................

do T

.......................



forms found in annex B of NFPA 25, Callforma Edrtlon

Section 902 is: amended to add Wiy S :::;'z;;;: ;

1. Theﬂreareaexoeeds5000 squarefeet zj:":.;?::. ) .55_:;;=-'-:.=

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or’ ‘more. 55:'551: e

903.2.1 3 Group A-3 An automatic sprinkler system shall be prowded for
Group A-3 occupanmes where’ one of the followmg condrtlons exlsts -

2. The fire area has an occupant load of: 300 or more.

3. The fire area is Iocated on a floor other than ‘a Ievel of exlt dlscharge
serving such occupancles e o :,;.-;;::. ; -

..... .”41 By ) N . e



Council Ordlnance 2014—01 i i .

903.2. 3 ’: Group E. Exoept as prowded for in -Section 903 2 3.1.for a- new -

public school campus an: automatlc sprinkler system shall: be prowded for Group E
occupancies as.follows: _ ‘:.;

903.2.4 ’ Group F-1 An ‘automatic sprlnkler system shaII be: prowded
throughout all buﬂdlngs contalnlng Group £-1 occupancy where one of the: followmg
conditions eX|sts : RN Lot aiaE

plane. G S

3. The combmed area -of: all:Group F 1. fire- areas on all ﬂoors lncludlng any;;g 3

mezzamnes exceeds 10 000 square feet

42 ......



903.2.9 i Group S1. An’ automatlc spnnkker system ‘shall be provuded:”..:

throughout - all bulldlngs contalntng Group:'S-1 occupancy wheré one of the followmg
conditions emsts . i ® AN e

piane.

Bu:ldmgs havmg two.-or more stories above grade plane, Includlng:
basements W|th a fire area contalnlng a repalr garage exceed:ng 5; 000 square feet ----- '

feet; or g i :; ..........

'R 43 ............

2. A Group S-1 fire area- is located more: than three stones above grade--:}_'=i



COUﬂCIlOrdInaI'ICGZO'M 01 'ff.:: 2z .: . “ ..:::'55:.: . : ’

groups.

Section 903. 3.1.1.2 i$ added as follows: -

approved location:i::. - oy R

Exceptron GroipiR-3 and R-3. 1 Occupancies. &~ - L

Section 903: 4 2 is amended to read:

903.4.2 Alarriis, One approved audible dev1ce shaII be connected fo every

automatlc spnnkler‘ system at an approved Iocatlon Such sprrnkler water-flow alarm -

':'44 ...........



of 4 (lowest hazard) ' e e o A
Section 90744|s added asfollows R : IR 2 2 E??Ei:
LE 907.4. 4 Monltorlng of other f iré systems ln buﬂdmgs equped-\'llvnl'th a f ire

907.5. 2 3.1 Public and common areas. Visible. alarm notlf cation. appllances shall
be provided in publlc use areas and common use: areas mcludmg but; not I|m|ted to

3. :Mu5|c practlce.rooms. | SR

. Ba'n& -rooms' '

4

8. Multtpurpose rooms. oy |
: : .
8

9

. Occupatlonal shops .....

1. Class'ooms CmSS e S S aBe  E

12. Medlcalexam fooms. oL e g R

45



18. Frle or Storage rooms-exceedmg 2OQ;sqoar_e feet.

Sectlon90765|samendedtoread S T e “

1. Slngle and multlple statlon srnoke_alanns req'mre& by sectron 907.2 1,1_

2. Group |-3 occupancles shali be monltored in accordance wrth sectlon s
907.2.6.3.4. e _ T SR

3. Residential Day Care Facmtles (occupancy load of 14 or Iess) :

4, One— and two—famlly dwelllngs

5. Resrdentlal Care Facmtles Ilcensed by the state wrth an occupant load of

six or less. ST : : :'Q'.ZQ?-.

907 86 ' Cerhflcatlon New f|re alarm systems shall be UL-Certlfed A



1 Pumps valves gaskets and similar equment _______
2 Plpes ducts glrders“of beams that have'a: Iength Iess 'fnan 21 Ilnear feet .
(6400 mm). oz R, el s B
3. Wé!lmor ceﬂmg panels ‘that have an area: 54 Egsilian: 1”0”square feet (0 935-5- |

m2) or:a dsmensuon of less than 10 Ilnear feet (3048 mm) ' Bt e
4. Floor tiles when thelr removai can be completed in Ies_s _t_h_an four hours_'--. i

5 Group R-3: bc'éupanmes ) ‘5:5 ) I e

33182 " Notlﬂcatlon ‘The Fire Code Official shall be: notified twenty-fourff
(24) hours pnor to the commencement and c!osure of asbestos-removal operatlons e

..... 47 |



5601 2 11 F|reworks The possessuon manufacture storage sale handllng B

dlsplay R
Snap Caps .and Party Popp'e'i"'s classﬂ' ed by the State Fire: Marshal as

pyrotechmc dewces . g JESTRC SRECEE T R

| 48 it 4 Lo S



19 Chapter 6 Article: 17 and when' applrcable NFPA 1122 NFPA 1125 and NFPA::"..;

127, 5 e

5601 3 1 A'nmonlum nitrate The storage and handling of ammonrum nltrate:-I. -

shall comply with the requ'rements of Chapter 40 and NIFPA 490 LS

' 5608.2 - :Parmit requrred A permit is requlred to conduct an: aerial display: i A
accordance W|th Callforma Code of Regulatrons Title 19, Chapter 6. (See Chapter iy =

Section 105.6, 52 )

5608.3 : Flnanclal responslbllrty Before 8 permrt is: |ssued pursuant to:-

Sectton 3308 2 the apphcant shall f le wrth the junsdrctlon a corporate surety bond in" -

exempt from thls bond requnrement U -:5 e

Chapter 57 Flammable and Combustible L=qurds i N B

Chapter 57is adopted m lts entlrety except as amended below

Sectron 5704 2 9 6 1 rs amended to read

“ds



S JUBe L TR L TR



sprinkler: "s'yétem and installed * in acoordance with Sectlon 903.3.1.1. Th'éiif .
resulting fire-flow-shall be not less than 1,500 gallons per mintite (5678le|n) for-
the prescrlbed duratlon as specn‘" ied i in Table B105 1oi=, dLa s

Appendlx C.: F|re Hydrant Locataons and Dlstrlbution

referto Sec 507 5 1 ] _ 2 . :El.::":'.

Appendlx D Flre Apparatus Access Roads N '; B

weighing :at !east 74,000 peunds (33 566 kg) in accordar-ce wnth Cal Trans De5|gn o =
Standard HS-20-44 S | T T ame o B T

51



finished surface of grooved. concrete sufficient to hold a 44,000 pound (19,958 kg).f:ﬂ.‘;

traction load. The grooves in the concrete: surface shall be ¥-inch (13 mm) wide by %

inch (13 mm) deep .and 1'% inch (38-mm) on center.and set at a 30 to 45.degree angle...
across the W|dth of the roadway surface No grade shaII exceed twenty percent (20%)

(feet)

0-150 . |  20% °|Nomerequred . ..

LENGTH - _ MINIMUM : iﬁ:':- TURNAROUNDS REQUIRED oo -

161=750 | " 20%: 100-foot Hammerhead 50-foot “Y" 75-foot Shunt or o

Over 7‘5-0,} g | Specil approval 'eq”'-'eqb """"




turnouts every 300 feet along the Iength of the road or dnveway, or" at_"__'
Iocatlons approved by the Flre Code Offi cual Ea’Ch"'outset or turnout shall be

90- DIAMETER SEIN S0y L MINIMUM CLEARANCE U
" CUL-DE-SAC o L AROUNDAFIRE .~ :*
. it HYDRANT:

: 200 NPT

ACCEPTABLE AL'tiéRNATtVE
TO. 100 HAMMERHEAD -

I.S3 .....



posted:on one side of the road as a fire lane. ks ol ':;"" |

Section D105.3 is amended to read | | L AT

~ D105. 3 Proxumlty to Bunldmg At Ieast one of the requ1red acoess routes o

D106.1 ;i Pro;ects having more than 100 dwelllng umts Multlple-famllyﬁ':. 5

Sectlon D1043 5 L EEE L

Exceptlon Delefed' o L o , S g

15-20 040. - APPEALS : ) % ::: . SN _:'.':;:.:

15.20.050 © NEW MATERIALS PROCESSES OR OCCUPANCIES WHICH MAY

REQUIRE PERMITS. - :;;;:::_, """ """ 5 ;;;z;:

Cw



thereoftomterestedpersons ' ;:.. AR .

15.20.060 VIOLATION PENALTY i T

punishable by a fine of not less than seventy—f ve dollars ($75 .00) ner more than fi ve -
hundred dollars ($500 00) or by |mpnsonment in the county jall for: a: penod of time: notii;. 1

Chapter1622 . .

..... g ADMINISTRATIVE GODE -

Sections: i e e

15.22.010  California Admlmstratlve Code Adoptlon o .
- 15.22.020 Copying'and i |mag|ng fee ;5‘5155 Il

15.22.010 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE ADOPTION

“B5"



Council Ordinance 2014-01 T T W

' Chapter1524 - i
VIOLATION — PENALTY T

Sections:

15.24.010 Violation Penalty AR

15.24.010 VIOLATION PENALTY

15.24.020 VIOLATION PENALTY FOR WORK WITHOUT PERMITS ------

Any person:.who- commences work wnthout the: neoessary permlts shall be subject toz:j

the following penalties: - S B

A Penaltles W|th|n a twelve (1 2) month penod



SECTION:S. Adoptlon -This Ordmance shall- take effect thlrty (30) days after passage
and shati wathm f fteen (18). days after passage be posted m accordance with. Sect:on__, f

AYES: COUNCILMEMBERSt‘-f.B"anueIos, Gi!ée'n,:_l.on, Mu;r‘rgy,-.sWearingen_‘:;; e

NOES: COUNCILM EMBERS; None:

ABSTAIN: COUNCILMEMBERS&II'None::

ABSENT: COUNCILMEMBERS;:. None ' ... TR ey

N - l n o a
Pursuant {o G.C. Sectxon 40806(c) | certify the followmg is:a true & correct capy:
Notlce of Adopted .....

Posted:
By:

57



RESOLUTION NO. 2014-56

A RESCLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PINOLE APPROVING
FINDINGS' TO SUPPORT LOCAL MODIFICATIONS TO THE STANDARDS
CONTAINED IN THE 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, ENACTED
AS PART OF CRDINANCE NO. 2014-01; AND DIRECTING THE CITY CLERK TO
SCHEDULE A HEARING AND PUBLISH A NOTICE OF THE ADGCPTION OF THE
2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE
LAW.

WHEREAS, Section 17922 of the California Health and Safety Code requires
that local agencies adopt the building standards contained in the California Building
Code, the California Fire Code, the California Plumbing Code, the California Mechanical
Code, and the California Electrical Code, as.such codes are approved by the State
Building Standards Commission (coilectively, the “California Building Standards Code");
and

WHEREAS, Section 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code allows
local agencies to enact modifications to those building standards provided that such
modifications are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, Section 17958.7. of the California Health and Safety Code further
provides that a local agency which enacts modifications to those building standards
must adopt findings which tie those modifications to such local climatic, -geological or
topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the Pinole City Council has ‘considered whether certain
modifications to the building standards contained in the California Building Standards
Code are necessary in Pinole due to local climatic, geological, or topographical
conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of
Pinole does hereby adopt the following findings in conformance with its obligations
under Section 17958.7 of the California Heaith and Safety Code:

.  The City of Pinole is subject to the following climatic, geological and
topographical conditions:

A. Climatic Conditions

General Conditions

Page 1 of 10



The seasonal climatic conditions during late summer, fall and early winter
create serious difficulties regarding the control of and protection against fires in Pinole.
The hot, dry weather typical of this area in the summer and fall, and the extreme
dryness of fuel stands in the early winter, coupled with wind, temperature and
precipitation conditions outlined below frequently cause fire events which threaten the

City.
il= Precipitation and Relative Humidity
(a) Conditions

Precipitation ranges from 15 to 24 inches per year with an average
of 18 inches per year. Ninety-five percent of all rainfall occurs during the seven months
of October through April and only five percent occurs from May through September. The
dry season is considered to last at least six months in this area, where typically 0.8
percent of the annual rainfall occurs in any given month during this period. in addition,
the Northern California area is subject to recurrent periods of drought lasting for several
years. Relative humidity remains in the middle range most of the year with 45 to 65
percent occurring during the spring, summer and fall, and a wider range of 60 to 80
percent in the winter. Occasionally, the relative humidity falls as low as 12 percent
during temporary changes in climate and wind direction. Such low humidity periods can
occur any time of year. Coastal fog, on the other hand, can raise humidity especially
during night hours.

(b) Impact

During the dry season generally and during occasional periods of
low humidity, burning conditions are worse than normal. Such weather conditions cause
extreme dryness in combustible material including untreated wood shakes and shingles
on buildings, wood siding, and combustible building materials. Non-irrigated grass,
brush, and weeds, which are often near buildings, are also subject to extreme drying.
Extremely dry, combustible materials are vulnerable to rapidly spreading exterior fires
which can quickly transfer to other buildings by means of radiation or flying brands,
sparks, or embers. Under such conditions, a small fire can rapidly grow in magnitude
beyond the capabilities of the City’s Fire Department to control. Such fires produce
excessive fire loss that has a negative impact on the quality of life in the community.

2. Temperature

(@) Conditions

Temperatures have been recorded as high as 107" F. Seasonal
highs over 80" can be sustained for several days in a row.

(b) Impact

Page 2 of 10



High temperatures cause rapid fatigue and heat exhaustion of
firefighters, reducing their effectiveness and ability to control large building and wildland
fires. High temperatures wiil preheat combustible building materials and non-irrigated
weeds, grass and brush causing their materials to ignite readily and bum more rapidly
and intensely. In addition, a series of iocal ridges and valleys produce differences in
solar heating of fuels which increase the probability of erratic fire behavior, including
area-wide ignition and "blow-up” conditions. Higher air and fuel temperatures increase
the rate of fire spread and reduce the effectiveness of water applied to extinguish fires.
Additicnal fire department rescurces and water will be required for timely and effective
suppression of fires. Temperature has a direct relationship to the intensity and size of
fires.

3. Winds
(@) Conditions

Prevailing winds in the area occur from the west or
southwest. Off shore winds from the northeast and east, known locally as Diablo winds,
frequently occur during the summer and fall and are prevalent during periods of hot, dry
weather. Virtually any time during the year a climatic pattemn of strong, steady, dry winds
can occur for several days in succession, creating extremely dry conditions. Hillside
elevation differences are ideal for the creation of localized up slope or down slope
winds, which follow ridgelines or canyon valleys. Because of these topographic
variables, winds can be experienced from virtually every direction depending on location
and surrounding climatic conditions. Wind velocities range generally from 15 to 25 mph,
with typical gusting to 35 mph. Severe storm gusts have been recorded as high as 80
mph. Westerly afternoon winds are common. Forty (40) mph winds are experienced
occasionally during extreme fire weather conditions. In rare circumstances, both on
shore and off shore breezes up to 55 mph have been registered locally during non-
storm conditions.

(b) Impact

Local winds can cause water intrusion and structural deterioration
to building components, this deterioration may facilitate a premature structural building
collapse. These local winds cause interior and exterior fires to burn intensely and
spread rapidly. Wind driven fires involving non-irrigated weeds, grass and brush can
grow to a magnitude and intensity beyond the capabilities of the fire department to
control. Even relatively moderate winds can cause extreme and erratic fire behavior.
Prevailing winds generally align with local topographical features creating ideal avenues
for uphill fire spread. Wind driven fires can move uphill or downhill with great speed.
When wind driven fires are not controlled they can spréad from property to property and
threaten the entire community.

Summary

Page 3 of 10



The local climatic conditions created by precipitation patterns,
temperature and wind conditions combine to affect the rate of acceleration, intensity,
and magnitude of fire in the community. Periods with little or no rainfall, low humidity
and high temperatures create extreme fire hazard conditions. Temperature extremes
can create intense and erratic fire behavior. Local winds can have a tremendous impact
on fire intensity, growth, and spread. Winds can carry sparks and burning brands to
other areas up to one-mile away thus spreading fire -and causing conflagrations. In
building fires and fires at the bottom of canyons, winds can literally create a "blow torch"
effect, which concentrates heat and resists control efforts.

B. Geologic Conditions

General Conditions

The geologic features of the local area create conditions that leave the
area vuinerable to local flooding, earthquakes, land sliding, restricted access and
conflagration. These events create serious difficulty regarding the control of and
protection against fires in Pinole. Local flooding conditions can impede the ability of the
fire department to aid or assist in fire control, evacuations, rescues and other
emergency tasks. Among the potential effects of earthquake activity are isolation of
neighborhoods or the entire community, loss of water sources and conflagration.
Seismic events and landslides may isolate Pinole from surrounding communities and
restrict or eliminate internal circulation by rendering surface travel difficult or impossible.
Topographic features present multiple problems in the delivery of emergency services
including fire protection.

1. Seismic
(a) . Conditions

Pinole is located in a High Risk Seismic Zone, the worst risk rating
in the United States. Buildings and other structures in High Risk Zones can experience
major damage as the result of a seismic event. Pinole is in close proximity (1.5 — 3.0
miles northeast) to the Hayward Fault and Rodgers Creek/ Healdsburg fault zone
underneath San Pablo Bay. The City's Planning Area is also located about 18 to 20
miles northeast of the San Andreas fault zone. The Green Valley-Concord fault trend is
located approximately 12 miles east of Pinole, The Hayward fault has been identified as
a likely site for a major seismic event in the 7 + Richter scale range within the next 25
years. Minor seismic events have been localized in the E! Cerrito-Berkeley area nearby
Pinole. Most recently, an earthquake measuring 6.0 on the Richter Scale occurred on
August 24, 2104 near American Canyon.

Much of the transportation infrastructure in Pinole is built upon soils

classified as subject to liquefaction or landslide. Interstate 80 which bisects Pinole is
subject to liquefaction. San Pablo Avenue, a major north-south route through the city, is

Page 4 of 10



subject to liquefaction. Pincle Valley Road a major north-south route within Pincle, is
subject to liquefaction and landslides. Simas Avenue which provides access to several
neighborhoods in southern Pinole is subject to landslide. Damage to these roadbeds
would have a significant, negative impact on response times.

Earthquakes of the magnitude expsrienced locally can cause majer
damage to electrical fransmission facilities which in tum, cause power failures while at
the same time starting fires throughout the city. The simuitaneous occurrence of
multiple fires will quickly disperse available fire department resources, thereby reducing
and delaying an emergency response to any additional fires. An electrical power outage
would incapacitate elevators, building smoke management systems, lighting systems,
alarm systems and other electrical equipment. Since these are urgently needed to
assist evacuation and fire control in large buildings there is increased expectation of life
loss and maijor fire losses in such larger buildings. -

A seismic event powerful enough to damage roadways would also
damage other utility systems such as water mains, natural gas pipelines and telephone
lines. The East Bay Municipal Utilities District anticipates seismic disruption of water
service. Damage to these systems would have a negative impact on the service delivery
capabilities of local emergency services.

(b) Impact

The above listed local geologic conditions increase accessibility
problems and fire hazards in the City of Pinole. Fire following an earthquake has the
potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the earthquake itself.
Hazardous materials, particularly toxic gases, could pose the greatest threat to a larger
number of citizens should a leak occur during a significant seismic event. Public safety
resources would have to be prioritized to meet the greatest threat and may be
unavailable for smaller structure fires in dwellings or other structures. Smaller fires may
grow to conflagration proportions. Other factors can intensify the situation:

1) The extent of damage to the water system;

2) The extent of isolation due to bridge or freeway
overpass collapse;, ‘

3) The extent of rcadway damage or amount of debris
blocking the roadway;

4) Climatic conditions (hot, dry weather with high winds);

5) Time of day will influence the amount of traffic on
roadways and could intensify the risk to life during
normal busiress hours;

6) The availability of timely mutual aid or military
assistance;

7) Dwellings with wood shingle roof coverings could burn
and resulit in conflagrations.

Page 5 of 10



Summary

The local geologic conditions leave the city vulnerable to emergency
conditions created by local flooding, earthquakes, landslide, and conflagration. Local
flooding from the drainages and slopes within the City could result in conditions
rendering the roads impassable. Earthquakes can occur at any time. Earthquakes can
isolate the community or significant portions of the community, cause loss of water
sources used to provide fire protection and cause injury or rescue situations, which
could then overtax-the available resources to respond to new fires. Land movement can
impair, restrict or deny emergency access to significant portions of the city. Geologic
features and conditions can make firefighting strategy and tactics difficult at best. When
coupled with prevailing climatic and topographic conditions, the City is at risk to
conflagration at any time and is extremely vulnerable during or after a triggering event
such as earthquake, floods, landslide or fire.

C. Topographic

General Conditions

The topographic features of the city increase the difficulty of fighting fires.
Steep hillsides, ridges and deep, well-defined canyons are subject to fires that, in those
areas, are easily influenced by wind and weather. Steep canyons are subject to rapid-
fire spread, spot fires and area ignition. Fire growth controlled by topographic features
(topography-driven fires) is subject to erratic fire behavior including blowups, fire whirls,
and sudden changes in fire front direction. On the other hand, certain topographic
features such as moist or sparse vegetation conditions, surface features, and man-
made improvements such as roads have a dampening influence on erratic fire behavior.

1. Soils
(a) Conditions

The area is replete with various soils, which are unstable: clay
loam, unconsolidated fills, and alluvial fans are predominant. These soil conditions are
moderately to severely prone to swelling and shrinking, and are plastic and tend to
liquefy. Large hillside portions of the city are subject to landslide, slumping and collapse.

(b) Impact

Throughout Pinole the topography and the pattern of growth and
development have created a network of aging, narrow roads which limit access to some
neighborhoods even in the best conditions. These roads are subject to damage and
closure from mud and rock slides caused by earthquakes, storms or erosion. Unstable
soils can slip causing trees, power poles and lines, or other obstructions to close
roadways. Any significant seismic or weather event can close roadways isolating
residential subdivisions.

Page 6 of 10



-

Vegetation

(a) Conditions

Highly combustible dry grass, weeds and brush are common six to
eight months of each year in the hilly and open space areas adjacent to built-up
iocations. Many of these areas have experienced wildland fires, which have threatened
nearby buildings; particularly those with wcod roofs or siding. The California
Depariment of Forestry and Fire Protection has designated areas within the southwest
portion of the city as Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones (VHFHSZ) and where
vegetation management is especially important. Many residential areas border
parklands, which contain vegetation fire hazards.

(b) Impact

Combustible dry grass, weeds and brush contribute to a recognized
conflagration hazard. City efforts to provide for vegetation management and strict fire
code enforcement have reduced but not eliminated the threat of conflagration due to
rapid fire spread in vegetation stands. Should active fire become established in
vegetation stands, this growing fire could rapidly overcome fire department control
efforts.

3. Surface Features
(a) Conditions

The arrangement and location of natural and man-made surface
features, including hills, valleys, creeks, roadways, housing density, commercial areas,
and fire stations combine to limit feasible emergency response routes to certain areas.

(b) Impact

The arrangement and location of natural surface features produce
an area very similar to those conditions found in the Oakland-Berkeley hills prior to their
conflagration of October 1991. Surface features can easily produce fires of great
magnitude or with erratic fire behavicr that couid threaten the entire community.

4, Buildings and Landscaping
(a) Conditions

Many commercial buildings and apartment complexes have
building and landscape features, which preclude or greatly limit the operational access
of fire department vehicles. There are houses and other buildings with untreated wood
shake or shingle roofs or siding in the City which are within 10 feet of each other. There

Page 7 of 10



are many such buildings to which access to all but one side is virtually impossible due to
landscaping, fences, electrical transmission lines, slopes or other buildings.

(b) Impact

When Fire Department vehicles cannot gain access to buildings on
fire, there is a high potential for complete loss. Difficult access to a fire site often
requires that personnel must carry equipment for long distances. Such operations
quickly exhaust fire personnel and reduce the effective number of personnel available
for suppression. Access problems often result in severe delays, the misdirection of fire
and smoke control efforts, or the failure to make a timely fire attack.

Summary

The above listed local topographical conditions increase accessibility
problems and fire hazards in the City of Pinole. Should a significant emergency occur,
such as an area wide conflagration, public safety resources would be prioritized to
mitigate the greatest threat and may likely remain unavailable for smaller single dweliing
or structure fires. Other variables may intensify the situation:

1) The extent of damage to the water system;

2) - The extent of isolation due to bridge and/or freeway
overpass collapse;

3) The extent of roadway damage and/or amount of
debris blocking the roadways;

4) Climatic conditions (hot, dry weather with high winds);

5) Time of day will influence the amount of traffic on
roadways and could intensify the risk to life during
normal business and commute hours;

6) The availability of timely mutual aid or military
assistance;

7) The large proportion of dwellings with wood single
roof coverings could result in conflagrations.

D. Conclusion

Based on the local climatic, geologic, and topographic conditions outlined
above, there is a real risk of damage to the community from a disaster. A seismic event
can cause structural damage to buildings and utility infrastructure; storm flooding and
high winds may increase the damages. Any of these conditions may negatively affect
fire prevention efforts by increasing the frequency, spread, acceleration, intensity, and
size of fires involving buildings in this community. Further, these conditions will increase
the potential damage to all structures occurring from any earthquake and subsequent
fire. It is found, therefore, to be reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code and
the State Building Standards Code are changed or modified to mitigate the effects of the
above conditions.

Page 8 of 10



L. Pursuant to Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the State of Califernia Health and
Safety Code, the City Council of the City of Pinole makes the finding that changes,
modifications, and amendments to the 2013 Edition of the California Building Standards
Codes are needed and are reascnably necessary because of certain local climatic,
geologic and topographic features and conditions as described in Section | above, and
that those features and conditions, under certain circumstances, affect delivery of
emergency services. The amendments to the California Building Standards Codes are
enacted to mitigate the impact of those local features and conditions by (i) preventing
the chance of accident or injury by requiring standards more stringent than required by
the current codes; and (ji) requiring additional built-in automatic fire protection systems
which will provide for early detection and initial fire control.

W The foliowing changes and/or modifications to the 2013 California Building
Standards Code are found to be necessary to mitigate the impacts caused by the local
ciimatic, geologic and topographic conditicns. The City of Pinole has adopted
substantive changes and modifications to the California Building Standards Code as
follows:

“Pinole MunigjpaliCods _
CBC 105.2, 105.3.2, 105.5, 105.8, 1A, 1B, and 1C
15.04.030 105.8.1, 105.8.3, 107.2.1, 107.3.5,

107.6, 110.1, 114.5, 202, 501.2, 902,
903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.3, 803.2.1.4,
903.2.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, .
903.2.8.1, 903.2.9, 903.2.9.1, 903.2.10,
1406.5, 1406.5, 1505.1.5, 1507.1.1,
1807.1.2, 2111.14, 2304.11.2.8, and

2509.3
16.06.030 CRC 202, 902.1.5, 506.1, 1007, and 1A, 1B, and 1C
Appendix G 100.2
1508.030 CGBSC 101.3.2, 101.3.3 1A, 1B, and 1C
15.12.030 CPC 604, 604.15, 710,710.1 1A, 1B, and 1C
15.16..030, 15.16.040, 2009 IPMC 304.14, 307.3.1, 602.4 1A, 1B, and 1C
and 15.16.050 _
15.40.030 CFC 101.1, 102.1, 105.6, 105.7, 108.1, | 1A, 1B, and 1C

1094, 111.4, 202, 304.1.2, 304.1 .4,
308.1.4, Chapter 3 adding 319 and 320,
401.5.1, 503.1, 505, 507.2, 603.6, 806,

Page 9 of 10



901.6.2.2, 902, 903.2, 903.3.1.1.2,
903.3.5, 903.3.8, 903.4.2, 903.6,
907.4.4, 907.4.2.3.1, 907.6.5, 907.8.6,
907.8.7, 1027.5, Chapter 33 adding
3301.3, 5001.5.3, 5003.9.1, 5601,
5704.2.9.6, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2,
6103.2.1.7, 6104.2, Appendix B 105.2,
Appendix C Table 105.1, Appendix D
102.1, Appendix D 103.2, 103.3,
103.6.2, 105.3, 106.1, and 106.2.

The aforementioned amendments have been incorporated in detail in Ordinance 2014-
01.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Pinole does
hereby direct the City Clerk to schedule a public hearing for consideration of Ordinance
No. 2014-01, to be held October 21, 2014, at 7:00 p.m. in the City Council Chambers,
and to publish a notice of such hearing in accordance with Government Code .Section
50022.3; and that such notice state that the purpose of the ordinance is to adopt the
2014 California Building Standards Code (including the Fire Code) and the California
Housing Regulations, with modifications to address unique local conditions.

| certify that at a regular meeting on September 16, 2014, the City Council of the
City of Pinole passed this Resolution by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCILMEMBERS: Banuelos, Green, Long, Murray, Swearingen
NOES: COUNCILMEMBERS: None
ABSENT: COUNCILMEMBERS: None
ABSTAIN: COUNCILMEMBERS: None

i ) ' ’ ‘l,' s N

Patricia Athenour, MN
City Clerk

ROISSIND]
SNIGING V1),

LeZ d €213 g

)

~

Page 10 of 10



