STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916)263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

January 27, 2014

Gene Paolini, Building Official
Building Inspection

City of Roseviile -

311 Vernon Street

Roseville, CA 85678

RE: Ordinance #5258
Dear Mr. Paolini:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on January 10, 2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance medifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Reguiations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaiuate the merit
of the code madification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Ccde §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,
=~ M '

Evkique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



O'Brien, Laurie@DGS

From: Paoiini, Gene <GPaolini@roseviile.ca.us>

Sent: Friday, January 10, 2014 4:.01 PM

To: Ordinancefilings@DGS

Subject: 2014 Code Adoption of the 2013 California Code of Regulations

Attachments: PRINT-PRD-01_CC1MFP-BD-01_2532_001.pdf; PRINT-PRD-01_CC1MFP-BD-01_2534_
001.pdf

Attached please find Ordinance number 5258 approved by the City of Roseville, California City Council for submittal to
the Building Standards Commission as required by State Law. This Ordinance repeals previous adoptions of the 2010
California Code of Regulations (second attachment for reference) replacing them with the 2013 Regulations. Within the
Ordinance is specific reference to amendments of Part 9 the Fire Code along with findings for the need of more
stringent reguirements.

Ali other Parts of the California Code of Regulations are adopted as approved by the Building Standards Commission for
the State of California. Should you have any questions please feel free to contact me.

Sincerely

Gene Paolini

Buiidirg Official
Building Inspection
City of Roseviile

311 Vernon Streat
Roseville, CA 95678
(916) 774-5332

{©16) 774-5394 fax
www.roseville.ca.us/pw

-
BTk

ROSEVYILLE



FYQ TR A NTOTT NIy 3aEs
E »5[':‘.‘:‘"-.:.;\_‘;— LA

ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CiTY OF ROSEVILLE REFEALING AND
REPLACDNG SECTION 16.04.100, REPEALING SECTION 16.04.106, AND REPEALING
AND REPLACING CHAPTER 16.16 OF TITLE 16 OF THE ROSEVILLE MUNICIPAL
CODE REGARDING CALIFORNIA BULLDING STANDARDS

SECTICN 1 Pumuse

The purpose of this ordinance is to prescrite regulations governing buiiding standards
and conditions hazardous ic It 2nd property by adopting portion: of Tiiie 24 of the Califormia
Code of Regulations. as amended hereir.

SECTION Z.  Section 1€.04.100 of Chapter 16.04 of Title 1€ of the Rozeville Munisipal
Codz is hereby repealed in its entirety

SECTION 3. Section 15.04.100 of Chapter 16.04 of Tiile 16 of the Roseville Muaicipal
Code is hereby added to r2ad as foliows:

16.04.100 California Building Standards Code-Adopted.

A The 2013 California Building Standards Code is hereby adopted by the City of Roseville
and incorporated by reference into the City of Roseville Municipal Code, as amended by this
Chapter. The 2013 Califomnia Building Standards Code includes, but is not limited tc, the
following:

il 2013 California Building Code—Volumes 1 and 2 of the California Code of
Regulations Title 24 Part 2.

2 2013 California Residential Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24
part 2.5.

3 Appendix H, Patio Covers of the 2013 California Residential Code of the
California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 2.5.

4 2013 California Electrical Code of the California Code of Reguiations Title 24
part 3.

5 2013 California Mechanical Code of the California Code of Regulations Title
24 part 4.

7 2013 California Energy Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24
part 6.

8 2013 California istoricai Building Code of the California Code of Regulations
Title 24 part 8.
Page10f16



&

[

fu—y

B.

2013 California Existing Building Code of the Catifornis Code of Repuiations

2013 California Green Building Standards Cede of the California Code of
Regulations Title 24 part 11.

2012 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials acopied by
refererce.

The ¢ity hereby adopts and enforces Chapter 1 Division IT and Section 3412.2 of the

2012 California Building Code. There is at least one copy of said code on file in the office of
the building officia! for use and examinaticn by the public.

SECTION 4. Section 16.04.106 of Chapter 16.04 of Title 16 of the Roseville Municipal
Code is bereby repealed in ifs entirefy.

SECTION 5. Chapter 16.16 of Title 16 of the Roseville Municipal Code is hercby
rzpealed in ifs entirety.

SECTION 6. Chapter 16.16 of Title 16 of the Roseville Municipal Code is hereby addec
to read as follows:

16.16 Fire Code.

Sections:
16.16.010
16.16.020
16.16.030
16.16.040
16.16.050
16.16.060
16.16.070
16.16.080
16.16.090
16.16.108
16.16.110
16.16.120
16.16.130
16.16.14¢
16.16.15¢
16.16.160
16.16.170

Short title.

International Fire Code—Adopted by reference.
Findings.

Permits and fees.

Appeals.

Violations.

Open burning, recrestional fires, and portable outdoor fireplaces.
General storage.

Fire apparatus access roads.

Premises identification.

Fire protection systems.

Eigh-piled combustibie storage.

Fire sefety during construction and demolition.
Fireworks.

Referenced standards.

Fire flow requirements for buildings.

Validity.

16.16.010 Short title.

This chapter may be referrec to as the "Roseville Fire Code."

16.16.020 Cziifornia Fire Code and International Fire Code — Adopted by reference.

Page2 of 16



Average yearly rainfall for the city is approximatelv 18 incaes; with the muajority

occurring oeiween Octaber and April. Dwuring the summer monihs, there is generadly ne
measurable precipitation snd temperatures for ihis dry period range from 70 to 112 degrzes
Fabreoheit. High summer month temperaturss are frequenily accompanied by lighi to gusty
westsrly and noriberly winds, The reiaiive humidity during the samimer months averages
from two (2} to thirty (30) millimeters ol mercury (HG), which is considersd arid. The city 13
surrounded by ihousands of acres of grasslands which, during the summey monihs are dried to
the point al which they are exceedingly combustible aznd easily ignitad.

B. Topographical.

Tke city is ssgmented by several topographical and paysical features, including minor
Tivers, stesp canyons, natural parksvavs, open space, freeways, reilroad iracks, drainage cenals,
and spravling industrial facilities. Heavy traffic congesiion o city strests acts as a barrier for
five and emergency vehicles providing timety response. Preservation of wetland areas, natural
pariways, riparien corridors, vernal poels, open space, and endangered species’ habitais havs 31l
contzibuied to access nrobivmas while also resulting in sxemptions from vegstation redaction

programs. These situations, though environmeirally important, increzse the demands on the Fire
Departmert due to extrems fre hazards creaied by increased fuel loading and access limitutions.

&1

. Geolezical.

The city is locaied within 2 seismic zone 3 area and is subiect {o ground iremors.
Fiooding has occurrsd in ihe portions of the ciiy that le adjucent to Roseville’s nomerous
cresks and sirears.

"h A 51 iouids, A pepmit shall he romiired a arars hoandig e cqem oo 1

A Clhass 3, 1 and LA Biguids. A permit shall be required 10 store, handle or vse Class 1, I
.| K Tas ST PERY Jo— — Cifly I BT T P ; o o 1 . o by i T — 2
and TA Biquids i excess 6 25 galions inside any sirugiure, or 50 gailons cuiside any stucture

Faze3olls

)



B. Ciass TE-B Hgueids, A permit will be required 1o store, handle or use Class I-B Higuids

sE s = qed i
in sxoess oF 110 g'rl.'.lD-;;;.

c. Chapter 1, Section 105.6.27 of the Californiz Fire Code, as adopted by the city, is

hereby amended to read as follows:
103.6,27 LP-gas. An operational permii 1s required for:
I Siorage and use oFf LP-gas

Exception: Az operutional permit is not required for individual containers with a
125-gallon (473.2 L) water capacity or less serving oceupancies in Group R-3.

2. Operation of cargo tankers that transpor: LP-gas
L. Chapter 1, Section 113.1 of the California Fire Code, as adopted by ihe city. is

hersby amended to read as foliows:

113.1 Fees. Each person who applies for, requests, or receives a permit, permit
amendment, or service furnished by the fire department shall, at such time, pay the applicable fee
or fees provided for by resolution of the city council.

E. Minimum fee remitiance, Prior to providing service, except for emergency services, a
minimum fee remittance is required based on the approved fee established for said service(s).
The minimum amount for an estimated fee calculation is required at the time of request for
service. Adjustments to the estimated fee may be made depending upon work required.

F. Modification of fees. The fire chief shall have the authority to waive or modify any fee
imposed due to services provided by the fire department as stated herein and established by
resolution of the city council for good cause providing such waiver or modification request is
submitted in writing, stating the reason such waiver or modification is necessary, prior to the
payment of the fee.

16.16.050 Appeals.

Chapter 1, Section 108.1 of the California Fire Code, as adopted by the city, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

108.1 Appezis. Any person aggrieved by any decision or action of the Chief cr his/her
designated representative may appeal the decision or action subject to the provisions of Seciion
16.04.110 of the Municipal Code referring to the Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals
designatec therein shall also serve as the Board of Appeals under the California Fire Code. The
fire chief or his or her designee shall serve as ex-officio member of the Board of Appeals in all
appeals under the California Fire Code.

16.16.650 Viclztioms.

Page 4 of 16



followws:

RSt m“g

work

T the approved

- o ‘."
mfrusiom or PR ik

- y e 8] = | N e I IR P e
Py EYPLE: “TAT A4, TSLTent ional i &5, 300 LWT;.‘ e QUTLODY 1ireDiates

il avdar D B aart o 241 4
Etaptsy Ty SERTINN 3571

307.1 Prohibited open burning, Open burniag shall be prohibitad within the oty
B -

Esxeception: VWhen auihorized by the fire chiel in accordance with the Csliforia Firs

16.16.C80 Gencral storage.

Mobiie storage racks. Mobile siorage racks sha! have a minimown s X (%) in
separation every four (4) et of siorage

16.16.09G Fire spparatus access roads.

Chrapter §, Section 503.2.3 of the Califernia Fire Core is nereby amended to read as
follows:

503.2.3 Sarface. Fire apparstus sccess roads shall be designed and me m.amed to support
thc imposcd loads of fire apparatus and shall be sm'm =0 with an AC pavement or equivalent
suzfzee so as te provide aﬂ«m ”*the dniving capahilitics,

16.16.300 Fromises ideatification,

A, fuitiple terant baildings. Muliiple tenant buildings shall coptain the followin b4

reatures:

1 Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehicular acsess i the rear through any
criveway, alleyway, or parking iot shall have nambers or addresses pluced poor i«
occupancy on all new and existing buildings as to be plainly visible and legible
Tom the rear accsss way when deemed necessary by the fire chief,

Muliiple tenant snaces serviced by 1% 2 eorridor, exi
paSI' —g‘fr‘- y— “K‘.': QCL:I or VX_A m;‘%IJ‘&J 01 \_ll ]rc S

3> ¥ 3 o '} X Y g 135 SEt
aisplayed cn the rear F‘*""‘“t“"*‘“m: a0e, Wicn deened necessary by the fire chiel

Page 5 ofi6



€12

Muliipie tey 1l spaces thai front on interior wallsvays or pedesiriar msils m.ﬂ!
bave approved mambers or addresses placed nesr the enitance door in all new and
exdsting buildings.

4 Mluminated directory boards shall be provided at v“hicuiar access ¢ "irazr:._cr-.-s £0
multipie building complexes as dzemed nscessery by the fivs chiot
B, THumination. Addressing shall be diuminated at night in all new builds ngs. Addrez

igns shall be internally or exiernally {iluminated. When the urinance previded for ike face of
un address sign is from an external source, it shall have an iniensity sufficient so as o be visible
at night from the adjoining accsss roadvway. Internally illuminated address signs sheil be
provided with equivalent luminance.

Fire control roen. An approved fire control room shall be provided for all buildings
prote _t"-*d by an automatic fire extinguishing system. Fire cortrol rooms shall meei the folios ring
requiremenis:

Fire control rooms shall contain only fire system control valves, fire alarm control
panels and other related fire system equipment.

2. The location of the fire control room shall be approved by the fire code official.

3. Fire control rooms shall have minimum dimensions of five (5) feet by seven (7)
feet.

4. Fire control rooms shali be constructed with & one-hour fire rating.

5. Fire control rooms shall be provided with an exterior access door approved by the
fire code official.

6. Durable signage shall be provided on the exterior side of the access door.

7. Storage of materials in fire control rooms is prohibited.

B. Chapter 9, Section 901.7 of the Caiiforria Fire Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

901.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire proteciion system is out of service,
the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately and an approved fire
watch shall be provided for all occupants in the building left unprotected by the shutdown until
the fire protection system has been returned to service. Fire watches shall be provided with at
least one approved means for notification of the fire department and their oaly duty shall be to
perform constant patrols of the protected premises and keep watch for Sres.

C. Chapter 9, Section 903.2 of tire Califernia Fire Code, as adoptec by the city, is
hereby zmended to read as foliows:

Paze 60f 16



4 .T. 00§ 1in

T
e

A9 ommroved sotomas;

L : SVEry 1
g el L R O RN I A T
JULEINZ. CXeepl ong ad twe family dw

arT S8l OF

ics shall be designead to Ordinary Hazard

2 Mercantile or similar use occupancies with a ced iing height of wp to wwenty (20
fesi shiall be designed 0 Ordinary Hezerd Group 2; with a minimion design aren
of 3000 sguare feet.

3 Cccupancies with 2 ceiling height exceeding tw ety (207 feet shell be desianed
with & minimum apnni;;er density of (.4935; with 2 minimom desi i area of 2000
square feer.

G. Upright sprinikders. Upright sprinklers shall be instalied in all constiaction types.

Spriniders located on branch lines shall be provided with one-inch plug ouileis

H. Lhaptor 8, SecHon 963.3.1.2 of the Caiifornia Fire Code, zs adepted by the city, ie
bereby smended te read as follows

$93.5.1.2 NFPA 13K sprinkler systerns. Auiomatic prinkler systems in Group R
occupancies ap to and including four stories in hsight shall not be installed in accordance with
NFPA I3R.

L Chapter 2, Section 995,3.10f the Californiz Fire Cox ¢, 25 adopied by the city, is

fereby apzended to read us fuimws.

9%’*,3.1 Height. In other than Gmup R-3 and R-3.1 coovpancies, Class [ stundpips

systems shiall oe installed througheout at sach floor where any of the vllowing coour:




Buildings
FN AT
(9 e Llua.!.‘) A

wiers ne floor lavs! of the highest siory is locaied mors than 30 fee
v¢ the lowest lavel of fire departinen: vehicle socess.

Buildings that are three or more stories in height.

Buildings where the floor level of the lowest siory is located more than 30 feet
{9144 mm) below the highest level of fire depariment vehicle access

Exceptions:

1.

L)

Class 1 standpipes arc allowed in buildings equipped throughout with an
sutomatic sprinkler system in accordancs with Section $07.3.1.1 or
903.5.1.2.

Class I manual dry standpipes are allowed in open parking garages that are
subject to freezing temperatures, provided that the hose connections are
located as required for Class II standpipes in accordance with section
905.5.

Class I standpipes are allowed in basements equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system.

In determining the lowest level of fire dspartment vehicle access, it shall
not be required to consider:

5.1 Recessed loading docks for four vehicles or less, and
52 Conditions where topography makes access from the fire
department vehicle to the building impractical or impossible.

Chapter 9, Section 903.4.2 of the California Fire Code, as adopted by tke city, is

irereby amended to read as follows:

203.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible alarm and visual strobe device, located

on the exterior of the building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automaziic
sprinkler system. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water fiow
equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smaliest orifice size instailed in the system.
Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate.
the building fire alarm system. Visible alarm notification appliances shall not be required except
when required by Section 907, A single approved audible alarm and visual strobe device shall be
provided in the interior of the buildirg in a normally occupied location within each space or
dwrelling unit and floor level, unless otherwise required by the California Fire Code.

Page 8 of 16



»

k.

. 2. s
Darsnyy amonnasa 1o
LITIDY amonged u

5
orn

:f the Cali

. N
Y e w o o Combingtor five nmd hpmolar alamed  sestoee e
o Aradlamatlan DL8t0 L RIUVITIL SN ETLINGR, WULEROTIEG 0L IITe 2.8 ‘_L’-g.-_l. AT OSREIIS 38

16.10.120 High-plied combustibiz storage.

Hose stations. For high-piled storage areas of greater then 2590 square fest of Class IV
commodities. or for high-piled combusiiblz siorage arzas of graater than 30C square fesi of Ligh
hazard commodities, approved 2 Vi-inch hose valves shal! be locatad directly adjacent o 21l firs
aceess doors,

18.16.130 Tire safety during construciion zad demolition.

AL Chapter 33, Section 3310.1 of the Caiifernia Fire Cods, as adopied by the cify, is
hereby smended te read as follows:

3310.1 Required aceess. Approved vehicle access for firefi gating shall be provided 1o
all consiruction or dernolition siies. Vehicle access zhal! be vrovided to within 100 feet {30480
mm)} of tsmperary or permanent fire dspartmeni connections. Vehicle access shall be proviced
with an AC pavement or equivalon: surface capable of supporting vehicle loading so as o
provide ali-weather Griving cepabilitizs. Said fire aceess road shall bs constructed prior to the
presence of on-site cornbusiible products and shall be maintained throughout the construiciion
procass.

iises identification. Buildings under consiruciion shall have approved addrsss
numbers, building numbers or aprroved buiiding identification vlaced at the entry point of each
fre access road.

16.16.14C Regulations for firewerks.

A Chapter 5§, Section 5608 of the Califoraia Fire Code. as agopiad by the oity, is
tereby amended to read as follows:



veuersl. Gude ..'_ rifrewocks dispiays, use of pyrotechnics befors 2 proghnzs
: ~f“-'0f‘cf‘1'1..1”’ specizl effects tn {keatrical and group enderiainmen: produciions shall

Tode ol RJ*ul.u ons, Title 12, Division 1, Chapier 6 — Fireworks, and

this ch;;:“s‘tcr.

B. Frohibited Oreworks. Excepi as otherwise provided in this chaprer, no person shall
possess, mapufacture, sell, use, display or explode any cangercus fireworks including, but not
limiied to, any rocket, {irecracker, roman candle, squib, torpedo, wire core sparkler, wooden
core sparkier, black cartridge. aerial shell or other combustible device or explosive substance
or any kind of fireworks, by whatsoever naroe known, or any zliered safe and sane fireworks
within the city.

C. Public displays. Public dispiays of fireworks may be given under permit issued by the
fire code official consisteni wiik sizte law where such displays will take place under the
direction and supervision of & state of California licensed pyrotechmic operator.

. Public motice. Applicants for a fireworks public dispiay permit shall provide noiice i
ihe surrounding comnmm‘ry prior to the public display in accordance with standards approved by
the fire code official.

E. Safe and sane fireworks. It shall not be unlawful to possess, use, display or
discharge, within the city, those fireworks that are defined and classified as safe and sane
fireworks authorized and labeled by the California State Fire Marshal during the period from
noon on the 28th of June through midnight on the 4th of July of the same calendar year. Any
person in violation of this section with amounts up to but not exceeding twenty-five (25)
pounds shall be cited for an infraction.

F. Sale of safe and sane fireworks. The sale of safe and sane fireworks authorized and
labeled by the Califormia State Fire Marshal, within the city, shall be permitted only between
noon and 10:00 p.m. on the 28th of June of each year and 9:00 a.m. through 10:00 p.m. on
June 29th through the 4th of July of the same calendar year.

Exceptien: No person shall sell or offer to sell or expose for sale any safe and
sane fireworks to any person under the age of eighteen {18) years.

G. Permits. It is unlawful for any persom, firm, or corporation to sell safe and sane
fireworks within the City without having first applied for and received a city permit therefor, in
addition to the required state license.

H. Permit requirements. The following are requirements for an application for a permit to
sell safe and sane fireworks in the city:

No permit to sell safe and sane fireworks shall be issued to any person or business
entity except nonprefit organizations.

a. “Nonprofit organizaiion” means: (1) any nonprofit association, charity
or corporation organized pursuant to the Internal Revenue Code or

Page 10 of 16



Califo .1 Revenus ang
ingzgral nart of & recog
e;;;..:.-.-.p:. s;a,T;;;; 0T (3) 47 OIgar ] d
officially recegmized byv: {8) ap e;emm.zf\- sc,i:u,e m.::'i schiool, and
m&b 33hool wm lor 'schoal d1 t"lf"t ” .J; wii 1 &0 in f)an; the
resitents of the ciiy,
college and/or vniv

& group wiich is an
zath ?n h_wm- suzh iax

e

CIty,

L L0AL I8 fualil

s
L 2llle Gu
ol

~

Criteris fore cau_m ious ':rr: od of not l_w than

v this c’namﬁ'%‘ '“um:i W
il to seil firevengd

Ber

. "
aAve & GEmionstic

c. Tne orgznization must have & minimu bons fide me
itwenly raerbers whe sither reside in the city or are owners or operaters of
& business or other establishment tocaied in the city or afiest thar the
ctnerwise qualified organizatior will have @ minimws of tweaiv
voruateess wo steff & firsworks buoth, The organizaticn shall provids
documentation demonstrating e muiniroum bora fide membership to ths

Pl Al AR L AF S Ly LYl
satisfsction of the fre chicf,

bersiip of ai least

L

d The orgenization ust not have been found by any court of commete:
mbmmer or e drninisirative heering officer to be in violation of anv

! or criming! local, state or foderal law withio tweniy-four calendar

months prior to the erganization’s submitial of ar application for 2 vermit

o seil fireworks.

e. Al atm?icsiﬁO"‘ for pe :..L‘L shall te accomp maiE’d by a California Biate

Board of Tguslization l2s iax permd

i riment on
display.

. ewoTks stand.

i

] ¢ aucompanied by a retadl sales permit

arshal.




L. Appheants shall furnish such other dats or information as may be required

relating o the issvance of such fireworks permits.

1. Applications shall identify the name, nrganizaiional form, address of the
prineipal mesting place, number of members, ihe purpose of the
organization or corporation and the date it came inio existencs within the
city. Only those organizations that are located within the city limits wili
te allowed to sell fireworks. Ezch orgenization, and its affiliated groups,
will be Iimited 1o no more than ons (1) booth.

m. Every applicaiion shall designate one (1) or more individuals as the
fireworks stand safeiy officer. That individual shall be reguired ic atiend &
dreworks stand operainrs safety seminzr and orientation session conducies
ar approved by the city’s fire departmeni prior to issuance of the permii.
The fireworks stand safety officer(s) must aitend the seminar each vear
regardless of whather or not they have previously awended such & seminar
in the past.

Each application shall be accompanied by the applicable permit fee. Such
fee shall be nonrefundable. The fee shall be used to defray the expense of
administering the provisions of this section and to provide safety and
informational material and programming relative to fireworks.

1. Permit revocation. The fire chief may suspend or revoke any permit upon proof that the
permitted organization or corporation, or any of its members, has violated any of the provisions
of this section relating to fireworks. If the fire chief determines that the suspension occurred too
late in the limited sales period to have the necessary deterrent effect, he/she may disqualify the
permitted person or organization from obtaining a permit for a period of up to two (2) additional
years. Such additional disqualifications may be appealed to the city manager in writing within
fifteen (15) calendar days of the action.

J. Number of permits issued. Except as otherwise provided, not more than fifieen (15)
permits for fireworks shall be issued during any one (1) calendar year. In the event more than
fifteen (15) applications for permits are received, priorities for issuing of permits shall be
determined by the fire chief as follows:

1 First priority shall be to those applicants who received a permit in the prior
calendar year and actually operated a fireworks stand. Provided, however, that
such priority shall expire after five (5) consecutive years, and that nothing herein
shall be construed so as to permit more than one (1) fireworks stand per

organization.
2. Second priority shall be to those otherwise qualified organizations.
3. In the event that the number of applicants within a given class of priority exceeds

the number of permits remaining to be granted, then the selection of permittees
shall be by lot. Such lottery shail be conducted in public by the fire chief who

Page 12 of 16



h

5]

T AGYEDTS O o

sane firsworks.

ey N

Each firsworks stand shall have o freworks stand safety
in charge 2t ell times whils it i being usad for e sals

szfe and sans firawork

f-m sefc and sanc fireveorks shall be retained or stored o the approved location of
e {ireworks stand, and i no even: shall fireveoris, other ther those whish have
ceen sold, be removed fom the approved frsworks siand losation to any other

place within the city.

.Tn ,..s.

There shali be no drinking or possession of al
fiveworke stand or storage site a: any time,

Fireworks stands may only be located on pro

~1.mh be tu..,ah, & wilkin w enf»-f“ vs (23) feet of mmy other
¢ station, fL:f-?_ pums,

¥ "TL for

\_

&
?—‘»

Fireworks siznds shail be localed at least ons hundrad (100) foes apart from any
otaer fireworks stand.
Fireworis stands shall compiy with the '*ro'-'i.s

deverm by and at the discretion of t.,u bu

S | peimr Hln crmeeris ot ey AF Flam Tt
":'l\z:tw\i IGer e SLDCTVISION CL w28 ou

Btrectgd it an

5]

{einporary elacitizul wiring within the freworis




1" e il il seml it dhall S aimed B Lo s ok e Py e 5
12 Electrically powersd equipment shall be loeated at leasitep (1) foor from the

froworks sund,

13 Each siand shall have at lecst two (2) approved exits located af opposite cads of
the stand.

s
"R

Each fireworks stand shall be provided with two (2} fwo-and-oae-half (2 1/2)
gallon "water-type” firz extinguishers approved by the fire chief, in good working
order and easily accessible for use in case of {ire. Suech fire extinguishers shall be
kept &t or immnedistely near tiie fireworks stanc.

All weeds and combustible materials chall be cleared from the location of the
fireworks stand, to a distance of at leas: thirty (30) feet.

17. When the fireworks stand is not being used for the sale and
fireworks. ali Troworks ehall be stored in & manner consistent v
foliowing:

‘or dispiev of
th one of the

a. Within a reinforced, heavy metal, fully-enclosed container, walk-in
type drop box, or its equivalent, as approved by the fire code
official; or

b Returned daily to the licensed fireworks wholesaler for storage at
an approved location.

L. Igniting fireworks near stand. It is unlawful to discharge or ignite fireworks of any
type within twenty-five (25) feet of a fireworks stand.

M. Removal of fireworks stand. Fireworks stands shall be removed from the temporary
locations by noon on the sixth day of July, and all accompanying litter shall be clearsd from the
locations by that time.

16.16.15¢ Referenced standards.

A, Ckapter 80 of the California Fire Code, as adoptec by the city, is hereby amended
by deleting the following stardard:

NEPA 13R-13. Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and
Including Four Stories in Height as amended.

B.  Sectiom 103.2 of the California Fire Code, as adopted by the city, is hereby amended
by deieting the following standard:

Sectior 103.2 Appointment. The fire code official shall be appointed by the chief
appointing authority of the jurisdiction; and the fire code official shall not be removed

Page 14 0f'16



O 1o be ngard on specific and ralsvan

11}

nered
B. ap pendix B, Section B185.2 of the California Fire Code, as adopted by i&e gy, is

heredy amendad tt‘ read as foliows:

Bi05.2 Bulldings other than one- and two famgl iy awellings. The minimuam fire-flow
and ﬁow Guration for buildings other then one- and two-famil v Gwellings shail be as specified in
Table B105.1,

Exczeption: A reduction in raquired fire-flow 0w 0 50 percent, as  SppIos
allowwed when the building is t*'owded vrlth an & Pprov & ariomatic fire sprinkle:
sysiom instalied in uc..trdarc th sec 3.1.000-903.3.1.2. »ne resutting
fire-flow shall nc T miaute (3678 L/min) for the
, prescribed duratiu nas sp~ cified in Ta‘cl: B 05 .1.

16.146.172 Veligity

‘The city counci! hereby declares that shculd G amy section, parsgraph, so ‘u’“ﬁ(‘«, or word of
tnis ordinance or of this code hereuv adopted be declarsd for any reascn to be ins salid, it 15 the
intent of the councii that it would have o passed all other poriicns of this ordinance independent of
the elimination therelrorn of anv such portion 2s tiay be declarsd invalid.

ST TION 7. This ordinance shall be effective at ths expizstion of thirty (3¢} days from
e date of or
the date of sdopiion.

=CiaC 10 causs this ordinancs to be r rublishsd
] et it %5 adopted in o newsnaper of generad
1l within fouricen (14} deys 2fier its adoption caase this ordinanes
po%uu i Lulf in at s:a.;f tj:‘« \3_3 public placzs in the City and enter in the Ordinance Book &
certificats st aoe ol said publication by posting

flq

»
)
iy
e
e
L
[o]
o
-
4



FASEED AND ADOPTED by ihe Coux
1 a1 N B

i

1w0il of the City of Roseviile this 20thgay of
ol i el 11 ' N

COUNCILMEZMBERS: Roccucci, Gore, Garcia
COUNCILMEMBERS: fone

COUNCILMEMBERS: Herman, Rohan

VICE MAYOR



16.04.100 California Building Standards Code—Adopted Page 1 of 1

Resaviile Municipa! Code

vy Preyious Baxt Main
Tide 16 BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION
Chanter 16.04 BULLDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION

16.04.100 California Building Standards Code—Adopted.*

* CodeAlert: This topic has been affected by 5258. To view amendments and newly added provisions, please refer to
the CodeAlert Ordinance List.

A, The 2010 California Building Standards Code, known as the California Code of Regulations, incorporates:

1. 2010 California Building Code—Volumes 1 and 2 of the Califomia Code of Regulations Title 24 Part 2.
This code is based upon the 2009 International Building Code.

2. 2010 California Residential Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 2.5. This code is
based upon the 2009 International Residential Code.

3. Appendix H, Patio Covers of the 2010 California Residential Code of Regulations Title 24 part 2.5.

4. 2010 California Electrical Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 3. This code is based
upon the 2008 National Electric Code.

5. 2010 California Mechanical Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 4. This code is based
upon the 2009 Uniform Mechanical Code.

6. 2010 California Energy Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 6.

A 2010 California Historical Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 8.

8. 2010 California Existing Building Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 10,

9. 2010 California Green Building Standards Code of the California Code of Regulations Title 24 part 11.
10. 2009 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code as published by IAMPO is adopted by reference.

B.  The city hereby adopts and enforces Chapter I Division II and Section 3412.2 of the 2010 California
Building Code. There is one copy of said code on file in the office of the building official for use and examination by
public. (Ord. 4888 § 1, 2010; Ord. 4602 § 1, 2008; Ord. 3883 § 1, 2002; Ord. 3356 § 2, 1999.)

http://qcode.us/codes/roseville/view.php?topic=16-16_04-16 04 100&frames=on 4



Page 1 of 1

Rezevilie Municipal Coge

¥p Frayious Hext Main Search Print No Frames
Title 16 BUILDINGS AND COMSTRUCTION
Chaprer 16.04 BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION

The city hereby adopts and enforces the 2010 Triennial Edition of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24,
part 5 California Plumbing Code, current provisions. There is one copy of said regulations on file in the office of the
building official for use and examination by the public. (Ord. 4978 § 1, 2011.)

1/10/2014

1‘!.\-11-1/\-lwuu-wrvuuthvuuv;;;v: D e N e I R et bt



Roseville Municipal Code (Roseville, California) Page 1 of 1

Roseville Municipal Code roseville Mupicipal Code
Roseville, California Yp  Prexious  Next  Main seprch  Print
Titkz 16 BUILDINGS ARD CONSTRUCTION

(Y GE “.@.—
ROSEYILLE

1.16.16.030

4 16.16.110 Key box or emergency information box.
!.16.16.120 Fire

s Roseville, California - Home
Page

1:16.16.170 Hazardous materials storage and toxic gas provisions.

@,

itp://qcode.us/codes/roseville/ 014



