STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
_ ———— e

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

May 15, 2014

Winfred DeLeon

Supervising Engineer

City of Sacramento

300 Richards Boulevard, 3™ Floor
Sacramento, CA 95811

RE: Ordinance #2014-0001
Dear Mr. DelLeon:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on May 8, 2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2014
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification are accepted for filing and are enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commissicn pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,
nrique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cC: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



" O'Brien, Laurie@DGS

From: Winfred DeLeon <WDeleon@cityofsacramento.org>

Sent: Thursday, May 08, 2014 11:31 AM

To: OrdinanceFilings@DGS

Subject: City of Sacramento 2013 Ordinance

Attachments: OR2014-0001.pdf t
BSC-

Attached is the City of Sacramento’s 2013 Code Adoption Ordinance. The City is filing local amendments-to the 2013
California Building Code, 2013 California Plumbing Code, 2013 California Mechanical Code and the 2013 California
Residential Code with the Building Standards Commission pursuant to California Health and Safety Code, Section

17958.7.
Please contact me if you have any questions.
Thank you.

Winired Deleon PE, CBO | Supervising Engzineer

City of Sacramenic | Conimunity Deveiopmen: Depanment
Building Division | Plau Review

300 Richards Bivd.. 3 Floor | Sacramenta. (4 ©5811
Direci: 916.508.5373 | wdeleon(@citvofsacramento.org

Vigion: 30 recognized as she Dostwaeig e d buildoss donavemeny in Caelifornia
Mission: Todevelon and mshitzi avaliy SIrvetitses 0 ar ¢ ICIepL, colsisient, ared respeefiiy] maaner. viivile pronsots

10 POSIING WOrs cnvires



ORDINANCE NO. 2014-0001
Adopted by the Sacramento City Council
January 14, 2014

AMENDING VARIOUS CHAPTERS AND SECTIONS OF TITLE 15 CF THE
SACRAMENTO CITY CODE RELATIMG TC THE SACRAMENTO CITY
BUILDING COPE, ADOPTING LOCAL AMEMDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AND AMENDING SECTION 8.100.3C0C OF THE
SACRAMENTC CITY CODE

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTC:
SECTION 1.

In connection with the local amendments to the 2013 California Building Code,
2013 California Plumbing Code, 2013 California Mechanical Code, and 2013
California Residential Code set forth below, and pursuant to California Health and
Safety Code sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5, the City Council finds
and determines that:

A. The amendments are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological or topographical conditions.

B. Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments are established that are
more restrictive than those adopted by the State of California under the State
Buildings Standards Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations.

C. Express Finding Number 1: Climatic

Climate is one of the greatest impacts to fire behavior and other major emergency
events because it cannot be controlled. The drying out of wood shakes and wild
lanc fuels in the summer allows for easy ignition.

The building of homes within weed-covered rural areas and combustible weeds on
vacant urban lots, coupled with windy conditions, is a recipe for disaster.
Sacramento has four distinct seasons: summer, winter, fall, and spring. The
distinctions of these seasons are an attraction to the area and one reason why

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 1 of 15



significant population growth has occurred. The population growth has impacted
emergency service levels causing a strain on emergency services, and the result is
increased response times.

Sacramento has significant variations in weather patterns. Summers are arid and
warm, winters are cool to freezing, fall and spring can bring any combination of
weather patterns together. It is this cyclical uncertainty that allows weather
events such as the rapid melting of the Sierra snowpack that causes flooding in
the low-lying valley areas of Sacramento. As rivers rise and fall with the runoff,
access to common areas of recreation and boating is affected. The doubling of
average rainfall called an "El Nino" event has occurred from time to time and
causes the grass to mature and grow in excess of six feet high before it dries out.
Ten square feet of land with this type of fuel exhibits an explosive force equivalent
to one gallon of gasoline. Although rapid melting of the Sierra snowpack may
cause flooding in low-lying valley areas, direct snowfall is rare and light in
Sacramento.

Average yearly rainfall is approximately 19 inches. This rainfall normally occurs
from October to April. Low-level fog (Tule fog) is present throughout the winter
months, which brings visibility to almost zero feet. The fog can also cause
freezing and slick roadways and is a contributing factor to serious vehicle
accidents.

During the summer months, there is generally no measurable precipitation.
Temperatures for this dry period range from 70 to 112 degrees Fahrenheit and are
frequently accompanied by light to gusty winds. The relative humidity during
summer months ranges from 2 to 30%, which is arid. The city contains many
acres of grasslands, which, in conjunction with the dry and windy conditions,
create a hazardous situation that has led to extensive grass and brush fires in
recent years. More development is extending from the urban core into the grass-
covered areas. Wind-driven fires can lead to serious consequences as occurred in
similar areas of the state.

The foliowing building standards in the 2013 California Building Standards Code
are amended or added based upon this express finding:

2013 California Plumbing Code sections 301.1.2, 312.4, Table 312.4, 1108.3;

2013 California Mechanical Code section 312.1; 2013 California Building Code,
Appendix I; and 2013 California Residential Code, Appendix H.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 2 of 15



2013 California Plumbing Code section 301.1.2 provides that plumbing systems
shall be installed so as to substantially comply with IAPMO installation standards.
2013 Plumbing Code section 312.4 requires certain types of buried piping to be
covered with a protective coating. Table 312.4 provides the allowable length of
coated and wrapped buried ferrous gas or water pipes. California Plumbing Code
section 1108.3 requires the rainfall rate for purposes of sizing roof drains,
conducters, leaders, gutters and storm sewers to be 3” per hour. 2013 California
Mechanical Code section 312.1 concerns disposal of condensate from air washers,
air cooling coils, fuel burning condensing appliances and the overflow from
evaporative coolers. California Building Code Appendix I and California Residential
Code, Appendix H address structural designs for patio covers.

D. Express Finding Number 2: Geological

Sacramento is subject to ground tremors from seismic events as the City is
located in a Design Category D, which relates to a high risk of earthquakes. Large
portions of Sacramento have very poor soil conditions. Additionally, the very low
elevations are subject to a very high water table. Experience with lightly-loaded
footing and foundations and concrete slabs on grade revealed structural cracks
resulting in differential settlement, in addition to moisture migrating from the soil
to occupied, habitable areas of buildings.

The agricultural history for many parts of Sacramento has resulted in many areas
having caustic or “hot” soil conditions due to the heavy use of fertilizers,
pesticides, insecticides, etc. Unprotected metal pipe, when buried in these areas,
is subject to corrosion and premature failure.

The following building standards in the 2013 Cailifornia Building Standards Code
are amended or added based upon this express finding:

2013 California Plumbing Code sections 301.1.2, 312.4, Table 312.4.

2013 California Plumbing Code section 301.1.2 provides that plumbing systems
shall be installed so as to substantially comply with IAPMO installation standards.
2013 Plumbing Code section 312.4 requires certain types of buried piping to be
covered with a protective coating. Table 312.4 provides the allowable length of
coated and wrappec buried ferrous gas or water pipes.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 3 of 15



E. Express Finding Number 3: Topograph'\ical

Sacramento is impacted by several topographical features, including major rivers,
minor rivers and creeks, agueducts, lakes, sioughs, natural parkways, open space,
bridges/overpasses, freeways, railroad tracks including light rail, drainage canals,
sprawiing industrial facilities such as Proctor and Gamble, and a former Armed
Services Depot. Traffic has to be channeled around several of these topographical
features and limitations, which creates traffic congestion and delays emergency
response,

Heavy traffic congestion on the City’s major streets already acts as a barrier to
timely response for fire and emergency vehicles. Some roadways are expected to
double their traffic flow within the next ten years. In the event of an accident or
other emergency at one of the key points of intersection between a road and river
or freeway, sections of the City could be isolated or response time could be
sufficiently slowed so as to increase the risk of injury or damage.

Preservation of wetland areas, natura! parkways, riparian corridors along
rivers/streams, vernal pools, open space and endangered species habitat all have
contributed to access problems as well as exemption from vegetation abatement
programs. These situations, though environmentally important, increase the
demands on the fire service due to the extreme fire hazard created by fuel loading
and limited access.

Sacramento contains agricultural areas at the outlying city boundaries. Specific
requirements are necessary because of the location of these agricultural buildings.
Sacramento contains a sighificant inventory of existing buildings and structures.
Maintaining a minimum sound transmission class rating between tenant walls and
floors is desirable.

The following building standards in the California Building Standards Code are
amended based upon this express finding:

2013 California Building Code section 501.2; 2013 California Residential Code
section R319.1; 2013 California Building Code, Appendix C; 2013 California
Residential Code, Appendix J; and 2013 California Residential Code, Appendix K.

Both 2013 California Building Code section 501.2 and California Residential Code

section R319.1 concern address illumination. 2013 California Building Code,
Appendix C addresses agricultural buildings; 2013 California Residential Code,

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 4 of 15



Appendix ] addresses existing buildings and structures. 2013 California
Residential Code, Appendix K addresses sound transmission.

SECTION 2.
Section 15.04.040 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.04.040 Definitions.

When used in this code, the following terms shall be construed as defined in
this section:

“Building official,” “administrative authority,” “director,” “enforcing
authority,” and "manager” mean the chief building official,

“"CBC"” means the California Building Code, 2013 Edition, Volumes 1
and 2.

"CEC” means the California Electrical Code, 2013 Edition.

“CGC"” means the California Green Building Standards Code, 2013
Edition.

“Chief building official” means the manager of the building division
or authorized representatives.

"CMC” means the California Mechanical Code, 2013 Edition.
“CPC"” means the California Plumbing Code, 2013 Edition.
“"CRC"” means the California Residential Code, 2013 Edition.

“Permit” means a permit required by this code, or required by any
other code or ordinance enforced by the manager.

“"Responsible party” means any person, business, company or
entity, and the parent or legal guardian of any person under the age of 18
years, who has done any act for which an administrative penalty may be
imposed.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 5 of 15



“Shell building” means any building or structure consisting only of
floors (or slab), walls and a roof, the interior of which is to be completed at a
later date.

SECTION 3.
Section 15.04.050 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.04.050 Adoption of the 2013 California Building Standards Code.

The building standards included in the following parts of the 2013 California
Building Standards Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Reguilations, are
adopted by reference and incorporated in this code, except as expressly
amended or superseded by the provisions of this code:

A. The CBC including Appendix C and Appendix I, which is based on
and which amends the provisions of the 2012 International Building Code, as
published by the International Code Council.

B. The CRC, including Appendix H, Appendix ], and Appendix K
which is based on and which amends the provisions of the 2012
International Residential Code, as published by the International Code
Council.

C. The CPC, including Appendix I, which is based on and which
amends the provisions of the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code, as published by
the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials excepting
from Appendix I the following installation standards: IS 1-2006, IS 2-2006,
IS 15-2006, IS 18-2006, IS 27-2003, IS 28-2005, SIS 1-2003 and SIS 2-
2003.

D. The CMC, which is based on and which amends the provisions of
the 2012 Uniform Mechanical Code, as published by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials.

E. The CEC, which is based on and which amends the provisions of
the 2011 National Electrical Code, as published by the National Fire

Protection Association.

F. The CGC.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 6 of 15



SECTION 4.

Section 15.08.010 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.08.010 Permits—Permit procedures.
Except as provided in this code, all permits shall be obtained as required by
and in accordance with the 2013 California Building Standards Code as
adopted in this Title 15.

SECTION 5.

Section 15.08.040 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.08.040 Permits—Exemptions.
No permit is required for work that is exempt from the requirement to obtain
a permit as provided for in the 2013 California Building Standards Code as
adopted herein.

SECTION 6.

Section 15.08.060 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.08.060 Permits—Applications.
In addition to the requirements of the 2013 California Building Standards
Code as adopted in this Title 15, the following shall be included with an
application for a permit:
A. All declarations, authorizations, and notices required by this code
or state law including the licensed contractor declaration, the owner-builder
declaration, the workers’' compensation declaration, the declaration
regarding construction lending agency, and the authorization to act on

property owner’s behalf, as applicable and fully executed; and

B. A plan review fee, where plans are reguired, unless a plan
review fee is paid at the time of pre-application plan review; provided, that

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 7 of 15



1. If the plan review fee is to be based on an hourly rate and not
the estimated value of the work to be done, a deposit shall be paid at the
time of application submittal and the balance shall be bilied as plan review is
conducted. The plan review fee shall be paid in full prior to issuance of the
building permit;

2. If the plans submitted are incomplete or are changed so as to
require additional plan review, an additional plan review fee shall be
charged.

SECTION 7.

Section 15.08.070 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
15.08.070 Permits—Permit issuance.

In addition to the requirements of the 2013 California Building Standards
Code as adopted in this Title 15, the followmg provisions shall apply to the
issuance of a permit:

A, When an owner-builder declaration has been executed with a
permit application, no permit shall be issued until the notice to the property
owner required under California Health and Safety Code section 19825 has
been completed and signed by the owner of the property on which the
proposed work is to be located and submitted to the chief building official.

B. No permit shall be issued until the applicant has paid the
building permit fee (inspection) and all other required fees (including the
plan review fee), taxes, and other charges; provided, that if the buiiding
permit fee (inspection) is to be based on an hourly rate and not the
estimated value of the work to be done, a deposit shall be paid at the time
of permit issuance, and the balance shall be billed as inspections are
conducted. The building permit fee (inspection) shall be paid in full prior to
final inspection approval.

C. Issuance of a building permit shall not entitle the permit holder
to commence the work authorized by the permit unless and until the permit
holder has obtained all other approvals required by, and has complied with,
all other applicable laws, rules, and reguiations relating to the proposed
work.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 8 of 15



SECTION 8.

Chapter 15.20 of the Sacramento City Code is repealed and added to read as
follows:

Chapter 15.20 AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
15.20.010 Amendments to the CBC.

The CBC is amended as set forth in this chapter.

15.20.020 Title lines.

For the purposes of this chapter, and notwithstanding the provisions of
section 1.04.060 of the Sacramento City Code, the title lines (or
“catchwords”) in this chapter shall be deemed to be part of such sections.

15.20.030 Local amendments to the CBC.

Subsection 501.2.1 is added to the end of the CBC section 501.2 to read as
follows:

501.2.1 Address Illumination. Addressing shall be illuminated at night
in all new buildings. Address signs shall be internally or externally
illuminated. When the luminance or the face of a sign is from an
external source, it shall have an intensity of not less than 5.0 foot-
candles. Internally illuminated signs shall provide equivalent
luminance.
SECTION 9.
Chapter 15.24 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:
Chapter 15.24 AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE
15.24.010 Amendments to the CPC.

The CPC is amended as set forth in this chapter.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 9 of 15



15.24.020 Title lines.

For the purposes of this chapter, and notwithstanding the provisions of
section 1.04.060 of the Sacramento City Code, the title lines (or
“catchwords”) in this chapter shall be deemed to be part of such sections.

15.24.030 Local amendments to the CPC.
A. The following is added to the end of the CPC Subsection 301.1.2:

All pilumbing systems shall be installed so as to substantially comply
with the IAPMO Installation Standards.

B. The CPC section 312.4 is amended to read as follows:

Corrosion, Erosion, and Mechanical Damage. Each system of
buried ferrous piping used for either potable water or gas supply shall
have a protective coating of an approved type, machine applied and
conforming to recognized standards. Field wrapping shall provide
equivalent protection and is restricted to those short sections and
fittings necessarily stripped for threading.

All buried ferrous piping shall be instalied with cathodic protection.
Private gas mains and laterals coming within the scope of the Federal
Regulations for Pipeline Safety shall be designed and the installation
supervised for compliance by a person qualified by experience and
training in pipeline corrosion control methods. Supply piping for
buildings shall be installed according to the same standards or by the
use of Table 312.4 of this code.

When Table 312.4 is used, the piping system shall be installed
according to the following requirements:

i, Galvanic anodes for cathodic protection of ferrous piping shall be
buried not less than three feet below grade, and below the bottom of
the pipe to be protected. They shall be not less than four feet
horizontally from any buried metallic pipe. Before backfilling, the
anode shall be flooded with a minimum of five gallons of water.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 10 of 15



Connecting of the anode to the pipe, when made less than six inches
above grade, shall be with a thermite weld. Connections six inches or
more above grade may be made by the use of an approved electrical
service grounding clamp.

2. Water supply piping shall be isolated at the connection of the
utility or private tap from the water main and at each building
foundation line adjacent to the full way shut-off valve,

3. Gas supply piping shall be isolated adjacent to each building
foundation line or at the appliance when located outside the building
and from the serving gas supplier’s service equipment.

4, Approved isolation fittings shall be located a minimum of six
inches above grade, except at the water tap.

Sn Any piping laid in the same trench with pipe requiring cathodic
protection shall be separated laterally a minimum of 12 inches, and
piping installed diagonally above pipe requiring cathodic protection
shall be separated vertically a minimum of six inches. All separations
shall be maintained with clean earth in accordance with CPC section
314.

All piping regulated by this code and subject to undue corrosion,
erosion or mechanical damage shall be protected in an approved

manher,

C. Table 312.4 is added to Chapter 3 of the CPC to read as follows:

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 11 of 15



Table 312.4. Ancde Selection Chart

Allowable Length of Coated and Wrapped Buried Ferrous Gas or Water
Pipe
Pipe Size
AnOde I " ” 1-1/4” & 1- 14 {4 14
Size 1/2 3/4" & 1 1/2" 2 3 4
| Liib. 50 ft - - - - -
anode
31b.
150 ft 100 ft 50 ft 50 ft - -
anode _
2 Ib. 500 ft 200 ft 200 ft 150 ft 100 ft 100 ft
ahode
17 Ib.
- 500 ft 350 ft 300 ft 250 ft 150 ft
anode
32 Ib. - - 500 ft 500 ft 450 ft 350 ft
anode
D. Subsection 1108.3 is added to the CPC section 1108 to read as
follows:
For the purpose of sizing roof drains, conductors, leaders, gutters, and
storm sewers, the rainfall rate used for calculations shall be three
inches (3”) per hour.
SECTION 10.

Chapter 15.28 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.28 AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE

15.28.010 Amendments to the CMC.

The CMC is amended as set forth in this chapter.

15.28.020 Title lines.

For the purposes of this chapter, and notwithstanding the provisions of

section 1.04.060 of the Sacramento City Code, the title lines (or

“catchwords”) in this chapter shall be deemed to be part of such sections.

Ordinance 2014-0001

January 14, 2014

Page 12 of 15




15.28.030 Local amendments to the CMC.

Section 312.1 of the CMC is amended to read as follows:
Section 312.1 Condensate Disposal. Condensate from air washers, air
cooling coils, fuel burning condensing appliances and the overflow
from evaporative coolers and similar water supplied equipment or
similar air-conditioning equipment shall be collected and discharged to

an approved plumbing fixture or approved disposal area.

An approved plumbing fixture for the purpose of this section shall be
one of the following:

1. An approved trapped and vented receptor connected to a
sanitary sewer;

2 A downspout when terminated in an approved disposal area.

An approved disposal area for the purpose of this section shall be one
of the following:

1, A drywell with a rock fill;

2. A planting area large enough to accept the discharge wastes;

B A storm drain system.

The waste pipe shall have a slope of not less than 1/8 inch per foot or
one percent slope and shall be of approved corrosion-resistant
material not smaller than the drain outlet size as required in either
section 309.3 or 309.4 of the CMC for air-cooling coils or condensing

fuel burning appliances, respectively.

Condensate or waste water shall not drain over a public way or over
any improved private walkwzay, driveway, or improved surface.

Vertical piping from condensate pumps shall be sized not less than the
pump outlet.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 13 of 15



Approved flexible tubing shall rise vertically, immediately to a height
whereby transition to rigid gravity waste pipe can occur.

SECTION 11,

Chapter 15.32 of the Sacramento City Code is repealed and added to read as
follows:

Chapter 15.32 AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE
15.32.010 Amendments to the CRC.

The CRC is amended as set forth in this chapter.

15.32.020 Title lines.

For the purposes of this chapter, and notwithstanding the provisions of
section 1.04.060 of the Sacramento City Code, the title lines (or
“catchwords”) in this chapter shall be deemed to be part of such sections.

15.32.030 Local amendments to the CRC.

Subsection R319.1.2 is added to the end of the CRC section R319.1 to read
as follows:

R319.1.2 Address Illumination. Addressing shall be illuminated at night
in all new buildings. Address signs shall be internally or externally
illuminated. When the luminance or the face of a sign is from an
external source, it shall have an intensity of not less than 5.0 foot-
candles. Internally illuminated signs shall provide equivalent
luminance.

SECTION 12.

Section 8.100.300 of the Sacramento City Code is amended to read as follows:

8.100.300 Ceiling heights.

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 14 of 15



Except for habitable spaces created in existing basements, habitable spaces,
laundry rooms, hallways, bathrooms and water closet compartments shall
have a ceiling height of hot less than seven feet. The ceiling height for
habitable spaces created in existing basements shall be as specified in the
2013 California Residential Code, Appendix J.

If any room in a building has a sloping ceiling, the prescribed ceiling
height for the room is required in only one-half the area thereof. No portion
of the room measuring less than five feet from the finished floor to the
finished ceiling shall be included in any computation of the minimum area
thereof.

If any room has furred ceiling, the prescribed ceiling height is

required in two-thirds the area thereof, but in no case shall the height of the
furred ceiling be less than seven feet.

Adopted by the City of Sacramento City Council on January 14, 2014, by the
following vote:

Ayes: Members Ashby, Cohn, Fong, Hansen, McCarty, Pannell, Schenirer,
Warren, and Mayor Johnson

Noes: None
Abstain: None

Absent: None

Attest:

Digitally signed by Shirley A. Concolino
DN: en=Shirley A. Concolino, 0=City of Sacramento, ou=City Clerk, emall=sconcolino@dltyofsacramento.org, c=US
Date: 2014.01.22 00:44:46 -08'00"

Shirley Concoling, City Clerk

Passed for Publication: January 7, 2014
Published: January 10, 2014
Effective: February 12, 2014

Ordinance 2014-0001 January 14, 2014 Page 15 of 15



STATE OF CALIFORNIA - GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
——eee———————

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

February 21, 2014

Michael Bartley

Fire Marshal

City of Sacramento Fire Department
5770 Freeport Boulevard, Suite 200
Sacramento, CA $5822

RE: Ordinance #2014-0003
Dear Mr. Bartley:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on February 10, 2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (cede), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely, J
ique M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



O'Brien, Laurie@DGS
_

From: Johnson, Carrie A. <cjohnson@sfd.cityofsacramento.org>

Sent: Monday, February 10, 2014 3:48 PM

To: OrdinanceFilings@DGS

Cc: Bartley, Michael

Subject: City of Sacramento Fire Department Local Ordinance to the 2013 CFC submittal
Attachments: Building Standards Commission Letter.pdf; OR2014-0003.pdf

To Whomever It May Concern:

Good afternoon to you. !n accordance with Health & Safety Code Sections17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 you
will find enclosed our adoptive ordinance, which makes revisions to the 2013 Edition of the California Fire
Code. Express findings are included as part of the adoptive ordinance.

Sincerely,

Carrie Johnson

Fire Prevention Cfficer-2321
Sacramento City Fire Department
5770 Freeport Bivd, Ste 200
Sacramento, CA 95822

Office: (916) 808-8621

Fax: (916) 808-7961

cjohnson@sfd.cityofsacramento.org



(tt)fa

SACRAM ENTO

B VPN it e i T T

Fire Department

DAN ME_HAVEBTY 5770 Freeport Bivd,, Sulte 200
Interim Fire Chief Sacramento, CA 95822-3516

Ph: (916) 808-1300
Fox (516) 808-1677
www.sacfire.org

February 7, 2014

Mr. Jim McGowan, Executive Director
Building Standards Commission

2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA £5833-2936

Subject; City of Sacramento adoption of the 2013 Califomia Fire Code

Dear Mr. McGowan,

In accordance with Health & Safety Code Sections17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 you will find enclosed our adoptive
ordinance, which makes revisions to the 2013 Edition of the California Fire Code. Express findings are included as part of
the adoptive ordinance.

If you have any questions or concerns please feel free to contact me at: (916) 808-1620.

Sincerely,

"Madul < DBavtta,
Michael Bartley, Assistant Chief

Fire Marshal

City of Sacramento Fire Department
5770 Freeport Boulevard, Suite 200
Sacramento, California 95822
mbartley@sfd.cityofsacramento.o
(916) 808-1620 office

(916) 216-0320 cell

Enclosure; 2013 Local Ordinance to the 2013 California Fire Code

The mission of the Sacramento Fire Departeeent is to protect our communily through effective and innovative public safely services.  fan.2103

o p———




CRDINANCE NO. 2014-0003

Adopted by the Sacramento City Council

January 21, 2014

REPEALING AND ADDING CHAPTER 15.36 OF THE SACRAMENTOC CITY CODE
RELATING TO THE 2013 EDITICN OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

BE IT ENACTED BY TEE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:
SECTION 1.

In connection with the local amendments enacted within section 15.36.050 of the Sacramento City
Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5,
the City Council finds and determines that:

A. The changes to the requirements published in the California Building Standards Code and
other regulations adopted by the State of California are reasonably necessary because of
local climatic, topographical, or geographical conditions.

B. The standards contained in the local amendmerits are more restrictive than those in the 2013
California Fire Code.

C. CLIMATIC

L. Climate has one of the greatest impacts on fire behavior and other major emergency
events because it cannot be controlled. The moisture loss in wood shakes and
wildland fuels in the summer months increases combustibility.

2. The building of homes within vegetation-covered rural areas and the combustible
vegetation on vacant urban lots, coupled with windy conditions, are a recipe for
disaster. Sacramento has four distinct seasons: summer, winter, fall, and spring. The
distinctions of these seasons are an attraction to the area and one reason why
significant population growth has occurred. The population growth has impacted
emergency service levels causing a strain on emergency services, and the result is
increased response times.

3. Sacramento has significant variations in weather patterns. Summers are arid and
warm, winters are cool to freezing, fall and spring can bring any combination of
weather patterns. It is this cyclical uncertainty that allows weather events such as the
rapid melting of the snow pack that causes flooding in the low-lying valley areas of
Sacramento. As rivers rise and fall with the runoff, access to common areas of
recreation and boating is affected. The doubling of average rainfall called an "El
Nino" event has occurred from time to time and causes the annual vegetation to
mature and grow in excess of six feet high before it dries out. A ten square foot area

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 1 of 17



with this type of fuel load is equivalent to the explosive force of one gallon of
gasoline.

4, Average yearly rainfall is approximately 19 inches. This rainfall normally occurs
from October to April. Low-level fog (Tule fog) is present throughout the winter
months, which may bring visibility to almost zero feet. The fog can delay emergency
responders and cause numerous vehicle accidents. The fog can also cause freezing
and slick roadways.

5. During the summer months there is generally no measurable precipitation.
Temperatures for this dry period range from 70 to 112 degrees Fahrenheit and are
frequently accompanied by light to gusty Delta winds. The relative humidity during
summer months range from 2% to 30%, which is arid. The city contains many acres
of grasslands, which, in conjunction with the dry and windy conditions, create a
hazardous situation that has led to extensive grass and brush fires in recent years.
More development is extending from the urban core into the grass-covered areas.
Wind-driven fires have led to serious consequences in similar areas of the state.

6. In the past, several consecutive years of drought conditions have occurred, thus
reducing the available water supply. Ground water as well as surface supplies have
all been affected. The drought conditions have led to lower water tables, reduced fire
flow testing, water contamination, and water conservation efforts. Additionally,
demands on water systems have increased due to increases in population growth.
These impacts have negatively impacted water use and availability for the fire
service. The degradation of water systems reduces the quality of fixed fire
protection, as well as fire suppression activities. Some water purveyors have reduced
the standard pressure maintained within their systems. This change can make fire
protection systems ineffective, and corrective measures, such as adding pressure and
increasing necessary booster pumps, generate additional costs to the community.

D. TOPOGRAPHICAL

. Sacramento is bisected by several topographical features, including two major rivets,
several streams and creeks, aqueducts, lakes, sloughs, natural parkways, open space,
bridges/overpasses, freeways, railroad tracks including light rail, drainage canals,
sprawling industrial facilities. Traffic has to be channeled around several of these
topographical features and physical limitations, which create traffic congestion and
delays emergency response. These features are located between many of the fire
stations located within Sacramento. It is imperative that no delays affect the timely
response of emergency responders.

2. Heavy traffic congestion on the City’s major streets already acts as a barrier to timely
response for fire and emergency vehicles. Some roadways are expected to double
their traffic flow within the next ten years. In the event of an accident or other
emergency at one of the key points of intersection between a road and river or
freeway, sections of the City could be isolated or response time could be sufficiently
delayed so as to increase the likelihood of injury or property damage.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 2 of 17



S Preservation of wetland areas, natural parkways, riparian corridors along
rivers/streams, vernal pools, open space and endangered species habitat have all
contributed to access problems, as well as exemption from vegetation abatement
programs. These situations, though environmentally important, increase the
demands on local fire agencies due to the extreme fire hazard created by fuel loading
and limited access.

E. GEOLOGICAL

1. Located at the confluence of two major rivers within California’s Central Valley, the
City of Sacramento has experienced seasonal flooding. Intricate levee systems were
created to hold back floodwaters, however development has moved into areas that
have the potential for flooding. Flooding and the resultant water intrusion into
buildings can incapacitate building fire protection systems, in addition to taxing the
emergency response capabilities should evacuation and rescue become necessary.

2, Based on the above climatic, topographical, and geological conditions, the local
amendments enacted within section 2 of this ordinance are reasonable and necessary
pursuant to Health and Safety Code section 18941.5. While it is clearly understood
that the adoption of such amendments may not prevent the incidence of fire, these
amendments attempt to reduce the severity and potential loss of life and property,
and enhance protection of the environment.

2 California Health and Safety Code section 17958.7 requires that the modifications or
changes be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers. The
following table provides the code sections that have been modified, which are
“building standards” as defined in Health and Safety Code section 18909, and the
associated conditions for modification due to local climatic, geographical and
topographical reasons.

Local Amendments to the Califorria Fire Code

Locat Climatic/ Geographical/ Topographical
Section Number | Ceondition
105.6 ' HI1
308.1.6.1 C1,C3,C5, & Gl
503.2.1 G2,346 & H1,2&12,3
903.2(c) Gl,6 &H1,2&11,34
903.3.1.3 (b) Hl &11,34
903.4.1.1 HI1 &11,3,4
907.2.3 G3,H1,2,14

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 3 of 17



SECTION 2.
Chapter 15.36 of the Sacramento City Code is repealed.
SECTION 3.

Chapter 15.36 is added to the Sacramento City Code to read as follows:

Chapter 15.36 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
15.36.010 Adoption of the 2013 California Fire Code.
The 2013 California Fire Code (Part 9 of the 2013 California Building Standards Code, Title
24, California Code of Regulations) is adopted by reference and incorporated into this code
except as expressly not adopted, amended, or superseded by the local amendments set forth
in this chapter.
15.36.020 Short title.
This chapter shall be known and may be cited as the “fire prevention code.”

15.36.030 Definitions.

“Fire code official” means the fire chief of the city or the fire chief’s designated
representative.

15.36.040 Penalties.

Any violations of this chapter are punishable as set forth in section 15.04.060 of the
Sacramento city code.

15.36.050 Local Amendments to the 2013 California Fire Code

The 2013 California Fire Code (Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of Regulations) is
amended as set forth in this section.

A. Division II, Administration of Chapter 1, is amended as follows:

L. SECTION 104 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES is amended
by adding the following subsections:

a. 104.2.1 Inspection fire envelope. Any work requiring fire department inspection
and approval shall have available on site an inspection fire envelope and an approved
set of construction documents that allow the Fire Code Official to conveniently
make the required entries thereon regarding the inspection of the work.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 4 of 17



b. 104.3.2 Citations and administrative penalties. The Fire Code Official may issue
citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this Chapter in accordance
with Sacramento City Code Section 1.28.020 and may issue an order imposing
administrative penalties pursuant to Sacramento City Code Section 1.28.010.

c. 104.7.2.1 Contract inspector. The Fire Code Official may require the owner or the
person in possession or control of the building or premises to provide, without charge
to the fire department, a special inspector (“Contract Inspector”), when the
department has no technical expertise available to conduct the required inspections.
The Contract Inspector shall be a qualified person who shall demonstrate his or her
competence to the satisfaction of the Fire Code Official. The Fire Code Official shall
establish policies and procedures to be followed by the Contract Inspector for the
duration of the contracted duties.

2. SECTION 105 is amended by adding the following subsections:

a. 105.6.48 Apartments. An operational permit is required for apartments and/or
complexes exceeding three units.

b. 105.6.49 Artists live/ work. An operational permit is required for the use of an
artist live/work facility.

c. 105.6.50 Battery systems. An operational permit is required for the use and
storage, within buildings, of battery systems having a liquid capacity of more than 50
gallons.

d. 105.6.5% Day care facilities. An operational permit is required for a day care
facility.

e. 105.6.52 Helistops and heliports. An operational permit is required to use or
operate a helistop, heliport, rooftop emergency landing area, or undesignated
helistop.

f. 105.6.53 Hotels and moteis. An operational permit is required for the use of a
hotel or motel.

g. 105.6.54 Institutions. An operational permit is required for the use of an
“institution” as defined by Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations.

h. 105.6.55 Marinas. An operational permit is required for the use of a marina.

1. 105.£.56 Cpen buraing. An operational permit is required for the use of items
that emit an open flame.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 5 of 17



j. 105.6.57 Radioactive materials. An operational permit is required for the use or
storage of any amount of materials capable of producing beta or gamma radiation.

k. 105.6.58 Refrigeration equipment. An operational permit is required to operate a
mechanical refrigeration unit or system regulated by Chapter 6.

3. Subsection 105.6.27 is adopted and amended to read as follows:

105.6.27 LPG. An operational permit is required for the use and storage of LPG
cylinders in quantities greater than 25 gallons.

4, Subsection 105.6.29 is amended to read as follows:

105.6.29 Miscellaneous combustible storage. An operational permit is required to
store, in any building or upon any premises, combustible empty packing cases,
pallets, boxes, barrels, or similar containers, rubber tires, rubber, cork or similar
combustible material, in excess of 1,500 cubic feet gross volume.

S. Subsection 105.6.42, is adopted and amended to read as follows:

105.6.42 Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts. An operational permit is
required to establish, conduct or maintain storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts
exceeding 1,500 cubic feet of total volume.

6. SECTION 106 is amended by adding the following subsection:

106.2.3 Administrative costs. The authority having jurisdiction may bill a
contractor for cost recovery for time spent at the test/inspection site as well as
administrative costs.

7. Subsection 108.1 Board of appeals established, is amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of appeals established. In order to hear appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals.
The board of appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and shall hold office
at its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business,
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate
copy to the fire code official.

B. CHAPTER 2, SECTION 202 is amended by adding the following definitions:
ELECTRONIC MONITORING SYSTEM. “Electronic monitoring system”

means an approved method to electronically detect and transmit, to an approved
alarm service provider’s Type A (listed) Central Station, information indicating that

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 6 of 17



the automatic fire sprinkler system or electronic fire detection system has been
activated and to relay the alarm to either (a) the Sacramento Regional Fire/EMS
Communications Center, or (b) the Sacramento International Airport
Communication Center.

QUALIFIED ATTENDANT. “Qualified attendant” means an individual that has
been trained in the proper methods of the handling, storage and dispensing of any
material, product or substance regulated by the code. These shall include, but not be
limited to ammonia, chlorine, cryogenic fluids, flammable and combustible liquids
and gases. The attendant must be able to demonstrate to the satisfaction of the Fire
Code Official that he or she possesses adequate knowledge in the subject area.

C. In CHAPTER 2, SECTION 202, the definition of “false alarm” is amended to read as
follows:

FALSE ALARM. “False alarm” has the same definition as “false fire alarm” as set
forth in Sacramento City Code section 8.38.030.

D. CHAPTER 3, Section 308.1.4 Oper-flame cooking devices is not adopted.

CHAPTER 3 GENERAL RECUIREMENTS is amended by adding the following
subsection:

308.1.6.3 Sky Lanteras. The use of sky lanterns or other similar devices is
prohibited.

F. CHAPTER 5 is amended as follows:

1. Subsection 503.2 is amended by adding the following as the first sentence in the
subsection

Two fire apparatus access roads shall be provided in accordance with Sections 501

and 503 for every facility, building, subdivision, development, campus, or complex,
containing 40 or more residential units within the jurisdiction.

2. Subsection 503.2.1 is amended by adding the following:

Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet,
exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates that comply with Section
503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches.

Exception: The required width may be reduced in a public alleyway to not less than
16 feet, only if the alleyway does not have fire department or standpipe connections
located in the alleyway.

3. Subsection 505.1 is amended by adding the following subsections:

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 7 of 17



a. 505.1.1 Muitiple tenant buildings. Multiple tenant spaces serviced by vehicular
access to the rear through any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall have numbers
or addresses placed prior to occupancy on all new and existing buildings as to be
plainly visible and legible from the rear access way when deemed necessary by the
Fire Code Official. Multiple tenant spaces serviced by rear access through a corridor,
exit court, or exit yard shall have approved numbers or addresses displayed on the
rear of the tenant space, when deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official.

b. 505.1.2 Multiple tenant spaces. Multiple tenant spaces that front on interior
walkways or pedestrian malls shall have approved numbers or addresses placed over
the entrance door in all new and existing buildings. An illuminated anunciator or
directory board shall be required at every entrance where deemed necessary by the
Fire Code Official.

c. 505.1.3 INumination. Addressing shall be illuminated at night in all new
buildings. Signs shall be internally or externally illuminated. When the luminance or
the face of a sign is from an external source, it shall have an intensity of not less than
5.0 foot-candles. Internally illuminated signs shall provide equivalent luminance. In
all cases, addresses shall be readily identifiable from the nearest fire apparatus access
road servicing the building.

4. Subsection 507.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where any portion of the facility or building within the
jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a water supply on a public street, as measured
by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire
hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be provided
when required by the Fire Code Official.

5. SECTION 511 is added to read as follows:

SECTION 511 EMERGENCY ACCESS GATES & BARRIERS

511.1 Scope. Where a new gate or barrier is installed on a fire access roadway, the
fire department shall have emergency access. Gates or barriers shall have a Click-2-
Enter (Click2Enter©) option for motorized gates and a Knox pad lock or Knox box
(Knox®) with appropriate keys for access to the premise.

511.2 Definitions.

GATES AND BARRIERS - shall mean a gate, crossbar, door or other obstructive
device that is utilized for the purpose of restricting, controlling or obstructing entry or
exit by motor vehicles or pedestrians to or from a private roadway and is not
monitored on a twenty-four hour, seven day per week basis by a person capable of
providing immediate access to a police or fire safety vehicle or person.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 8 of 17



FRIVATE DRIVEWAY - A private way for vehicular travel that provides access
from an off-street parking area to a public or private drive.

PRIVATE STREET OR ROADWAY - shall mean any roadway (not dedicated as
public right-of-way) that is owned and maintained by abutting property owners or
association of property owners and is utilized for the purpose of providing vehicular
or pedestrian access to a subdivision, apartment complex, condominiums or other
residential development or wildland, excluding off-street parking areas, driveways,
and driveways to off-street parking areas.

511.3 Permit.

A permit issued by the fire authority having jurisdiction is required to install any
secured access gate system. Applications to install gates or barriers should be
submitted to the City of Sacramento, Fire Prevention Division. Plans shall be
approved by the fire authority and a permit issued prior to installation. In addition to
the required plans, the following documents shall be submitted when required by the
Fire Code Official.

1. Written concurrence of property owners, in the form of a notarized letter,
indicating that all property owners served by the gate agree to the installation
and operation.

2. A notarized “Road Maintenance Agreement” identifying the addition of
the gates and operating systems.

The fire authority having jurisdiction shall inspect all gates for proper installation and
operation prior to activation or use.

511.4 Requirements for vehicle gates.

1. All gates shall be UL 325 compliant.

2. Gates shall not be installed within a required turning radius of a fire access
roadway.

3. Access for single direction traffic shall be unobstructed 16 feet wide and 13 feet 6
inches high.

4. Access for bi-directional traffic shall be unobstructed 20 feet wide and 13 feet 6
inches high.

5. Swinging gates for single direction traffic shall swing in the direction of vehicle
travel.

6. Swinging gates for bi-directional traffic shall swing into the property being
entered.

7. All gates shall be accessible from the driving lane nearest the edge of the street by
turning radii of at least 35 feet inside and 55 feet outside. After passing through a
gate, the nearest curb of any cross street shall be no less than 40 feet.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 9 of 17



511.5 Operation of gates, general.

1. Electrically operated gates shall be equipped with the following approved fire
department methods for entry and exit:

a. Key override switch (Knox®), and

b. Radio operated controller (Click2Enter© or other approved equipment).
EXCEPTION:

Radio controlled exit may be waived by installation of a “free exit” loop.

2. Gates requiring radio-controlled access shall be provided with an approved 2 inch
by 2 inch, blue, reflective marker visible to approaching traffic. It shall be located in
the center of the exit gate.

a. Wiring for electrical gates shall be provided by AC current, underground
installation. An electrical permit is required by the Sacramento Building
Department.

b. Electrically operated gates shall fail to the open position when the power is
off. They shall remain open until power is restored.

c. Knox® Company authorization forms are required for orders of key
switches, boxes and padlocks. The forms may be obtained by calling the Fire
Prevention Division.

511.6 Manual gates or barriers.

1. Manual gates or barriers may be approved on a case-by-case basis for nighttime
security of business property or access to wildland property.

2. They shall be constructed in a manner that reflects good construction practices
acceptable to the fire authority having jurisdiction.

3. They shall be accessible by means of an approved fire department padlock
(Knox®) or by the installation of an approved key box (Knox®).

4. Approved manual gates or barriers across emergency access roadways shall be
provided with an 18-gauge metal sign in the center and on both sides of the gate that
shall read, “FIRE LANE-NO PARKING.” Letters shall be red on a white
background and be a minimum of 3 inches high with a % inch stroke.

5. For nighttime security only, gates to close off a fire lane, in order to minimize
dumping and vandalism shall be approved with (Knox®) padlock access. Gates to be
closed during business hours are required to be electronically operated.

511.7 Prohibitions.

1. No gate shall be installed where access requires the use of a proximity reader or
card.

2. Direction-limiting devices, such as fixed tire spikes, are prohibited.

3. The total number of vehicle access control devices or systems, through which
emergency vehicles must pass to reach any address shall not exceed one.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 10 of 17



4. No commercial property owner shall install fences and gates where more than one
gate must be opened in order to reach within 150 feet of the rear portion of any
building.

511.8 Pedestrian gates.

1. All vehicle gates obstructing pedestrian access to a public way (street) shall have
an approved pedestrian gate installed within 10 feet of the vehicle gate.

2. Gates shall be handicap accessible and comply with exit door requirements of the
2013 California Building Code.

3. An approved key box (Knox®) shall be installed at least 48 inches above grade on
the outside of the gate. It shall be provided with a key to open the pedestrian gate.

4. No pedestrian gate shall be located in the median between two vehicle gates.

EXCEPTION:

Private driveways serving one single-family residence are exempt from this
requirement.

511.9 Additional requirements.

Because of the delays caused by vehicle access control devices or systems, additional
fire protection requirements may be applied based on other access limitations, such
as narrow or winding streets, or dead-end streets without an approved turnaround
available for fire apparatus. Other than the obstruction and the reduced width
controlled within this standard, no other requirement of the fire authority having
jurisdiction shall be adversely affected by.the placement of any vehicle access control
device or system in any required fire apparatus access road. Fire department
approval does not waive any requirement by other authorities having jurisdiction.

G. CHAPTER 6, SECTION 602 is amended by adding the following definitions:

ROOF ACCESS POINTS. An area that does not place ladders over openings (i.e.,
windows or doors) and are located at strong points of building construction and in
locations where it does not conflict with overhead obstructions such as tree limbs,
wires, or signs.

SLOPED ROOF. For the purpose of solar photovoltaic power systems, a roof with a
greater than a 2-in-12 pitch.

STRUCTURAL STRONG POINT. Bearing wall or other such suitable load
bearing member.

H. CHAPTER 9 is amended as follows:

1. Subsection 903.2 Where required, is amended by adding the following;

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 11 of 17



For all occupancies except Group R-3 and detached U, an automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed and equipped with an electronic monitoring system as
follows:

a. In every new building where the total floor area exceeds 3,599 square feet or
greater.

b. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in every building when there
is an addition to the floor area in existence on the effective date of this ordinance of
20 percent or more within a 12 month period and the aggregate floor area of the
building exceeds 3,599 square feet.

C. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in any portion of a
building where there is a change of occupancy that creates a greater fire or life safety
hazard, and the floor area of that portion of the building, which is changed, exceeds
3,599 square feet.

d. For the provisions of this section, area separation walls shall not apply to
eliminate the installation of a sprinkler system.

Exception: Non-combustible, detached canopies open on four sides not exceeding
the basic allowable square footage in CBC Table 503 used exclusively for the parking
or storage of private or pleasure vehicles and noncombustible storage (includes fuel
islands).

2. Subsection 903.2.11, is amended by adding the following:

903.2.11.7 Covered floats, marinas and piers. A fire sprinkler system shall be
provided for all covered floats, marinas, piers, and any/all other covered floating
structures that are commercially operated and exceeds 3,599 square feet.

3. Subsection 903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:
Section 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems
installed in one- and two- family dwellings and townhouses shall be permitted to be

installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D and the City of Sacramento
standards.

Every submittal shall include a full set of plans including details of type of pipe and
fittings, hydraulic calculations, elevation views of all potential models if site is a
master planned community and any other requested data sheets.

4. Subsection 903.4.1 is amended by adding the following:

Subsection 903.4.1.1 Fire control room. An approved fire control room shall be
provided for all new buildings or occupancies with a change of use, protected by an

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 12 of 17



automatic fire extinguishing system. The room shall contain all system control
valves, fire alarm control panels and other fire equipment required by the Fire
Code Official. Fire control rooms shall be located within the building at a location
approved by the Fire Code Official, and shall be provided with a means to access
the room directly from the exterior. Durable signage shall be provided on the
exterior side of the access door to identify the fire control room. Fire Control
Rooms shall not be less than 50 square feet.

Exception:
1. Group R, Division 3 Occupancies.

2. Occupancies with a fire pump shall have a fire control room that is a
minimum of 200 square feet.

3. In highrise buildings, the fire control room shall not be less than 200 square
feet.

5. Subsection 907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 907.2.3 Group E. Group E Occupancies shall be provided with fire
alarm systems in accordance with Section 907.2.3. Group E Occupancies
having an occupant load of 50 or more, shall be provided with an approved
automatic fire alarm system. When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke
detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be connected to the
building fire alarm system. When more than one fire alarm control unit is
used, they shall be interconnected and shall operate all indicating devices.
Group E Occupancies with an occupant load of 50 persons or less shall have
an early-warning device as approved by the fire authority having jurisdiction.

6. Subsection 907.6.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 907.6.5 Mionitoring. Required alarm systems shall be monitored by an
approved alarm service provider’s Type A (listed) Central Station as established by
Sacramento Regional Fire/EMS Communication Center. The Central Station
monitoring company or approved alarm company shall notify the authority having
jurisdiction in writing, within 24 hours, of systems that are found not to be in
compliance with applicable codes. Receipt of supervisory signals by the monitoring
company require the dispatch of a runner or maintenance person (arrival time not to
exceed 3 hours), unless the condition can be restored to normal through the
subscriber’s efforts.

Exception: Monitoring by a supervising station is not required for:
1. Single and multiple-station smoke alarms required by Section 907.2.11.

2. Group I-3 occupancies shall be monitored in accordance with Section
907.2.11.

3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one and two family dwellings.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 13 of 17



907.6.5(A) Branch electrical circuits. When providing a fire alarm circuit in
a multiple-occupancy type building (multiple metering), the circuit shall be
energized from the building meter panel board. When a separate source of
power (i.e. emergency generator) is provided, the fire alarm circuit shall be
energized from the emergency panel board.

907.6.5(B) Alarm trarsmission. The activation of a fire sprinkler system,
hood extinguishing system, special extinguishing system or a fire
alarm/detection system shall cause the system to initiate a signal to the
Central Station within 90 seconds. Retransmission from the Central Station to
the Fire Dispatch Center shall not exceed 60 seconds.

Exception: Hood extinguishing systems or special extinguishing systems
installed in existing buildings without a fire alarm system need not be
monitored.

907.6.5(C) Signal interference. Signal amplification shall be required to
provide signal integrity at the discretion of the Fire Code Official. All costs
regarding the installation, maintenance, and continuous operation of those
lines of transmission shall be the responsibility of the building owner.

907.6.5.1 Automatic telephone dialing devices. Two separate telephone
lines (numbers) that use Digital Alarm Communicator Transmitters (DACT)
shall be provided from the protected premises to the Central Station. All costs
regarding the installation, maintenance, and continuous operation of those
lines shall be the responsibility of the building owner.

1. CHAPTER 11, Subsection 1101.3 is amended to read as follows:

1. Section 1101.3. Permits. Permits are required to operate an airport, heliport,
helistop, aircraft refueling vehicle, application of flammable or combustible finishes,
and hot work, and the fire code official is authorized to issue permits for these
operations in accordance with the provisions in Section 105 permits.

1101.3.1 Helicopter use permits. A permit is required for any person, firm or
business landing a helicopter at a site other than an approved airport or
heliport as described by Federal Aviation Administration F.A.R. Part 77, for
the purpose of advertising, promotions, lifting, or rides whether for public or
private use. The fire code official is authorized to issue permits for these uses
in accordance with the provisions in section 105 permits. In addition to any
other information that the fire code official may require under Section 105.2
Application, sufficient information shall be provided to the fire code official
to allow him or her to reasonably determine or assess the operational safety of
the use.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 14 of 17



.J. Subsection 2006.5 is amended by adding the following:

2005.1.4 Fueling at rooftcp heliports. Refueling at rooftop heliports, helistops or
emergency landing areas is not permitted.

K. CHAPTER 26 1s adopted 1n its entirety and amended as follows:
1. Subsection 2603.3 Notification, is amended to read as follows:

2603.3 Notification. The Fire Code Official shall be notified in writing at least 24
hours before the structure is to be closed in connection with the utilization of any
toxic or flammable fumigant. Notification shall give the location of the enclosed
space to be fumigated or fogged, the occupancy, the fumigants or the insecticides to
be utilized, the person or persons responsible for the operation, and the date and time
at which the operation will begin. Notice of any furigation or thermal insecticidal
fogging shall be served with sufficient advance notice to the occupants of the
enclosed space involved to enable the occupants to evacuate the premises.

L. CHAPTER 56 is amended by adding the following subsections:

1. 56061.2 Seizure of fireworks. The Fire Code Official is authorized to seize, take,
remove or cause to be removed at the expense of the owner all stocks of fireworks
offered or exposed for sale, stored or held in violation of local, state, or federal
regulations.

2. Section 5698.3 Sales. Permits are required for the sale and display of “Safe and
Sane” approved fireworks as permitted and regulated by Chapter 8.48 of the
Sacramento City Code.

M. CHAPTER 57, Section 5704.2.14. Removal and disposal of tanks, is amended by adding
the following subsection:

5704.2.14.1 Removai. Tanks shall not be disassembled at the site by any means.
N. CHAPTER 80 is amended to read as follows:

NFPA - National Fire Protection Association

All NFPA Standards current as of the date of this code’s adoption shall be adopted
except: 11C, 13E, 13R, 297, 473, 550, 902, 1001, 1002, 1003, 1021, 1031, 1033,
1035, 1041, 1201, 1221, 1402, 1404, 1405, 1410, 1500, 1561, 1581, 1710, 1720, 1901,
1911, 1914, 1931, 1932, 1971, 1975, 1981, 1982, 1983, 1999.

O. Appendix C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION is amended by
adding the following subsections:

C104.2 Existing single outlet 2 1/2 inch hydrants. Existing single outlet 2 % inch

hydrants shall be changed to an approved steamer-style hydrant, when construction
or use increases the required fire flow.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 15 of 17



C104.3 Water main improvements. Where water main improvements are required to
meet gallon per minute (GPM) flow, and the existing water main has a single 2 1/2
inch outlet fire hydrant, an upgrade of hydrants is required.

C104.4 Existing hydrants. Existing hydrants affected by right-of-way improvements
shall be moved to an approved location at no cost to the fire authority.

C104.5 Hydrant type. The Fire Code Official shall approve the type of fire hydrants
to be installed in public right-of-way or on private property prior to any such
installation under the City Utilities Standard.
P. Table C105.1 of Appendix C is amended to read as follows:
TABLE NO. C105.1

NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

FIRE FLOW MINIMUM AVERAGE MAXIMUM DISTANCE
REQUIREMENT | NUMBER OF SPACING FROMHYDRANT TO

- (gpm)° HYDRANTS BETWEEN ANY POINT ON STREET

' HYDRANTS 4 OR ROADWAY
£e FRONTAGE (Ft.)
(Ft.)

1750 or less 1 300 150
2000-2250 2 300 150
2500-3250 3 300 150
3500-4250 4 300 150
4500-5250 5 300 150
5500-5750 6 300 150
6000-6250 6 250 150
6500-7250 7 250 150
7500 or more 8 or more ® 200 120

P. Footnotes to Table C105.1 are amended to read as follows:
a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roadways.

b. Hydrants shall be required on both sides of the street whenever one or more of
the following conditions exist: :

1.  Street has a median center divider that makes access to hydrants difficult, causes
a time delay or creates an undue hazard;

1. There are four or more lanes of traffic;
i, Width of the street 1s in excess of 88 feet; or

iv. The existing street will be widened or will have a raised median center divider
installed in the future pursuant to the General Plan Roadway Improvement Plans

for the City of Sacramento.

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 16 of 17



¢.  One hydrant for each 1000 gpm or fraction thereof.

d. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not
needed for protection of structures or similar fire problems, fire hydrants should
be provided every 1000 feet of street to provide for transportation hazards In
addition, there shall be at least one hydrant at each intersection.

e. Average spacing between hydrants may be extended to 500 feet on streets serving
one- and two-family dwellings.

15.36.060 Adoption of ordinance.

Adoption of the ordinance codified in this chapter repealing and adding Sacramento city
code chapter 15.36 does not affect any administrative, civil, or criminal prosecutions or
proceedings brought or to be brought, pursuant to chapter 15.36 or other provisions of the
Sacramento city code, or pursuant to applicable federal, state, or local laws, to enforce
provisions of chapter 15.36 as they existed prior to the effective date of the ordinance
codified in this chapter. The provisions of chapter 15.36, as they exist prior to the effective
date of the ordinance codified in this chapter, shall continue to be operative and effective
with regard to any acts occurring prior to the effective date of the ordinance codified in this
chapter.

Adopted by the City of Sacramento City Council on January 21, 2014, by the following vote:

Ayes: Members Ashby, Cohn, Fong, Hansen, McCarty, Pannell, Schenirer, and Warren
Noes: None

Abstain: None

Absent: Mayor Johnson

Attest:

Q @i ~ : Digitally signed by Shiriey A. Concoline
L 3 f DN: cn=8hirley A. Concoline, o=City of Sacramento, ou=City
L) n I ri ey A . UO ﬂ COI I n O . Clerk, email=sconcolino@cityofsacramento.org, c=US

Date: 2014,01.29 12:58:40 -08'00

Shirley Concolino, City Clerk
Passed for Publication: January 14, 2014

Published: January 16, 2014
Effective: February 20, 2014

Ordinance 2014-0003 January 21, 2014 Page 17 of 17



