STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

February 21, 2014

Laurie Donnelly

Fire Marshal

County of San Luis Obispo
635 N. Santa Rosa

San Luis Obispo, CA 93405

RE: Ordinance #3249
Dear Ms. Donnelly:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on January 21, 2014.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your county receive and ratify Fire Protection District
ordinances making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code
§13869.7(c) requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the
Department of Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards,
State Housing Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making
modifications to the energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the
California Energy Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

ique M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



CAL FIRE

San LUiS Ob,‘g)o 635 A;, Santa Rosa » San Luis Obispo, CA 93405
° Phone: 805-543 -4244 « Fax: 805-543-4248
unty Fire Department www.calfireslo.org
g N\ Robert Lewin, Fire Chief

January 7, 2014

California Building Standards Commission
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833-2936

Dear Commissioners,

California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 (c) requires that express findings and
amendments to the California Fire Code be filed with the California Building Standards
Commission. Enclosed is a copy of the San Luis Obispo County ordinance and resolution adopting
and amending the 2013 California Fire Code. The code has been reviewed by the County Fire Chief
and the County Building official as well as presented to the County Board of Supervisors as a
resolution.

Sincerely,
Laurie Donnelly

Fire Marshal
Battalion Chief



ORDINANCE NO. 3249

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 16.10 OF THE SAN LUIS OBISPO COUNTY
CODE BY ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2013
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, INCLUDING ANNUAL SUPPLEMENTS
AND STATE AMENDMENTS AND ERRATA

WHEREAS, it is the desire and intent of the Board of Supervisors of San Luis Obispo
County to provide citizens with the greatest degree of protection from fire; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Code, Title 24, which incorporates the
California Fire Code, is adopted every three years by order of the California Legislature
with supplements published in intervening years; and

WHEREAS, the latest edition of the California Building Standards Code was published
this year and has the force of law beginning January 1, 2014 and the Board of
Supervisors desires to make local additions, amendments and deletions thereto as
authorized by California Health and Safety Code Sections 18941.5 and 17958.5; and

WHEREAS, this Ordinance will amend the San Luis Obispo County Code so that it
adopts and amends Part 9 of the California Building and Standards Code, which is known
as the 2013 California Fire Code, including Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices B, BB,
C, CC, F, H and |, as modified and amended. All other Appendices to the 2013 Fire Code
are expressly not adopted by this Ordinance. All annual supplements and state
amendments and errata are adopted by this Ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of San Luis Obispo County adopted findings on
November 26, 2013 as required by California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7,
that because of climatic, geological, and topographical conditions that exist in the county
that the amendments to the adopted codes are reasonably necessary to protect the
citizens life, health and property.

NOW THEREFORE, The Board of Supervisors of the County of San Luis Obispo, State
of California, ordains as follows:

Page 1 of 16



SECTION 1:

Chapter 16.10 of the San Luis Obispo County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Chapter 16.10

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

Sections:

16.10.010

16.10.010  Adoption of the California Fire Code.

16.10.020  Definitions.

16.10.030 Establishment of limits for the storage of
flammable or combustibie liquids.

16.10.040  Establishment of limits for the storage of
liguefied petroleum gases.

16.10.050 Establishment of limits for the storage of
explosives and blasting agents.

16.10.060 Amendments made to the California Fire Code.

16.10.070  Appeals.

Adoption of California Fire Code.

Except as amended in Section 16.10.60, Part 9 of the California Building and Standards

Code,

which is known as the 2013 California Fire Code, including Appendix Chapter 4

and Appendices B, BB C, CC, F, H, | and K, are adopted by reference into this Chapter.
All other Appendices to the 2013 Fire Code are expressly not adopted. All annual
supplements and state amendments and errata are adopted by reference into this
Chapter.

16.10.020

(@)

(b)

()

Page 2 of 16

Definitions.

Wherever the word “jurisdiction” is used in the California Fire Code,

it shall mean the unincorporated territory of the County of San Luis Obispo
protected by the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection/San Luis
Obispo County Fire Department.

Wherever the phrase “Building Department” is used in the California Fire Code, it
shall mean the San Luis Obispo County Department of Planning and Building.

Wherever the phrase “Chief of Police” is used in the California Fire
Code, it shall mean the Sheriff of San Luis Obispo County. (Ord. 2774 §1 (part),
1996: Ord. 2633 §1 (part), 1993: Ord. 2435 §1 (part), 1990).



16.10.030

Establishment of limits for the storage of flammable or combustible liquids.

The limits referred to in Sections 5704.2.9.6.1 of the California Fire Code, “Locations
where above-ground tanks are prohibited” by which the storage of flammable or
combustible liquids is restricted are established by the provisions of San Luis Obispo
County Code, including but not limited to, Titles 22 and 23. (Ord. 2774 §1 (part), 1996:
Ord. 2633 §1 (part), 1993: Ord. 2435 §1 (part), 1990), and the California Code of
Regulations Title 23, Chapter 16, Sections 2632, 2635, 2636, 2637, 2638, 2641.

16.10.040

Establishment of limits for the storage of liquefied petroleum gases.

The limits referred to in Section 6104.2 “Maximum capacity within established fimits” of
the California Fire Code, by which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted are
established by the provisions of San Luis Obispo County Code, including but not limited
to, Titles 22 and 23. (Ord. 2774 §1 (part), 1996: Ord. 2633 §1 (part), 1993: Ord. 2435 §1

(part),

16.10.050

1990).

Establishment of limits for the storage of explosives and blasting agents.

The limits referred to in Chapter 56 of the California Fire Code regarding the storage of
explosive materials are established by the provisions of San Luis Obispo County Code,
including but not limited to, Titles 22. and 23. (Ord. 2774 §1 (part), 1996: Ord. 2633 §1

(part),

1993: Ord. 2435 §1 (part), 1990).

16.10.060 The California Fire Code is hereby amended as follows:

Amendment No. 1

Section 101.1 “Title”, is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the County of
San Luis Obispo, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Amendment No. 2

Section 103. “Department of Fire Prevention” is amended by addition thereto as follows:

Page 3 of 16

103.5 Fire prevention Bureau Personnel and Police. “The chief of the fire
department and certain other members of the California Department of Forestry
and Fire Protection/San Luis Obispo County Fire Department have the authority of
peace officers or public officers pursuant to California Penal Code sections
830.2(g), 830.7(d) and 836.5(a) in performing their duties under the California Fire
Code.”



Amendment

No. 3

Section 105.3.3 “Occupancy Prohibited Before Approval” is amended to read as foliows:

Amendment

105.3.3 Occupancy and use prohibited before approval. The building or
structure shall not be occupied prior to the fire code official issuing a permit that
indicates that applicable provisions of this code have been met. No appliance,
device, equipment, or system shall be operated or used until the installation has
been approved and permitted by the fire code official and all applicable provisions
of this code have been met. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant or
contractor or both to cause the work to remain accessible and exposed for

inspection purposes.

No. 4

Section 108.1 “Board of Appeals Established” is amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of Appeals Established. Appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code, shall be heard and decided by the Fire Code Board of
Appeals established by the Board of Supervisors on 10-9-1990 (Consent Agenda
ltem A-15 which is on file in the Office of the County Clerk-Recorder).

Amendment No. 5

Section 202, “General Definitions” the definition of “Alteration” is amended to read as
follows:

Alteration. Any construction change or renovation to an existing structure other

than a repair or addition. Alterations include, but are not limited to, the addition or
elimination of walls within the existing building envelope. Alteration also includes
modifications to the structure which involve complete removal and replacement of

wall board within any room.

Amendment No. 6

Sectio

n 202, “General Definitions” the definition of “Floor Area, Gross”, is amended by

addition thereto as follows:

Page 4 of 16

Floor Area. For the purpose of calculating square footage for the application of fire
sprinkler requirements and fire flow requirements, the floor area shall include all
combustible areas attached to the structure, including garages, patio covers,
overhangs, covered walkways and alterations, additions and remodel square
footage will be considered a combined and cumulative sum of floor area.



Amendment No. 7

Section 202, “General Definitions” is amended by addition thereto to include the following
definition of “Greenhouse”:

Greenhouse. An agricultural building used for the growing of plants. It shall
include other structures also known as hothouses, cold frames and other similar
specialty categories. It shall include without limitations, construction materials of
glass, rigid plastic, flexible plastic, masonry, wood, metal and concrete.

Amendment No. 8

Section 302.1, “Definitions”, is amended to add the following definition:

SKY LANTERN. An airborne lantern typically made of paper with a wood frame
containing a candle, fuel cell composed of waxy flammable material or other open
flame which serves as a heat source to heat the air inside the lantern to cause it to
lift into the air. Sky candles, fire balloons and airborne paper lanterns mean the
same as sky lanterns.

Amendment No. 9

Section 308.1.6.3 is added to read as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. The ignition and launching of sky lanterns is prohibited.

Exceptions:
Upon approval of the fire code official, sky lanterns may be used under the
following conditions:
(a) When necessary for religious or cultural ceremonies and adequate
safeguards have been taken in the discretion of the fire code official.

(b) Sky Lanterns shall be tethered in a safe manner to prevent them from
leaving the area and must be constantly attended until extinguished.

Amendment No. 10

Section 403 Public Assemblages and Events is amended by addition thereto to read as
follows:

Page 5 of 16

403.2.2 Procedures

Prior to Fire Department Review, proposed event area must first complete all
requirements pursuant to Title 22, the San Luis Obispo County Land Use
Ordinance. This includes receiving any necessary land use permit approval and
issuance of construction and Conditional Use Permit requirements.



A fire safety review is required to ensure public safety in a place of assembly, or
any other place where people congregate, inciuding but not limited to; amusement
buildings, carnivals and fairs, exhibits and trade shows, open burning, flames and
torches, candles, places of assembly, temporary membranes structures and tents,
pyrotechnics and special effects, live audiences and any event with public
attendance over 250.

A written plan must be submitted to the fire code official 30 days prior to the event.
Written submittal requirements will be in accordance with Section 404 Fire Safety
and evacuation plans. A field inspection verifying compliance of fire and life safety
conditions must be conducted prior to public occupancy of the event. If
modifications or additions to the event areas are made, an updated permit &
inspection must be completed.

All other provisions of section 403 remain unchanged without amendment.
Exception: A and E Occupancies

Amendment No. 11

Section 405.7 “Initiation” is amended to read as follows:

405.7 Initiation. Where a fire alarm system is provided, emergency evacuation
drills shall be initiated by activating the fire alarm system. Prior to initiating an
alarm, the person initiating the alarm shall contact the fire alarm monitoring
company and advise the company’s dispatcher of the fire drill. In cases where the

fire alarm system is not monitored by a central station, notification shall be
provided to the fire department dispatch center.

Amendment No. 12
Section 503.1.2 “Additional Access” is amended by addition, thereto as follows:
503.1.2.1 Maximum Dead-end Road Lengths. The maximum length of dead-end

roads, including all dead-end roads accessed from a dead-end road, shall not
exceed the following cumulative lengths, regardless of the number of parcels

served:
Parcel size Length
less than one (1) acre 800 feet
1 acre to 4.99 acres 1320 feet
5 acres to 19.99 acres 2640 feet
20 acres or larger 5280 feet

All lengths shall be measured from the edge of the roadway surface at the
intersection that begins from the road to the end of the road surface at its farthest
point. Where a dead-end road crosses areas of differing zoned parcel sizes

Page 6 of 16



requiring different length limits, the shortest allowable length shall apply. VWhere
parcels are zoned 5 acres or larger, turnarounds shall be provided at a maximum
of 1320 feet or 1/4 mile intervals.

Amendment No. 13
Section 503.2 “Specifications” is amended by addition there 1o as follows:

503.2.7 Grade. The grade for all roads, streets, private lands and driveways shall
not exceed 16 percent unless approved by fire code official. Design criteria shall be
in accordance with San Luis Obispo County Public Works public improvement
standards. Roads 12%-16% shall be a nonskid asphalt or concrete surface as
specified in San Luis Obispo County public improvement Standards, specifications
and drawings.

503.2.9 Driveway. Driveway specifications shall be provided and maintained when

serving no more than one legal parcel or lot with no more than 3 dwelling units, and any
number of accessory buildings.

503.2.9.1 Driveway width for high and very high fire severity zones:

Length Required Width
0-49’ 10°
50’-199' 12’
Greater than 200’ 16’

503.2.9.2 Turnarounds. Turnarounds must be provided if driveway exceeds 300
feet, and shall be within 50 feet of the building. For driveways exceeding 300 feet,
a turn-around shall be at the building site and must be within 50 feet of the dwelling.
For driveways exceeding 800 feet, turnouts shall be provided no more than 400 feet
apart. Driveways exceeding 150 feet in length, but less than 800 feet in length, shall
provide a turnout near the midpoint of the driveway.

503.2.9.3 Turnouts. A turnout shall be provided near the midpoint and shall be a
minimum of 10 feet wide and 30 feet long with a minimum 25 foot taper on each
end.

Amendment No. 14

Section 503.4 “Obstruction of Fire Apparatus Access Roads is amended to read as
follows:

503.4 Obstruction of Fire Apparatus Access Roads Fire apparatus access roads
shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. Minimum
required widths and clearances established under Section 503.2.1 shall be

Page 7 of 16



maintained at all times.

503.4.2 Authority to Remove Obstruction. The Fire Code Official and his
authorized representatives shall have the power and authority to remove or cause
to be removed, without notice, any vehicle or object parked or placed in violation of
the California Fire Code and California Vehicle Code 22651. The owner of any item
so removed shall be responsible for ail towing, storage and other charges incurred.

Amendment No. 15

504.3 Stairway access to roof. New buildings two or more stories above grade
plane, except those with a roof siope greater than four units vertical in 12 units
horizontal (33.3-percent slope), shall be provided with a stairway to the roof or other
access to the roof for emergency personnel approved by the fire code official.
Stairway access to the roof shall be in accordance with Section 1009. Such
stairway or other approved access shall be marked at street and floor levels with a
sign indicating that the stairway or access continues to the roof. Where roofs are
used for roof gardens or for other purposes, stairways shall be provided as required
for such occupancy classification.

Amendment No. 16
Section 505.1 “Address Identification” is amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall have approved
address numbers, building numbers or approved building identification placed in a
position that is plainly legible and visible from the street or road fronting the
property. These numbers shall contrast with their background. Where required by
the fire code official, address numbers shall be approved in additional approved
locations to facilitate emergency response. Address humbers shall be Arabic
numerals or alphabet letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of: Residential 6
inches, Commercial 8 inches, and Industrial 10 inches high with a minimum stroke
width of 0.5 inch (12.7mm).

505.1.1 Directories. When required by the fire code official, complexes with
multiple buildings may be required to provide directories, premises maps and

directional signs. The scale, design and location of directory signs shall be
approved by the fire code official and may be required to be illuminated.

Amendment No. 17
Section 603.1.4 “Fuel Oil” is amended to read as follows:

603.1.4 Fuel Oil. The grade of fuel oil used in a burner shall be that for which the
burner is approved and as stipulated by the burner manufacturer. Oil containing
gasoline shall not be used.

Page 8 of 16



Amendment No. 18
Section 606.8 “Refrigerant Detector” is amended to read as follows:

606.8 Refrigerant Detector. Machinery rooms shall contain a refrigerant detector
with an audible and visual alarm. The detector, or a sampling tube that draws air to
the detector, shall be located in an area where refrigerant from a leak will
concentrate. The alarm shall be actuated at a value not greater than the
corresponding TLV-TWA values shown in the California Mechanical Code for the
refrigerant classification. Detectors and alarms shall be placed in approved
locations. In addition, emergency shutoff shall also be automatically activated when
the concentration of refrigerant vapor exceeds 25 percent of LFL (Lethal

Flammable Limits).

Amendment No. 19

Section 903.2 “Where Required” is amended by deletion of Sections 903.2 through
903.2.11.3. Amend Sections 903.2 by addition thereto to read as follows:

Page 9 of 16



91 jo 0l obed

JUBLIEM SUOIIPUOD [BUO)EIado JO [BJUSLULOIIAUS USUM SBOIASD JUB)SISaI UOIS0LI00 parcidde aq |[eys SUOREO0| JOLISIXS e paj|elsul Sispjuuds all4 ojewony

‘slapjuuds oy

JNEWOINE YJIM PaINIOEJNUEBLL JOU S18M UDIUM | |0Z 'Z) UDJB|A 810434 10 UO palaje I0 Pajonijsuod SSUoe02 [BI2ISWWOD JO SawWoy Jjing AJ0joe) Jo painjoenuew/a|iIqo .,

18dpz 1e wdBpg/ 18y} SS9) SI JUBIPAY € WOl MO} 11} By} PUB QSO SOSO SOT UIYIM 10 D40 ‘DFD Ul S8jge] JO SS9IXa Ul

sannuenb ul pajpuey Jo paios 'painjoBnuEL Sleusjew snopiezey Aue Jo sopse|d uljAxolAd ‘wyjy sjenu aso|n|jed asaym Aouednoaoo Aue so Aouednooo | dnos ‘H dnoig
'y ‘BUIBLIOMPOOAA |4 ‘eJeakeq 3 ‘v dnoio e jou si Aouednooo ay) pue J9a} alenbs goQ| PEROX JOU S0P BaIE JOOJ) iaym LOB0D [elnsawwo o Bulpiing Alo)s-sibuis v .

‘Buipfing JeloJawWLLIOD B SB Ppasn aq Jouuen = 'sjusrg/ebejquissse oljgnd Joj Jo JuawAojdiwis o aoejd e se pasn aq Jouur) « "iNonijs ey} jJo

JI0LIB]X8 8Y] Ul pajunow Jjaq s|qipne ue o] payull DED YIM 8dUBpI0od. Ul PajBISUI S10J08]ap jesy = ‘Sjuswianbsay uojonjsuo) Juejsisey uopiubj asepsjuj-ueqin
PUBIDIM BILIOMRD BY] Ylim S8ljdwos 8Injonss « Y 008 UIyum juelpAy ey papiroid Apunwiwod ou si aisy} ji (uejd Ajejes alyj 88S)Zy L L Vd-IN Yim souelduwos
1iny Ul yjue) 188)s suojeb 0po ‘S JO winwuL abeIO)S J8jeM allf PEJRIIPaP = "BaIE J00) JO %0} O] Pajill S8oJ0 10 sdoysxiom = ‘(1oop Buibuims abuly apis) ioop
ueLjsapad suo Bulpnjour Syxe oM} WNWIUIW « ‘(Pamojje aje mojeq o} uado pue eale JOOY 8y} £/} SHOJ) S8LI0JS PUOIBS OU ='80BdS 8jqejiqey JO PauOHIPUOd OU =
‘SjJudwiaaINnbal BUIMO|[O] 913 JO J|€ pue sjuawalinbai a|ge)} BACTE ay} JO |[E 1oaw jsnw a6ejoo} alenbs WinwiUILL 8} 19A0 saINonys .,
"SH09p puUB SABM[EM palaAod 183) Z Joro sBueyiano ‘s1anoo oned ‘sabeleb Buipniou; ‘ainjonus au 0 payoelje seale
a|qIsSNQIOD ||B 8pNoUl |[BUS BaJE JOO) ay) ‘siuswalinbal moy a1y pue sjuewasinbal Japjuuids auiy jo uonesldde ayy Joy abejooy sienbs Bunenoles jo esodind ay) Jod .,

159)0U)004
(funog odsigo sin ues) soueuIpIQ @SN pueT 0N | epoD Buipjing eiuioied 08D | SpOQ il BIUIOUED 04D | SPOD |BRUSPISSY BILIOHED DD
HCERITETETE|
salnjonis S8I0B (Z 19A0 (pauinbai yaepiye)
6l 9L ¥ _ uaeplje psubis (pasinbai yiwiad ou)
1810 Woy} 188} 05 pue| pauoz by . Juswealbe 000'c 0 ON
‘“1d wolj 198} 001 uo uleg-by %3S ydwaxg by lad 8 1dwex3 by on 1dwoxg jeamnonby
folcle) sasnoyuaalh
P wmr_c:%:ww uonduosap mmm_w SI0Ll 10 oAy lod sapis ‘euale Buipu o asnoyuaals ‘euale
; H 3 1993 09 s8g SUON uo usdo v.cm SALEPLORE ||e uo 3884 09 palanoo ‘abelols Aey N paiano) ‘uleq 9jod
1d Woi 183} 001 olgnd ou ‘saakojdws oN 3 penwIUN fios auQ
uoniuysp
0490 % ON1 9OV uim
S2.monAs Solqels 2]0U}00 (pauinbai yAEpUE) . .. | @ouepioooe ul suojelado ainjonlig Alossaaoy
Jayjo woyj 198} 05 Jo uleq z 085 sdolo 10 Yo01saAl %G/ 000's | 000 _m_:u_:o:m,.q o SAA jeanynouBy
14 wolj }@3) 0oL Aois auQ aq jsnw abesn Aewd YoOIS m>.__ ‘uonesado )
[einynoufe o) Alossaonoy
bp|q abeio)s
jenuepisal saoeds
saInonIs i
olpnis a]0Uj004 Buideais 1o Buial oN . . YD Ul pauyap ainjonyg
L.\_"Euo wodi 193] o€ ‘doysyJom ‘ TS Buijooo 1o bugesy oN 000€ | 000} | & salnjonls Alossa00y oA A10SS022Yy |eljUapISOY
1 WoJ} 13984 0§ '
abe.eb
Aoys suQ
sBuyjemp pue S , S9UOBO0D |B104OLULIOD
oD ‘08D J8d uononisuod | e Joulood sBuiping mau jnoybnoiy 0 pue sswoy a|iqow SOA UOIJINIISUOD MAN

29g

.- (1d)saNi
" AL¥3dONG ON

STUNLONYLS N3

- ONVISIZNIN

Buipnjout sbuip|ing manN

NOILLONYLS




099 8y} Ul Uorela)je Jo uoULSP Sy} PUB 0Z0°0Z 61 ORIL Ul Z'Z'S0L 995 "eoueusiurew o asodind ay} Joj [Emaual 1o UoHoNSUosal 8yl SI YIVdIy
"suepjuLds Bunebbiy Jnoyym peppe 89 0} Pamo||e S| Mojaq WOOJ 3y} JO Bale 100j) 3U} JO PAIL} SUO UBL) S10W OU pue mojaq Jooj) ay) o} uado 1o| ¥
"JUBLIEM SUOIIPUO2 [EJUSLUUOIIALUD UBSUM SB2IASP JUB]SiSal UoisoLi00 pancidde aq ||eys SUONED0| JOLIB)Xa JB pajjelsul siapjuuds ali4 onewony

aunnod Jo ‘sjiem Buurelal ‘s|elsle| lames 'saolAlas |eoljosfe 'Buloal ‘smopulm pue sBuLIBA0D JoleIXe JO Juslusorjdal :Buimojjoy By} 1o auc AjUo 0] palilul| SUoREIS}Y
"S)08p pue SABMY|EM PRIBA0D puk 193} Z JaAo sBueylano ‘sienod oned ‘sebeleb Buipnjoul 'ainjondls ay} 0} payoeje seaie

9l 40 |} obed

sjuswalinbal Jepuuds 2.1y 0] 10a[qns jou aJe siapuuds
B4l JJELUOINE YIM paJnjdBjNUBLL JOU a1am YdIUM | 10T ‘2L YDIB 810jaq 10 U pals)je JO Pajonlisuod SSUoeOoD [BIoJSLWIWOD Jo sawoy }ing AIojoe) 10 painjoenuew/e|Iqon

‘s
L4
e

"sliiedal |BojuBYyOSW pue [eoLuosle ‘Buiguinid

e

s|qusnquIod [je apnjoul j[Bys Bale 100}) 8U) ‘sjuaiuaiinbal mol a1y pue sjuawalnbai japjuuds a1y jo uoneodde sy 1o} afejoo) asenbs Bunenojes jo asodind ey} o4 .

| apoo Buipling BlLIONED 0D | 9POD auld BILIOHED (94D | SPOD [eRUSpISSY BILIOJED (9HD

159j0U30044

:saouaiajoy

°G00S Ja1deyd D490 ul
pejsi| se sjuawalinbal

040 080 ul s8|qe] JO Ssaoxs
uj sapyyuenb u) pajpuey lo

sbulpjing

mm._,_sﬁm

mmm._xz_Em

Kouednooo Auy SUON apn[oul osje ishuwl Auy paJo)s ‘painjogjnuewl s|elsjew SaA opISU] S[eUBIEN ShopIezel
Buipping e jo uomnlod snopJezey Aue Jo soiseid
Aue pue Buipjing ullAxolAd 1o wiyi ejesu asojnjieD
asn [eI0JaWILLIOD
01 p EiEsns DUON 61 a2nil Jad Bunels Auy aly Aq Aressadau pawisap se 1o SOA abueys uoneoiisse|d fouednaoQ
weq 1o dousyiom UORBOUISSE|D plezeH piezey Jaybiy u; synsal abueyn
‘abeieb payoeje
Buipjing pamojje Jou salnyonis
palapiuLds Auy SUON pasepjuuds AEEd Auy Aouednoaoo Auy SaA sBuip|ing palspjuudg
ainonans TS
Bunsixa ue mojaq Jo 2]0U00 .
sutiqe SoetlssIaB]|gEl v 085 000 r mN,Mwmmco"_um_moEoo Auy Alois jeuonippe ue Bulppy SOA S3LI0}g [eUCIPPY
Aue Buipaauoo/Buippy } R
eaJe 00|}
JO WINS BAIEINWND PUE |  EBIE JOO| di
iysiaumo Jo abueyo Aue
uonippe Auy SUON um:_m_%ﬁ_u_w‘,mmwmm“wwww:oo 10 ”\ooom 10 ssgjpiebal gooz 10 Aenuep “UH'SBA , Suolppy
alenbs [apolwual pue 15 000'} L.} SAREINLING SUOKPRY
suonippe ‘suopela)y
BaJE 100}
1O WNS @AR|NWIND pUE wood Aue ulypm pleoq [jem
uoney|iqeyay z muomumoon_ PaUIGLUOD B paJapIsuos | + mmzmw_ooz 10 JuswWwaoe|dal pue |eAowsal o
‘S|apoLudJ JoLBjU| mmmn_ oy aq {|Im abejooy hw_ww WM . 919/dwos aAjoAUl YDIYM i SeA , Suoijesaly
L alenbs |spowal pue ° 81N1oN.)s ay] 0} SUONEINIpoW
suonippe ‘suonesdly sepnjoul UoReIS)Y
e 14 3509.. e . 3dAL NOILYOIITOW

t_<v.5._b=m_._.w -le} >oz<n_=ooo

NOILONYISNOD ONILSIXS 10} Sisiaiinboy weyskg 1epunds ail4 JeWoINY — Z°€06 AIGEL



Amendment No. 20

Section 903.3.6 “Hose Threads” is amended to read as follows:

903.3.6 Hose Threads. Fire hose threads used in connection with fire-
extinguishing systems shall be national standard hose thread or as approved by the

fire department.

Amendment No. 21

Section 903.4 “Sprinkler System Supervision and Alarms” is amended to read as follows:

903.4 Sprinkler System Supervision and Alarms. All valves controlling the water
supply for automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels, and
temperatures, critical air pressures and water-flow switches on all sprinkler systems
shall be electrically monitored for integrity and to ensure valves are locked in the
open position, by a central station listed by Underwriters Laboratories for receiving

fire alarms.

Exceptions:
1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one and two-family dwellings.

2.

3.

Limited area sprinklers serving fewer than 20 sprinklers.

Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where
a common supply main is used to supply both domestic water and the
automatic sprinkler system, and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic

sprinkler system is not provided.
Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, paint spray booths or dip tanks
that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Valves controlling the fuel supply to a fire pump engine that are sealed or
locked in the open position.

Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, pre-action and deluge sprinkier
systems that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Amendment No. 22

Section 904.11 “Manual System Operation” is amended by addition thereto as follows:

904.11.1. Manual System Operation Training. It shall be the responsibility of the
business owner to ensure that all employees are knowledgeable in the use of
manually operated or activated fire-extinguishing systems within the occupancy.

Page 12 of 16



Amendment No. 23
Section 905.3 “required installations Standpipe Systems” is amended to read as follows:

905.3.1 Building height and area. Class Ili standpipe systems shall be installed
throughout buildings where the floor level of the highest story is located more than
30 feet (9144 mm) above the lowest level of the fire department vehicle access, or
where the floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm)
below the highest level of fire department vehicle access and in any parking
structure.

A building that is greater than 20,000 square feet (1.858 m2) of floor area and
greater than18 feet (5.49 m) in height shall have a dry or wet standpipe system
with a 2 % inch (64 mm) outlet at the roof near the roof access. Location of the
outlet and the fire department connection to the standpipe shall be labeled and
approved by the fire code official.

Amendment No. 24
Section 907.7.5 “Monitoring” is amended to read as follows:

907.7.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the
California Building Code shall be monitored by an approved supervising station
listed by Underwriters Laboratory for receiving fire alarms in accordance with
NFPA 72. The supervising station shall contact and notify the Fire Chief or their
call receiving location immediately on notification of an alarm and prior to making
contact with the protected premises.

Exception: Supervisory service is not required for:
1. Single- and multi-station smoke alarms required by Section

907.2.11.
2. Group I-3 occupancies shall be monitored in accordance with

Section 907.2.6.3.4.
3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings.

Amendment No. 25

Chapter 50,”"Hazardous Materials-General Provisions”, is amended by addition thereto as
follows:

If any provision of Chapter 50 as it pertains to Explosive Material is in conflict with San
Luis Obispo County Code Chapter 6.32, the provisions of Chapter 6.32 shall control.

Page 13 of 16



Amendment No. 26

Chapter 56, “Explosives and Fireworks”, is amended by addition thereto as follows:

If any provision of Chapter 56 conflicts with San Luis Obispo County Code Chapter 6.32,
the provisions of Chapter 6.32 shall control.

Amendment No. 27

Section 5609 is amended by addition thereto to read as follows:

5609.1 Fireworks Prohibited. The manufacturing, possession, storage, sale, use
and handling of fireworks, including without limitation, “Safe and Sane” fireworks,

is prohibited.

Exceptions:
1. Storage of fireworks in accordance with the requirements for low order

explosives in Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 10.
2.  Storage of fireworks, 1.4G in accordance with the Building Code.
3. Use and handling of fireworks for professional display in accordance
with Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 6.

5609.2 Seizure of Fireworks. The fire code official shall have the authority to
seize, take and remove fireworks stored, sold, offered for sale, used or handled in
violation of the provisions of Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 6
and California Health and Safety Code, Chapter 9.

Amendment No. 28

Section B103.3 “Areas Without Water Supply Systems” of Appendix B Fire-Flow
Requirements for Buildings, is amended to read as follows:

B103.3 Areas without water supply systems. |n areas without service water
companies, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 1142, or NFPA
Standard 13, current edition, is used to establish on-site storage capacities, except
that in all cases a minimum storage capacity of 2,500 gallons is required if so
authorized by the fire code official.

16.10.070  Appeals

(@) Any appeals to the requirements of this section shall be heard in
accordance with Section 108 of the California Fire Code.

Page 14 of 16



SECTION 2:

The Board of Supervisors has considered the changes that are proposed with respect to
the matter described above. The Board of Supervisors has, as a result of its
consideration, the evidence presented at the hearings on said matter, and all comments
that were received during the public hearing process, determined that this activity is
exempt from review pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) which provides that an activity is not
subject to CEQA review where it can been seen with certainty that there is no possibility
that it may have a "significant effect on the environment." The Board of Supervisors finds
that it can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility that the adoption and
amendment of the 2013 California Fire Code may have a significant effect on the
environment because there is no substantial evidence that the adoption of this ordinance
will have a significant effect on the environment. The Board of Supervisors hereby
approves this adoption and amendment of the 2013 California Fire Code in accordance
with the California Environmental Quality Act and the County's regulations implementing

said Act.

SECTION 3:

If any section, subsection, clause, phrase or portion of this ordinance is for any reason
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of a court of competent jurisdiction,
such decision shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of the remaining portion of this
ordinance. The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would have passed this
ordinance and each section, subsection, clause, phrase or portion thereof irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, phrases or
portions be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 4:

The fire chief is hereby authorized and directed to transmit a copy of this ordinance to the
California Building Standards Commission as required by California Health and Safety
Code Section 17958.7.

SECTION 5:

This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force on and after 30 days from the date of
its passage hereof, but not before January 1, 2014. Before the expiration of 15 days after
the adoption of this ordinance, it shall be published once in a newspaper of general
circulation published in the County of San Luis Obispo, State of California, together with
the names of the members of the Board of Supervisors voting for and against the
ordinance.

Page 15 of 16



INTRODUCED at the regular meeting of the Board of Supervisors held on the 26" day of
November, 2013, and PASSED and ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the
County of San Luis Obispo, State of California, on the 3™ day of December, 2013, by the

following roll call vote, to wit:

AYES: Supervisors Frank R. Mecham, Adam Hill, Caren Ray, Debbie
Arnold and Acting Chairpersen Bruce S. Gibson
NOES: None

ABSENT: None
ABSTAINING:None
The foregoing ordinance is hereby adopted.
Bruce S. Gibson
Acting Chairman of the Board of Supervisors

of the County of San Luis Obispo,
State of California

ATTEST:

JULIE L. RODEWALD
County Clerk and Ex-Officio Clerk
Of the Board of Supervisors of the County of San Luis Obispo, State of California

By./s/ Annette Ramirez STATE OF CALIFORNIA ) ss.
Deputy Clerk COUNTY OF SAN LUIS OBISPO)

I, JULIE L. RODEWALD, County Clerk of the above
entitled County, and Ex-Officio Clerk of the Board

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGAL EFFECT; | of Supervisors thereof, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a full, true and correct copy of an

[seal]

RITA L. NEAL order entered in the minutes of said Board of
County Counsel Supervisors, and now remaining of record in my
office.

By: /s/ Nina Negranti
Chief Deputy County Counsel Witness, my hand and seal of said Board of

Supervisors this 14th day of January, 2014,

JULIE L. RODEWALD,
County Clerk and Ex-Officio Clerk of the Board of
Supervisors

Date: October 29, 2013

Page 16 of 16
By:__JBmady &untme

g
Deputy Clerk




IN THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

COUNTY OF SAN LUIS OBISPO, STATE OF -CALIFORNIA

Tuesday., November 26. 2013

PRESENT:  Supervisors Frank R. Mecham, Adam Hill, Caren Ray, Debbie Arnold and
Acting Chairperson Bruce S. Gibson

ABSENT: None
RESOLUTION NO. 2013-280

RESOLUTION ESTABLISHING SPECIAL FINDINGS RELATED TO ADOPTION
OF THE 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND AMENDMENTS BASED ON LOCAL
CLIMATIC, GEOGRAPHICAL AND TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS.

The following resolution is hereby offered and read:

WHEREAS, it is the desire and intent of the Board of Supervisors of San Luis
Obispo County to provide citizens with the greatest degree of protection from fire; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Code, Title 24, which incorporates the
California Fire Code, is adopted every three years by order of the California Legislature with
supplements published in intervening years; and

WHEREAS, latest edition of the California Building and Standards Code was
published this year and has the force of law beginning January 1, 2014 and the Board of
Supervisors desires to make local additions, amendments and deletions thereto as authorized
by California Health and Safety Code Sections 18941.5 and 17958.5; and

WHEREAS, the Ordinance introduced on this date will amend the San Luis Obispo
County Code Chapter 16.10 so that it adopts and amends the 2013 California Fire Code,
including Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices, BB C, CC, F, H, I and K , as modified and

amended, including annual supplements and state amendments and errata; and

Page 1 of 6



WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of San Luis Obispo County desires to make
findings as required by California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 that
because of climatic, geographical and topographical conditions that exist within San Luis
Obispo County, the amendments to the adopted codes are necessary to protect citizens' life,
health, the community environment and property; and

WHEREAS, the Fire Chief for San Luis Obispo County has prepared a Report and
Findings setting forth the underlying factual support for the required local findings, a copy of
which is attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated herein by reference as though fully set

forth herein.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED by the Board of
Supervisors of the County of San Luis Obispo, as follows:

1. That the recitals set forth hereinabove are true, correct, valid and incorporated into

the body hereof by this reference.

2. Based upon the facts contained in the Report and Findings attached as Exhibit
A, the Board of Supervisors hereby makes findings that because of climatic, geo graphical
and topographical conditions that exist throughout the unincorporated areas of San Luis
Obispo County, the amendments to the adopted codes are necessary to protect the life,
health, environment and property within the unincorporated areas of San Luis Obispo
County. Said Report and Findings is hereby approved and adopted in the form set forth
in Exhibit A.

Upon motion of Supervisor Mecham, seconded by Supervisor Ray, and on the
following roll call vote, to wit:
AYES: Supervisors Mecham, Ray, Hill, Arnold and Acting Chairperson Gibson

NOES: None

Page 2 of 6



ABSENT: None

ABSTAINING: None

the foregoing Resolution is hereby adopted.

ATTEST:

Julie L. Rodewald

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By: /s/Sandy Currens
Deputy Clerk

Bruce S. Gibson
Acting Chairperson of the Board of
Supervisors

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGAL EFFECT:

Rita L. Neal
County Counsel

By:/s/Nina Negranti

Deputy County Counsel

DATED: October 29, 2013

STATE OF CALIFORNIA ) SS.
COUNTY OF SAN LUIS OBISPO)

I, JULIE L. RODEWALD, County Clerk of the above entitled County, and Ex-Officio
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors thereof, do hereby certify the foregoing to be a
full, true and correct copy of an order entered in the minutes of said Board of
Supervisors, and now remaining of record in my office.

Witness, my hand and seal of said Board of Supervisors this 14th day of January,
2014.

JULIE L. RODEWALD,
County Clerk and Ex-Officio Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:_sJomaduy, Lurrom§
0 Deputy Clerk

Page 3 of 6




EXHIBIT A
SAN LUIS OBISPO COUNTY FIRE DEPARTMENT
REPORT AND FINDINGS

The Board of Supervisors of the County of San Luis Obispo finds that in order to
best protect the health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the County of San Luis
Obispo, the standards of building within the County must conform with State law except
where local conditions warrant more restrictive regulations.

Pursuant to Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, this
Report and Findings constitutes the findings to support the proposed Ordinance
Amending Chapter 16.10 of the San Luis Obispo County Code by Adopting and
Amending the 2013 Edition of the California Fire Code, Including Annual Supplements
and State Amendments and Errata (“Ordinance”). Pursuant to the Ordinance, specific
amendments have been established which are more restrictive in nature than those
sections adopted by the State of California and contained in Title 24 and Title 25 of the
California Code of Regulations.

The amendments to the 2013 Edition of the California Fire Code, and is part of
the California Code of Regulations/California Buildings and Standards Code, Title 24,
Part 9), are necessary to address the unique fire problems facing San Luis Obispo County
due to the unique local conditions as noted below.

Under the provisions of Sections 17958.5 and 18941.5 of the Health and Safety
Code, local amendments shall be based on climatic, geographical, or topographical
conditions. The findings contained herein shall address each of these situations and shall
present the local conditions which cause the need for the amendments to be adopted.

SAN LUIS OBISPO COUNTY PROFILE

San Luis Obispo County has over 257,000 residents and an area of 3,316 sq. mi. It
includes diverse topography, including beaches and coastline bluffs, extensive
agriculture, oak and coniferous forests, mountains, and high deserts. There is significant
critical infrastructure in the County, which has experienced rapid growth in recent years.
The County has a history of earthquakes, including the 2003 San Simeon Earthquake
(two deaths, $239 million damage), and is the home to Diablo Canyon Nuclear Power
Plant. The County’s northern and eastern borders are relatively remote, and as a result we
cannot rely on timely mutual aid responses from neighboring counties in those directions.

Significant critical infrastructure exists in the County, including: Diablo Canyon
Nuclear Power Plant, one commercial gas-fired electrical power plant, and 535 mi. of
110-500kv transmission lines; four drinking water reservoirs, 70 mi. of water
transmission pipelines, one pumping station and one holding station; two sea ports; 110
mi. of roadways designated as National Security Route and part of the Strategic Highway
Network with 21 major bridges; two National Guard bases, housing active Army satellite,
maintenance and fiscal operations; 72 mi. of main line railroad with seven major bridges,
five tunnels and a switchback loop; one prison facility with 6,500 inmates (directly below
the afore-mentioned railroad switchback loop) one commercial service airport, one
general aviation airport, one basic utility airport, and one FAA navigational beacon; one
oil refinery, three oil pipeline pumping stations, and 215 mi. of 12-26 inch oil and natural
gas transmission pipelines; one departure hub for oceanic telecommunication cables;
Hearst Castle and other state parks; one campus of the California State University system,
with 19,000 students, performing arts and sports venues; two community college
campuses, with 11,150 students, performing arts and sports venues; five acute care
hospitals; and, one maximum-security mental hospital with up to 1,200 patients.

Local wineries, beaches, and other attractions draw large numbers of tourists into
the area, with resulting planning and security issues. The region has a long history of
‘earthquakes, and is a designated tsunami hazard area. One of only three major north-
south highway routes in California passes through the County, as does one of only two
major north-south railway lines. Any disruptions to highway or railroad transportation
would have significant impacts over a much larger area. Additionally, any such
disruptions could totally isolate the region from other parts of the state, significantly
limiting the amount of outside help available during an emergency.

Page 4 of 6



EXHIBIT A
SAN LUIS OBISPO COUNTY FIRE DEPARTMENT
REPORT AND FINDINGS

After due consideration the County Board of Supervisors of the County of San
Luis Obispo hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions
as stated in this section, that modifications and changes to the current California Building
Standards Code are reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of
life, health and property.

Climatic: The hot, dry weather in combination with Santa Lucia winds frequently
results in wildland fires in areas of the County of San Luis Obispo. These conditions
create an environment where the entirety of local fire department personnel is required to
control, monitor, fight and protect against such fire situations in an effort to protect life
and preserve property. The same climatic conditions may result in the concurrent
occurrence of one or more fires in the more populated areas of the County without
adequate fire department personnel to protect against and control such a situation.

During such periods, limited fire-fighting resources support the imposition of greater fire-
protection requirements than set forth in the 2013 California Fire Code.

Geological: The County of San Luis Obispo is in an area of high seismic risk.
Four active faults are within the county, each capable of generating large, damaging
earthquakes. These faults are: the San Andreas Fault, which trends northwest-southeast
near the eastern boundary of San Luis Obispo County; the San Simeon Fault, which is
part of the larger Hosgri Fault Zone and parallels the coastline in the northern part of San
Luis Obispo County; the Los Osos Fault, which parallels the Los Osos Valley a few miles
southwest of the city of San Luis Obispo; and the Oceanic Fault, which runs from the city
of San Luis Obispo northwest toward the community of Cambria, and was the fault
responsible for the Magnitude 6.5 San Simeon earthquake that affected the region in
December 2003. In addition, there are several potentially active faults within the county,
including the Rinconada Fault, the Huasna Fault, and the Nacimiento Fault Zone. These
faults could also produce large earthquakes.

Earthquakes from these faults could produce primary effects such as strong
ground shaking or ground rupture, and secondary effects such as liquefaction and
landslides. These primary and secondary effects pose a significant hazard to the county’s
building stock and infrastructure, and to public health and safety. These hazards include
strong shaking causing collapse of vulnerable buildings and bridges, ground rupture
affecting roads and highways, and liquefaction damaging buildings, pipelines (water, gas,
sewage), marine facilities (docks, jetties), railroads, and airports. Fire from broken gas
lines and the lack of water from broken water lines could result in major damage.
Landslides caused by strong shaking, possibly in combination with wet weather
conditions, could block highways and railroads, thereby isolating parts of the county and
affecting emergency response. Earthquake-induced landslides could also produce
rockfalls that could strike and damage buildings and vehicles. Tsunamis could inundate
the coastline. The protection of human life and the preservation of property in the event
of such an occurrence support the imposition of fire protection requirements greater than
set forth in the 2013 California Fire Code.

. Topographical: The County of San Luis Obispo has rural areas that are in very
high fire hazard areas. Due to varied topography, access to structures in rural areas
increases response time and delays fire suppression efforts. An extended response time
will allow fires to grow beyond the control of initial attack fire suppression resources.
Large structure fires in the hillside areas will have a greater likelihood of starting a
wildland fire, which may expose additional structures to fire. The above described
problems support the imposition of built-in fire protection requirements greater than
those set forth in the 2013 California Fire Code.

CONCLUSION

The amending and adoption of the 2013 California Fire Code identifies a legally accepted
and recognized means to insure public safety and proper protection from fire. The

Page S of 6



EXHIBIT A
SAN LUIS OBISPO COUNTY FIRE DEPARTMENT
REPORT AND FINDINGS

adoption of these Codes together with the amendments provides a reasonable and
established means of adequately protecting life, environment and property in the

unincorporated parts of San Luis Obispo County.

Based on these findings, Ordinance No. , will provide effective protection of
the residents, the environment, as well as property and help reduce the ravages of fire.

While the adoption of stringent regulations may not prevent all incidents of fire or deaths
from fire, the implementation of the various codes and/or requirements will reduce the
severity and potential for the loss of life, damage to the environment and property in the
unincorporated parts of San Luis Obispo County.

Prepared by: Laurie Donnelly, Battalion Chief/ Fire Marshal

Submitted by: Robert Lewin, Chief

Page 6 of 6



