STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
—_——— e e ______GOVERNOREDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

January 13, 2014

Terri A. Griffin

City Clerk

City of Santa Rosa

100 Santa Rosa Avenue, Room 10
Santa Rosa, CA 95404

RE: Ordinance #4015 & #4016
Dear Ms. Griffin:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency on December 11, 2013.

Our review finds the submittal t6 contain two ordinances modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modifications are accepted for filing and are enforceable. This letter attests only to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of local code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Development, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

ique M. Rodriguez

Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



O'Brien, Laurie@DGS

From: Griffin, Terri <tgriffin@srcity.org>

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2013 2:59 PM

To: OrdinanceFilings@DGS

Cc: Pedroia, Mark; Whitaker, Michael; Williams, Stephanie

Subject: Local Filings - 2013 California Fire Code and 2013 California Building Standards Code
Attachments: Ordinance No. 4015 - Building.pdf; Ordinance No. 4016 - Fire.pdf

To Whom it May Concern:

Attached please find certified copies of the following ordinances, adopted by the Santa Rosa City Council on
December 3, 2013:

1. ORDINANCE NO. 4015 - ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013
CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE,
2013 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARD CODE, 2013
CAL!IFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2013
CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA
ENERGY CODE, 2012 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

2. ORDINANCE NO. 4016 - ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013 EDITION
OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

Should you have any questions, please contact me at (707) 543-3015.
Terr &. Griffin | City Clerk

Citv Tlerk’s Office {100 Sanie Rosa Avenue, Room: 10 | Santa Rosa, CA 95404
Tel. (707) 542-3015 | Fax (747) 543-3030 | CityClerk@srcity.org



ORDINANCE NOJoLs

OBRDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013

CALIFORNIA ADMININIRATIVE CODE. 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE. 2013

o

CALIFORNIA  RESIDENTIAL  CODE. 20153 CALFOENIA  GREEN  BUILDING

STANDARDS CODE. 2003 CALIFORNIA la’.i"*’"RF":(‘T“J \"! ANDARD CODE. 2013

CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE. 23 CALIFORWIA MECHANICAL CODE, 2012

A

LS

CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2013 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE.

"ﬂl-‘ CALIFORNIA E"CI‘%TI"‘JG BUILDING CODE. 2613 CALIFOENIA ENERGY CODE.
JINTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA DO ENACT AS TOLLOWS:

Sechion 1. The existmg scetions of Chapter 18-04. General Provisions. that are not sepeajed
er amended by 1iis ordinance are readopied and shall apply. as applicable. w the mode! codes
herein adopted.

Section 18-04.015 Adoption by reference, Subscetion (A}, of the Santa Rosa City Code is
amended 1o read as follows:

“(A) It is hereby adopted by reierence by tite City of Santa Rosa those eerlain mode!
cedes as adopted and ‘arsended by the Swate of Calitoraia and deiined in the Health and
Safety Code and eontained in Tiﬂ;: 24 ot the Californiz Code of Ragulations as apphicable
W vagdous aecupancies as depicied w the matriy adoption tables mu in ov the

proniug

cating instramients 1lz-:w wiicn codes wie known ast The CALITORN]A
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE. Part 1 of Title 24. 2013 Edition. published by the
International C‘od:’ Council and emended by the California Buiiding Standards
Commission: The CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE. Pari 2 of Titie 24, 2013 Edition.
published by the Iniernational Code Council and amended by the Califormiz Buiiding
Standards Commission. and Appendix C. Apricultural Buildings: Appendix H, Sigus:
Appendix I, Patio Covers:‘Appendix J, Grading: the CALIFORNIA RESIDENT! f&'L
LODL, Part 2.5 of Title 24. 2613 Edition. published by the international Lud. Counci
and amended by the Califomin Building Standards Commission. and Appendix H. P .um
LCovers: CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE. Part 11 of Title 2
2013 Edition. including Appendix Chapier Ad. Re \“‘Llc. uml V nldl]i wry Measures at Ter 1
tove] for Planning and Destan: Waer Bfito servanion, Material

e ¥ =S § S P 5 s - e T L =
LOnGs i ! ”‘U }:~ L% £ LLCIo N ill" R ‘ { ‘ il " ¥, ﬂia‘.l- ._.il;v>..1':n-l$“li-‘- 5:;:'
™ ] - A Tas f .
Voluntars \lt... supes i Tierd levet for Planaing and Design, Waier

Lzh\ shey and L e ation, Maresiat Con ‘mm n and Resource Efficiency. and

A ” 'TH“‘ LB *’f ERENCED STANDART ’)\&Hi E, ™
Pin the internatonal Code Coundtl and the Calitom

_.;\T} “i”" \i—f CTRICAL CODE Fx

':'-“‘ —'\‘»\ﬂs. il ;{‘u ‘.,u.

ad Anney H.

s A BT Triie")
'-.."‘ (841 Hi'i‘.:.\--':.

Environm ,.,ﬂﬁ:

CAL 11 CHUNG -

! :-1! .y ) ‘\..I = o L
1DV Ihe i’uw...l..i;'-';“,-, S S50

)nsé,n l\w-' {]*Il/ -4-.". E

2015 Edition.



amended by the Caditorida Bullding Stendards Commission. inciading tables and
Appendix B. Uniform Mecharical Caode Siandards: The CALIFORNIA PLUMBING
CODE. Part 5 oi Titke 24. 2013 Edition, published by the Imernatioral Association of
Plumbing nd Mechanical Oficials and amended by the California Building Swandards
Commission. including IAPMO Insiallation Standards, including tables and Appendix A.
Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Piping System: Appendix B. Lxplanatery
Notes on Combinaion Wasie and Vent Systems: Appendix D. Sizing Storm Water
Drainage Systems: Appendix I, Installation Standurds; and Appendix L. Alternate
Plumbing Systems; The CALIFORNLA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, Part 8 of
Title 24. 2013 Edition. published by ihe International Code Council and adopted by the
California Building Standards Commission; The CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING
CODE. Pari 10 of Title 24, 2013 Edition. published by the International Code Council
and the Cahifurnia Building Standards Commizsion: The CALIFORNIA ENERGY
COD¥. Part 6 of Titic 24, 2013 Edition, published by the Iniernational Code Council and
the California Building Standards Commission: the INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE. 2012 Edition. published by the Iniernationa! Code Council.™

Section 18-04.040 Building Official — Administrative authority of the Santa Rosa City Code
is amended to read as follows:

“The Chief Building (fficial is appointed and designated as the Director of
Building and Code Compliance. Chief Building Official. Building Official, Code Oificial
or Administrative Authority, as such terms are used and such positions are established in
the Santa Rosa City Code, California Adminisirative Code, California Building Code.
California Residential Code, California Fire Code. California Electrical Code. California
Mechanical Code, Czlifornia Plumbing Code, California Energy Code, International
Property Maintenance Code, California Green Building Standards Code, California
Historical Building Code, and the California Existing Building Code. The Assistant
Director of Community Development is charged with the enforcement of and given the
authority to administer all provisions o such codes and City regulations and requirements
adopted under the authority provided in Government Code Sections 38001(b) and
38660."

Section 18-04.065 Form of appeal — Filing, Subsection (A)(8) is added to the Santa Rosa
City Code to read as follows:

Building Oificial 1o Beard of Building Regulations Appeals in the amount fixed by
resolution of the Ciiy Council”

“Ry  Payment of (2e to iile an spplication w appeal a decision by the Chief

Seetion 18-04.080 Vielation—Tenain .

Ay persoh VIGIang i

Ko vidns) 14 ot S [ OB
adopied medel codos, a3 amenaed nn

Seciion 1-28.010 ol'this cotic



Seetion 2. The existing epealed or
amended by this ordinance are readopied and shall apply. as appiicable. to the made! codes
herein ..domu

welions of vhapia 1808, Permits aad Fees. il are not s

Scction J8-08.020 Single forms, Subsection (A of the Sania Rosg Cits Code is amended to
read as folluws:

“(A)  Fees for ihe issusnce of sueh permits shall be payable in the amouns fxed
[} 'L-'-wit-liol‘: of the City Councll. based on the valuation listed therein or on the cost
based fees In the amomus fixed by resoluion of the City Council. The fees shall be
charge I.m‘-‘-.*-n cted i the time of issuance of the permit, ™

Section 18-08.0450 Expiration of plan review of the Santn Rosa Ciey Code is amended o
read as follows:

A building permii appiic'uim uxd plan review shall expire 11 mqwmu is issued wihin
one veur of the date the .Lppliwm».. is ied. The construction plans and supponi
docwmenis submiited for review may thereafier 1c"umr_d w© mw applicant or desiroved
by the Buiiding Oificial. The Building © Vitjeial 1 s exwend the Gme for action by the
';plh ans for a period of 186 days upen welnen tequest by the applicant showing that
circumsiances bevond the full contal of the dnph\.a;nt have pM :nted any action irom
being wken. In the event that the appiicant is diligently pursuing permit issuance and
there h.\,u been nuupu;n-:s to the State of .*.I‘Iu\!‘nl“ auopt—‘.l hu ding codes or expiration
ol any oil wer applicable City required permuit sisnce the time of initial submital of the
building permit application, the Butiding Official may exiend the apy
aodiiionsd 186 & : Fees for exension of permit '&h“.lif;ﬁiv{!‘-’b and plan review shali be
in the awmounis fixed by resolution: of the Ciiv Council. In order 1o renew action on ai
apphicution afier expiradon. the applicant shall re upnl*' for the butlding pernm resubinit
construction plans and support documents and pay 2 new plan review fee”

Section3.  The existing sections of Chapter 18-12, buprovement Regnirements. that are not
repealed or amended by this ordinance are readopied and shall apply, as applicable, to the model

cades hereln adopted.

Scerion 4. The existing sections of Chapier 1816, California Building Code, that are not
led or amended by this ordinance are readopied and shall apply. as applicsble. 1o the mode!

ooy gy g b snt e
hereu "-ud,:\d..j

Section I8-16.01# Citations of seeiions of the Sunta Rosa Tty Code is amended 0 read as
tollows:

“Thus chapler »!" 11 e hnown as the .*5: uz* ia B.m‘“.:-... Code.” and mav be cited as

- 1. ihe Califo

a Vg nmembemnim]
e ierpational

l

Commission. and only App

and nerelo adopied oy

g No. 4015
%}J;_.\.'.’: O i'-'



before each section.”

Section 18-16.114.4  Violation penalties is amended to read as follows:

“California Building Code, Section 114.4 1 amended 1o read as follows:

Section 114.4 Violation penaltics. Any person violating any of the provisions of this
title, including, but noi limited 10, adopted mode! codes, gs amended in this e, shall be
subject to the penalty provisions of Section 1-28.010 of this cade™

Section 18-16.903.2 Where required is amended to read as follows:

“Caliturnia Building Code Section 903.2 paragraph number one is amended to read as tollows:
Section 903.2. Where Required. Approved zutomatic sprinkler svstems in new
buildings and struciures shall be provided in locations described in sections 903.2.1
through section 902.2.20. The most restrictive requirement shal! apply.”

Section 18-16.903.2.18 Exception is amended to read as follows:

“California Building Code Se¢ction 903.2.18 Exception is amended to read as follows:

Section 903.2.18 Exception.

1. Carports of nonconibustible construciion witi: non-habitable spaces above.
2. Additions and/or alterations not exceeding 30 percent of the existing square footage.”

Section 18-16.903.2.19 of the Santa Rosa City Code is deleted.
Section 18-16.903.2.20 Local fire sprinker requirements is added to read as follows:
“California Building Code Section 903.2.20 is added tu read as follows:
Section 903.2.20 Local fire sprinkler requirements.”
Section 18-16.9032.2.20.1 Automatic sprinkler system. is added to read us follows:
“Californiz Building Code Section 903.2.20.1 i added to read as follows:

Sepiion 903.2.20.0 An approved awomatic sprinkler system shall be instalied and
maintained i all newly constructed building

Aot boildinag e mrnycad e the Fi o Theetleils O et
A«:stc;;lm.:.;. buildings as anpmoves oy e Fire or Buitlding oahcia

Lxceptions:
1.

i).nz, el wond I'\ o iy ies 1000 <o B SInar arss srntbiin Ay Tamy ol ke naol =
CLaciida r Bl FIANLTS L; ko WU g Bk FLTIATA TR S vl S LTI I S w L R 1 L J A ]

n
limated 1o a single bathroom,

[«

Cred, Nz, $015

Py iz 3l
L’.;':-._'".‘. tof 1o



1
S

k¥

Deiached non-combusiibie motor vehicle fuel dispensing camopies classified as
Group M oceupaney,

Detached Growp U oteupancies 1000 squmre feet or loss,

A roein above o detached o ased for sjorage only that doss not conuin o
bathivom, cooking or relgersion zk:qm ,
Carpons of non-combustible consruction with nop-habiiible spaces ahove
B or M occupandies 300 sq. flor less.”

Section 15-16.903.2.20.2 Additivns, remodels, alicrations or repairs is added ta read as

follovs:

“Calilornia Building Code Secion

15 ol 0 10ad as oiows:

Sectivn 18-10.903.2.20.2 Additiens, Remndets, Alterations or Rupairs.

L

= 1]

“An auiomatic fire sprinkler svstem shall be provided inan o :s’ﬂ..rti:{"‘- OF W
Lamily dwelling when sdditions increase the avsa by 30% or more of the caicuisied
exisnng gross foor ares.

Arn automaiic five sprinkler svstem shall be v\rcwicird i ab existing non~residential
building when additions increass ilu arga H\ 3% or more calculaied by existing
gross oot arca.

Additions to existing Group K, Division 1 aecupancies that resuit in additional guest
rooms or dwellings uniis. the building shell meei the reguirenzents for a newly
(‘(mstt"l eted building.

Forremodels, alterations or re I"d.o o gn existing building involving dewolition.

o of the siructure {to include walis. colanms,
heams or givders, rh.»c'r or ceiling joists and coverings. reol mfiers, roof diaphragms.
foundations or similar compnnum-:f the building shall meer the requirements for »
rewly construction building. For die purpose of applying this seetions. the joliowing

TeHinw ‘." il r\.; ..uf ” nore k]]in& o

it
critesia shall be considered in the 30% threstiold evahiaton:
& Ibe removal or demolition of more than 50%: of the exterior or ierior

weight-bearing walis, Or.

b. Removal of theroof struciure.or ceiling thereby permitiing installation of
overhead piping, Oy

¢. Removal of interior ienant improvements reducing the building 1o a “shell”
condition shall require the fotare baild-out w um:_-gl}- with fire sprinkler
reguiremenis.

cay

l..\\.‘j WG ¢ \Iu, STH R RS .iu-

with the Amesi

.

5 CYii i) cRESyE | AT \ 1N
& Shall: CQBSTINNS 8 supstanual )

n .
sied 4 «i-. N peen -.m-:.»g.i.h. Ll
I»L WP GIY QD0 SPTRIT 4

tlhs srvives il o s || ryvaaei TE P II e e e T
HiC Ciiire t l‘,g,..ur.: Sl Ieel HIC TOQUITLELICH: 18

= ) 5



Section 18-16.903.2.26.3 Changes of occupancy is added to read as follows:
“California Building Code Section 903.2.20.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 903.2.20.3 Changes of Occupancy. When any change of occupancy
occurs where the proposed new occupancy classification is more hazardous; as
determined by the Building Code Official, including the conversion of residential
buildings to condominiums, the buiiding shali meet the fire sprinkler requiremenis
for a newly constructed building.”

Section 18-16.903.2.11.7 Design Criteria is added te read as follows:
“California Building Code Section 903.2.11.7 is added to read as follows:

Section 903.2.11.7 Design Criteria. Fire sprinkler systems installed in buildings of an
undetermined use shall be designed and installed to have a design density of .33 gallons
per minute per square foot over a minimum design area of 3000 square feet. Where a
subsequent occupancy change requires a sysiem with greater capacity. it shall be the
building owner’s responsibility to upgrade the system to the required density.”

Section 18-16.903.4.2 Alarms is amended to read as follows:
“California Building Code Section 903.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 903.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible and visible device shall be
connected to every automatic fire sprinkler system in an approved location. Such
sprinkler water flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow
of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a building
fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic fire sprinkler svstemn shall
actuate the building fire alarm system.

Every new commercial fire alarm system installed as a sprinkler system monitoring alarm
shall also provide notification for the purpose of initiating evacuation, including those
svstems activated solely by fire sprinkler sysiems, so that occupants of the building shall
be noitfied audibly and visually within each suite or building divisior. A minimum of one
notification appliance shall be located in each suite or building division in an occupied
location.”

Section 18-16.905.3.1 Execption 2 is amended {o read as follows:
~Caittornia Building Code Section 903.2.1, Exceprivn 2. §s amended to read as follows:
Section 905.3.1 Exception 2. Buildings thatare three or more siories in height.”

o

Section S, Phe existing sections of chapier 18-20, Property Mainrenance Code. that sre not

repealed or amended by this ordinance are readepted and shall apply, as applicable, 16 the miede!

Ord. Na, 40 S

Page ¢ of 1o



cades herein adopied.
Section 18-26.010 Citation of sections is amended to read as follows:
“This chapter shall be known as the “Property Mainienance Code,” und may be cited as such.

For purposes of citation. the I*n\.rn'"onm Prape ity Maintenance Code, 2012 Eduion, pubu.,h d
by the Inicm.,tuuml Code Counc ll adopied by reference and smiended by the City, is renumbered

PYs

by adding “18-200." befove each section.
Secrion 18-20.106.4 Violation penalties is amended to read us follows:
“lntemmaiional Property Maintenance Code Seetion 106 4 is amended to read a3 follows:
Section 106.4 Vielation penalties. Any person violating anv of the provisions of this
title, including, but not Hmiied 1¢, adopted model codes, 25 amended in this title. shall be
subiect tv the penalty provisions of Section 1-28.010 of this code.”
Section 6. The existing sections of chapter 18-22. California Residential Code, that aze not
repes aled or amended by this ordinance are readopted and shall apnly. as applicshle. to th; model
codes herein adopted.
Section 16-22.010 Citatien of sections is amended to read as follows:
“For purposes of citation, the California Residential Cede, Pare 2.5 of Title 24. 2612 Edition,
published b3 the Internaiional Code Council. as amendad by the California Building Siandards
Commission, and Appendix H. Patio Cavers, adopted by referenice and amended by the City, are
renumbered by adding <18-22." before each section.”
Lxisting Section 18-22.R313.1 of the Santa Kesa City Code is deleted.
Sectiom 18-22.R313.1 Section R313.1 Exception is added to read as follows:

“Califoruie Residenidal Code Section R313.1 Exceplion is delewd.”

Section 18-22.R313.2 Section R312.2 Exception is added to read as follows:

:,( Y
ant

ornia Resideniial Cade Section R313.2 Excepiion is deleted.”
Secrion 18-22.RI13.2.2 Seetton R313.2,7 is added to read as foliows:
California Residential Code Section B313.2.2 is added 1o read as follows:
Section B313.2.2 A"‘G’.iiéirjl‘r's. Remodels. Alterations ov }‘l‘cg‘ airs,

5 Ao myTErTr - L 4
E. A P b iaiss ;'fn. \i Y :-.,.‘3 =0 "s.;.. \ﬂ ‘ L

-y
i
tise i
i ar

oY L.u;"" IL AL ENISUEL 060 27 G-

ea by 30% or more of the caleulated




E-)

An automaiic fire sprinkler system shali be presvided 1a an existing non-residential
building when additions increase the area by 25% or more calculared by exisiing
eross floor area.
Additions te existing Group R Division 1 occupancies that result in additional guest
rooms or dwellings units, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly
constructed building.
4. For remodels, alterations or repairs to an existing building involving demolition.
removal or repair of more ithan 50% of the structurs (to include walls. columns,
beams or girders, floor or ceiling joists and coverings, roof rafters, roof diaphragms,
foundations or similar components). the building shall meet the requirements for a
newly construction building. For the purpose of applying this seciions, the following
criteria shall be considered in the 50%0 threshold evaluation:
a. The removal or demolition of more than 50% of the exterior or interior weight-
bearing walls. Or.
b. Removal of the roof structure or ceiling thereby permitting installation of
overhead piping. Or,
¢. Removal of interior tenant imprevements reducing the bulding to a “shell”
condition shall require the future build-out to comply with fire sprinkler
requirements.
i. Exception: Alterations or additicns made solely for the purpose of
complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act.
The percentage of work shall be determined and added tv any successive remodels
that may occur within a subsequent three (3) year period. If the combined percentage
totals 50% or more, this work shall constitute a substantial improvement and the
building shall be subject to the fire sprinkler requirement.
6. Any combination of items above where the improvements equals or exceeds fifty
percent (509) of the structure, the entire building shall meet the requirements for a
newly constructed building.”

L8]

Y4

Section 18-22.R908 of the Santa Rosa City Code is deleted.

Section 7. The existing sections of Chapter 18-24, California Plumbing Code, that are not
repealed or amended by this ordinance are readopied and shall apply. as applicable, to the madel
codes herein adopted.

Section 18-24.010 Citation of sections is amended to read as follows:

“This Chapter shail be knows us the “California Plumbing Code.” and may be ciied as such. For
rurposes of citaiion. the Califomia Plumbing Code, Part 5 of Title 24, 2013 Edition. published
by the International Association ¢f Plumbiag and dMechanical Ofiicials including LTAPNO)
Insiallation Standards. and Appendix A, Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Suppiy
System: Appendix B. Explanatery Notes-on Conibination Wasie aad Vent Svsiems: Chapter D,
Sizing Starm W arer Drainage Systems: Appendix I Installation Standards. s amended by the
California Building Standards Commission. adopted by reference and amended by the Cire. are
enumbered by adding <18-24.7 before sach seciion.”

Ord. Mo 4015
Page 8o 1y



Section 18-24.102.3 Boar¢ of appeals is amended to read as follows:
“California Plumbing Code Scetion 102.3. Board of Appeuls. is amended to read as follows:
Seetion 162.3 The Beard oi Building Regulation Appeals, established in Scction 13-
04.050 of the Sania Rosa ( ity Code. shall kear and determine any sppeal ansing i'rnm an
action or detennination made by the huilding official relative 1o the ."“ﬂlt.xtiul an
interpreiation of this code. Em.tmn 18-04.060 of the Ci ity Code shall nppl‘ 16 the Board™s

determination. All appeals shali be filed in accordance with the requirements snd within
the time period set {orth in Scetion 18-64.065 of the Santa Rosa City Code.”

Seciion 18-24.102.3.2 of the Suniu Resu Ciiy Code is delete

Section 18-24,102.5 is amended to read as follows:

“California Plumbing Code Section 102.3 is amended io read as foliows:
Section 102.5 Pemalties. Any person viclaiing any of the provisions of this code,
including but noi limited ic adopied model co¢ des. as amended in this utie, shall be
subiecrt the peualiy provisicns of Section 1-28.010 of the Santa Rosa City Code ™

Section 18-24.103.1.1 Work Exempt from Permit is amended by adding new subsection (3):

“California Plumbing Code Seetion 103,114z amended by adding subsecton (3);
Section 103. i.l(’i; The replacement nf lm atory and sink faucers, shower heads, water
closets, or urinals that comply with or exceed the water conservation pregram
requiremants of the Ciiy of Santa Rosa [ uhm 5 Department or criteria set forth in
California Code of Regulations Title 20, Chapter 2. and Health and Safeiv Code Section
17921.3. This provision applies only to installations that do not requize the
rearrangement of valves. pipes or fixtures.”

Section 18-24.103.1.2 of the Santa Rosa City Codeis deleted.

Sectiom 18-24.103.3.3 Expiration is amended to read as follows:
“Califomia Plumbing Coede Section 103,33 §s smended to read as follows:
Seetion 102.3.3 Expiration. Cxpiration of 1 sied permit shall be determined as set forth

) P

IliA s\-l‘ 1\('\L\\l"1 -l. ) a..-uA\\. i L ‘ (‘t’v
Seciion 13-24.103.3.4 of the Sania Rosa Ciry Coide is deleied.
Sections 18-24163.41, 103 4.2, and 193,43 of the Santa Rosa City Caode are deletad.

Seption 15-24.102.4 Fees is amendad 10 vead as follvws:




~California Plumbing Code Section 103.4 is amended i read as foilows:

Section 103.4 Fees. Fees shall be deiermined as set forth in Section 18-08.130 of the
Santa Resa Ciwy Code.”

Section 18-24.103.4.1 Plan Review Fees is amended to read as fellows:
“California Plumbing Code Section 103.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 103.4.1 Plan review fees. Focs shall be determined as set forth in Section 18-
08.130 of the Santa Rosa City Code.”

Section 18-24.103.4.2 Expiration of Plan Review is amended to read as follows:

“California Plumbing Code Section 103.4.2 is amended to read as follows:
Section 103.4.2 Expiration of plan review. Expiration of permit application and plan
review shall be determined as set forth in Section 18-08.050 of the Santa Rosa City
Code.”

Section 18-24.103.4.3.1 Investigative I'ees is amended to read as follows:

“California Plumbing Code Section 103.4.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 103.4.3.1 Investigation fees. Fees shall be determined as set forth in Section
18-08.130 of ihe Santa Rosa City Code.”

Section 18-24.304.0 Connections to plumbing system required is amended by adding new
subsection to read as follows:

Section 18-24.304.2 Section 304.2 is added to read as follows:
“(alifornia Plumbing Code Section 304.2 is added 10 read as follows:
Seciion 304.2 Sewers required. Every building in which plumibing fixtures are installed

shall have a connection to a public sewer or an approved private sewags disposal system
or i ap approved grey waier disposal sysiem.”

Section 6, The exisiing secticis of Chapier 18232, Calitornia Elecyical Code, tnat ziv nol
tepealed or amended by this ordinance are readopted and shall apply. as applicable, 1o the modei
codes horein adopied.

Section 18-32.010 Cisation of sections 1= amended 1o read as follows:

Ord, ™o, 2013

Ps.i‘;.:;'.i“‘ 10ar s



“This Chapier shall be known as the “Califomia Elecirical Code.” and may be ciied as such. For
PUTPOSES oY chiation. dx. California Elecrrical Code, Pan 5 of Tide 24, 2013 Edition. peblished
by the \".um";.; Fire Prosection Associntion and amended by the Califomiz Building Standards
Commizsion. including {ables. and Annec H. Adminisiratio " and Enforcement: thereto adopled

by reference and amended by tie Ciry. is repumber 'Ef ~adding ~18-32" belre each section

e

Section 153280111 4.7 Pealties is added to vead as Tollows:

“Cahiorain Fleetrical Code Ardcle 89,111 4.7 15 added o read as lollows:

Article 89.111.4.7 Penalties. Ay person violating avv of ¢ proy isions of this code.
including but nog Hmied 1o adopied model codes. as amendc\‘ in s tie, shatl be
subjest o tie penaliy provisions of Section 1-28.010 of the S;lel;ll\a:.xrazk("%i:- Code”

(.

-

s of Chapier 18-33, Califernia Energy Code, that are niot

Hilow W 1-\...!*::upt-;u S SR URDIY. B8 ¢ ulL h". o the modsl

Section Y, The existing sectio
iv\-LLJ oy ancnded | 3 this ordi
Ludn herein adopted.

2%

Sectien 18-32.010 Crtation of sections i amended 1o read a5 follows:

“This clmpicr shall be known as the “California Energy Code,” and mav be chied as such. For’
purposes of ciiaton, the Calitornia Enerey Code. Pari 9 of Title 24, 2013 Edidon. published b
the Internatiopal Code Council. Ine, and the Califomis Building Siandards Commission.
including whles and appeiv reto adopied by reference by the Cliy, are renumberad by

R T . B L Ty s W
adding ~18-22 beiore each sectinn,

o8 g

Qccxiu l 'I'h-.. existing secticns of Chapier 18-36, California Mechanical Code. that are not
epeaked nended by this ardinance are -;u;z;inpi;:d and shall appiv. us appiicable. w the model
ciades hrz‘s,;; dopted.

Section 18-36.010 Citation of scetions is amended to read as fallows:
e known as the “California Mechanical Code.” and may be cited s such.

tion. lnv(::hinr » Mechanical Code. Pari 4 of Tide 24, 2013 Fdiiion.
toiz & Phamibing and Mechanica Ui_m = a1

TOWE &by A0 irn
2INe easn sechion.

Secilsn 18-30.100.1 Board of Appeal s ameaded e read as follon s:

Calttormnm Mechanical Code Section 108, ], Board ¢! S DRSO s amended o read as 1oligws;

A el Say K egne -
IF qmc.;h_. estiudished i Sdection -

e
Loag 0y AT 1T .
i hear and u-.-....dﬂt. any appeal arisiag from an

= G $TY¢ o
(. b s.; \'-- . *i'!' 1
Page 11 of 16



action or determination made by the buliding official relative to e appiication and
inierpretution of this code. Section 18-04.060 of the Ciny Code shall apply w the Board's
determination. Al appeals shall be filed in accordance with ke requiremenis and within
the time period se: forth in Section 18-04.003 of the Santa Resa City Code.”

Section 18-36.110 of the Santa Rosa City Code is deleted.

Section 18-36.110.1 California Mechanical Code, Subsection 110.1 is amended to read as
follows:

“Califcrnia Mechanical Code Section 170.1 is amended to read as follows:
Section 110.1 Penalties. Am person violating anv of the provisions of this code
including but not limiied to adopied medel codes, as amended in this title. shall be
subject to the penaliy provisions of Section 1-28.010 of the Santa Rosa Ciiy Code.”
Section 18-36.113.4 iIxpiration is amended to read as follows:

“Californiz Mechanical Code Section 113.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 113.4 Expiration of issued permit shall be determined as sei forth in Section 1&-
08.060 of the Sama Rosa Ciiy Code.™

Section 18-36.114.0is amended to read as follows:

“California Mechanical Code Section 114.0 is amended to read as follows:

Section 114.0 Fees shall be determined as set forth in Section 18-08.130 of this code.”
Section 18-36.114.2 Permit Fees.
“California Mechanical Code Section 114.2 s deleted”
Existing Section 18-36.114.4 of the Santa Rosa City Code is deleted.
Section 13-36.114.4Expiratien of plin review is amended to read as follows:

“Cualitorniz Mechanical Code Section | 144 is amended to read as follows

Pan set frth in

Section 114.4 Expimmion of plan review permi shiall be deter

Seciion 18-08.050 of ihe Swnia Rosa City Cede”
Seetion 18-36.11-4.5.1 Investigation fee is amended to read as follows:

“Calitsmia Mechanical Code Seordon 114.5.7 i amended 1o read as ohows:



seetion 11431 Investigation fees shali be determined as set forth in Section 18-08.170
of the Sania loss Oty Code”

mection 18-36.115 of the Sania Rosa City Code is deleted.

Seetien 15-36.115.4 of the Santa Rosa City Code s deldeied,

Section 11 The existing sections of Chaper 18-40, Fyasting Buiiding Code. that are not

repealed or amended by this ordinance are readopted and s ;.zil appiy, as applicabie, 1o the model
codes herein adopted,

Seetion 18-40.010 Citation of sectivns is amended 1o read as folivws:

“This Chapier shall be knovwn as thc “Califorma Exisney Buoilding c;dc." :-md I
suchi, For purposes of chmtion. the California Bvising Buit ding ©

Edition. including Appendix Chapier AT, Referenced Stzadards. and / '\*‘xpmdv.\ Cc ha}‘lc..l A3,
published by tip I*ucrnatiu:m‘ Code Council mud the Calitornie Building

a8 }’ lh f R B A 731.. ‘ '"‘ a1 m“"; '1d iTe i ....EZ'::'!' i i1 ...»-.s i 1 i' u-&; T”‘- l».‘w-n.-,u-.-, ‘l-\- ;3‘.».
Ciaty, are 1o numb.md l“ sdn:m “lu--lu before sach secuion,”

J
Seetion 12 The existing sections of Chapier 18242, Californin Green Buildive Standards

1 - - - -y s Tyeese 3 o pe I "0
Code. that are nat repealted or amended by this ordinance ave readopied and shall apph, as

o Heahia jmthe s A TR SO Tpyd etrt
APBICAC. WO T model codes hereln »ixivp;.‘u.

Seetion 15-42.810 Citation of sectious is amended 16 read as follows:

“ihis Chaprer shu‘ be Ko a5 the *Cal ii'or' ta Green Building Swandards Code” and may be
cited as such. For purposes of ciwation. the Calitornid Green Building Standurds Code. Part 11 of
Titie 24, 2013 Edition. published by the (‘ aliforia Building Standards Commission. including
Appendi\ Chapter A4, Sections A4.1; A4.3,. Am 4 A4 ¥ and A6 Residential V olunt.u‘
Mensures o Tier | level for pew structires and | A

AS.4: ASS and ASG, Nonresidensial Ve '*"t“li.;:."‘_'- wieaswresw Tiey [ level for new struciures ondy.
are ”LJ'"FL-:‘;{ byvrelerence uau w-lm,i\.u by the City of Santa Pns,; and are verunbered by adding
. ‘ “"’f "3 52 1.' ). "!..' . _‘" % .

"."':ﬁ"""".-.s’l' A% Sections

e ndd

Seetiop 13, The existing sections of Chapter 18-48, Keview and abatament of Existing
Butidines. that are not repealed or amended by this ordinance are readopeed and shall apply

applicable. to the mode codes herein adopied

Section I8-48.050 subseotions (A and (B) of the Santa Rosa Ciiy Code ave gmended to read
us followss

2-Chapter 24 Existing Structures;



{8) 2013 California Historical Building Code Tie 24, Part 827

Section 14.  The existing sections of Chapter 18-64. Historical or Architeciurally Significant
Buildings, that are not repealed or amended by this ordinance are readopted and shall apply, as
applicable, to the model codes herein adopted.

Section 18-64.010 of the Santa Rosa City Codg, Purpose - is amended to read as follows:

“Purpose.  In-order tv maintain the historical and architectural integrity of buildings
designared as historical or architecturally significant buildings within the community
consistent with objectives of the urban design element of the General Plan. it is necessary
to provide necessary code alternatives of rehabilitaiion and restoration of such buildings.
Such alternative building regulations are intended to facilitate the restoration or changes
of occupancy so as to preserve the original or restored architectural clements and -
features. to provide a cost-effective approach to the preservation of historical or
architecturally significant buildings and to provide for the safety of the building
occuparits consistent with the Title 24, Part 8, of the 2013 California Historicul Building
Code:”

Section 16.  Findings of Fact, The Council finds that the siandards for buildings within
the City of Sania Rosa should comply with the CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE,
2013 Edition; CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2013 Edition; CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE, 2013 Ediuon; the CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, 2013 Edition; the
CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 2013 Edition; the CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE, 2013 Edition; the CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2013 Edition; the
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE. 2013 Edition; the CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE.
2013 Edition; the CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2013 Edition: all
as amended and adopted bv the Staie of Cahifornia and further amended by this Ordinance; the
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. 2012 Edition, as further amended
by this Ordinance. Based on materials presented by the Chief Building Official of the City of
Santa Rosa, the Council finds that it is necessary to make procedural and administrative
modifications and changes to the model codes as amended and adopted by the State of California
and specifically adopted and amended in this Ordinance. Such standards are needed for efficient,
cconomical, and expeditious enforcement of the Buildings and Construction of the Santa Rosa
City Code, Chapter 18. The Council further finds and determines, based on the materials and
repoits presemed. that the subsiantive amendments to the model codes. which are identified by
and adopted in this Ordinance, are hereby deterniined to be reasonably necessary because of
local climzatic, geological or topegraphicai conditions zud deo not lessen, diminisk or changs the
standards set forth within the mode! codes except as authorized by law. 17 any non-
administiatlve or non-procedural model code provisien or apphicablc Staic.of Caltivimia
amendment is in conflict with this ordinance, it is the intert of this ordinance 1o amend or delete
such provision when findings of local conditions are statad as requived by sections 17838.F and

-

17928.7 of the Hezlth and Safers Code

Satd local coadivons are:

Cird. Mo, 013

Page 14 8716



A Farthguake hazard:

s pasoclated s

: ishurg-Rodgers (.:-.}. Faalt and aiber
Jocalized carbquake faulis In close proximiny of  densaly populated urban area.
B. History of heavy winter rains and poorly dy

many locallons.,

d soiis including expansive adobe soils

C. High proundwaier tables and unconsalidnied

(B Heavy accumulations of demmable plant materdal covering many arens. periodic high
winds and an extended dry season

k. The propensiry of loeal strarna 1w flood due w periods of intense rainiall.
I, Sama Rosa is '1’11;‘1 ind cify that dl.;a:'.:m'u*-'- reated reclaimed water in thees wavs: W

urban and ze: u!mr'-'l ms;mtwr W e immu River ua m; certain period of the vewr at

araic “x‘“ \\.i Q 9\. x,H(“v‘ {'I J-.-. FER UG 1 ‘I 1 L(.;l]l‘\u wihs

Ireererimal Deld.

grevn house gas u.,;luctm i, The consimiction of new

5 oy chmae control.

(. Sanie Rosg has eswablished goals for

structures has o direet bopact on g

Such loeal conditons apply to Tocal smendments md medifications w de State of California
adopted madal eodes as indicated below:

SRCC 18-i802.2 B
SRCC 18-20. B,
SROC 18-22R:A: A.D
SRCC 18-24,1073 E
SRCC 18-42 G
;R: L ]«“*i\: A

Section 17, Enviromnental Review, "..»(numxlu leniines that this ordinance
s procedures for isauing 'ucv:“n P \UH.. .m;l iherefore, r< T ~'m' e 1o the

substantial adverse ¢l yiment.

Sesiiont 1. Dunv. Notwithsts 4\1.:-.-_ any proviston contained in Tile {8 of the Santa Rosa

o~ (el = _pee L | vl s fryrramyant af o
ity Code, whenever the words i MLISE the enforcement of . o1

words of simila rs 10 establish a responsibility u'.‘i‘]: City of Santa

Rosa, or of the members of any board. commission, deparument. officers of the City, including.

P o irena il
e used in said

but not fimited io the Council and City Planning Commission :1:-:;1‘;:: or of any officer. official,

‘.\_ !‘ ,,i I"\l“. ’.?'(_’!. ::‘

Pace 13 i 16



or employee of the City of Santa Rosa, it is the legislative intent that such words shall establish a
discretionary authority or power requiring the exercise of judgment and discretion, as
distinguished from a mandatory duty. No mandatory duty is imposed upon any member of the
Council, or upon any board or commission of the City of Santa Rosa. or upon any department,
officer, official, or employee of the City of Santa Rosa by the provisions of said chapters, and
said chapters shall not be construed so as to hold the City of Santa Rosa or any member of the
Council or of any board, commission, or department of the City. or any officer. official or
employee of the City of Santa Rosa responsible or liable for any damage to persons or property
by reason of any action taken or by reason of any approval given or not given, under the

provisions of said chapters or in connection with any such members, officers, or employees

duties set forth in said chapters.

Section 19.  Severabilitv. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this
ordinance is for any reason held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
remaining portions of this ordinance. The Council declares that it would have passed this
ordinance and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any
one or more sections, subsections, clauses or phrases be declared unconstittional.

Section 20.  Effective Date, This ordinance shall take effect on January 3, 2014, upon
passage by the Council and publication pursuant to Section 8 of the Santa Rosa City Charter.

The existing non-administrative or non-procedural provisions of this Title shall remain in effect
as applicable to specific permit applications as of the date of submittal for plan review when such
date of submittal is prior to the effective date of thisordinance. For purposes of this section, the
date of submittal for master planned projects shall be the date of submittal for plot plan review,

IN COUNCIL DULY PASSED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

AYES: (6) Mayor Bartley. Vice Mayor Swinth, Council Members Combs, Olivares,
Ours, Wysocky

NOES: ®
ABSENT: (1) Council Member Carlstrom
ABSTAIN: (O)

ATT}:ST‘__, :}-' g g w10 / A e 45 AP ROVED i ) T .lc»y ,,-.,_\
‘Deputv City Clerk /2/ez/ 20 Mm or )

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true

APPROVED AS TO FORM: and correct copy of a meselutienfordinance
¥ N P . duly and regularly adopted by the Council of
( emesdons X, -y the City of Sa Eta Rosa ata reguia%eetmg

th eof hel

City Attorney ~—"

Date .ﬁ_’_mj_

RRI GRIFFIN, ity Clerk

City of Santa
Ord. No. 4015
Page 16 of 16



ORDINANCE NO. 4010

ORDINANCE OF THE CTI'Y OF SANTA ROSA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2013
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA DO ENACT AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Subsection (B) of Scction 18-04.015 of the Santa Kosa Ciiy Code is amended
to read as follows:

“(B) There is hereby adopted by reference the 2013 Edition of the California Fire Code including
Appendices 4. B.C.DL E F, G H. 1L jand K.

Scetion 2. All the existing sections of Chapter 18-44 of the Santa Rosa City Code are
repealed and a new Chapter 15-44 entitled “California Fire Code™ is added as follows:

“Chapter 18-44
CALIFGRXKIA FIRE CODE
Section 18-44.101.1 Title.

Cualifornia Fire Code Chapier 1 Divigion Il Administration, Section 101.1 is amended to read as
follows:

Scction 18-44.101.1 Title. This chapter shall be known as the =213 California Fire
Code,” and may be cited and refeired te as such. For purposes of citation. the sections of
the “2013 California Fire Cade”, including the appendices identified in Section 18-
04.015(B) of il:is code, are renumbered b adding 18-44 before each section of the
California Fire Cade (e.g.. Sections 101.1 and 50¢1.1 of the California Fire Code shall b
cited respectiveiy as Sections 18-44.101.1 and 18-44.5001.1 of this code).

Section 18-44.103.1.1 Bureau of Fire Prevention.

California Fire Code Chapter I Division I Administration Section 103.1.1 s added to read as
follows:

Section 15-44.103.1.1 Bureau of Fire I'vevention., Wi iiis code refers io the
Department of Fire Prevention. the Bureau of Five Pr

cade refers o the Fire Code O sshal will be tnsered.

21t s s -.-l‘(“l e, gt 5
0wl be ipseried. Whers this

13-44.103.2 Appointiurent.

California Fire Code Chapier | Division 1 Adminisrration. Section 103.7 iz amended to read as

" 1 11 -
fellows;

Ord, No, 4014



Section 18-44.103.2 Appoinimeni. The fire code cificial shisll be appoinied by the chiel
appointing authority of the jurisdiction.

18-44.104.3.2 Inspection access.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division II Administration, Section 104.3.2 is added to read as
follows:

Section 18-44.104.3.2 Inspection Access.

1. The Chief or authurized representative, in the performance of the duties herein
prescribed, shall have the right to enter upon and into any and all premises under his
jurisdiction, at all reasonable hours for the purpose of inspecting the same to determine
whether or not the provisions of this code and of all other applicable laws or ordinances
pertaining to the protection of persons and property from fire and explosions are observed
therein; provided. however, that an inspection warrant. issued pursuant to Title 13, Part 3
of the Code of Civil Procedure be first secured where entry is refused. excepr in an
emergency situation.

2. The owner, lessee, manager or operator of any such building or premises shall permit
the Chiet or authorized representatives to enter and inspect them at the time and for the
purpose stated in this section. Failure to permit such entry when an inspection warrant is
not required shall constitute a misdemeanor.

3. The Chief or duly authorized represeniative shall have tiie authority to enter any
building or premises for the purposes of extinguishing or controlling any fire. performing
any rescue operation. investigating the existence of suspected or reported fires, gas leaks,
or other hazardous conditions or taking any other action necessary in the reasonable
performance of their duty.

18-44,105.1.4 New materials and permits.

California Fire Code Chapicer 1 Division I1 Administration. Section 103.1.4 is added to read az
follows:

Section 18-44.105.1.4 New Materials and Permits. The Chief and the Fire Marshal may
act as a commiitiee to determine and speciiv any new regulated nrawerialz, and shall
establish processes or becupancies requiring permits in addition to these enumerated in
this code. The Chief or designee shall post such [ist in a conspicueus place in the oflice
and distribute copies thereof 1o imerested persons. Permiits under ihiz section shail be
administered in accordance with Secuon 163,

18-44.105.6.8 Permit amounts for compressed gasses.

Czliforniz Fire Code Chapter 1 Division I Adminisiration. Table 10568 §s smended e read as

JOLOWS,

Ora. Mo, 4dia

Page 7 of 2]



Table: 105.6.8

o Permit Ameunts for Compressed Gases
;FTI vpe of Gas i Amount
| {cubic feet at NTP) |
| Corrosive _ 1 Any Amount -‘;
i Tlarmable  Any Amount S !
i Highly toxic Ay Amount |
| Inert and simple asnh\'\i.m; | 600
i O idizing (including Oxvgen) - Any Amourni
! P}-rophom, TAny Amount ]
{ Toxde . Any Amount |

18-44.105.6.10 Permit amounts for cryogenic fluids.

Califomiz Fire Code Chapier 1 Division 1] Administeation, Table 105.6.10 is amended 1o read as
full WS

Tablc 105.6.10
Permit Amounts for Cryogenic Fiuids

; Tyvpe . tInside | Qutside !
| Building | Buildings |

| (gallons) : {gallons}
i Flamimable P Ain Any .
Amount ¢ Amount |
Oxidizer (inclndes Oxygen) | Any I 10 I
|

i

11

i Amount !
: Corrosive -~ L Any .
i Amount ! !
| Highly waxic CAny Ary l

l

o

b

i Amount | Amoum
g Nonflammable | Anv d
C Amount

ft "

18-44,105.6.16.12 Transfer of ownership.

Cadiforma Fire Code Chapter | Division I Admmistrasion. Sectdon 103.6.16.17 is added 10 read

v tofows:

pasfer of Osvaersh n A0 Opard ] { 3na O
4‘![ nderground Shr.w Tonk (UST) fucili 1y, P*r:.]

O Lomp r CHON G

1044105620 Fermii amounts fur hazardens auterials,

T e e .y T TR & 2N e Brrerie s ~
].‘. Vimali 11 L’luu SITAN00. 180 13 i '.\.:‘..L(_ 1S amanddad 10 rey -.] as




iullows:

‘Tabte 105.6.20

Permit Amounts for Hazardous Materials

?l"u{pe of Material

Amount

!
H
$

Combustible liguids
Corrosive materials
Gases
Liquids
Solids
Explosive materials
Flammabie materials
Gases
Liquids
Solids

| Highly toxic materials

L

Gases
Liguds
Solids -

- Oxidizing materials

(ases
Liquids
Class 4
Class 3
Clazs 2
Class 1
Solids
Class 4
Class 3
Class 2
Class 1
Organic peroxides
Liquids
Class 1
Class IT
Class I
Clase IV
Clas: V

Chass= Ii
Class 1
Class TV
Class W

Pyropaoric malerias

25 gallons

Any Amount
Any Amount
Any Amount
See Section 165.6.14

See Seciion 105.6.8

See Section 105.6.16
100 Pounds

o

See Section 1036,
Any Amount
Amy Amount

See-Section 103.6.8

Any Amount
Anv Amount
1 gallon
1 gallon

Any Amount
5 pounds

10 puunds
100 nounds

Any Amouni
Any Amouiit
1 gallow

b JEP |

e
a~ S
s

25 gallens

Ay Aaneunt
H) poands
e pounds

RS ot uns

Oed, ]

kais &%

L4016

Paes 4 pf 22



Te

Li

W

(WHE
Liguids
Solids

yie mmeriais
{aases
Laquids
Solids

quids

Clasy
Clasz

Ve

\.. ARADLT

Class
Salids

41\ reactive m
& i’;;u;i: by

1

RN M"

LY PP |
Class 2

(:L.' :

(!’ﬁ'--

-y

=

]

" r
Aa83s 3

Ci.‘l?.\ 2
3]

Clas

‘n‘«;mblc x\r{:aa.:'.i‘v.. ) materials

Aount
Amouni

AR
A0y

See »z.;ctmr

ount
Amount

Anv Am
Any
i galion
5 galions
Ay Aanouni
ABY Arsound

Amount

A
10 pounds
20 pounds

e

165,68

18-44.105.0.20.1 Hazardous materials siorage range.

Calitomug Fir

Tollows:

Soklds in Pounds

¢ Code

Table 105.6.20.1 Hazardous Materials Permit Ranges.
HAZARDOUS MATERIALS STORAGE RANGE
Compressed Gas
10w Fuat ST

Up 1o 500

h

Liguds in Gailens

e Chapter 1 Divis

1T A

dmi

PR "
IRRY; i
or greaic

3007 1

w, .\!;":‘:l,xr ‘q;—i‘ii";‘ !{. " ,; "h ] !\ ‘!JJ_"’(

10 204
H _2 J

RRIXLY

200010 o 30,001

SEUNRIRIY]

1 i
.),I.llll { L‘ _-l_‘“r\)z

read a8

Duaraiion

Anne

Anrnal

BRI

Annugl

1G16
oF 1Y
| e



18-44.105.6.48 Apartment, hotel, or motel.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division I Administiation. Section 1u5.6.48 is added to reud as
follows:

Section 18-44.105.6.48 Apartment, hotel, or motel. An operational permit is required to
operate an apartment house, hotel or moiel

18-44.105.6.49 Bowling pin or alley refinishing,.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division 1l Administration, Section 105.6.49 is added to read as
follows:

Section 18-44.105.6.49 Bowling Pin or Alley Refinishing. An operational permit is
required to operate a Bowling Pin or Alley Refinishing operation.

18-44.105.6.50 Bonfires or rubbish fires.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division 1l Administraticn, Section 103.6.50 is added to read as
follows:

Section 18-44.105.6.50 Bonfires or rubbish fires. An operational permit is requirzd to
kindle or authorize the kindling or maintenance of bonfires or rubbish fires.

18-44.105.6.51 Day care.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division 11 Administration. Section 105.6.51 is added to read as
follows:

Section 18-44.105.6.51 Day care. An operational permit is required to operate a day care
occupancy with an occupant load in excess of eight (3) persons.

18-44.105.6.52 High rise occupancy.

California Fire Code Chapier 1 Division II Administration. Section 103.6.52 is added to read as
follows:

Secrion 18-44.103.6.32 High rise occupancy. Axn eperational permis is required w
operate 2 high rise building as defined in Title 24, Part 2, California Code of Regulations.

16-44.103.6.53 Kesideniiai and commercial insiitutional care occupancy.

Caittornia Fire Code Chapter 1 Divisien i1 Adminizration, Secden 195,653 is added to read as

followva:

Seetivn 18-44.105.6.53 Resideniial and Commercial Institutiona! Cure Geeupancy.

Ord. No. 4814

Pacc oot 22



Ap operatienal periit is required o operaie a residential oy conunercial instiuional carc
occupancy. Occupancies complying with Health and Safetv Code Section 13235 are
esenIpL

13-44.105.6.54 Instirutional oceupancy/residential cave/day care pre-licensure inspection.

Calitornia Fire Code Chapter 1 Divisien H Administration, Section 105.6.54 iz added 1o read as
.Ml(?n&.

Seciion 18-44.105.6.54 Institutional occupancy/residential care/day eare: pre-
licensure mspcctmn. A fee shall be required for & Pre-Licensure Inspection in

3 S
ded ijua. oy W 11‘1 11\.()! ;h JI:\; i b

\.’L‘ Code Section 13235,
18-44.105.6.55 Model rockets rental, sale or operation.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division II Adminisiration. Seetion 105.6.55 is added 10 read as
faliows:

Section 18-44.105.6.55 hiode! rockets rental, sale or epcration. \n operationa permi

is required 1 opersie. manufacture. import. export. passess. store. rent or sefl rodel
rockets as deiined by Health and Safeiv Code Section 12310,

18-44.105.6.56 Live cntertainment.

Californiz Five Code Chepter 1 Division [I Adminisiration. Section 103.6.36 15 added o resd a:
follows:

Section 18-44.105.6.56 Live Entertainment. An operational permii is required to
operaic a business providing live enweriainment w e public

18-44.105.6.57 Emergency responder radio system.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Divisien 1l Administration. Section 105.6.57 is added to read as
fullows;

Section 18-14.105.6.57 Lmurﬂ""am Responder Radio Svstern. An operational perinii is

required 1 operate ap Emergency Responder Radio Svatem.

1
=

California Fire Code Chaptzr 1 Division T Adininisiadon. Section 108 35 amended 10 y=ad a:

Seetion 15-44.108 Board of Appeals.

15-44.1058.1 W1 bemwer the Fire Marsh:
e ’-*]"“z'; i for, the a;
Firo 32

Fire Marshal o tl




Chiel may be appeaied o the Bowd of Buiiding Regulation Appeals and shali be
appealed within fifteen (151 days o the decision. The decision of the Board of Building
Regulution Appeals shall be a finai decision exhausting the adminisurative remedies of
the appellunt notwithstanding Sanwa Rosu City Code Section 1-20.011:. Appeals shall
comply with procedures speciiied in Santsz Rosa City Code Section 18-04.050 et. seq.

18-44.109.4 Abatement of violation and penalries.

California Fire Code Chapier 1 Division 11 Administration, Sectien 109.4 is amended to read as
follows:

Seetion 18-44.109.4 Abatement of violaiion and penalties. Any persen opuraiing or
maintaining any occupancy. premises, or vehicle subject io this code or any person who
shall permit anv viclation of this code, fire and life safetv provisions of the California
Building Cude, any firc hazard 1o exist on premises under his control or who shall fail 1o
take immediate action to abute & fire hazard when ordered or notified to do so by the
Chief or the Chifef s duly authorized representative, shall be subject o the penalty
provisions of Secton 1-28.010, of the Sania Resa City Code or state law. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been given shall be deemed a separate eifense.

18-44.109.5 Authority to issue citations.

California Fire Code Chapter 1 Division Il Administration, Section 109.5 is added to read as
follows:

Section 18-44.109.5 Authority to issue citations. The Chief and members of the Fire
Prevention Burcau whe have the discretionary duty to enforce a siatute or ordinancs may,
pursuant io Section 836.5 of'the California Penal Code and subject to the provisions
thereof, arrest a person without a warrant whenever the Chief or member of the Fire
Prevention Bureau has reasonable cause to believe that the person to be arrested has
committed a violation in the presence of the Chief or member of the Fire Prevention
Bureau which he or she has discretionary duty to enforce. and to issue a notice 1o appear
and to release such person on his or her written promise 10 appRar in COUTT, PUrSUaN i
the provisions of Section 833.5 et seq. of the California Penal Code.

18-44.111.4 Failure to comply.

Cailivrsin Fire Code Chupter 1 Division 11 Administration. Secton 1114 15 aniended 1o read as
foliows:

Section §5-44.11 14 Failure to comply. Aa person who shali cominue any work alier
hirving been served with @ stop work order. except such work as that person is divected o

- y B A T D e AR L s AR e s s L i 3 ’
perform to remove 2 violetion or uesale condition. shall be subject 1o e pe waliy

B

e, T g »: Y TAA L2 an i et ol .- iy o . e o - ) k]
R TR R A R Qection 128010, of the Santa Rosa € LY Code OF 3G law.

TR-40.802 2.6, Eyvalusiion.

Opd Mo, G

Page § o 22



Emli s Ttem 1 Arle 5 o e &5y
Californin Five Code Section 505,

Section 158-44.503.2.6.1 Evaluation. Al faces
shall be evaluaied by a California b A In steveiural

neering or a Cal

iz licensed sy

ineer. for mﬁ 3 weight rating, and
the vehicle load limits shall be posted w ‘Wﬁ eniranees w bridges, These evalutions
<hall be perivmmed when direcied by the Fire Code Oificial.

15-44.502.2.6.2 Bridee maintenanee,

g Fre Coge bection S5U3.2.6.2 1s added 1o read as HES IS CEAt N

Py 3
L.k

b

Section 18-44.5023.2.6.2 Bridse maintenance new and existing bridges and elevated
SUUCTUres pros iding emergency access .:DJT be 'r«'ruri*"---‘!' ey -'."u-;n-\.-«,z uné n m.lu.vw in

accordaace with the | A

\"'.l’ riean

15 (O f.ux is, oro 1}:.-:'
.m;.‘m ..i standard.

i8-44.505.1 Address identification.

Calitora Fire Code Secidon 3031 is amended 10 read as follones:

Seotion 1545081 Ad fdentification. .
pr.ﬂ, mu with approved iliuminated addross saubers or letiers. They at“x.
isiadied on & conraming background and be plainly visible from the strest or roud
“ﬁf;‘z.)mn;: me :‘f:*fzpen\ Address nunmibers an..xl‘ ke Azabic pumerals ov alphabetic
Toters. Where access is by weans of a private icad and the bail q*-z;. cangiiyt be
viewed trom the public way. 2 monument. pole. or other approved siza or means
shall be'used o identity the sivuciure, Address identification shali comply with
Fire Department Siandards.

18-44.505.1 One and two-family dweliings.

{ alitmin Fire Code Section 50511 ¢ added 10 read as follows

or one and 1wo

- 1
1% yired % 1143y 115%) [Irokia
1t with g Uit STron

Seciion 13»44.. ARLLT Giee and pyvoe- imnm dw dimu.x Numbers

.

NI \".

I5-4L505,1.2 Numbers Tor other vhan one and twefamily dweilings,

e B - . T | § “ .y
{ s TR | 1 WNariemey "l | i 1 reall s« PR
Lait POLOUS ST DU s 18 aGded 10 read &3 1ollows;

¥

Section 15-44.505.1.2 Nambers for m%au ihisn one ang pyvoe- 3-;3;.a!x d u’-lfiu_‘:.\.




twelve (127 inches in helght with 2 minimutn siroke width of two (25 incies, Sutie
and unit directional numbers shall be a minimum of six (6) inches ir height with a
rainimum stroke widih of three-guarier 10.75) inches, Individual unit numbers
shall be a minimum of < inches in height with @ minimum of strike with of one-halt
0.5 inches.

18-44.505.1.3 Complex directory.

California Fire Code Secuion 505,1.3 is added 1o read ws ollows:
Section 18-44.503.1.3 Complex Directory. YWhere twe or more buildings are set back
ofl the streer ia exeess of 130 feet or when reguired by the Fire Code Oflicial, an
approved illuminated complex directory shall be provided at the mein entrances to 1he
property.

18-4.£.505.1.4 Roof top address.

California Fire Code Sceticn 505.1.4 i3 added 1o read a3 follows:

Section 18-44.505.1.4 Roof Top Address. Buildings four or more stories in height or
greater than 13,000 square feet in area shall provide a reflective roof top address. Roof
top address numbers shall be a minimum of 48 inches in height with @ minimum atroke
width of 8 inches and located in a central approved roof top arca.

18-44.507.3 Fire hvdrant systems.

California Fire Code Section 307.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 18-44.507.5 Fire hydrant systems, Fire hydrant systems shall comply with
Sections 507.5.1 through 507.5.6 and Appendix C as amended.

18-44.507.5.1 Where required.

(aiifornia Fire Code Seciion 507.3.1 is amended io read as follows:
Section 18-44.5 07.5,1 Where required. Where a partion of the fucility or building
hereafior construcied or moved imie or within the urisdiction 1 more than 130 ject

(43,179 o) trom & hvdrant on a fire apparai:
reute around the exterior of tie faeHity or bud

ACUERY ’t.v..... 25 miersiged b an u““‘“\“ ed

» hvdrames and mains shal

b provided where regaived in thie fire code offy
15-44.307.3,1 Section S07.5.1 Lxception.

i nevie: Tocem Fmrim TET oS R e g 1 r=
Califorais Pire Code Scafon 3075 1 "Laception” 1 delewd,

15-45.507.5. 1.1 Hyvdrager for fire departarent conneciian,




California T'ire Code Section 307.%5.1.1 is amended o read as follows

Section 18-44.507.5.1.1 Hydrani for Fire }}L-partmunt Connection,
A fre ydrant shall be locmed within 30 {eet of g Fire Depariment Connection

1

(FDC ) or as appraved by the {ire code oifiaal

13-44.510.1 Emergencey responder radio coverage in buildings.

Cadifornio Fire Code Section 3101 is amended to read ae follovas:

§ £3

Scetion 18-44.510.] Emergencs iicapm‘xdcr fiadiu Ceverage in Builidings. All
tmildings shall bave approved rudio coverage for emerzency responders within the
huxidnm The systew shall comply with this section and the Fire Depariment Standacd for

oy

Emergency Responder Rudio Coverage Systens,

= .

18-44.310.1 Seedion 510.1 fxceptinn 1.

Caiifornia Tave Code Seetion 36,0 “Dxception 17 s defeted,
18-44.510.3.1 Gperaiional permit vequired.

Califomis Fire Code Secuion 316.3.1 isadded to road ¢ follovs:

Seetion 18-44.316.3.0 Operadosal Permit Required. Operation of an Emergenc:

Respender Radio Coverage Svsem shall require o permit,

18-44.605.11 Photovoltaic power systems,

Calitornia Fire Code Section 60517 2 added o rend as falions:

Scctmn t8-44.605.11 Solar hotoveitaic Pewer Systems. ‘-u l.‘r Phoiwevolisic power
siemis shall be installed in accordmnce with s 11, 414

(« mii‘omu Building Code. California Electrical Code and .\luhl Hosa Fire Ikk Arunent

Standasd for wstaliation of Phoiovohaic Power Svsiemsi,

IS-44.8903.2 Whaie r&dﬂﬁ ed.

( anT N a e £ "y
K i ¥} % 1IMCENASA {1 16 1d> My

Secnur 1S-4L563.2 V5 n»n Regnired. Approved sumomang s PR LT SYSICIS 140y
l ildings and stroctures shatl be c“‘wi;ﬁ;.. in l«'-c.-;uvns desertbed W Sections 902 21
dion GNR

E . ; P
TN T 3 SOV T
reuZin Sectidn 33.2.20, Theq

3N

LTESIUVe requirémen

i8-44.903.2,11.7 Dusign eriseria,




California Fire Code Section 903.2.11.7 is added to read az follows:
Section 18-44-903.2.11.7 Design Criteria. Fire sprinkler sysiems installed in buildings
of an undetermined use shall be designed and installed to have a design density oi’.33
gallons per minute per square foot over a minimum design area of 3000 syjuare feet.
Where a subsequent occupancy chanie requires a system with greater capacity. it shall be
the building owner’s responsibility to upgrade the system to the required density,
18-44.903.2.18 Exception.
California Fire Code Section 903.2.18 Exception is amended to read as follows:
Section 18-44.903.2.18 Exception -
1. Carports of noncombustible construction with non-habitable spaces above.
2. Additions and or alierations not exceeding 30 percent of the existing square Tootage.
18-44.903.2.20. Local Automatic Sprinkler Systems.

California Fire Code Scction 903.2.20 is added 1o read as follows:

Section 18-44.903.2.20. Local Automatic Sprinkler Systems. Automatic sprinkier
systems shall comply with-this section.

18-44.903.2.20.1 Local automatic fire sprinkler system requirements.
California Fire Code Section 903.2.20.1 is added to read as follows:
Secfion 18-44.903.2.20.1. Local Automatic Fire Sprinkler System Requirements. An

approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed and maintained in all newly
constructed buildings.

Exceptions:
1 Agricultural buildings as approved by the Fire or Building Official.

2. Detached pool houses up we 1000 sq. 1. i floor area within 38 feet of the pool and
limized to a singie bathroom,

g D SO, | %y b Tl ety weliiedts Thed diaperaing earianieos einasted ag (K VITYY
2o Deiaoned mnol-COomngsuoio REDW0T welilcid TUe GIRPCTRNE CANOPIcs Clnslilda s LI

M occupancy.
4. Detachied Group U oceupancies 1LOUG square Tfect or less.

|

& y ahe o datar 3 e e v vt il T SO T
I, Adraom ;}.b...“a o \,is'-.‘,-.‘h;.:;x f.:.l:d;; € USSR 1D .-.\‘-'.-‘fi:’».. Vi l Ldl du'\."' not Cotiiim &

d. No 4016
Page 120822



bathrocin, coohing or refrigeration facuiiiaes.
6. Carports i non-combusiible construction with non-habitable spaces above,
7. B or M occupuncies 3006 sq. 11 or less,
18-44.903.2.20.2 Additions, remodel, alteration or repairs,
California Fire Code Section 903.2.20.2 is added to read as illows:
903.2.20.2 Additions, Remodel, Alteration or Repairs.

1. An auiomatic {ire sprinkler system shall be provided in an existing one- or two-
family dwelling when additions increase the arsa by 50% or more caleulated by
existing gross floor arca.

An auiomusic fire sprinkler s

building when addiiions increase the ares by 25%% or more ealenlated by existing

gross floor arca.

3. Additions o existing Group R, Division 1 occupancies that result m additonal
Fuest rooms or dwelling vnits, the bisidine shall meet the requirements for o
newly consiructed building.

For remodels. alteradons or repairs 10 un exisiing building involving demolition,
remowval or repair of more than 30% of the structure (1o include walls. columns.
beam: or girders, floor or ceﬂmQ joists and coverings, vooi rafiers, roof
Jdisphragms. fhundatic n or similar comporenis), the building shell meet the
requirements for 2 newt; ‘.onstr.u. L;d bulldl..,,. For the purposs of applying this
section, the following criteria shall be considered in the 50% threshold evaluation:

' 4. The removal or demolition of more than 50% of the exterior or interior

weighi-bearing walis. Or.
b. Removal of ihe rouf striucture or ceiling thereby permiiting instailation of
overhead piping, Or,

12

2

siem shal! ke provided in an existing non-residential

:[..

¢. Remova!l of inicrior tenant i;npm'- emenis reducing tae building wa
*shell” conduion shall reguire the future build-ont w comply with fire

sprinkier requirements.

E,\\..-m S13% U.y avions or additions made solzl fur the purpose of complvin
wiih the Americany with Irqomh::e»z et

The percentage of work <! mll pe determined and added 10 any successh

N

Sy INE ot e el S s Rt B Pragr e S gt R
rarnodels that may oceur within o subseguent thres (353

iminle <50 S i it T P
{CUs M or maye, (N1 Wirk

.
combined nercentace

" 1 - :
SULBITUL IO Litw LIVe aDTITRICT IO

A e, (e 1
£, Anv combingmi

ve where the "11!‘ Rl ke b

ne entire huildimg shali meet we requirements for




18-44.503.2.20.3 Changes of occupancy.
California Fire Code Section 903.2.20.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 18-44.903.2.20.3 Changes of Occupancy. When airv change of
occupancy occurs wherz the proposed new occupancy classification is more
hazardous, or as determined by the Fire Code Official including the conversion of
residential buildings to condominiumn:s. the building shall meet the fire sprinkler
requirements for a newly constructed building.

18-44.903.4.2 Alarms,
California Fire Code Section 903.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 18-44.903.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible and visible device shall be
connected to every automatic fire sprinkler system in an approved location. Such
sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activaied by waterfiow equivalent to the fiew
of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a building
fire alarm system is installed. actuaiion of the automatic fire sprinkler system shall
actuate the building fire alarm system.

Every new commercial fire alarm system installed as a sprinkler system monitoring
alarm shall also provide notification for the purpose of initiating emergency action,
including those systems activated solely by fire sprinkler systems, so that
occupants of the building shall be notitied andibly and visually within each suiic or
building division. A minimum of one notification appliance shall be located in
each suite or building division in a normally occupied location.

-

California Fire Code Seciion 905.3.1.2, is amended to read as follows:
Section 18-44.905.3.1.2. Buildings that are three or more stories in height.
18-44.905.9 Section 905.9 Exception 2 deleted.
California Fire Code Section 905.9 Exception 2 is deleted.
18-44.907.8.5.1 False fire alarms.
Catifornia Fire Code Section 907.8.5.1 18 added o read a5 folloves:
Scetion 15-4-4.907.8.3.1 False Fire Alarms. Owners of properiies wikod live wlan
svsiem shall maintzin the sysiem in accordance with Section 907.8.5. When moze than
one false fire alarm activaies within a calendar vear, a teg shall be assessed per the

current adopicd fec schednle.

18-44.910.1 Section 910.1 Exczpiion 2 deleted.

Ord, N, 4016
e am

I‘LJ&".'\: l4ofd2



Californiz Fise Code Seation 16,7 Fxception 2 is deleied,
18-44.910.3.2.7 Section 910.2.2.1 deleted.

Caitfomnia Fire Code Section %16.3.2.1 is deleied.

18-44. 110321 Rection 1103.2.1 deleted.

California Fire Code Sceidon 11022001 s deleted.

I8-44 310302 Section 1163.2.2 Eacepiion doleted
Californiz Fire Code Section 110322 Exception is deleted

18-443314.3 Large building spriskler proteciion,

GO ALy e ) e [, (e W St 19 T, e, Ly s
Caliomia Fue Code Segtion A314.3 Is added o Fosba ds {1

Seotpon T8-44, ’31! 3 Laree Building Qprin!;’ler Protection. Buildings in excess
of fhree stories in height or hmmg a first siory in exeess of 100066 square feet in
arce shall provide an approved operating fire sprinkier system oo each floor during

construetion prior to continuing consmruciion on upner Janc'.:_-.

T

[8-44.3206.3 Section 3206.2, Table 3206.2 fostnate | delete

g s e ey s .
Secien 3200.2. Table 22042 fooinate pis delered,

California Fire Cod

18-44.3206.5.1 Small hose stations,

ditornin Fire Code Section 2206.8.1 s added 0 read us follows:

o b 1 =
neshal e

Section 13-003206,8.1 Small Hinse Stations, Small hose vuly

required when a High Pled Storage Arca exveeds 23
I Virinehhase valve shall be provided at approved loeations. Hose. nozzles, hose racks

and covers shall he provided,

T
S AR
1

15 foliows

1490201 e mmended 10 read o

IO0Ta g LOOg Helt

- on . ~
it fyqny S seyt ek Npvl
.)-L!’--..f.r; < Tromn

o | 3 gt

¥l oini L
e o S
ae 4310 B

g Loel .ﬁ ared, - bkl »‘-l nii Vah

vy ". i Floavsd "iﬂ}'\\ -
ke RELELS ST TR EVAL SRS ‘um.,\\\

No 4016

=~ -



18-44.4907.1 Defensible space.
Calitormia Fire Code Section 4907.1 is amended o read a5 fullows:
Section 18-44.4907.1 Defensible Space. Buildings ard strectures located within @
desizmated Wildland-Urban Intertace Fire Aveas of a Local Responstbility Area
{LRA) shull maintain defensible space as outiined in the Government Code
Sectiops $1175-51189 and local standards of the authority having jurisdiction.
18-44.5001.5.3 Electronic reporting.
California Fire Code Section 5001.5.3 is added to read as foliows:
Section 18-44.5001.5.3 Electronic Reporting. All hazardous Material
Moanagemeni Plans (HMMP) and Hazardous Material Inventory Siatements
(HMIS) shali be subnzitied electromically as requared by the Fire Code Officiul.
18-44.5308 Materials which arc or may become toxic gases.
Cal:fornia Fire Code Section 5308 is added to read as follows:
Section 18-44.5308 Materials which are or may become toxic gases. The Fire Code
Officia! shall publish standards previding requirements for facilities that use, handle or
store materials that cre or may become WXIC gases.
18-44.5608.2 Fireworks definition.

California Fite Code Section 5608.2 is added to read as follows:

Section 18-44.5608.2 Fireworks Definitions. The following words and phrases,
a3 used in this chapter, are defined as follows:

“Dangerous fireworks™ shall mean dangerous fireworks as defined in Health and Safet:
Code Seciions 12305 and 12361 and the relevant seciions of Title 19, Cede of
Regulations, and Subchapter 6 which arc hereby ncorporated by reference,

“Person” includes amy individual. timm. parts
wion, state, irust, business trust. reced

2Y FLONPIVECE MK T2 ITitiP
LI PRSI S 3 HIAGEE I Ve EE AN

srship. joint venwre, sssocinion. concem

T SN TS OF G oLner Jroun o

“Public displav of fireworks” shall mear an enterialnment featwre where the pubiic is

TN T Y. U LA SO T O _—
) ﬁxt’h:a.: 1§33} PCT"].\iﬂ.d o WEIEW ?»u.‘ \!.(‘:?1-.‘3 W LLE hl‘_ I_,r\t

¢ of fireworks., including

S
}'. itend g rhvmes A fTemoe k-‘ )
Al 10, Thaad Geiliigu Dt

v e ~ R . 5
L5 5 RN : »

- 20 s - -
TR ey FERPTS P o I ia bt T et el 2urs O35 oy kgl AT i e il Lt I ac i TR I
LR Lo P34 LN “I Qistaayy  ard Dol SN GTE QISTIAYE OF QISOIEVS MOG IV U uiilciiin



with special effects. for motion pictures, thearrical and group entertaimnent productions
operated by a professional Celifornia Sie licensed pyretechnician. All such displays
musi secure a fire deparimient pernit and meet all applicable requirensents of California
Health and Safets (‘nd‘.

“State-approve d firewerks™ shiall mean state-approved fireworks defined in Heslih and
Satery Code Sections 12326 and 1 'qo > and e relevani sections of Title 19, Code of
Regulations. Subch.q*m 6. which are hereby incorporated by reference.

18-44.5608.2 Sale, use or discharge of fireworks prohibited — exception.
Califomia Fire Code Section 5608.3 is added w read as Toliows:

Scction 18-44.5608.3 Salc. use or discharge of fireworks prohibited —
exception.

1. Except ior pablic dispiays of fireworks auhorized pursaairt to this seciion. it is
unl;w;ﬁll for any person to possess, swore, offer or expose for sale. seli atretail, give away
T in any manrer dispose of any fireworks, or 10 use. s<plod\., or otherwise discharge any

fir sworks,

. Any person or group desiring 10 perform a public display of freworks shall first maice
w ntte"x applicadion for & permit to the Fire Chief -\nplzcmm for a permit shall bz made
17 writing at least twenty (20) d s rmol to the proposed dispiay. The application shall
be considered and acted upon by the Tire Chie! pursusnt 1o Titde 19, Chapter 6. Arndele 2
- Licenses of the California Code of Regulations. Any permit for a pubiic display of
fireworks may be suspended or revoked at any time by the Fire Chief,

18-44.B105.1 One- and two-family dwellings.
California Fire Code Appendix B Section B10%2,] is amended io read as follows

Section 18-44.B102.1 Cuie- and two-family dwellings. The niinimium fre-flot
requirernents for one- -wms,.a~f.;.'ntl_\ dwellings having a ifire-fiow caleulation areu
which does not excead 3,600 squ

e st 20 psi, h:-:,-tu W
calculation area s excess .-{.'?

that speciiled in Table B 165.1.

18-44.E105.2 Bulidings other than coe- and tvwo-famils dwellings.

o N o Ly & 3 - T o aryy pvm gl ad T b -
(,m..uuu Fue Cade iidin 3 Seclion BICeS 2 isamesded 10 read a2 polows:

Section I5-44.BI05.2 iin

mimiinisn tre-flow u.ld 45




Exception: A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 30 percent, as
approved. is allowed when the building is provided with an approved
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 18-
44.903.3.1.1 or 18-44.902.3 1.2, The resulting fire-tlow shall nov be less
than 1,500 gallons per minuie or the prescribed duration as specified in
Table B105.1.

18-44.C105.1 Table C105.1 Footnote fand g.

California Fire Code Appendix C Table C103.1 is amended fo add “footnote fand g7 to
read as follows:

Section 18-44.C105.1 Table C105.1 Footnote f. For commercial, industrial.
multifamily residential and designated Firs Severity Zones. average spacing shall
be no greater than 300 fect.
Section 18-44.C105.1 Table C105.1 Footnote g. A fire hvdrant shall be located
within 50 feet of the Fire Department Connection (FDC), or as approved by the
fire code official.

18-44.D103.1 Section D103.1 deleted.

California Fire Code Appendix D Section D103.1 is delewed.

18-44.D103.2 Grade.

California Fire Code Appendix D Section D103.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 18-44.D103.2 Grade. The grade of fire apparatus access roads shall be in
accordance with the local agency requiremeni for public streets or as approved by
the fire code official.

18-44.D103.3 Turning radius.
California Fire Code Appendix D Saction 1316:3.3 is umended to read as follows:

Section 18-44.D103.3 Turning radius. The minimum turning radius shail be
dotermined by local agency requirements or as approved by the fire cade viticial,

P5-34.J¢163.4 Dead cnds.

California Tire Code Appendix D Section D103 4 is amended to read as foliows:

Section 18-44.0102.4 Dead ends. Dead-end five appuaratus access roads i excess
of 150 feer (45 720 ) shall be provided with width and twnareuad provisions in




accordance with the locsl agency requirements ior public strests or as approved by
the firz code official.

18-44.D103.4 Table I3103.4 deleted.

California Fire Code Appendixn D Table D102.4 is defcied.

15-44.10103.6 Signs.

California Five Code Appendix D Section D103 6 is amended o read as follows:
Seetion i5-44.D105.6 Signs. Where required by the fire code oificial. fire
apparatus access roads shall be marked with permanent NO PARKING-FIRE
LANE signs ihat comply wiih the California Vehicle Code.

15-44.D183.6.1 Seciion D103.6.1 deleted.

California Fire Code Appendix D Section D103.6.1 is delered.

18-4.L.0102.5.2 Section D1032.6.2 deleted.

California Fire Code Appendix D Section D03.6.2 is deleted.

18-44.9104.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 square feet in area.

Cuiifornia Fire Code Appendix D Section Di04.2 is amendad to delete the Exception and
read as follows:

Sectior 18-44.D104.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 square feet in area. Buildings
or facilities having a gross building area of more than 62,000 square feet (3760
m?2) shall be provided with wio separawe end approved fire apparatus access roads

18-44.D106.1 Multi-family dwelling residential developinents.

California Fire Code Appendix D Section DIOG.T is amended 1o delete the Excepiion and
read gs foliows:

Seciion 15-4-4.11{06.1 Muli-famil: um!hn‘ residential deyelopments. Projecs
having more than 30 ‘l\ chling he i

PRESI-A AR R
H
"
ADPRFOVE

.\\L\ !i (SR \‘r’.-;

© ADRAra

& b Y
~ l [ aeciess roads.

[N

18-44.D100.2 Section Bili.2 dedeted.
California Fire Code Appendix D Seciion DI106.2 is defeied

15-44L0107.1 One- ov owo-family dwelling residential desddopments.



California Fire Code Appendix D Section D107.1 i amended to delete Exceptions 1 and 2
and read as follows:

Section 18-44.D107.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments.
Projects having more than 50 dwelling units shall be provided with two separate
and approved fire apparatus sccess roads and shall meet the requiremenis of
Section 18-44.D104.3.7

Section 3. Findings of Fact. The Council finds that the standards for buildings within
the Citv of Santa Rusa should comply with the 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, with adopted
amendments. Based on materials presented by the Fire Chief of the City of Santa Rosa the
Council finds that it is necessary to make procedural and administrative modiiications and
changes to the model codes as amended and adopted by the State of California and specifically
adopted and amended in this Ordinance. Such standards are needed for efficient, economical,
and expeditious enforcement of ihe Fire Code of the City of Santa Rosa. The Council further
finds and determines, based on the matcrials and reports presented. that the substantive
amendments to the model codes, which are identified by and adopted in this Ordinance, are
hereby determined to be reasonable and necessary because of local conditions and do not lessen.
diminish or change the standards st forth within the model codes except as authorized by law.
If any non-administrative or non-procedural model code provision or applicable State of
California amendment is ir: conflict with this ordinance,; it is the intent of this ordinance to
amend or delete such provision when findings of local conditions are stated as required by
Sections 17938.5 and 17958.7 of the Health and Safety Code.

Said local conditions are:

Al Earthquake hazards associated with the Healdsburg-Rodgers Creek Fault and other
localized earthquake faults in-close proximity of a densely populated urban area.

B. History of heavy winter rains and pocrly drained soils including expansive adobe soils in
many locations.

C. High groundwater tables and unconsolidated alluvial soils.

D. Heavy accumulations of flammable plani material covering many areas, periodic high
winds and an extended drv season.

E The propensity of Jocad streams to floed due fo periods of intense rainfall,
= Sania Rosa 1= an infund city et discharges treated reclanned waler i (e ways: i

urban and agnieultural frrigaiion, to ihe Russtan River during certain puriod of the year at
a rute based on the fow of the river. and puniped to the Geysers hvdrothermal tield.

Section 4. Lovironmentsl Revie The Council determines that this ordinance
o

.f.,klfn'--.m e -._N_,j;.eh S 3 aer ity mAreaite et e T piyEesoer e slooms e T .;lb‘. art T By
SHOLSHCE PTOIC nres par }:’“"““nr i‘ull_:...: dha 13 N o t;l\q;v\.x. dnd, U0 e Nt all A L



ll'-

Califorsia Envirenmeniad Qx Acy Tae Council furilior iinds that the adoption of this
ordinance is exemnt from C U} A under the provisions of ,.st:.*-.‘w(t&‘--\- gudelings. .\.e.ctm 15061
(n) {33, in r.lm& there is ne possi bility t the provisions enucted by this ovdinance will effvet o
subsgantind adverse chanee in dx environmen.

Section §, capiaised in Tide 18 0"'1‘"&* Nante Rosa

City Code, swhenever the words ”‘ii";;‘: 'i.” “witl,” Yinus " “is chavged with the enforcement of.” or
words of similar unport age w.J Hi saled chapters o establish a nsihility of the City of Sania
Rosa. ar of the members of any board, u\“’lr!‘.i“wi.‘h. depa wunent, officers of the City. including.
ur net timited o the Cowncll and Chy : ion they
or emplovee of the Cit of Saala L. ce iment that such words shall estahb
Ly OF power requining the exarcise ol judgment and discretion, us
distnguished from @ mandaton dury, Mo mandaions dupon apy member ¢f th
Ceuneil. or upon any boasd or cominission of the City of Sama Rosa. or upon any depar u-:ui.
officer. oilicial. or emplovee of the City of Sanw Rasa | oy the provisions of said chapters. and
smd chapters shall not be constiued 50 as l!(zh‘ e Ciny u* bla.. Rosa or any mwember of the

s baard. commission, o icer, official o

TR h R AR
TSNS OF DI LARTLRL

v dhagy HEA E i

¥ o o oy 1l . 1 e
toor of any ofiicer, ofit

s :
I R TET] vt XA 1)
discretionary audl

ment of 1-9 Ci. orany e

‘5‘” l‘d. M.(‘ :i,“m‘-
- :

wislons of
satforih

Section 6. If any section. subsection. & enienee, clase. or "1

rdinance is | vreason held 3o be uncons national, su
remaining poriions of ihis o

e e H . 253 % IRy
erdinzree aid each section. subseciion. clanse or plirase theren

ome O PH0IT -wu\m\\ subsections. clauses or phrases be declarad uncon "!.iuuium}.

Section 7, biicciive Diate, 1This ordinance shall take effect on J.wu'"‘
by the Council and publicaiion r-t!l:'- ans o Section 8 o7 (e Santa R t.nurt.... {fh.‘
exisung aon-admmisiraiive or non- W reNinin i

spplicable W speeific permit applications as of the date of submitial tor plan veview when such

;L‘ o yer ,\

<
i ¥
e
7.
e
o
3=
¥




date of submittal is prior to the eifzciive date of this ordinance. For purposes of this seciion, the
date of submittal for master planned projects shall be the date of submital for plot plan review,

IN COUNCIL DULY PASSED this 3rd day i December, 261

AYES: (6) Mayor Bartley, Vice Mayor Swinth. Council Members Combs, Olivares,
Ours, Wysocky

NOES: (0)
ABSENT: (1) Council Member Carlstrom
ABSTAIN: (0)

ATTEST: g oo Mrdvram o/ APPROVED: =7 {304
'Deputy City Clerk ; &/ af 2l Mavor ™

4

.’&PPRQ\ ED AS TO FOPAL

~ 4 regoing is a true

':f 3 gl ;.-: e :‘:, | hg'igrt:gtga;hzg e e gmr.*.u"m'u.ce
— = - ' an

City Attorney =7 duly and regularly adopted by the Counci} of

the City of Sant@ Rcsa ata reular‘q;no%gtmg

theteof held

d. New 4010

P
l“...‘ 2zol2



