STATE OF CALIFORNIA — GOVERNMENT OPERATIONS AGENCY GOVERNOR EDMUND G. BROWN JR.

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916  FAX (916) 263-0959

January 8, 2014

John D. Kuehl

Building Official

City of Pacific Grove
300 Forest Avenue
Pacific Grove, CA 93950

RE: Ordinance #13-019
Dear Mr. Kuehl:

This letter is to advise you of our determination regarding the referenced ordinance with
express findings received from your agency cn December 5, 2013.

Our review finds the submittal to contain one ordinance modifying provisions of the 2013
California Building Standards Code in Title 24, California Code of Regulations (code), and
express findings complying with Health and Safety Code §§17958.7 and 18941.5. The code
modification is accepted for filing and is enforceable. This letter attests cnly to the
satisfaction of the cited law for filing of lccal code amendment supported by an express
finding with the Commission. The Commission is not authorized by law to evaluate the merit
of the code modification or the express finding.

Local modifications to the code are specific to a particular edition of the code. They must be
readopted and filed with the Commission in order to remain in effect when the next triennial
edition of the code is published.

On a related matter, should your city receive and ratify Fire Protection District ordinances
making modifications to the code, be advised that Health and Safety Code §13869.7(c)
requires such ratified ordinances and express findings to be filed with the Department of
Housing and Community Develepment, Division of Codes and Standards, State Housing
Law Program, rather than this Commission. Also, ordinances making modifications to the
energy efficiency standards of the code may require approval from the California Energy
Commission pursuant to Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)(2).

If you have any questions or need any further information, you may contact me at
(916) 263-0916.

Sincerely,

ue M. Rodriguez
Associate Construction Analyst

cc: Chron
Local Filings

BSC TP-219 (Rev. 10/13)



CITY OF PACIFIC GROVE

300 FOREST AVENUE
PACIFIC GROVE, CALIFORNIA 93950
TELEPHONE (831) 648-3100
FAX (831) 375-9863

December 3, 2013

California Building Standards Commission
Executive Director

2525 Natomas Park, Suite 130
Sacramento, CA 95833

RE: Code Adoption
2013 California Building Codes

To whom it may concern:

Enclosed please find City of Pacific Grove Ordinance No. 13-019 with Amendments and Agenda
Report. These new codes were adopted by the City on November 6, 2013.

You may contact me at 831.646.5642 with any questions.

Sincerely,

hnD.Kuchl "7 !
Building Official 7
JDK:If

enc:  Ordinance No.13-019 with Amendments and Findings
Agenda Report

Printed on
Recycled Paper



Consent Agenda Item No.7B

CITY OF PACIFIC GROVE

300 Forest Avenue, Pacific Grove, California 93950

' AGENDA REPORT |

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: John Kuehl, Building Official
MEETING DATE: November 6 2013 .

Second reading and adoption of an ordinance amending Sections
18.04.010 and 18.32.010 of the Pacific Grove Municipal Code to

SUBJECT: adopt the 2013 Edition of the California Building Standards and
related codes .

This action is exempt from environmental review, per the
CEQA: provisions of Section 15061(b)(3) of the California Environmental
Quality Act of 1970 (“CEQA?”), as amended.

RECOMMENDATION
Hold second reading and adopt an ordinance that amends the Pacific Grove Municipal Code and
adopts the 2013 Edition of the California Building Standards Codes, with amendments.

DISCUSSION

The California Building Standards—comprising codes regulating building, fire, electrical,
plumbing, and mechanical conditions—are revised on a multi-year cycle. On January 29, 2013,
the State adopted and approved the 2013 Edition of the Building Standards Codes, also known as
the California Codes. These codes were published July 2013 and will take effect on January 1,
2014 (and are known as the 2013 Edition of the California Codes). All local jurisdictions in
California are mandated to begin enforcement of these new codes and standards by January 1,
2014.

Typically, and in accordance with state law, local jurisdictions incorporate an additional
regulation that addresses special circumstances in the community or area provided. Such special
regulations are based on geographical, topographical, climatic, or environmental findings. City
staff has developed and incorporated a few local amendments to the model codes.

Council could choose to adopt the revised 2013 Edition of the Building Standards Codes with no
changes. However, amendments are appropriate to address local conditions. Similar
amendments are believed to be appropriate for structures in both Pacific Grove and Monterey.

For each amendment to be effective, it must be adopted by the City Council along with the
model codes that have been adopted by the state.



Consent Agenda Item No.7B

For the first time, the City will adopt the 2013 California Green Building Standards Code (Cal
Green). In years past, the City has used the Pacific Grove Green Building Ordinance because it
was more restrictive and applicable to the Pacific Grove environment, but the State has now
revised Cal Green to a point where it is now consistent with the City’s own version.

One other change from past practice is modification to the Administrative section of the Fire
Code. The code divides permits into two separate categories, Operational and Construction
permits. The existing Construction permit program is in place and works very well, while
Operational permits are not as well defined as the City would like. We indicate in the Code that a
separate Operation permit program would be established by resolution, which would take City
Council approval. Over the next few months staff will be work with the community to establish a
well defined Operational permit program.

Notice of the proposed adoption was published in the Monterey Herald on October 28, 2013. No
significant changes have been made to the draft since the first reading; minor adjustments have
been made to improve readability and implementability.

The proposed Ordinance is exempt from environmental review, per the provisions of Section
15061(b)(3) of the California Environmental Quality Act of 1970 (“CEQA”™), as amended. The
Ordinance does not have the potential to cause a significant effect on the environment because
the Building Codes ensure that property improvements meet the State of California’s health and
safety requirements. New property improvements undergo their own environmental clearance
when proposed.

FISCAL IMPACT
None

ATTACHMENTS
1. Draft Ordinance

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED: REVIEWED BY:
"y .
/’J‘ : L T,
-~/ 4 ILW lt0mds [lucitot!
John Kuehl Thomas Frutchey
Building Official CITY MANAGER



ORDINANCE NO. 13 - 019

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF PACIFIC GROVE AMENDING
CHAPTERS 18.04, 18.32, AND DELETING CHAPTER 18.42 OF THE PACIFIC
GROVE MUNICIPAL CODE REGARDING THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING
AND RELATED INTERNATIONAL CODES

WHEREAS, pursuant to Sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the
Califomia Health and Safety Code, the City of Pacific Grove (“City”) may adopt the
provisions of the International Building Code, the Plumbing Code, the Mechanical Code,
the Fire Code, the Housing Code, and the National Electrical Code, to protect the health,
welfare and safety of the citizens of Pacific Grove because of local climatic, geological,
topographical, and Environmental conditions; and

WHEREAS, this Ordinance is found to be categorically exempt from
environmental review, per the provisions of Section 15061(b)(3) of the California
Environmental Quality Act {“CEQA™) of 1970, as amended; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with state law, local jurisdictions can incorporate
additional regulations that address special circumstances in the community or area
provided that they are at least as restrictive as the statewide codes.

WHEREAS, the Pacific Grove City Council finds that specific amendments have
been established by the City that are more restrictive in nature than those sections
adopted by the State of California (State Building Standards Code, and State Housing and
Community Development Code) commonly referred to as Title 24 and Tite 25 of the
California Administrative Code. These “Findings of Fact™ are submitted and made a part
of this Ordinance pursuant to its Section 1, as authorized by Sections 17958.5 and
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code. Under the provisions of Section
17922.2 of the California Health and Safety Code, local amendments shall be based on
climatic, geographical, or topographical conditions. The Findings of Fact contained
herein address cach of these situations and as presented by the local situation, and
singularly or in combination provide a basis for the amendments to be adopted.

P‘mﬁle of the City of Pacific Grove: The City of Pacific Grove encompasses an area of 4
square miles of land, with resident population of 15,295 as of the 2012 census, The
physical location of the City is between the adjacent lands of the City of Monterey and

the City of Carmel.

The placement of residential and commercial development within the City of Pacific
Grove has generally adopted itself to areas of least resistance, within the confines of
ridges and foothills. Other unique environmental characteristics include the flatter plains
that contain the shoreline of Monterey Bay, which creates the boundaries that attract the

visitor population.



Throughout the City of Pacific Grove major roadways and highways create barriers.
Other barriers result from military facilities, which include the United States Army and

the Presidio of Monterey.

Climstic I; Climate wezather pattems within the City of Pacific Grove are moderately
affected by the ocean bodies of the Pacific Ocean and Monterey Bay, which extend the
year-round growing season of vegetation, The average normal year’s rainfall
approximates eighteen to nineteen (18-19) inches. Summer conditions, with the
prevatent Pacific High Cell, create the mid-day fog normally associated with Pacific
Grove. This climatic fog promotes natural vegetation growth.

Later in the year, winds and drying vegetation mix to create hazardous fuel conditions,
which can canse grassland and brush land fires. While normal temperatures usually do
not exceed 75-80 degrees, during late summer and early fall (August, September,
October) temperatures can exceed 100 degrees. Afternoon winds can move a fire guickly
in the hiilsides and canyon areas of the City.

Because of weather patterns and population increases, as well as unique water supply
limitations affecting the Monterey Peninsuta, the City of Pacific Grove (like other
California cities) has experienced water rationing and water allocation limits, Due to
limited storage capacity and consumption, as well as climatic conditions, limited water

resSoUrces are an issue,

Climatic IT: The region is within a climate zone that requires compliance with energy
efficiency standards for building construction. The amendment adds up-to-date design
standards to add energy efficiency in construction while maintaining nationally

recognized health and safety standards.

Geographical I: Residents and visitors alike appreciate the scenic appeal and
geographical features of the City of Pacific Grove. The forested areas along with the
lower brush tands give a feel of balance and z sort of backdrop for the City itself. These
geographical features establish the roadways and building sites, as well create bartiers for

accessibility for fire suppression forces.

Forested areas of ozk and pines create windbreaks from oncoming winds, while
producing fue! from the annual fall leaves, which drop to the ground, as well as from
decayed trees and branches, The dry vegetation, mountainous terrain, and minimal water
available tend to ¢ause concern and added fire problems.

The City of Pacific Grove has adjacent to its boundaries potentially active seismic
hazards with respect to the “Navy,” “Berwick Canyon,” “Chupines,” and “Seaside”
faults. While systems have been developed to study and monitor the activity of
carthquakes, science has not yet been able to predict (with reliability) the potential for
activity on these or any active fault.



Seismic activity within the City occurs yearly with little or no damage, although real
potential for damage does exist with these four active faults. New construction may be
limited by its respective distance to such faults, and replacement of exisling structures

could be costly.

The geographical layout of forested areas creates hazardous conditions when a storm of
gale-force winds causes trees to fall onto roadways used for access by Fire Department
equipment and personnel. The growing pattern and inherent nature of the Monterey Pine
lends itself to being blown over easily. This is due in part to the shallow root system
associated with the Monterey Pine tree.

Landslides have been experienced that affect the City of Pacific Grove, due to excessive
land cuts associated with the roadway systems designed to access the City. While
stabilization can sometimes he provided, heavy rainfalls have caused failures. These
failures have closed roadways affecting the City, again msking accessibility impossible
until properly cleared.

Geographical [I: The region is located in an area of high seismic activity as indicated by
United States Geological Survey and California Division of Mines and Geelogy. Recent
earthquake activity has indicated the lack of flexibility of materials and/or building
systems has been a contributing factor to damages that reduced the protection of the life-
safety of building occupants and increased the cost of rehabilitation of structures.
Activities have indicated the need for increased levels of safety in buildings systems,
mcluding but not limited to means of egress, wiring systems, and fire protection systems.,

Topographical: The topographical element of this report is associated closely with the
geographical element noted above. While the geographic features create the topographic
conditions, the findings in this section are cansed by the construction and design of the

City of Padﬁc Grove.

The water supply (domestic and fire flow) system is directly affected by the topographic
layout. The distribution system consists of water lines that carry the water from storage
tanks and dammed areas to the public via pipes. These street mains create lift-zones
where the pressure and flows are adequate at lower elevations and minimal, sometimes
critical supplies at the top. Water supplies within the City of Pacific Grove vary from
less than 250 gallons-per-minute to flows in excess of 5,500 gallons-per-minute. This
wide variation causes major problems to development, as well as fire suppression forces,

The roadway system is designed around the topography with respect o narow, windy,
steep grades and overhanging tree branches. The grades on the roadway surfaces exceed
25% and widths of less than twelve (12) feet for access are not uncommon, Due to traffic
congestion on many streets, especially the commercial downtown area, vehicles double
park for loading and unloading purposes. This creates barriers that reduce response time

of fire equipment.



The topography also makes construction more restricted to the level portions of the City
with higher concentrations of building in these areas. The existing structures are being
removed and replaced with larger, more cost effective buiidings. Those existing
structures which remain cause congern fo the Fire Department because of their lack of
adequate fire protection {firewalls, fire extinguishing systems, ete.). The hazard exposure
created by these structures poses a separate and significant problem.

It is not uncommon to see a single or two-story building torn down and replaced with a
one or two-story building. For practical and cost reasons, these new structures are built
of wood (Type V). The potential for conflagration exists with the high build out of the
various specific areas of Pacific Grove. The concentrated commercial, as well as
residential occupancies, cause concern regarding the exposure elements of building-to-
building and building-to-vegetated areas of this City.

The topographical nature of Pacific Grove also lends itself to power failures caused when
trees and tree limbs damage sections of electrical transmission lines. These power
failures cause the electrical pumps to become inactive, interrupting water supplies.
Vehicnlar aceidents also have been known to interrupt this pumping operation, due to the
narrow strects, which are congested with residents and visitors.

The natural rocky shorelines of Pagific Grove creats a situation restricting access to some
buildings for responding firefighters. Built property-line to property-line, these structures
creatc an clement of construstion of blocks of continuous construction.

Lastly, while possibly not being within the “topographical” context of Findings of Fact,
the historical significance is a major visitor draw for the City of Pacific Grove. Buildings
and roadways have been preserved to create a lasting reminder of what has been. While
many of the historieal structures ar¢ small and surrounded by landscaped courtyards, etc.,
some buildings are constructed closer than would be presently allowed under the
Intemational Building Code. Construction methods were also less restrictive than would
be required today. These structures and settings create barriers, which firefighters must
work around and protect from exposure. Forty-four to fifty historical buildings, dating

back to the early 1800°s are imeplaceable.

These Findings of Fact, which identify the various “climatic, geographical, and
topographical” conditions, are considered reasonably necessary to modify the
requirements established pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17922 based upon

local conditions,

While it is clearly understood that adoption of this ordinance may not prevent the
incidence of fire or building related accidents, implementation of these various
regulations and/or requirements may serve to reduce the severity and potentiat loss of life

and property.,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF PACIFIC GROVE:



SECTION 1. The City Council finds each recital set forth ahove & be true and
correct, and by this reference incorporates each as an integral part of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. Section 18.04.010 of the Pacific Grove Municipal Code is amended
by deleting the current Section 18.04.010 in its entirety and replacing it with the text set
forth below as follows:

18.04.010 Adoption of Buiiding Codes.

Except as otherwise amended by this Chapter and Chapter 18 of the Pacific Grove
Municipal Code, the following amended Model Codes are hereby adopted by reference
and are incorporated in this Chapter as if fully set forth herein, as authorized by
Government Code section 50020, et seq. ‘The City Manager may enforce these Codes in
zccord with the enforcement procedures and remedies set forth ie PGMC Chapter 1,19, in

addition to any other provision of law.

ARTICLE 1 - GENERAL PROVISIONS
The following amended Model Codes are hereby adopted by reference as if set forth fully

herein:

1. 2013 California Buikding Code And Appendices I and J;

2. 2013 California Historic Building Code;

3. 2013 California Existing Building Code;

4. 2013 California Residential Code;

5. 2013 California Plumbing Code;

6. 2013 California Electric Code;

7. 2010 California Mechanical Code;

8. 2013California Fire Code And Appendices A-J;

9. 2012 International Property Maintenance Code

ARTICLE 2 - BUILDING CODE

Division 1 —Amendments to the 2013 California Building Code

Section 105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:



105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review: Applications for which no pemnit is issued within
180 days foliowing the date of the application shall expire, and plans and other data
submitted for review shall thereafter be returned to the spplicant or destroyed by the
building official, The building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for
a period not exceeding 180 days on written request by the applicant showing that
circumstances beyond the controt of the applicant have prevented action from being
taken, as long as the extension request has been submitted in writing prior to the

expiration date.

If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90
days may be granted provided the project has not changesd in scope and further provided
that the applicant submits this request in writing and pays the fee required by the City
Master Fee Schedule for ¢ach requested 90-day extension

Exception; Written extensions shall not be required for any project that has been
approved by the City, and the approval contains an express condition stating that
approval from an outside agency is pending at time of expiration. This exception shall
apply only nntil such time as the outside agency approval is granted. Thereafier, the
expiration limitation shall spply.

Section 105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.5 Expiration of Permits: Every permit issued by the building official under the
provisions of the technical codes shall expire and become null and void, if the project
authorized by such permit has not achieved an approval for one of the required
inspections identified in Section 110.3 of the 2010 California Building Code within one

year of such permit.

The bnilding official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 days provided the
applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project has
not changed in scope. If a permit hias not been obtained after the first extension,
additional extensions of 90 days may be pranted provided the project has not changed in
scope and further provided that the applicant submits this request in writing and pays the
fee required by the City Master Fee Schedule for each requested 90-day extension

Before work ¢an commence or recommence under an expired permit, a new permit
application must be submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees for this

new project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and will be subject to the conditions listed
above.

Section 1505.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Real covenings within all fire hazard zeverity zones. Any new roof on a new or
existing structure and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the
total roof area within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or Class “A”

roof.



ARTICLE 3 - RESIDENTIAL CODE
Division 2—Amendments to the California Residential Code

Section R105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review: Applications for which no permit is issued within

180 days following the date of the application shall expire, and plans and cther data
submitted for review may thereafter be returmned to the applicant or destroyed by the
building official. The building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for
a period not exceeding 180 days on written request by fhe applicant showing that
circumstances beyond control of the applicant have prevented action from being taken
and the extension has been submitted in writing prior to the expiration date.

If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90
days may be granted provided the applicant submits this request in writing and pays the
fee required by the City’s Master Fee Schedule for each requested 90-day extension and
the project has not changed in scope.

Exception; If a project has been approved by the City on condition where a pending
approval from an outside agency exists at time of expiration, written extensions will not

be required.

Section R105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R105.5 Expiration of Permits: Every permit issued by the building official under the
provisions of the technical codes shalt expire and become null and void, if the project
authorized by such permit has not achieved an approval for one of the required
inspections identified in section 110.3 of the 2010 Califomia Building Code within one

year of such permit.

The building official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 days provided the
applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project has
not changed in scope. Additional extension requests of 90 days each may be granted by
the building official if the request is made in writing, the project has not changed in
scope, the project has obtained at least one inspection approval and the applicant pays the
fee required by the City’s Master Fee Schedule for each 90-day extension.

Before work can commence or recommence under an expired permit, 2 new permit
application must be submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees applied

for this new project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and witl be subject to the conditions listed
above,

Section R313.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section R313.2 One-and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems: An automatic
residential fire sprinkler system shall be instatied in new one- and two-family dwellings,



or fo which additions, alterations or repairs are made within a one-year period that
involve the removal or replacement to 50 percent or greater of the linear length of walls

of the building (exterior plus interior)

Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.3 Selsmie reinforcing: Concrete footings located in Seismic Design Categories
D@, D1 and D2, as established in Tabie R301.2(1}, shall have minimum reinforcement of
at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller than No. 4 bars. Bottom
reinforcement shall be located a minimam of 3 inches (76 mm) clear from the bottom of

the footing.

In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 where a construction joint is created
between a concrete footing and a stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be
installed at not more than 4 feet (1.2 meters) on center. The vertical bar ghail extend to 3
inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing, hive a standard hook and extend a
mivimum of 14 inches {357 mm) into the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2 where a grouted masonry stem wall is
supported on a congrete footing and stem wall, 2 minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be
installed at not more than 4 feet (1.2 meters) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3
inches (76 mn) <lear of the bottom of the footing and have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2 masonry stem walls without solid grout and
vertical reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings that are three stories or less in
height and constructed with stud bearing walls, isolated plain concrete footings
supporting columns or pedestals are permitted.

Section R9D2.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Roof coverings within all fire hazard severity zones. Any new roof on a new or existing
structute, and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the total roof area
within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or Class “A” roof,

ARTICLE 4 - PLUMBING CODE
Division 3—Amendments to the Califomia Plumbing Code

Section 710.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: .

In every case where the outlet of a trap for a plumbing fixture is installed or located at an
elevation which is less than two feet above the rim of the nearest manhoie uphill from the
point of connection of the building sewer to the public sewer in any new or existing
drainage system, approved types of backwater valve, relief vent and cleanout approved
shall be installed in the buiiding sewer at the point of lowest elevation of the ground
surface of the building site outside of the building or at such other location as is peruitted



by the Building Inspector, providing that at any such location, the elevation of the ground
surface is not less than two below the lowest trap outlet served by the building sewer.

The instaliation shall consisi of an approved fresh air inlet and a Y branch or combination
fitting installed in sequence in the line of flow from the building. The vent from this
fresh air inlet shall be piped to the ground surface and capped with a vent cap. Provision
shall be made by elevation shove the ground or by other means for preventing the
obstruction of the vent opening or the flow of water therein, The ¢leancut shail be placed
as close to the valve as is practical and shall be piped to within one foot of the ground
surface and closed with an approved cleanout plug. Every existing installation which
includes a plumbing fixture trap cutlet which is less than two feet sbove the rim of the
nearest manhole nphill from the point of connection of the building sewer to the public
sewer is hereby declared to be dangerous, unsanitary and a menace to life, health and
property. Whenever it shall come to the attention of the Building Inspector that such an
installation exists, he or she is hereby empowered to order and require that such plumbing
outlet be immediately plugged or capped, or that the equipment described in the
preceding paragraph of this section be installed immediately.

SECTION 3, Section 18.32.010 of the Pacific Grove City Code is herchy
amended by deleting the current Section 18.32.010 in ifs entirety and replacing it with the

text set forth below:

ARTICLE 1~ FIRE CODE

18.32.010 Amendments to the Fire Code
The California Fire Code as adopted under Section 18,32.010 is amended and changed in

respect of the following sections set forth therein;

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title: These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Pacific

Grove.

Section (A) 105.1.2 is amended to read as follows:
{A) 105.1.2 Types of permits. There are two types of pemmnits as follows:

1. Operational permit. Any and all conditions of an operational permit will be
established through a separate Resolution approved by the City Council.

2. Construction permit. A construction permit allows the applicant to install or
modify systems and equipment for which a permit i3 required by Section (A}105.1.1.

Section 109.3 is amended to read as foltows:

109.3 Violation Penalties: Persons who shall violate any provision of this code, fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof , or erect, install, alter, repair, or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or
of a permit or certificate nsed under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of an
infraction, punishable by a fine not more than $500. Bach day that a violation continues



after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. Eaforcement
procedures and remedies set forth in PGMC Chapier 1.19 shall also apply.

Section 202 is amended to add the following definitions:
ALL WEATHER SURFACE. A road surface constructed to the minimum standards

adopted by the jurisdiction.

Section 304 and 305 are amended to read as follows:
Section 304 — Combustible Materials:

Storage and Accumulation of Rubbish and Vegetation

304 Rubbish within Dumpsters: In all rooms or above outside areas, adjacent to
building or underneath roof overhangs or when located nezzer than 10 feet to adjacent
property line, used for storage of combustible waste materials in other than Group R,
Division 3 occupancies shall be protected by automatic sprinkler protection. Such
sprinklers may be connected to the domestic water supply, provided sufficient covezage
of the area is provided and an approved accessible shutoff valve is provided for each

To0M: O Arca.

Exception: (1} Trash areas adjacent 1o solid brick or concrete walls with no openings or
eaves are hot required te be protected by automatic sprinkler systemq(s).

Section 307 is amended to read as follows:
Section 307 — Incinerators, Open Burning and Commercial Barbecue Pits

Open Burning

307 General: Open bumning shall be prohibited including outdoor rubbish fires and
bonfires, unless: 1) the fire is confined to an approved container as defined by the
Uniform Mechanical Code and authorized by the Moaterey Ray Air Pollution Control
District; 2) the open fire is for the explicit purpose of preparation of food, such as in the
case of a luau, barbecue, and the like; or 3) a special condition or circumstance exists and
written authotization is granted by the Fire Chief.

Section 503 is added as follows:
Section 503 — Fire Apparatus Access:

Section 503.2.1 is added as follows:
503.2.1 Dimensions; Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not

less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not legs than 13

feet 6 inches (4115 mm).
BRIDGE. A structure to carry a roadway over a depression or obstacle.

Section 503.2.6.1 is added to read as follows:



503.2.6.1 Private Bridge Engineering: Every private bridge hereafier constructed shall
meet the following engineering requirements:

a. The weight shall be designed for a minimum of HS-20 loading as prescribed by the
AASHTO.

b. The unchstructed vertical clearance shall be not less than 15 feet clear.

¢. The width shall be a minimurn of 20 feet clear. The fire code official may require
additional width when the traffic flow may be restricted or reduce the width to a
minimum of 12 feet for Occupancy Group U or R-3 accupancies.

d. The maximum grade change of the approach to and from any private bridge shall not
exceed 8% for a minimum distance of 10 foet.

Section 503.2.6.2 is added to read as follows:

503.2.6.2 Private Bridge Certification: Every private bridge hereafter constructed shall
be engineered by a licensed professional engineer knowledgeable and experienced in the
engincering and design of bridges. Certiftcation that the bridge complies with the design
standards required by this code and the identified standards, and that the bridge was
constructed to those standards, shall be provided by the licensed engineer, in writing, to
the fire code official. Every private bridge, including existing and those constructed under
this code, shall be certified as to its maximum load limits every 10 years or whenever
deemed neoessary by the fire code official. Such recertification shall be by a licensed
professional engineer knowledgeabte and experienced in the engineering and design of
bridges. All fees or costs necessary and appropriate for the purpose of certification or
recertification of private bridges shall be at the owner's expense.

Section 503.2.7 is amended to read as foliows:
503.2.7 Grade: The grade of fire apparatus acoess roads shall be no greater than 15%

unless specifically approved by the fire code official.

Section 503.2.7.1 is added to read as foltows:

503.2.7.1 Paving: All fire apparatus access roads over 8% shall be paved with a
minimum 0.17 feet of asphaltic concrete on 0.34 feet of aggregate base, All fire apparatus
access roads over 15% where approved shall be paved with perpendicularly grooved

concrete.

Section 505 is added to read as follows:
Section 505 — Premises Identification:

505.1 Address Identiflcation: New buildings shall have approved address numbers,

building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly
legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These nurnbers shall be
Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shail be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6



mm) high with a minimumn stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Where access is by
means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a
monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Large
complexes or multiple buildings shall have their address posted so that it is visible from

the street.

Section 506.] is amended to read as follows: .

306.1 Where Regnired: Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted
because of seoured openiings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or
fire-fighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized to required a key box or other
approved emergency access device to be installed in an approved location. The key box
or other approved emergency access device shall be of an approved type and shall contain
keys or other information to gain necessary access as required by the fire code officiat.

Section 507.5.2 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.2 Inspection, Testing and Maintenance: Fire hydrant systems shall be subject to
periodic tests as required by the fire code official. Fire hydrant systems shall be
maintained in an operative condition at all times and shall be repaired where defective.
Additions, repairs, alterations and servicing shall comply with approved standards. When
required by the fire code official, hydrants shall be painted in accordance with the most

current edition of NFPA 291.

Section 603.6.6 is added to read as foilows:
603.6.6 Spark Arresters: An approved spark arrester shall be installed on all chimneys,

in¢inerators, smokestacks or similar devices for conveying smoke or hot gases to the
outer air.

Section 901.1.1 is added to read as follows:
901.1.1 Responsibility: The owner of the protected premises shall be responsible for all
fire protection systems within the protected premises, whether existing or installed under

this code.

Section 901.4 is amended to read as follows:

901.4 Installation: Fire protection systems shall be maintained in accordance with the
original installation standards for that system. All systems shall be extended, altered, or
augmented as necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever the building is
altered, remodeled or added to. Alterations to the fire protection systems shall be done in

accordance with applicable standards.

Section 901.4.5 is added to read as follows:
901.4.5 Nomoperational Equipment: Any fire protection equipment that is no Jonger in

service shall be removed.,

Section 901.7 is added to read as follows:
501.7 Systems out of Service: Where a required fire protection system is out of service,
the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately and, where



required by the fire code official, the building shall either be evacuated or an approved
fire watch shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected by the shutdown until the

fire protection system has been returned to service.

Section 903 is amended to read as follows:
Section 903 — Fire Sprinkiers:

Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:
903.2 Where Required: Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in all
new buildings and structures constructed, movea into or relocated within the jurisdiction.

Exceptions:
{1) Structures not classified as Group R occupancics and not more than 500 square

feet in totat floor area,

(2)  Detached Group U occupancies (private garages, carports, sheds, and
agriculture buildings)

The following sections are amended by changing requiremeats to 500 square feet for fire
sprinkier installation, as follows (the complete text of the section is not provided):

903.2.1.1 Group A-1, Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square fect.
903.2.1.2 Group A-2. Change 5,000 square feet to 500 square feet.
903.2.1.3 Group A-3. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.
$03.2.1.4 Group A-4. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.
903.2.1.5 Group A-5. Change l,ﬂOU square feet to 500 square feet.

©03.2.3 Group E. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.4 Group P-1. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet. Change 2,500 square
feet for woodworking operations to 500 square feet.

903.2.7-1 Group M. Change 12,000 square fect to 500 square feet.

903.2.7-3 Group M. Change 24,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.9 Group S-1. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet,

903.2.9.1 Repair Garages. Change 10,000 square feet (2 story buildings) and 12,000
square feet (1 story buildings) to 500 square feet.

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Change 20,000 cubic feet to 500 square fect.

Section 903.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R: An automatic sprinkler system instalted in accordance with Section
903.3 shall be provided in all buildings with a Group R fire area, including, but not
limited to, one-and two-family dwellings, town homes, and manufactured homes and
mobile homes located outside of licensed mobile home parks hereafter constructed,
moved into or relocated within the jurisdiction, including all additions to buildings



already equipped with automatic fire sprinkler systems.

Section 903.2.20 shall be added as follows:

903.2.20 Change of use; Automatic fire sprinklers shall be instalied when the occupancy
changes from a single occupancy to a mixed-use occupancy which would require the
installation of an occupancy separation, or when the occupancy changes from any type of

occupancy to Assembly use occupancy,

Section 903.3.1.1.2 is added to read as follows:
903.3.1.1.2 Elevators: Automatic fire sprinklers shall not be installed at the top of

passenger elevator hoist ways or In the associated passenger elevator mechanical rooms.

903.3.1.1.2.1 Where auiomatic fire sprinklers are not instailed at the top of passenger
elevator hoist ways, heat detectors for the shunt trip mechanism shall not be installed, nor

shall smoke detectors for elevator recall be installed.

903.3.1.1.2.2 Where automatic fire sprinklers are not installed in associated elevator
mechanical rooms, heat detectors for the shunt trip mechanism shall not be installed. A

smoke detector shall be instatled for elevator recall.

Section 903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:
503.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems: Where allowed, automatic sprinkler systems
instalted in one-and two-family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance

with NFPA 13D.

903.3.1 .3.1 All fire sprinkler systems installed in one-and two-family dwellings shall
be tested for leakage by undergoing a hydrostatic test made at 200 psi for two-hour

duration.

903.3.1.3.2 Each water system supplying both domestic and fire protection systems
shall have a single indicating-type control valve, arranged to shut off both the domestic
and sprinkler systems. A separate shut-off valve for the domestic system only shall be
permitted to be installed. The location of the contrel valve shall be approved by the fire

code official.

903.3.1.3.6 Local water flow alarms shall be provided on all sprinkler systems, Local
water flow alarms shall be powered from the main kitchen refrigerator circuit. The local
water flow alarm shall be clearly audible from within the master bedroom at an audibility
levet of not less than 75 dBa, Where no kitchen exists in the building, the water flow
alarm shall be powered from the bathroom lighting circuit. -

Section 903.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

993.4.1 Monitoring: Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different
and shall be automatically transmitted to an approved central station, remote supervising
station or proprietary supervising station as defined in NFPA 72-2010, or, when approved
by the fire code official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended location.



[Note: Exceptions remain unchanged.]

Section 903.4.2 is amended to read as follows:
903.4.2 Alarms: One exterior approved audible devicea shall be connected to every

automatic sprinkler system in an approved location. Such sprinkler water flow alarm
devices shatl be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the
smaliest orifice size installed in the system. Where a building fire alarm system is
installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm

system.

Section 903.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.4.3 Fleor Control Yalves: Approved indicating control valves and water flow
switches shall be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in all
buildings over one story in height, and shall be individually annunciated as approved by

the fire code official.
Section 903.6 is amended to read as follows:

903.6 Repairs, Alterations, and Additions: In all buildings, except where otherwise
provided herein in this Section, where the total floor area exceeds 5,000 square feet, or
which are 40 feet or more in height or which are three or more stories in height, they shail

be made to comply with the provisions of this Section.

In all buildings where the total ficor area exceeds 5,000 square feet, or which are 40 feet
or more in height, or which are three or more stories in height, if the repairs or alterations
are made excesding twenty-five percent of the current market value of the building and
property as shown in the records of the County Assessor within any 360-day period shall

be made to comply with the provisions of this section.

Definitions
Repair: It is the reconstruction or renewal of any part of an existing building or structure

for the purpose of its maintenance.

Alteration: It is any change, addition, or modification in construction or occupancy.

Exception: Projects where the sole purpose is for seismic upgrade,

Existing Group R, Division 3 buildings to which additions, alterations, or repairs are
made that invofve the removal or replacement to 50 percent or greater of the linear length
of wallz of the building {exterior plus interior) within 2 one-year period shall meet the
requirements of new construction or this code.

Section 904.11 is added to existing section. _
904.11 Non-Conforming Restaursnt Cocking Appliances and Five Extinguishing
Systems: All non-conforming restavrant cooking appliances, hood and duct systems, and



fire extinguishing systems found to exist as of the effective date of this Ordinance shafl
be made to conform to the requirements of this Section within 90 days of notification, It
shall thereafter be unlawful for any person to maintain or suffer {0 be maintained any
non-conforming restaurant cooking appliance, hood and duct system or fire extinguishing
system on any properfy owned or controlled by said person within the City of Pacific

Grove.

Section 907.7.4 is added to read as follows:
907.7.4 Zone Transmittal: Where required by the fire code official, fire alarm signals
shall be transmitted by zone to the supervising station and retransmitted by zone to the

public fire service communications center.

Section 907.8.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.8.2 Completion Documents: The following documentation shail be provided at the
time of acceptance testing for all fire alanm system installations:

1. A record of completion in accordance with NFPA 72.

2. A coniractor's statement verifying that the system has been installed in accordance
with the approved plans and specifications, and has been 100% tested in accordance with
NFPA 72,

3. A contractor's affidavit of personnel qualifications, indicating that all personnel
involved with the installation of the fire alarm systetn meet the qualification requirements

of the fire code official,

Section 907,13 is amended to read as follows:
907.13 Access: Access shall be provided to each fire alarm system component for

periodic inspection, maintenance and testing.
Section 5704.2.9.6.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 Outdoor Storage of Comtainers and Portable Tanks. Storage
of Class 1 and Class IT liguids ir aboveground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited within the limits established by law as the Limits of districts in which
such storage is prohibited except as permitted by the Zoning Ondinance.

Bxceptions:
1. For marine fueling operations, a maximum of 2000 gallons of diesel fuel

may be stored and dispensed from an above ground tank as approved by
the Fire Chief.

2. Storage tanks of 500 gallon maximum capagity may be used only in
conjunction with emergency generators 2s approved by the Fire Chief.

Section 4907.1.1 is added to read as follows:

4907.1.1 Standard Defensible Space Requirements: (FIRE 019} Remove
combustible vegetation from within 3 minitoum of 100 feet or to the property line
from structures, whichever is closer. Vegetation shall be no taller than four



inches (4"} high. Limb trees 6 feet up from ground. Remove limbs within 10 feet
of chimneys. Additional or alternate fire protection approved by the fire code
official may be required to provide reasonable fire safety. Environmentally
sensitive areas may require alternative fire protection, to be determined by the
fire code official and other jurisdictional authorities.

SECTION 4. Chapter 18.42 is repealed.

SECTION 5. If any provision, section, paragraph, sentence, clanse, or phrase of
this ordinance, or any part thereof, or the application thereof to any person or
circumstance is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this Ordinance, or any part thereof, or its application to other persons or
circumstances. The City Council hereby declares that it would have passed and adopted
each provision, section, paragraph, subparagraph, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof,
itrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, paragtaphs, subparagraphs,
sentences, clanses, or phrases, or the application thereef fo any person or circumstance,

be declared invalid or unconstitutions!.
SECTION 6. This Ordinance shall take effect on January 1, 2014.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PACIFIC
GROVE this 6™ day of November, 2013, by the following vote:

AYES; Mayor Kampe & Councilmembers Cohen, Cuneo, Fischer, Huitt, & Miller

NOES: None

ABSENT: Councilmember Lucius
APPROVED:

BILL KAMPE, Mayor ‘
ATTEST: -

DAVID COWION, City Clerk

APPR D AS TO FORM:

L

C. LAREDO, City Atiorney




