
 
BSC 1 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

 EXPRESS TERMS 
 FOR 

PROPOSED BUILDING STANDARDS 
OF THE 

 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION 
 
REGARDING THE ADOPTION OF AMENDMENTS TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 

(IBC) FOR USE AS  
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (CBC), CHAPTERS 16, 18, 19, 23 , 31 & 34 

 TITLE 24, PART 2, CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS (CCR) 
 

 
LEGEND FOR EXPRESS TERMS 

1. Existing California amendments or code language being modified, as well as selected terms set forth 
in Chapter 2, Definitions are in italics when they appear in the model code text, independent of state 
amended definitions: All such language appears in italics, modified language is underlined.  

2. New California amendments:  All such language appears underlined and in italics. 
3. Repealed text:  All such language appears in strikeout. 

 
 

CHAPTER 1 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below  

X  

1.2.1.1 X  
1.2.1.2 w/ Exceptions X  
 

 
AMENDMENTS: 

 
 

CHAPTER 1 

CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION 

DIVISION I 

 
1.1.0 General… 
 
 

SECTION 1.2 
BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION 

 
1.2.1 Specific scope of application of the agency responsible for enforcement, the enforcement agency and the 
specific authority to adopt and enforce such provisions of this code, unless otherwise stated. 
 

1. State buildings for all occupancies. 
 
Application – State buildings (all occupancies), including buildings constructed by the Trustees of the 
California State University and the Regents of the University of California where no state agency has the 
authority to adopt building standards applicable to such buildings. 
Enforcing agency – State of local agency specified by the applicable provisions of law. 
Authority cited – Health and Safety Code Section 18934.6. 



 
BSC 2 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

Reference – Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.5, commencing with Section 18901. 
 

2. University of California, California State Universities and California Community Colleges. 
 
Application – Standards for lighting for parking lots and primary campus walkways at the University of 
California, California State Universities and California Community Colleges. 
Enforcing agency – State of local agency specified by the applicable provisions of law. 
Authority cited – Government  Code Section 14617. 
Reference – Government  Code Section 14617. 

 
3. Existing state-owned buildings, including those owned by the University of California and by the 

California State University. 
 

Application – Building seismic retrofit standards including abating falling hazards of structural and 
nonstructural components and strengthening of building structures. See also Division of the State 
Architect. 
 Enforcing agency – State of local agency specified by the applicable provisions of law. 
Authority cited – Health and Safety Code Section 16600. 
Reference – Health and Safety Code Section 16600 through 16604. 

 
4. Unreinforced masonry-bearing wall buildings. 
 

Application – Minimum seismic strengthening standards for building specified in Appendix Chapter A1 
of the California Existing Building Code, except for buildings subject to building standards adopted 
pursuant to Health and Safety Code (commencing) with Section 17910. 
Enforcing agency - State of local agency specified by the applicable provisions of law. 
Authority cited - Health and Safety Code Section 18934.6. 
Reference – Health and Safety Code Sections 18901 through 18949. 

 
1.2.1.1 State building. For purposes of this code, a “state building” is a building for which a state agency has 
authority to construct, alter, enlarge, replace, repair, equip, use or demolish. 

 
1.2.1.2 Enforcement. [For CSU, UC, Judicial Courts, and CDCR] State entities authorized to control state 
buildings shall appoint a Building Official who is responsible to the agency for enforcement of the provisions of 
the California Building Standards Code to all its actions. The objectives, duties, functions and responsibilities of 
the Building Official are described in Division 2 of this chapter.  

  
 Exceptions: 
 

1. A state entity shall not be required to appoint a Building Official if, by interagency agreement or other legal 
means, another state entity, having a Building Official, is assigned the responsibility and authority of Building 
Official for all other entity’s buildings and structures. 

 
2. State buildings regulated by other sections of this code remain the enforcement responsibility of the 
designated entities.  

 
1.2.2 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. The provisions of this code are 
not intended to prevent the installation of any... 
 

1.2.2.1 Research reports. Supporting data, where necessary to assist… 
 
1.2.2.2 Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence… 

 
. . . 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §18934.5 
 
 
 

 



 
BSC 3 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

CHAPTERS 16 
STRUCTURAL DESIGN  

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

X  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

1613.1.2 w/ Exception X  
1613.3.1 X  
1613.6.3 X  
 
AMENDMENTS: 

 
 
1612.5 Flood hazard documentation. The following documentation shall be prepared and sealed by a registered design 
professional and submitted to the building official: 
 

1. For construction in flood hazard areas not subject to high-velocity wave action: 
 

1.1. The elevation of the lowest floor, including the basement, as required by the lowest floor elevation inspection 
in Section 109.3.3 1.9.3.3, Appendix Chapter 1, Division I. . . . 

 
2. For construction in flood hazard areas subject to high-velocity wave action: 

 
2.1. The elevation of the bottom of the lowest horizontal structural member as required by the lowest floor 

elevation inspection in Section 109.3.3 1.9.3.3, Appendix Chapter 1, Division I. . . . 
 

1613.1 Scope. Every structure, and portion thereof,… 
 
1613.1.1 Scope. [SL] For applications listed in… 
 
1613.1.2. State-owned structures. State-owned structures, including those of the University, shall not be constructed 
where any portion of the foundation would be within a mapped area of earthquake-induced liquefaction of landsliding or 
within 50 feet of a mapped fault rupture hazard as established by Section 1802.7 
 Exception: Buildings that would satisfy the requirements of Sections 3415.4.1 and 3415.4.2. 
 
1613.3 Existing buildings.  Additions, alterations, repairs, or change of occupancy of existing buildings shall be in 
accordance with Sections 3403.2.3 and 3406.4. 
 

1613.3.1 Existing state buildings.  Additions, alterations, reparis, or change of occupancy category of existing 
buildings shall be in accordance with Chapter 34. 
 

1613.6.Alternatives to ASCE 7.  The provisions of Section 1613.6 shall be permitted as alternatives to the relevant 
provisions of ASCE 7. 
 
. . . 
 
1613.6.9 Exceptions for nonstructural components. Replace items 4 and 5 of ASCE 7 Section 13.1.3 by the following 
items. 
 4. Mechanical and electrical components in Seismic Design Categories D, E or F where all of the following apply: 
  a. The component importance factor, Ip, is equal to 1.0; 
  b. The component is positively attached to the structure; 

c. Flexible connections are provided between the component and associated ductwork, piping, and 
conduit; and either: 



 
BSC 4 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

I The component weights 400 lb (1780 N) or less and has a center of mass located 4 ft. (1.22 
m) or less above adjacent floor level. 
Ii The component weights 20 lb (89 N) or less, or, in the case of a distributed system, 5 ib/ft 
(73N/m) or less. 

 
. . . 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 

 
CHAPTERS 18 

SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS  
 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

X  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

1803.5.12.1 X  
 
AMENDMENTS: 
 

1803.5.12 Seismic Design Categories D through F. For structures assigned to… 
 
1803.5.12.1 Site hazard determination for state-owned structures. For state-owned structures, including 
those of the University of California and the California State University, site hazards shall be evaluated if any 
portion of the building footprint would be within the zone of potential active faulting, or earthquake-induced 
landsliding, or liquefaction susceptibility as published by the California Geological Survey or by another body that 
could regulate the building if it was under their authority. Site hazards shall be documented in a report that meets 
the requirements of Section 1803.6. 
 

 
. . . 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 

 
CHAPTERS 19 

CONCRETE 
 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

X  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  



 
BSC 5 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

1908.1.2 X Add Item (h) 
1908.1.3 X Add new §21.4.5 and renumber remaining §§ 
1908.1.9.1 X  
 
AMENDMENTS: 
 

1908.1.2 ACI 318, Section 21.1.1 Modify ACI 318 Section . . . 
 
21.1.1.7 - Structural systems designated as part of the seismic-force-resisting system shall be restricted to 

those permitted by ASCE 7. . . . 
 
. . . 
 

(h) In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, concrete tilt-up wall panels which exceed the limitations of 
intermediate precast structural wall system shall satisfy 21.9 in addition to 21.4.2. and 21.4.3. . . . 

 
1908.1.3 ACI 318, Section 21.4. Modify ACI, Section 21.4, by renumbering Section 21.4.3 to become 21.4.4 and 
adding new Sections 21.4.3, 21.4.5, and 21.4.6 and 21.4.7 to read as follows: 

 
. . . 

 
21.4.5 – Wall piers in Seismic Design Category D, E or F shall comply with Section 1908.1.4 of the Code. 
 
21.4.5. 6 – Wall piers not designed as part of a moment frame in SDC C shall have transverse reinforcement 
designed to resist the shear forces determined from 21.3.3.  Spacing of transverse reinforcement  . . . 
 
21.4.6 7 – Wall segments with a horizontal length-to-thickness ratio less than 2.5 shall be designed as 
columns. 
 
. . . 
 
1908.1.9.1 ACI 318, Section D3.3.  Modify ACI 318, Section D3.3.1 and add Section D.3.3.7 to read as 
follows: 

 
D3.3.1 – The provisions of Appendix D do not apply to the design of anchors in plastic hinge zones of 
concrete structures under earthquake forces or anchors defined in Section D3.3.7. 
D3.3.7 – For anchors of wood sill plates with nominal diameters not exceeding 5/8 in. (15.9 mm) with 
embedment of 7 in. (178 mm) or greater, located a minimum of 2.5d from edge of concrete and 15d from 
end of concrete, design strength in shear parallel to edge of concrete shall be permitted to be 
determined in accordance with Section 2305. 

 
 

CHAPTERS 21, 22 
 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

X  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 



 
BSC 6 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

 
 

CHAPTER 23 
WOOD 

 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

X  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

2305.1.2 X  
 
 
AMENDMENTS: 
 
 

2305.1.2 Sill plate anchor bolts.  As specified in Section 1908.1.9.1 modifications to ACI 318 Section D3.3, the design 
strength in shear parallel to the edge of a concrete slab or footing for sill plate anchor bolts not exceeding 5/8 in. (15.9 mm) 
nominal diameter, having a minimum embedment of 7 in. (178 mm), located a minimum of 15d from the end of the 
concrete, is permitted to be determined using the lateral design value for the bolt attaching a wood sill plate to concrete, as 
specified in AF& PA NDS Table 11E. 

 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 

CHAPTERS 24, 25, 26  
 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapters without 
amendments 

X Editorial reference change for Chapter 1 in Chapter 25 

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
EDITORIAL AMENDMENT: 
 
2503.1 Inspection. Lath and gypsum board shall be inspected in accordance with Section 109.3.5 1.9.3.5, Appendix 
Chapter 1, Division I. 
 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 

CHAPTER 27 
ELECTRICAL 

 



 
BSC 7 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
Refer to California Electrical Code, Title 24, Part 3 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 

CHAPTER 28 
MECHANICAL SYSTEMS 

 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
Refer to California Mechanical Code, Title 24, Part 4 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 

CHAPTER 29 
PLUMBING SYSTEMS 

 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
Refer to California Plumbing Code, Title 24, Part 5 
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 



 
BSC 8 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

 
 

CHAPTER 30 
ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS 

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

X  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 

CHAPTER 31 
SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION 

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter as amended below: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

X  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

3108.1 X Modify for resistance to seismic loads 
3109.4.4 X Move existing amendment forward to the 2010 CBC 
   
 
 
AMENDMENTS: 
 
3108.1 General.  Towers shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the provisions of TIA-222.  Towers 
shall be designed for seismic loads; exceptions related to seismic design listed in TIA Section 2.7.3 shall not apply. 
 
. . . 
 
3109.4.4 Private swimming pools (statewide).  These regulations are subject to local government… 
 3109.4.4.1 Definitions. As used in this division, the following terms… 

3109.4.4.2 Construction permit; safety features required. Commencing January 1, 2007, except as 
provided in Section 3109.4.4.5… 
3109.4.4.3 Enclosure; required characteristics. An enclosure shall have all of the … 
3109.4.4.4 Agreements to build; notice of provisions. Any person entering into an agreement… 
3109.4.4.5 Exempt facilities. The requirements of this article shall not… 
3109.4.4.6 Application to facilities regulated by the Department of Social Services. This division does 
not apply to any… 
3109.4.4.7 Modifications and interpretation of division. Notwithstanding any other provision of law… 
3109.4.4.8 Construction requirements for building a pool or spa. Whenever a building permit is issued… 



 
BSC 9 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

 
 

 
CHAPTER 31A 

 SYSTEMS FOR WINDOW CLEANING OR EXTERIOR BUILDING MAINTENANCE 
 

See Title 8, California Code of Regulations, Division 1, Chapter 4, Subchapter 7, General Industry Safety Orders, Group 1, 
Articles 5 and 6. 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 
 
 

CHAPTER 32 
ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY 

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

X  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 

 
 
 

CHAPTER 33 
SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION 

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter unamended: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

X  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 

 
 

CHAPTER 34 
EXISTING STRUCTURES 



 
BSC 10 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter as amended below: 
 
Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

X  

3401 X  
3401.1.1 X  
3401.6 X  
3402 X  
3403 X  
3403.1 Except. X Add existing section 3403.2 from the 07 CBC as 

exception to 3403.1 
3403.2 Except.  X  
3404 X  
3404.1 Except. X Add existing section 3403.2 from the 07 CBC as 

exception to 3404.1 
3405 X  
3405.1 Except. X Add existing section 3403.2 from the 07 CBC as 

exception to 3405.1 
3406 X  
3408 X  
3415 X Modify §3415.4 and its subsections 
3416 X Delete definition of “Dangerous Conditions”, adopt 

model code definition in 3402 
3417 X Modify §§3417.2, 3417.12 and 3417.12.1 
3418 X  
3419 X  
3420 X  
 
AMENDMENTS: 
 
3401.6 Dangerous conditions.  The building official shall have the authority to require the elimination of conditions 
deemed dangerous. 
 
 

SECTION 3403 
ADDITIONS 

 
3403.1 General. Additions to any building or structure shall comply with the requirements of this code for new 
construction. Alterations to the existing building or structure shall be made to ensure that the existing building or 
structure together with the addition are no less conforming with the provisions of this code than the existing building or 
structure was prior to the addition. An existing building together with its additions shall comply with the height and 
area provisions of Chapter 5. 
 

Exception: (relocated from 2007 CBC Section 3403.2) For state-owned buildings, including those owned by 
the University of California and the California State University, the requirements of Section 3403.2 Sections 
3403.3 and 3403.4 are replaced by the requirements of Sections 3415 through 3420. 

 
 

SECTION 3404 
ALTERATIONS 

 



 
BSC 11 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

3404.1 General. Except as provided by Section 3401.4 or this section, alterations to any building or structure shall 
comply with the requirements of the code for new construction. Alterations shall be such that the existing building or 
structure is no less complying with the provisions of this code than the existing building or structure was prior to the 
alteration. 
 

Exceptions: 
1. An existing stairway shall not be required to comply with the requirements of Section 1009 where the 
existing space and construction does not allow a reduction in pitch or slope. 
2. Handrails otherwise required to comply with Section 1009.12 shall not be required to comply with the 
requirements of Section 1012.6 regarding full extension of the handrails where such extensions would be 
hazardous due to plan configuration. 
3. (relocated from 2007 CBC Section 3403.2) For state-owned buildings, including those owned by the 
University of California and the California State University, the requirements of Section 3403.2 Sections 
3404.3 through 3404.5 are replaced by the requirements of Sections 3415 through 3420. 

 
 

SECTION 3405 
REPAIRS 

 
3405.1 General. Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be repaired in compliance with Section 3401.2. 
Work on nondamaged components that is necessary for the required repair of damaged components shall be 
considered part of the repair and shall not be subject to the requirements for alterations in this chapter. Routine 
maintenance required by Section 3401.2, ordinary repairs exempt from permit in accordance with Section 105.2, and 
abatement of wear due to normal service conditions shall not be subject to the requirements for repairs in this section. 

 
Exception: (relocated from 2007 CBC Section 3403.2) For state-owned buildings, including those owned by 
the University of California and the California State University, the requirements of Section 3403.2 Sections 
3405.2 through 3405.4 are replaced by the requirements of Sections 3415 through 3420. 
 

3405.1.1 Dangerous conditions. Regardless of the extent of structural or nonstructural damage, the building 
code official shall have the authority to require the elimination of conditions deemed dangerous. 

 
3415.4 Evaluation required.  If the criteria in Section 3415.3 apply to the project under consideration, the design 
professional of record shall provide an evaluation in accordance with Section 3415 to determine the seismic 
performance of the building in its current configuration and condition. . . . 
 

3415.4.1 Site hazard study.  If a portion of the foundation is within a zone of potential active faulting, 
earthquake-induced landsliding, or liquefaction susceptibility, as published by the California Geological Survey, 
then a site hazard study shall establish that the structure can sustain the effects of liquefaction, landslide, or fault 
displacement corresponding to the Level 2 performance criteria of Table 3415.5.  Fault displacement demands 
shall be permitted to be taken as the median horizontal and vertical displacements corresponding to or having the 
same annual probability of exceedance as the hazard specified with the Level 2 performance criteria of Table 
3415.5. 
 

Exception:  Fault displacement need not be considered when no portion of the foundation is with 50 feet of 
a splay of an active fault. 

 
3415.4.2 Site hazard study report.  The site hazard study shall be documented in a report that meets the 
requirements of Section 1802.7. 

 
Exceptions: 
 
1) A new site hazard study report shall not be required if a previous geotechnical, geologic, and/or site 

hazard investigation report has evaluated the relevant hazards and if the previous report is approved as 
current. 

2) A new site hazard study report shall not be required where the structure and foundation are shown to 
satisfy the performance criteria of Section 3415.5.  Application of this exception requires peer review per 
Section 3420. 

 
3416.1.   For the purposes of this chapter, certain terms are defined as follows: 
 
. . . 
 



 
BSC 12 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

DANGEROUS CONDITION Any building or structure or any individual component with any of the structural conditions 
or defects described below shall be deemed dangerous: 

1. The load action in a component due to all factored dead and live loads is more than one and one-third the 
nominal strength permitted by this code. Where vertical load bearing walls, columns, or other vertical load 
bearing elements or components list, lean, or are otherwise laterally deformed, the resulting vertical load 
times lateral deformation (P-Delta) effect shall be considered in the evaluation of the load action. 

2. Any portion, structural or non-structural component of the building or structure, or any appurtenance within 
the structure damaged to the extent that it could potentially fail, detach, or dislodge, or collapse under normal 
operational conditions or loading and thereby cause a health and safety hazard. 

3. Any portion of a building, structural or non-structural component, appurtenance, or ornamentation on the 
exterior thereof with insufficient strength or stability, or attachment to resist lateral loading equal to two-thirds 
of that specified in Section 3417. 

4. The building, or any portion thereof, is likely to collapse partially or completely due to damages caused by 
fire, earthquake, wind, or flood; or any other similar cause. 

 
. . . 
 
3417.2 Existing Conditions.  The existing condition and properties of the entire structure must be determined and 
documented by thorough inspection of the structure and site, review of all available related construction documents, 
review of geotechnical and engineering geologic reports, and performance of necessary testing and investigations. . . . 
 

These requirements shall be met following the data collection requirements of ASCE 41 Section 2.2 and shall be 
implemented as follows: 

1. For state-owned buildings, the “Usual” level as defined in requirements shall be met following the data 
collection requirements of ASCE 41, Section 2.2.6.2. 

 
. . . 
 
3417.12 Voluntary modifications to the lateral-force resisting system. Where modifications of existing structural 
components and additions of new structural components are initiated for the purpose of improving the lateral-force 
resisting strength or stiffness of an existing structure and they are not required by other sections of this code, then 
they are permitted to be designed to meet an approved seismic performance criteria provided that an engineering 
analysis is submitted that shows: 
 
. . . 
 

5.  A dangerous condition as defined in Section 3416 does not exist is not created. 
 

3417.12.1 State-owned buildings.  Voluntary modifications to lateral-force-resisting systems conducted in 
accordance with Appendix A of the IEBC and the referenced standards of this code shall be permitted. 
 

3417.12.1.1 Design documents.  When Section 3417.12 is the basis for structural modifications, the 
approved design documents must clearly state the scope of the seismic modifications and the acceptance 
criteria for the design.  The approved design documents must clearly have the phrase “The seismic 
requirements of Chapter 34 for existing buildings have not been met by checked to determine if these 
structural modifications meet CBC requirements; the modifications proposed are to a lesser different seismic 
performance standard that would be required in Section 3417 if they were not voluntary as allowed in 
Section 3417.12.”  

 
 
Notation 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 
 

 
CHAPTER 35 

REFERENCED STANDARDS 
 
Adopt and/or codify entire chapter as amended below: 
 



 
BSC 13 8-11-09 
Express Terms 2009 IBC 

Adopting Agency BSC COMMENTS 

Adopt Entire Chapter without 
amendments 

X  

Adopt Entire Chapter as 
amended (amended sections 
listed below) 

  

Adopt Only those sections that 
are listed below 

  

   
 
 
This chapter lists the standards that are referenced in various sections of this document. The standards are listed herein 
by the promulgating agency of the standard, the standard identification, the effective date and title, and the section or 
sections of this document that reference the standard. The application of the referenced standards shall be as specified in 
Section 102.4 1.2.4, Appendix Chapter 1, Division I.  
 
. . . 
 
 
Notation: 
Authority:  Health and Safety Code §18928 & 18934.5 
References:  Health and Safety Code §§18928, 18928.1, & 18934.5 


