COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX TITLE (CODE)
AGENCY: DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT [06/12] CCR, TITLE 24, PART 2 (2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE)
LEGEND:
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s Actions: Amendments, if indicated by agency:
(CAC)s: A = Accepted S = Statutory
ACCESS = Accessibility AA = Approve as amended E = Existing
BFO = Building, Fire & Other AS = Approve as submitted N = New
HF = Health Facilities D = Disapprove Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action):
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy FS =Further Study GREEN = uncontested items
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces WI/D = Withdrawn by agency YELLOW = challenged items

GB = Green Building

BFO/SDLF COMMITTEE (HCD)

ITEM 1 - CHAPTER 1, DIVISION 1, SECTION 1.1.1
Adopt amendments listed below

SALMON = W/D, no action required

Type of . REETEY CBSC
CAC: Re- ;
alliEns (AS, | sponse 45-Day Comments GO
[tem Number Code Section ment AA. | to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations (AS,
(S,E AA, D,
N) D,FS) | (A D, FS)
WID)
HCD 6/12-1-1 111 E AS Editorial
ITEM 2 - CHAPTER 1, DIVISION Il
Adopt Chapter 1, Sections listed below
e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section arrgg:?- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAEg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-2-1 105.2 “Building: 1-13” only E AS
HCD 6/12-2-2 107.1,107.2.1, 107.2.4, E AS
107.2.5
HCD 6/12-2-3 110.3.1, 110.3.2, 110.3.3, E AS
110.3.4, 110.3.5, 110.3.6,
110.3.8,110.3.9 and
110.3.10
HCD 06/12 1of16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 3 - CHAPTER 1, DIVISION I

Adopt Chapter 1, Amend sections listed below

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
. amend- (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments . AE
[tem Number Code Section gerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-3-1 1103.4.1 N AS Add language
HCD 6/12-3-2 110.3.10.1.2 N AS Add language
ITEM 4 — CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt amendments listed below
e CAC: Agency CB.SC
item Numb Code Secti amen?- (AS, Response 45-Day Comments Annotati AcAtg)n
em Number ode Section (rgeré AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) nnotations A(A D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-4-1 201.3 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-4-2 202 ACCESSIBILITY E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-3 202 ACCESSIBLE E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-4 202 APPROVED E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-5 202 AUTOMATIC DOOR E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-6 202 CELLULAR E AS Amend Definition
CONCRETE
HCD 6/12-4-7 202 CONCRETE E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-8 202 CIRCULATION PATH E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-9 202 COMMON USE E AS Amend Definition
AREAS
HCD 6/12-4-10 | 202 CROSS SLOPE E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-11 | 202 CURB CUT E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-12 | 202 CURB RAMP E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-13 | 202 DETACHED SINGLE- E AS Amend Definition
FAMILY EWELLING
HCD 6/12-4-14 | 202 DETECTABLE E AS Amend Definition
WARNING
HCD 6/12-4-15 | 202 DWELLING UNIT E AS Amend Definition
HCD 6/12-4-16 | 202 EQUIVALENT E AS Amend Definition
FACILITATION

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

2 0of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




HCD 6/12-4-17 | 202 FACILITY (OR E AS Amend Definition
FACILITIES)

HCD 6/12-4-18 | 202 GRAB BAR E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-19 | 202 IMPACT E AS Remove Definition
INSULATION-CLASS

HCD 6/12-4-20 | 202 INTERNATIONAL E AS Amend Definition
SYMBOL OF
ACCESSIBLITY

HCD 6/12-4-21 | 202 KICK PLATE E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-22 | 202 LEVEL AREA E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-23 | 202 LIFT, PLATFORM E AS Amend Definition
(WHEELCHAIR)

HCD 6/12-4-24 | 202 MARKED CROSSING E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-25 | 202 NOSING (OR NOSE) E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-26 | 202 OPEN RISER E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-27 | 202 PASSAGE DOOR E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-28 | 202 PEDESTRIAN E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-29 | 202 PEDESTRIAN RAMP E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-30 | 202 PEDESTRIAN WAY E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-31 202 PLATFORM E AS Amend Definition
(WHEELCHAIR) LIFT

HCD 6/12-4-32 | 202 PUBLIC ENTRANCE E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-33 | 202 PUBLIC-USE AREAS E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-34 | 202 PUBLICLY FUNDED E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-35 | 202 RAMP E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-36 | 202 RESTRICTED E AS Amend Definition
ENTRANCE

HCD 6/12-4-37 | 202 RISER E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-38 | 202 SANITARY FACILITY E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-39 | 202 SERVICE E AS Amend Definition
ENTRANCE

HCD 6/12-4-40 | 202 SHOPPING-GENTER E AS Remove Definition
{OR SHOPPING-MALL)

HCD 6/12-4-41 | 202 SIDEWALK E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-42 202 SITE E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-43 | 202 SLEEPING E AS Amend Definition
ACCOMMODATIONS

HCD 6/12-4-44 | 202 SOUND E AS Remove Definition
TRANSMISSION
CLASS{STC

HCD 6/12-4-45 | 202 TRANSIENT E AS Amend Definition
LODGING

HCD 06/12 30f 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




HCD 6/12-4-46 202 TREAD E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-47 202 WALK E AS Amend Definition

HCD 6/12-4-48 202 WHEELCHAIR E AS Remove Definition
SPACE

HCD 6/12-4-49 | 202 WHEELCHAIR E AS Amend Definition
SPACE

ITEM 5 - CHAPTER 3, USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
Adopt chapter except Section 308.2 without amendments

P CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section am:?' (AS, HESPOTER e by Commens Annotations A((,:At\lso "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-5-1 Entire chapter except E AS
Section 308.2
ITEM 6 — CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section a::g:?- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-6-1 406.3.4 E W/D Agency withdrawal
HCD 6/12-6-2 406.4.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-6-3 419.7 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-6-4 419.9 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-6-5 420.7 E AS New Section
HCD 6/12-6-6 420.7.1 E W/D Agency withdrawal
HCD 06/12 4 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 7 — CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS
Adopt chapter without amendments

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
SUIEIE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section (n;er&t AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
Ny | D:FS) | (AD,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-7-1 Entire chapter E AS
ITEM 8 - CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION
Adopt amendments listed below
amend. | CAC: | Agercy Actor
. (AS, Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
N) | O:FS) | (A D WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-8-1 Table 602 E AS Amend Table
ITEM 9 - CHAPTER 7 FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES
Adopt chapter without amendments
amend. | CAC: | Agency Actor
. (AS, Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(,QSD
N) " | D,FS) | (A, D, WD) Fé) ’
HCD 6/12-9-1 Entire chapter E AS
ITEM 10- CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISHES
Adopt chapter without amendments
amend. | CAC: || Agency Action
. (AS, Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
Ny | D:FS) | (AD,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-10-1 | Entire chapter E AS

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

5of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 11 - CHAPTER 9
Adopt chapter except Section 908.7with amendments listed below

B2l CAC: Agency CB.SC
' SUIEIE: (AS, Response 45-Day Comments - AETE
[tem Number Code Section gerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-11-1 | 908.7 E AS Refer to Section 420.6
HCD 6/12-11-2 | 908.7.1 E AS Refer to Section 420.6
HCD 6/12-11-3 | 909.13.1 E AS Amend Section
ITEM 12 —- CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
Type of CAC: Agency CBSC
' SUIEIE: (AS, Response 45-Day Comments - AETE
[tem Number Code Section gerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-12-1 | 1003.1 N AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-2 | 1003.2 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-3 | 1003.3.4 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-4 | 1003.5 Exceptions E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-5 | 1007.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-6 | 1007.2 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-7 | 1007.3 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-8 | 1007.5 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-9 | 1007.9 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-10 | 1008.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-11 | 1008.1.4.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-12 | 1008.1.7 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-13 | 1008.1.9.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-14 | 1009.7.2 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-15 | 1010.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-16 | 1010.10 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-17 | 10114 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-18 | 1013.2 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-12-19 | 1022.9 E AS Amend Section
HCD 06/12 6 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 13 - CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY

Proposes not to adopt chapter 11

ITEM 14 — CHAPTER 12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT

Adopt chapter with amendments listed below

T o gy [ e
[tem Number Code Section (n;erét (A A,’ fg%%cs ¢ (IAS% yAA(,)rB,mFe;) S Annotations A(QSD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-14-1 | 1203.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-2 | 1203.2 E AS Add Exception Section
HCD 6/12-14-3 | 1203.2.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-4 | 1203.2.1.1 E AS Add Section
HCD 6/12-14-5 | 1203.4.2.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-6 | $20%% E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-7 | 2672 E AS Remove Definitions
HCD 6/12-14-8 | 120721 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-9 | 673 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-10 | £2674 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-11 | 26%5 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-12 | 126746 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-13 | 26762 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-14 | $20%# E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-15 | 2648 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-16 | 2648 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-17 | +26718 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-18 | :207%4L E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-19 | 207141 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-20 | 207112 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-21 | 26713 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-22 | 26714 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-23 | 126%12 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-24 | 20713 E AS Repeal Section
HCD 6/12-14-25 | 1208.4 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-26 | 1210.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-27 | 12111 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-28 | 1211.1.1 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-14-29 | 12116 E AS Amend Section

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

7 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




HCD 6/12-14-30 | 1212 N AS Add Section
HCD 6/12-14-31 | 1212.1 N AS Add Section
ITEM 15 - CHAPTER 13 ENERGY EFFICIENCY
Proposes not to adopt chapter 13
ITEM 16 - CHAPTER 14 EXTERIOR WALLS
Adopt chapter except Table 1405.3.1 without amendments
S OT CAC: Agency CB.SC
amend- | xs” | Response 45-Day Comments g
[tem Number Code Section (n;erét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-16-1 | Entire chapter EXCEPT E AS
table 1405.3.1
ITEM 17 - CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
U2 gf CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section arnr;:gt 5 Respenes SR (ORI Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-17-1 | 1503.4 E AS Committee directed HCD to coordinate ASCE 7
between HCD and BSC
HCD 6/12-17-2 | 1503.4.1 AS Committee directed HCD to coordinate ASCE 7
between HCD and BSC
ITEM 18 - CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt amendments listed below
Type of CAC: Ag;g_cy CBSC
SUIEIE: (AS . sponse 45-Day Comments gion
[tem Number Code Section ment AA. | to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations (AS,
(S,E AA, D,
N) D,FS) | (A D, FS)
WID)
HCD 06/12 8 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




HCD 6/12-18-1 | 1607.8.2 (for BFO) E AS Page 25 of ET - to be considered by BFO CAC
HCD 6/12-18-1 | 16135 N AA # 4 of the 9 pt criteria
HCD 6/12-18-2 | 1613.5.1 - BALLASTED N AA New definition for ASCE-7
PHOTOVOLTAIC # 4 of the 9 pt criteria
SYSTEM Coordinate language with BSC
HCD 6/12-18-3 | 1613.5.2, Exception E AA Modify ASCE 7 §13.4
# 4 of the 9 pt criteria & public comment by
Kenneth Luttrell
Coordinate language with BSC & DSA-SS
ITEM 19 - CHAPTER 17 STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt amendments listed below
12 @] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section am?- 5 Respenes SR (ORI Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-19-1 | 1707.1 N AS Add new paragraph
ITEM 20 - CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
Adopt amendments listed below
TEE] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section am:g?- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-20-1 | 1803.1.1 E AS Editorial change to modify statutory reference
HCD 6/12-20-2 | 1803.1.1.1 E AS Editorial change to modify reference
HCD 6/12-20-3 | 1803.1.1.3 E AS Editorial change to modify reference
HCD 6/12-20-4 | 1803.1.1.4 N AS New section
HCD 6/12-20-4a | 1803.1.4.5 N AS New section
HCD 6/12-20-5 | 1804.3.1 N AS New section
HCD 6/12-20-6 | 1805.4.1, Exc. 2 N AS Add exception
HCD 6/12-20-7 | 1810.3.104 N AS Add new paragraph
HCD 06/12 9 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 21 - CHAPTER 19 CONCRETE
Adopt amendments listed below

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
SUIEIE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section gerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
Ny | D:FS) | (AD,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-21-1 | 1907.1.1 N AS Add new reference section
ITEM 22 - CHAPTER 20 ALUMINUM
Adopt chapter without amendments
12 @] CAC: Agency CB.SC
. B (AS Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
N) " | D,FS) | (A D, WD) Fé) ’
HCD 6/12-22-1 | Entire chapter N/A AS
ITEM 23 - CHAPTER 21 MASONRY
Adopt chapter without amendments
Do | e | goney o
. AS, | Response 45-Day Comments :
[tem Number Code Section (n;erét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
Ny | D:FS) | (AD,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-23-1 | Entire chapter N/A AS
HCD 06/12 10 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 24 - CHAPTER 22 STEEL
Adopt chapter without amendments

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
SUIEIE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments AETE
[tem Number Code Section (n;er&t AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
Ny | D:FS) | (AD,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-24-1 | Entire chapter N/A AS
ITEM 25 - CHAPTER 23 WOOD
Adopt amendments listed below
s e; CAC: Agency CB.SC
. EE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(,QSD
N) " | D,FS) | (A, D, WD) Fé) ’
HCD 6/12-25-1 | 23043.1.1 N AS Add new reference section
ITEM 26 - CHAPTER 24 GLASS AND GLAZING
Adopt chapter without amendments
v | o | gy =
. AS, Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(f\\SD
Ny | B:FS) | (A D,WD) FS)
HCD 6/12-26-1 | Entire chapter N/A AS
HCD 06/12 11 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code




ITEM 27- CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM BOARD AND PLASTER
Adopt chapter without amendments

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section arrgg::i- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAEg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-27-1 | Entire chapter N/A AS
ITEM 28 - CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC
Adopt chapter without amendments
12 @] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section am:rr:?- 5 Respenes SR (ORI Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, WI/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-28-1 | Entire chapter E AS
ITEM 29 - CHAPTER 27 ELECTRICAL
Proposes not to adopt chapter 27
ITEM 30 - CHAPTER 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS
Proposes not to adopt chapter 28
ITEM 31 - CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS
Proposes not to adopt chapter 29
ITEM 32 - CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
Typeof | e | agency CECL
[tem Number Code Section amgzg- A5, Respenes DY (GOl Annotations A&g) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-32-1 | 3001.1 E AS Repeal Exception
HCD 6/12-32-2 | 30013 E AS Amend Section

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

12 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 33 - CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt chapter without amendments

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section arrgg:?- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAEg) "
(S.E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-33-1 | Entire Chapter E AS
ITEM 34 - CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY
Adopt chapter without amendments
e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section arrgg:?- [ Resgenes G0 ORI Annotations A(CAEg) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-34-1 | Entire Chapter E AS
ITEM 35 - CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt chapter 33 Section 3303, 3304, 3305, 3306, 3307, 3308 and 3310 only with amendments listed below
Typeof | cac. | Agency CESC
[tem Number Code Section amz:?' A5, | Respenes AV G| Annotations A&g) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-35-1 | 3304.1.5 E AS Add Section
HCD 6/12-35-2 | 3306.2 E AS Amend Section

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

13 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 36 - CHAPTER 34 EXISTING STRUCTURES
Adopt amendments listed below

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
. amend- (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments . AETE
[tem Number Code Section (n;er&t AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-36-1 | 3401.1 N AS Add new paragraph
HCD 6/12-36-2 | 34013 E,N AS Correct code references & repeal paragraph
HCD 6/12-36-3 | 3401.4.1 E AS Relocate 3401.4.3 in new paragraph
HCD 6/12-36-4 | 3483%% E AS Repeal
HCD 6/12-36-5 | 3405.1.1 E AS Renumber 3405.1.2 to match format of IBC
ITEM 37 - CHAPTER 35 REFERENCE STANDARDS
Adopt chapter with amendments listed below
Typeof | e | agency OB
. EE: (AS, Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-37-1 | IGC—ICC/ANSIALLZL E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-2 | ICC-ICC 300-12 E AS Amend Standard
HCD 6/12-37-3 | ICC-ICC 400-12 E AS Amend Standard
HCD 6/12-37-4 | ICC - ICC 500-08 E AS Amend Standard
HCD 6/12-37-5 | ICC-ICC 600-08 E AS Amend Standard
HCD 6/12-37-6 | {66—EBC-12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-7 | {eE—ECC-12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-8 | IcE—FCR2 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-9 | Ie6—FGE12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-10 | {e6—McR2 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-11 | 66—PC12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-12 | {cC—PMC12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-13 | {66—PSDCA2 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-14 | {c6—RGC12 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-15 | ICC SBCCI SSTD 11-97 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-37-16 | NFPA-720 E AS Repeal Standard
HCD 6/12-37-17 | NFPA 720-89-12 E AS Amend Section
HCD 6/12-37-18 | Y-—2034 E AS Repeal Standard

HCD 06/12

Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

14 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




HCD 6/12-37-19 | UL - 2034-2008 AS

m

Amend Section

HCD 6/12-37-20 | UL-2075 E AS

Amend Section

ITEM 38 — APPENDIX A EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix B

ITEM 39 — APPENDIX B BOARD OF APPEALS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix B

ITEM 40 - APPENDIX C Group U — AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix C

ITEM 41 - APPENDIX D - FIRE DISTRICTS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix D

ITEM 42 — APPENDIX E - SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix E

ITEM 43 — APPENDIX F- RODENT PROOFING
Proposes not to adopt Appendix F

ITEM 44 — APPENDIX G — FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION
Proposes not to adopt Appendix G

ITEM 45 — APPENDIX H — SIGNS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix H

HCD 06/12 15 of 16
Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 46 — APPENDIX | - PATIO COVERS
Adopt Appendix | with amendments listed below

Typeof | e | agency CECL
e (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments AEE
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-46-1 1102.1 E AS Amend Section
ITEM 47 — APPENDIX J — GRADING
Adopt Appendix J with amendments listed below
Dt | cac | gy o
. AS, Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
HCD 6/12-47-1 | J102.1 E AS Amend Standard
HCD 6/12-47-2 | J105.1 E AS Amend Standard

ITEM 48 — APPENDIX K — ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix K

ITEM 49 — APPENDIX L — EARTHQUAKE RECORDING INSTRUMENTS
Proposes not to adopt Appendix L

ITEM 50 — APPENDIX M — TSUNAMI-GENERATED FLOOD HAZARD
Proposes not to adopt Appendix M

HCD 06/12 16 of 16
Adopt & Amend 2012 International Building Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012




