COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX TITLE (CODE)

AGENCY: OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL [SFM 03/12] CCR, TITLE 24, PART 9 (2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE)
LEGEND:
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s Actions: Amendments, if indicated by agency:
(CAC)s: A = Accepted S = Statutory
ACCESS = Accessibility AA = Approve as amended E = Existing
BFO = Building, Fire & Other AS = Approve as submitted N = New
HF = Health Facilities D = Disapprove Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy FS =Further Study GREEN = uncontested items
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces WI/D = Withdrawn by agency YELLOW = challenged items
GB = Green Building SALMON = W/D, no action required

BUILDING FIRE AND OTHER CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE _ (SEM)

ITEM 1 - CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION DIVISION |
The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California provisions contained Sections 1.1.0 through 1.1.12 and Sections 1.11 through 1.11.10 with modifications listed below.

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
[tem Number Code Section SUIEIE: (ACSAiA RESTEIES G CRE Annotations A(?AEI&? "
ment D ’FS)7 to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, W/D) Fé) !
SFM 03/12-1-1 | Section 1.1.1 E AS Amend code year
SFM 03/12-1-2 Section 1.1.3.2 E AS Amend reference to Matrix table
SFM 03/12-1-3 Section 1.1.11 E AS Amend reference to Matrix table and add note

ITEM2 - CHAPTER 1
The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 102.1-102.5, 102.9, 104.2, 104.5, 104.7-104.7.2, 104.10, 105-105.2.2, 105.2.4, 105.3 105.3.3-105.3.8, 105

4.6, 105.5, 105.6-105.6.8, Table 105.6.8, 105.6.10-105.6.11, 105.6.13-105.6.15, Table 105.6.20, 105.6.21-105.6.26, 105.6.43, 105.6.46, 105.6.47, 105.7-105.7.14, 106.2-106.4, 109-109.3.1, 110.1,
110.4, and 111-114 contained in Chapter 1

ITEM 3 - CHAPTER 2- DEFINITIONS
The SFM proposes to Adopt Chapter 2 with the following amendments and California regulations

SFM 03/12 Page 1 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Fire Code



CBSC
Type of . Agency .
amend- G Response 45-Day Comments oy
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
SFM 03/12-3-1 COMMUNITY N AS Add definition
CARE FACILITY
SFM 03/12-3-2 FOSTER FAMILY N AS Add definition
HOME
SFM 03/12-3-3 | GROUP-HOME E AS Repeal definition
SFM 03/12-3-4 GROUP HOME N AS Add definition
ITEM 4 - CHAPTER 3 GENERAL REGULATIONS
The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 301, 304, 308.5, 312, 313, 314, 315, 316 and 317 of Chapter 3 without amendments
ITEM 5 - CHAPTER 4 EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS
The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 401, 402, 403 AND 407 of Chapter 4 without amendment.
ITEM 6 - CHAPTER 5 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
The SFM proposes to only Chapter 5 with the following amendments; SFM propose note to adopt Section 510.3.
. CBSC
ype of ) Agency 3
. amend- giles Response 45-Day Comments ] ooy
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
SEN | D (A, D, WD) FS) |
SFM 03/12-6-1 503.1 E AS Add Exceptions

ITEM 7 - CHAPTER 6 BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 6 without amendments.

ITEM 8 - CHAPTER 7 FIRE RESISTANCE-RATED CONSTRUCTION

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 7 without amendments.

ITEM 9 - CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 8 without amendments; SFM does not adopt Section 805 through 808

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 2 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 10 - CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 9 with the following amendments.

Type of CAC: Agency EB.SC
: ction
ltem Number Code Section e (AS, AA, AT D) COMEIS Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, W/D) Fé) '
SFM 03/12-10-1 | 907.2.11.1.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-10-2 | 907.2.11.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-10-3 | 907.2.11.2.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-10-4 | 907.2.11.2.4 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-10-5 | 907.2.11.5 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-10-6 | 29.8.3.4 E AS Amend Section and Exception
ITEM 11 - CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 10 with the following amendments.
CBSC
Type of CAC: Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section e (AS, AA, Response D] COENLS Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WD) Fé) '
SFM 03/12-11-1 | 1004.1.1.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-2 | 1004.1.1.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-3 | 1004.1.1.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-11-4 | 1014.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-5 | 1008.1.9.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-6 | 1015.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-7 | 1015.2.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-8 | 1021.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-9 | Table 1021.1 E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-11-10| 1021.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-11| Table 1021.2(1) E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-11-12 | Table 1021.2(2) E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-11-13| 1021.2.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-11-14 | 1021.2.2 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-11-15| 182122 E AS Repeal Section
SFM 03/12-11-16 | 362523 E AS Repeal Section
SFM 03/12-11-17 | 162524 E AS Repeal Section
SFM 03/12 Page 3 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code



SFM 03/12-11-18 | 402125 E AS Repeal Section
SFM 03/12-11-19 | 10213 E AS Repeal Section
SFM 03/12-11-20 | 162134 E AS Repeal Section and Exception
SFM 03/12-11-21 | 182+4 E AS Renumber Section
1021.3

ITEM 12 - CHAPTER 11 CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BULDINGS

The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 1103.7, 1103.7.3, 1103.7.3.1, 1103.7.8-1103.7.8.2, 1103.7.9-1103.7.9.10, 1103.8-1103.8.5.3 and 1106c of Chapter 11 without amendments.

(no item) CHAPTERS 12 through 19 RESERVED

ITEM 13 - CHAPTER 20 AVIATION FACILITIES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 20 without amendments.

ITEM 14 - CHAPTER 21 DRY CLEANING

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 21 without amendments.

ITEM 15 - CHAPTER 22-COMBUSTIBLE DUST-PRODUCING OPERATIONS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 22 without amendments.

ITEM 16 - CHAPTER 23-MOTOR FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES AND REPAIR GARAGES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 23 without amendments.

ITEM 17 - CHAPTER 24-FLAMMABLE FINISHES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 24 without amendments.

ITEM 18 - CHAPTER 25-FRUIT CROP RIPENING
The SFM does not adopt Chapter 25.

ITEM 19 - CHAPTER 26-FUMIGATION AND THERMAL INSECTICIDAL FOGGING
The SFM does not adopt Chapter 26.

ITEM 20 - CHAPTER 27-SEMICONDUCTOR FABRICATION FACILITIES

SFM 03/12 Page 4 of 16
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012




The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 27 without amendments.

ITEM 21 - CHAPTER 28-LUMBER YARDS AND WOODWORKING FACILITIES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 27 without amendments.

ITEM 22- CHAPTER 29-MANUFACTURE OF ORGANIC COATINGS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 29 without amendments.

ITEM 23- CHAPTER 30-INDUSTRIAL OVENS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 30 without amendments.

ITEM 24- CHAPTER 31-TENTS, CANOPTIES AN OTHER MEMBRANE STRUCTURES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 31 without amendments.

ITEM 25- CHAPTER 32-HIGH-PILED COMBUSTABLE STORAGE
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 32 without amendments.

ITEM 26- CHAPTER 33-FIRE SAFETY DURING CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 33 without amendments.

ITEM 27- CHAPTER 34-TIRE REBUILDING AND TIRE STORAGE
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 34 without amendments.

ITEM 28- CHAPTER 35-WELDING AND OTHER HOT WORK
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 35 without amendments.

ITEM 29- CHAPTER 36-MARINAS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 36 without amendments.

(no item) CHAPTERS 37 through 49 47-RESERVED

ITEM 30- CHAPTER 48 [SFM] -MOTION PICTURE AND TELEVISION PRODUCTION STUDIOS SOUND STAGES, APPROVED PRODUCTION FACILITIES, AND
PRODUCTION LOCATIONS
The SFM proposes to maintain adopt Chapter 48 without amendments.

SFM 03/12 Page 5 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code



ITEM 31- CHAPTER 49[SFM]-REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREAS.

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 49 without amendments.

ITEM 32- CHAPTER 50-HAZARDOUS MATERIALS-GENERAL PROVISIONS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 50 without amendments.

ITEM 33- CHAPTER 51-AEROSOLS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 51 without amendments.

ITEM 34- CHAPTER 52-COMBUSTABLE FIBERS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 52 without amendments.

ITEM 35- CHAPTER 53-COMPRESSED GASES.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 53 without amendments.

ITEM 36- CHAPTER 54-CORROSIVE MATERIALS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 54 without amendments.

ITEM 37- CHAPTER 55-CRYOGENIC FLUIDS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 55 without amendments.

ITEM 38- CHAPTER 56-EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 56 without amendments.

ITEM 39- CHAPTER 57-FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTABLE LIQUIDS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 57 without amendments.

ITEM 40- CHAPTER 58-FLAMMABLE GASES AND FLAMMABLE CRYOGENIC FLUIDS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 58 without amendments.

ITEM 41- CHAPTER 59-FLAMMABLE SOLIDS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 59 without amendments.

SFM 03/12 Page 6 of 16
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012



ITEM 42- CHAPTER 60-HIGHLY TOXIC AND TOXIC MATERIALS.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 60 without amendments.

ITEM 43- CHAPTER 61-LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES.
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 61 without amendments.

ITEM 44- CHAPTER 62- ORGANIC PEROXIDES
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 62 without amendments.

ITEM 45- CHAPTER 63-OXIDIZERS, OZIDIZING GASES AND OXIDIZING CRYOGENIC FLUIDS.

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 63 without amendments.

ITEM 46- CHAPTER 64- PYROPHORIC MATERIALS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 64 without amendments.

ITEM 47- CHAPTER 65- PYROXYLIN (CELLULOSE NITRATE) PLASTICS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 65 without amendments.

ITEM 48- CHAPTER 66- UNSTABLE (REACTIVE) MATERIALS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 66 without amendments.

ITEM 49- CHAPTER 67 WATER-REACTIVE SOLIDS AND LIQUIDS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 67 without amendments.

(no item) CHAPTERS 68 through 79 RESERVED

ITEM 50- CHAPTER 80 REFERENCED STANDARDS
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 80 with the following amendments.

SFM 03/12 Page 7 of 16
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012



CBSC

Typeof | opc. | Agency Action
. amend- ) Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (AISS,FQA, o % AC ( AS,yA A, D, FS) Annotations A(::\SD
SEN | 2F) | (aD wb) FS)
SFM 03/12-50-1 | NFPA-10-10 E AS Strike Standard
SFM 03/12-50-2 | NFPA 11-10813 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-3 | NFPA 13-10613 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-4 | NFPA 13D -106 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-5 | NFPA 13R - 18 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-6 | NFPA 14 -10813 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-7 | NFPA 20-18 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-8 | NFPA22-68 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-9 | NFPA 24 -1013 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-10 | NFPA 31-0611 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-11 | NFPA 37 - 10 N AS New Standard
SFM 03/12-50-12 | NFPA 51-6713 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-13 | NFPA 51A-1112 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-14 | NFPA 52-1013 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-15| NFPA 54 -12 N AS New Standard
SFM 03/12-50-16 | NFPA 55-1013 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-17 | NFPA 59A -89 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-18 | NFPA 61-068 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-19 | NFPA 72 -1013 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-20 | NFPA 80 -10 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-21 | NEPA 82 — 09 N AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-22 | NFRPA-92B—09 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-23 | NFPA 92 - 12 N AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-24 | NFPA 99 -10 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-25 | NFPA 105 -10 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-26 | NFPA 110-18 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-27 | NFPA 111-1813 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-28 | NFPA 120-10 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-29 | NFPA 204 -07 12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-30 | NFPA 211-1013 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-31 | NFPA 241-69 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-32 | NFPA 260 -69 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-33 | NFPA 261 -09 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-34 | NFPA 289 -09 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12 Page 8 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code




SFM 03/12-50-35 | NFPA 318 -69 12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-36 | NFPA 385 -67 12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-37 | NFPA 400 -13 N AS New Standard
SFM 03/12-50-38 | NFPA 409 -10 11 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-39 | NFRA-430-10 E AS Strike Standard
SFM 03/12-50-40 | NFRPA-490-10 E AS Strike Standard
SFM 03/12-50-41 | NFPA 495-18 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-42 | NFPA 498 -18 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-43 | NFPA 505-10 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-44 | NFPA 654 -11 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-45 | NFPA 703 -12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-46 | NFPA 720 -65 12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-47 | NFPA—790-04 E AS Strike Standard
SFM 03/12-50-48 | NFPA 1122 -68 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-49 | NFPA 1124 -1213 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-50 | NFPA 1127 -68 13 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-51 | NFPA 2001 -1 12 E AS Amend Standard
SFM 03/12-50-52 | Y—790-04 E AS Strike Standard

ITEM 51- APPENDIX CHAPTER 4 [SFM] SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter Appendix 4 with no new amendments.

ITEM 52- APPENDIX A BOARD OF APPEALS
The SFM proposes not to adopt Appendix A.

ITEM 53- APPENDIX B FIRE-FLOW REQUIRMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix B with no new amendments.

ITEM 54- APPENDIX BB [SFM] FIRE FLOW REQUIRMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix BB with no new amendments.

ITEM 55- APPENDIX C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix C with no new amendments.

ITEM 56- APPENDIX CC [SFM] FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix CC with no new amendments.

ITEM 57- APPENDIX D, E, F AND G
The SFM proposes not to adopt Appendix D, E, F and G.

SFM 03/12 Page 9 of 16
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

CAC Action August 14, 2012




ITEM 58- APPENDIX H HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLAN (HMMP) AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVENTORY STATEMENT (HMIS) INSTRUCTIONS
The SFM proposes not to adopt Appendix H and not print in the California Fire Code.

ITEM 59- APPENDIX H HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLANS AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVENTORY STATEMENTS
(See Sections 5001.5.1 and 5001.5.2)
The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix H with no new amendments.

ITEM 60- APPENDIX | and J
The SFM proposes not to adopt Appendix | and J.

ITEM 61- APPENDIX K TEMPORARY HAUNTED HOUSES, GHOST WALKS AND SIMILAR AMUSEMENT USES
The SFM proposes to adopt new Appendix K.

CBSC
Type of CAC: Agency Action
ltem Number Code Section B (AS, AA, NEETEIIED D COIEs Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
S, E, N) ’ (A, D, W/D) k)
SFM 03/12-61-1 | APPENDIXK N AS New Appendix Title
SFM 03/12-61-2 | SECTION K101 N AS New Section Title
GENERAL
SFM 03/12-61-3 | K101.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-4 | K101.2 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-5 | K101.2.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-6 | SECTION K102 N AS New Section Title
DEFINITIONS
SFM 03/12-61-7 | K102.1 N AS New Section
DECORATIVE
MATERIALS
SFM 03/12-61-8 | K102.2 HAUNTED N AS New Section
HOUSE
SFM 03/12-61-9 | K102.3 GHOST N AS New Section
WALKS
SFM 03/12-61-10| K103.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-11 | K103.2 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-12 | K103.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-13 | K103.4 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-14 | K103.5 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-15| K103.6 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-16 | K103.6.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-17 | K103.6.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 10 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012



SFM 03/12-61-18 | K103.6.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-19 | K103.6.4 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-20 | K103.6.5 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-21 | K103.7 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-22 | K103.7.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-23 | K103.7.2 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-24 | K103.7.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-25| K103.7.4 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-26 | K103.7.5 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-27 | K103.8 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-28 | K103.8.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-29 | K103.8.2 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-30| K103.8.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-31 | K103.9 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-32 | K103.10 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-33 | K103.11 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-34 | K103.12 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-35| K103.13 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-61-36 | K103.14 N AS New Section

ITEMS 62 thru 65; Take same coordination actions as CAC Actions for SFM Part 2 ITEMS 42-45

ITEM 62- VARIOUS CHAPTERS - SPECIFIC PROVISIONS RELATING TO HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS
The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-Risk Task Force.

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
. amend- Gaes Response 45-Day Comments . geny
[tem Number Code Section ment (gS,FéA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
SEN | 2F) | (a D wib) o
SFM 03/12-62-1 | 508.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-62-2 | 508.1.6 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-62-3 | 604.2.14.1.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-62-4 | SECTION 705 N AS New Section Title
SFM 03/12-62-5 | 705.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-62-6 | 907.6.1.1 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-62-7 | 907.6.3.3 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-62-8 | 913.6 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-62-9 | 1007.8.1 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 11 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




SFM 03/12-62-10 | 1007.8.2 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-62-11 | 1008146 E AS Renumber and Amend Section and Exceptions
1008.1.9.12

SFM 03/12-62-12 | 1022.10 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-62-13 | 1022.10.1 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-62-14 | 202 DIRECT N AS Add definition
ACCESS

SFM 03/12-62-15 | 909.18.9 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-62-16 | 1027.1 E AS Amend Section

ITEM 63- VARIOUS CHAPTERS - SPECIFIC PROVISIONS RELATING TO CUSTODY, CORRECTION AND THE REHABILITAION FACILITIES
The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to custody, correction and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM High-risk Task Force.

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- Gaes Response 45-Day Comments el
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
SEN | D (A, D, WID) FS)
SFM 03/12-63-1 | CELL E AS Amend Definition
SFM 03/12-63-2 | COURTROOM N AS New Definition
DOCK
SFM 03/12-63-3 | COURTHOUSE N AS New Definition
HOLDING
FACILITY [SFM]
SFM 03/12-63-4 | DETENTION N AS New Definition
ELEVATOR [SFM]
SFM 03/12-63-5 | DETENTION N AS New Definition
TREATMENT
ROOM [SFM]
SFM 03/12-63-6 | OCCUPANCY E AS Amend Institutional Group -3 Conditions
CLASSIFICATION
SFM 03/12-63-7 | OCCUPANCY N AS Add Occupancy Condition 6
CONDITION 6
SFM 03/12-63-8 | OCCUPANCY N AS Add Occupancy Conditions 7
CONDITION 7
SFM 03/12-63-9 | OCCUPANCY N AS Add Occupancy Conditions 8
CONDITION 8
SFM 03/12-63-10 | RESTRAINT [SFM] N AS Amend Definition
SFM 03/12-63-11 | SECURE N AS New Definition
INTERVIEW
ROOMS
SFM 03/12-63-12 | TEMPORARY N AS New Definition

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 12 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




HOLDING CELL
ROOM, OR AREA

[CSA and SFM]
SFM 03/12-63-13 | TEMPORARY N AS New Definition
HOLDING
FACILITY [SEM]
SFM 03/12-63-14 | TENABLE N AS New Definition
ENFIRONMENT
[SEM]
SFM 03/12-63-15 | 903.2.6.2 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-16 | 907.2.6.3 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-17 | 907.2.6.3.3 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-18 | 907.3.2.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-19 | 1008.1.9.7 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-20 | 1015.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-21 | TABLE 1015.1 E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-63-22 | TABLE 1016.2 E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-63-23 | TABLE 1018.1 E AS Amend Table
SFM 03/12-63-24 | 1025.4 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-63-25 | 16282 E AS Repeal CBC Section
SFM 03/12-63-26 | 1028.1 E AS Add Exception to existing Section

ITEM 64- CHAPTERS 9 and 80 - SPECIFIC PROVISIONS RELATING TO SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC PANELS OR SYSTEMS

The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to solar photovoltaic panels or systems.

CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- L Response 45-Day Comments Action
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, b y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
SEN | D (A, D, WID) FS)
SFM 03/12-64-1 | 903.3.1.1.1 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-64-2 | 2010 NFPA-13 N AS Amend Reference Standards
CHAPTER 80)
SFM 03/12-64-3 | 8.15.7.6 N AS New Section
SFM 03/12-64-4 | 2010 NFPA-13R N AS Amend Reference Standards
CHAPTER 80)
SFM 03/12-64-5 | 6.6 N AS New Section

ITEM 65- CHAPTERS 2, 9 and 10 - SPECIFIC PROVISIONS RELATING TO SCHOOL CONSTRUCTION

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 13 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to school construction.

U1e gf CAC: RAge”CV 45.Day C X?{i)(r:\
. amend- ) esponse -Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (ADS,F/;)A, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
SEN | D (A, D, WID) FS)
SFM 03/12-65-1 | CHARTER N AS New Definition
SCHOOL
SFM 03/12-65-2 | MODERNICZATHO E AS Relocate Definition to new section 442.2/442.3
N-PROJECTISFM}
SFM 03/12-65-3 | NEW-RUBLIC E AS Relocate Definition to new section 442.2/442.3
SCHOOLCAMPUS
[SEM}
SFM 03/12-65-4 | PORTABLE E AS Relocate Definition to new section 442.2/442.3
BUILDING[SFM]
SFM 03/12-65-5 | PORTABLE E AS Relocate Definition to new section 442.2/442.3
BUILDING;
EXCEMPTED
[SEM]
SFM 03/12-65-6 | RELOCATABLE N AS New Definition
BUILDING
SFM 03/12-65-7 | 903.2.3 E AS Relocate deleted Text to 442.2.2
SFM 03/12-65-8 | 903231 E AS Strike Section
SFM 03/12-65-9 | 9032311 E AS Relocate to 442.2.2
SFM 03/12-65-10 | 9032312 E AS Relocate to 442.2
SFM 03/12-65-11 | 907.2.3 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-65-12 | 907.2.3.1 N AS New Section Title and Amend Section
SFM 03/12-65-13 | 907.2.3.3 E AS Amend Section
SFM 03/12-65-14 | 96723+ E AS Relocate to 442.2
SFM 03/12-65-15 | 96%23+1% E AS Relocate to 442.2
SFM 03/12-65-16 | 90++F52 E AS Renumber Section
907.6.5.3
SFM 03/12-65-17 | 1008.1.11 N AS New Section
ITEM 66- CHAPTERS 3, 4,5, 6, 8, 9, 10 and 80 and APPENDIX CHAPTER 4- SPECIFIC SFM REG’S IN TITLE 19, DIVISION 1.
The SFM proposes to adopt specific section in various chapters relating to school construction.
Type gf CAC: RAgency 45 c XcBnSoa
" amend- ) esponse -Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment (gS,F,g,)A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(,QSD
(S, E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) !

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 14 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




SFM 03/12-66-1 | 401.3.4 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-2 | 401.9 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-3 | 404.6 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-4 | 404.7 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-5 | 404.7.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-6 | 404.7.1.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-7 | 404.7.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-8 | 404.7.2.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-9 | 404.7.2.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-10 | 404.7.3 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-11 | 404.7.3.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-12 | 404.7.3.1.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-13 | 404.7.4 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-14 | 404.7.5 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-15 | 404.7.5.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-16 | 404.7.5.1.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-17 | 404.7.5.1.3 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-18 | 404.7.6 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-19 | Table 405.2 N AS Amend Table

SFM 03/12-66-20 | 408.3 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-66-21 | 408.3.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-22 | 408.3.1.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-23 | 408.3.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-24 | 4083:% E AS Renumbered Section
408.3.3

SFM 03/12-66-25 | 40832 E AS Renumbered Section
408.3.4

SFM 03/12-66-26 | 40833 E AS Renumbered Section
408.3.5

SFM 03/12-66-27 | 4083:4 E AS Renumbered Section
408.3.6

SFM 03/12-66-28 | 408.12 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-29 | 408.12.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-30 | 408.12.2 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-31 | 408.12.3 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-32 | 504.4 N AS New Section and exception

SFM 03/12-66-33 | 603.8 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-66-34 | 803.10 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-35 | 803.10.1 N AS New Section

SFM 03/12-66-36 | 807.4.3.2 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code

Page 15 of 16

CAC Action August 14, 2012




SFM 03/12-66-37 | 901.6 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-66-38 | 1004.3 E AS Amend Section

SFM 03/12-66-39 | CHAPTER 80 N AS New reference standard
REFERENCE
STANDARD NFPA
82-09

SFM 03/12-66-40 | CHAPTER 80 E AS Amend reference standard
REFERENCE
STANDARD NFPA
99- 05 12

SFM 03/12-66-41 | CHAPTER 80 E AS Amend reference standard
REFERENCE
STANDARD NFPA
101-06 12

SFM 03/12-66-42 | CHAPTER 80 N AS New reference standard
REFERENCE
STANDARD UL
791-06

SFM 03/12-66-43 | SECTION 426 N AS New Section Title

SFM 03/12-66-44 | 426.1 n AS New Title

SFM 03/12 Page 16 of 16 CAC Action August 14, 2012

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Fire Code



