STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use item No.
STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130

SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: chsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: i 2\
Patrick Rivera, PE /Q% % :
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco CA 94103
Sireet City State Zip

IWe (do)agrée with:

[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-406.5.3

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ 1Approved [ ] Disapproved [X] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

The requirement for a 48 inch deep clear space at the top of a curb ramp should only apply universally to
new construction. Only in new construction will it be feasible to provide the necessary grading of the
streets beyond intersection to include the crosswalk areas in order to allow for the provision of such level
landing areas in the adjoining sidewalks.

An exception under 11B-406.5.3 should be provided for existing locations to allow providing no 48 inch
deep clear space or smaller spaces at the top of a curb ramp where it is technically infeasible or
structurally impracticable due to existing topography or other physical or legal constraints.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As

Amend" and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10/26-12/102012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use Item No.

STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130
SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: cbsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: - ; -~
Patrick Rivera, PE gﬂw\
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco CA 94103
Street City State Zip

I/We (do)ido not) agree with:
[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-406.5.8

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ 1] Disapproved [X] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

The requirement for a 48 inch deep counter slope area in the street where it meets the hottom of the curb
rap is limited to 5%. We agree with this provision for new streets and typically even for altered streets.
However some existing conditions may make it technically infeasible or structurally impracticable to meet
this slope limit in all cases.

An exception under 11B-406.5.8 should be provided for existing locations to allow providing a shorter
area that is limited to 5%; as short as two feet. Two feet is the wheelbase of a typical wheelchair. Such an
alternative would be allowable only where it is technically infeasible or structurally impracticable due to
existing topography or other physical or legal constraints to meet the basic 5% slope limitation in the 48
inch counter slope area.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As

Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10.26-1210/2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use ltem No.

STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130
SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: cbsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: ,’ﬂ) «
Patrick Rivera, PE @Z/ \/V e~—
Name (Print or type) ) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works

Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco CA 94103

Street City - State Zip

I'We (do) agree with:

[ X ] The Agency proposed madifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-406.5.9

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ 1 Approved [ ] Disapproved [X] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

The requirement for a 48 inch deep clear space at the bottom of a curb ramp should only apply to
diagonal or corner type curb ramps ONLY!

There is no need for a user to turn beyond the bottom grade break at curb ramps that are not diagonal or
corner type. Other curb ramp types cannot be properly constructed within sidewalk limits and also
provide a 48 inch deep clear space at the bottom of a curb ramp beyond the bottom of the grade break.
The whole purpose and need for a 48 inch deep clear space at the bottom of a curb ramp beyond the
bottom of the grade break is for users of diagonal or corner type curb ramps, since they need a clear
space outside of vehicle travel areas to turn one direction or the other to use the crosswalk that they
intend to without conflict with vehicles moving in the same direction at the same time through the
intersection.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As

Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10,26-12/10/2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use ltem No.
STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130

SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: cbsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: { 7 M)_\/‘
Patrick Rivera, PE Vo7 /A
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco . CA 94103
Street City State Zip

I/We (do){do not) agree with:
[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.1.2

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ 1 Approved [ X ] Disapproved [ ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

The full range of truncated dome spacing that is allowed in the model code (2004 ADAAG/2010 ADA
Standards) and the current California Building Code must be maintained. Many jurisdictions in California
have already set their standards and constructed many curb ramps with truncated domes spaced at 1.6
inches (41 mm). Each jurisdiction must be allowed to choose the truncated dome spacing that works best
for their constituents and their capital planning.

The public process that those jurisdictions undertook to develop and adopt their ADA Transition Plans for
Curb Ramps and Sidewalks incorporate such standards and took much effort to achieve.

The higher density of truncated domes provided by the tighter 1.6 inches spacing provides greater
redundancy. Greater redundancy reduces replacement costs over time due to damaged or missing
truncated domes.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As

Amend" and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10/26-12/10,2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use ltem No.

STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130
SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: chsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: ; Z4 | .
Patrick Rivera, PE _ %’/ ,& ,)\_\
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco ' CA 94103
Street City State - Zip

i/We (.do){pomt) agree with:
[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.1.3, Exception

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ X ] Disapproved [ ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

Delete the proposed exception to this section. Federal studies on the issue of the effectiveness of color
contrast for persons who are visually disabled indicate that the federal yellow color is most effective,
even when the contrast with the adjacent surface is as low as 40 percent. Feedback from our constituents
has confirmed the effectiveness of the yellow color in detectible warnings. .

The model code (2004 ADAAG / 2010 ADA Standards) and the current California Building Code do not
require providing a 1 inch wide black strip at yellow detectible warnings. What is the justification for this
requirement at only yellow detectible warnings and not other colors?

Reason: [The reason should be concise-if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As
Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Forin- 3rd 45 Day: 10/26-12/10/2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use item No.

STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130
SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: cbsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
Patrick Rivera, PE %4 .
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works

Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor San Francisco CA 94103

Street City State Zip

I/We (do){do not) agree with:
[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.1.4, Exception

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ ] Disapproved [X ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

Expand the exception to include all exterior locations. The products available on the market that provide
either resilience or sound-on-cane properties require replacement on a cycle that would be too
burdensome for public entities to meet. The deleterious effects of UV, weather, vehicular traffic, heavy
pedestrian traffic, pallet jacks, carts, etc. will result in rapid degradation of detectible warning materials
that are able to provide the properties of resilience or sound-on-cane.

The model code {2004 ADAAG / 2010 ADA Standards) and the current California Building Code do not
require providing the properties of resilience or sound-on-cane at exterior detectible warnings.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As
Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (foliowing) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 1026-12/10,2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use ltem No.

STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130
SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: chsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to. the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: %)L\,
Patrick Rivera, PE / /

Name (Print or type) (Signature)
Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works ]

Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor San Francisco CA 94103

Street City State Zip

[/We (do){do not) agree with:
[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.1.5, Exception

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ ] Disapproved [X ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

Revise the text to the following: “Detectible warning surfaces at curb ramps, islands or cut-through
medians may be of any color, provided sufficient visual contrast is provided with the directly adjacent
surrounding curb ramp, island or cut through median color.”

The proposed exception phrasing “...shall not be required to comply with...” could be misconstrued by
some who may claim that local jurisdictions that do require the yellow color on detectible warnings may
not do so.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As
Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10,26-12/10/2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use Item No.
STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130

SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: chsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
From: &/ /}’\;
Patrick Rivera, PE %/ v -
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco CA 94103
Street City State Zip

I/We (do)@ﬂ agree with:

[ X 1 The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.2.2

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ X ] Disapproved [ ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

Allow a range of 24 to 36 inches of detectible warnings on curb ramps. The 24 inch depth of detectible
warnings of truncated domes that is allowed in the PROWAG and as adopted by the FHWA must be -
allowed in order for the State and Federal access standards to be in full alignment. Many jurisdictions in
California have already set their curb ramp design standards and constructed many curb ramps with
truncated domes with the 24 inch depth. Each jurisdiction must be allowed to choose the truncated dome
amount that works best for their constituents, their capital planning and the many construction projects
completed to date.

The public process that those jurisdictions undertook to develop and adopt their ADA Transition Plans for
Curb Ramps and Sidewalks incorporate such standards and took much effort to achieve.

Federal studies have shown that 24 inches of detectible warnings are sufficient, and that is what most if
not all of the nation is typically following.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As

Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10/26-12/10/2012



STATE OF CALIFORNIA Office Use Item No.
STATE AND CONSUMER SERVICES AGENCY

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

2525 NATOMAS PARK DR., SUITE 130

SACRAMENTO, CA 95833

(916) 263-0916 Phone

(916) 263-0959 Fax

Email: chsc@dgs.ca.gov

PARTICIPATION COMMENTS FOR THE NOTICE DATED OCTOBER 26, 2012
Written comments are to be sent to the above address.

WRITTEN COMMENT DEADLINE: DECEMBER 10, 2012

Date: 10 December 2012
Patrick Rivera, PE / .
Name (Print or type) (Signature)

Jurisdiction & Agency: City & County of San Francisco, Department of Public Works
Agency, jurisdiction, chapter, company, association, individual, etc.

1680 Mission St., 4" Floor  San Francisco CA 94103
Street City State Zip

I'We (de)' agree with:

[ X ] The Agency proposed modifications As Submitted on Section No. 11B-705.1.2.3 through 11B-
7051.2.7

and request that this section or reference provision be recommended:

[ ] Approved [ X ] Disapproved [ ] Held for Further Study [ ] Approved as Amended

Suggested Revisions to the Text of the Regulations:

The 6 to 8 inches range of the location of the beginning of detectible warnings must apply to all
applications. When located adjacent to a street or lane, a lane of vehicular traffic or the dynamic envelop
of trolleys, streetcars or cable cars the spacing must be constituent with that which is adopted and
promulgated by federal agencies such as the FHWA. Many jurisdictions in California have already set
their standards and constructed many detectible warnings with a setback spacing of 6 to 8 inches. Each
jurisdiction must be allowed to choose the truncated dome loctions that works best for their constituents
and their capital planning.

The public process that those jurisdictions undertook to develop and adopt their ADA Transition Plans for
Curb Ramps and Sidewalks incorporate such standards and took much effort to achieve.

Reason: [The reason should be concise if the request is for “Disapproval,” “Further Study,” or “Approve As
Amend” and identify at least one of the 9-point criteria (following) of Health and Safety Code §18930.]
Reasons for the suggested revision are: 4, 5, 6, and 7.

Public Comment Form- 3rd 45 Day: 10/26-12/10/2012



