COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX- GREEN TITLE (CODE)

AGENCY: THE DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT [DSA-AC 01/12] CCR, TITLE 24, PT 2, CH 11B (2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE)
LEGEND:
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s Actions: Amendments, if indicated by agency:
(CAC)s: A = Accepted E=Existing
ACCESS = Accessibility AA = Approve as amended S = Statutory
BFO = Building, Fire & Other AS = Approve as submitted N = New
HF = Health Facilities D = Disapprove Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):
PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy FS =Further Study GREEN = uncontested items
SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces WI/D = Withdrawn by agency YELLOW = challenged items
GB = Green Building SALMON = W/D, no action required

ACCESS CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE (DSA-AC)

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, VOL. 1, CHAPTER 11B — ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS PUBLIC ACCOMMODATIONS, COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS AND
PUBLICLY FUNDED HOUSING

The following commenters submitted Approval for all Access Amendments during the 45-day comments period.

C.J. Hirshfield, Children’s Fairyland; John Paul Scott, AIA, CASp, CREATE Access Architects/Consultants; Robert Lorenzini, LEGOLAND; Daniel Conway, California
Restaurant Association; Mark Wood, CBO, CASp, California Certified Accessibility Specialists, Inc; John Robinson, CAPA; Wendy Crain, San Diego Coaster Company at
Belmont Park; Jay Bond California State University Fullerton, Janice L. Miller, Universal Studios; Kris Reyes, Santa Cruz Beach Boardwalk; Dana Wyatt, Pacific Park Santa
Monica, Thomas Kennedy, California State University

The following commenters submitted Approval for all Access Amendments during the 15-day comment period.

Sally Swanson, Sally Swanson Architects, Inc.; Brent Davies, AIA, LEED AP, ANOVA NEXUS Architectural; Steven Hinz, Sutter Health; Dennis Dong; Dan Conwell, Sutter
Health Facility; Ann Weaver, Harriss & Associates; Regina Konet, Konet Archtiecture; Scott Paddon, Boulder Associates Architects; James Benney, Sutter Health; Russell
Rocker, HGA Architects and Engineers; Scott Burnham, Silva Stowell Architects; Peter Oliver, NORR Associates; Victor Yanez, URS Corporation; Michael Malinowski,
Applied Architecture; Bruce Playle, INDIGO; Duane Thompson

The following commenter submitted Approval for specific Access Amendments during the 45-day comments period.

Eugene Lozano, California Council of the Blind (CCB); Section 1009.6 Pool Stairs, Section 406 Curb Ramps, 307.36.1 Edges and Corners, 11B-303.5 Warning Curbs, 11B-247
Detectable Warnings and Detectable Directional Texture, 11B-246.8 Nature Trails, 11B-246.4 Day Use Areas and Vista Points, 11B-220.2 Point of Sale Devices, 11B-216.6
Entrances, 11B-216.7 Elevators, 11B-216.8 Toilet Rooms and Bathing Rooms, 11B-216.9 TTY’s, 11B-216.10 Assistive Listening Systems, 11B-216.11 Check-out aisles, 11B-
216.12 Amusement Rides, 11B-216.2 Designations, 11B-216.3 Directional and Information Signs, 11B-216.4 Means of Egress, 11B-210 Stairs; 11B-206.4.4.1 Location, 11B-
206.2.1 Site Arrival Points, 11B-216.1; 11B-407.4.7.1.3 Symbols; 11B-407.4.10.3 Structural Strength; 11B-408.2.1 Call Buttons; 11B-408.2.3 Hoistway Signs; 11B-408.4.6 Car
Controls 11B-504.3 Open Risers; 11B-504.5 Nosings;11B-504.8 Floor Identification; 11B-505.5 Clearance; 11B-602.9 Pedestrian Protection; 11B-604.4 Seats; 11B-703.1
General; 11B-703.2 Raised Characters; 11B-703.5.6 Height From Finish or Ground;11B-703.3 Braille; 11B-703.4 Installation Height and Location; 11B-703.7.2.6 Toilet and
Bathing Facilities Geometric Symbols; 11B-703.7.2.7 Signs General; 11B-703.5.10 Format; 11B-703.5.7 Stroke Thickness; 11B-703.7.2.7 Pedestrain Traffic Control Buttons; 11B-
703.7.2.6 Toilet and Bathing Facilities Geometric Symbols; 11B-705.1.1 Dome Size; 11B-705.1.2.2 Curb Ramp; 11B-705.1.2.3 Islands or Cut Through Medians; 11B-705.1.2.4

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN Page 1 of 33 January 8, 2013
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B



Bus Stops; 11B-705.1.2.5 Hazardous Vehicular Areas; 11B-705.1.2.6 Reflecting Pools; 11B-705.1.2.7 Track Crossings; 11B-707.9.1.1 Tactilely Discernible Numerical Keypad;
11B-705.2 Detectable Directional Texture; 11B-705.1.1.1 Dome Size; 11B-703.5.10 Format; 11B-810.1 General; 11B-810.1.1 Vehicle Boarding; 11B-810.1.2 Baggage Systems.

The following commenters submitted Disapproval for any Access Amendments which would reduce CA standards during the 45-day comments period.

The commenters were not specific. Carolyn Minor, Dennis and Joanne Sharp, Sharp Design Consultants

During the 45-day comments period the following commenter submitted a comment pertaining to public right of way but was not specific.
Suzanne Furjanic, City of Santa Ana Public Works Agency — DSA amended 15Day language to incorporate federal Public Right of Way Guidelines.

CHAPTER 1-DIVISION | & II, CALIFORNIA SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

CBSC
Type ol | cac: | pagenoy 45Day C Action
: amend- ) esponse -Day Comments .
Item Number Code Section ment (AISS,F@)A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 1.1 Ch.1, Div. |
DSA-AC 01/12-1 1.1.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-2 1132 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-3 1.1.3.2 notel7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-4 1.1.11 Format... E/IN AS A
TOPIC 1.2 Section 1.9
DSA-AC 01/12-5 1.9.1 Access E/N A
Compliance...(3
paragraph)
DSA-AC 01/12-6 19114 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-7
DSA-AC 01/12-8 1.9.1.7 E AS A
TOPIC 1.3 Ch.1, Div. Il
DSA-AC 01/12-9 Ch. 1 Note E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-10 [A] 101.1 Title E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-11 [A] 101.2 Scope E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-12 | [A] 101.4.1 through E AS A
[A] 101.4.6
DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN Page 2 of 33 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B




CHAPTER 2-DEFINITIONS
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

Type
of AT CBSC
ame G Reg on)s/e 45-Day Comments AEon
[tem Number Code Section nd- | (AS, AA, b y Annotations (AS,
to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS)
ment D, FS) (A, D, WID) AA D,
(S, E, Y FS)
N)
TOPIC 2.1 DEFINITIONS
Section 202
DSA-AC 01/12-13 Access aisle E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-14 Accessibility EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-15 Accessible EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-16 Accessible element EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-17 Accessible means of EN A
egress
DSA-AC 01/12-18 Accessible route N A Michael Mankin DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
Recommends Disapprove and posted 15Day language; no comments
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible | received during 15 Day
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-19 Aceessible-route-of E A
travel
DSA-AC 01/12-20 Accessible space E/N A Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA modified the definition per public comment
Recommends Approve as Amended | and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-21 Adaptability E A
DSA-AC 01/12-22 Adaptable N A
DSA-AC 01/12-23 Adaptable-dwelling-unit E A
DSA-AC 01/12-24 Addition (2" paragraph | E/N A
only)
DSA-AC 01/12-25 Administrative authority EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-26 Aisle (2 paragraph E/N A
only)
DSA-AC 01/12-27 Aisle-empleyeeareas E A
DSA-AC 01/12-28 Alteration {er-Altery 2nd EIN A
paragraph only
DSA-AC 01/12-29 E A
DSA-AC 01/12-30 Amusement attraction N A
DSA-AC 01/12-31 Amusement ride N A
DSA-AC 01/12-32 Amusement ride seat N A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 3 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-33 ANSI E A
DSA-AC 01/12-34 Approved (2nd E A
paragraph only w/o
Notes)
DSA-AC 01/12-35 Approved testing E AS A
agency (2 paragraph
only)
DSA-AC 01/12-36 Area of refuge E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-37 Area of sport activity N A
DSA-AC 01/12-38
DSA-AC 01/12-39 Assistive-device E A
DSA-AC 01/12-40 Assistive listening N A
system (ALS)
DSA-AC 01/12-41 Automatic Teller E/N A
Machine
DSA-AC 01/12-42 Automatic door E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-43 Bathroom N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-44 Blended Transition N A
DSA-AC 01/12-45 Boarding pier N A
DSA-AC 01/12-46 Boat launch ramp N A
DSA-AC 01/12-47 Boat slip N A
DSA-AC 01/12-48 Building (w/o E A
exceptions-and Notes)
DSA-AC 01/12-49 Building-entrance-on-an E A
aceessibleroute
DSA-AC 01/12-50 -Building-existing E A
DSA-AC 01/12-51 Building Official E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-52 Catch pool N A
DSA-AC 01/12-53 CCR E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-54 Characters N A
DSA-AC 01/12-55 Children’s USE N A
DSA-AC 01/12-56 Circulation path E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-57 Clear E A
DSA-AC 01/12-58 Clear floor space EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-59 Closed-circuit telephone | EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-60 CommerciaHacilities E A
DSA-AC 01/12-61 Common use N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-62 Commenuse-areas E A
DSA-AC 01/12-63 COMPLY WITH EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-64 Cevered-multifamily A
dwellings
DSA-AC 01/12-65 Cross slope E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 4 of 33

January 8, 2013




and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-66 Curb cut EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-67 Curb ramp EIN A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-68 Detectable warning E/IN A
DSA-AC 01/12-69 Directional sign E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-70 Disability E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-71 Disabled E A
DSA-AC 01/12-72 Dormitory E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-73 DBwelling-urit E A
DSA-AC 01/12-74 Element EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-75 Elevated play N A
component
DSA-AC 01/12-76 Elevator, passenger E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-77 Employee work area N A
DSA-AC 01/12-78 Enforcing agency E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-79 Entrance E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-80 Equivalent facilitation E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-81 Existing-building E A
DSA-AC 01/12-82 Existing building or N A
facility
DSA-AC 01/12-83 Exit E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-84 Facility {er-facilities) E A
DSA-AC 01/12-85 Free-standing-pedestal E A
DSA-AC 01/12-86 Gangway N A
DSA-AC 01/12-87 Golf car passage N A
DSA-AC 01/12-88 Grab bar EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-89 Grade (adjacent ground E AS A
elevation)
DSA-AC 01/12-90 Grade Break E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-91 Ground floor E A
DSA-AC 01/12-92 Ground level play N A
component
DSA-AC 01/12-93 Guard {er-guardrai) E A
DSA-AC 01/12-94 Handrail E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-95 Health care provider E A
DSA-AC 01/12-96 Historical Buildings E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-97 If,If ... Then EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-98 independententity E A
DSA-AC 01/12-99 International Symbol of E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 5 of 33

January 8, 2013




Accessibility

and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day

DSA-AC 01/12-100 | Key station N A
DSA-AC 01/12-101 | Kick plate EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-102 | Kitchen or kitchenette N A
DSA-AC 01/12-103 | Lavatory N A
DSA-AC 01/12-104 | Levelaceessible-area E A
DSA-AC 01/12-105 | Level area E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-106 | Lift, platform E A
DSA-AC 01/12-107 | Mail boxes N A
DSA-AC 01/12-108 | Marked crossing EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-109 | May EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-110
DSA-AC 01/12-111 | Multiple- E A
! .
facility
DSA-AC 01/12-112 | Multistory-dwelling-unit E A
DSA-AC 01/12-113 | Newly-constructed E A
DSA-AC 01/12-114 | NFPA E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-115 | Nosing {er-nese} 2 E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with
paragraph only model code language and posted 15Day language;
no comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-116 | Occupant load N A Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group | DSA modified the definition to coordinate with
Recommends Disapprove model code language and posted 15Day language;
no comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-117 | Occupiable space E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-118 | Open riser E/IN A
DSA-AC 01/12-119 | Operable part E/IN A
DSA-AC 01/12-120 | Passage-deer E A
DSA-AC 01/12-121 | Passenger elevator E A
DSA-AC 01/12-122
DSA-AC 01/12-123 | Pedestrian EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-124 | Pedestrian-grade E A
separation
DSA-AC 01/12-125 | Pedestrianramp E A
DSA-AC 01/12-126 | Pedestrian way E/IN A
DSA-AC 01/12-127 | Permanent E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-128 | Permit E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-129 | Persens-with-disabilities E A
DSA-AC 01/12-130 | Pictogram N A
DSA-AC 01/12-131 | Place of public N A
accommodation
DSA-AC 01/12-132 | Platform E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-133 | Platform (wheelchair) lift | E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD

and posted 15Day language; no comments

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 6 of 33

January 8, 2013




received during 15 Day

DSA-AC 01/12-134 | Play area N A
DSA-AC 01/12-135 | Play component N A
DSA-AC 01/12-136 | Powder room EIN A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-137 | Power-assisted door E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-138 | Private building or N A
facility
DSA-AC 01/12-139 | Professional office of a E/N A
health care provider
DSA-AC 01/12-140 | Public-accommedation E A
DSA-AC 01/12-141 | Public building or facility N A
DSA-AC 01/12-142 | Public entity N A
DSA-AC 01/12-143 | Public entrance N A
DSA-AC 01/12-144
DSA-AC 01/12-145 | Public use A
DSA-AC 01/12-146 | Public-use areas E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-147 | Public way E/N A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-148 | Qualified-historicat A
DSA-AC 01/12-149 | Qualified historic N A
building or facility
DSA-AC 01/12-150 | Ramp 2" paragraph EIN A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
only and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-151 | Reasonable portion E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-152 | Recommend E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-153 | Remodeling E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-154 | Repair E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-155 | Residential dwelling unit N A
DSA-AC 01/12-156 | Restricted entrance N A
DSA-AC 01/12-157 | Riser EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-158 | Running slope EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-159 | Sanitary-facility E A
DSA-AC 01/12-160 | Self-service storage N A
DSA-AC 01/12-161 | Service entrance E A
DSA-AC 01/12-162 | Shall EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-163 | Shopping center or E/N A
shopping mall
DSA-AC 01/12-164 | Should EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-165 | Sidewalk EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-166 | Signage E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-167 | Single-accommeodation E A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 7 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-168 | Sink N A
DSA-AC 01/12-169 | Site EIN A DSA modified the definition to coordinate with HCD
and model code language. DSA posted 15Day
language; no comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-170
DSA-AC 01/12-171 | Sleeping E/N A
accommodations
DSA-AC 01/12-172 | Slepe E A
DSA-AC 01/12-173 | Soft contained play N A
structure
DSA-AC 01/12-174 | Space EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-175 i E A
DSA-AC 01/12-176 | Specified public EIN A
transportation
DSA-AC 01/12-177 | Stage E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-178 | Stair E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-179 | Stairway E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-180 | Story (2 paragraph E/N A
only)
DSA-AC 01/12-181 | Steryfirst E A
DSA-AC 01/12-182
DSA-AC 01/12-183 | Structure E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-184 | Tactile EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-185
DSA-AC 01/12-186 | Teeing ground N A
DSA-AC 01/12-187 | Temporary E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-188 | Text telephone E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-189 | Transfer device N A
DSA-AC 01/12-190 | Transient lodging E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-191 | Transit boarding E/N A
platform
DSA-AC 01/12-192 | Transition plate N A
DSA-AC 01/12-193 | Tread EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-194 | TTY N A
DSA-AC 01/12-195 | Fype-ofmetorfuel E A
DSA-AC 01/12-196 | Unreasonable hardship E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-197 | Use zone N A
DSA-AC 01/12-198 | Vehicular-orpedestrian E A
arrival-points
DSA-AC 01/12-199 | Vehicular way E/N A
DSA-AC 01/12-200 | Walk EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-201 | Wet bar EIN A
DSA-AC 01/12-202 | Wheelchair E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-203 | Wheelehair-occupant E A
{orwheelehairuser)

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 8 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-204 | WHEELCHAIR SPACE N A
DSA-AC 01/12-205 | Workstation (21 EIN A
paragraph only)
DSA-AC 01/12-206 | Work area equipment N A
DSA-AC 01/12- Structurally Michael Mankin
306.2 Item added Impracticable Recommends Disapprove Agency modified this item per public comment and
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible | posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommends Disapprove during 15 Day
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
CHAPTER 3- USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
Type of CAC: Agency AC\cBuSo?l
. amend- ) Response 45-Day Comments .
Item Number Code Section ment (AISS,F@)A, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 3.1 Section-302 AA A
fioat
DSA-AC 01/12-207 | 362-1-General-& E W/D W/D
subsections
TOPIC 3.2 Section 310
DSA-AC 01/12-208 | DORMITORY. A E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12- 307.4 Vertical E AS A DSA modified this item due to an error discovered
208.1 Item added Clearance during 45 day comment period. DSA posted 15Day
for 2nd 15Day language; no comments received during 15 Day.
comment
DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN Page 9 of 33 January 8, 2013

Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B




CHAPTER 4- SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

T CBSC
ype of ) Agency 3
. amend- GRES Response 45-Day Comments ] g
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 4.1 Section 406
DSA-AC 01/12-209 | 406-2-2 406.4.1 E AS A
TOPIC 4.2 Section 410
DSA-AC 01/12-210 | PLATFORM. E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-211 | STAGE. E AS A
TOPIC 4.3 Section 412
DSA-AC 01/12-212 | 432.3:6 412.3.5 E AS A
TOPIC 4.4 Section 419
DSA-AC 01/12-213 | 419.7 Accessibility E AS A
CHAPTER 9- FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
CBSC
Type of . Agency ;
amend- CAC: Response 45-Day Comments Action
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 9.1 Section 907
DSA-AC 01/12-214 | 907.2.11 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-215 | 907.2.11.2 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-216 | 907.2.11.3 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-217 | 907.2.11.4 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-218 | 907.4.2.2 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-219 | 907.5.2.1 E FS A
Exceptionl
DSA-AC 01/12-220 | 907.5.2.3 E FS A
Exception 1 & 2
DSA-AC 01/12-221 | 907.5.2.3.3 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-222 | Table 907.5.2.3.3 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-223 | 907.5.2.3.4 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 10 of 33

January 8, 2013




CHAPTER 10- MEANS OF EGRESS

Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- GRE; Response 45-Day Comments AEE
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E, N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 10.1 Section 1002
DSA-AC 01/12-224 | 1002.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-225 | ACCESSIBLE E AS A
MEANS OF
EGRESS.
DSA-AC 01/12-226 | AREA OF E AS A
REFUGE.
An-area-
DSA-AC 01/12-227 | EXIT. E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-228 | GUARD {JBSA-AC] E AS A
o-GUARDRAL)
Abuilding-—
DSA-AC 01/12-229 | HANDRAIL. E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-230 | PUBLIC WAY. E AS A
A-street
DSA-AC 01/12-231 | STAIR. E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-232 | STAIRWAY. E AS A
TOPIC 10.2 SECTION 1003 A
DSA-AC 01/12-233 | 1003.5, exception E AS A
1,2&3
TOPIC 10.3 SECTION 1007 A
DSA-AC 01/12-234 | 1007.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-235 | 1007.2 Items 1-6 E AS A
and 8
DSA-AC 01/12-236 | 1007.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-237 | 1007.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-238 | 1007.5; E AS A
[DSA-AC]
DSA-AC 01/12-239 | 1007.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-240 | 1007.6.1 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 11 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-241 | 1007.8.1 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-242 | 1007.8.1.1 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-243 | 1007.8.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-244 | 1007.9; E AS A
ltem1&
Signage...

DSA-AC 01/12-245 | 1007.10 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-246 | 1007.11 E AS A

TOPIC 10.4 SECTION 1008 A

DSA-AC 01/12-247 | [DSA-AC]IN... E A

DSA-AC 01/12-248 | 1008.1.4 Special E AS A
doors, Item, 5

DSA-AC 01/12-249 | 1008.1.7 E AS A
Thresholds, Item, 2

DSA-AC 01/12-250 | 1008.9.1 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-251 | 1008.1.9.7 Items 4 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-252 | 1008.1.9.7 Items 5 E FS A
&5.1

TOPIC 10.5 SECTION 1009

DSA-AC 01/12-253 | DSA-AC]In.. E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-254 | 1009:4.2 1009.7.2 E AS A
& Exept. 6

DSA-AC 01/12-255 | 4809:12-1009.15 & E AS A
[DSA-AC]...

TOPIC 10.6 SECTION 1010

DSA-AC 01/12-256 DSA-AC]... E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-257 | 1010.1 E AS A
Exempt. 2

TOPIC 10.7 SECTION 1011

DSA-AC 01/12-258 | 16143 1011.4 E AS A
& Forthe

TOPIC 10.8 SECTION 1012

DSA-AC 01/12-259 | [DSA-AC]... E AS A

TOPIC 10.9 SECTION 1013

DSA-AC 01/12-260 | 18431 E AS A
1013.2

DSA-AC 01/12-261 | 16132 E AS A
10133 &
Exceptions.
1 through 5

DSA-AC 01/12-262 | 16133 E AS A
1013.4

TOPIC 10.10 SECTION 1017

DSA-AC 01/12-263 | [DSA-AC]In... E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 12 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-264 | 10472 E AS A
1017.3 &
Exception:
Nonpublic...
TOPIC 10.11 SECTION 1017
DSA-AC 01/12-265 | 1022:8 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-266 | 1022.9 EIN AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-267 | Faetile In addition... AS A
CHAPTER 11A- HOUSING ACCESSIBILITY
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
CBSC
Type of . Agency )
amend- CAC: Response 45-Day Comments Action
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, b y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 11A.0 | Chapter 11A
DSA-AC 01/12-268 | +102A3-1-Exe: E NO
ACTION
NEEDED
DSA-AC 01/12-269 | +04A2-Exe: E NO
ACTION
NEEDED
DSA-AC 01/12-270 | 1128A through E NO
1136A ACTION
NEEDED
CHAPTER 11B- ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS, PUBLIC ACCOMMODATIONS,
COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS AND PUBLICLY FUNDED HOUSING
Repeal Entire Chapter
Type of CAC: Agency AC(|:3t|So$1
Item Number Code Section | 2mend- (AS, AA, RESEIES D (CEIIELS Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ’ (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC11B.1 | Chapter 11B
DSA-AC 01/12-271 | ENTIRE CHAPTER E AS A
SECTION-1101B
SCOPE-Through
FIGURE11B41

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California

Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 13 of 33

January 8, 2013




CHAPTER 11B-DIVISION | - APPLICATION AND ADMINISTRATION
Adopt Chapter with Amendedments as listed below

Recommends Approve as Amended
Michael Mankin
Recommends Approve as Amended
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove

Agency modified the definition per public comment
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day

Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- CRES Response 45-Day Comments Aieiler
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E,N) ' (A, D, WID) o
FS)
TOPIC 11B.2
DSA-AC 01/12-272 | 11B-101.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-273 | 11B-101.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-274 | 11B-102 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-275 | 11B-105.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-276 | 14B-105:2 thru E AS A
11B-105:2.5
DSA-AC 01/12-277 | 11B-106.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-278 | 11B-106.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-279 | 11B-106.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-280 | 11B-106.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-281
DSA-AC 01/12-282 | 11B-107 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-283 | 11B-108 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-284 | 11B-201.1 Scope E FS A Agency modified the Scope per public comment
and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-201.1 Scope Michael Mankin Agency modified the Scope per public comment
284.1 Item added ADD EXCEPTION Recommends Approve as Amended | and posted 15Day language; no comments
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible | received during 15 Day
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-285 | 11B-201.4 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-286 | 11B-202.2 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-287
DSA-AC 01/12-288 | 11B-202.3.3 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-289 | 11B-202.4 E FS A Tim McCormick, VCA Code Group

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 14 of 33

January 8, 2013




15-Day comment:

Janis Kent Stepping Thru
Accessibility
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-290 | 11B-203.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-291 | 11B-203.8 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-292 | 11B-203.9 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-293 | 11B-205.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-294 | 11B-206.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-295 | 11B-206.2.1 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-296 | 11B-206.2.3 E AA A Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & Agency modified an item to better clarify and
Inspection Services posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommend Approve as Amended | during 15 Day
Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-297 | 11B-206.2.4 E AA A Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & Agency modified the definition per public comment
Inspection Services and posted 15Day language; no comments
Recommend Approve as Amended | received during 15 Day
Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
15-Day comment:
Janis Kent Stepping Thru
Accessibility
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-298
DSA-AC 01/12-299 | 11B-206.2.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-300
DSA-AC 01/12-301
DSA-AC 01/12-302 | 11B-206.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-303 | 11B-206.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-304 | 11B-206.4.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-305 | 11B-206.4.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-306 | 11B-206.4.4.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-307 | 11B-206.4.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-308 | 11B-206.4.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-309 | 11B-206.4.10 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-310 | 11B-206.5.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-311 | 11B-206.5.2 E AS A Mark Wood, CASp Agency modified the item to correct a drafting error
Recommends Approve as Amended | and posted 15Day language; no comments
received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-312 | 11B-206.5.5 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-313 | 11B-206.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-314 | 11B-206.7.6 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 15 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-315 | 11B-207.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-316 | 11B-207.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-317 | 11B-208.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-318 | 11B-208.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-319 | 11B-208.2.3.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-320 | 11B-208.2.3.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-321 | 11B-208.3.2 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-322 | 11B-208.3.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-323 | 11B-209.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-324 | 11B-209.2.3 E AS A Gail Farber County of LA Agency modified this item per public comment and
Recommend Approve as Amended | and error. Agency posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-325 | 11B-209.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-326 | 11B-210.1 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-327 | 11B-212 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-328 | 11B-212.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-329 | 11B-212.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-330 | 11B-213.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-331 | 11B-213.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-332
DSA-AC 01-12- 11B-213.2.1 E AS A Daniel Larsen, DPL Consulting & Agency modified this item per public comment and
332.1 Inspection Services for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Item added for 45 Recommend Approve as Amended comments received during 15 Day
Day comment Jay Hyde, SCABO
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-333 | 11B-213.2.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-334 | 11B-213.2.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-335 | 11B-213.3.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-336 | 11B-213.3.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-337 | 11B-213.3.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-338 | 11B-215.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-339 | 11B-215.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-340 | 11B-215.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-341 | 11B-215.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-342 | 11B-216.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-343
DSA-AC 01/12-344 | 11B-216.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-345 | 11B-216.4.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-346 | 11B-216.4.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-347 | 11B-216.4.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-348 | 11B-216.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-349 | 11B-216.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-350 | 11B-216.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-351 | 11B-216.8 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-352 | 11B-216.9.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 16 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-353 | 11B-216.10 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-354 | 11B-216.11 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-355 | 11B-216.12 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-356 | 11B-216.13 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-357 | 11B-216.13.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-358 | 11B-216.13.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-359 | 11B-216.13.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-360 | Table 11B-217.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-361 | 11B-217.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-362 | 11B-217.4.3.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-363
DSA-AC 01/12-364 | 11B-219.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-365 | Fable219:3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-366 | 11B-219.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-367 | 11B-219.5 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-368 | 11B-220 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-369 | 11B-220.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-370 | 11B-220.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-371 | 11B-220.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-372 | 11B-220.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-373 | 11B-220.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-374 | 11B-221.1 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-375 | Table 11B- E FS A
221.2.1.1
DSA-AC 01/12-376 | 11B-221.4 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-377 | 11B-221.6 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-378 | 11B-222.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-379 | 11B-223.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-380 | 11B-223.1.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-381 | 11B-223.1.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-382 | 11B-223.1.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-383 | 11B-223.1.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-384 | 11B-223.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-385 | 11B-223.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-386 | 11B-223.2.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-387 | 11B-223.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-388 | 11B-223.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-389 | 11B-224.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-390 | 11B-224.1.1 E W/D A
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-224.1.2 E Agency modified this item due to an error
390.1 Item added discovered during 45 day comment period. DSA
for 15Day comment posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day.
DSA-AC 01/12-391 | 11B-224.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-392 | 11B-224.14 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 17 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-393 | 11B-224.1.5 N AS A DSA modified this item and posted 15Day
language; no comments received during 15 Day.

DSA-AC 01/12-394 | 11B-224.1.5.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-395 | 11B-224.1.5.2 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-396 | 11B-224.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-397 | 11B-224.2.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-398 | 11B-224.2.2 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-399 | Table 11B-224.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-400 | Table 11B-224.4 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-401 | 11B-224.6 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-402 | 11B-225.2.3 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-403 | 11B-226.1 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-404 | 11B-226.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-405 | 11B-227.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-406 | 11B-228.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-407 | 11B-232.2 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-408 | 11B-232.2.1.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-409 | 11B-232.2.1.2 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-410 | 11B-232.2.1.3 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-411 | 11B-232.2.1.4 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-412 | 11B-232.3 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-413 | 11B-233.1.1 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-414 | 11B-233.1.2 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-415 | 11B-233.2 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-416 | 11B-233.3 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-417 | 11B-233.3.1.2 N FS A DSA modified this item and posted 15Day
language; no comments received during 15 Day.

DSA-AC 01/12-418 | 11B-233.3.1.2.1 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-419 | 11B-233.3.1.2.2 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-420 | 11B-233.3.1.2.3 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-421 | 11B-233.3.1.24 N FS A DSA modified this item and posted 15Day
language; no comments received during 15 Day.

DSA-AC 01/12-422 | 233312 11B- EN FS A

2333.1.3

DSA-AC 01/12-423 | 11B-233.3.2 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-424 | 11B-233.3.3 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-425 | 11B-233.34 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-426 | 11B-233.3.4.1 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-427 | 11B-233.3.4.2 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-428 | 11B-233.3.5 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-429 | 11B-233.3.6 N FS A

DSA-AC 01/12-430 | 11B-244 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-431 | 11B-244.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-432 | 11B-245 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12-433 | 11B-245.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 18 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-434 | 11B-245.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-435 | 11B-245.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-436 | 11B-246 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-437 | 11B-246.1 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-438 | 11B-246.2 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-439 | 11B-246.3 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-440 | 11B-246.4 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-441 | 11B-246.5 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-247.1.2 E DSA modified this item to align with model code
441.1 11B-247.1.2.1 language. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Item added for 45 11B-247.1.2.2 comments received during 15 Day.
Day comment 11B-247.1.2.3
11B-247.1.2.4
DSA-AC 01/12-442 | 11B-303.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-443 | 11B-303.5 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-444 | 11B-306.2.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-445 | 11B-306.3.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-446 | 11B-306.3.2 AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-447 | 11B-306.3.3 E FS A Janis Kent CASp Stepping Thru DSA modified this item for clarity. DSA posted
Accessibility 15Day language; no comments received during 15
Recommend Approve as Amended | Day.
Richard Traversi CDCR
Recommend Approve as Amended
Michael Mankin
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Approve as Amended
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
15Day Comment:
Len Swatkowski, PMI
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-448 | 11B-306.3.4 E AS A Richard Traversi CDCR DSA modified this item to remove an error during
Recommend Approve as Amend 45 day language. DSA posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day.
DSA-AC 01-12- 11B-306.3.5 E AS A Michael Mankin DSA modified this item for clarity. DSA posted
448.1 ltem Added Recommends Approve as Amended | 15Day language; no comments received during 15
for 45Day comment Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible | Day.
Recommends Approve as Amended
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Approve as Amended
Susan Chandler, CDR
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-449 | 11B-307.3.1 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 19 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-450 | 11B-308.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-451 | 11B-308.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-452 | 11B-308.3.1 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-453 | 11B-403.3 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-454 | 11B-403.4 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-455 | 11B-403.5.1 E FS A Gail Farber County of LA DSA modified this item to remove an error during
Recommend Approve as Amended | 45 day language. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Michael Mankin comments received during 15 Day.
Recommends Disapprove
Richard Skaff, Designing Accessible
Recommends Disapprove
Peter Margen, Margen & Associates
Recommends Disapprove
DSA-AC 01/12-456 | 11B-403.7 N FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-457 | 11B-404.1 E FS A Richard Traversi CDCR DSA modified this item per public comment. DSA
Recommend Approve as Amended posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-458 | 11B-404.2.4 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-459 | Table 11B- E FS A
404.24.1
DSA-AC 01/12-460 | Figure 11B- E FS A Neal Casper, CASp Casper DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
404.2.4.1 Development Resources posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommend Approve as Amended | during 15 Day
Mark Wood, CASp
Recommend Approve as Amended | DSA issued another 15 Day language to correct a
drafting error.
15-Day comment:
Janis Kent Stepping Thru
Accessibility
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-461 | Figure 11B- E FS A
404.2.4.2
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-404.2.43 & E Mark Wood, CASp DSA modified this item and figure to correct an
461.1 ltem added Figure 11B- Recommends Approve as Amended | error. DSA posted 15Day language; no comments
for 15 Day 404243 received during 15 Day
comment
DSA-AC 01/12-462 | 11B-404.2.5 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-463 | Figure 11B- FS A Mark Wood, CASp DSA modified this item and figure to correct an
404.2.6 Recommends Approve as Amended error. DSA posted 15Day language; no comments
Neal Casper, CASp Casper received during 15 Day
Development Resources
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-464 | 11B-404.2.7 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-465
DSA-AC 01/12-466 | 11B-404.2.10 E FS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 20 of 33 January 8, 2013



DSA-AC 01/12-467 | 11B-404.2.11 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-468 | 11B-404.3 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-469 | 11B-404.3.1 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-470 | 11B-405.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-471 | Fable4052 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-472 | 11B-405.5 E FS A
DSA-AC 01/12-473 | Figure 11B-405.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-474
DSA-AC 01/12-475
DSA-AC 01/12-476
DSA-AC 01/12-477 | 11B-405.7.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-478 | 11B-405.8 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-479 | 11B-405.9 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-480 | 11B-405.9.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-481 ; 9 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-482 | 11B-405.9.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-483 | 11B-406 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-484 | 406-% thru 4067 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-485 | 11B-406.1 thru N AS A
11B-406.2.2
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.1 N AS A DSA modified this item to align with the definition of
485.1 CURB RAMP. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Item added for 15 comments received during 15 Day
Day comment
DSA-AC 01/12-486 | Figure 11B- E AS A
406.2.2
DSA-AC 01/12-487 | 11B-406.3 thru N AS A
11B-406.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12-488 | Figure 11B- N AS A
406.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12-489 | 11B-406.4 thru N AS A
11B-406.5.3
Landings
DSA-AC 01/12-490 | Figure 4064 E AS A
11B-406.5.3
DSA-AC 01/12-491 | 11B-406.5.4 thru N AS A
11B-406.5.7
DSA-AC 01/12-492 | Figure 406-2 E AS A
11B-406.5.7
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.5.8 Michael Penrose, Sacramento DSA modified this item due to public comment and
492.1 Counter Slope County, Dept. of Transportation for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Item add for 45 Day Recommend Disapprove comments received during 15 Day.
comment Matt Carpenter, SACOG;

Recommend Disapprove
Jose Luis Caceres, SACOG,;
Recommend Disapprove

DSA is not proposing other modifications for this
item. See DSA’s FSOR for explanation

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 21 of 33

January 8, 2013




Richard Shepard City of Elk Grove
Recommend Approve as Amended
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Further Study
Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine
Recommend Approve as Amended

Norm Hughes, City of Freemont
Recommends Approve as Amended

Terry Abbott CDorT
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.5.9 AS Christophe Schneiter P.E., DSA modified this item due to public comment and
492.2 Clear Space City of Santa Cruz; for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
Item add for 45 Day Recommend Disapprove comments received during 15 Day.
comment Michael Mitchell

Recommend Disapprove
Roxanne Namazi, City of Davis;
Recommend Approve as Amended
Herb Fredricksen
Recommend Further Study
Michael Penrose, Sacramento
County, Dept. of Transportation;
Recommend Disapprove
Panos Kokkas, Yolo County Dept
Planning & Public works;
Recommend Disapprove
Matt Carpenter, SACOG;
Recommend Disapprove
Jose Luis Caceres, SACOG;
Recommend Disapprove
Murali Pasumarthis
County of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Richard Shepard City of Elk Grove
Recommend Approve as Amended
Gail Farber County of LA
Recommend Disapprove
Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF
Recommended Further Study
Jose Navarro
City of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Fletcher Callanta
City of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Robert Newman, City of Santa
Clarita
Recommend Disapprove

DSA is not proposing other modifications for this
item. See DSA's FSOR for explanation

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 22 of 33

January 8, 2013




Norm Hughes, City of Freemont
Recommends Approve as Amended

Terry Abbott CDorT
Recommend Disapprove
Edric Doringo Cit of SD
Recommended Further Study

DSA-AC 01/12-493 | 11B-406.5.8 thru N AS A

11B-406.5.10
DSA-AC 01/12-494
DSA-AC 01/12-495
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-406.5 Herb Fredricksen DSA modified this item to coordinate with
495.1 ltem added Recommend Further Study amendment to 11B-406.5.3. DSA posted 15Day
for 15Day comment Alexandra Warner language; no comments received during 15 Day

City of San Diego
Recommend Further Study
Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine
Recommend Approve as Amended

DSA-AC 01/12-496 | Figure 406-7 11B- E AS A

406.6
DSA-AC 01/12-497 | 11B-407.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-498 | 11B-407.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-499 | 11B-407.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-500 | 11B-407.2.1.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-501 | 11B-407.2.1.2 E AS A Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item due to public comment and

Recommend Approve as Amended for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day

DSA-AC 01/12-502 | 11B-407.2.1.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-503 | 11B-407.2.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-504 | 11B-407.2.2.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-505 | 11B-407.2.2.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-506
DSA-AC 01/12-507 | Figure 11B- E AS A

407231
DSA-AC 01/12-508
DSA-AC 01/12-509 | Figure 11B- E AS A

407.2.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12-510 | 11B-407.35 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-511 | 11B-407.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-512 | Table 11B-407.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-513 | Figure 11B- E AS A

407.4.1
DSA-AC 01/12-514 | 11B-407.4.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-515 | 11B-407.4.6.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-516 | 11B-407.4.6.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-517 | 11B-407.4.6.2.3 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 23 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-518 | 11B-407.4.6.2.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-519 | 11B-407.4.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-520

DSA-AC 01/12-521 | 11B-407.4.7.1.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-522 | Table 11B- E AS A

407.4.7.1.3

DSA-AC 01/12-523 | 11B-407.4.7.1.5 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-524

DSA-AC 01/12-525

DSA-AC 01/12-526 | 11B-407.4.10.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-527 | 11B-407.4.10.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-528 | 11B-408.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-529 | 11B-408.3.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-530 | 11B-408.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-531 | Figure 11B- E AS A

408.4.1

DSA-AC 01/12-532 | 11B-409.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-533 | 11B-409.3.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-534 | 11B-409.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-535 | 11B-410.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-536 | 11B-410.7 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-537

DSA-AC 01/12-538 | 11B-502.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-539 | Figure 11B-502.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-540 | Figure 11B-502.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-541

DSA-AC 01/12-542

DSA-AC 01/12-543 | 11B-502.3.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-544 | 11B-502.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-545 | 11B-502.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-546 | 11B-502.6.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-547 | 11B-502.6.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-548

DSA-AC 01/12-549 | 11B-502.6.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-550 | 11B-502.6.4.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-551 | 11B-502.6.4.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-552 | 11B-502.7.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-553 | 11B-502.7.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-554 | 11B-502.8 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-555 | 11B-502.8.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-556 | 11B-502.8.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-557 | 11B-503 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-558 | 11B-503.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-559 | 11B-503.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-560 | 11B-503.3 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 24 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-561

DSA-AC 01/12-562 | Figure 11B-503.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-563 | 11B-503.6 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-564
DSA-AC 01/12-565 | 11B-504.4.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-566 | 11B-504.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-567 | Figure 11B-504.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-568 | 11B-504.8 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-569 | 11B-505.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-570 | 11B-505.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-571 | 11B-505.10.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-572 | Figure 11B- E AS A
505.10.3
DSA-AC 01/12-573 | 11B-602.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-574 | 11B-602.8 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-575 | 11B-602.9 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-576 | 11B-603.2.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-577
DSA-AC 01/12-578 | 11B-604.3.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-579
DSA-AC 01/12-580 | 11B-604.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-581 | 11B-604.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-582 | 11B-604.5.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-583 | Figure 11B- E AS A
604.5.1
DSA-AC 01/12-584 | 11B-604.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-585 | 11B-604.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-586 | Figure 11B-604.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-587 | 11B-604.8.1.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-588 | 11B-604.8.1.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-589 | Figure 11B- N AS A
604.8.1.1.2
DSA-AC 01/12-590 | 11B-604.8.1.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-591 | Figure 11B- N AS A
604.8.1.1.3
DSA-AC 01/12-592 | 11B-604.8.1.2 E AS A DSA modified this item for clarity due to public
comment. DSA posted additional 15Day language;
no comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-593 | Figure 11B- E AS A
604.8.1.2
DSA-AC 01/12-594 | 11B-604.8.1.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-595 | 11B-604.8.1.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-596 | 11B-604.8.2.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-597 | Figure 11B- E AS A
604.8.2
DSA-AC 01/12-598

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 25 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-599 | 11B-605.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-600 | 11B-606.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-601 | 11B-606.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-602 | 11B-606.6 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-603 | 11B-606.7 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-604 | 11B-607.2 E AS A DSA modified this item and figure to clarify
clearances. DSA posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-605 | 11B-607.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-606
DSA-AC 01/12-607 | Figure6082.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-608 | 11B-608.2.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-609 | 11B-608.2.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-610 | Figure 11B- E AS A
608.2.2
DSA-AC 01/12-611 | 11B-608.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-612
DSA-AC 01/12-613 : 3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-614 | 11B-608.3.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-615 | Figure 11B- E AS A
608.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12-616 | 11B-608.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-617 | 11B-608.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-618
DSA-AC 01/12-619 | Figure6085-1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-620 | 11B-608.5.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-621 | Figure 11B- E AS A
608.5.2
DSA-AC 01/12-622 | 11B-608.5.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-623 | Figure 11B- E AS A
608.5.3
DSA-AC 01/12-624 | 11B-608.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-625 | 11B-608.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-626 | 11B-608.9 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-627 | 11B-608.10 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-628
DSA-AC 01/12-629 | 11B-609.9 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-630 | 11B-610.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-631 | 11B-702.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-632 | 11B-703.1.1 N AS A DSA modified this item to provide specific reference
sections. DSA posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-633 | 11B-703.1.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-634 | 11B-703.1.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-635 | 11B-703.2.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-636 | 11B-703.2.9 N AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 26 of 33

January 8, 2013




669.1 Item added

DSA-AC 01/12-637 | Table 11B-703.3.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-638 | 11B-703.3.2 E AS A Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item due to public comment and
Recommend Approve as Amended for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
comments received during 15 Day

DSA-AC 01/12-639 | Figure 11B- E AS A

703.3.2
DSA-AC 01/12-640 | 11B-703.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-641 | Figure 11B- E AS A

703.4.1
DSA-AC 01/12-642 | 11B-703.4.2 E AS A Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item due to public comment and

Recommend Approve as Amended | for clarity. DSA posted 15Day language; no
15Day Comment: comments received during 15 Day
Sharon Toji Access Communications
Recommend Approve as Amended

DSA-AC 01/12-643 | 11B-703.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-644 | 11B-703.5.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-645 | Table 11B-703.5.5 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-646 | 11B-703.5.6 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-647 | 11B-703.5.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-648 | 11B-703.5.10 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-649 | 11B-703.7.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-650 | 11B-703.7.2.5 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-651 | 11B-703.7.2.6 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-652 | 11B-703.7.2.6.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-653 | 11B-703.7.2.6.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-654 | 11B-703.7.2.6.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-655 | 11B-703.7.2.6.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-656 | 11B-703.7.2.7 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-657 | 11B-704.2.1.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-658 | Figure 11B- E AS A

704.2.1.2
DSA-AC 01/12-659 | 11B-704.3 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-660 | 11B-704.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-661 | 11B-705 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-662
DSA-AC 01/12-663 | #05-% 11B-705.1.1 E FSIST A
DSA-AC 01/12-664
DSA-AC 01/12-665
DSA-AC 01/12-666 | Part 12 11A-201 E AS A

and-11B-201
DSA-AC 01/12-667 Figure 11B- E AS A

705.1

DSA-AC 01/12-668
DSA-AC 01/12-669
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-705.1.1.5 N Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item to correct and error. DSA

Recommend Approve as Amended

posted 15Day language; no comments received

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 27 of 33

January 8, 2013




for 45 Day Patrick Rivera City & Co. of SF during 15 Day
comment Recommended Further Study
Michael Apodaca, City of Irvine
Recommend Approve as Amended
15Day Comment:
Sharon Toji Access Communications
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-670
DSA-AC 01/12-671
DSA-AC 01/12-672
DSA-AC 01/12-673 | 11B-705.1.2.3 N AS A Terry Abbott CDorT DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Recommend Approve as Amended posted 15Day language; no comments received
15Day Comment: during 15 Day
Eugene Lozano, CCB
Recommend Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-674 | 11B-705.1.2.4 N AS A Gail Farber County of LA DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Recommend Disapprove posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-675 | 11B-705.1.2.5 N AS A Brian Moffitt DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Schools Insurance Authority posted 15Day language; no comments received
Recommend Approve as Amended during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-676 | 11B-705.1.2.6 N AS A DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-705.1.2.7 N AS A DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
675.1 Item added posted 15Day language; no comments received
for 15Day comment during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-677 | 11B-705.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-678 | Figure 11B-705.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-679
DSA-AC 01/12-680 | 11B-706.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-681 | 11B-707 E AS A DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
posted 15Day language; no comments received
during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-682 | 11B-707.7.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-683 | 11B.707.7.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-684 | 11B.707.7.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-685 | 11B.707.7.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-686 | 11B-707.9 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-687 | 11B-707.9.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-688 | 11B-707.9.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-689
DSA-AC 01/12-690 | 11B-707.9.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-691 | 11B-802 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-692 | 11B-802.4.2 E AA A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 28 of 33 January 8, 2013



DSA-AC 01/12-693 | 11B-802.5 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-694 | 11B-803.3 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-695 | 11B-803.5 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-696 | 11B-803.6 N AA A 15-Day comment; DSA modified this item to correct an error. DSA
Janis Kent Stepping Thru posted 15Day language.
Accessibility
Recommend Approve as Amended
Kerwin Lee, AIA, CASp
Recommended Approve as Amended
DSA-AC 01/12-697 | 805-1+-thru-8054 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-698 | 11B-805.1 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-699 | 11B-805.2 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-700 | 11B-805.2.1 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-701 | 11B-805.2.2 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-702 | 11B-805.2.3 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-703 | 11B-805.2.4 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-704 | 11B-805.3 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-705 | 11B-805.3.1 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-706 | 11B-805.4 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-707
DSA-AC 01/12-708 | 11B-805.4.2 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-709 | 11B-805.4.3 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-710 | 11B-805.5 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-711 | 11B-805.6 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-712
DSA-AC 01/12-713 | 11B-806.2.3 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-714 | 11B-806.2.3.1 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-715 | 11B-806.2.5 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-716 | 11B-809.5.1.1 AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-717 | 11B-809.5.2 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-718 | 11B-810.1.1 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-719 | 11B-810.1.2 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-720 | 11B-810.1.3 N AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-721 | 11B-810.2.3 E AA A Eugene Lozano, CCB DSA modified this item to align with other
Recommend Approve as Amended amendments. DSA posted 15day language; no

comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-722 | 11B-810.2.4 E AA A DSA modified this item to align with other

amendments. DSA posted 15day language; no

comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-723 | 11B-810.9 E AA A
DSA-AC 01/12-724 | 11B-902.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-725
DSA-AC 01/12-726
DSA-AC 01/12-727
DSA-AC 01/12-728

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 29 of 33

January 8, 2013




DSA-AC 01/12-729 | 11B-904.3.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-730 | 11B-904.4.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-731 | 11B-904.4.2 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-732 | 11B-1005.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12- 11B-1008.2.6 N AS A DSA modified this item to be consistent with 2013
732.1 Item added CBC format. DSA posted 15day language; no
for 15Day comment comments received during 15 Day
DSA-AC 01/12-733 | 11B-1008.3.2.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-734 | 11B-1009.2.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-735 | 11B-1009.2.4 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-736 | Figure 11B- E AS A
1009.2.4
DSA-AC 01/12-737 | 11B-1009.2.7 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-738 | 11B-1009.3.1 E AS A

CHAPTER 11C- STANDARDS FOR CARD READERS AT GASOLINE FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES

Repealing adoption

CBSC
Type of CAC: Agency Acti
[tem Number Code Section CETE: (AS AA RESTEIES G CRE Annotations (?Ag) "
ment D 7FS) ’ to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 11C.1
DSA-AC 01/12-739 | CHARTER1C E AS A
Secton1H8Ct
thru Seetien
1104C-and
subsections
CHAPTER 16 - STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
CBSC
[ CAC: BT Action
ltem Number Code Section | 2mend- (AS, AA, RETBITER DY Coinelis Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WD) Fé) '
TOPIC 16.1 SECTION 1607
DSA-AC 01/12-740 | 166772 E AS A
1607.8.2

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 30 of 33

January 8, 2013




CHAPTER 16A — STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- Gl Response 45-Day Comments AT
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 16A.1 SECTION 1607A
DSA-AC 01/12-741 | 1667AF2 E S A
1607A.8.2
CHAPTER 24 — GLASS AND GLAZING
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
amend- Gl Response 45-Day Comments AT
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, P y Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 24.1 SECTION 2406
DSA-AC 01/12-742 | 24661 thru E AS A
2406.5 and Fable
2406.-2(1) and
Table 2406.2(2)
TOPIC 24.2 SECTION 2407
DSA-AC 01/12-743 | SECTION 2407 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-744 | 2407.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-745 | 2407.1.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-746 | 2407.1.2 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-747 | 2407.1.3 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-748 | 2407.1.4 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-749 | 2407.1.4.1 N AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-750 | 2407.1.4.2 N AS A
CHAPTER 30 - ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
CBSC
Type of CAC: Agency Acti
. amend- ) Response 45-Day Comments . ction
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) ’
TOPIC 30.1 SECTION 3001
DSA-AC 01/12-751 3001.1 E AS A
DSA-AC 01/12-752 3001.3 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 31 of 33

January 8, 2013




CHAPTER 31 - SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

CBSC
Type of . Agency .
. amend- GAES Response 45-Day Comments . Gtion
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 31.1 SECTION 3104
DSA-AC 01/12-753 3104.2 E AS A
CHAPTER 31B - PUBLIC SWIMMING POOLS
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
CBSC
Type of ) Agency .
. amend- CRES Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 31B.1 SECTION 3113B
DSA-AC 01/12-754 3113B.1 E AS A
CHAPTER 33 - SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
. amend- CRES Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) : (A, D, W/D) Fé) ,
TOPIC 33.1 SECTION 3306
DSA-AC 01/12-755 3306.2 E AS A
CHAPTER 34 - EXISTING STRUCTURES
Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below
Type of . Agency CB.SC
. amend- NS Response 45-Day Comments . e
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 34.1 SECTION 3401
DSA-AC 01/12-756 3401.1 E AS A
TOPIC 34.2 SECTION 3409
DSA-AC 01/12-757 3409 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 32 of 33

January 8, 2013




CHAPTER 35 - REFERENCE STANDARDS

Adopt Chapter with amendments as listed below

CBSC
Type of ) Agency .
. amend- s Response 45-Day Comments . GEHON
[tem Number Code Section (AS, AA, Annotations (AS,
ment D, FS) to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S, E,N) ' (A, D, WID) Fé) '
TOPIC 35.1
DSA-AC 01/12-758 Chapter 35 E AS A

DSA-AC 01/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 California Building Code, Ch 11B

Page 33 of 33

January 8, 2013




