COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX TITLE (CODE)

AGENCY: OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL [02/12] CCR, TITLE 24, PART 2 (2013 California Building Code)
LEGEND:
Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s Actions: Amendments, if indicated by agency:
(CAC)s: AA = Approve as amended S = Statutory

ACCESS = Accessibility AS = Approve as submitted E = Existing

BFO = Building, Fire & Other D = Disapprove N = New

HF = Health Facilities FS =Further Study Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action):

PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy WI/D = Withdrawn by agency GREEN = uncontested items

SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces YELLOW = challenged items

GB = Green Building SALMON = W/D, no action required
2013 CYCLE BFO CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE SFM

NOTE OF EXPLANATION:

For the 2012 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle, the Express Terms are displayed as follows:

*PART 1** Includes the California Amendments SFM proposes to bring forward from the 2010 California Building Code with changes as
shown, and also identifies the model code standards from the 2012 International Building Code SFM proposes for adoption into the
2013 California Building Code.

*»*PART 2** Displays the standards SFM proposes to bring forward from the 2010 California Building Code without change, except for
nonsubstantive editorial corrections, for adoption into the 2013 California Building Code; the text is provided for context and the
convenience of the code user.

SUMMARY OF REGULATORY ACTION

SFM PROPOSES TO:
*PART 1%

1. Bring forward existing California Amendments from the 2010 California Building Code for adoption into the 2013 California Building Code
with amendment.

2. Adopt standards from the 2012 International Building Code into the 2013 California Building Code without amendment.

Adopt standards from the 2012 International Building Code into the 2013 California Building Code with amendment.
4. Repeal 2010 California Amendments, which are not brought forward into the 2013 California Building Code.

HPART 2%
1. Bring forward existing California Amendments from the 2010 California Building Code for adoption into the 2013 California Building Code
without amendment, except for editorial corrections.

SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 1 of 17 November 19, 2012
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code



ITEM #1 - CHAPTER 1 - SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION - DIVISION | - CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION - Office of the State Fire Marshal (SFM)
The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California provisions contained Sections 1.1 through 1.1.12 & Sections 1.11 through 1.11.10 with modification in Sections listed

below
Typeof | e | agency CECL
. ETIIEIE (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments . Aieiler
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-1-1 Section 1.1.1 - Title E AS A Change Date as indicated 26092012

Section 1.1.3 — Scope
Section 1.1.3 -
— Exceptions

1.1.11 Format & Note:

Add language - efficiency dwelling unit, and

Add language — #1 & 2. Owner-occupied...
Section R313 --
Strike and add language as indicated

ITEM #2. The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 105.2.1 — 105.2.2, 105.3 — 105.3.1, 105.4, 105.6 — 105.7, 106.1, 106.2 — 106.3, 107.1 — 107.3, 107.4,
107.5, 108.1 - 108.4, 110.1 - 110.3, 110.3.4 - 110.3.6, 110.3.8 - 110.3.10, 110.4 — 110.6, 111.1, 111.2, 111.3 - 111.4, 112, 114.1 — 114.2, 115 and 116
contained in Chapter 1.
(IBC Chapter 1 Administrative provisions - Sections 101 through 114 relocated to Division Il of Chapter 1.)

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

Typeof | e | agency CEEL
EE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments AT
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(::SD
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-2-1 DIVISION Il E AS A
SCOPE AND Amend Note
ADMINISTRATION
Note:
ITEM #3 - CHAPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS - Office of the State Fire Marshal (SFM)
The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 2 with the following amendments and California regulations
See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM I-3 Task Force.
See item 45 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for Group E occupancies, developed in coordination with the Division of State Architect.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
P CAC: Agency CB.SC
amend- Action
[tem Number Code Section ment [ Resgenes D (CEIIELS Annotations (AS
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-3-1 COMMUNITY CARE N AS A New Definition
FACILITY
SFM 2/12-3-2 FOSTER CARE E AS A Amend Definition
SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 2 of 17 November 19, 2012

Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code




FACILITIES

SFM 2/12-3-3 FOSTER FAMILY HOME N AS A New Definition
SFM 2/12-3-4 GROUP-HOME E AS A Repeal Definition
SFM 2/12-3-5 GROUP HOME N AS A New Definition

ITEM #4. The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 3 with the following amendments and California regulations.

CHAPTER 3 - USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATIONS

See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM 1-3 Task Force.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

ITEM #5 - CHAPTER 4 - SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY

See item 42 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force.

See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM I-3 Task Force.
See item 45 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for Group E occupancies, developed in coordination with the Division of State Architect.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

e CAC: Agency CB.SC
EE: (AS Response 45-Day Comments AT
Item Number Code Section (rgerét AA, to CAC (AS, AA. D, FS) Annotations A(,QSD
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-5-1 Sections 406.3.4 (2) E FS A SFM to analyze language
ITEM #6 - CHAPTER 5 - GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS
See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM I-3 Task Force.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
P CAC: Agency CB.SC
amend- Action
[tem Number Code Section ment (AS, RESp OISR 9 DEY (GRS Annotations (AS
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-6-1 TABLE 508.4 E AS A The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 5
REQUIRED with footnotes, the amendments shown in
SEPARATION OF the ET and ISOR and existing California
OCCUPANCIES (HOURS) regulations.
SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 3 of 17 November 19, 2012

Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code




ITEM #7 - The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 6 with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 6 - TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

ITEM #8. The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 7 with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 42 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 7 - FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED CONSTRUCTION

ITEM #9. The SFM proposes to maintain the adoption of SFM Chapter 7A without modification.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 7A - MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS FOR EXTERIOR WILDFIRE EXPOSURE [SFM]

ITEM #10. The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 8 with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 8 - INTERIOR FINISHES

ITEM #11. The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 9 with the following amendments and California regulations.

ITEM #11 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 9 with the following amendments and California regulations.

CHAPTER 9 — FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

See item 42 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force.

See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM 1-3 Task Force.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.

See item 45 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for Group E occupancies, developed in coordination with the Division of State Architect.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

12 @] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section am?- 5 Respenes D COEs Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-11-1 CHAPTER 9 - FIRE E AS A Amend Title
PROTECTION SYSTEMS
SFM 2/12-11-2 Section 907.2.11.1.1 - E AS A Amend Section
Group R-1
SFM 2/12-11-3 Section 907.2.11.2 Groups E AS A Amend Section
R-2,R-2.1,R-3,R-3.1 and

SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 4 of 17
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

November 19, 2012




R-4

SFM 2/12-11-4 907.2.11.2.3 Smoke E AS A Amend Section
alarms

SFM 2/12-11-5 | 907.2.11.2.4 E AS A Amend Section

SFM 2/12-11-6 907.2.11.5 Specific E AS A Amend Section

location reguirements.

ITEM #12 - CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS
See item 42 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force.

See item 43 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM I-3 Task Force.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.
See item 45 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for Group E occupancies, developed in coordination with the Division of State Architect.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

e CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section angs- A5, Respenes DY (GOSN Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-12-1 1004.1.1 - Cumulative E AS A
occupant loads
SFM 2/12-12-2 1004.1.1.1 - E AS A Greg Schwab, Fire Chief,
Intervening spaces Georgetown Fire District; SFM accepted the comment and issued
Robert Gill, Pioneer Fire 14 Day language. No comments were
Chief; Michael Lilienthal, El received in the 15 Day comment Period.
Dorado Hills Fire Marshal;
Gary Baldock, Diamond See FSOR for comments and agency
Springs Fire protection responses.
Specialist
Recommends: Approve as
Amended
SFM 2/12-12-3 1004.1.1.2 - E AS A Greg Schwab, Fire Chief, SFM accepted the comment and issued
Adjacent levels for Georgetown Fire District; 14 Day language. No comments were
mezzanines w/ Robert Gill, Pioneer Fire received in the 15 Day comment Period.
Exception Chief; Michael Lilienthal, El
Dorado Hills Fire Marshal; See FSOR for comments and agency
Gary Baldock, Diamond responses.
Springs Fire protection
Specialist
Recommends: Approve as
Amended
SFM 2/12-12-4 | 1004.1.1.3 - Adjacent N AS A Add Section
stories
SFM 2/12-12-5 1014.2 Egress through E AS A Add language as indicated on ET and ISOR
SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 5 of 17 November 19, 2012

Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code




intervening spaces

SFM 2/12-12-6

1008.1.9.1 Hardware

m

AS

Add language as indicated on ET and ISOR

SFM 2/12-12-7

1015.2 Exit or exit access
doorway arrangement

AS

Add language as indicated on ET and ISOR

SFM 2/12-12-8

1015.2.2 Three or more
exits or exit access
doorways

AS

Add language as indicated on ET and ISOR

SFM 2/12-12-9

SECTION 1021
NUMBER OF EXITS
AND-EXIT
CONFHGURATHON

AS

Modify Section Title, Strike and add language as
indicated on ET and ISOR

SFM 2/12-12-10

Section 1021.1 GENERAL
and Exceptions:

AS

Strike and add language as indicated on ET and
ISOR; Strike Exceptions:

SFM 2/12-12-11

TABLE 1021.1
MINIMUM NUMBER OF
EXITS OR ACCESS TO
EXITS PER STORY

AS

New table

SFM 2/12-12-12

1021.2 Single exits from
steries-w/ Exceptions:

AS

Amend Section

SFM 2/12-12-13

TABLE 1021.2(1) (IFC [B]
TABLE 1021.2(1))
STORIES WITH ONE
EXIT OR ACCESS TO
ONE EXIT FOR R-2
OCCUPANCIES

AS

Amend Table

SFM 2/12-12-14

TABLE 1021.2(2)
STORIES WITH ONE
EXIT OR ACCESS TO
ONE EXIT FOR OTHER
OCCUPANCIES

AS

Amend Table

SFM 2/12-12-15

1021.2.1 Mixed
occupancies

AS

Amend Section

SFM 2/12-12-16

1021.2.2 (IFC [B
1021.2.2) Exits from

specific space

AS

New Section

SFM 2/12-12-17

AS

Repeal Section

SFM 2/12-12-18

AS

Repeal Section

SFM 2/12-12-19

AS

Repeal Section

SFM 2/12-12-20

AS

Repeal Section

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 6 of 17

November 19, 2012




SFM 2/12-12-21 | $0253{FC{B}-10213) E AS A Repeal Section

SFM 2/12-12-22 | 10213:1{IFC{B] E AS A Repeal Section

Exception:

SFM 2/12-12-23 | 1021.3 10.24.1 Vehicular E AS A Renumber Section
ramps

ITEM #13 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapters 11.
Note: This chapter will not be printed in the California Building Code.
-CHAPTER 11-ACCESSIBILITFY

ITEM #14 The SFM proposes to only adopt Section 1118A.1 of Chapter 11A with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 11A - HOUSING ACCESSIBILITY

ITEM #15 The SFM proposes to only adopt Section 1114B.2.1 of Chapter 11B with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 11B - ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS, PUBLIC ACCOMMODATIONS, COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS AND PUBLICLY FUNDED HOUSING

ITEM #16 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 1203.5, 1206, 1208 and 1209 of Chapter 12 with the following amendments and California
regulations.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 12 - INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT

ITEM #17 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapter 13
CHAPTER 13 - ENERGY EFFICIENCY

ITEM #18 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 1401, 1402, 1403.4, 1404, 1405, 1406, 1407 and 1408 of Chapter 14 without amendment.
18. The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 14 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 14 - EXTERIOR WALLS

ITEM #19 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 1501, 1502, 1505, 1506, 1507, 1509 and 1511 of Chapter 15. See item 44 for additional amendments
or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic power systems.

See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 15 - ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES

SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 7 of 17 November 19, 2012
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code



ITEM #20 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapters 16 through 20.
CHAPTER 16 - STRUCTURAL DESIGN

CHAPTER 17 - STRUCTURAL TESTS AND SPECIAL INSPECTIONS
CHAPTER 18 - SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS

CHAPTER 19 -CONCRETE

CHAPTER 20 - ALUMINUM

ITEM# 21 The SFM proposes to only adopt Section 2113.9.1 of Chapter 21 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 21 - MASONRY

ITEM# 22 The SFM proposes to only adopt Section 2113A.9.1 of Chapter 21A without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 21A -MASONRY
ITEM# 23 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapter 22.
CHAPTER 22 —STEEL

ITEM# 24 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 2303.2 — 2303.2.9 of Chapter 23 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 23 - WOOD

ITEM# 25 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 24 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 24 -GLASS AND GLAZING

ITEM# 26 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapter 25.
CHAPTER 25 -GYPSUM BOARD AND PLASTER

ITEM# 27 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 26 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 26 - PLASTIC

ITEM# 28 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 27 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 27 - ELECTRICAL

ITEM# 29 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 28 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 28 - MECHANICAL SYSTEMS

SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 8 of 17
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

November 19, 2012



ITEM# 30 The SFM proposes to not adopt Chapter 29.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 29 - PLUMBING SYSTEMS

ITEM# 31 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 30 without amendment.

See item 42 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 30 - ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

ITEM# 32 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 3101, 3102, 3102.3.1, 3103, 3104, 3105, 3105.4, 3106, 3110 and 3111 of Chapter 31.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic power systems.)

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 31 - SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

ITEM# 33 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 32 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 32 - ENCROACHMENT INTO PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY

ITEM# 34 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 33 without amendment.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 33 - SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION

ITEM# 35 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 3401.1 — 3401.3, 3401.4 — 3401.4.2, 3401.6, 3402, 3403.1, 3403.4.1, 3404.6, 3405.1, 3405.1.1, 3406,
3408, 3413, 3414, 3415 and 3416 of Chapter 34 without amendment.

See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.

CHAPTER 34 - EXISTING STRUCTURES

ITEM# 36 The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 35 with the following amendments and California regulations.
See item 44 for additional amendments or building standards proposed for solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems.
See item 46 for existing SFM amendments and California regulations that are brought forward without modification.
CHAPTER 35 - REFERENCED STANDARDS

Typeof | cac. | agency CBSC

[tem Number Code Section amgzg- 55, | Respse <D CREN S Annotations A&g) "

(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D

N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-36-1 NFPA 10—10 E AS A Strike Reference

SFM 2/12-36-2 NFPA 11—10 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-3 NFPA 13—10 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-4 NFPA 13D—20 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-5 NFPA 13R—20 13 E AS A Amend Reference

SFM 02/12 - GREEN
Commission Action Matrix Page 9 of 17 November 19, 2012
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code



SFM 2/12-36-6 NFPA 14—10 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-7 NFPA 15—12 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-8 NFPA 17—09 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-9 NFPA 17A—09 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-10 | NFPA 20—10 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-11 | NFPA 22—13 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-12 | NFPA 24—13 N AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-13 | NFPA 31—06 11 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-14 | NFPA_37—10 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-15 | NFPA_52—13 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-16 | NFPA 54—12 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-17 | NFPA 61—08 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-18 | NFPA 72—10 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-19 | NFPA 80—10 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-20 | NFPA-92B—09 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-21 | NFPA 92—12 N AS A New Reference

SFM 2/12-36-22 | NFPA 99—10 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-23 | NFPA 105—20 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-24 | NFPA 110—20 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-25 | NFPA 111—20 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-26 | NFPA 120—10 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-27 | NFPA 211—40 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-28 | NFPA 259—08 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-29 | NFPA 275—09 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-30 | NFPA 285—211 12 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-31 | NFPA 288—12 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-32 | NFPA 289—09 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-33 | NFPA 409—10 11 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-34 | NFPA 654—311 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-35 | NFPA 720—09 12 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-36 | NFPA 1124—06 13 E AS A Amend Reference
SFM 2/12-36-37 | NFPA 2001—08 12 E AS A Amend Reference

ITEM# 37 The SFM proposes to not adopt Appendix A and B.

APPENDIX A - EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS

APPENDIX B - BOARD OF APPEALS

ITEM# 38 The SFM proposes to adopt Appendix C without amendment.

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 10 of 17

November 19, 2012




APPENDIX C - GROUP U — AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS

ITEM #39 The SFM proposes to not adopt Appendices D through H.
APPENDIX D-FIRE DISTRICTS

APPENDIX E-SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS
APPENDIX F-RODENT PROOFING

APPENDIX G-FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

APPENDIX H-SIGNS

ITEM #40 The SFM proposes to only adopt Sections 1101, 1102 and 1103 of Appendix | without amendment.
APPENDIX I-PATIO COVERS

ITEM #41 The SFM proposes to not adopt Appendix J.
APPENDIX J-EXCAVATION AND GRADING

ITEM #42 The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to high-rise buildings, developed by the SFM High-rise Task Force

P CAC: Agency CB.SC
LG (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments Aol
[tem Number Code Section (n;erét AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(QSD
\) | D:FS) | (A,D, WD) ES)
SFM 2/12-42-1 403.3.1 E/N AS A
SFM 2/12-42-2 403.3.2 Exceptions E/N AS A
SFM 2/12-42-3 4033.2.1 N FS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-4 403.3.4 N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-5 403.5.4 Exception E/N AS A
SFM 2/12-42-6 | 705.12 N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-7 | 907.6.1.1 w/ Exceptions N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-8 907.6.3.3 N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-9 909.20.2.3 E AS A
SFM 2/12-42-10 | 911.1.5 w/ Exceptions EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-42-11 | 911.1.6 N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-12 | 913.6 N AS A New definition
SFM 2/12-42-13 | 1007.8.1 E AS A
SFM 2/12-42-14 | 1007.8.2 E AS A
SFM 2/12-42-15 | 1668-1:4.6 1008.1.9.12 w/ E/N AS A

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 11 of 17

November 19, 2012




Exception

SFM 2/12-42-16 | 1022.10 and Exceptions E AS A

SFM 2/12-42-17 | 1022.10.1 E AS A

SFM 2/12-42-18 | 202 Definitions-DIRECT N AS A
ACCESS

SFM 2/12-42-19 | 909.18.9 E/N AS A

SFM 2/12-42-20 | 1027.1 E AS A

SFM 2/12-42-21 | 3007.7.1 w/ Exception E/N AS A

ITEM #43 The SFM proposes to adopt specific provisions relating to custody, correctional and the rehabilitation facilities, developed by the SFM I-3 Task

Force
e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section amggs- (AS, HESHOnE 8Dty Lo s Annotations A(:At\g) "
u S | A | toCAC (AS, AA, D, FS) A(A )
N) D,FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-43-1 Ch. 2 Definition-CELL E/N AS A Amend definition
{group-1-3-eceupancy}
Detention or correctional
facility )J[SFM]
SFM 2/12-43-2 Ch. 2 Definition-Courtroom N AS A New definition
Dock
SFM 2/12-43-3 Ch.2 Definition- N AS A New definition
COURTHOUSE HOLDING
FACILITY [SFM].
SFM 2/12-43-4 Ch. 2 Definition - N AS A New definition
DETENTION ELEVATOR
[SEM].
SFM 2/12-43-5 Ch. 2 Definition- N AS A New definition
DETENTION
TREATMENT ROOM.
[SEM].
SFM 2/12-43-6 Ch. 2 Definition- E AS A Amend definition
RESTRAINT. [SFM]
SFM 2/12-43-7 Ch. 2 Definition- SECURE N AS A New definition
INTERVIEW ROOMS:
SEM 2/12-43-8 Ch. 2 Definition- N AS A New definition

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 12 of 17

November 19, 2012




TEMPORARY HOLDING

CELL, ROOM or AREA.

[CSA and SFM]
SFM 2/12-43-9 Ch. 2 Definition- N AS A New definition
TEMPORARY HOLDING
FACILITY [SFM]
SFM 2/12-43-10 | Ch. 2 Definition- N AS A New definition
TENABLE
ENVIRONMENT [SEM]
SFM 2/12-43-11 | 308.5 Group I-3 E AS A Added new occupancy classes
SFM 2/12-43-12 | 308.5.6 condition 6 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-13 | 308.5.8 condition 7 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-14 | 308.5.8 condition 8 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-15 | 407.2.2 E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-16 | 4407.3.1.1 w/ Exception E/N AS A Add exception
SFM 2/12-43-17
SFM 2/12-43-18 | 408.1.2.3 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-19 | 408.1.24 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-20 | 408.1.2.5 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-21 | 408.1.2.6 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-22 | 408.1.2.7 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-23 | 408. E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-24 | 408.2.1 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-25 | 408.3.10 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-26 | 408.3.11 N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-27 | 408.6.1 Exception EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-43-
27.1 ltem added
for 45 Day
Comments
SFM 2/12-43-28
SFM 2/12-43-29
SFM 2/12-43-30
SFM 2/12-43-31 | Ch. 5 Table 503 E AS A
And footer ¢
SFM 2/12-43-32 | 903.2.6.2 Exception E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-33 | 907.2.6.3 Exception EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-43-34 | 907.2.6.3.3 Exceptions E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-35 | 907.3.2.1 Exception EIN AS A

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 13 of 17

November 19, 2012




SFM 2/12-43-36 | 1008.1.9.7 Exception E/N AS A
SFM 2/12-43-37 | 1015.1 Exceptions E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-38 | Table 1015.1 & footer a E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-39 | Table 1016.2 & footer a E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-40 | Table 1018.1 footer b E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-41 | 1025.4 E AS A
SFM 2/12-43-42 | 1028-1-General E AS A 2010 CBC amendments no longer necessary
SFM 2/12-43-43 | 1028.1 General Exception E/N AS A

ITEM #44 The SFM proposes to amend, modify or adopt new building standards relating to solar photovoltaic panel(s) or systems into chapters 5, 6, 9,

15, 31 and 35.
s e; CAC: Agency CB.SC
[tem Number Code Section amzrr:;j- A5, Respenes DY Coinelis Annotations A(CAtg) "
(S,E AA, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
N) D, FS) | (A, D, W/D) FS)
SFM 2/12-44-1 | 503.1 Exceptions EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-44-2 | Ch.5figure 5-1 E AS A
SFM 2/12-44-3 | 602.1 Exception EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-44-4 | 903.3.1.1.1 EIN AS A
SFM 2/12-44-5 1505.1 Exceptions E AS A Revisions to 2012 IBC Sections 1505.1,
initially based on ICC proposals for the
2015 IBC Current 2012 IBC text.
Propose S19-12 to amend 1505.1
SFM 2/12-44-6 1505.8 (S19-12) E AS A Revisions to 2012 IBC Sections 1505.8
initially based on ICC proposals for the
2015 IBC Current 2012 IBC text.
Propose S19-12 to amend 1505.1 and
1505.8
SFM 2/12-44-7
SFM 2/12-44-8 1511.1 E AS A
SFM 2/12-44-9 1511.1.1 E AS A
SFM 2/12-44-10 | 332 E AS A
SFM 2/12-44-11
SFM 2/12-44-12 | 3111.2 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-13 | 3111.2.1 N AS A

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 14 of 17

November 19, 2012




Edition (modifications)

SFM 2/12-44-14 | 3111.2.2 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-15 | 3111.2.3 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-16 | 3111.24 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-17 | 31113 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-18 | 3111.4 w/ Exceptions N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-19 | 311141 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-20 | 3111.4.2 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-21 | 3111.4.2.1 w/ Exception N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-22 | 3111.4.2.2 w/ Exception N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-23 | 3111.4.2.3 w/ Exception N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-24 | 3111.4.24 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-25 | 3111.4.3 w/ Exception N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-26

SFM 2/12-44-27 | 3111432 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-28 | 3111.4.33 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-29 | 31115 N AS A
SFM 2/12-44-30 | Ch.35 NFPA 13 2010 E/N AS A

Edition (modifications)
SFM 2/12-44-31 | Ch.35 NFPA 13R 2010 EIN AS A

ITEM #45 The SFM proposes to amend, modify or adopt new building standards relating to school construction into chapters 2, 4, 9 and 10.

e ] CAC: Agency CB.SC
itern Nurmb Code Secti amen?- (AS, | Response 45-Day Comments Annotati AcAtg)n
em Number ode Section (rgeré AA. 10 CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) nnotations A(A D
Ny | D FS) | (A D, WD) £S)
SFM 2/12-45-1 Ch. 2 definitions N AS A
CHARTER SCHOOL
SFM 2/12-45-2 | Ch. 2 definitions E AS A Relocated provisions to new section
MODERNIZAHON 442.2/442.3
PROJECTSFM}
SFM 2/12-45-3 | Ch. 2 definitions E AS A Relocated provisions to new section
NEW-PUBLIC-SCHOOL 442.2/442.3
CAMPUS[SFM}
SFM 2/12-45-4 | PORTABLEBUILDING E AS A Relocated provisions to new section

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 15 of 17

November 19, 2012




[SFM} 442.2/1442.3

SFM 2/12-45-5 | RELOCATABLE N AS A
BUILDING

SFM 2/12-45-6 Ch. 4 SECTION 442 E AS A
GROUP-E SCHOOL...

SFM 2/12-45-7 442.1 General provisions N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-8 | 442244211 E/N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-9 | 4422442.1.2 E/N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-10 | 4423442.1.3 E/N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-11 | 4424 442.14 EIN AS A

SFM 2/12-45-12 | 4425442.15 EIN AS A

SFM 2/12-45-13 | 442:5:1442.1.6 E/N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-14 | 442.2 New public school N AS A (Replaces 903.2.3.1.1, 907.2.3.7 and 907.2.3.7.1,
campus and provisions for modernization project, new
442.2.1 wl exceptions public school campus and portable building

contained in definitions)

SFM 2/12-45-15 | 442.2.2 E AS A (Relocated provisions of 903.2.3.1.1)

SFM 2/12-45-16 | 442.2.3 N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-17 | 4423 N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-18 | 442.3.1 w/ exceptions N AS A

SFM 2/12-45-19 | 442.3.2 N AS A (Relocated provisions of 907.2.3.7.1)

SFM 2/12-45-20 | 442.3.3 w/ Exceptions N AS A (Relocated provisions of 907.2.3.7.2)

SFM 2/12-45-21 | 903.2.3 group E & E AS A (Relocated deleted text to 442.2.2)
exception

SFM 2/12-45-22 | 903-2-3-1-Public-sehoels E AS A

SFM 2/12-45-23 | 9032:3-11-New-public E AS (Relocated provisions to 442.2.2)
schookeampus

SFM 2/12-45-24 | 9832312 Permanent E AS A (Relocated provisions to 442.2)

SFM 2/12-45-25 | 907.2.3 Group E (existing E/N AS A (EXCEPTIONS REMOVED DUE TO NEW
CBC Ia_nguage) LANGUAGE IN IBC FOR MANUAL FIRE ALARMS)

SFM 2/12-45-26 | 907.2.3.1 E/N AS A (new IBC language and section number)

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix

Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 16 of 17

November 19, 2012




Exceptions
SFM 2/12-45-27 | 907.2.3.3 Exception EN AS
SFM 2/12-45-28 | 9072:37-Public-schook E AS (Relocated provisions to 442.2)
SFM 2/12-45-29 | 90723+1-New-public E AS (Relocated provisions to 442.2)
sehool-campus:
SFM 2/12-45-30 | 907.5.2.4 E AS
SFM 2/12-45-31 | 1008.1.11 w/ Exceptions N AS

SFM 02/12 - GREEN

Commission Action Matrix
Amend 2013 Pt. 2 Building Code

Page 17 of 17

November 19, 2012




